BILL ANALYSIS

Senate Research Center C.SSB.5
By: Brown, J. E. “Bugse”

Natura Resources

4/9/2001

Committee Report (Subgtituted)

DIGEST AND PURPOSE

The federd Clean Air Act authorizes the United States Environmenta Protection Agency (EPA) to
edtablish the maximum alowable concentrations of pollutants that can endanger human hedlth, harm the
environment, and cauise property damage. A significant portion of Texas currently does not meet these
gtandards and is facing severe sanctionsiif attainment is not reached by 2007. While the Texas Natura
Resource Consarvation Commission (commission) has submitted a proposed State Implementation
Plan (SIP) requiring emissions reductions of sources under their control, there are significant areas of
potential emission reductions the commission cannot regulate but which may be redized through
incentive programs. C.S.S.B. 5 establishes programs to encourage emissions reductions.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY

Rulemaking authority is expressy granted to the Texas Naturd Resource Conservation Commission
and the comptroller in SECTION 1 (Sections 386.053, 386.152, Health and Safety Code) and
SECTION 15, the Texas Natural Resource Conservation Commissionin SECTION 1 (Section
386.112, Hedlth and Safety Code) and SECTION 14, and to the comptroller in SECTION 1 (Section
386.160, Hedlth and Safety Code), SECTION 13 (Article 9036, Revised Statutes) and SECTION 14
of thishill.

SECTION BY SECTION ANALYSS

SECTION 1. (a) Setsforth legidative intent.

(b) Amends Title 5C, Hedlth and Safety Code, by adding Chapters 386, 387, and 388,
asfollows.

CHAPTER 386. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN
SUBCHAPTER A. GENERAL PROVISIONS
Sec. 386.001. DEFINITIONS. Defines *advisory board,” “ affected county,” “commission,”
“council,” “fund,” “incrementa cog,” “motor vehicle” “new vehicle” “nonattanment area,”
“plan,” and “ste.”
Sec. 386.002. EXPIRATION. Provides that this chapter expires August 31, 2008.
[ Sections 386.003-386.050 reserved for expansion]
SUBCHAPTER B. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN
Sec. 386.051. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN. Requires the Texas Natural
Resource Conservation Commission (commission), the comptroller, and the council to establish

and adminigter the Texas emissions reduction plan in accordance with this chapter. Requires the
commission, the comptroller, and the council, under the plan, to provide grants or other funding

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 1 of 18



for certain purposes. Provides that equipment purchased before September 1, 2001, is not
eigible for agrant or other funding under the plan.

Sec. 386.052. COMMISSION DUTIES. Requires the commission, in administering the plan
established under this chapter and in accordance with the requirements of this chapter, to
perform certain procedures. Provides that appropriate commission objectives include certain
items.

Sec. 386.053. GUIDELINES AND CRITERIA. Requires the commission to adopt grant
guidelines and criteria congstent with the requirements of this chapter. Requires the commission
to condder examples of amilar programs in other sates during the development of guiddines
and criteria. Requires the guiddines to include protocols to caculate projected emissons
reductions, project cost-effectiveness, and safeguards to ensure that funded projects generate
emissions reductions not otherwise required by state or federd law. Requires the commission to
make draft guidelines and criteria available to the public and the United States Environmentdl
Protection Agency before the 45th day preceding the date of final adoption and hold at least
one public meeting to congder public comments on the draft guidelines and criteria before find
adoption. Authorizes the commission to propose revisions to the guidelines and criteria adopted
under this section as necessary to improve the ability of the plan to achieve its gods. Authorizes
the revisions to include among other changes, adding additiond pollutants or adjugting digible
program categories, as gppropriate, to ensure that incentives established under this chapter
achieve the maximum possible emissions reductions. Requires the commisson to make a
proposed revision available to the public before the 45th day preceding the date of final
adoption of the revison and to hold at least one public meeting to consder public comments on
the proposed revison before the find adoption. Authorizes the commission and the comptroller,
because the legidature finds that the current Sate of air qudity in the Sate creates an imminent
peril to the public hedlth, safety, and welfare and jeopardizes the state' s ability to meet federd
ar quaity requirements, to adopt emergency rules under Section 2001.034 (Emergency
Rulemaking), Government Code, with abbreviated notice, to carry out any rulemaking
necessary to implement this chapter. Provides that except as provided by Subsection (€), the
rulemaking requirements of Chapter 2001 (Administrative Procedure), Government Code, do
not apply to the adoption or revision of guiddines and criteria under this section.

Sec. 386.054. MONITORING PROCEDURES. Requires the commission to develop
procedures for monitoring whether the emissions reductions projected for projects awarded
grants under this chapter are actualy achieved. Authorizes monitoring procedures to include
project reviews and contract requirements that the grant recipient provide information annualy
about the project. Requires the report, if the commission requires an annua report, to contain a
minimum amount of information required from arecipient and the report format to be smple
and convenient. Requires monitoring and reviewing procedures to be sufficient to enable
emissions reductions generated by funded projectsto be fully credited to air qudity plans.
Authorizes the commission to revise monitoring and reviewing procedures from timeto time as
necessary or appropriate to enhance the effectiveness of the plan.

Sec. 386.055. AVAILABILITY OF EMISSIONS REDUCTION CREDITS GENERALLY.
Prohibits a project funded under a program established under this chapter from being used for
credit under any state or federd emissions reduction credit averaging, banking, or trading
program. Prohibits an emissions reduction generated by a program established under this
chapter from being used as a marketable emissons reduction credit or to offset any emissons
reduction obligation. Provides that a project involving a new emissions reduction measure that
would otherwise generate marketable credits under state or federa emissions reduction credit
averaging, banking, or trading programs is not eigible unless the project includes the transfer of
the marketable credits to the end user and the retirement of the credits.

Sec. 386.056. AVAILABILITY OF EMISSIONS REDUCTION CREDITSIN CERTAIN

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 2 of 18



NONATTAINMENT AREAS. Authorizes an owner or operator of asite located in the
Houston-Galveston or Ddlas-Fort Worth nonattainment areas to use emissions reductions
generated by a program established under this chapter to offset the requirements of commission
rules relating to control of air pollution from oxides of nitrogen if certain conditions are met.
Requires funds collected under this section to be used to generate emissons reductions needed
to meet the commisson’s atainment demongrations. Requires the commission to verify that
emissions reductions generated from funds collected under this section occur in the same
nonattainment arealin which the ste that purchased the emissions credit is located. Requiresthe
commission, to the extent practicable, to assure that emissons reductions funded under
programs authorized by this chapter used to offset commission requirements under this section
benefit the community in which the Ste usng the emissons reductionsis located. Authorizes the
commisson, if there are no igible emisson reduction projects within the community, to
authorize projects in an adjacent community. Provides that in this subsection, “community,”
means a justice of the peace precinct.

Sec. 386.057. REVIEW AND REPORTING REQUIREMENTS. Requires the commission,
in consultation with the advisory board, to annudly review programs established under the plan,
including each project funded under the plan, the amount granted for the project, the emissions
reductions attributable to the project, and the cost-effectiveness of the project. Requires the
commission, in consultation with the advisory board, to biennidly publish and submit to the
legidature a plan report. Requires the report to include the information included in the annua
reports and specific information for individua projects as required by this section. Requiresthe
report, for projects funded as part of the infrastructure demonstration program under
Subchapter C, to meet certain criteria. Requires the report to supply certain information.
Requires the commisson to request public comment and hold a public meeting on each draft
biennid report and, in producing afind biennia report, to consder and respond to Al significant
comments received.

Sec. 386.058. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN ADVISORY BOARD. Provides
that the Texas Emissions Plan Advisory Board conssts of certain persons. Requires
gppointments to the advisory board to include representatives from certain industries or entities.
Provides that appointed members of the advisory board serve staggered two-year terms.
Provides that the terms of six gppointed members expire February 1 of each even-numbered
year. Provides that the terms of seven gppointed members expire February 1 of each odd-
numbered year. Authorizes an appointed member to be reappointed to a subsequent term.
Providesthat ex officio members of the advisory board include certain persons. Requires the
advisory board to annualy dect apresding officer. Requires the advisory board to review the
program and to recommend to the commission changes to revenue sources or financia
incentives or any legidative, regulatory, or budgetary changes needed. Requires the commission
to provide necessary staff support to the advisory council.

[ Sections 386.059-386.100 reserved for expansion]
SUBCHAPTER C. DIESEL EMISSIONS REDUCTION INCENTIVE PROGRAM
Sec. 386.101. DEFINITIONS. Defines * cost-effectiveness,” “ covered engine,” “covered
source,” “covered vehicle” “fud cdl,” *heavy-duty vehicle” “offroad engine,” *offroad

equipment,” “offroad vehicle,” “program,” “qudifying fud,” “repower,” “retrofit,” and “very-
low-emissons vehicle”

Sec. 386.102. PROGRAM. Requires the commission to establish and administer adiesdl
emissons reduction incentive program. Requires the commission, under the program, to

provide grants for digible projects to offset the incremental cost of projects that reduce
emissons of oxides of nitrogen from high-emitting diesel sources in nonattainment and affected
counties of the sate. Requires the commission to determine the digibility of projects. Authorizes

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 3 of 18



projects that are to be considered for agrant under the program to include certain factors.
Provides that a new purchase, lease, retrofit, repower, or add-on equipment project is not
eligible for agrant under this subchapter if the new purchase, lease, retrofit, repower, or add-on
equipment is required by any state or federa law, rule or regulation, memorandum of
agreement, or other legally binding document. Provides that this subsection does not apply to
certain projects and purchases.

Sec. 386.103. APPLICATION FOR GRANT. Authorizes any person as defined by Section
382.003 that owns one or more covered vehicles that operate primarily within a nonattainment
area or affected county near of this Sate or that otherwise contributes to the state inventory of
emissions of oxides of nitrogen to gpply for a grant under the program. Requires an application
for agrant under this subchapter to be made on an application provided by the commission and
to contain information required by the commission, including certain other factors.

Sec. 386.104. ELIGIBILITY REQUIREMENTS. Requires the commission to establish
criteriafor setting priorities for projects eligible to receive grants under this chapter. Requires
the commisson to review and is authorizes the commission to modify the criteriaand priorities
as appropriate. Requires a proposed project as described in Section 386.102 to meet the
requirements of this section to be eigible for agrant under the program. Requires, for a
proposed project as described by Section 386.102(b), other than a project involving amarine
vessH or engine, not less than 75 percent of vehicle miles traveled or hours of operation
projected for the five years immediately following the award of a grant to be projected to take
place in a nonattainment area or affected county of this state. Requires the vessel or engine, for
aproposed project involving a marine vessel or engine, to be operated in the intercoastal
waterway's or bays adjacent to a nonattainment area or affected county of this sate for a
sufficient amount of time over the lifetime of the project to meet the cogt-effectiveness
requirements of Section 386.105. Requires each proposed project to meet the cost-
effectiveness requirements of Sections 386.105 and 386.106. Requires a proposed repower
project to exceed commission requirements relating to basdline emissons levels of the engines
being replaced under the project. Requires a proposed retrofit, repower, or add-on equipment
project to document, in a manner acceptable to the commission, a reduction in emissions of
oxides of nitrogen of at least 30 percent compared with the basdline emissions adopted by the
commission for the relevant engine year and gpplication. Authorizes the commission, after sudy
of available emissions reduction technologies, public notice and comment, and consultation with
the advisory board, to revise the minimum percentage reduction in emissons of oxides of
nitrogen required by this subsection to improve the ability of the program to achieveits gods.
Requires the commisson, for purposes of this chapter, if abasdline emissons standard does not
exist for new offroad equipment in a particular category, to establish an gppropriate basdine
emissions level for comparison purposes. Authorizes the commission to gpprove payments to
offsat the incremental cogt, over the expected lifetime of the covered vehicle, of quaifying fue
used in acovered vehicle if the proposed project as awhole, including incrementa fud cog,
meets the requirements of this subchapter. Requires the commission to develop an appropriate
method for converting incrementd fud costs over the covered vehidée slifetime into an initia
cost for purposes of determining cost-effectiveness as required by Section 386.105. Provides
that the owner or operator of afacility as defined by Section 382.003 is not eligible to receive a
grant under this subchapter unless the owner or operator holds a permit for the facility under
Sections 382.0518, 382.0519, 382.05194, 382.05195, or 382.05196.

Sec. 386.105. CALCULATION OF COST-EFFECTIVENESS. Requires one-time grants of
money & the beginning of a project, in caculating cost-effectiveness, to be annudized using a
time vaue of public funds or discount rate determined for each project by the commission,
taking into account the interest rate on bonds, interest earned by state funds, and other factors
the commission congders gppropriate. Requires the commission to establish reasonable
methodologies in consultation with al affected stakeholders, for evauating project cost-
effectiveness cons stent with this section and with accepted methods. Requires the commission

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 4 of 18



to develop protocols for caculating oxides of nitrogen emissions reductions not otherwise
required by state or federd law in nonattainment and affected counties of this state from
representative project types over the life of the projects. Authorizes the commission to include
in cogt-effectiveness determinations only reductions in oxides of nitrogen emissionsthet are
achieved in nonattainment areas and affected counties of this state.

Sec. 386.106. COST-EFFECTIVENESS CRITERIA; DETERMINATION OF GRANT
AMOUNT. Prohibits the commission, except as provided by Section 386.107, from awarding
agrant for aproposed project the cost-effectiveness of which, caculated in accordance with
Section 386.105 and rules adopted under that section, exceeds $13,000 per ton of oxides of
nitrogen emissions reduced in the nonattainment or affected county for which the project is
proposed. Provides that this subsection does not restrict commission authority under other law
to require emissions reductions with a cost-effectiveness that exceeds $13,000 per ton.
Prohibits the commission from awarding a grant thet, net of taxes, provides an amount that
exceeds the incrementa cost of the proposed project. Requires the commission to adopt
guidelines for capitdizing incrementa lease costs o those costs may be offset by a grant under
this subchapter. Requires the commission, in determining the amount of agrant under this
subchapter, to reduce the incrementa cost of a proposed new purchase, lease, retrofit,
repower, or add-on equipment project by the vaue of any existing financia incentive that
directly reduces the cost of the proposed project, including tax credits or deductions, other
grants, or any other public financid assstance. Authorizes the commisson to establish maximum
grant awards per vehicle or engine replaced for projects that propose to repower offroad
equipment.

Sec. 386.107. ADJUSTMENT TO MAXIMUM COST-EFFECTIVENESS AMOUNT
AND AWARD AMOUNT. Authorizes the commission, in consultation with the advisory
board, after study of available emissions reduction technologies and costs and after public
notice and comment, to change the vaues of the maximum grant award criteria established in
Section 386.106 and any per-project maximum set by the commission under Section
386.106(€) to account for inflation or to improve the ability of the program to achieveits gods.

Sec. 386.108. INFRASTRUCTURE DEMONSTRATION PROJECTS. Requiresthe
commission to provide funding under Section 386.252(a)(1) for infrastructure demongration
projects to provide initid support for low-emissons vehicle projects at the start of the program.
Requires the commission to perform certain procedures to implement the requirements of this
section.

Sec. 386.109. ELIGIBLE INFRASTRUCTURE DEMONSTRATION PROJECTS.
Authorizes the commission to consder for funding under Section 386.108 certain equipment or
projects.

Sec. 386.110. APPLICATION PACKAGE FOR INFRASTRUCTURE
DEMONSTRATION PROJECTS. Requires the commission to develop asmple,
standardized application package for infrastructure demonstration project grants under this
subchapter. Requires the package to include certain information. Requires the application form
to require as much information as the commission determines is necessary to properly evauate
each project but to otherwise minimize the information required. Prohibits the commisson from
requiring an applicant, as part of the gpplication process, to caculate tons of emissions reduced
or cost-effectiveness.

Sec. 386.111. APPLICATION REVIEW PROCEDURES. Requires the commission to
review an gpplication for a grant for a project authorized under this subchapter, including an
goplication for agrant for an infrastructure demongtration project, immediately on receipt of the
goplication. Requires the commission, if the commission determines that an gpplicaion is
incomplete, to notify the gpplicant, not later than the 15th working day after the date on which

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page5 of 18



the commission received the gpplication, with an explanation of what is missng from the
gpplication. Requires the commission to record the date and time of receipt of each gpplication
the commission determines to be complete and eva uate the completed gpplication according to
the appropriate project criteria. Requires the commission, subject to available funding, to make
afina determination on an application as soon as possible and not later than the 60th working
day after the date the gpplication is determined to be complete. Requires the commission to
make every effort to expedite the gpplication review process and to award grants to qudified
projects in atimely manner. Requires the commission, to the extent possible, to coordinate
project review and gpproval with any timing congtraints related to project purchases or

ingta ments to be made by an applicant. Authorizes the commission to deny an gpplication for a
project that does not meet the applicable project criteria or that the commisson determinesis
not made in good faith, is not credible, or is not in compliance with this chapter and the god's of
this chapter. Requires the commission, subject to available funds, to award a grant under this
subchapter in conjunction with the execution of a contract that obligates the commission to
make the grant and the recipient to perform the actions described in the recipient’s grant
gpplication. Requires the contract to incorporate provisions for recgpturing grant money in
proportion to any loss of emissons reductions or underachievement in dispensing qudifying fue
compared with the volume of emissions reductions or amount of fuel dispensed that was
projected in awarding the grant. Requires grant money recaptured under the contract provision
to be deposited in the fund and reallocated for other projects under this subchapter. Authorizes
an gpplicant to seek reimbursement for qudifying equipment ingtdled after the date of this

program.

Sec. 386.112. HEAVY-DUTY MOTOR VEHICLE PURCHASE OR LEASE

INCENTIVE. Requires the commission to develop a purchase or lease incentive program for
heavy-duty motor vehicles and to adopt rules necessary to implement the program and to
remburse a purchaser or lessee of a heavy-duty motor vehicle that is eigible for rembursement
of incremental costs under this subchapter. Requires the program to authorize statewide
incentives for the reimbursement of incrementa costs for the purchase or lease, according to the
schedule provide by Section 386.113, of heavy-duty motor vehiclesthat are certified by the
United States Environmenta Protection Agency to an emissions standard provided by Section
386.113 if the purchaser or lessee of the vehicle agrees to register the vehicle in this state and

to operate the vehicle in this state and to operate the vehicle in this state for not less than 75
percent of the vehicle s annua mileage. Provides that only one incentive will be provided for
each motor vehicle. Requires the incentive to be provided to the lessee and not to the purchaser
if the motor vehicleis purchased for the purpose of leasing the vehicle to another person.
Requires alease incentive for amotor vehicle to be prorated based on an eight-year lease term.

Sec. 386.113. HEAVY-DUTY MOTOR VEHICLE PURCHASE OR LEASE INCENTIVE
SCHEDULE. Provides that a heavy-duty motor vehicle is digible for rembursement of
incrementa cogts according to a certain schedule.

[Sections 386.114-386.150 reserved for expansion]
SUBCHAPTER D. MOTOR VEHICLE PURCHASE OR LEASE INCENTIVE PROGRAM

Sec. 386.151. DEFINITIONS. Defines “bin” or “emissonsbin,” “ILEV,” and “light-duty
motor vehicle”

Sec. 386.152. LIGHT-DUTY MOTOR VEHICLE PURCHASE OR LEASE INCENTIVE.
Requires the comptroller and the commission to develop a purchase or lease incentive program
for light-duty motor vehicles and to adopt rules necessary to implement the program. Requires
the program to authorize statewide incentives for the purchase or lease, according to the
schedule provided by Section 386.153, to be implemented at the point of sde or lease, of light-
duty motor vehicles that are certified by the United States Environmental Protection Agency to

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 6 of 18



an emissions standard provided by Section 386.153 for a purchaser or lessee who agreesto
register the vehicle in this state and to operate the vehicle n this Sate for not less than 75

percent of the vehicle s annua mileage. Provides that only one incentive will be provided for
each motor vehicle. Requires the incentive to be provided to the lessee and not to the purchaser
if the motor vehicleis purchased for that purpose of leasing the vehicle to another person.

Sec. 386.153. LIGHT-DUTY MOTOR VEHICLE PURCHASE OR LEASE INCENTIVE
SCHEDULE. Providesthat alight-duty motor vehicleis digible for an incentive according to
certain schedules.

Sec. 386.154. MODIFICATION OF INCENTIVE EMISSIONS STANDARDS.
Authorizes the commission, in consultation with the advisory board, after evauating new
technologies and after public notice and comment, to change the incentive emissons standards
established by Section 386.153 to improve the ability of the program to achieve its goas.

Sec. 386.155. MANUFACTURER' S REPORT. Requires amanufacturer of motor vehicles,
at the beginning of but not later than July 1 of each year preceding the vehicle modd yesr, to
provide to the commission certain information.

Sec. 386.156. LIST OF ELIGIBLE MOTOR VEHICLES. Provides that on August 1 each
year the commisson is required to publish and provide to the comptroller alist of the new
model motor vehicles as listed for the commission under Section 386.155. Requires the
compitroller to digtribute the ligt of digible motor vehiclesto new vehicle deders and leasing
agentsin this sate.

Sec. 386.157. VEHICLE EMISSIONS INFORMATION LABEL . Requires a motor vehicle
digtributor to affix on each new light-duty motor vehicle for sde or lease in this Sate display a
clearly legible labd that shows the vehicl€ s class rating under the United States Environmental
Protection Agency’s 5-gtar green vehicle class rating system to enable consumers to make
informed purchase decisons based on the relaive amounts of emissions produced by motor
vehideswithin each vehicle class. Requires the commisson to design the label and have it
available on the commission website. Requires the labd to dso contain certain information.

Sec. 386.158. POINT-OF-SALE OR POINT-OF-LEASE INCENTIVE; REPORT TO
COMPTROLLER; PENALTY. Providesthat a person who purchases or leases during the
model year in which it isfirst offered for sde or lease anew motor vehicle that has been listed
under Section 386.155 is digible for an incentive under this subchapter. Requires a new motor
vehicle dedler or leasing agent to credit a purchaser or lessee with the appropriate incentive as
part of the sales or lease transaction after the assessment of dl applicable taxes. Requires the
dedler or agent to report to the comptroller, at the beginning of each calender month and in the
manner prescribed by the comptroller, the amount of incentives credited by the dedler or agent
during the preceding cadender month. Prohibits a new motor vehicle dedler or leasing agent
from increasing the price of amotor vehicle that qudified for an incentive under this subchapter
by an amount that exceeds the incremental cost to the dedler or leasing agent. Provides that a
violation of this subsection is punishable as a violation of the Deceptive Trade Practices-
Consumer Protection Act (Chapter 17E, Business & Commerce Code). Requires alease
incentive for amotor vehicle to be prorated based on afour-year lease term.

Sec. 386.159. PUBLIC INFORMATION. Requires the commission in cooperation with the
comptroller to develop and implement a program to inform the public and new motor vehicle
dedlers and leasing agents about the motor vehicle purchase or lease incentive program.
Requires the Texas Department of Public Safety to insert a notice describing the motor vehicle
purchase or lease incentive program with each annua vehicle registration renewa notice.

Sec. 386.160. COMPTROLLER TO ACCOUNT FOR MOTOR VEHICLE PURCHASE

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 7 of 18



OR LEASE INCENTIVES. Requires the comptroller by rule to develop amethod to
adminigter and account for the motor vehicle purchase or lease incentives authorized by this
subchapter, and to adminigter the fund to reimburse new motor vehicle deders or leasing agents
within 20 days after the invoice date for incentive amounts credited by the deder. Authorizes
the comptroller to develop forms and ingtructions for new motor vehicle deders and leasing
agents to use in accounting for and reporting motor vehicle purchase and lease incentives and
requires the comptroller to provide new motor vehicle deders and leasing agents with
information to assst them in accounting for and reporting the incentives. Requires the
comptroller to add two percent of the total dollar amount due to a new motor vehicle deder or
leasing agent each month to the amount due that dealer or agent.

Sec. 386.161. REPORT TO COMMISSION; SUSPENSION OF PURCHASE OR LEASE
INCENTIVES. Requires the comptroller to report to the commission annudly regarding motor
vehicle purchase or lease incentives. Requires the comptroller to inform the commission and all
new motor vehicle deders and leasing agentsiif a any time during afiscd year the bdance
available in the money dlocated in the fund for motor vehicle purchase or lease incentives fdls
below 15 percent of the total amount alocated for the incentives during that fiscal yesar.
Requires the comptroller by order, if the balance available for motor vehicle purchase or lease
incentives fdls beow that amount, to suspend the incentives until the comptroller can certify that
the balance available in the fund for incentivesis an amount adequeate to resume the incentives,
but not |ater than the beginning of the next fiscd year. Requires the comptroller, if the
comptroller suspends the incentives, to immediately notify the commission and dl new motor
vehicle deders and leasing agents that the incentives have been suspended. Requires new motor
vehicle deders and leasing agents to suspend incentives on the 15th day after the date of the
comptraller’ s notification of suspension of incentives.

[Sections 386.162-386.200 reserved for expansion]
SUBCHAPTER E. LOCAL GOVERNMENT GRANT PROGRAM

Sec. 386. 201. GRANT PROGRAM. Requires the commission to develop a competitive grant
program to encourage certain environmentally-conscious actions. Authorizes the grant program
developed under this section to be administered by municipalities or counties.

Sec. 386.202. COST-EFFECTIVENESS REQUIREMENT. Requires the amount of an
award of a competitive grant under this subchapter to be based on the cost-effectiveness of
reductions in emissions of oxides of nitrogen to be provided by the proposed project.

Sec. 386.203. GRANT PROJECTS. Authorizes grant projects under this subchapter to
include targeted rebates and revolving loan programs for the purposes listed in Section
386.201(a). Requires each award to include a low-income component that provides for
wesetherization of residences and retirement and replacement of inefficient cooling equipment
and other household gppliances for low-income households.

Sec. 386.204. USE OF GRANT MONEY . Authorizes grant money to be used in conjunction
with other energy efficiency programs but not to be used to replace other funds from other
agencies. Authorizes grants, for the first two years of the program, to be awarded only in
counties in nonattainment areas. Authorizes grants, in years three and four of the program, to
aso be awarded in affected counties. Authorizes grants, in subsequent years, to be awarded in
al counties of the date.

Sec. 386.205. DISPOSAL OF RETIRED EQUIPMENT. Requires a grant recipient to assure
that any appliance, resdential cooling equipment, or lawn or garden equipment retired and
replaced under this subchapter is recycled or disposed of in accordance with dl applicable
locd, state, or federa requirements.

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 8 of 18



Sec. 386.206. PRICE INCREASE PROHIBITED; PENALTY'. Prohibits the seller of an
gppliance, resdentia cooling equipment, or lawn or garden equipment or a provider of
wegtherization services from increasing the price of an appliance, resdentid cooling equipment,
lawn or garden equipment, or westherization services that is sold under a grant program
authorized and developed under this subchapter by an amount that exceeds the incrementa
cost to the sdller or provider. Provides that a violation of this section is punishable as aviolaion
of the Deceptive Trade Practices-Consumer Protection Act (Chapter 17E, Business &
Commerce Code).

[Sections 386.207-386.250 reserved for expansion]
SUBCHAPTER F. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN FUND

Sec. 386.251. FUND. Provides that the Texas emissions reduction plan fund is an account in
the state treasury. Provides that the fund is administered by the comptroller for the benefit of the
Texas emissons reduction plan established under this chapter. Provides that the fund consists of
certain fees, surcharges, and payments.

Sec. 386.252. USE OF FUND. Authorizes money in the fund to be used only to implement
and administer programs established under the Texas emissions reduction plan and requiresit to
be dlocated for certain purposes. Authorizes up to 15 percent of the money alocated under
this section to a particular program and not expended under that program by March 1 of the
second fiscal year of afisca biennium to be used for another program under the Texas
emissons reduction plan as determined by the commisson in consultation with the advisory
board.

CHAPTER 387. NEW TECHNOLOGY RESEARCH
Sec. 387.001. DEFINITION. Defines * program.”

Sec. 387.002. TEXAS COUNCIL ON ENVIRONMENTAL TECHNOLOGY . Provides
that the Texas Council on Environmental Technology (council) conssts of certain members.
Requires the governor to designate from the council members a presiding officer of the council.
Sets forth provisions regarding terms of the council. Requires the council to work to enhance
the entrepreneurid and inventive sprit of Texans to take certain actions to assist in developing
solutions to. Requires council offices and projects to be housed at the Center for Energy and
Environmental Resources at the University of Texasa Audtin.

Sec. 387.003. NEW TECHNOLOGY RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT PROGRAM.
Requires the council to establish and administer a new technology research and development
program as provided by this chapter. Requires the council, under the program, to provide
grants to be used to support development of emissions-reducing technologies that may be used
for projects digible for awards under Chapter 386 and other new technologies that show
promise for commercidization. Provides that the primary objective of this chapter is to promote
the development of commercidization technologies that will support projects that may be
funded under Chapter 386 and this chapter.

Sec. 387.004. SOLICITATION OF NEW TECHNOLOGY PROPOSALS. Requiresthe
council to issue specific requests for proposals or program opportunity notices for technology
projects to be funded under the new technology research and devel opment programs.

Sec. 387.005. ELIGIBLE PROJECTS; PRIORITIES. Requires grants awarded under this

chapter to be directed toward a balanced mix of certain technologies. Requires the council to
identify and evauate and authorizes it to consder making grants for technology projects that

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 5 77(R) Page 9 of 18



would alow qudifying fuesto be produced from energy resources in this state. Requiresthe
council, in considering projects under this subsection, to give preference to projects involving
otherwise unusable energy resourcesin this state and producing quaifying fuels a prices lower
than otherwise available and low enough to make the projects to be funded under the program
economicaly attractive to local businessesin the areafor which the project is proposed.
Requires the council, in soliciting proposas under Section 387.004 and determining how to
dlocate grant money available for projects under this chapter, to give specid consderation to
advanced technologies and retrofit or add-on projects that provide multiple benefits by reducing
emissions or particulates and other air pollutants. Provides that a project that involvesa
technology that alows an onroad covered vehicle to replace with dectric power, while the
vehicleis parked, the power normally supplied by the vehicle sinternd combustion engineis
eligible for funding under this chapter if the project meets dl applicable criteria. Providesthat a
project that involves publicaly or privately owned vehicles or vessdsis digible for funding
under this chapter if the project meets dl gpplicable criteria

Sec. 387.006. EVIDENCE OF COMMERCIALIZATION POTENTIAL REQUIRED.
Requires an gpplication for atechnology grant under this chapter to show clear and compelling
evidence that certain criteria exigts. Requires the council to consider specificdly, for each
proposed technology project application, certain criteria

Sec. 387.007. COST-SHARING. Authorizes the council to require cost-sharing for
technology projects funded under this chapter but prohibits it from requiring repayment of grant

money.

Sec. 387.008. ENVIRONMENTAL RESEARCH FUND. Provides that the environmental
research fund is an account in the generd revenue fund, consisting of certain funds.

Sec. 387.009. ADVISORY COMMITTEES. Authorizes the council to appoint advisory
committees as necessay or desrable to asss the council in performing its duties. Authorizes an
advisory committee to include certain persons or entities.

Sec. 387.010. REPORTS. Sets forth provisions regarding reports submitted by the council to
the legidature.

CHAPTER 388. TEXAS BUILDING ENERGY PERFORMANCE STANDARDS
Sec. 388.001. LEGISLATIVE FINDINGS. Setsforth legidative findings.

Sec. 388.002. DEFINITIONS. Defines “accredited energy program,” “advisory committee,”
“affected county,” “building,” “code adminidtrator,” “code-certified ingpector,” “commisson,”
“internationa building code” “internationd residential code,” * internaiona energy consarvation
code,” “laboratory,” “locd juridiction,” “municipdity,” “sngle-family resdentid,” and
“dructure.”

Sec. 388.003. ADOPTION OF BUILDING ENERGY PERFORMANCE STANDARDS.
Provides that to achieve energy conservation in angle-family resdentid congtruction, the energy
chapter in the International Residential Code, asit existed on May 1, 2001, is adopted as the
energy code in this sate for angle-family resdentia congtruction. Provides that to achieve
energy consarvation in al other resdentid, commercia, and indudtrid congruction, the
International Energy Conservation Code asit existed on May 1, 2001, is adopted as the energy
code for usein this state. Authorizes amunicipdity to establish certain procedures. Prohibits
loca amendments from resulting in less stringent energy efficiency requirements than the
Internationa Residentiad Code or International Energy Conservation Code. Requiresthe
|aboratory to determine, a the request of amunicipality, the relative impact of proposed locd

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 10 of 18



amendments to an energy code, including whether proposed amendments are substantialy
equal to, less stringent than the unamended code, and requires the [aboratory to report certain
information. Requires amunicipdity to periodicaly review and consder anendments made by
the Internationa Code Council to the International Energy Conservation Code and the
International Residential Code energy chapter adopted after May 1, 2001.

Sec. 388.004. ENFORCEMENT OF ENERGY STANDARDS OUTSIDE OF
MUNICIPALITY. Setsforth congtruction standards for a building outside of the loca
juridiction of amunicipdlity.

Sec. 388.005. ADDITIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION PROGRAMS IN NON-
ATTAINMENT AREA AND AFFECTED COUNTY . Requires each municipdity in an
affected county and the affected counties to develop energy efficiency or weetherization
programs for exigting buildings that would result in energy savings equa to or greater than 10
percent of the projected energy savings that would result from the adoption of energy codes for
new congtruction. Requires the laboratory by September 1, 2001, the to develop and
implement energy savings estimates and set targets for each municipdity and affected county.
Requires eech municipality and affected county to develop and implement energy savings and
wesetherization programs to meet these targets. Authorizes the municipdity and affected
counties to use projected savings gpproved by the Public Utility Commission of Texas for
certain energy efficiency measures to estimate the impact of such measuresin loca programs.
Authorizes eech municipdity and affected county in caculating the effect of its program toward
the additional savings established in this section, to count measures funded by the Texas
Emission Reduction Program grant program in Subchapter E of this chapter, but prohibitsiit
from counting energy efficient measures funded by other sate or federd agencies required by
Section 39.905 (God for Energy Efficiency), Utilities Code. Authorizes amunicipdity or county
to adopt non-code energy performance stlandards for the sdle and ingtallation of certain
equipment. Requires the laboratory, on request of amunicipaity, county or aregiond
government representation, to determine the additiona energy savings potentia from non-code
energy performance programs being consdered, and advise the requesting entity of its
determination within 60 days. Authorizes the laboratory to review the specifications adopted the
Environmenta Protection Agency’s Energy Star program or comparable nationaly developed
gpecifications, in consultation with the advisory commiittee, to determine whether modifications
should be incorporated into the non-code energy performance standards available to
jurisdictions under this section, and to modify the Energy Star, or comparable nationdly
developed, specifications as needed to assure certain conditions. Requires amunicipdity or
affected county to submit an annual report to the laboratory on its progress under this section
and requires the laboratory to submit the report to the commission for incluson into the annua
report as required by Section 386.057.

Sec. 388.006. GREEN BUILDING PERFORMANCE STANDARDS. Requiresthe
laboratory to develop a series of green building guiddines that meet certain criteria.

Sec. 388.007. TEXAS BUILDING ENERGY PERFORMANCES STANDARDS
ADVISORY COMMITTEE. Providesthat the Texas Building Energy Performance Standards
Advisory Board is composed of certain persons.

Sec. 388.008. APPLICATION OF STANDARDS. Provides that except as otherwise
provided by this chapter, the International Energy Conservation Code and the energy chapter
of the Internationa Residentia Code gpply to any building or structure in this state for which a
building permit application is recelved by aloca jurisdiction on or after September 1, 2002.

Sec. 388.009. DISTRIBUTION OF INFORMATION AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.

Requires the |aboratory to make available to certain persons code implementation materias that
explain the requirements of the Internationd Energy Conservation Code and the energy chapter

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 11 of 18



of the Internationa Residentid Code and describe methods of compliance acceptable to code
enforcement officias. Requires the materids to include software tools, smplified prescriptive
options, and other materids as gppropriate. Requires the smplified materids to be designed for
projects in which adesign professond is not involved. Requires the laboratory to provide loca
juridictions with technica ass stance concerning implementation and enforcement of the
International Energy Conservation Code and the energy chapter of the International Residentia
Code.

Sec. 388.010. DEVELOPMENT OF ACCREDITATION PROGRAM FOR HOME
ENERGY RATING SERVICES. Requires the laboratory, in consultation with the advisory
committee, mortgage companies, and contractors who provide home energy rating services, to
develop an accreditation program for energy rating services. Requires the laboratory, in
establishing slandards for the accreditation program, to consder available nationd home energy
rating system guiddines and to base the ratings on the Internationa Energy Conservation Code
and the International Residential Code energy chapter. Requires the laboratory to develop
procedures for determining whether a provider of home energy rating services meets
accreditation standards devel oped under this section. Requires the laboratory to develop a
standardized report format to be used by providers of home energy rating services. Requires
the form to be designed to give potentid buyers or enters information on a structure' s building
energy performance, including certain criteria. Requires the laboratory to establish a public
information program to inform certain persons regarding the accreditation requirements for
home energy rating services. Requires the [aboratory to submit its home energy rating
accreditation program to the advisory committee by September 1, 2002. Requires the home
energy rating accreditation program to be implemented by September 1, 2003

SECTION 2. Amends Chapter 151C, Tax Code, by adding Section 151.0515, asfollows:

Sec. 151.0515. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN SURCHARGE. Defines
“equipment.” Provides that in each county in this Sate, a surcharge is imposed on the retall,
sde, lease, or renta of new or used equipment in an amount equa to 0.25 percent of the sale
price or the lease or renta amount, not to exceed atotal amount of $750 for each surcharge.
Requires the surcharge to be collected at the same time and in the same manner and to be
administered and enforced in the same manner as the tax imposed under this subchapter.
Requires the comptroller to adopt any additiona procedures needed for the collection,
adminigtration, and enforcement of the surcharge authorized by this section and to deposit dll
remitted surcharges to the credit of the Texas emissons reduction plan fund. Providesthet this
section expires September 30, 2008.

SECTION 3. Amends Chapter 152B, Tax Code, by adding Section 152.0215, as follows:

Sec. 152.0215. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN SURCHARGE. Providesthat a
surcharge isimposed on every retail sae or lease of every onroad diesel motor vehicle over
14,000 pounds sold or leased in this state. Provides that the amount of the surcharge is one
percent of the total congideration. Requires the surcharge to be collected at the same time and
in the same manner and be administered and enforced in the same manner as the tax imposed
under this subchapter. Requires the comptroller to adopt any additiona procedures needed for
the collection, adminigration, and enforcement of the surcharge authorized by this section and
deposit dl remitted surcharges to the credit of the Texas emissions reduction plan fund.
Provides that this section expires September 30, 2008.

SECTION 4. Amends Section 153.203, Tax Code, by adding Subsection (b), to provide that the tax
imposed by this subchapter des not apply to the volume of water that is blended together with taxable
diesd fuel when the finished product sold or used is clearly identified on the retall pump, storage tank,
and salesinvoice as acombination of diesd fuel and water. Provides that this subsection expires August
31, 2008.

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 12 of 18



SECTION 5. Amends Chapter 156B, Tax Code, by adding Section 156.054, as follows:

Sec. 156.054. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN SURCHARGE. Providesthat in
this section, “nonattainment ared’ and “ affected county” have the meanings assigned by Section
386.001, Hedlth and Safety Code. Requires a person owning, operating, managing, or
controlling ahotel located in a nonattainment area or affected county to collect a surcharge
imposed by this section. Provides that a $1 surcharge isimposed on a person for each day that
the person has the right to use or possess aroom in ahotel that is ordinarily used for deeping.
Provides that Sections 156.101, 156.102, and 156.103 do not apply to the surcharge
authorized by this section. Requires the surcharge to be collected at the same time and in the
same manner and to be administered and enforced in the same manner as the tax imposed
under this subchapter. Requires the comptroller to adopt any additiona procedures needed for
the collection, adminigtration, and enforcement of the surcharge authorized by this section and
to deposit dl remitted surchargesto the credit of the Texas emissions reduction plan fund.
Provides that this section expires September 30, 2008.

SECTION 6. Amends Section 224.153, Transportation Code, by adding Subsection (c), to provide
that a motor vehicle diolaying the “ clean vehicle’ inggnia authorized by Section 502.186 is entitled to
travel in apreferential car pool or high occupancy vehicle lane designated under this section regardiess
of the number of occupantsin the vehicle. Provides that this subsection expires August 31, 2008.

SECTION 7. Amends Section 431.073, Transportation Code, by adding Subsection (d), to provide
that amotor vehicle displaying the “clean vehicle” insgnia authorized by Section 502.186 is entitled to
travel in ahigh occupancy vehicle lane designated under this section regardless of the number of
occupantsin the vehicle. Provides that this subsection expires August 31, 2008.

SECTION 8. Amends Chapter 502D, Transportation Code, by adding Section 502.1675, as follows:

Sec. 502.1675. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN SURCHARGE. Providesthat in
addition to the registration fees charged under Section 502.167, a surcharge isimposed on the
regidtration of atruck-tractor or commercia motor vehicle under that section in an amount to
10 percent of the total fees due for the registration of the truck-tractor or commercia motor
vehicle under that section. Requires the county tax assessor-collector to remit the surcharge
collected under this section to the comptroller at the time and in the manner prescribed by the
comptroller for deposit in the Texas emissons reduction plan fund. Provides that this section
expires August 31, 2008.

SECTION 9. Amends Chapter 502D, Transportation Code, by adding Section 502.186, as follows:

Sec. 502.186. “CLEAN VEHICLE” INSIGNIA FOR CERTAIN MOTOR VEHICLES.
Requires the department, at the time of regidtration or reregistration of the motor vehicle, to
issue a specidly desgned “cdlean vehide’ indgniafor avehidethat is digible for amotor vehicle
purchase or lease incentive under Chapter 386D, Health and Safety Code. Requires the
insgniaissued under this section to include certain words. Requires the department to issue a
“clean vehicdle’ inggnia under this section without the payment of any additiona fee to a person
who meets certain conditions. Provides that this section expires August 31, 2008.

SECTION 10. Amends Chapter 548H, Transportation Code, by adding Section 548.5055, as follows:

Sec. 548.5055. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN FEE. Requires the department,
in addition to other fees required by this subchapter, to fund the Texas emissions reduction plan
established under Chapter 386, Hedth and Safety Code, to collect, for every motor vehicle
required to be inspected under this chapter, certain fees. Requires the fees to be deposited in
the Texas emissions reduction plan fund. Provides that this section expires August 31, 2008.

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 13 of 18



Makes conforming changes.

SECTION 11. Amends Section 681.009, Transportation Code, by adding Subsection (f), to require a
political subdivision or a person who designates five or more parking spaces or a parking area for the
exclusve use of vehides trangporting persons with disabilities, in a nonattainment area or an affected
county in this state, to designate the same number of parking spaces or a parking area for the exclusive
use of motor vehicles displaying “clean vehicle’ inggnia authorized by Section 502.186. Requires
parking spaces or a parking area designated under this section to be as close to the building or areafor
which the spaces are provided as the parking spaces or parking area provided for vehicles transporting
persons with disabilities. Providesthat in this subsection, “nonattainment ared” and “ affected county”
have the meanings assigned by Section 386.001, Hedlth and Safety Code. Provides that this subsection
expires August 31, 2008.

SECTION 12. Amends Chapter 31B, Parks and Wildlife Code, by adding Section 31.0265, to
require each gpplication for an origind or renewd certificate of number for a motorboat that will be
operated primarily in a nonattainment or affected county of this state, to be accompanied by a $3 Texas
emissions reduction plan surcharge in addition to any other fee required to be paid to the department.
Provides that this section expires August 31, 2008. Makes conforming changes.

SECTION 13. Amends Chapter 20, Title 132, Revised Statutes, by adding Articles 9035 and 9036,
asfollows

Art. 9035. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN SURCHARGE ON TAXI FARES

Sec. 1. DEFINITIONS. Defines “fare,” “nonattainment area,” “affected county,” “taxi,”
“subsidized fare for disabled passengers,” and “very-low-emissions vehicle”

Sec. 2. APPLICATION. Provides that this article applies only in a nonattainment areaor an
affected county in this Sate.

Sec. 3. IMPOSITION AND COLLECTION OF SURCHARGE. Provides that a surcharge
of 50 centsisimposed on each fare collected by the taxi driver for transportation by ataxi.
Requires ataxi driver who is employed by or under contract with ataxi company to remit to the
company at the end of each month the total amount of surcharges collected by the driver during
that month, less five percent of the totd to be retained by the driver. Requires the taxi company
to remit to the comptroller a the end of each month the total amount of surcharges collected by
drivers employed by the company, lessfive percent of thetotd to be retained by the company.
Requires an independent taxi driver to submit to the comptroller a the end of each month the
tota amount of surcharges collected by the driver during that month, less five percent of the
total to be retained by the driver. Requires the person required to remit the surcharge to
maintain records of the surcharge in the manner prescribed by the comptroller and to remit the
surcharge, less five percent, to the comptroller each month in the manner prescribed by the
comptroller for depodit to the credit of the Texas emissons reduction plan fund.

Sec. 4. EXEMPTION FROM SURCHARGE. Provides that the surcharge imposed by this
article does not gpply if the taxi providing the transportation for which the fare is charged mesets
certain requirements.

Sec. 5. INTEREST AND PENALTIES. Providesthat a person isliable for pendties and
interest on surcharges that are not remitted when due in the same manner and at the same rate
as provided for delinquent taxes by Section 111.060 (Interest on Delinquent Tax) and 111.061
(Pendty on Delinquent Tax or Tax Reports), Tax Code.

Sec. 6. CRIMINAL PENALTY. Provides that a person who violatesthis article or arule
adopted by the comptroller under this article commits an offense. Provides that an offense

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 14 of 18



under this section is a Class C misdemeanor.
Sec. 7. EXPIRATION. Provides that this article expires August 31, 2008.

Art. 9036. TEXAS EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN SURCHARGE ON THE SALE OF
BUNKER FUEL

Sec. 1. DEFINITIONS. Defines “bunker fud,” “petroleum refining facility,” and “importer.”

Sec. 2. IMPOSITION OF SURCHARGE. Provides that a surcharge of 25 cents per galonis
imposed on the sale of bunker fuel by a petroleum refining facility in this Sate. Requires a
person who imports bunker fud into this state for sale or use to pay to the comptroller a
surcharge of 25 cents per galon of bunker fud imported into this Sate.

Sec. 3. EXEMPTIONS. Providesthat the surcharge imposed by this section does not apply to
bunker fud sold by a petroleum refining facility or an importer for certain purposes.

Sec. 4. ADMINISTRATION, PAYMENT, COLLECTION, AND ENFORCEMENT.
Provides that Chapters 101 and 111-113, Tax Code, apply to the administration, payment,
collection, and enforcement of the surcharge imposed by this article in the same manner that
those chapters apply to the administration, payment, collection, and enforcement of taxes under
Title 2, Tax Code. Requires the comptroller to adopt any necessary rules for the administration,
payment, collection, and enforcement of the surcharge and to deposit dl surcharges remitted
under this article to the Texas emissons reduction plan fund.

Sec. 5. EXPIRATION. Providesthat this article expires August 31, 2008.

SECTION 14. Requires the commission, not later than the 45th day after the effective date of this Act,
to adopt dl necessary rules, guidelines, or criteriarequired to implement programs established under
this Act. Requires the compitroller, not later than the 45th day after the effective date of this Act, to
adopt al rules necessary to enable the comptroller to carry out the comptroller’ s duties under this Act.
Requires the commission, pending find adoption of rules by the commission and the comptroller to
implement programs established by this Act, to begin implementation of the programs using guiddines
developed by asmilar program currently operating in another state, modified as necessary for
goplication in this date.

SECTION 15. Requires the commission and the comptroller, under certain conditions, to adopt rules
necessary to implement the diesel emissons reduction incentive and the motor vehicle purchase or lease
incentive programs. Requires by the commission, not later than September 1, 2001, to adopt criteriafor
setting priorities for projects eigible for grants under Chapter 386C, Hedth and Safety Code. Requires
the commisson to publish the first annud list of vehicles digible for motor vehicle purchase or lease
incentives, as required by Section 386.156, Hedlth and Safety Code, as added by this Act, not later
than the 30th day after the effective date of this Act.

SECTION 16. Provides that the vehicle purchase or lease incentives apply only to the sde or lease of a
vehicle that occurs on or after January 1, 2002.

SECTION 17. Requires the Texas Department of Transportation, not later than the 45th day after the
effective date of this Act, to make available to the county tax assessor-collector of each county in the
date the “clean vehicle’ insignia authorized by Section 502.186, Transportation Code, as added by this
Act. Requires the county tax assessor-collector of each county in the state to begin issuing the “clean
vehide’ inggniato persons who qudify for the inggnianot later than the 10th working day after the dete
theinggniaare available.

SECTION 18. Requires the gppointing authorities, in making the initid appointments to the Texas

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 15 of 18



Emissions Reduction Plan Advisory Board, as created by Section 386.058, Hedth and Safety Code,
as added by this Act, to designate their gppointees so that Sx members terms expire February 1,
2002, and seven members terms expire February 1, 2003. Requires gppointments to the advisory
board to be made not later than July 1, 2001, or the effective date of this Act, whichever islater.

SECTION 19. Requires the governor to gppoint members to the Texas Council on Environmental
Technology (TCET) as soon as practicable after the Act’s effective date. Requires the governor to
designate the expiration of the gppointees terms.

SECTION 20. Requires the TCET to issue requests for proposals for projects to be funded under the
new technology research and development program, not later than the 30th day after the adoption of
rules governing the program.

SECTION 21. Requires the commission, on the effective date of this Act, to submit to the United
States Environmenta Protection Agency arevison to the state implementation plan that deletes the
requirements of the construction shift and early purchase of Tier 2 and Tier 3 equipment and adds the
provisons of this Act.

SECTION 22. Provides that the Texas emissions reduction plan fund and the environmental research
fund are accounts in the genera revenue fund and the accounts and money deposited to the accounts
are exempt from any Act of the 77th Legidature, Regular Sesson, 2001. Requires the deposit of
money that would be deposited to the credit of a specia account or fund to be deposited to the credit
of aspecid account or fund deposited to the credit of the unobligated portion of the generd revenue
fund unless the fund, account, or dedication is exempted under that Act. Provides that this section
prevails over any Act of the 77th Legidature, Regular Session, 2001.

SECTION 23. Requires the commisson to submit the final biennia plan report to the legidature not
later than December 1, 2008.

SECTION 24. Sets forth that expiration of Sections 151.0515, 152.0215, and 156.054, Tax Code,
and Articles 9035 and 9036, Revised Statutes, as added by this Act, does not affect an obligation that
was incurred, a violation that occurred, or an offense that was committed under those sections or
articles before the expiration date of those sections or articles. Provides that violation occurs or an
offense is committed before the expiration of those sections or articles if any element of the violation or
offense occurs before that date.

SECTION 25. Effective date: upon passage or September 1, 2001.

SUMMARY OF COMMITTEE CHANGES

SECTION 1. Amends As Filed SB. 5, asfollows:

. Amends language in previoudy proposed Chapter 386 regarding TEXAS
EMISSIONS REDUCTION PLAN.

. Adds new proposed Chapter 387. NEW TECHNOLOGY RESEARCH AND
DEVELOPMENT PROGRAM

. Adds new proposed Chapter 388. TEXAS BUILDING ENERGY PERFORMANCE
STANDARDS

SECTION 2. Amends Chapter 151C, Tax Code, Section 151.0515, to define “equipment,” add an
expiration date for the section, and make conforming and nonsubstantive changes.

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 16 of 18



SECTION 3. Deletes the proposed amendments to Chapter 151H, Tax Code, and redesignates
SECTION 4 of the original as SECTION 3. Amends proposed Section 152.0215, Chapter 152B,
Tax Code, to add an expiration date for the section and make a clarifying change.

SECTION 4. Amends Section 153.203, Tax Code which was not amended in the originad. Deletes
origind SECTION 5, which amended Section 153.001(5), Tax Code, to redefine “diesd fue.”

SECTION 5. Redesignates SECTION 6 of the origind as SECTION 5. The substitute clarifies and
expands the text of proposed Section 156.054, Tax Code, and adds an expiration date to the

proposed section.

SECTION 6. Redesignates SECTION 8 of the origina as SECTION 6 and adds an expiration date to
the proposed new Section 224.153(c), Transportation Code.

Deletes SECTION 7 of the origind, which proposed amending Chapter 171 of the Tax Code by
adding SUBCHAPTER S. TAX CREDIT FOR USE OF LIQUIFIED GASTO FUEL MOTOR
VEHICLES.

Deletes SECTION 9 (which amended Section 224.155, Transportation Code), SECTION 10 (which
amended Section 361.179, Transportation Code), and SECTION 11 (which amended Section
366.173, Transportation Code) of the origina bill.

SECTION 7. Redesignates SECTION 12 of the original as SECTION 7 and amends proposed
Section 471.073(d), Transportation Code.

SECTION 8. Redesignates SECTION 13 of the origina as SECTION 8 and amends proposed
Section 502.1675, Transportation Code, by adding an expiration date to the section.

SECTION 9. Amends Chapter 502D, Transportation Code, by adding Section 502.186.

Deletes SECTION 14 (proposed Section 502.1715, Transportation Code), SECTION 15 (proposed
Section 502.2665, Transportation Code), and SECTION 16 (proposed Section 521.421(c),
Trangportation Code) of the origind hill.

SECTION 10. Redesignates SECTION 17 of the origina as SECTION 10. Amends proposed
Section 548.5055, Trangportation Code, by adding an expiration date to the section and making
conforming changes.

Deletes SECTION 18 (which amended Section 643.053, Transportation Code) of the origind hill.
SECTION 11. Redesignates SECTION 19 of the origina as SECTION 11. Amends proposed
Section 681.009(f), Transportation Code, by adding an expiration date to the subsection and making
conforming changes.

SECTION 12. Redesignates SECTION 20 of the origina as SECTION 12 and amends proposed
Section 31.0265 by adding an expiration date to the Section and by making conforming changes.

SECTION 13. Redesignates SECTION 21 of the original as SECTION 13 and amends proposed
Articles 9035 and 9036, Revised Statutes.

Deetes SECTION 22, regarding compliance of energy-efficient sandards for new congtruction, and
SECTION 23, regarding an emissions reduction plan surcharge as fuel for marine vessdls, of the
origind hill.

SECTION 14. Redesignates from SECTION 24 of the original.

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 17 of 18



SECTIONS 15-25. Contains both new and amended SECTIONS relating to the implementation of
thisAct.

Deletes SECTIONS 27-29, and 31 of the origind hill.

SRC- MWN C.S.SB. 577(R) Page 18 of 18



