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FAIRNESS COALITION, et al.,
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§ IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF
§
§
VS. § TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS
§
§
§
§

MICHAEL L. WILLIAMS, Commissioner
of Education, et al.,

Defendants. 200™ JUDICIAL DISTRICT

NOTICE OF FILING

Pursuant to the agreement of the parties and authorization by the Court, the Texas
Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. Plaintiffs hereby give notice of the filing of the
attached Affidavit of Richard E. Gray, I1I as proof of their clain for attorney’s fees in the above-
styled matter.

Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. respectfully request that they be
awarded their costs and their reasonable attorney’s fees as set forth in the attached Affidavit.

Respectfully submitted,

GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Ave.

Austin, Texas 78701
Telephone: (512) 482-0061
Fax: (512) 482-0924

By: /s/Richard E. Gray, IV
Richard E. Gray, III
State Bar No. 08328300
Rick.gray@graybecker.com
Toni Hunter
State Bar No. 10295900
Toni.hunter@graybecker.com
Richard E. Gray, IV
State Bar No. 24074308

Richard.graylV@graybecker.com




Randall B. Wood
Buckwood@raywoodlaw.com
State Bar No. 21905000
Doug W. Ray

State Bar No. 16599200
Dray@raywoodlaw.com
RAY & WoOD

2700 Bee Caves Road #200
Austin, Texas 78746
Telephone: (512) 328-8877
Fax: (512) 328-1156
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TEXAS TAXPAYER & STUDENT
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

The undersigned certifies that on February 28, 2014, a true and correct copy of Texas Taxpayer &
Student Fairness Coalition, et al.'s Notice of Filing was served upon the following counsel of record via
email pursuant to the agreement of the parties and in compliance with the Texas Rules of Civil Procedure

and the Texas Local Rules:

Shelley N. Dahlberg

Assistant Attorney General

Texas Attorney General's Office
General Litigation Division

P. O. Box 12548, Capitol Station
Austin, Texas 78711

Attorneys for the State Defendants

Mark R. Trachtenberg

HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP

I Houston Center

1221 McKinney St., Suite 2100
Houston, Texas 77010

John W. Tumer

Micah E. Skidmore

Michelle C. Jacobs

HAYES AND BOONE, LLP

2323 Victory Avenue, Suite 700

Dallas, Texas 75219

Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Calhoun County ISD, ¢t
al.

J. David Thompson, Il
Philip Fraissinet

THOMPSON & HORTON, LLP
Phoenix Tower, Suite 2000
3200 Scuthwest Freeway
Houston, Texas 77027

Holly G. McIntush

Thompson & Horton LE¥

400 West 15th St., Suit= 1430

Austin, Texas 78701

Attorneys for Ft. Bend ISD Plaindiffs

David G. Hinojosa

Marisa Bono

MEXICAN AMERICAN LEGAL DEFEFSE AND
EDUCATIONAL FUND, INC.

110 Broadway, Suite 300

San Antonio, Texas 78205

Atitorneys for the Edgewcad ISD Plaintiffs

J. Christopher Diamond

The Diamond Law I'am, P.C.

17484 Northwest Ficeway, Suite 150
Houston, Texas 77040

Craig T. Enoch

Melissa A, Lorber

Enoch ikever PLLC

600 Congress, Suite 2800

Ausiin, Texas 78701

Aitorneys for Efficiency Intervenors

Robert A. Schulman

Joseph E. Hoffer

Leonard J. Schwartz

Schulman, Lopez & Hoffer, L.L.P.

517 Soledad Strect

San Antonio, Texas 78205-1508

Attorneys for the Charter School Plaintiffs

/s/ Richard E. Gray, IV
Richard E. Gray, IV
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CAUSE NO. D-1-GN-11-003130

TEXAS TAXPAYER & STUDENT § IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF
FAIRNESS COALITION, et al., §
Plaintiffs, §
VS. § TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS
§
MICHAEL WILLIAMS, Commissioner of  §
Education, et al., §
Defendants. § 200™ JUDICIAL DISTRICT

AFFIDAVIT OF RICHARD E. GRAY, IIT

STATE OF TEXAS §
§
TRAVIS COUNTY §

Before me, the undersigned authority, personally appeared on this day RICHARD E.
GRAY, III, who, after being by me duly wom on oath; deposed and said:

1. “My name is Richard E. Gray, IIl. I am over the age of 18 and am fully
competent to testify to the matters stated in tiis affidavit. Ihave personal knowledge of the facts
and statements contained in this affidavit, and each of them is true and correct.

2.  Iam a member of Gray & Becker, P.C. in Austin, Texas and have been practicing
law in Texas for more than 36 vears. This affidavit is submitted on the issue of attomey’s fees
for the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. Plaitiffs. I have tried many
complicated and document-intensive cases involving many different issues including
constitutional issves, and including the first four cases involving Texas public school finance,
known as Edgewood I, Edgewood II, Edgewood III, and Edgewood IV. I was lead counsel for
the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. Plaintiffs in this litigation. [ testified via
affidavit as the attomey’s fees expert for the plamtiffs in West Orange Cove II. 1 have

represented the State of Texas in numerous matters over the years both in my capacity as former
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Executive Assistant to Attomey General Mark White and thereafter in an outside counsel
capacity.

3. I have practiced law in Travis County since September of 1980. I am familiar
with the reasonable and customary rates, charges, and costs for legal services in Austin, Texas
for cases similar to this one. My experience and qualifications are set forth in mere detail in my
resume which is attached to this affidavit as Exhibit “A”. The resumes of my co-counsel, Toni
Hunter and Richard E. Gray, IV, are attached as Exhibit “B” and Exhibit “C”. The resumes of
my co-counsel, Randall B. Wood and Doug W. Ray, are attached as Exhibits “D” and “E”. I am
very familiar with the experience and qualifications of Ms. Hunter, Mr. Gray, IV, Mr. Wood, and
Mr. Ray.

4.  In forming my opinions, not only have I relied on my personal knowledge having
attended every day of trial and personally participated in much of the discovery in this matter,
but 1 have further reviewed the pertinent pleadings, the attorneys’ time records for the Texas
Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs, and I have given substantial thought to the
appropriate fee in this matter. [ am very familiar with the work that was necessary to prepare
and try this case, and I am also familiar with the work that will be necessary to handle an appeal
of this case.

5.  The Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs consist of 443
independent school districts located throughout Texas. This case was originally filed on October
10, 2011. The preparation of this case for trial involved, among other things, meetings and
interviews with scores of witnesses and client employees; the review, analysis, and production of
an extremely large volume of client documents; the review and analysis of an extremely large

volume of documents produced by the State Defendants; the review and analysis of many expert




reports; the assistance of numerous expert witnesses, written discovery, and depositions of more
than 90 factual and expert witnesses. The trial lasted 45 days during which 80 witnesses testified
in person and more than 5,500 exhibits were admitted into evidence. The trial was conducted in
a “paperless” fashion, which meant that thousands of documents had to be imaged, managed, and
presented electronically at trial. The trial was “fast tracked” which necessitated multiple
attorneys’ involvement and the involvement of legal assistants.

6.  An Order granting the Motion to Reopen Evidence by Calhoun County ISD, ef
al., was signed by the Court on June 19, 2013. The preparation for the reopening of the evidence
involved, among other things, meetings and interviews with multiple witnesses and client
employees; the review and analysis of many expert réports with accompanying data and
spreadsheets; and depositions of more than 10 factual and expert witnesses. The reopening of the
evidence lasted 12 days during which 16 witnesses testified in person or by deposition and
several thousand pages of exhibits were admitted into evidence. The reopening of the evidence
was conducted in a “paperless” fashion, which meant that hundreds of documents had to be
imaged, managed, and presented elecironically during the reopening. The reopening was “fast
tracked” which necessitated muitiple attorneys’ involvement and the involvement of legal
assistants.

7.  The time records of Gray & Becker, counsel for the Texas Taxpayer & Student
Fairness Coalition Piamtiffs, pertaining to the original trial are attached to this affidavit as
Exhibit “F”. The time records of Gray & Becker, counsel for the Texas Taxpayer & Student
Faimess Coalition Plaintiffs, pertaining to the reopening of the evidence are attached to this
affidavit as Exhibit “G”. The time records included in Exhibit “G” begin the day after the time

records in Exhibit “F” stop. I believe the rates set forth in the attached time records being




$450.00 an hour for Richard E. Gray, III, $325.00 an hour for Toni Hunter, and $175.00 an hour
for Richard E. Gray, IV are reasonable and customary rates in Travis County, Texas for the level
of experience of the lawyers doing the work and the complexity of the case. I am also familiar
with the level of experience of any additional attorneys reflected in the time records and it is my
belief that the rates charged for said work is reasonable given the level of experience of the
individuals performing the services within Travis County, Texas. The mumber of hours
expended by the attorneys listed above and reflected in Exhibits “F” and “G” were reasonable
and necessary for the complexity of the case. The legal assistant primnarily assigned by Gray &
Becker to work on this case was Susan Jennings. Ms. Jennings has worked with Gray & Becker
in excess of 20 years and has worked on many large dccutnent-intensive cases. She is very
familiar with managing large document productions, drafting pleadings, and doing things that a
lawyer would otherwise have to do. I have carefully reviewed the time records of Gray &
Becker attached as Exhibits “F” and “G” and zdjusted the billings for Ms. Jennings to no-charge
any billing that I felt was not substantive légal work done under the direction of an attomey. Ms.
Jennings’ rate of $100.00 an hour is veasonable and customary for the work of a legal assistant of
her experience in Travis County and the hours that are billed by Ms. Jennings in the attached
Exhibits “F” and “G” were in my opinion reasonable and necessary.

The total amount reflected on the attached Exhibit “F” for attomney’s fees of Gray &
Becker in the renresentation of the Texas Taxpayer & Student Faimess Coalition is
$1,499,171.75. I have reduced the amount sought by 9.05 hours, which is attributable to billings
dated 10/20/11, 10/26/11, 4/13/11, 4/16/11, 6/25/12, 9/19/12, 10/18/12, 11/14/12, 2/21/13 and
2/22/13, for an adjustment of $2,163.75. Further, no claim is being made for the time of Ray &

Wood, co-counsel in this matter. I have further reduced the amount sought for the time




contained in Exhibit F by an additional $69,830.34 in order to insure that fees are not sought for
non-recoverable time (the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition had two claims set forth
in their pleadings that they did not vigorously pursue and, in fact, non-suited one prior to the
close of evidence) and to further cover any potential duplication of effort. Therefore, the fees
sought via Exhibit F, as adjusted, are $1,427,177.66, all of which I believe to be reasonable and
necessary.

The total amount reflected on the attached Exhibit G for attorney’s fees of Gray &
Becker in the representation of the Texas Taxpayer & Student Faimess Coalition during the
reopening phase of the trial is $461,585.00. I believe a reduction of 5% of this amount is
appropriate to avoid compensation for any potential duplication of effort and to avoid recovery
for any non-recoverable time. Therefore, in my opinion the reasonable and necessary attorney’s
fees for the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition during the reopening phase of this trial
is $461,585.00 x 95% or $438,505.75.

[ estimate that an additional $25,63.00 in recoverable fees will be incurred through the
end of March 2014 in connection with finalizing the findings of fact and conclusions of law
requested by the Court.

In my opinion, taking into consideration the factors set forth in Rule 1.04 of the Texas
Disciplinary Rules for Ptofessional Conduct and the factors set forth in Arthur Andersen & Co.
v. Perry Equipment Curporation, 945 S.W.2d 812, 818 (Tex. 1997), the fees set forth in Exhibits
“F*» and “G” are reasonable and necessary. More specifically, I have taken into consideration the
novelty and difficulty of the questions involved, the significance of the issues involved, the fee

arrangement with the clients, the skill required to perform the legal services, the time limitations

imposed by the circumstances, the experience, reputation, and ability of the attorneys, the benefit




conferred and the time and labor required. Based on all of these factors, as well as those set forth
in Rule 1.04 of the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct and the Arthur Andersen
factors, it is my opinion that all of the services rendered by counsel for the Texas Taxpayer &
Student Fairness Coalition Plamtiffs in the prosecution and trial of this case were necessary and
the amount of time spent and rates charged for such services (as reflected in the time records) are
reasonable and that a reasonable and necessary fee for the Texas Taxpayer % Student Fairness
Coalition Plaintiffs for the prosecution of this matter by Gray & Beckeris $1,427,177.66 (the
discounted amount found in Exhibit “F”) plus $438,505.75 (the discounted amount reflected in
Exhibit “G™) plus $25,000.00 bringing the total fee that I believe to be reasonable and necessary
for the prosecution of this matter by the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition to be
$1,890,683.41.

Consequently, I believe that the reasonzble and necessary fee incurred by the Texas
Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintitfs in the preparation and prosecution of this
matter, after taking into consideration all of the factors set forth in Rule 1.04 of the Texas Rules
of Disciplinary Procedure and the faciors set forth in the Arthur Andersen case as well as taking
into consideration the issue of segregation as set forth in the Tony Gullo Motors case is
$1,890,683.41.

8. It is further my opinion that in the event this case is appealed directly to the
Supreme Court, the cum of $325,000.00 would be a reasonable fee for the representation of the
Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition in such appeal. If this case is first appealed to the
Court of Appeals, it is my opinion that an additional fee of $325,000.00 would be reasonable and
necessary for the work at the Court of Appeals and $100,000.00 would be a reasonable and

necessary fee should the case be appealed thereafter to the Texas Supreme Court.”




er Affiant sayeth not, %/f jg ,

Richard E. ?’ray, 111,’Affant

Swom to and subscribed before me by Richard E. Gray, III on February &, 2014.

P

Notary Publie State of Texas




Gray & BECKER
ATTORMEYS &T LAW
DO WEST AVEMUE
ATUSTIN, TERAS 7¥B701-2210
(512} 4B 2-0081
TELECORIER (512) 4830889

Richard E. Gray, III -- Preparatory education: Washington and Lee University,
B.A. with honors (1973); legal education: University of Texas Schocl of Law,
J.D. with honors (1976). Private practice of law with BUTLER, RiNION, RICE,
Cook & KNAPP, Houston, Texas, specializing in litigation (1976-80); Executive
Assistant to Attorney General Mark White (1980-82); has served as Special
Counsel to Attorney General Jim Mattox (1983-86) and Special Counsel to
Attorney General Daniel Morales (January 1991-92). Admiited to practice before
the United States Supreme Court, Texas Supreme Court_United States Court of
Appeals for the Fifth Circuit, and the United States-District Courts for the
Northern, Southern, Eastern, and Western Districts of Texas. Member: Omicron
Delta Kappa; American Bar Association; State Bat of Texas; Travis County Bar
Association; and American Board of Trial Advocates. Listed in: Who's Who
Among Students in American Universities and Colleges; Who's Who in American
Law; Who's Who Among Rising Young. Americans; “The Best Lawyers in
America”; and “Texas Super Lawyers”.

Notables:

e Lead counsel for the poor school districts in the school finance litigation
case Edgewood v. Kirby;

e Represented the State of Texas in the prison reform litigation case Ruiz v.
Estelle;

e Represented tiie State of Texas in the higher education school finance
litigation LULAC v. Richards;

e Represented elected officials in redistricting litigation from1980 to
present.

Exhibit “A”



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 WEST AVENUE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701
(512) 482-0061
(512) 482-0924-FAX

Toni Hunter- Preparatory education: Rosary Hill College, B.A. with honors
(1965); legal education: Cleveland State University, Marshall College of Law,
JI.D. cum laude (1979). Chicago Title Company Award in Real Property Law.
Staff Attorney, Texas Senate Jurisprudence Committee (1980-81}; Texas Senate
State Affairs Committee (1980-83). Assistant Attorney General of Texas (1983-
2003); Section Chief for Health and Human Services Civil Rights Section (State
& County Affairs Division); Deputy Chief, General Litigaticn Division (formerly
State & County Affairs Division) (1988-93); Division ‘Chief, General Litigation
Division (1993-2003). Admitted to practice before the United States Supreme
Court, Texas Supreme Court, United States Court of ‘Appeals for the Fifth Circuit,
and the United States District Courts for the Nerihern, Southern, Eastern and
Western Districts. Travis County Women Lawyer’s Association Government
Attorney Award, 1993. Board Certified, Civi} Appellate Law—Texas Board of
Legal Specialization. Trained mediator-—American Academy of Attorney-
Mediators, Inc. Member: State Bar of Texas and Travis County Bar Association.

Exhibit “B”



Gray & BeCXER
ATTORMEYS AT LAW
SO0 WEST AVENLUE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701-2810
{512} 482-0081
TELECORIER (8128) 4820924

Richard E. Gray, IV - Preparatory education: University of ‘[exas at Austin
(B.A., 2007); legal education: Baylor Law School (B.A., 2010).. Member: State
Bar of Texas.

Exhibit “C”



RANDALL BUCK WOOD

Education:

Career:

General:

The University of Texas, Austin, Texas
B.A. - History, 1966

The University of Texas School of Law, Austin, Texas
LL.B. - 1968

1968-1972, Director, Elections Division, Office of the Secretary of State

1972-1975, Executive Director, Common Cause of Texas

1975-1977, Deputy Comptroller and Chief Clerk, Office of the
Comptroller of Public Accounts

April 1977-Present, Partner and Co-founder, Ray & Wood

Mr. Wood was admitted to the Bar in 1968 after receiving his B.A. and LL.B.
from The University of Texas at Austin. He served as Director of the Elections
Division of the Office of the Secretary of State from 1969 to 1972 where he
was in charge of enforcement of the State’s eiection laws. In this capacity, he
oversaw all general and special elections aiid assisted local government
bodies with their elections. After leavingthe Secretary of State’s Office, Mr.
Wood became the Executive Director of Common Cause, a public interest
lobby group chartered to maintain fairness in the governmental process.
While serving Common Cause, M. Wood drafted and helped pass much of
the legislation dealing with open meetings, open records and numerous
election laws that govern the operation of public entities today.

Mr. Wood is acknowledged nationally as one of the foremost authorities on
public law including election law. As such, he represents many elected
officials including House and Senate members and several prominent state
judges. In addition, Mr. Wood served in various top level positions in the
State Comptrotier’s Office, including Deputy Comptroller and Chief Clerk.

In the early 1980s, Mr. Wood began representing school districts. In 1989 he
became thie general counsel for the Equity Center, an organization of low
wealth school districts and continues in that position to the present. He was
an expert witness in the Edgewood Il case, a counsel of record in the
Edgewood IV case and lead counsel in the West Orange Cove I and II cases in
which he represented low wealth school districts associated with the Equity
Center.

Exhibit “D”



DOUG W. RAY

Education:

Career:

General:

B.B.A. University of Texas (Accounting, with highest honors) 1986

J.D. University of Texas School of Law (with honors) 1989
Executive Editor, Texas Law Review
Note, 67 Texas Law Review 1295 (1989)

1989-1990, Law Clerk to the Honorable David R. Thompson
United States Court of Appeals, Ninth Circuit

1990-1991, Associate with Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher
Newport Beach, California

June 1991-Present, Associate and Partner, Ray'&Wood

Mr. Ray worked for Ray & Wood for over six years prior to joining the firm
as an Associate. While attending undergraduate and law school at the
University of Texas, Mr. Ray worked .in all areas of the firm, including
delinquent property tax collections and defaulted student loan collections.
Since joining the firm as an attorney Mr. Ray has continued working in the
defaulted student loan collections area and also has extensive experience in
elections, campaign finance and appellate practice.

Exhibit “E”
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GRAY & BECKER. P.C.
900 West Avenue

Austin, Tx 78701
512/482-0061

August 31, 2010

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoiceif: 35094-1 REG

Equity Center Our file#: 3102 0000}
Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D. Billing throagh: 08/31/2010
1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
06/29/2010 REG Conference with W. Pierce, and 1.90 hrs . $855.00

R. Freeman re: school finance issues;

telephone call to L. Moak - left message;

telephone conference with B. Wood re:

factual background and status; telephone

call to D. Hinojosa - left message: felephone

call to D. Thompson - left messoge;

telephone conference with D. Thompson re:

status of matters; review mcssage from D.

Hinojosa.
06/30/2010 REG Telephone call to L..Moak - left message. 0.05 hrs $ 2250
07/01/2010 REG Telephone call to 4. Moak - left message; 0.30 hrs $135.00

telephone callio D. Hinojosa - left message;
review message from L. Moak; review
message fiom D. Hinojosa; review message
from B Wood on stams conference.
07/02/2010 REG Telephone call to L. Moak - left message; 0.20 hrs $ 90.00
telepnone call to D. Hinojosa - left message;
correspond to clients via email re: status.

07/06/2010 REG Telephone conference with L. Moak re: 0.25 hrs $112.50
school finance issues and possible litigation.
07/09/2010 REG Review message from D, Hinojosa; 0.20 hrs $ 90.00

telephone call to D». Hinojosa - left message;
review message from W, Pearce; conference
with M. Bolen re: scheduling 7/20

conference.

07/13/2010 REG Review L. Cook email; reply to same; 0.15 hrs $ 67.50
review W. Pearce email.

07/19/2010 REG Telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re: 0.15 hrs $ 67.50

school funding issues.



0741972010

07/20/2010

07/21/2010

07/22/2010
07/22/2010
07/28/2010

07/29/2010
07/30/2010

08/01/2010

08/02/2010

08/02/2010

08/03/2010
08/04/2010
08/05/2010

08/06/2010

08/07/2010

08/08/2010

08/09/2010

08/09/2010

08/09/2010

3102-01

MLB

REG

REG
TBH
REG

REG

REG

REG

TBH
TBH
REG

TBH
REG

REG

Telephone call to B. Wood's office re:
canceling today’s meeting - left voice
message; telephone conference with
Carolyn re: same.

Autend conference at Equity Center re:
school finance matters.

Telephone call to W. Pierce re: setting up
conference with R. Gray and T. Hunter - left
message; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: same; conference with R. Gray re:
same; telephone conference with W. Pierce
re: moving time to 10:30.

Begin review of all school finance cases.
Gather Edgewood cases and documents.
Begin review of school finance case law in
Texas.

Complete review of prior cases.

Set up file; prepare correspondence to W.
Pierce; forward to R. Gray for review.
Conference with T. Hunter re: preparation
of pleadings and law suit thereof; review
case law.

Conference with T. Hunter ard . Pierce
re: pleadings and possible theories;
conference with T. Hunter r¢; pleading
issues.

Meet with Equity Cenier; conference with
R. Gray; review dccoments.

Begin drafting Pstition.

Research and draft petition.

Conference with T. Hunter re: status of
pleadings.

Review material sent by R. Freeman; emal
back with questions; draft petition.

Uraft petition.

Complete review of Supreme Court cases;
work on pleadings.

Work re: pleading preparation; conference
with T. Hunter re: revisions and additional
input.

Work re: pleadings preparation; conference
with T. Hunter re: revisions and additional
input.

Telephone conference with R. Freeman re;
questions; edit petition and email to Equity
Center for comments; conference with R.

Invoice #35094

0.20 brs

3.75 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs
1.00 hrs
1.50 hss

1.50 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.75 hrs

1.75 hrs

2.00 hrs

2.70 hrs
5.00 hrs
0.10 hrs

2.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.80 hrs

NIC

$2587.50

N/C

$225.00
$325.00
$675.00

$675.00
N/C

$337.50

$787.50

$650.00

$877.50
$1625.00
$ 45.00

$682.50

$162.50
$225.00

$562.50

$562.50

$260.00



08/09/2010

08/10/2010

08/10/2010

08/10/2010
08/11/2010

08/12/2010

08/12/2010

08/12/2010

08/13/2010

08/13/2010

3102-01

LVS

REG

LVS

REG

LVS

Lvs

Gray re: same.

Prepare 2nd draft revisions to POP for T.
Hunter.

Conference with T. Hunter re: revisions to
pleading; additional work re: original
petition; conference with T. Hunter re:
securing input from and B.
Wood; review T. Hunter email.

Review materials sent by R. Freeman;
Telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
same; conference with R. Gray re: Petition;
edit petition; email to Buck Word,

re: petition; review email from W. Pierce
and respond.

Conference with T. Hunter re: case status.
Review emails re: petition; follow up with
T. Hunter re: revisions to petition; review R.
Bonillo email.

Review email; conference with
T. Hunter re: same; review message fromi B.
Wood; telephone call to B. Wood - left
message; conference with T. Hunter re:
revisions to petition and confereace with B.
Wood.

Telephone conference with R. Gray re:
telephone call from B Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: meeting and
petition; review comments from

Conference with R. Gray re: contacting B.
Wood toschedule meeting; telephone
conference with Wood re: Tuesday meeting,
discuss Ray Bonilla attendance; email POP

tc. T. Hunter for review; email to R. Gray re;

delay in scheduling meeting for Tuesday.
Review Equity Center email re: gaps;
review T. Hunter email; review email re:
8/17 conference re: petition; schedule
conference.

Conference with R. Gray re: Tuesday
meeting; telephone conference with B.
Wood re: same; email to Gray and T.
Hunter confirming August 17, 2010, 9:00
meeting; telephone conference with Hunter
re: slide show and meeting; fax to Hunter
forwarding slide show for review.

Invoice #35004

1.00 hrs

0.65 hrs

1.20 hic

0.10 hrs
0.35 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.35 hrs

0.30 hrs

$100.00

$292.50

$390.00

N/C
$157.50

$225.00

$195.00

NIC

$157.50

Page 3



08/14/2010

08/15/2010
08/16/2010

08/16/2010

08/16/2010

08/17/2010

08/17/2010

08/18/2010

08/19/2010

08/20/2010

08/21/2010

08/21/2010

08/22/2010
08/24/2010
08/24/2010

08/25/2010

3102-n

LVS

REG

REG

TBH

Review material from W. Pierce re: gaps;
exchange emails with W. Pierce re: same.
Work re: revisions to petition.

Review emails re: petition; review T.
Hunter email; reply to same; conference
with S. Jennings re: red-lined version s of
petition.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
gap examples; edit petition, email to S.
Jennings with instructions; more editing;
email petition to with question.
Receipt and review email from T. Hunter re:
drafts 2 and 3 of Original Petition; convert
and Jable Draft #2; receipt and review of
vanous emails from Hunter to S. Jennings
re: same; reply to Hunter's emails as to
status of revisions.

Review email; review T.
Hunter email; review W. Pierce email;
conference with B. Wood, R. Bonallicand
T. Hunter re: petition.

Telephone conference with R. Gyay, B.
Wood. R. Bonilla; review W.Pierce’s
comments on 3rd draft; review B. Wood and
R. Bonilla memorandum:.

Work with T. Hunter re; revisions fo
petition.

Review message ficm B. Wood; telephone
conference with 3. Wood re: 8/20
conference with W. Pierce; work re:
pleading qevisions.

Conference with W. Pierce and B. Wood re:
petitivn, funding and plaintiffs.

Raview W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter
emails (2).

Review comments from R. Freeman and W.
Pierce and generate 4th draft of petition;
email to all.

Review T. Hunter email re: petition status.
Review T. Hunter email; reply to same.
Telephone conference with Pierce re:
organization of petition and what I need
from them.

Review D, Hinojosa email; reply to same;
comrespond to W. Pierce via email re; same;
review T. Hunter email; reply to same;

invoice #35094

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.45 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.65 hrs

1.70 hrs

0.15 hs

0.30 hes

1.75 hrs

0.25 hrs

2.20 hrs

0.35 hrs
0.15 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.55 hrs

$ 65.00

$225.00
$202.50

$520.00

N/C

$742.50

$552.50

$ 67.50

$135.00

$787.50

$112.50

$715.00

$157.50
$ 67.50
$ 65.00

$247.50
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08/26/2010 REG Review emails re: petition; work re:
preparation of petition.

08/27/2010 REG Review emails re: petition; review T,
Hunter email re: petition.

08/27/2010 TBH Review information sent by W. Pierce;
email to W. Pierce re: same.

08/28/2010 REG Additional work re: revisions to draft
petition.

08/30/2010 REG Review W. Pierce email; telephone
conference with T. Hunter re; petition
issues.

08/31/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D, Hinojosa email; reply to same;
telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:
status, evaluation, D. Thompson call and
status.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG HI, Richard E. Gray Pariner 2735 hrs @

MLB  Bolen, Marnee Paralegal 0.00 hrs @

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 22.30 hrs @

LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 1.00 hrs @

Fee Recap Totals 50.85

3102-01 Invoice #35094

review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;

review T. Hunter email; review W. Pierce
email; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same.

450.00 /hr
125.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

0.15 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.50 his

V20 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.90 hrs

$19,745.00

$12,397.50
$ 0.00
$7247.50
$100.00

$19,745.00

$ 67.50

$ 67.50

$162.50

$ 90.00

$ 67.50

$405.00

Page 5



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512/482-0061

September 30, 2010

$1,987.50

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 35394-} REG
Equity Center Our file®: 3102 00001
Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D. Billiaz through: 09/30/2010
1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
09/02/2010 REG Review R. Freeman email; review T. Hunézr (.30 hrs $135.00
email; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: litigation issues and theories.
09/06/2010 REG Work on latest edits to petition. 0.25 hrs $112.50
09/08/2010 REG Correspond to T. Hunter via email re: 0.35 hrs $157.50
petition status; review T. Hunter email;
reply to same; correspond to Y. Pierce via
email re: status.
09/09/2010 REG Correspond to W, Pierce via email re: 0.05 hrs $22.50
exhibit.
09/09/2010 TBH Review chart on avorages. 0.10 hrs $ 3250
09/14/2010 REG Review messags {rom B. Wood; telephone 0.20 hrs $135.00
conference with B. Wood re: status; review
R. Bonille-email; reply to same.
09/15/2010 REG Review &, Bonillo email; reply to same. 0.10 hrs $45.00
09/20/2010 REG Teleplicae conference with T. Huater re: 0.15 hrs $67.50
statuz of petition and 9/22 conference.
09/20/2010 TBH Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 1.10 hrs $357.50
status; edit 4th draft of petition.
09/22/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa ernail; reply to same; 0.60 hrs $270.00
conference with T. Hunter re: 89/22
conference with client; conference with T.
Hunter re: conference with W. Pierce re:
status; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same.
09/22/2010 TBH Conference with R. Gray re: MALDEF, 1.80 hrs $585.00
attend meeting at Equity Center re: status;
email to D. Hinojosa re: draft pleading.
09/23/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same. 0.15 hrs $67.50



TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Pariner 225 his @ 450.00 /hr $1,012.50
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 3.00 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $975.00
Fee Recap Totals 5.25 $1,987.50

3102-01 Invoice #35394 Page 2



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512/482-0061
December 31, 2010

Equity Center

Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D.

1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

08/16/2010 SEJ Review emails from T. Hunter re: revisions

to Petition; conferences with R. Gray re:
same; revise petition and email to clients fui
review.

10/06/2010 REG Review W. Pierce email; reply to saine; ;
review email; reply to'same;
review D. Hinocjosa emails (2); reply to
same (2).

10/07/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; review T.
Hunter email; review W. Pierce email.

10/07/2010 TBH Review comments on draft of petition from
D. Hinojasa; emailwo W. Pierce re: same;
email to D. Hinoiasa re: same, review email
from W. Pierce.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Parter 075hs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 0.40 hrs @
SEY Jennings, Susan Tmalegal 1.00 hrs @

Fee Recap Totals 2.15

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406

Invoice#: . 36260-1 REG

Qur file#; 3102 00001

Billing through: 12/31/2010

1.00 hrs $100.00

0.45 hrs $202.50

0.30 hrs $135.00

0.40 hrs $130.00

$567.50
450.00 /hr $337.50
325.00 /br $130.00
100.00 /hr $100.00
$567.50



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
September 30, 2011

Tax ID No.: T4-2427406
Invoice#: (38792-1 REG
Our filex: 3102 00001
Equity Center Billing through: 09/30/2011

Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D.
1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSHONAL SERVIUES

08/29/2011 TBH Telephone conference with W. Pierce; 0.30 hrs $ 97.50
review material sent by W. Pierce;
conference with R, Gray.

08/3172011 TBH Review 5B 1 and work on st draf? of 1.40 hrs $455.00
petition,

08/31/2011 LVS Revise "draft #1” of Original Detition, 0.15 hrs N/C

09/0172011 TBH Read articles re: 82nd Legis!ation and 3.30 hrs $1072.50
update petition.

09/06/201 1 TBH Telephone conference with Lynn Moak re: 0.10 hrs $ 3250
school finance issues,

09/08/201 1 TBH Review ; telephione conference 0.20 hrs $ 65.00
with W. Pierc¢ re: same and other matters.

09/09/2011 REG Review T. Hunter email; reply to same; 0.20 hrs $90.00
review T. Hunter email.

09/12/2011 TBH Review voice mail from W. Pierce; 0.50 hrs $162.50

telephone conference with W, Pierce;
revisw cases in preparation for meeting.
09/13/2011 TBH Prepare for meeting; telephone conference 2.30 hrs $747.50
with D. Ray; telephone conference with
, left message.

09/14/2011 TBH Attend Equity Center meetings with school 5.80 hrs $1885.00
superintendents; edit petition.

(9/15/2011 TBH Edit draft petition; review material on ACT 4.00 hrs $1300.00
& STARR; review email from clients and
respond.

09/19/2011 REG Conference with T. Hunter re: status; review 0.75 hrs $337.50

email; review draft petition.
09/19/2011 TBH Attend and participate in webcast; review 2.60 hrs $845.00

comiments on petition from :
email to B. Wood re: editing petition;



09/20/2011

09/21/2011

09/21/2011

09/22/2011

09/222011

09/23/2011

09/23/2011

09/24/201 1
09/26/2011
09/26/2011

09/26/2011

09/27/2011

09/27/2011

09/2812011

3102-01

TBH

TBH

REG

TBH

REG

TBH

REG
RGIV
REG
TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

telephone conference with K. OHanlon re:
his involvement in school finance; email to
client re: same; review editorial in Lufkin
paper; conference with R. Gray re: status.
Review email from W. Pierce re: taxpayer
Plaintiff and respond; make edits
to petition; review FLASH information and
tax rate information from TEA; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: changes to
petition; review Alvarado’s West Orange
Cove pleadings.

Review T. Hunter memo; review B. Wood
suggestions; review message from B, Wood;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
status of matters and strategy; review
message form B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: 9/26
conference.

Conference with R. Gray re: meeting with
attomeys.

Conference with T. Hunter re: petition;
telephone conference with B. Wood te: 9/26
conference.

Review voice mail from R. Freeinan re:
experience and respond; review West
Orange Cove II in preparation for attomey
meeting.

Conference with T. Huuter re: preparation
of petition; review zmail re: petition
preparation.

Conference with R. Gray; telephone
conference wita ; conference
with L. Moak; prepare for meeting of
attomeys.

Rewiew T. Hunter memos (2) re: pleadings.
Legal research re: School Finance caselaw.
Conference with attomeys re; pleadings and
strategy.

Attend mesting of attomeys; review
publication of LBB and Comptroller.

Legal research re: school finance caselaw;
organize binders re: same.

Review draft co-counsel agreement; review
W. Pierce emails; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email.

Review R. Freeman email; review T. Hunter
email; reply to R. Freeman email; review D,

Invoice # 38792

2.20 hrs

©.95 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.75 hrs
2.50 hrs
2.50 hrs

0.35 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.65 hrs

$715.00

$427.50

$ 32.50

$90.00

$487.50

$225.00

$650.00

$90.00
$131.25
$1125.00

$812.50

$ 61.25

$270.00

$292.50
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09/28/2011

09/292011

09/292011

09/29/2011

06/30/2011

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

TBH

RGIV

REG

Lvs

Ray email; review R. Freeman email; reply
to same; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same.

Review material sent by L. Moak re:
fitigation; review email from C. Langston
and respond; review emails from D. Ray re:
costs and iranscript of WOE II; review
email from W, Pierce re: organizational
meeting; conference with R. Gray re: all of
the above.

Travel to meeting; meeting with state
superintendents re: school finance; travel
back to office from meeting; review draft of
petition re: same.

Review W. Pierce emails; reply to same;
review C. Langston email; reply to same;
prepare for conference with potential
clients; conference with C. Langston re:
litigation; conference with school
superintendents for potential litigation.
Email to D. Ray re: copying of testimony
and exhibits on Monday, Oct. 3; receipt of
response from Ray; arrange for copying on
Monday.

Correspond to C. Langston via email re:
conference.

REG M, Richard E. Gray Partner 11.45 hes @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 4.60 hrs @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 29.30 hrs @
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 45.35

310201 Invoice # 38792

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

0.50 hrs

3.50 hrs

4.75 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.15 hrs

$162.50

$612.50

$2137.50

$67.50

$15,480.00

$5,152.50
$ 805.00
$9,522.50
$ 000

$15,480.00
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
October 31, 2011
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 33053-1 REG
Qur file#t 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billirg tisrough: 1073172011
c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROEESSIONAL SERVICES
10/03/201 1 RGIV Legal research re: Texas school finance law: 1.50 hrs $262.50
10/03/2011 REG Conference with T. Hunter re: pleading 0.65 hrs $292.50
status; review material produced by school
finance.
10/04/2011 RGIV Legal research re: Texas school finance law. 2.00 hrs $350.00
10/04/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email; reply tc'same; 0.75 hrs $337.50

review T. Hunter email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; conference with T,
Hunter re; status; review 7. Hunter email;
review W. Pierce emzij; review
email; reply to same
10/04/2011 TBH Review several rzails from W. Pierce re: 0.20 hrs $ 65.00
meeting with L. Moak: review email from
L. Moak re; teeting; conference with R.
Gray resaime.
10/05/2011 REG Reviev: T. Hunter revisions; conference 0.85 hrs $382.50
withy'T. Hunter re: same; review emails;
teiephone conference with e
school finance issues and petition; work re:
preparation of petition.
10/06/2011 RGIV. Legal research re: Texas school finance law. 1.50 hrs $262.50
10/06/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter 1.65 hrs $742.50
email; reply to same; review
email; work re: petition; conference with T.
Hunter re: petition; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; review W. Pierce email; reply
to same; conference with T. Hunter re: equal
protection claim; review B, Wood insert;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
email; reply to same.



10/06/2011

10/06/2011
10/07/2011

10/07/2011

10/07/2011

10/08/2011

10/09/2011

10/10/2011

10/10/2011
10/10/2011

10/11/2011

10/11/2011

TBH

LVS
REG

TBH

LVS

REG

REG

REG

SEJ
TBH

RGIV

REG

Review emails from client and respond;
review B. Wood's insert to petition and edit
petition; conference with R. Gray re:
petition and new agreement.

Revise POP per T. Hunter.

Conference with T. Hunter, B. Wood, R.
Freeman, W. Pierce and L. Mock re: legal
theories; work on petition; review W. Pierce
emails; review T. Hunter emails (2).

Attend meeting with client, attomeys and L.
Moak re: adequacy.

Review email from T. Hunter; revise draft
POP for T. Hunter; email Hunter re: same,
Review emaii; review D,
Thompson email; correspond to S. Winkler
via email re: school finance.

Correspond to W. Pierce via emai re:
status; review W. Pierce email.

Review email; reply to same; work re:
petition; reply to emails; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re: stitus and
working together; conference with T.
Hunter re: petition; review emaiis; review L.
Cook email; reply to same; work re:
petition; review email; review
D. Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa
emaii; conference with T. Hunter re: same;
review L. Cook emgiis; reply to same;
review, revise and Tinalize petition.

Efile Plaintiffs  Original Petition.

Review emails and attachments from client
re: facts for petition; meet with W.Pierce
and R.(rreeman re: petition edits;
conference with R.Gray; email and
telepnone conference with B. Wood re:
signature on petition; make final edits to
petition and file.

Legal research re: Texas school finance
caselaw.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review T.
Hunter email; correspond to D. Hinojosa via
email re: filings (2); reply to same;
correspond to W. Pierce via email re: same
(2}, review W._ Pierce emails (2); correspond
to W. Pierce via email re: funding question;
review notice of filing; correspond to D.
Thompson via email re: same; correspond to
W. Pierce via email re: same; review emails;

0.90 hrs

0.20 hrs
3.00 hrs

2.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.20 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.25 hrs
5.60 hrs

2.30 hrs

5.00 hrs

$292.50

$20.00
$1350.00

$910.00
N/C

$112.50

$ 90.00

$1350.00

N/C
$1820.00

$402.50

$2250.00



10/1172011

1/11/2011

10/12/2011

10/12/2011

10/13/2011

SEJ

TBH

REG

TBH

REG

reply to same; review messages; reply to
same; telephone conference with B. Wood
re: petition and status; review D, Thompson
email; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same.

Review email confirmation of filing
Plaintiffs’ Original Petition; telephone
conference with District Clerk re: status of
file-marked copy; confer with R. Gray re:
same; email client re: status; confer with T.
Hunter re: service of citations; telephone
conference with District Clerk re: status of
citations; email T. Hunter re: status.
Review emails from client and others re:
petition and respond.

Conference with T. Hunter re: trial outline
and potential witnesses; review messages
and retum calls; review D. Ray email; repiy
to same; review L. Cook email; conference
with T. Hunter re: same; review D. Kay
email; reply to same; review L. Cock email;
review T. Hunter email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review W, Pierce
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; rely to same; corcespond to T. Hunter
via email re: same; review D. Hinojosa
email; correspond to re: Equal
Protection issues, c2view message from B.
Wood; telephone conference with B. Wood
re: pleading.

Review enuails from client; &
D. Hingjosa and respond; conference with
R. Gray.

Coirespond to Dr. Folks re: litigating;
teview L. Mock email; review

email; reply to same; review C. Nickel
email; review L. Cook email; correspond to
W, Pierce via email re: data analysis; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review T.
Hunier email re: statistics; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review D. Thompson

material; review email from :
review message from ; review
message from telephone call to

- left message; review
email; review email from L.

0.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.55 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.35 hrs

NIC

$162.50

$1147.50

$162.50

$1507.50



10/13/2011

104132011

10/14/2011

10/14/2011

10/15/2011

10/16/2011

10/17/2011

10/17/2011

10/17/2011

10/18/2011

10/18/2011

10/18/2011

10/19/2011

SEJ

TBH

REG

TBH

REG

REG

REG

TBH

LVS

RGIV

REG

RGIV

Magee(2); reply to same (2); review various
messages; retum calls; review W. Pierce
emails; repiy to same.
Telephone conference with District Clerk
re: status of citations.
Review emaiis from D. Hinojosa and

re: equal Protection; travel to San
Antonio for interview at KLRN on school
finance.
Review W, Pierce email; correspond to T.
Hunter via email re; same; work re: 10/14
presentation; attend 10/14 conference with
clients; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same,; telephone conference with

re: equal protection claim and
status.
Tape interview on school finance; retum to
Austin from San Antonio.
Review L. Cook email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email.
Conference with D. Richards re: legal
theories.
Review W. Pierce email; reply-te same;
review L. Cook email; review emails; reply
to emails; review correspondence; review D.
Thompson email; reply to/'same; review D.
Thompson email; repiy to same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email; replv'to same.
Draft memorandum to R. Gray re: equal
protection clzim; review email from client
and attache<d news report.
Prepars draft memo from T. Hunter to R.
Gray,
Mecting with client at Equity Center re: data
and litigation strategy.
Review 8. Winkler email; reply to same;
prepare for conference with W. Pierce re:
data analysis; review T. Hunter memo re:
Equal Protection; conference with attomeys
and Equity Center personnel re: data
analysis.
Review email from client; attend meeting
with W. Pierce, R. Freeman, R, Gray and R.
Gray IV on data capacity.
Review data; conference with counsel re;
same; calculate average wealth per WADA,
calculate total wealth per WADA for 2011

0.10 hrs

1.00 hrs
1.00 hrs

1.35 tws

2.00 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.55 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.15 hrs

1.40 hrs

2.15 hrs

1.80 hrs

2.05 hrs

N/IC

$325.00
N/C

$607.50

N/C

$112.50

$ 90.00

$697.50

$520.00

N/C

$245.00

$967.50

$585.00

$358.75



10/19/2011

10/19/2011

10/19/2011

10/20/2011
1042072011

10/20/2011

1072042011

10/21/2011

10/21/2011

10/22/2011

10/22/2011

10/22/2011

10/23/2011

10/24/2011

RGIV

REG

RGIV
REG

TBH

LVS

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

REG

RGIV

Region 4; conference with counsel re: data;
legal research re: school finance law.

Excel spreadsheet organization; review
workings of excel. (NO CHARGE)
Review J. Haney email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email; prepare for 10/20
conference; correspond to S. Winkier via
email re: status; review C. Nickel email;
travel to Houston for 10/20 presentation.
Review email from client re: bios; respond
to same; review TEA data; conference with
Richard re: data; email to W. Pierce re: top
and bottom at $1.17 and $1.04; review
expert bios.

Work re: data analysis.

Attend Region 4 conference; make
presentation; return travel to Austin.
Review bio and approve; prepare for
meeting with R. Gray.

Telephone conference with D. Ray re:
missing documents in West Oranges Crse,
help determine which files are missing;
email to T. Hunter re: same; arrange for
delivery of 2nd flashdrive; review flashdrive
for documents; email to T-Hunter re: same.
Legal research re: schofl finance caselaw;
create new spreadshects sorting by 2011
Wealth per WADA and 2011 State and
Local M&O Revenue per WADA; email
Wayne Pierce 1e: target revenue data.
Work with printouts re: financial analysis;
review message from B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re; status; review
W. Pierce emails (3); reply to same (3);
review W. Pierce email; reply to same.
Legal research re: Texas Education Code;
meeting with counsel re: litigation strategy.
Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
conference with REGIV and T. Hunter re:
strategy conference and experts.
Conference with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re:
strategy.

Various emails and replies with T. Hunter
re: legal terms and experts.

Review 25 emails re: scheduling of
meetings among plaintiff's attomeys re:
litigation strategy; review email from
counsel re: meeting with expert; legal

1.50 hrs

5.75 hrs

1.20 hug

5.30 hrs
8.00 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.05 hrs

1.35 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.90 hrs

$262.50

$2587.50

$390.00

$927.50
$3600.00

$877.50

N/C

$183.75

$607.50

$306.25

$675.00

$487.50
$112.50

$332.50



10/24/2011

10/24/2011

10/25/2011

10/25/2011

10425/2011

10/26/2011

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

research re: Texas Constitution; meeting
with counsel and legal assistants re: case
organization and responsibilities; create
spreadsheets for the top 15% and the bottom
15% of FY2011 Wealth per WADA and
State and Local Revenue per WADA;
calculate averages for same.

Review W. Pierce emails (2); reply to same;
review Ft. Worth Agenda; review A,
Kauffman article; correspond to attomeys
via email re: working together; review M.
Trachtenby email; reply to same; review T.
Hunter email re: P. Colbert; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same (2);
review D. Hughes email; review and reply
to emaiis re: P. Coibert; review M.
Trachtenby email; review various emails re:
lawyer conference; work re; P. Colbert
conference; telephone call to Sarah (Sern:
Lugo) re: amicus brief; conference with
staff re: file organization.

Outline proof requirements in Wesi Orange
Cove II; meet with R. Gray and staff;
review emails from D. Thompson, D.
Hinojsa and M. Trachenburg; set up
meeting with P. Colber'; rzsearch expert on
history of Texas Constitution,

Conference with counsel re: data; create
spreadsheets re: ten and bottom 15% of
districts in Adopted M&O Tax Rate and
sum total of top and bottom 15% of districts
in ADA 20d WADA; create spreadsheets re:
top and bottom 15% based on wealth per
WALA and State and Local Revenue per
WADA and the corresponding average tax
tate, and the corresponding total ADA and
total WADA.

Conference with REGIV re: additional
analysis; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review additional printouts; travel to
Ft. Worth; atiend Ft. Worth ISD conference;
retum travel and conference with clients.
Finalize summary of WOCT]; review
summary of Murdock testimony and review
exhibits; review current data from State
Demopgrapher.

Review analysis of court decisions; review
witness list in West Orange case; review W,

2.75 hrs

4.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

11.25 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.85 hrs

$1237.50

$1300.00

$288.75

$5062.50

$520.00

$382.50



Pierce email; reply to same.
10/26/2011 TBH Review articles by A, Kaufman on History 3.00 hrs $975.00
of Edgewood and Fundamental Rights
under Texas Constitution; travel to State
Law Library to get 2nd article; create list of
West Orange Cove Il witnesses; review
portions of West Orange Cove I transcript.
10/27/2011 RGIV  Telephone conference with Dr. Bill Kelly 1.80 hrs $315.00
re: school finance expert; legal research re:
Texas school finance sysiem,

10/27/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email; review 0:25 hrs $112.50
email: reply to same.
10/2772011 TBH Review P. Clobert's testimony from WOC 1T 1.50 hrs $487.50
in preparation for meeting.
10/28/2011 RGIV  Research re: Texas school finance system. 1.20 hrs $210.00
10/28/2011 REG Review R. Freeman email; review W. Pierce 0.85 hrs $382.50

email r: research; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; review R. Freeman email;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same.
10/31/2011 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: experts; email 0.30 hrs $52.50
William Kelly re: school finance exgent;
review and reply to email from Dr. Kelly re:

expert.
10/31/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email. 0.15 hrs $ 67.50
10/31/2011 TBH Review email from client and respond; 2.10 brs $682.50

telephone conference with Loren Cook re:
article on equal protection and Senator Ellis;
review transcript of Colbert testimony from

WOCIL

$42,207.50
TINIEREEPER RECAP A
REG I, Richard E. Gray Partrer 59.70 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $26,865.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 27.20 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $ 4,760.00
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 3250 his @ 325.00 /hr $10,562.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan, Paralegal 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 0.00
LVS von Stemberg, Lyin 0.20 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 2000

Fee Recap Totals 119.60 $42,207.50



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

November 30, 2011

Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition

¢fo Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 7870

1

Re: School Finance Litigation

1140172011

11/01/2011

11/02/2011

11/02/2011

1170272011

11/03/2011

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

REG

TBH

RGIV

Review M. Trachtenburg correspondence,
review messages re: school finance; return
calls; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review W. Pierce email; review &\
Hinojosa email; reply to same; revicw T.
Hunter email; review D. Hinojosa omail;
review L. Cook email; comresponi to T.
Hunter via email re: same,
Draft language for newsletzr on Equal
Protection claim; reviev emails from D.
Hinojosa on equal protection; review emails
from W. Pierce and respond; conference
with R. Gray re: Hinojosa emails and
request to be involved; email
to L. Cookre: involvement;
review F. Colbert testimony from WOC II
in preparation for meetings.
Review email from Dr. Kelly re: expert;
conference with counsel re: same; meeting
with Paul Colbert re: expert.
Review B, Kelly email re: experts;
conference with T. Hunter re: same;
conference with T. Hunter, R. Gray IV and
P. Colbert re: expert issues.
Review L. Moak article on cuts to teachers;
review Colbert charts in preparation for
meeting with Colbert; email to W. Kelly re:
experts; review Murdock report from WOC
II; meet with P. Colbert,
Review message from B. Ward, telephone
conference with B, Ward re; experts.

Tax ID No..
Invoice#: 32293-1
Our file# 3102
Billing \hrough:

1.65 hrs

4.50 hrs

1.10 hrs

1.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.25 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
11/30/2011

$ 74250

$1462.50

$192.50

$ 675.00

$975.00

$ 11250



11/04/2011

11/407/2011

11/07/2011

11/07/2011

11/07/2011

11/08/2011

11/08/2011

11/09/2011

1140972011

1171672011

1171072011
11/10/2011

3102-01

REG

RGIV

REG

SEI

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

Work re; 11/8 Lubbock trip; review
message from B. Wood.

Review Original Answer; create data
spreadsheet re: Lubbock County; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review notice from C. Nickell; review
Original Answer of State; conference with
T. Hunter re: experts; prepare for Lubbock
trip; review message from B. Wood,
telephone call to B. Wood - left message;
review W. Pierce email.

Confer with T. Hunter re: contact
information for Paul Colbert; email C.
Nickell re: same.

Review email from P. Colbert and
attachments; telephone conference with D,
Hinojosa re: P. Colbert and other experts;
conference with R. Gray re: experts;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
expert; review resume for O. Lopez; email
to J. Butler; review chart sent by W. Pierce
and respond.

Travel to/from Lubbock; make presentation
to Lubbock ISD Board.

Review emails re: next step fromi.. Cook
and respond; review audionof B. Lesley re:
money matters; telephone conference with
D. Hinojosa re: experts_seview expert
resumes.

Conference with attorneys re: experts and
pleadings.

Review videe of C. Clark on TASB school
finance plian;search internet for Cook and
‘Walch rzsumes; telephone conference with
J. Waich re: expert testimony; review chart
seniby W. Pierce; telephone conference
wits W. Pierce re: experts and TCJL
meeting.

Conference with counsel re: data sorted by
wealth per WADA at $1.04 and $1.17 tax
rate; email Wayne Pierce re: same;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
workbook spreadsheet; create spreadsheets
re: top and bottom 15, 20, 25, and 50
percent wealth per WADA.

Additional analysis of tax/revenue issues.
Review notebook sorted by wealth per
WADA; email to B. Baker, potential expert;
telephone conference with J. Walch,

Invoice # 39293

0.30 tus

0.50 hrs

1.30 hrs

(.20 hrs

2.60 hrs

10.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.80 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

(.75 hrs
0.60 hrs

$ 135.00

$ 87.50

$ 585.00

RNiC

$845.00

$4,500.00

$487.50

$ 360.00

$650.00

$262.50

$ 337.50
$195.00

Page



11/11/2011

1171172011
11/14/2011

11/14/2011

11/14/2011

11/14/2011

11/15/2011

11/15/2011
115201

11/15/2011

11/16/2011

11/17/2011

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SEI

RGIV

RGIV
REG

RGIV

potential expert; review website for
American Association of Educational
Finance.

Conference with counsel re: workbook data:
organize spreadsheet re: all 1024 districts
sorted by wealth; email Wayne Pierce re:
workbook data.

Review spreadsheet re: tax rates/frevenue,
Conference with counsel re: Bexar county
data; create spreadsheets re: same.

Review email re; expert; conference with T.
Hunter re; same; review email from Water
Valley ISD; work re: preparation for 11/15
conference; review T. Hunter email; review
email; conference with S. Jennings re: 11/15
Northside conference; conference re: school
finance issues.

Telephone conference with J. Lisson,
attorney for Water Valley ISD, re: Original
Petition and possible intervention; confer
with R. Gray re: same; email Mr. Lisson're;
same; confer with R. Gray re: travel to
Northeast ISD; telephone conference with
W. Pierce’s office re: same; confer with R.
Gray re: status; telephone conference with
Caroline re: trip to San Antonio; confer with
R. Gray re: same.

Set up telephone conference with B. Baker;
review email from P. Colbert and respond.
Conference with cowisel re: case status and
experts.

Review emails from counsel re: experts.
Review L. Cook emails; review R. Freeman
email; work re: expert selection; travel
to/froin San Antonio; conference with
Northside ISD Board.

Review various emails from P. Colbert and
respond; contact attorneys re: B. Baker;
review emails from W.Pierce re: W,
Bingham and T. James and meeting of
Coalition committees; conference with R.
Gray re: experts.

Correspond to W. Pierce via email re:
status; review R. Freeman email; reply to
same; review W, Pierce email.

Telephone conference with Bruce Baker re:
school finance litigation expert; conference
with counsel re: same; telephone conference
with John Robb re: working with Bruce

Invoice # 39293

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.50 hss

1.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.35 hrs
4.15 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.25 hrs

$ 52.50

$ 225.00
$ 87.50

$ 697.50

% 65.00
$ 2625

$ 61.25
$1,867.50

$780.00

$ 112.50

$218.75

Page 3



11/17/2011

1171772011

1171772011

11/18/2011

i1/21/2011

11/21/2011

11/21/2011

1142272011

11/22/2011

3102-01

REG

SEI

TBH

RGIV

Baker as an expert.

Review L. Moak email; review T. Hunter 0.55 hrs
email; review L. Moak email; review T.

Hunter emails; review W, Pearce email;

review L. Cook emails.

Confer with T. Hunter re: request for 0.20 hrs
Answer from L. Moak; email L. Moak re:

same.

Review material to prepare for interview 2.60 hrs

with B. Baker; interview B. Baker by
telephone conference; interview J. Robb re:
B. Baker; review material provided by B.
Baker to W. Orange Cove CISD
Defendant’s and material on CEI: review
video of C. Dupre; exchange emails with
W.Pierce re: Target Revenue and

Pflugervilie.

Conference with attorneys re: experts; 0.50 hrs
review emails; reply to same.

Review Inside Texas Schools Video re: 0.60 hrs

Charles Dupre; review email from counsa|

re: districts that have joined the coalition;

revise spreadsheet and print for R. Gray II1.

Review additional data; review R Fieeman 1.70 hrs
email; review M. Trachenberg eimail; review

D. Thompson email; reply to zame; review

M. Trachenberg email; reply to same;

correspond to other attcsmeys via email re:

when they expect to file; review emails re:

status; reply to same: conference with T.

Hunter re: status, experts and strategy.

Review emails from client and respond,; 1.30 hrs
conference with R. Gray re: experts; email

to P. Colbeit re: starting data analysis;

review tesponse; telephone conference with

P. colbert re: same; telephone conference

wiihi B. Lesley re: expert analysis.

Revise and print spreadsheet re: coalition 0.05 hrs
districts.
Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; 1.05 hrs

review P. Colbert email; correspond to T.
Hunter via email re: same; review T. Hunter
email; review L. Cook email; reply to same;
review B. King email; review T. Hunter
email; review B. Wood email; correspond to
T. Hunter re: 11/30 conference; review
emails; review message from R. Freeman;
telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
Mexican American School Board

Invoice # 39293

$ 24750

N/C

$845.00

$ 22500

$105.00

$ 765.00

$422.50

$ 875

$ 47250

Paged



11/22/2011

11/22/2011

11/23/2011
11/25/2011

11/25/2011

1172572011

1112672011

114277201 1

117282011

11/28/2011

11/28/2011

1112972011

1172972011

11/29/2011

11/30/2011

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV
RGIV

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

conference.

Email W. Pierce re: consulting agreement
with P. Colbert.

Review various emails from client and
respond; email to B. Wood re: meeting of
attorneys; review articles by various
experts; search for bio information on W.
Bingham and T. James; prepare for strategy
meeting with R. Gray.

Review Gannon report of Bruce Baker.
Meeting with counsel re: case status and
litigation strategy.

Prepare for strategy conference; conference
with R. Gray IV and T. Hunter re: status and
strategy.

Prepare for meeting on strategies with R.
Gray and R. Gray I[V; review B. Baker’s
evaluation of the Texas FSP; meet with R.
Gray and R. Gray I'V.

Review T. Hunter email re: legal theories;
reply to same; additional data analysis.
Research study re: SAT/ACT scores; review
T. Hunter email.

Research re: Interest and Sinking fund tax
rate; review data re: analysis.

Review article re; SAT/ACT score;
correspond to T. Hunter via email re:
exhibits; telephone call ¢5 B. Wood - left
message; review message from B. Wood;
conference with T. Hanter re: B. Wood call.
Review TEA study on preformance on
college tests; review emails from W. Plerce
and responq; telephone conference with B.
Wood re: expert and meeting; email to P.
Colbert setting up telephone conference.
Telepione conference with Wayne Pierce
ez Study on district lines splitting
neighborhoods and I&S tax rates; legal
research re: school finance law.

Review W. Pierce email; conference with T.
Hunter re: 11/30 conference with attorneys;
telephone call to B. Wood - left message;
review D. Hinojosa email; review opinion in
Allcot claims.

Review email from W Pierce and respond,
review spreadsheet on college achievement;
review report on superintendent’s salary.
Research Texas School Finance; review
emails from Wayne Pierce re; District line

Invoice # 39293

0.20 hrs

1.90 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.58 Jirs

1.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.55 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.80 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.85 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.70 hrs

N/C

$617.50

$ 43.75
$262.50

$ 675.00

$812.50

$ 180.00

$ 67.50

$ 96.25

$ 225.00

$260.00

$218.75

$ 38250

$£162.50

$647.50

Page 5



11/30/2011 REG

11/30/2011 TBH

data; meeting with all attorneys re: litigation
status and sirategy; review and reply to
email from Wayne Pierce re: district lines
splitting neighborhoods.

Review report re: SAT/ACT scores; prepare
for 11/30 conference; conference with
attorneys re: litigation issues and strategy;
review message from R. Freeman; telephone
conference with R. Freeman re; Ector
County ISD; review message from B.
Wood; telephone conference with B. Wood
re: experts and strategy; review message
from W. Pierce; telephone conference with
K. Ohlanon re: Edinburg ISD,

Prepare for meeting with attorneys; meet
with attorneys; review emails from client.

HIMEKEEPER RECATD

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 3430 s @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 13.55 hes @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 2900 hrs @
SEJI Jennings, Susan Paralegal 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 76.85

3102-01 Invoice # 39203

450.00 /hr
175.00 /r
325.00 for
100.00 /hr

4.10 hrs

2.60 hrs

$1,845.00

$845.00

$27,231.25

$15,435.00
$ 2,371.25
$ 9,425.00

$ 0.00

$27,231.25

Page 6



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

December 31, 2011
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 39462-1 REG
Our file# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 12/31/2011

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVIUES
12/01/2011 RGIV  Review email from Wayne Pierce re: 2.10 hrs $367.50
showing neighborhoods split by district
lines; forward same to T. Hunter;
conference with counsel re: Ector data;
create spreadsheet re: same; review siides
re: Ector county presentation; conierence
with counsel re: same; review emails from
Ray Freeman re: Ector County presentation;
check data on Ector Couniy: telephone
conference with Ray Frezman re: same and
Ector county presentation; create
spreadsheet re: same.
12/01/2011 REG Review R. Freeman email; reply to same; 0.85 hrs $382.50
make arrangenw:nt for 12/6 conference;
correspond-to-W. Pierce via email re:
Edinburg ISD; review R. Freeman email;
conference with R. Gray IV re: same; reply
to R. Freeman; review W. Pierce email,
review R. Freeman emails (2),
12/01/2011 TBH Review emails from client and respond; 2.40 hrs $780.00
prepare for telephone conference with P.
Colbert; telephone conference with P,
Colbert re: B. Baker, expert; telephone
conference with Ie: experts;
telephone conference with H. Daniels, left
message; telephone conference with W,
Pierce re: Helen Daniels.
12/02/2011 RGIV  Review summary of WADA,; print same for 0.90 hrs $157.50
counsel; conference with counsel re: same;
Telephone conference with Ray Freeman re:
Ector county presentation; conference with




12/02/2011

12/04/2011

12/04/2011

12/05/2011

12/05/2011

12/05/2011

12/05/2011

12/06/2011

12/06/2011

12/06/2011

1240772011

3102-01

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

MLB

RGIV

RGIV

counsel re: Ector presentation slides; review
slides; review email from Wayne Pierce re:
coalition members being named plaintiffs,
Review message from R. Freeman;
telephone call to R. Freeman re: Ector
County; review information of weights.
Meeting with counsel re: Ector County
presentation; revise presentation; complete
and finalize same.

Prepare for presentation to Ector County
ISD.

Meeting with counsel re: case status;
research school building architects re: cost
of building facilities.

Review R. Freeman email; reply to same,
review W. Pierce email: conference with T.
Hunter re: same; conference with W. Pierce,
R. Freeman and T. Hunter re: status and
strategy; prepare for Ector Co. ISD
conference; conference with T. Hunter re: [
Moak call; conference with attorneys re: go
forward strategy; review message from .
O'Hanlon; conference with T. Huntes re:
same; review T. Hunter email re: survey;
review W, Pierce email; review avicle re:
facilities and test scores.

Review emails from clien and respond;
email to B, Baker re: telephone conference;
review articles by Baker on equity met with
R. Freeman, R. Gray and W. Pierce re:
various matters; ineet with R. Gray and
Richard Gray.re: status of efforts; internet
search on facitity experts; edit questions to
Plaintiff disiricts.

Telepiione call to Ector Co. ISD re:
tomenow’s board meeting - no answer,
revisw web site - school closed due to
weather.

Review email and document sent by Mark
Trachtenberg re: TIER and the state of
public education in Texas.

Travel toffrom Odessa; conference with
Ector Co. ISD; review paper on construction
cOS{s.

Review emails from H. Daniels and forward
to client and R. Gray; review Tier article;
telephone conference with O’'Hanlon re:
Edinburgh.

Print data for counsel; research school

Invoice # 39462

0.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.25 has

0.50 hrs

2.15 hrs

3.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

12.25 hrs

0.40 hrs

2.75 hrs

$225.00

$262.50

$562.50

$ 87.50

$967.50

$1267.50

NiC

$ 5250

$5512.50

$130.00

$481.25

Page 2



12/07/2011

12/07/2011

12/08/2011

12/08/2011

12/08/2011

12/08/2011

12/09/2011

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

finance in Texas: review data; review email

and article from Ray Freeman re: Wichita

Falls; compile data re: same; review email

and spreadsheet from Tim Wolff re: Public

Education Data available; conference with

counsel re: same.

Review email update re: analysis and (.40 hrs
experts; review message from J. Corrales;

telephone call to J. Corrales - left message.

Attend meeting at Equity Center with B. 4.60 bxs
Leslie, P. Colbert, W. Pierce, R. Freeman

and staff regarding AEIS data; prepare for

telephone conference with B. Baker; review

email from R. Freeman re: Wichita Falls

article and respond; draft contract for H.

Daniels and email to her; conference with R.

Gray re: telephone conference with O°

Hanlon asking to reschedule; email re:

same.

Meeting with counsel re: case status and 2.55 hrs
litigation strategy; review documents re:

Intercultural Development Research

Association; telephone conference with Tim

Wolff re: data analysis to run; legat research

re: findings of fact and conclusions of law in

West Orange Cove II; conferance with

counsel re: same.

Conference with T. Hunier re: new database 1.65 hrs
and expert vetting; coiference with R. Gray

IV and T. Hunter re: exhibits and analysis;

review articie by 8. Baker; review research;

conference with T. Hunter re: Edinburg

ISD; review eiail re: litigation committee

conference.

Confer with T, Hunter re: Board Resclution; 0.40 hrs
reviev:tile re; same; email L. McCollom re:

same.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 2.10 hrs

Edinburgh phone call; meet with R. Gray
and Richard Gray re: data, Edinburgh and
strategy; review Carrollton - Farmers;
telephone conference with B. Baker; review
material from B, Leslie.

Review documents from the Intercultural 3.60 hrs
Development Research Association re:
Texas statewide attrition rates; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: email
address; Telephone conference with Equity
Center re: same; research Texas school

Invoice # 30462

$180.00

$1495.00

$446.25

$742.50

MiC

$682.50

$630.00

Page 3



12/09/2011

12/10/2011

12/12/2011

12/12/2011

12/12/2011

12/13/2011

12/13/2011

12/13/2011

12/13/2011

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

DMB

RGIV

REG

TBH

finance systern re: tier | and tier 2 funding
and basic allotment and student weights.
Review M. Trackenburg email; reply to 1.00 hrs
same; review article by prospective experts;
review school funding article.
Review email re; low income students; 1.25 hrs
review T. Hunter email re: Edinburg; reply
to same; review Calhoun County suit;
correspond to W. Plerce via email re: same.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 3.20 kny
data analysis; review petition filed by Hanes
and Boone; conference with counsel re: data
analysis; email Tim Wolff re: same;
research re: current state of Texas School
Finance System; review article re: Several
Efforts Under Way to Measure Effect of
Texas’ Budget Cuts on Schools; review
studies within article.
Telephone conference with T. Hunter re: 2.70 hrs
Edinburg call; review W. Pierce email,
review K. O'Hanlon email; telephone
conference with K. O'Hanlon re: confercnce
call; telephone conference with K. Chanlon
and Dr. Gutierrez re: Edinburg; telepaone
conference with T. Hunter re: samz; review
email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review M. Trachenburg einail; conference
with T. Hunter re: status,
Several telephone conferences with K. 0.90 hrs
O’Hanlon, R. Gray, . Pierce and R.
Freeman to arrange telephone conference
with superintendent of Edinburg 1.8.D. re:
joining suit;telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: what was said during conference
call; review emails and articles from client;
conference with R. Gray.
Canference of attorneys re: lawsnit 0.50 hrs
participation by Wichita Falls ISD;
telephone conferences with K. Hines’s office
and Hines, school board member, re: same.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 0.85 hrs
data analysis; review Wichita Falls data;
conference with counsel re: same.
Conference with D. Richards re: status; 0.80 hrs
review W. Pierce email; review R. Freeman
email; correspond to D. Becker via email re:
Wichita Falls ISD; review emails re:
potential experts.
Review contract with H. Daniels; review 1.30 hrs

Invoice # 39462

$450.00

$562.50

$560.00

$1215.00

$292.50

$175.00

$148.75

$360.00

$422.50

Puge d



12/14/2011

12/1472011

12/14/201 1

12/15/2011

12/15/2011

12/16/2011

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

articles sent by client; emails to client about
theme of our case; telephone conference
with P. Colbert re: AEIS data correlated to
wealth; review O. Lopez’s vitae,

Review data re: texas high school exit exam
policies; review data on varying states
expectations on students performance in
science; review data re: coalition districts
eligible for free lunch program; review data
re: district lines splitting neighborhood
study; conference with counsel re: same;
email Wayne Pierce and Josh Haney re:
progress of study; telephone conference
with Buck Wood re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; review HB 1 summary.
Review L. Cook email; reply to same;
review R, Freeman email; review L. Cook
email; review D. Hinojosa email; forward to
clients; reply to same; review L. Cook
email; conference with D. Becker re:
Wichita Falls; correspond to D. Hinojosare:
filing; review summary of exit exam
profiles; review Lobott decision; review
additional articles written by potentizl
experts; review MALDEF press release and
suit; review email re: H. Danizls.

Review email from O. Lopez and respond;
review emails from client and respond;
review MALDEF petition; review data on
coalition districts.

Review email from Josh Haney re:
neighborhood teports; review reports;
telephone conerence with Cathy at Buck
Wood's oftice re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; email Cathy at Buck
Wood's office re: same; review Property
Tax Relief: The $7 Billion Reality; meeting
with counsel re: inter district comparisons;
email Josh Haney re: same; review The
Adequacy of Educational Cost Functions.
Review data on taxpayer inequity;
conference with Richard re: same; review F
of F from W. Orange Cove.

Review email from Josh Haney re: inter
district comparisons; conference with
counsel re: same; review pertinent statutory
school finance law; review tier 2 funding
analysis; review data sent by Tim Wolff re;
analysis; email Tim Wolff re: same;

Invoice # 39462

2,95 hrs

2.35 hrs

1.30 hrs

3.15 hrs

1.10 hrs

2.60 hrs

$516.25

$1057.50

$422.50

$551.25

$357.50

$455.00

Page 5



12/16/2011

12/19/2011

12/19/2011

12/19/2011

12/20/2011

12/20/2011

12/2172011

12/2172011

12/2172011

12/22/2011

12/22/2011

3102-01

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

conference with counsel re: same.

Review West Orange Cove opinion and
findings; review W. Pierce email.

Review pertinent statutory law on Texas
School Finance.

Status conference with atiorneys; review
correspondence.

Review articies sent by client; review
MALDEF petition; email to EC re: target
revenue; review articles on *Overcoming
Rodriquez” by B. Baker; Telephone
conference with O. Lopez re; serving as
expert; review property levels of member
district.

Review pertinent statutory law on Texas
School Finance; review data; telephone
conference with Tim Woiff re: same and
new analysis; format data; review data re:
district comparison based on revenue per
WADA,

Review property level of coalition districis;
review emails from B. Leslie and W. Pierce
re: Omar Lopez, email to W Pierce re:
MALDEF petition; review respons=; review
equal protection article from ;
ernail to re: san; begin
review of Deborah P.

Review data created by Tim Wolff; meeting
with counsel re: litigation strategy and data;
telephone conferencs with Tim Wolff re:
analysis.

Review L. Cook email; review W, Pierce
email; reply 1o same; conference with
attorneys re: status and strategy.

Meet with R. Gray and R. Gray IV to
discuss progress, data, legal issues; email to
. Colbert re: what the data shows: review
response; read 11th Circuit case.
‘Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data analysis; conference with counsel re:
data; create filing system re: same; email
Wayne Pierce re: 2012-2013 data and
district data at a $1.00 tax rate; telephone
conference with Paul Colbert re: data; email
data to Paul Colbert.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review P. Fraysetter email; review petition
of Thompson and Horton; review L. Cook
email; review D. Hinojosa email (2); reply

Invoice # 39462

0.60 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.90 hrs

2.95 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

$270.00

$192.50

$225.00

$942.50

$516.25

$455.00

$262.50

$450.00

$585.00

$210.00

$675.00

Page 6



12/2212011

1272272011

12/23R2011

12/26/2011

12/27/2011

12/27172011

12/28/2011

12/28/2011

12/28/2011

12/29/2011

1272972011

12/29/2011

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

to same (2); review data on ACT/SAT
scores; review W. Pierce email,

Confer with T. Hunter re: Texas School
Coalition lawsuit; telephone conferences
with District Clerk re; status of same; email
attorneys and client re: status of same.
Review emails from client re: Texas School
Coalition case and respond; review material
from experts.

Review W, Pierce email; reply to same.
Review T. Hunter email; reply to same;
correspond to D. Hinojosa via email re: 1/12
conference.

Review 5% interval data; conference with
counsel re:; same; email Tim Wolff re:
description of analysis; email Josh Haney
fe; maps.

Review data analysis; conference with R,
Gray IV re: same; review emails re: filings
and 1/12 conference.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data analysis; review emailed data from Tim
Wolff re: data at $1.00 tax rate; email same
to Toni Hunter and Paul Colbert: veview
data sent by Tim Wolff re: top an< bottom
percentiles; manipulate data ang print for
counsel.

Conference with R, Gray IV re: additional
analysis; conference with T. Hunter re:
Motion to Consolidztz; conference with T.
Hunter re: attoracy conference and
amending pleaclings.

Review emails from client and H. Daniels
re: facility data; respond; review materials
on weaghts and test scores; review bio
inforniation on H. Keller; confer with R.
Gray re: filing Motion to Consolidate and
Amended Petition; review David
Thompson’s petition; respond to client
emails re: same.

Conference with counsel re; data; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: analysis;
review email from Paul Colbert re: Deer
Park and Pasadena analysis; review and
reply to email from counsel re: data.
Review correspondence; conference with R.
Gray I'V re: data analysis; work re: data
analysis.

Review data from Equity Center; review

Invoice # 39462

0.25 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.15 hirs

0.25 nhrs

1.05 hrs

0.60 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.45 hrs

2.40 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.35 hrs

1.90 hrs

N

$162.50

$67.50

$112.50

$183.75

$270.00

$350.00

$202.50

$780.00

$192.50

$157.50

$617.50

Page 7



emails from P. Colbert re: data and respond;
begin drafting 1st Amended Petition and

Motion to Consolidate.

1213072011 REG Review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter
email; conference with attomeys re: Motion

to Consolidate and 1/12 conference.

TIMEREEPER RECAR

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
DMB  Becker, Douglas M. Partner
MLE  Bolen, Mames Paralegal
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TRH Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

328 hs @
0.50 hrs @
0.00 hrs @

3785 hrs @

28.90 hrs @
0.00 hrs @

100.10

Invoice # 39462

450.00 /hr
350.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
175.00 /o
325.00 fir
100.00 'hr

0.30 hrs

$135.00

$30,973.75

$14,782.50
$ 175.00
$ 000
$6,623.75
$9,392.50
$ 000

$30,973.75

Page &



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

January 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition
¢/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSIONAL SERVICES

01/03/2012 RGIV  Review email from Wayne Pierce re: data
meeting; review data sent by Tim Wolff:
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: meeting
times; review data; print hard cop of same
for T. Hunter; meeting at the Equity Center
re: data, case status, and litipation strategy’
review articles re: consequernices of the 4
billion dollar funding cut.

01/03/2012 REG Conference with R. Giay IV re: W, Pierce
conferences and dara-analysis; review M.
Trachtenberg einail; review status answer;
correspond to'W. Pierce via email re: same;
review message from D. Thompson; review
D. Hinoioza email; correspond to W. Pierce
via email re: same; conference with T.
Hunter re: data analysis and equal protection
issue; telephone call to D. Thompson - left
message; telephone conference with D,
Thompson re: status and strategy; review
W. Pierce email.

01/03/2012 TBH Review emails from L. Cook re: coalition
members and respond; review data by
precincts; work on Amended Petition and
Motion to Consolidate; attend meeting at
Equity Center re: facilities data; conference
with R. Gray re: meetings with other
attomeys and direction of case.

01/04/2012 RGIV ~ Review email from Wayne Pierce re:
plaintiff groups representative districts and

Tax ID No.:
Invoiced 39335-1
Our file; 3102
Billing tirough:

4,40 hrs

1.40 hrs

3.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
01/31/2012

$770.00

$630.00

$1072.50

$ 1750



01/04/2012

01/04/2012

01/04/2012

01/05/2012

01/05/2012

01/05/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

students.

Review email from Josh Haney re: 2.55 hrs
Inter-District Comparisons; print hard

copies to T. Hunter; review top and bottom

15, 20, and 25% data; review data and print

for T. Hunter; meeting with counsel re: ali

data review and how to proceed re: same,

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; 0.90 hrs
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.

Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email;

reply to same; review T. Hunter email; reply

to same; review D. Thompson email; reply

to same.

Work on Amended Petition and Motion to 2.30 hrs
Consolidate; review emails from Equity

Center and respond; review data provided

by Equity Center; confer with R. Gray IV

re: data.

Review email from Paul Colbert re: I&S tax 0.25 hrs
rate comparisons for Deer Park and

Pasadena and the rates effect on the overall

Revenue per WADA difference between the

districts; review and reply to email fiom

counsel re: inter-district data.

Review W, Pierce email: review M. 1.70 hrs
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.

Hunter re: correspondence-io Judge

Livingston and Motion to Consolidate;

review T. Hunter drait correspondence to

Judge Livingstoa r=! consolidation; review

M. Trachtenberg email; review P. Colbert

email; review Washington decision; review

D. Hinojosa email; conference with T.

Hunter ro:'same; review D. Thompson

email; review M. Trachtenberg email;

review and revise Motion to Consolidate;

conference with T. Hunter re: same: review

M. Trachtenberg emails {2); conference

with T. Hunter re: same.

Exchange several emails with other parties 4.60 hrs
re: letter to Judge Livingston and Motion to

Consolidate; respond; conference with R.

Gray re: same; draft letter to Judge

Livingston and send; draft Motion to

Consolidate and Circulate; edit Amended

Petition; telephone conference with D.

Hinojosa re: witnesses and discovery;

telephone conference with 8. Dahlberg re:

agreeing to letter and Motion; telephone

Invoice # 39835

$405.00

$747.50

$ 4375

$765.00

$1495.00

Page 2



01/06/2012

01/06/2012

01/08/2012

01/09/2012

01/09/2012

01/10/2012

01/10/2012

0171172012

0171142012
01/12/2012

310201

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

conference with Mary Ann Whitelar re: new
Plaintiff; telephone conference with Pete
Johnson, new Plaintiff, telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: email
communications; email to W.Pierce re:
Plaintiff.

Review email from Paul Colbert re: State
share of Facilities Spending; print same for
T. Hunter; review Washington news article
re: Washington Supreme Court’s decision.
Finalize correspondence to Judge
Livingston; conference with T. Hunter re; L.
Mock involvement; review email re:
correspondence to Judge Livingston.
Review updated analysis.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation requests 1, 2, and 3 and revisions
to all; review email from Paul Colbert re;
facilities funding trends by the state; review
email from Wayne Pierce re: state share of
facilities funding; review and reply to email
from Tim Wolff re; litigation request 38.
Review articles emailed by B. Lesiey and
W. Pierce; review facilities data provided by
P. Coleman; finalize draft of Amended
Petition and circulate fro comment;
conference with R. Gray re: Motion to
Consolidate; review jaw joumal article on
adequacy v. equity; Teview article by B.
Baker on money 1hatters; review email on
Thursday meeting.

Review and r=vise amended petition;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
D. Hinojasa email; reply to same.
Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
emails; review documents sent by Equity
Center.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation request 002B; review and print
litigation request 001B.

Review and revise amended petition.
Review Plaintiff's First Amended Original
Petition; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: litigation requests; review funding
gaps of districts within counties; review
emails from Tim Wolff re: litigation
requests 001C and 002B; forward same to
T. Hunter and Paul Colbert; review
litigation request 002B re: no overlap tables.

Invoice # 39835

0.45 hrs

0.55 hrs

0.25 hrs
1.60 hrs

4.80 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.85 hrs

0.50 hrs
3.10 hrs

$ 7875

$247.50

$112.50

$280.00

$1560.00

$112.50

$ 97.50

$148.75

$225.00
$542.50

Page '}



01/12/2012

01/12/2012

01/13/2012

01/13/2012

01/13/2012

01/16/2012

01/16/2012

01/16/2012

01/17/2012

01/17/2012

01/17/2012

310201

TBH

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

Conference with T. Hunter re: amended
pleading; review L. Cook email; conference
with T. Hunter re; status and data; telephone
call to A. Kauffman - left message.

Contact 2 taxpayer Plaintiffs; draft
consulting contract for Equity Center; meet
with W.Pierce and R. Freeman to go over
Plaintiff district; conference with R. Gray
re: meeting with D). Hinojisa and experts;
review questionnaires filled out by potential
Plaintiff districts.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
clarification on litigation request 002B;
meeting with MALDEF re: case status.
Conference with T. Hunter, D. Hinojosa, R,
Gray IV and MALDEEF staff re; status,
strategy and experts.

Prepare for meeting with MALDEF; meet
with MALDEF attomeys.

Email David Hinojosa re: data spreadshee:s;
conference with counsel re: same:
conference with counsel re: facilities
funding expert; review and make list of
David Thompson’s Below Averape Wealth
Level Districts; review Bruce Baker's blog.
Conference with T. Hunter re. school
faculty study; conference with R. Gray IV
re: data from D. Hinojosa; begin preparation
for 1/18 conference oi attorneys; review
email re; See of Siate Advisory re: name;
conference with T. Hunter re: same and
solutions to-same.

Review aticies sent by Equity Center;
Telephoi< conference with W. Pierce re:
S0S e ection of coalition name; conference
with R. Gray re: same; respond to emails
trom W. Pierce re: facilities study; review
B. Baker materials.

Review and reply to email from counsel re;
litigation common interest agreement and
proposed pre-trial exhibits; review email
from David Hinojosa re: data spreadshests;
review litigation common interest
agreement and proposed pre-trial exhibits;
meeting with counsel re; same.

Review data re: SAT/ACT comparisons
based on wealth range.

Review W. Pierce email; review J. Tumer
email; review D. Thompson email; review

Invoice # 39835

0.65 hrs

3.00 hrs

2.30 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.90 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.60 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.05 hrs

0.35 hrs

1.40 hrs

$292.50

$975.00

$402.50

$787.50

$617.50

$218.75

$270.00

$650.00

$183.75

$ 61.25

$630.00

Page 4



01/17/2012

01/18/2012

01/18/2012

01/18/2012

01/19/2012

01/19/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

draft Litigation Common Interest
Agreement; review draft proposed pre-trial
agreements; reply to J, Tumner email; review
D Hinojosa email; conference with
attomeys re: preparation for 1/18 conference
and trial preparation; review correspondence
assigning case to Judge Dietz.

Review email from J. Turner and attached
documents; finish reviewing B. Baker
documents; conference with R. Gray and R.
Gray IV, telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: Texas Taxpayer and Reesearch
Organizations; review Select Committee
Reports.

Conference with counsel re: needed data;
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation requests 002B, 4, 5, 6, and 7,
review agenda for lawyers meeting; lawyers
meeting; meeting with Moak/Casey.
Review W. Pierce email; conference with 2.
Gray IV re: data analysis; reply to W. Pieice
email; prepare for 1/18 conference; review
W. Pierce email; conference with 8. Gray
IV re: exhibits; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; telephone call to 5. Dahlberg
- left message; telephone zailto B. Echols
re: Judge Dietz assignmeni and scheduling;
telephone call to 8. Danlberg - left message;
conference with attomeys re: status, experts,
strategy, issues 4nd schedule; review L.
Cook email; reply to same; conference with
attomeys anu M. Casey re: expert
involvement.

Prepare for meeting of attomeys; meet with
attoraeys; review letter from J. Livingston;
meet with Moak and Casey; conference with
R. Gray.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
meeting on case strategy and experts;
meeting with counsel re: data requests;
review email from Wayne Pierce re: article;
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation requests 8 and 9; organize data,
articles, reports, etc into folders; conference
with legal assistant re: same; review school
finance caselaw.

Conference with R. Gray IV re: additional
analysis; review email correspondence;
review W. Pierce emails {2) re: additional

Invoice # 39835

2.20 hrs

6.65 hrs

7.00 hrs

5.00 hrs

1.95 hrs

0.40 hrs

$715.00

$1163.75

$3150.00

$1625.00

$341.25

$180.00

Page 5



01/20/2012

01/20/2012

01/23/2012

01/23/2012

01/23/2012

01/24/2012

01/24/2012

01/24/2012

01/25/2012

310201

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

RGIV

districts; conference with S. Jennings re:
updating list.
Review and reply to email from counsel re:

meeting.
Review additional data analysis; review W,
Pierce email; review email.

Review emails from counsel and John
Tumer re: pretrial agreements; review email
and analysis from Josh Haney re:
inter-district comparisons; review email and
data from Tim Wolff; meeting with counsel
re: case status. case strategy, experts, and
data; review email from counsel re; all
petitions filed, Texas Tribune article,
facilities standards.

Review 1. Tumer emails (2); conferences
{2} with T. Hunter re: same; review W,
Pierce email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review message from B. Wood;
review D. Hinojosa email; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: litigation
status; review D. Hinojosa email; review
States answer to MALDEF petitioy;
conference with attomeys re: siauus, exerts
and strategy.

Review emails from W. Pierce and respond;
prepare for telephone conicrence with B.
Baker; telephone confercnce with B. Baker
re: consulting; telechone conference with L.
Moak re: meetirg, meet with R. Gray and R.
Gray IV re: experts and data; review and
revise Comnion Intent Agreement and
Pre-Trial & yeements; review proposed
scheduling order; look for facility standards;
review article by B. Baker on equity issues
in New York; review voice mail from
potential taxpayer Plaintiff,

Review Original Petitions of plaintiffs; draft
summary memmorandum for counsel re:
plaintiffs lawsuits; review litigation request
001C; print and organize same.

Review schedule of conferences: review W,
Pierce email.

Revise amended petition; review suggested
edits from W. Pierce.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
revenue per WADA for Bryan and College
Station ISD; review data re: same; review,
format, and print litigation request 002B,

Invoice # 39835

0.10 hrs

0.25 hrs

3.60 hrs

2.15 hrs

5.60 hrs

4.45 hrs

0.20 hrs

4,60 hrs

5.05 hrs

$ 1750

$112.50

$630.00

$967.50

$1820.00

$778.75

$ 90.00

$1495.00

$883.75

Page ¢



01/25/2012

01/25/2012

01/25/2012

01/26/2012

01/26/2012

01/27/2012

3102-01

REG

LVS

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

003C, 004 A, 005A, 006A, and 007A,;
review First Amended Petition; conference
with counsel re: same; conference with
counsel re: data for the second year of the
current biennium; telephone conference
with Tim Wolff re: same; email counsel re:
same; review haynes and boon petition and
summarize plaintiffs names within,
Correspond to A. Kauffman re: equal
protection claim; review draft amended
pleading; conference with T. Hunter re:
same; review request for disclosure;
conference with T. Hunter re: same:
conference with R. Gray IV re: database
issues; review B. Wood text; reply to same;
correspond to B. Wood and D. Ray via
email re: amended petition.

Do final edits on amended petition and file;
review emails from W. Pierce: review
summary of Plaintiff districts and edit;
conference with L. Moak; conference wiil
R. Gray.

Prepare revised Plaintiff's 1st Amended
POP per T. Hunter; review docainent for
comment as to consistency; email to Hunter
re: same; second revision of 2ocument per
Hunter; third revisions per Hunter; make
final corrections; efile with court.

Review date re: top 1 5%/Bottom 15%
average revenur, par WADA and average
ATR ranked by Wealth; conference with
counsel re: same; conference with counsel
re: data meeting; review data re:
superintendent questionnaire responses and
data rzgarding their districts.

Conference with T. Hunter re: First
Amended POP; make notes as to revisions
on future petitions (n/c); calendar due date
for Plaintiff responses to RFD (n/c); prepare
Request for Disclosure to Defendants;
conference with T. Hunter re: revisions and
filing of Corrected First Amended POP;
efile Corrected First Amended with courts.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
accountability ratings; review and print
litigation requests 00BA and 009A;
telephone conference with Josh Haney re:
inter-district comparisons of our taxpayer
plaintiff’s districts; email counsel re: same;

Invoice # 39835

0.80 hrs

3,70 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.95 hrs

0.60 hrs

1.60 hrs

$360.00

$1202.50

NiIC

$166.25

N/IC

$280.00

Page 7



01/27/2012
01/27/2012

01/29/2012

01/29/2012

01/30/2012

01/30/2012

01/30/2012

01/30/2012

01/31/2012

01/31/2012

01/31/2012

3102-01

RGIV

LVvS

RGIV

review email from Tim Wolff re:
accountability ratings; complete spreadsheet
for T. Hunter re: same; organize all data;
draft sununary re: same,

Conference with R. Gray IV re: data.

Email parties identified by T. Hunter as to
meeting on Febmary 1, 2012 re: school
finance.

Telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
1/29 conference and 1/30 conference;
review T. Hunter email.

Prepare for presentation at Equity Center
meeting; attend meeting and speak;
conference with M. Rebell and L. Moak.
Review counties ranked by revenue per
WADA and counties ranked by wealth gaps:
meeting with Paui Celbert re: data and case
status; conference with counsel re: same;
email Paul Colbert most recent data.
Conference with litigation committee;
conference with coalition members;
conference with T. Hunter re; "To Do List™;
conference with P. Colbert re; dat4 cnalysis;
review R. Freeman email; conferviice with
W. Pierce, R. Freeman and T. Hunter re:
trial team issues; review b4, RBebill paper.
Attend meeting of Litigation Committee,
attend Coalition meefing; meet with P.
Colbert re: data; me=r with R, Gray, W.
Pierce, R. Freepian re: counsel status;
telephone conference with P.Colbert re:

Conference with T. Hunter re: meeting; text
to R. Gray IV re: same,

Revicw all data re: prepare for meeting with
counsel; review article from Paul Colbert re;
Houston Chronicle Kilday Hart; review and
respond to email from counsel re; Alief ISD
rating; meeting with counsel re: all data.
Review article re: funding; correspond to B.
Wood via email re: status; conference with
T. Hunter re: data analysis; review B, Wood
email; reply to same; conference with R.
Gray IV and T. Hunter re: data and
reporting; review B. Wood email; reply to
same; review article re: finance system;
review L. Cook email.

Correlate district data with superintendent
answer to questionnaire; telephone

Invoice # 39835

0.15 brs
0.10 hrs

0.35 hrs

2.50 hrs

3.80 hrs

3.30 his

4.30 hrs

0.05 hrs

3.25 hrs

2.15 hrs

3.00 hrs

$ 67.50
N/C

$157.50

$812.50

$665.00

$1485.00

$1397.50

N/C

$568.75

$967.50

$975.00

Page §



0173172012 LVS

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

conference with B. Baker re: various things;

review emails from W. Pierce and

and attached articles; conference
with C. Jacob re: blog search; conference

with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re: data.

Final Request for Disclosure; prepare fax

cover to 8. Dahlberg,

REG IT1, Richard E. Gray Partner 2670 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 49.65 hrs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 5310 hs @
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 129.45

3102-01 Invoice # 39835

0.10 hrs

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 fhs
100.00 suir

N/C

$37.961.25

$12,015.00
$8,688.75
$17,257.50

$ 0.00

$37,961.25

Page 9



GRAY & BECKER, P.C,

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

February 29, 2012
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 43087-1 REG
Our filett: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing tiirough: 02/29/2012

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSIONAL SERVICES

02/01/2012 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: litigation 0.75 hrs $131.25
request 005A and 008A; draft questions for
data meeting; email same to counsel for
review; review inter-district comparisons re:
addresses of those living in poor schiool

districts.
02/01/2012 RGIV ~ Meeting at Equity Center re; data. 3.00 hrs $525.00
02/01/2012 REG Review M. Trachtenberg @mail; conference 2.75 hrs $1237.50

with T. Hunter re: 2/1 conterence;
conference with W. Picrce, R. Freeman, C.
Aki, P. Colbert, T. Hunter, R. Gray IV, T.
Wolff and H. Dinicls re: data analysis and
exhibits.
02/01/2012 TBH Email to K. Cruse; telephone conference 3.90 hrs $1267.50
with Cruse, left message; conference with
R. Gray re: counsel responsibilities; draft
letter ‘o B. Baker; attend meeting on data at

Equity Center.

02/01/2012 LVS Final letter to B. Baker per T. Hunter's 0.15 hrs N/C
nstructions.

02/01/2012 CM1 Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinance101) 9.00 hrs $1260.00

to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.
02/02/2012 RGIV  Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 0.80 hrs $140.00
data requests; review email from counsel re:
facilities standards; telephone conference
with Wayne Pierce re: same.
02/02,2012 REG Review draft scheduling order; conference 0.50 hrs $225.00
with T. Hunter re: same and 2/2 conference



02/02/2012

02/02/2012

02/03/2012

02/03/2012

02/03/2012

02/04/201 2

02/06/2012

02/06/2012

02/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SEJ

call; review correspondence to B. Baker;
review emails,
Telephone conference with D. Thompson
re: designation of districts and experts;
prepare for telephone conference with
attorneys; review articles on equity from
W .Pierce.
Review Common Interest Agreement,
review email from B. Wood and respond.
Review article by John Kuhn re: inequity in
schoo! funding; conference with counsel re:
same; bi-weekly telephone conference with
all plaintiffs re: scheduling order, pretrial
agreements, consolidation/coordination,
common interest agreement, and experts;
review Education Week blog; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data request.
Conference with R. Gray IV re: additional
data analysis; conference with R. Gray IV
re: conference call results; review draft Joint
Motion for Pre-Trial Conference;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
J. Tumer email; review D. Thompson email;
review T. Hunter emails (2).
Telephone conference with all piaintiff
attomeys re: scheduling cenference; joint
proposed scheduling ordei;and other
matters.
Review emails re: sciicduling order and
Motion for Statws Conference: reveiw

email with attached article.
Review emai! iiom Wayne Pierce re:
Facilities Standards; review statutory law re:
same; review and reply to email from
counszlre: updated data.
Revisw article re: Finland schools; review
U. Hinojosa email; review P. Fraissinet
zmail; conference with T. Hunter re: Motion
for Pre-Trial Conference; review emails re:
scheduling conference; review D. Hinojosa
email; conference with T. Hunter re: setting
hearing for status conference; review J.
Turner email; review D. Thompson email;
review D). Hinojosa email; review T. Hunter
emails (3) re: scheduling; review P,
Fraissinet email.
Confer with T. Hunter re: finalizing Joint
Motion for Scheduling Conference; confer
with T. Hunter re: revisions to Motion;

Invoice # 40087

1.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

3.10 ars

0.75 brs

1.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.05 hrs

0.95 hrs

1.50 hrs

$455.00

$ 65.00

$542.50

$337.50

$455.00

$225.00

$358.75

$427.50

$150.00



02/06/2012

02/06/2012

02/07/2012

02/07/2012

02/07/2012

02/08/2012

310204

CMJ

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

revise and finalize Motion; efile and serve
Motion; email counsel re: same; prepare
letter to Judge Dietz re: same.

Respond to email from W. Pierce re:
amount of time before final opinion; review
suggested edits to proposed pre trial
schedule; make and send our edits and
suggestions; telephone conference with
H.Keller; finalize and file motion for
scheduling conference; telephone
conference with L. Moak; coordinate
schedules for possible hearing.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re;
Texas school finance.

Review email from Josh Haney re:
inter-district comparisons; forward email to
counsel and Paul Colbert; review emails
amongst all plaintiff groups re: scheduling
conference motion and proposed scheduliug
order; review email from Tim Wolff e,
updated data; reply to email from Yosi
Haney re: inter-district comparison;
summarize all current data for counsel;
review all current data; telcphone
conference with Tim Woliire: litigation
request 010 and 011.

Review D. Thompscn email; conference
with B. Wood re; status, strategy and
working relationship; conference with T,
Hunter re: statuy; review T. Hunter email re:
status conlerence; correspond to team re:
status caiis; correspond to parties via emai}
re: stalus; review emails re: scheduling
corference; review material provided by D.
Hinojosa.

Telephone conference with Juge Dietz's
office re: scheduling hearing; conference
with R. Gray re: status updates with B.
Wood; conference with Richard Gray re;
data; review emails from attorneys on other
cases and respond.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
current data summary and data to send to
Bruce Baker; review email from Wayne
Pierce re: updated school finance litigation
page; review content re: same; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data

Invoice # 40087

1.00 hrs

8.50 hrs

3.35 hrs

2.90 hrs

0.40 hrs

3.20 hrs

$325.00

$1190.00

$586.25

$1305.00

$130.00

$560.00

FPoage 3



02/08/2012

02/08/2012

02/09/2012

02/09/2012

02/09/2012

02/10/2012

02/10/2012

02/10/2012

02/10/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

REG

CMJ

requests; review email from John Tumner re:

revised proposed scheduling order; review

email from David Hinojosa re:

Commissioner Scott’s remarks; draft letter

to inter-district comparison poor district

home owners re: possible testimony.

Review W. Pierce email; correspond to 0.60 hrs
parties via email re: workshop; conference

with R, Gray IV re: comrespondence to

property owners; conference with R. Gray

IV re: correspondence to B. Baker; review J.

Tumer email re: scheduling order; review R.

Freeman email and article,

Review data to send to B. Baker; review 1.00 hrs
edited proposed scheduling order; review

dates for telephone conference with

coalition attomeys.

Review emai! from Lauren Cook re: 0.50 hrs
STARR test and passing results; review

email from counsel re: data to send to Brucs

Baker and proposed scheduling order;

review proposed scheduling order; review

email from Tim Wolff re: updated#ngation

request 003E; forward same tocounsel and

Paul Colbert; review data to send to Bruce

Baker and begin compiling.

Review emails re: scheduling order; reply to 0.50 hrs
same; review correspondence from L.

Mock; review P. Fraissinet email re;

scheduling orde:.

Review edits to pre-trial agreements; review 0.20 hrs
new data.

Review lelter to inter-district comparison 1.90 hrs

homeowiicrs; conference with legal assistant

re: sarag; conference with legal assistant re:

saine; comprise and organize data emails to

Biuce Baker; email same to counsel re;

double checking information to be sent.

Review T. Hunter email; review P. 1.00 hrs
Fraissinet email; review D. Thompson

email; status review with team attomeys;

telephone conference with T. Hunter re:

scheduling order.

Telephone conference with plaintiff 0.80 hrs
attorneys re: scheduling, experts, testing,

pre-trial hearing.

Review Dr. Baker's blog {schoolfinancel01) 1.00 hrs
to determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Invoice # 40087

$270.00

$325.00

$ 87.50

$225.00

$ 65.00

$332.50

$450.00

$260.00

$140.00

Page 4



02/10/2012

02/12/2012
02/13/2012
02/13/2012

02/13/2012

02/13/2012

02/16/2012

02/16/2012

02/16/2012

02/1712012

02/17/2012

02/20/2012

3102-01

CMJ

RGIV

SEJ

CMJ

RGIV

REG

CMI

RGIV

RGIV

Texas school finance.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.

Email data to Bruce Baker.

Review D. Hinojosa email.

Review email from T. Hunter re: meeting
with K. Cruz and B. Wood; telephone
conference with Cathy, B. Wood's office re:
same; email T. Hunter re: same.

Telephone conference with John Hankason,
school board attomey re: re:
litigation status.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinance101)
to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.

Review emails from Wayne Pierce and Papi
Colbert re: updated and resorted data; prini
same; conference with legal assistant re.
letter to home owners.

Correspond to T. Hunter and B. Weand via
email re: status; review message Irom D.
Thompson; telephone conference with D.
Thompson re; commitmerni irom Meek
Casey and status; correspond to Texas
Taxpayer/Student Faiivess Coalition via
email re: same; reviow W. Pierce email;
review T, Huntec email.

Review Dr. Beker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determine if hie has written anything that
may be usen to impeach his testimony re:
Texas sciwool finance.

Revise and finalize letters to lower wealth
homezowners in district comparisons;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review and reply to email from Josh Haney
re: Van-Grand Saline inter-district
comparison.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); reply to
same; conference with T. Hunter re:
conference call; review I. Turner email;
review L. Cook email with article on school
finance; review W. Pierce email; review
articie by various potential experts; review
W. Pierce email.

Review email from Mark Trachtenberg re:
final proposed scheduling order: review

Invoice # 40087

0.75 hrs

0.15 hrs
0.15 hrs
0.25 hrs

0.10 hrs

4.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.65 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

$105.00

$ 2625
$ 67.50
N/IC

$ 32,50

$560.00

$ 87.50

$292.50

$280.00

$288.75

$630.00

$ 52.50

Page 5



02/20/2012

02/20/2012

02/20/2012

02/21/2012

02/21/2012

02/22/2012

02/22/2012

3102-01

SEJ

CMJ

RGIV

RGIV

REG

same; review and organize file.

Review article re: potential expent; review 0.60 hrs
M. Trachtenberg email; correspond to T.

Hunter via email re: same; conference with

S. Jennings re; B. Wood call.

Telephone conference with Cathy, Buck 0.20 hrs
Wood's office, re: meeting with Keith Cruz

on February 23rd; email T, Hunter re: Mr.

Wood's change of plans and attendance at

the meeting; telephone conference with

Cathy re: responses to Request for

Disclosures 2/27/12; confer with R. Gray re:

same.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 2.00 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance.

Review emails re: proposed scheduling 0.35 hrs
order and meeting with the State’ review

email from Josh Haney re:

Hillsboro-Miiford inter-district comparizon.

Telephone conference with S. Rosen Qudge 2.70 hrs
Dietz) re: timing of conference; corrzspond

to all parties via email re: same: roview S.

Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg

email; reply to same; revicw D). Thompson

email; review D. Hinojosa email; review D.

Hinojosa email; review . Thompson email;

telephone conferencz with S. Rosen re:

pre-irial hearingdates; correspond to

attomeys via email re: same; review M.

Trachtenberg email; review D. Thompson

email; review D. Hinojosa email; review D.

Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email;

review 'W. Pierce email; reply to same;

coirespond te attorneys via email re:

ore-trial; review 8. Dahlberg emails (2);

reply to same; review M. Trachtenberg

email; review P. Fraissinet email; review D

.Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson

email.

Review emails re: scheduling conference 0.40 hrs
with Judge Dietz; calendar same.

Review emails re: status conference; reply 2.10 hrs

to same; telephone cali to S. Rosen - left
message; telephone conference with S.
Rosen re: status conference; correspond to
all attorneys via email re: same; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review M.

Invoice # 40087

$270.00

N/IC

$280.00

$ 61.25

$1215.00

$ 70.00

$945.00

Page 6



02/22/2012

02/23/2012

02/23/2012

02/23£2012

02/23/2012

310201

TBH

RGIV

TBH

Trachtenberg email; review S. Dahlberg
email; review D. Hinojosa emails (2).
review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;
review D. Thompson emails (2); review M.
Trachtenberg email; telephone conference
with S. Rosen re: request for petitions;
correspond to attorneys via email re: court's
request; review D. Thompson email; review
B. Wood text messages (2); reply to same
(2); review D. Thompson email.

Review emails re: scheduling pre-trial
hearing with Judge and respond.

Read and review school finance caselaw;
conference with legal assistant re:
inter-district compatison poor homeowners;
review emails from plaintiff's re: meeting
and 5th lawsuit being filed; review email
from counsel re: Equity Center request;
summarize same.

Review various emails re: scheduling;
conference with T. Hunter re: coordinating
same; review email re: petition; review S.
Rosen reply; review D. Thompson eniail;
review M. Trachtenberg email: cciiespond
to S, Dahlberg via email re; 3/2 conference;
review D. Thompson email; reply to same;
review D. Thompson emaii-re: potential
suit; reply to same; review D. Ray email;
review S. Dahlberg suiail; review D.
Hinojosa email; seview D. Thompson email;
conference with T. Hunter re: potential
expert and scheduling; conference with B.
Wood re: ¢tstus; review $. Dahlberg email;
reply to saine; review D. Thompson email
re; adcitional suit; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same.

Lonfer with T. Hunter re: Notice of
Pre-Trial Conference:; email all counsel re:
same; telephone conference with Court
Administrator's office re: same; confer with
T. Hunter re: Notice set on Judge’s personal
docket; email Stacy Rosen, Judge Dietz's
Court Operations Officer, Plaintiffs' live
pleading in Word format.

Frepare for meeting with K. Cruse; meet
with K. Cruse re: testing; conference with
B. Wood and R. Gray; prepare for telephone
conference with B. Baker, telephone
conference with W. Pierce re discovery;

Invoice # 40087

1.85 hrs

0.75 hrs

3.90 hrs

$ 65.00

$612.50

$832.50

KiC

$1267.50

Page 7



02/23/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/25/2012

3102-01

CMI

RGIV

SEJ

CMI

CMJ

REG

telephone conference with S. Dalberg re:

extensions for response to RFD; review and

respond to various email from plaintiff

attorneys re: scheduling meeting with state

and new lawsuit; review articles sent by W,

Pierce.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 2.00 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance.

Review email and articles from Wayne 1.2Q hrs
Pierce re: New Jersey school finance and

5th texas lawsuit; find contact information

and call Chris Diamond re: 5th school

finance suit; conference with legal assistant

re: emailing same to Wayne Pierce and Ray

Freeman.

Review W, Pierce email; review articles re; 0.90 hrs
additional suit; review D, Thompson email:

review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review T.

Hunter email; conference with S. Jennings

re: B. Baker trip.

Confer with T. Hunter re: meeting »nih 0.75 hrs
Bruce Baker; research flights and hotels for

meeting; email B. Baker re: same; email W.

Pierce re: Plea in Intervention'of the

Efficiency Intervenors in e Fort Bend ISD,

et al. v. Robert Scott, et 24. suit; email client

letter from counsel r2: extending deadlines

to respond to requests for disclosures.

Telephone conference with B. Baker; 4.00 hrs
review 5th lawsuit; conference with R. Gray

re: schedu'e four Baker's visit; conference

with R. Gray re: 5th lawsuit; review 5th

lawsuys; review Imagki and Reschovsky

articles on School Finance Reform in Texas;

review R. Reich article on Adequate v.

iZqual Education; review New York Times

article on Education Group Between Rich

and Poor.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 1.50 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 2.00 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance,

Analysis of new suit; review 0.65 hrs

Invoice # 40087

$280.00

$210.00

$405.00

NiIC

$1300.00

$210.00

$280.00

$292.50

Page 8



0212672012

02/27/2012

02/27/2012

02/21;2012

02/27/2012

02/28/2012

02/28/2012

3102-01

RGIV

CM]

RGIV

email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; review D. Thompson email (2); reply
to same (2).

Review report of L. Darling-Hammond
from Colorado suit; review report of W.S.
Burnett on Pre-School Education from
Colorado suit; review report of C. Belfield
on Fiscal and Social Burden of Inadequate
Education on Colorado from Colorado suit.
Review emails re: intervention lawsuit,
Review email re: B. Baker conference; reply
to same; review ernails re: intervention;
conference with T. Hunter re: securing
COnsSensus re: new answer to intervention;
review information re: B. Baker conference;
conference with T. Hunter re: intervention
and complication of new suit.

Telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:
5th lawsuit and experts; conference with R
Gray re: same; Telephone conference with
D. Thompson re: 5th lawsuit; review eraails
from W .Pierce and respond; review atticle
on state testing; conference with C_Jacobs
re: blogs and twitters of B. Baker, review B.
Baker's blog.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to
determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach s testimony re:
Texas school finane::

Review emails rs: agenda for meeting with
the State; review articles re: affect of budget
cuts; review inter-district comparison of
Deer Park'ana Pasadena; review emails re:
scheduling order and pre-trial agreements;
review same; review district performance
data; format and print same.

Conference with T. Hunter re: conference
with state; work re: proposed scheduling
order; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same; correspond to W. Pierce via email
1e: tax/groundwater issue; review emails re;
pre-trial schedule and pre-trial conference;
review W. Pierce email; review D. Hincjosa
email; review J. Tumner email; review draft
pre-trial agreernents; review draft
scheduling order; conference with T. Hunter
1e: same; review M. Trachtenberg emails
{2}, review D. Thompson email; review P.
Fraissinet email.

Invoice # 40087

1.50 hrs

0.10 ars

073 hrs

1.40 hrs

3.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

1.55 hrs

$487.50

$ 1750

$337.50

$455.00

$420.00

$288.75

$697.50

Page @



02/28/2012 TBH

02/28/2012 RGIV

02/29/2012 REG

TINIEREEPER RECAD

Review several email between Plaintiffs 1.60 hrs
attomneys re: proposed pre-trial schedule and

pre-trial agreement; conference with R.

Gray and B. Wood re: same; review articles

by M. Rebell re: equal education rights.

Review emails from plaintiff's re: meeting 1.00 hrs
with State and agenda; telephone conference

with Tim Wolff re: litigation request 012A;

review email from counsel re: facilities

SUrveys; review same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review M. 0.53 brs
Trachtenberg email; review draft scheduling

order.

REG M, Richard E. Gray Partner 2425 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 29.45 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 2300 hs @ 325.00 Mmr
CMI Jacobs, Craig 3575 hs @ 140.00 /hr
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 1.50 his @ 100.00 /hr
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
Fee Recap Totals 113.95

3102-01 Invoice # 40087

$520.00

$175.00

$225.00

$28,696.25

$10,912.50
$5,153.75
$7,475.00
$5,005.00
$ 150.00
$ 0.00

$28,696.25

Page 10



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.006!

March 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Stadent Faimess Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSIONAL SERVICES
03/0172012 RGIV  Review email from Tim Wolff re: Litigation
Request 012B; format and print same;
review emails from Plaintiff's counsel re
pretrial agreements; review litigation
request 012B; review and respond o email
from counsel re: data request 1238,
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
top and bottom 15% of liigation request
012B; conference with counsel re:
inter-district comparisons; review data sheet
re: contiguous distiicts; telephone
conference with losh Haney re: same.
03/01/2012 REG Review J. Turrer email; review D.
Thompson cmail; review J. Tumer email;
review drafi common interest agreement;
confevence with T. Hunter re: same.
03/01/2012 SEJ Confer with T, Hunter re: hotel
arrangements for B. Baker; research
availability; confer with T. Hunter re: same;
review emails from T. Hunter and W. Pierce
re: TASA Daily; telephone conference with
editor of TASA Daily re: amended petition;
email editor re: same.
03/02/2012 RGIV  Review and reply to email from Paul
Colbert re: contiguous districts data; review
and reply to email from Tim Wolif re:
litigation request 01 2C; review contiguous
district data and plaintiff districts; build
spreadsheet re: same; telephone conference
with Josh Haney re: same and surveys;

Tax ID No.:

Invoice#: 43154-1

Qur files:

Billing through:

2.70 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

2.30 hrs

74-2427406

REG
00001

03/31/2012

$472.50

$225.00

$402.50



03/02/2012

03/05/2012

03/05/2012

03/05/2012

03/06/2012

03/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

REG

review article re: affect of budget cuts on
teachers and students; conference with
counsel re: surveys and data; review and
reply to email from Josh Haney re: revised
SUIVEYs.

Conference with T. Hunter and B. Wood re:
372 conference with attorneys for State;
conference with Plaintiff and Defense
attorneys re: scheduling procedure; review
message form D. Thompson; review
message from M. Hurley re; financial
accountability; telephone conference with
M. Hurley re: white paper; conference with
T. Hunter re: conclusion of conference.
Review email from counsel re; surveys;
forward same to Josh Haney re: revisions to
same; telephone conference with Equity
Center re: surveys; emails Josh Haney re:
same; Telephone conference with Josh
Haney re: surveys; review emails from
plaintiff's re: revised scheduling order ana
pre-trial agreements.

Review emails; review scheduling Zdraft)
order; conference with T. Hunter re: L.
Moak conference; review draft common
interest agreement; confezence with T.
Hunter re; facilities survey; review I. Hurley
email; conference with- T. Hunter re: same;
review J. Tumer eriail; conference with T.
Hunter re: same’ review J. Turner email:
review D. Hinojosa email; review T. Hunter
email re: Moiion to Consolidate; review I.
Tumer emasl; reply to T. Hunter email;
review D. Hinojosa email.

Breakcast meeting with L. Moak;
conference with R. Gray; review facilities
survey and comment; review amended
proposed scheduling order and pre-trial
agreements; draft update for Coalition
members; edit proposed Motion to
Consolidate.

Review proposed scheduling order and
pre-trial agreements; conference with
counsel re: trial date; review emails re:
consolidation agreement; create and format
data request for counsel re: Harris County.
Conference with R. Gray IV re: revised
schedule; review draft Motion to
Consolidate; conference with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 40154

3.25 his

0.85 hrs

1.30 hrs

3.40 hrs

1.35 hrs

0.80 hrs

$1462.50

$148.75

$585.00

$1105.00

$236.25

$360.00

Page 2



03/06/2012

03/07/2012

03/07/2012

03/07/2012

(3/07/2012

03/08/2012

03/08/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

same; review emails re: scheduling order;

review J. Turner email re: scheduling order;

review additional emails re: scheduling

order and pretrial agreement; review

message re: J. Hammerlin conversation re:

constricting costs.

Conference with R. Gray and D. Ray re: 2.50 hrs
Motion to Consolidate; email to Facilities

expert; telephone conference with W. Pierce

re: superintendent witness and other

matters, comment on proposed pre-trial

schedule and pre-trial agreement; review

comments from D. Hinojosa; telephone

conference with J. Hammerlan re: cost of

facilities; review article on relationship of

facilities to performance.

Review and reformat data for counsel; print 4.40 hrs
same; review emails re: schsduling order

and pre-trial agreements.

Review M. Hurley email; reply to same; 0.40 hrs
review material re; B. Baker prior

testimony.

Review email from W. Pierce re: 1noeting 3.10 hrs

with A. Cortez; emails to D. Hingjosa re:

same; reply to W. Pierce re: meeting; read

articles on facilities; search Vor facilities

expert; review edits to update to coalition

members; email to B. Raker re: March 12;

telephone conference with A, Brownson re:

meeting with B/ Baker.

Attempt to locate Martin Eugene Sheets via 0.20 hrs
telephone conference with Texas Tech

personnel, ran anywho.com searches;

conference with T. Hunter; email address

and phone number found,

Review emails and attachments re: proposed 0.75 hrs
motion to consolidate, proposed pre-trial

agreements, and proposed scheduling order;

finalize data for counsel; review email from

Wayne Pierce re: School Business Daily.

Review C. Nickel email; conference with T. 1.40 hrs
Hunter re: scheduling conference; review J.

Tumer email; review D. Hinojosa email,

review J. Tumer email; conference with T.

Hunter re: same; review J. Turner email;

review J. Tumer email; telephone

conference with M. Hurley re: white paper

preparation; conference with T. Hunter re:

status.

Invoice # 40154

$812.50

$770.00

$180.00

$1007.50

N/C

$131.25

$630.00

Page 3



03/08/2012

03/08/2012

03/08/2012

03/08/2012

03/05/2012

03/09/2012

03/09/2012

03/12/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

MLB

LVS

RGIV

RGIV

Conference with T. Hunter re: change of 0.20 hrs
hotel arrangements for Dr. Baker; email Dr.

Baker re: same.

Review email from W. Pierce and respond,; 3.00 hrs
research on facilities and adequate

education; telephone conference with G.

Sheets re: facilities; review revised

scheduling order and pre-trial agreements;

email to J. Turner re: same; review email

from I. Turner on Motion to Consolidate;

review J. Tumer’s edits to Motion to

Consolidate and respond; review

superintendent surveys and begin making a

list of potential witnesses; telephone

conference with M. Hurley re:

accountability; conference with R. Gray;

review index to data.

Research Martin E. Sheets; forward results 1.20 hrs
to L. von Stemberg; research Faith Colber;

forward results to L. von Sternberg.

Review email from T. Hunter re: M. Shiesis; 0.30 hrs
email to M. Bolen requesting search and

providing information on hand; rescarch

internet for Faith Crampton and/or

Crampton & Associates in Milwaukee;

email to M. Bolen re: seaich-on Crampton.

Review emails re: changes to consolidation 0.35 hrs
agreement; telephone conference with

Kathy and Ray and "Wood re: telephone

conference amengst attorneys; telephone

conference with Charlie from the equity

center re: surveys.

Review J}. Thompson email; reply to same; 0.90 hrs
review material re: B. Baker writings and

testirony.

Attempt telephone conference with B. 1.50 hrs

Wood, review questionnaire; review emails
from W. Pierce and respond, telephone
conference with G. Sheets; prepare for
meeting with B. Baker.

Conference with counsel re: meeting with 5.50 hrs
Dr. Baker; prepare for same; meeting with
Bruce Baker, Paul Colbert and counsel re:
expert analysis, case strategy and data;
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data; meeting at Equity Center re: Bruce
Baker, case status, case strategy, and data;
meeting at office with counsel and Bruce
Baker re: same and contract.

Invoice # 40154

NIC

$975.00

$120.00

NIC

$ 6125

$405.00

$487.50

$962.50

Page 4



03/12/2012

03/12/2012

03/12/2012

03/12/2012

03/13/2012

03/13/2012

03/13/2012
03/1372012

03/14/2012

03/14/2012

03/14/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

Conference with attorneys and B. Baker re:
potential expert testimony; conference with
B. Baker, T. Hunter, R. Gray IV and Equity
Center panel re: report, analysis and trial
issues,

Telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
March 12th meeting with Bruce Baker;
email and telephone conferences with B,
Wood's assistance, Cathy, re: same; confer
with T. Hunter re: same; review and retum
email from R. Gray re: the date for the end
of discovery in the most recent proposed
scheduling order.

Meet with B. Baker, R. Gray. P. Colbert;
meet with A. Brownston, B. Baker and P.
Colbert; meet with W. Pierce, R. Freeman,
F. Colbert, B. Leslie, H. McDaniels, Equity
Center staff, B, Baker.

Telephone conference with Kathy of Ray &
Wouods; conference with R. Gray, IV re;
meeting schedule; conference with S.
Jennings re: Ray Wood.

Telephone conference with Tim Waiif re:
data; review data sent to Bruce Biker;
review School Business Daily articles.
Review W. Pierce email; zeply to same;
review W. Pierce reply; conference call with
W. Pierce and T. Hunterre: status and
strategy.

Prepare plan packets for T. Hunter.
Telephone conference with W. Pierce, R.
Freeman, R Gruy re: order of testimony;
telephone ‘conference with G. Sheets re:
phone conference tomormmow,

Telzphune conference with Tim Wolff re:
datay review and reply to email from Tim
Wolff re: litigation requests 008C and 009C;
2mail same to counsel and Bruce Baker;
format and print for counsel; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: revision of
litigation request 008C and 009C;
conference with counsel re: same.

Review email correspondence; review email
re: Motion to Consolidate; conference with
attorneys re: B. Baker; review message from
B. Wood; telephone call to B. Wood - left
message.

Review letter and study from Houston
Endowment; email to P. Colbert and W.

Invoice # 40154

5.00 hrs

0.50 his

R.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.55 hrs

2.03 hrs

$2250.00

NC

$2600.00

MNAC

$ 87.50

$180.00

$50.00
$ 65.00

$157.50

$247.50

$659.75

Page 5



03/15/2012

03/15/2012

03/16/2012

0371772012

03/18/2012

03/19/2012

03/19/2012

3102-01

REG

Pierce re: summary of hold harmless;
review articles sent by W. Pierce; telephone
conference with G. Sheets re: facilities;
review survey on facilities; review
superintendent survey in prep for choosing
witnesses; telephone conference with F.
Crampton, left message; review background
check on F. Crampton; email to I. Duyar;
telephone conference with F. Crampton.
Conference with T. Hunter re:
Superintendent witness; conference with T.
Hunter re: witness selection; telephone
conference with R. Hooker re: 3/16
conference.

Respond to email from G. Sheets; prepare
for meeting with W. Pierce; meet with W.
Pierce, R. Freeman and J. Haney re;
superintendents and facilities; email to D.
Hinojosa re: facilities.

Review email re: 3/28 conference; review
message from B. Wood; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to sanie;
conference with T. Hunter re: S. Murdoch;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Thompson email; review J. Tumer email;
review D. Thompson emyil; review D.
Hincjosa emails (3); review M.
Trachtenberg email; review M. Bono email;
review M. Trachtenzerg email.

Review article 7=: new adequacy study;
correspond to attorneys via email re: same.
Review articiz by F. Crampton on facilities;
review vilae of F. Crampton.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
requested data from Dr. Baker and litigation
requzsts 013 and 014; review and reply to
=tnail from counsel re: interdistrict
comparison homeowners and litigation
requests 013 and 014; review email from
Mark Trachtenberg re: electronic service;
format and print litigation requests 009D,
013A, and 014A; conference with legal
assistant re; same; review articles re: Texas
Schools Slash Spending on Technology and
School Districts Statewide Cut 25,000
Positions after Budget Cuts.

Review analysis of new study; conference
with T. Hunter re: open records request for
study; review M. Trachtenberg email;

Invoice # 40154

0.40'hs

3.50 brs

1.25 hrs

0.25 brs

1.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

0.95 hrs

$180.00

$1137.50

$562.50

$112.50

$325.00

$288.75

$427.50

Page 6



03/19/2012

03/19/2012

03/20/2012

03/20/2012

03/20/2012

03/21/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

correspond to S. Jennings via email re:
service list; review emails re: experts;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review J.
Tumner email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review J. Tumer email; review C. Dupree
email re: superintendent witness; review
emails re: litigation conference.

Review email from M. Trachtenberg re: 0.20 hrs
email service list.
Review facilities survey; review G. Sheet's 220 hss

dissertation; email to F. Crampton re: he
articles, vitae and experience testifying;
review new data on tax rates without target
revenue; review email from W. Pierce and
respond; review emails from R. Gray and
respond; telephone conference with D.
Thompson re: experts; review email from S,
Dahlberg re: proposed scheduling order;
review Comptroller's 2006 study on
facilities; email to G. Sheets re: facility
survey.

Review and reply to email from Tim Wolff 0.85 hrs
re: data requested by Dr. Baker; forward
data 1o Toni H. and Paul Colbert; review
and respond to email from counsel re: same;
review emails re: numbers of students

eaming degrees.

Conference with T. Hunder re: litigation 0.40 hrs
conference; confercace with T. Hunter re: S.

Murdoch integrated testing.

Telephone conference with D. Thompson 0.70 hrs

re: Murdock and our contribution for
experts; conference with R. Gray re: same;
review emails from W_ Pierce and R.
Freetruin and respond,; review data to be sent
to B! Baker; email to M. Hunter re:
hiigation conference.

Review emails from Wayne Pierce re; 4.10 hrs
improving student dropout rates and Glen
Rose ISD expenditures; telephone
conference with Bill Franz at the Texas
Higher Education Coordinating Board re:
open records request; draft and email same;
review article re; Building a Grad Nation;
telephone conference with Texas Higher
Education Coordinating Board re: seventh
grade completion rate data; email Wayne
Pierce resuits of request; format and print
same for counsel.

Invoice # 40154

N/AC

$715.00

$148.75

$180.00

$227.50

$717.50

Page ¥



03/21/2012

037212012

03721720012

03/22/2012

03/22/2012

03/22/2012

03/23/2012

03/23/2012

3102-01

CMJ

RGIV

RGIV

REG

Conference with T. Hunter re: experts and
faculty issues.

Review various emails from W. Pierce and
R. Freeman and respond; review email from
B. Baker re: facilities study; send study to
G.. Sheets; review email from G. Sheets re:
facilities study.

Research Austin Library availabilicy of
"Joumnal of Education Finance”

Review and reply to email from Tim Wolff
re: data requested by Dr. Baker; forward
same to counsel and Paui Coibert; format
and print data requested by Dr. Baker for
counsel; review emails re: sending plaintiff's
proposed scheduling order to Judge Dietz
prior to the hearing on the 28th.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review J. Tumer
emails (2); review D. Thompson emails {2);
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to all;
review W, Pierce email; reply to same;
review S. Dahlberg email; review J. Tumer
email; reply to same.

Review email from F. Crampton r=:
telephone conference with and respond;
review email from Richard Gray IV re: data
and respond; review emaii fyom W. Pierce
re: TAASB meeting and respond; review
emails from J. Turner e proposed pre-triai
schedule and respond; emails to S. Dahiberg
re: extension for Response to AFD.
Telephone conference with counsel re:
weekly call with Buck Wood; review email
from Jobr. Yumer re: proposed letter to
Judge Dietz; review same; telephone
conference with Buck Wood re; weekly
conference; telephone conference with Toni
Hunter re: conversation with Buck Wood;
review and respond to email from counsel
re: meeting with superintendents; review
emails re: proposed conference call and
intervenors proposed changes to scheduling
order; review emails re: conference call with
State re: scheduling order; review proposed
scheduiing order and revised letter to Judge
Dietz,

Review J. Tumer email with draft
correspondence to Judge Dietz; conference
with T. Hunter re: status conference; review
J. Tumer email; review P, Fraissinet emaii;

Invoice # 40154

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.00 hrs

$ 90.00

$ 65.00

$42.00

$122.50

$337.50

$ 97.50

$245.00

$450.00
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03/23/2012

03/23/2012

03/24/2012

03/26/2012

03/26/2012

03/26/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); review C. Diamond
email; review J. Tumer email; review D.
Thompson email; review W. Pierce email.
Draft Plaintiffs' Response to State
Defendants' Request for Disciosure; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Telephone conference with B. Wood re:
conference call; telephone conference with
Richard Gray IV re: problems with
telephone conference; review and respond
te various emails from W. Pierce re:
superiniendents meeting and facilities
survey; telephone conference with all
attomneys re: pre-trial order.

Review ematl correspondence; review
"Texas K-12 Public Education - No
Financial Accountability” paper.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
version 2 of Dr. Baker's requested data;
review email from Chris Diamond re;
intervenors proposed changes to scheduling
order; review and forward email feoim Tim
Wolff re: revised data set requésted by Dr,
Baker; forward same to Dr. Baker; review
emails re: Texas Education Accountability
Project and response to reports findings;
review summary of Texas Education
Accountability Project's report; telephone
conferences with iter-district comparison
districts with counsel; review emails re;
plaintiff's mevting prior to scheduling
conferenca.

Review W. Pierce emails (2); reply to same
{2); work re: expert selection and expert
reports; review J. Tumner email; review

scheduling order; review C. Diamond email;

review correspondence with court; review
email re: report (M. Hurley); correspond to
clients re: same; review W. Pierce email;
conference with T. Hunter re; facuity siatus;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
. Hinojosa emails (3); review emails re;
Motion to Consolidate; review D.

Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa emaii;

review M. Trachtenberg email; work re:
consolidation motion; review D. Thompson
email; review email re: 3/28 conference.
Review email from R. Gray and M. Daniel

Invoice # 40154

0.50 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.15 hrs

1.85 hrs

2.55 hrs

0.50 hrs

$50.00

$390.00

$517.50

$323.75

$1147.50



03/26/2012

03/27/2012

03/27/2012

03/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

re: preparation for speaking engagement
with Texas School Assessors Association;
email bio information to M. Daniel: confer
with T. Hunter re: further revisions to the
Agreed Motion to Consolidate; revise
Motion; confer with T. Hunter re; same.
Review emails re: facilities study, Hurly
report, superintendents meeting; meet with
Richard Gray IV re: taxpayers in adjoining
districts; attempt to call such taxpayers;
conference with R. Gray re: Wednesday
meefing; review email from L. Moak re:
TASBY presentation and respond; review
comments on Motion to Consolidate and
edit Motion; email to state re; same.
Review, format, and print all data for
counsel; conference with counsel re: same
and current pleadings; conference with iegal
assistant re: all; conference with legal
assistant re: inter-district comparison

homeowner contact information; confecence

with counsel re: live pleadings; conference
with legas assistant re: same; review
Houston Endowment 8th Gradz Swdy.
Review D. Hinojosa email; review amended
petition; conference with R. Gray IV re:
data analysis and conference to review
same; review W, Pierce email; conference
with W. Pierce, R. Greeman and T. Hunter
re: status, witnecses, faculty and litigation
approach; revisw emails; prepare for 3/28
hearing; review M. Trachienberg email;
conference with T. Hunter re: 3/28 heaning;
telepkone conference with D. Thompson re:
TASE involvement; conference with T.
Bunier re: same; review S. Dahiberg email;
review states correspondence; review states
scheduling order.

Finalize and serve Response to Defendants’
Request for Disclosure; revise Agreed
Motion to Consolidate; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; efile and serve Agreed
Motion to Coensolidate; email all counsel
and client re: same; prepare and forward
letter and Agreed Motion to Consclidate to

Judge Dietz; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
email service list; review and revise iist for
our group; confer with T. Hunter re: same.

Invoice # 44154

2.60 hrs

4.00 hrs

4.85 hrs

1.15 hrs

$845.00

$700.00

$2182.50

$115.00
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032772012

03/28/2012

03/28/2012

03/28/2012

03/28/2012

03/29/2012

03/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

MLB

RGIV

Prepare for meeting on facilities; meet with
R. Gray, W Pierce and R. Freeman on
facilities issue; emails to W. Pierce and R.
Freeman following up on meeting; review
emails from W. Pierce re: various matters;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
TASBY funding; prepare for Wednesday
meeting and hearing; conference with R.
Gray re: same; conference with S, Dahlberg
ad D, Hinojosa re: Motion to Consolidate;
edit Motion to Consolidate and file.
Review ail proposed scheduling orders;
conference with counsel re: meeting with
plaintiff's attorneys and scheduling
conference; meeting with plaintiff's
attomeys re: scheduling order and
scheduling order hearing; scheduling order
hearing; meeting at MoakCasey re: data.
Conference with Assessors Association;
prepare for pre-trial; attend conference price
to pre-trail with Plaintiffs counsel; attend
pre-trial conference; post hearing
conference with attomeys; review éiigation
update; conference with attomcys re: data,
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
focus group districts.

Prepare for meeting with Plaintiff's
atiomeys; review articies by F. Crampton;
telephone conferencs with F. Crampton re:
possible testimony on facilities; aitend
meeting with Plaintiff's attomeys; attend
pre-trial conterence; conference with L.
Moak, D. Cusey, A. Brownson, D,
Thompsou, J. Tumer, Richard Gray IV, M.
Trach‘enberg and P. Fraiser re: data on test
surgery; review update to Coalition
racmbers.

Research telephone numbers for five
districts; forward results to R. Gray IV.
Review Texas Education Accountability
Project’s study on Financial Accountability;
review and reply to email from Dr. Baker
re: data request; email Tim Wolff re: same;
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
same; conference with counsel re: meeting
to outline case,

Review W, Pierce email; review email from
TASB; conference with R. Gray IV re: data
analysis conference; review litigation

Invoice # 45154

3.70 hrs

7.75 hrs

5.90 hrs

6.70 hrs

3.10 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.05 hrs

$1202.50

$1356.25

$2655.00

$2177.50

N/C

$350.00

$472.50
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03/29/2012

03/30/2012

03/30/2012

03/30/2012

03/30/2012

03/31/2012
03/31/2012

03/31/2012

TIMEKEEPER RECAR

RGIV

SEJ

update; correspond to T. Hunter via email
re: B. Baker contract and report; review
email re: trial date and buliet point
summary; review M. Trachtenberg emaii;
reply to same; review message from D,
Thompson; telephone conference with D.
Thompson re: status.

Review emails from J. Farley and W, Pierce
re: update to coalition members and
respond; draft order on Motion to
Consolidate; email to all attorneys on same;
review data in preparation for Saturday
meeting; email to P. Colbert and W. Pierce
re: data.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
summary for Judge Dieiz; draft summary
for all plaintiff's cases; email same to
counsel for review; review article on
inadequate funding in Texas.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review
amended petition of Ft. Bend plaintiffs;
review emails; conference with T. Huater
re: expert conference; review emails re:
consolidated order; telephone Conference
with C. Diamond re: intervention.

Email counsel filed Agrecd Motion to
Consolidate,

Telephone conference with Plaintiff's
atiorneys re: trial dawe and other issues
raised at schediuling conference; conference
with R. Gray r=: meeting on trial strategy
and experts; email to W. Pierce and P,
Colbert re:aate; review email from R.
Freeman and J. Freeman re: meetings with
Superiitend.

Meeiing with counsel re; review all data.
Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; work re: data analysis and exhibits.
Meet with R. Gray and Richard Gray IV re:
data; edit order on Motion to Consolidate
and email to B. Baker re: telephone
conference.

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
MLB  Boien, Mamee Paralegal
Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH  Hunier, Toni Partner

3102-01

39.05 hrs @

1.20 his @
4995 hrs @
50.13 hrs @

Invoice # 40154

450.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr

0.50 hrs

3.05 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

(.80 hrs

3.00 hrs
2.75 hrs

3.00 hrs

$162.50

$533.75

$495.00

N/C

$260.00

$525.00
$1237.50

$975.00

$42,983.00

$17,572.50
$ 12000
% 8,741.25
$16,292.25

Page 12



CMJ  Jacobs, Craig 030 his @ 140.00 /hr $ 4200

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 215 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 215.00
LVS von Stemberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 0.00
Fee Recap Totals 142.78 $42,983.00

3102-01 Invoice # 40154 Page 13



GRAY & BECKER. P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

April 30, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSIONAL SERVICES

04/0172012 REG Review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review M,
Trachtenberg additional email; review P
Fraissinet email.

04/02/2012 RGIV  Review pleadings of Efficiency fntcrvenors;
update summary of plaintiff's cases for
Judge Dietz; email counsel ¢&; same;
telephone conference witi Tim Wolff re:
data; review emails re; service list; review
Defendant’s Responscs to Plaintiff's Request
for Disclosure.

04/02/2012 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; correspond to T.
Hunter via einall re; conference call; review

emails; revizw D. Thompson email; review
M. Trachienberg emails (3); reply to same;
conférence with T. Hunter re: trial date;
review C, Diamond email; review D.
Hinojosa email; conference with T. Hunter
re: intervention; review email re: conference
with T. Hunter re: same; review M.
Trachtenberg email re: trial date; review C,
Diamond email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review R. Freeman email; conference with
T. Hunter re: faculty study; review
disclosure responses by State; conference
with T. Hunter re: same; conference with T.
Hunter re: our disclosure responses; review
C. Diamond email.

04/02/2012 TBH Prepare for telephone conference with B.

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 40383-1
Our files#: 3102
Billing through:

.60 hrs

1.35 hrs

1.85 hrs

2.80 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
04/30/2012

$270.00

$236.25

$832.50

$ 910,00



04/02/2012

04/03/2012

04/03/2012

04/03/2012

04/03/2012

04/04/2012

3102-01

LVS

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

Baker; telephone conference with B. Baker
re: money matters; review emails from J.
Freeman re: superintendents meeting; re;
emails from G. Sheets re: facilities study;
review emails from R. Freeman re: same;
revise summary for judge; review emails of
various counsel re: final data; scheduling
order and telephone conference to discuss
same; go to count house to get judge to sign
order on Motion to Consolidate.

Review email from T. Hunter; review
schedules; email to M. Trachtenberg re:
availability,

Review edits to Summary of Plaintiff's
cases for Judge Dietz; email counsel re:
same; telephone conference with Tim Wolff
re: data; review email re: summary for
Judge Dietz and Order Granting Agreed
Motion to Consolidate.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review J, Tumer
email; review M. Trachtenberg emaii;
conference with T. Hunter re: confoience
issues; review email re: trial date: review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D, Hinojosa
email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review message from P. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Woaod re: status
conference; review £ Tumer email.

Email C. Nickell ve: list of Superintendents
in the Coalition; confer with T. Hunter re;
same; review email from C. Nickell.
Prepare for Telephone conference with
PlainiiiTs attomeys and State; telephone
conference with Plaintiff's attomeys and
state re: trial date and scheduling order;
review voice mail from Stacy, Judge Dietz's
clerk, review signed Order; circulate Order
and Summary of case; meet with L. Moak;
email to W Pierce and R. Freeman re:
various matters; review response; review
emails from G. Sheets; email Baker articles
to D. Thompson.

Telephone conference with counsel re:
reschedule meeting; review counsel’s
calendar re: same; review emails re: case
summary for Judge Dietz; conference with

Invoice # 40583

.40 hrs

2.05 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.15 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.75 hrs

NIC

$358.75

$495.00

WiC

$ 877.50

$131.25

Page 2



04/04/2012

0410412012

04/04/2012

04/05/2012

04/05/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

counsel re: data meeting with Wayne Pierce;
review email re: Calhoun plaintiff's
discovery.

Correspond to B. Wood via email,
correspond to T. Hunter via email re: B.
Wood conference; telephone conference
with B. Wood re: status; review 19 emails;
reply to same; conference with T. Hunter re:
conference call re: experts; conference with
T. Hunter re: conference call with experts
and conference with W. Pierce; review
Cachou County discovery; review C.
Diamond email.

Confer with T. Hunter re: list of
superintendents; email C. Nickel] re: same;
review and retum email from C. Nickell re:
same.

Review emails from W. Pierce and respond,
review money matters articles by Baker &
Leslie; telephone conference with D.
Thompson; M. Tractenberg; J. Tumer and
D. Fraissinet on experts; call Judge Dietz's
clerk re: next step on consolidaticn, left
message; review email from 1. Hinojosa re:
summary; conference with Richard Gray IV
re: same; conference P Colbert re: target
revenue; telephone conierence with L Duyor
re: facilities; review revisions to proposed
scheduling order, review C. Diamond’s
email re: Order to Consolidate; respond to
same; teleghone conference with W, Pierce
re: D, King, B. Leslie, data and other
mattey:

Review Calhoun Plaintiff's first RFP;
conference with legal assistant re: printing
and filing of discovery in hard form and
digitally; review article sent by Wayne
Pierce re: public education by
accountability; review emails re; pre-trial
agreements; review same; review and reply
to email from counsel re; summary for
Judge Dietz; revise and update summary;
review and respond to email from David
Thompson re: same,

Review message from B. Wood,; telephone
conference with B. Wood re; 4/5

Invoice # 40583

1.80 brs

.25 hrs

5.20 hrs

2.25 hrs

3.25 brs

$810.00

NIC

$1,690.00

$393.75

$1462.50

Page 3



04/05/2012

04/06/2012
04/06/2012

04/06/2012

04/07/2012
04/09/2012

04/09/2012

04/06/2012

04/09/2012

04/10/2012

3102-01

RGIV
REG

SEJ

REG
RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

conference; review R. Freeman email;
review chart re: TEA rankings; conference
with B. Wood and T. Hunter re: trial
preparation, status and strategy; review J.
Tumer email; review J. Tumer emails (2)
with attachments; review D. Hinojosa email;
work on trial outline,

Strategy meeting with B. Wood; review and 2.30 brs
respond to emails from D. Hinosja;
telephone conference with C. Diamond re:
Order on Motion to Consolidate; review
edits to summary for judge; review Calhom

City discovery.

Email counsel re: summary for Judge Dietz. 0.10 hrs
Work re: witness re: Chamber of Commerce 0.60 hrs
type stuff; review D. Hinojosa email.

Review message from R. Gray re: contact 0.25 hrs

information for the Austin Chamber of
Commerce, Lew Little, Gary Farmer;
research and email R. Gray information.

Work on trial outline. 2.50 hrs
Review and reply to email from Chzis 0.20 hrs

Diamond re: intervenors opporitipn to

severance in the motion to consolidate;

conference with counsel re; same.

Review D. Hinojosa email and discovery; 2.75 hrs
work on trial outline; prepare

correspondence to {Ciamber persons re:

possible testimony; correspond to B.

Hammond re: education system; work re:

expert seleciion; review material re: drop

out rate; review discovery from Haynes &

Boonz: review W. Pierce email; reply to

same; review test score data analysis.

Revise Exhibit A to disclosures; confer with 1.20 hrs
T. Hunter re: same; review emails from C.

Nickell re: additional district information;

review email from T. Hunter re: adding the

Equity Center group; email T. Hunter re:

listing attomeys; review email from Dr.

Baker and T. Hunter re: expert fee; prepare

letter to Dr. Baker forwarding same.

Diraft outline for trial; conference with D. 1.80 hrs
Hinojosa.
Conference of Attomeys re: case outline; 3.45 hrs

review and reply to email from Holly

Invoice # 40583

$ 74750

$17.50
$270.00

N/C

$1125.00
$35.00

$1237.50

$120.00

$ 585.00

$603.75

Pape 4



04/10/2012

04/10/2012

04/11/2012

0471172012

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

McIntush re: case summary for Judge Dietz;
revise summary for judge Dietz; email to
counsel for review; review Calhoun
Plaintiff's Discovery Requests; summarize
same; review email re; Fort Bend first
request for production.

Review J. Tumer email re: scheduling 3.75 hrs
order; conference with attomeys re: status,
strategy and outline of presentation; review
D. Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson
report for productivity; review L. Moak
outline of area to cover; review C. Diamond
email; review summary of various claims to
be presented to Judge; review message from
D. Hinojosa; conference with T. Hunter re;
same.

Meet with B. Wood, R. Gray and Richard 3.50 hrs
Gray IV to structure case; review summary
for Judge; telephone conference with R.
O'Keefe re; proposed Scheduling Order,
review email from D. Hinojosa re: same;
review email from J. Tumner re: sazie.
Revise and re-format Summary for Judge 4.65 hrs
Dietz; review emails; finalize re-formatting
of Summary Chart for Judge Dietz;
conference with counsej ve: same; review
emails re: Defendant’s changes to proposed
scheduling order and intervenor’s objections
to motion to consolidate; fonmat, organize,
and summariz2 all data requests of Dr.
Baker.

Review ©) Diamond email; review 2.25 hrs
correspondence to Court; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; review intervenors
proposed scheduling order; review States
proposed scheduling order; review C.
Diamond correspondence; review I. Tumer
emails (2); review red-line comparison of
scheduling order; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review T.
Hunter email; review emails re; 4/16
hearing; review emails re: scheduling order
and focus of distribution; review article:
review draft correspondence to Court;
review D). Thompson email; review D,
Hinojosa email; review G, Farmer email re:

Invoice # 40583

$1687.50

$1.137.50

$813.75

$1012.50

Page 5



04/11/2012

04/11/2012

04/12/2012

04/12/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

Chamber of Commerce; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; review J. Tumer
email; prepare for conference with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman; review D. Hinojosa
email.

Review email from C. Nickell re: Crystal 1.75 hrs
City ISD and Excelsior ISD; continue
preparing list of persons with knowledge;
review and retum emails from T. Hunter re:
service of Motion to Consolidate; efile and
serve letter to Judge Dietz; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; email clients re: same;
email attomeys not registered for e-service.
Review letter filed by C. Diamond re: Order 2.70 hrs
on Motion to Consolidate; review emails re:
same; draft letter to Judge Dietz in response;
email to J. Arnold re: testimony; review
studied sent by W, Pierce on carly
childhood education; charter schools and
drop out rates; email to F. Crampton re;
testimony; review summary for Judgo:
review State’s proposed changes t¢ proposed
scheduling order; review several emails
from D. Hinojsa and C. Diamond re: Order
on Motion to Consolidate and proposed
scheduling order; review MALDEF's letter
to judge; telephone conferance with B.
Leslie re: edits to Money Maitters article;
draft cover letter io Judge for Scheduling
Order.

Format and print all data requests made by 5.50 hrs
Dr. Baker; summarize all requests; prepare
for mecting with counsel, Wayne Pierce,
and Ray Freeman; data meeting; conference
with counsel re: summary chart for Judge
Dietz; revise Summary Chart for Judge
Dietz; email same to Plaintif s counsel for
approval; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: data.

Review W. Pierce emails; review emails re: 3.95 hrs
scheduling order and conference call
;review J. Tumer email; review C. Diamond
email; conference with R. Gray IV, R.
Freeman, T. Hunter and W. Pierce re;
exhibits, status, trial outline, scheduling and
testimony; review J, Tumer emails (2);

Invoice # 40583

$175.00

$ 87750

$962.50

$1777.50

Page §



04/12/2012

04/13/2012

04/1372012

04/13/2012

04/13/2012

04/14/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SE!

REG

review D. Hinojosa email; review C.
Diamond email.

Meet with W. Pierce, R. Freeman, R. Gray,
Richard Gray IV re: data; telephone
conference with B. Baker re: same; review
summary for Judge and edit; instruct
Richard Gray I'V on procedure for getting
Scheduling Order to Judge.

Review and reply to emails re: Summary for
Judge Dietz; revise Summary for Judge
Dietz; conference call with plaintiff's
counsel and State re: proposed scheduling
order; conference with counsel re: Summary
for Judge Dietz; email counsel re: same;
format and print litigation request 002E;
review emaiis re: Rule 11 Agreement,
Agreed upon scheduling order.

Work re: scheduling order; review emails;
review D.Hinojosa email; review C.
Diamond email; review D. Hinojosa emaii;
review J. Tumer emails (2); work on issues
chart; review C. Diamond email; review P.
Fraissinet email; review D. Hiniojosa email;
review S, Dahlberg emails (2); review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); reviéw J. Tumer email,
review P. Fraissinet email; review emails re:
scheduling order; finalize work on
scheduling order; review draft
correspondence to Judge Dietz,

Review emaiis re; 9/29/12 coalition
meeting; ¢al¢ndar and email attomeys re:
same; confer with R. Gray re: pretrial
heariag; telephone call to Judge Dietz's
clerk re: same (left message); confer with R.
ray re: same; email 5. Rosen re: same;
revise Scheduling Order; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review email from S.
Rosen re: 4/16/12 hearing setting; email
attomeys re: same.

Telephone conference with all Plaintiff
attomeys, interviewers and State attomeys
re: proposed scheduling order and clarifying
order on consolidation; travel to court house
to deliver same to judge.

Review C, Diamond email; review T.
Hunter email; reply to emails.

Invoice # 40583

3.70 hrs

4.15 his

1.70 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.35 hrs

$1,202.50

$726.25

$765.00

$ 48750

$157.50

Page¥



04/15/2012

04/16/2012

04/16/2012
04/16/2012

04/16/2012

04/16/2012

04/17/2012

04/17/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV
REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

Review emails re: scheduling order; review
emails re: 4/16 hearing,
Review emails re: proposed and agreed
upon scheduling order, heating on same;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review and summarize Fort Bend plaintiff's
first request for production.
Calendar Scheduling Order.
Review 5. Rosen email re: 4/16 hearing
cancelled; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review email re: consolidation order;
conference with T. H re: discovery;
conference with

involvement in case; review C.
Diamond email; correspond to T. Hunter via
email re: Dr. Foelks, a potential witness;
review signed scheduling order,
Review email from T. Hunter re: cancelled
pretrial hearing; email S. Rosen re: same;
telephone call to 8. Rosen (left message) re:
same; email counsel re: cancelled heaning;
review emails re: service list; revicw service
list; email M. Trachtenberg re:‘sayne; confer
with T. Hunter re: signed Scheduling Order;
telephone call to Judge Dietr’s clerk,
Elizabeth, re: same (left message); email S.
Rosen re: same; telenhone conference with
District Clerk re: same; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; veview email from S.
Rosen re: signad Scheduling Order; email
signed Ordet o all counsel and clients;
calendar all deadlines.
Instnint law clerk on obtaining court’s order;
email to C. Diamond re: clarifying order;
roview email to S. Dalhburg and respond,;
ielephone conference with W. Pierce re:
scheduling order; telephone conference with
P. Theobald at Texas Tribune re: same;
email to W. Pierce and state attomeys re:
scheduling order; send order to B. Baker
and P. Colbert.
Review files; conference with counsel re:
live pleading; print same for counsel; print
and complete caselaw notebook for Wayne
Pierce.
Work re: data analysis and expent

Invoice # 40583

0.25 hrs

1.80 hrs

.10 hrs
2.15 hix

1.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.95 hrs

1.25 hrs

$112.50

$315.00

$17.50
$967.50

MO

$ 9750

$166.25

$562.50

Page §



04/17/2012

04/18/2012

04/18/2012

04/19/2012

04/19/2012

04/19/2012

04/20/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

s8]

RGIV

identification; review L. Lacy email re: Rule
11 Agreement; review T. Hunter email;
review L. Mock email,

Review email from L. Moak; review email 0.10 hrs
from L. Lawrence and respond.
Conference with runner re: Caselaw book 0.65 hrs

for Wayne Pierce; have same delivered;

review emails re: depositions and clarifying

order; review and reply to email from

Wayne Pierce re: schedule meeting, and

named defendants.

Review C. Diamond emails (2); review draft 1.00 hrs
Clarifying Order; review D. Hinojosa email;

review W. Pierce email; conference with R.

Gray IV re: conference with W. Pierce re:

data; review C. Diamond email; reply to

same.

Review current data and summary; review 395 hrs
emails re: depositions; prepare for meeting

with Wayne Pierce; conference with ccunsel

re: same and questions wanted asked,

meeting at Equity Center with Wajne Pierce

and Ray Freeman.

Review W, Pierce email; review r. Freeman 1.65 hrs
email; review T. Hunter emazils; review

emails re: Clarifying Ocder; review article

re; Tatum bond election; review D.

Hinojosa email; revicw 8. Dahlberg email;

review C. Diamond email; reply to same;

review Taturi 1SD web page; review R.

Freeman email; reply to same; review J.

Tumer evail; review D. Hinojosa email,

review, . Diamond email; review D.

Hiacjosa email; review H. McIntosh email;

cenference with R. Gray IV re: conference

with W. Pierce; review J. Tumer email;

conference with R. Gray IV re: status of

exhibits and data analysis.

Review emails re: scheduling depositions; 0.25 hrs
review email from T. Hunter re: same; email

R. Gray re: same,

Review emails from all parties re: 2.35 hrs
deposition dates and availability and

clanifying order; telephone conference with

Tim Wolff re: data; email all

current pleadings; review and respond to

Invoice # 40583

$ 3250

$113.75

$450.00

$691.25

$742.50

NIC

$411.25

Page 9



04/20/2012

04/20/2012

04/217/2012

04/22/2012
04/22/2012

04/23/2012

04/23/2012

04/23/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV
REG

RGIV

REG

SEJ

email from Dr. Baker re: data requests;
format and print updated data.

Review message from B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: status; review
C. Diamond emails; reply to same; review
D. Thompson email;r review J. Tumer
email; review C. Diamond email; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); correspond to attomeys
via email re: deposition; review C. Diamond
email; review email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review Rule 11 Agreement
as executed.

Review emails from Plaintiffs attomeys and
response.

Review and reformat various litigation
requests; print same in preparation for
meeting tomorrow,

Meeting with counsel re: data review,
Review revised exhibits; conference with .
Gray IV re: same.

Telephone conference with Tim Wol€f ce:
data and expert requests; review.aqd file
emails re: use of bond funds t¢ pey M&O
expenses, review emails re: depositions;
format and print litigation requests 012D
and O11B.

Review D. Hinojosa email; correspond to
counsel via email ¢ deposition dates;
conference with T. Hunter re; M. Hurley
deposition and Jeposition dates; review text
message fron: B. Wood re: deposition dates;
review B Freeman email; review Eanes
bond program information; telephone call to
C.(Heidrick - left message; review T. Hunter
email re: expert witnesses; review S,
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; conference with T. Hunter re: Rule 11
Agreement; review D. Thompson email;
review C. Diamond email; review D,
Hinojosa email; telephone conference with
C. Heidrick re: chamber studies and D.
Scherbele; review discovery; correspond to
D. Scherbele via email re: potential witness.
Prepare Plaintiffs’ Request for Disclosure to
Intervenors, draft Rule 11 agreement re:

Invoice # 40583

1.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.75 hrs
0.75 hrs

1.35 hrs

1.95 hrs

1.00 hrs

$630.00

$ 6500

$525.00

$131.25
$337.50

$236.25

$877.50

$100.00

Page 10



04/23/2012

04/24/2012

0472472012

(4/24/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

depositions; confer with T. Hunter re: same;
serve Request for Disclosure to Intervenors.
Telephone conference with P. Colbert; 2.30 hrs
email to B. Baker re: deposition schedule;
review comments from various parties on
proposed Rule 11 Agreement on
dispositions; conference with R. Gray on
various matters; email to W.Pierce, R.
Freeman and B. Baker re: M. Hurley
deposition; review and edit summary for
judge; review list of superintendants for
meeting; email to L. Moak and B. Baker re:
areas of testimony that L. Darling-
Hammond was going to cover; check with
R. Freeman on facilities survey; review
email from G. Sheets and respond; update
R. Gray on contact with J. Arnold and
review his email to D. Scheberle; review
material on NEFC conference; review
Eames 1.5.D. bond information.

Prepare for meeting with counsel re: 3.10 hrs
summary for Judge Dietz, data, inier-district
comparison homeowners; review and reply
to email from Tim Wolff re; data issues;
review emails re: Rule | [ Agreement
regarding depositions, ¢xpert reports, etc;
conference with counsel re: litigation
request 008 and 00%; print same for counsel;
meeting with counsel re; changes to
summary for judge Dietz; review and reply
to email fr'om Wayne Pierce re: Edgewood
caselaw; keycite same; telephone
conférence with Bruce Baker re: data
cletification; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: same; print and review Edgewood
Plaintiff's REFP and RFD.

Review message from D. Scherbele; review 0.90 hrs
and sign Rule 11 Agreement; conference
with T. Hunter re: new developments;
review D. Thompson email; telephone call
to D. Scherbele - left message; review
Edgewood Plaintiff discover; conference
with T. Hunter re: target reverse; review
intervenors request for disclosure.

Review email from T. Hunter re: Rule 11 1.75 birs
agreement re: depositions; revise Rule 11

Invoice # 40583

$ 747.50

$542.50

$405.00

$175.00

Page 11



04/24/2012

04/25/2012

04/25/2012

04/25/2012

3102-01

RGIV

TBH

agreement; prepare working notebook of
discovery and pleadings; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review emails from
counsel re: permission to sign Rule 11
agreement; calendar discovery deadlines.
Meet with P. Colbert; review summary for
Judge; meet with Richard Gray IV re:
summary; finalize Rule 1] Agreement on
depositions; conference with R, Gray re: TR
and meeting with P. Colbert; review
Education Code re: TR; email to W. Pierce,
R. Freeman, B. Baler and R, Gray re:
Edgewood discovery.

Format and print litigation request 007C;
review email from Wayne Pierce and
counsel re; Edgewood Ila; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data and
expert requests; finalize and email final
summary for Judge Dietz for approval;
email Holly Macintush re: same; email
Wayne Pierce re: Edgewood [la; review
opinion on motion for rehearing; 1cview
emails re: depositions, days neaded for each
parties case at trial, Edgewoodla, data;
format and print litigation requests 0031,
O12E.

Review W. Pierce emuiis (2); review
summary of claims for court; review study
on underfunding costs; review emailr :
scheduling; review emails re: Rule 11;
review S. Dailberg email re; trial time;
reveiw M Trachtenberg email; telehpone
call to'L. Scherbele - left message; reveiw
D.(Thompson email; review D. Hinojos
email; review S. Dahlberg email; conference
with T. Hunter re: experts.

Find Edgewood II a and review; email to W,
Pierce explaining Edgewocod 11 a; telephone
conference with H. Keller; review article on
cost of NCLB; prepare for telephone
conference with D. Hinojosa re: various
matters; telephone conference with
Plaintiff’s attorneys re: experts; email to D.
Hinojosa and S. Dahlberg re: scheduling of
depositions; review B. Balar's article on
inequity in funding in New York and

Invoice # 40583

3.50 hrs

2.95 hrs

1.45 hrs

3.80 hrs

$1,137.50

$516.25

$652.50

$1,235.00

Page 12



04/26/2012

04/26/2012

04/21/2012

04/27/2012

04/27/2012

04/28/2012

04/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

Ilinois.

Review message from D. Scherbele;
telephone calls (2) to D. Scherbele - left
messages (2); review 5. Dahlberg email;
review emails re: experts; conference with
T. Hunter re: experts; conference with T.
Hunter re: 4/27 conference call: review
emails re: experts,

Review Blincoe facilities study; email to G.
Sheets re: follow up; email to R. Freeman
re: [ & S data; review email from H. Keller
and respond; telephone conference with D.
Ashley from Texas Manufacturing
Association; telephone conference with S.
Dahlberg re: Rule 11 Agreement on
discovery; email and telephone conference
to . Diamond re: same; email to M. French
re: meeting; review emails from W. Pierce:
email to P. Colbert re: MALDEF,

Review emails re: status conference
availability with Judge Dietz; review and
reply to email re: Summary for Judge Dietz;
revise Summary for Judge Dietz; zmail
Calhoun plaintiffs re: same; 2mail final
version of Summary for Judze Dietz to all
plaintiff parties for appieval.

Review emails re: scheduling; review S.
Rosen email; corrzspond to T. Hunter via
email re: same; review P. Fraissinet email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review H.
MclIntosh email; review P. Fraissinet email:
review ' Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D, Hinojosa emails (3); review R.
Fréeman email; review emails re: Rule 11
Agreement; review Agreed Order of
Clarification; review P, Fraissinet email re:
5/18 conference; review additional emails
re: 5/18 conference; reply to same.
Telephone conference with B. Wood re:
update; telephone conference with Plaintiff’s
attorneys re: Rule 11 Agreement and other
matters; review emails from R. Gray, W.
Pierce, R. Freeman and respond.

Review email re: status conference; review
additional data and analysis of same.
Review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;

Invoice # 40583

0.85 hrs

2.30 hys

0.60 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.15 hrs

$382.50

$ 74750

$105.00

$630.00

$ 32500

$225.00

$ 67.50

Page 13



conference with T. Hunter re: same,
04/30/2012 RGIV ~ Review and reply to email from Holl 0.35 hrs $61.25
MclIntush re: Summary for Judge Dietz;
update and revise same; review articel re:
Tax Shelter.
04/30/2012 REG Conference with T. Hunter re: Dr. John 0.90 hrs $405.00
Foelks: review message from D. Scherbele;
work re: data analysis; review email from B.
Wood,; review 8. Rosen email re; 3/18 status
conference; forward same to W. Pierce via
email; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same.
04/30/2012 SEJ Review email from D. Ray re: B. Wood 1.25 hrs N/C
contact information; revise service list;
review email from T, Hunter re; meeting
with M. French May 15th. Calendar
meeting; email T. Hunter re: possible
scheduling conflict; review email from S,
Rosen re: status conference and calendar
same; efile and serve Rule 11 agreemerit ye;
depositions; email B. Wood, D. Ray, R.
Freeman, and W, Pierce re: same.
04/30/2012 TBH Make arrangements for NEFC, telephone 4.00 hrs $1,300.00
conference with J. Flokes re: meeting; email
to H. Keller re; meeting; review Rule |1
Agreement and file; prapare for meetings
with superintendents,

$42,233.75
TOHERKEEPER RECAP
REG IO Richard E. Gray Partner 4300 hrs @ 450,00 /hr $19,350.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 46.35 his @ 175.00 /hr $ 81i11.25
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 4370 hrs @ 325.00 hr $14,202.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 570 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 57000
LVS  von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr 3 0.00
Fee Recap Totals 138.75 $42.23375

3102-01 Invoice # 40583 Page 14



GRAY & BECKER. P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
May 31, 2012
Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 40881-1
Our file#: 3102
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billing through:

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEFESSTONAL SERVICES
05/01/2012 RGIV  Review emails between counsel and Drew 0.10 hrs
Scheberle re: Austin Chamber of Commerce
and any studies showing the lack of
preparedness of students for college or for
the workforce.
05/01/2012 REG Review emnail from Equity Center;“~ork re: 1.35 hrs
witness preparation; conference with T.
Hunter re: school board presentation; review
press release re: school fiaance discussions;
review B, Scherbele emails (3); reply to
same (3); review Ft. Bend discovery
requests; conference with T. Hunter re;
discovery; review email re; conference with
Dr. Folks.
05/01/2012 TBH Review and iespond to emails from W. 2.00 hrs
Pierce r¢: presentations and testimony;
prepare for presentation to NEFC; review
ematis from other Plaintiff attorneys re:
vaviety of topics; review supplemental
discovery request of Ft. Bend.
05/02/2012 RGIV -« Attend press release at Capitol re: Texas 1.30 hrs
Association of Business joining the
Intervenor’s lawsuit; review and reply to
email from David Hinojosa re: Summary for
Judge Dietz.
05/02/2012 REG Review amended petition of efficiency 1.25 hrs
intervenors; review R. Freeman email:
review C. Woods email; review W. Pierce
email; review TAB press release; review
email from W, Pierce; review message from

3102-01 Invoice # 40881

74-2427406
REG

00001
05/31/2012

$ 1750

$ 607.50

$650.00

$227.50

3 56250

Page 1



05/02/2012

05/02/2012

05/03/2012

05/03/2012

05/03/2012

05/04/2012
05/04/2012

05/05/2012

05/06/2012
05/07/2012

05/07/2012

05/08/2012

05/08/2012

3102-01

SEJ

R. Freeman; telephone conference with B,
Zahn re: lawsuit status.

Review email from T. Hunter re:
Intervenor's Amended Plea in Intervention;
update TBH working notebook re: same,
Drive to San Antonio for NEFC
presentation.

Review email from plaintiffs re; approval
for Summary for Judge Dietz; review email
from counsel to Chris Diamond re: TBA.
Work on discovery; correspond to C.
Diamond via email re: witness; review A.
Kauffman email; reply to same; review A,
Kauffman email (2); review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; review subpoena for
M. Hurley records; review C. Diamond
email; reply to same; review T. Hunter
emails; reply to same.,

Presentation at NEFC regarding litigation;
return to Austin from San Antonio.

Review T. Hunter email re: experts.
Review emails from R. Gray, D. Hinojosa
and R. Freeman and respond; mect with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman re: evidence for trial
and meeting with superintcndent.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review
MAILDEEF special excepiions.

Work re: exhibits.

Review email cormrespondence; review
notice of setting re: special exceptions;
review R, Freenian email; review article
sent by R. Freeman re: charter school.
Review email from Charles Akida and send
to B. Baker with email; prepare for meetings
wili superintendent,

Deview States response to production
request; review T. Hunter email; reply to
same; telephone conference with D.
Scherbele re: chamber report cards and
conference; review H. Keller email;
conference with T. Hunter and S. Jennings
re: discovery; conference with T. Hunter re;
superintendent interviews.

Review emails re: discovery responses;
review emails from R. Gray and T. Hunter
re: same; conference with R. Gray and T,
Hunter re: documenis produced.

Invoice # 40881

0.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.15 hrs

2.90 hrs

0.10 hrs
2.70 hrs

0.25 has

0.50 hrs
0.95 hrs

2.70 hrs

1.15 hrs

0.50 hrs

N/C

$ 2625

$ 78750

N/IC

$ 4500
$877.50

$ 11250

$ 225.00
$ 42750

$877.50

$ 51750

$ 50.00

Page 2



05/08/2012

05/09/2012

05/09/2012

05/09/2012

05/10/2012

05/10/2012

05/11/2012

3102-01

TBH

SEJ

TBH

REG

Meetings with Superintendents; conference 5.50 hrs
with W_ Pierce and R. Freeman re: samge;

emails to various experts to set up telephone

conference; telephone conference and email

to H. Keller re: meeting; email to B. Baker

to set up telephone conference; email to W.

Pierce to set up trial preparation meeting;

conference with R. Gray re: all these issues.

Review C. Diamond email: review 2nd 0.60 lus
amended plea in intervention; review H.

Keller email; review M. Trachtenberg

email.

Review email from S. Dahlberg re: 1.25 hrs
documents responsive to Calhoun County

ISD’s RFP; review documents and confer

with attorneys re; same.

Meet with Superintendents; conference with 6.00 hrs
W .Pierce and R. Freeman; review emails

from M. Tractenberg re: interviewers and

telephone conference and respond; review

emails from D. Hinojosa re: same;

telephone conference with H. Kellzr re:

college success; telephone confervnice with

S. Navasro re: comp ed.

Conference with T. Hunter re: expert 2.95 hos
witness and superintendent witness;

conference with D. Sclietbele re: potential

expert witness; review Austin Chamber

material; review amended intervention;

conference with T. Hunter re:

superintendonts conference and conference

with Dr K eller; review email re: 5/31

conferonce with H. Keller.

Mect with superintendents for trial 5.30 hus
pieparation; conference with R, Gray re:

witnesses on college and career readiness;

set up meeting with H.Keller; review email

from T. Robertson re: May 15 meeting and

respond.

Work re; witness selection; review R. 1.75 hrs
Freeman email; review attachment re: bond

fund use; review W, Pierce email; reply to

same; review R. Freeman email; review W.

Pierce email; conference with T. Hunter re:

status and 5/11 conference call; review

Callahan County disclosure requests.

Invotce # 40881

$1787.50

$ 270.00

$125.00

$1950.00

$1,327.50

$1722.50

$ 787.50

Page 3



05/11/2012

05/12/2012

05/13/2012

05/14/2012

05/14/2012

05/14/2012

05/15/2012

3102-01

TBH

REG

TEH

SEJ

TBH

Telephone conference with B. Baker re:
charters and weight; telephone conference
with all Plaintiff attorneys re: intervenor’s
positions; plea to jurisdiction; experts and
managers documents; conference with R,
Gray; review email on class size from M.
Tractenberg and I, Finn; draft memorandum
re: superintends recommendations.

Review P. Fraissinet email; reply to same;
review J. Turner email.

Review Wayne's description of system and
edit; look up Bincoe; email to W. Pierce re:
same; begin reviewing Haney testimony;
review Baker article on Charters and Baker
blog on same.

Review D. Scherbele email: forward to R.
Gray IV with request for analysis; reply to
D. Scherbele; work re: exhibits and witness
selection; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review notes re: Los Fresna ISD and
possible testing; conference with T. Hunter
re; same; conference with T. Hunter re;
LBB/TEA conference; review S, Dahlberg
correspondence; review States report and
production requests,

Review and organize State Defendants’
documents responsive io Fort Bend County
ISD's RFP; confer with attorneys re: same.
Edit summary cn superintendents; prepare
for meeting with superintendents;
Telephone conference with R. Bincoe re:
meeting; euiail to G, Sheets re: Telephone
confercnce with Bincoe; review emails from
W_Pierce and respond; request data from
W Pierce; review dropouts; conference with
legal assistant about organizing documents
received from State; conference with R.
Gray re: various matters.

Review (partial} of document production;
conference with T. Hunter re: discovery;
review email re: document production;
review D. Anderson presentation to LBB;
review email re: conference with H. Keller;
review S. Hernandez email re: document
production; review email from H. Keller's
office; reply to same; review and analysis of

Invoice # 40881

6.00 hrs

0.25 lus

0.00 hrs

1.55 hrs

1.20 hrs

4.70 hrs

4.50 hrs

$1950.00

$ 11250

$ 000

$ 697.50

$120.00

$1527.50

$2,025.00

Paged



05/15/2012

05/15/2012

05/16/2012

05/16/2012

05/16/2012

05/16/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

document production; conference with T.
Hunter, R. Freeman and W, Pierce re:
status, exhibits and testing.

Review documents produced by State
Defendants; confer with attorneys re; same;
telephone conference with AG's office re:
documents produced; confer with T. Hunter
re; same; continue reviewing documents
produced by State Defendants to Calhoun
County ISD.

Telephone conference with Jermey Finn re:
class size; finish memorandum on
superintendent witnesses; emaii to D.
Hinojosa re: ELS and comp. education;
review response from D. Hinojosa; review
articles on class size matters; review emails
from W. Pierce and respond; meet with J.
Folkas.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data, conference with counsel re: same:
Telephone conference with Wayne Pieice
re: data and contact information for Tom
Camby at TASBO; conference with counsel
re: data and meeting; review and reply to
email from counsel re: supenintendent
recommendations; update same; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: same.
Conference with R( Gray IV re: exhibits;
conference with T. Hunter re; same; prepare
for conference with J. Folks; review §.
Dahlberg era2il; review additional
production, conference with R. Gray IV re;
exhibuis; telephone call to G. Santiago - left
message; telephone conference with G.
Santiago re: M. Hurley deposition; review
W. Pierce email; review revised exhibits;
conference with T. Hunter and J. Folks re:
possible witness testimony; review memos
re: superintendent witnesses; conference
with T. Hunter re: same.

Continue reviewing and organizing
documents produced by State Defendants;
confer with attorneys re: same.

Telephone conference with B. Wood re:
superintendents and Harney as expert;
review emails from W. Pierce and respond;

Invoice # 40881

2.00 hrs

430 hrs

2.25 hrs

3.25 hrs

2.25 hus

0.80 hrs

$200.00

$1365.00

$393.75

$1,462.50

$225.00

$260.00

Page 5



05/11H2012

05/17/2012

05/17/2012

05/18/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

email to T. Robertson re: scheduling follow
up meetings with superintend; email to D.
Hinojosa re: meeting.

Review and print data re: meeting with
counsel; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: litigation requests; email Wayne
Pierce re: funding gap exhibit; conference
with counsel re: correlation between
performance and revenue per WADA,;
review and update I&S tax rates for
Memorandum on recommendation on
superintendent witnesses; email counsel re:
same; review email from counsel re: same;
email Wayne Pierce, Ray Freeman, and
Toni Hunter re; differences found in data we
have and information given to us by
superintendents; finish formatting and
printing all data and exhibits; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; conference with
T. Hunter re: 5/18 hearing; telephone
conference with G. Santiago re: M. hiurley
deposition; conference with R.(uay IV re:
data analysis; review additional analysis;
telephone conference with G Santiago re:
5/25 conference; review C. Diamond email;
review request for production from C.
Diamond; review W, Pierce email re:
conference re; ¢ihibits; correspond to T.
Hunter re: same; conference with T. Hunter
re: superintendents interview conference;
confererice with T. Hunter re: S. Hurley
interview; work re: exhibits.

Review Efficiency Intervenor REP; respond
t¢-1. Robertson re: follow up meeting with
superintendents; set up meeting to discuss
data.

Review and reply to email from counse] re;
data request; review email from State re:
discovery; meeting with counsel re: data and
exhibits; create exhibit binder; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data
requests; conference with counsel re: exhibit
notebook; conference with counsel re:
summary for Judge Dietz; print same;
scheduling conference with Judge Dietz;

Invoice # 40881

5.60 hrs

2.10 hrs

0.80 hus

5.40 hrs

$980.00

$ 945.00

$260.00

$945.00

Page 6



05/18/2012

05/18/2012

05/20/2012

05/21/2012

05/21/2012

05/21/2012

05/21/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

meeting with R. Gray and T. Hunter re:
debriefing of status conference; telephone
conference with Dr. Baker re: requested
data and discovery.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; conference
with T. Hunter re: data set; prepare for
status conference; conference with R. Gray
IV re: exhibits and working notebook:
review W, Pierce email; reply to same;
review D). Hinojosa email re: testimony on
weights; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D. Hinojosa email; conference with
T. Hunter and B. Wood re: weights and trial
strategy; attend status conference; post
hearing conference with attorneys.

Meet with B. Wood and R. Gray re: status;
attend court pre trial conference; conference
with R. Gray and Richard Gray IV as follow
up to conference; emails to T. Robertson o
meeting with superintendents; emai] to
Plaintiff attorney re: issues raised by Judge.
Review P. Fraissinet email; review T,
Hinojosa email; reply to same.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
Proposed Agreed Data Sed; einail Mark
Trachtenberg re: same; review emails from
Ray Freeman re: charter versus public
school spending; review articles re; same;
calendar next s¢ii=guling conference with
Judge Dietz; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: datz requests and exhibits;
confererce with counsel re:proposed agreed
data s=i: review email from Mark
Trachienberg re: same, email counse] re:
same.

Keview W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review M. Moses email; conference with M.
Bolen re: reply to same; review R. Gray IV
email re: database; reply to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: School District
Listings; compile information pertaining to
the T. Hunter recommended school districts.
Prepare for presentation at Litigation
‘Workshop in San Francisco; many emails to
set up telephone conference with Plaintiff's
attorneys re: various matters; email to

Invoice # 40881

4.70 hrs

3.60 hrs

0.35 hrs

1.05 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.20 hrs

4.00 hrs

$2,115.00

$1170.00

$ 15750

$183.75

$ 22500

N/IC

N/IC

Pape 7



05/22/2012

05/22/2012

05/23/2012

054232012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

W Pierce re: Judge's decisions; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: "agreed data”;
review email from T. Robertson re:
superintendents meetings and respond.
Review email from Tim Wolff re: litigation
requests 004C, 006C, and 014B; begin
printing same; telephone conference with
Tim Wolff re: same; meeting at Equity
Center with John Hubbard re: School
Finance System in Texas; conference with
counsel re: data, meeting at equity center,
and conference call; telephone conference
with Supreme Court re: electronic record;
telephone conference with Third Court of
Appeals re: same; format and print litigation
reguest 005D and 014B; format litigation
request 004D); review proposed exhibit list;
print same.

Respond to various emails from T.
Robertson re: meetings with
superintendents; review email from M.
French and respond; review discovery
responses from State to Ft. Berd end
Calhorn County and summerize for R. Gray,
meet with L. Moak re: variots maiters:
prepare for presentation at Litigator's
Workshop in San Francisco; telephone
conference with P. ¢_albert re: various
matlers.

Review email ftom Wayne Pierce re:
Superintencent M&D and I&S tax rates;
telephore vonference with Plaintiff Groups
re: Semninar to Judge Dietz, disclosing of
experis to Judge; "agreed data set,” class
s12e expert, teacher quality expert, and
geadline for dispositive motions; conference
with counsel re: same; email Wayne Pierce
and Ray Freeman re: data variables check.
Review revised interview notes with
superintendents; prepare for interviews;
review States discovery responses,
conference with T. Hunter re: cost of
education analysis; work re: discovery and
database; conference with T. Hunter re:
witness interviews, data analysis and 5/23
conference call; review M. Hurley report;

Invoice # 40881

4.50 hrs

1.00 hrs
4.00 hrs

1.25 hrs

2.95 hus

$787.50

$325.00
N/IC

$218.75

$1,327.50

Page 8



05/23/2012

05/24/2012

05/24/2012

05/24/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

prepare for conference with G. Santiago and

T. Canby; conference with R. Gray IV re:

5/23 conference call and issues to cover.

Work on presentation for Litigator’s 3.00 hrs
Workshop in San Francisco; Telephone 2.00 hrs
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys re:

various matters; conference with R. Gray re:

discovery responses and other matters;

review emails and attachments on [ & §

from R. Freeman and J. Hamey; telephone

conference with W. Pierce and others on

discovery requests.

telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 0.25 hrs
data; review emails re: deposition of Mark

Hurley.

Review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter 5.45 hrs

email re: conference call, review email re:
M. Hurley deposition; review message form
H. D. Chambers office; conference with S.
Jennings re: same; review T. Hunter emai;
re: B. Baker; review emails re: HD.
Chambers conference; conference #:ith T.
Hunter re: presentation to cour’ and
methodology for calculation of $3,500 in
today’s values; review inflation calculator
calculation re: $3,500; conterence with B.
Wood, T. Hunter, T. Wallis and J. Vaughn
re: potential testimony; conference with B,
Wood and T. Bunter re: witnesses and
$3,500 calculation; review deposition notice
with subpocra for M. Hurley; review Ft.
Bend's discovery responses; review C.
Diamond email; review intervenors
discovery responses; review A. Brownson
cinail; review chart provided; review D.

‘thompson email; review T. Hunter email to

D. Hinojosa, review D. Hinojosa reply;

conference with T. Hunter re: A. Coriez

conference; review C. Diamond email;

review M. Trachtenberg email; conference

with S. Jennings re: travel logistics for M.

Hurley deposition.

Confer with T. Hunter re: response to 1.10 hrs
Efficiency Intervenors’ RFD; prepare draft

of response; confer with R. Gray re: Hurley

deposition; review notice re: same; review

Invoice # 40881

$975.00
N/C

$ 4375

$2,452.50

NAC

Fage 9



05/24/2012

05/25/2012

05/25/2012

05/21/2012

05/28/2012
05/29/2012

05/25/2012

3102-01

TBH

REG

RG 1‘»’

REG

and calendar schedule of meetings with

superintendents; confer with T. Hunter re:

rescheduling H.DD. Chambers to June Ist.

Telephone conference with Wayne, Buck, 4,00 hrs
and Doug re: Comyn’s number; review 0.90 hrs
email from W. Pierce re: same and respond;

conference with R. Gray re: seminar for the

judge; elephone conference with W. Pierce

re: same; work on presentation to Litigator’s

‘Workshop; meet with superintendents re;

serving as witnesses; confer with R. Gray

and B. Wood re; Cornyn’s number;

telephone conference with C. Diamond re:

Judge's seminar and revealing our experis;

email to Richard re: FAST, email 10 S.

Dahlburg re: telephone conference; email to

D. Hinojosa re: conferring re: emails from

C. Diamond and D. Hinojosa and respond.

Prepare for conference with 5.55 hrs
superintendents; prepare for conference with

(. Santiago and T. Canby re: M. Hurley;

review analysis of of use of 1&S for M&O

by wealthy districts; conference with T.

Canby and G. Santiago re; M. Hurley

report; conference with B, Wood, T. Hunter,

J. Cooper and J. Pfeifer re: possible

witnesses and testing; roview W. Pierce

correspondence; ccroerence with T. Hunter

re: 5/29 conferchice; review L. Mock email,

Respond to email from W. Pierce and D. 2.50 hrs
Hinojosa re. raeeting on Tuesday; meet with

superintendents; conference with R. Gray

re: supcrintendents and M. Hurey

derocition.
Currespond to T. Hunter via email re: 5/29 0.15 hrs
conference.
Work re: exhibits. 3.00 hrs
Online research re: MALDEF potential 4.80 hrs

experts Delia Pompa and Elena Izquierda;

review all data and vpdate and revise

Summary of Litigation Requests; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: litigation

request 014C; Review data sheet Counties

Ranked by Wealth Alphabeticaily; find all

gaps in revenue per WADA bigger than

$800.00 and indicate same.

Travel to/from San Antonio; conference 5.85 hrs

Invoice # 40881

$1300.00
N/C

$2,497.50

$812.50

$ 6750

$1,350.00
$840.00

$2,632.50

Page 10



05/29/2012

05/2912012

05/30/2012

05/30/2012

05/30/2012

05/30/2012

05/31/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

with D. Hinojosa, A. Cortez, W, Pierce and

T. Hunter re: school finance and database

matiers; review Edgewood discovery

responses; review email re: D. Thompson

call; review discovery responses.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Plaintiffs’ 1.50 hrs
response to Efficiency Intervenor’s RFD;

review and revise response; revise RFP to

Commissioner, TEA, State Education

Board; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

finalize and serve Plaintiffs’ Response to the

Efficiency Intervenors’ Reguest for

Disclosure.

Travel to San Antonio to conference with D, 6.60 hrs
Hinojosa and A. Cortez re: data and

weights; telephone conference with D.

Thompson re: Moak data and weights;

finalize Response to RFP of Intervenors;

review suggestions for RFP to state; email

to W, Pierce updating him; telephone

conference with T. Wallis re: College

Station's tax rate; confer with R, Geay're:

various matters.

Review email from Tim Wolff re: litigation 0.55 hrs
request 014D; format and print same;

review emails re: discovery.

Review P. Fraissinet einail; prepare for 5.35 hrs
conference with sugerintendents; conference

with R. Gray I'V re: exhibits; conference

with attorneys re: $3,500 figure inflation

adopted; conferences with T. Hunter, B,

Wood aud superintendents re: possible trial

testimony; conference with B. Wood re:

status,

Revise RFP to Robert Scott, et al.; confer 0.50 hrs
with T. Hunter re: same.

Telephone conference with P. Colbert re: 6.40 hrs

discovery request; edit RFP 1o State; email

to W. Pierce and R. Gray re: $3500; emails

to D. Hinojosa re: discovery and J. Finn;

review responses from D. Hinojosa; meet

with superintendents; confer with R. Gray

and B. Wood re: same.

Prepare for meeting with counsel re: 2.65 hrs
exhibits; meeting with counsel re: same;

telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:

Invoice # 40881

$150.00

$2145.00

$ 96.25

$2,407.50

$ 50.00

$2080.00

$463.75

Page 11



05/31/2012 REG

05/31/2012 SEJ

05/31/2012 TBH

exhibits discussed in meeting.

Prepare for conference re: exhibits; review 3.70 hus
M. Sissler correspondence; review States

response to admissions; review States

responses to production request; review W,

Pierce email; review T. Hunter email;

conference with R. Gray IV re: exhibits;

review W. Pierce email; review material re:

H. Keller conference; conference with H.

Keller and T. Hunter re: probable testimony;

conference with R. Gray IV re: additional

exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re;

production request.

Review State Defendants’ documents 1.25 hus
responsive o Edgewood ISD’s RFP; confer

with R. Gray re: same.

Prepare for meeting with H. Keller; attend 3.60 hrs
meeting with H. Keller and R. Gray, review

discovery requests of other parties; respond

to emails from W. Pierce and T. Roberison;

email to D. Hinojosa; edit our RFP to Siate;

telephone conference with H. Daniels re:

same.

TIMEREEPER RECAY

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 61.80 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 2985 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 71.40 hrs @ 325.00 /hr
SEI Jennings, Susan Paralegal 10.45 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
Fee Recap Totals 173.50

3102-01 Invoice # 40881

$1,665.00

$125.00

$1170.00

$57,283.75

$27.810.00
$ 522375
$23,205.00

$ 1,045.00

$57,283.75

Page 12



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

June 30, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 41109-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing thirough: 06/30/2012

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSIONAL SERVICES

06/01/2012 REG Prepare for conference with H.D. 1.80 hrs $ 855.00
Chambers; conference with H.D. Chambers,
B . Wood and T. Hunter re: possible
testimony; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review state’s proposed agreed database,
06/01/2012 SEJ Confer with T. Hunter re; telephone call 0.25 hrs NG
from D. Murphy re: rescheduling
conference; telephone conferénce with and
email to D. Murphy re: same; email B.
Wood re: same.
06/01/2012 TBH Conference with B Wood re: 2.90 hrs § 94250
superintendent witiesses; meet with H.D.
Chambers; telephone conference with B.
Baker re: vanious matiers; conference with
R. Gray re: superintendents; review and
respond to various emails from M.
Trachtznberg, D. Thompson, W. Pierce and
D Murphy.
06/02/2012 REG Review M. Trachienberg email; conference 1.10 hrs $ 495.00
with R. Blink and T. Hunter re: possible
testimony; work on exhibits.

06/02/2012 TBH Meet with R. Blincoe; conference with R. 2.00 hrs $ 650.00
Gray.

06/04/2012 RGIV  Meeting with counsel re: exhibits. 0.60 hrs $105.00

06/04/2012 REG Review P. Colbert email; review email re: 2.05 hrs $ 92250

R. Scott deposition; review R. Scott
deposition notice; conference with R. Gray
IV re: exhibits; conference with T. Hunter
re: R. Blincoe conference and weights;
review memo on D. Murphy 6/5 conference;

3102-01 Invoice #41109 Page 1



06/04/2012

06/04/2012

06/05/2012

06/05/2012

06/05/2012

3102-01

SEX

RGIV

REG

review W, Pierce email; reply 1o same;
review D). Ray email; review memo
prepared by D. Ray; reply to D, Ray, review
W. Pierce additional email; review emai! re:
6/8 conference re: B. Blake.

Review Notice of Intention to Take Oral 0.10 hrs
Deposition of Commissioner Robert Scott.
Telephone conference with H. Keller; 2.90 hrs

emails to W. Pierce and B. Baker to set up
telephone conference; review emails from
H. Daniels re: $3,500 figure; draft
recommmendation on R. Blincoe; review
recommendations to make cuts; conference
with R. Gray re: various matters; review
emails from W. Pierce on R. Jaklich;
prepare for meeting with D. Murphy;
telephone conference with Charles; edit
RFP; review Baker fairness blog.

Review emails re: discovery; conference 0.20 hrs
with counsel re: inter-district comparison.
Review C. Diamond email; review 5.25 hrs

intervenors discovery; review B. Wood
email; reply to same; work re: B. Bass
status; conference with T. Hunterand D.
Murphy re: potential testimony; conference
with re: exhibits; review P.
Fraissinet email with protective order;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
message from D. Mirtphy; review R,
Blincoe treatise te. facilities; review FAST
report; conference with R. Gray IV re:
exhibits; revicw property tax exhibit;
conference with R, Gray re: same.

Edit memorandum on Superintendents; meet 5.90 hrs
with [0 Murphy; review emails from P,
Freissinet re: notice under TERPA and
orotective order; conference with R. Gray
ve: same; respond to P. Fraissinet's email;
review email from 8, Dahlberg re: seminar
for judge; review varied of school finance
articles; email te B. Baker re: school he
identifies as not getting fair funding and
PAST Report; telephone conference with all
Flaintiff attorneys re: protective order and
notice, focus district, experts, agreed data
set, Hurley deposition, tech persen for trial
and deposition notice to TEA; conference
with R. Gray re: same; follow up emails to
all Plaintiff attorneys.

Invoice # 41109

$10.00

$ 942,50

$ 35.00

$2.362.50

$1,917.50

Page?



06/06/2012

06/06/2012

06/06/2012

06/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SE7

TBH

Review notes from meeting with counsel re: 2.65 hrs
exhibits; prepare for meeting at Equity
Center re: same; review emails re:
discovery; update discovery summary,
review emails re: protective order; review
protective order.

Review J. Turner email; review P. Fraissinet 2.85 hrs
email; review draft protective order; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review
message re: Equal Protection issue; review
message re: focus districts; conference with
T. Hunter re: same; conference with T.
Hunter re; equal protection claim, protective
order and list of focus districts; review C.
Diamond email; review J. Turner email;
reply to same; review J. Turner email;
conference with T. Hunter re; R, Scout
deposition; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review C. Diamond email; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same; review
8. Dahlberg email; review emails 72; D.
Hurley deposition; review D. Finnjosa
email; reply to same; review draft
correspondence to Superidtendents;
ielephone conference with W, Pierce re: B.
Hammmond press confereice; correspond to
C. Diamond re: B. fammond, review B.
Wood email re;§. Harvey; conference with
T. Hunter re: same; review sigued
protective crder; conference with T. Hunter
re: same: review T. Roberison emails (2);
reply to same (2); conference with T. Hunter
re: salre; review J. Reilly emails (2).
Review email from W. Pierce re: telephone 1.50 hrs
conference with REG; confer with R. Gray
re: same; email W. Pierce re: same; confer
with T. Hunter re: letters to superintendents;
email T. Robertson re: list of all
superintendents T. Hunter met with; review
emails re: same; confer with T, Hunter re:
RFP to the TEA and Interrogatories; revise
and finalize Interrogatories; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; finalize and serve RFP and
Interrogatories.

Draft designation of districts; finalize 4.40 hrs
discovery requests and serve on state;
emails to T. Roberison re: FERPA notice;

Invoice # 41109

$463.75

$1,282.50

$1,430.00

Page 3



06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/08/2012

06/08/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

REG

review emails on agreed data set from P.

Colbert and from various Plaintiff aitorneys

and respond; review emails from H. Daniels

re: information for B. Baker and respond;

review emails from P. Fraissinet and D.

Hinojosa re: teacher testimony and respond;

several telephone conferences with re:

FERPA notice; email to W. Pierce re: same.

Review discovery; update discovery 4.10 hrs
summary; telephone conference with Tim

Wolff re: exhibit requests.

Review various emails re: notice; reply to 215 hrs
same; review C. Diamond email; reply to

same; review D. Thompson email; reply to

same; review T. Robertson emails; reply to

same; review discovery request; work re:

preparation for M. Hurley deposition;

review message from T. Hunter; telephone

call to T. Hunter - left message; conference

with S. Jennings re: designation of focus

district; review D. Thompson email; reply 1o

same; review P. Fraisset email; review T.

Robertson email; reply to same revisw

email from Hutio; reply to same; review T.

Robertson status email; conference with S.

Jennings re: S. Dahlberg calize: discovery.

Confer with REG re: districts who need to 7.00 hrs
be called and FERPA neiice; review live

pleading re: same; confer with R. Gray re:

same; confer with T. Hunter re; letters to

superintendents; finalize and send letters;

confer with T, F.obertson re: same; confer

with R. Gray re: same; telephone conference

with 8. Dahlberg’s office re: discovery

requesis in Word format; email same to J.

Reich; confer with R. Gray re: same,

‘I'ravel to San Francisco for school Finance 7.50 brs
Litigator's Workshop; prepare for

presentation; review email from S, Dahlberg

re: seminar for Judge.

Review email from T. Hunter re; contacting 0.05 hrs
R. Freeman; emai! to S. Jennings re: same;

email to Hunter.

Review emails re: deposition exhibits; 0.80 hrs
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:

data; conference with counsel re: same.

Review emails re: notice; conference with 1.40 hrs
T. Hunter re: protective order; conference

with S. Jennings re: designation of focus

Invoice # 41109

$717.50

$ 967.50

$700.00

NIC

$140.00

$ 630.00

Page 4



06/08/2012

06/08/2012

06/08/2012

06/09/2012

06/10/2012

06/11/2012

3162-01

SEJ

SEJ

RGIV

district; review C. Diamond email; reply to
same; review C. Diamond email re:
depositions; review C. Diamond email;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review J. Tumer email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review message from T. Robertson;
conference with S. Jennings re: same;
review email re: designation of focus
districts; work re: exhibit preparation;
review T. Robertson email; review S,
Jennings reply; work re: deposition
preparation.

Continue sending letters to superintendents;
efile and serve Designation of Focus
Districts for Trial and Other Purposes;
confer with attorneys re: status of same;
telephone conference with T. Robertson re:
same; review and calendar Coalition
Plaintiffs discovery requests to State
Defendants; confer with T. Hunter re: emai!
from 8. Dahlberg; email counsel re: same.
Confirm R. Gray 6/12 trip to Dallas; confer
with R. Gray re: same; review Calooun
County Cross Notice.

Give presentation on Adequacy, Equality
and Efficiency; attend workshop;
conference with D. Hinojosa re: seminar for
Judge; review emails 12 STARR EOC
results; conference vnth S. Jennings re:
letters to superizitends.

Review S. Dahlberg email; review D.
Hinojosa enail; review analysis of test
results; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review cross notice of deposition for M.
Huzley, review date re: early test results;
review docoments produced by M. Hurley;
work re: deposition preparation.

Work re: M. Hurley deposition preparation;
work on exhibits and expert reponts.
Review emails re: deposition notices;
conference with counsel re: scheduling
order; review same; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review plaintiff's
discovery requests, conference with counsel
re: STAAR results; telephone conference

‘with W, Pierce re: same; scan and email

results to W. Pierce; review email re:
proposed deposition notices to TEA and

SBOE,; telephone conference with W. Pierce

Invoice # 41109

3.75 hrs

0.25 hrs

2.00 hrs
6.00 hrs

2.65 hrs

1.25 hrs

3.20 brs

$375.00

N/C

$ 65000
N/C

$1,192.50

$ 562.50

$560.00

Page 3



06/11/2012

06/11/2012

06/11/2012

06/12/2012

06/12/2012

06/12/2012

06/13/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

re: STAAR resuits and standards;
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with counsel re: scheduling
order and Supplemental Designation of
Focus Districts; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review email re: Fort
Bend County Second Amended Petition;
review same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same,
conference with R, Gray IV re: exhibits;
complete preparation for M. Hurley
deposition; analysis of EQC scores and
research re: same; outline potential
witnesses and exhibits; review A. Kauffman
emails (3); reply to same; review J. Turner
email; review deposition notice; reply to J.
Turmner email; review Second Amended
Petition of Ft. Bend; review and revise
supplemental focus district designation;
review deposition notices; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re;
designation of Aldine as focus district and
M. Hurley deposition; review Ft. Fiend
designation of districts.

Efile and serve Supplemental Designation
of Focus Districts; confer with atiorneys re:
same; email Equity Center re: same.

Return from San Francisco; conference with
R. Gray IV re: designation of districts;
review articles o isacher training.

Review emails re: deposition dates and
subjects; review email from W. Pierce re: B.
Baker Kaiisus testimony article; read article.
Travel to/iromn Dallas; secure deposition of
M. Huwiey, review W, Pierce, etc.; review T.
Hunier emails.

¥ollow-up from conference; emails to
various Plaintiff attorneys and review
responses from Plaintff attorneys re: agreed
data; seminar for judge, experts on teachers
and class size; review designations by Ft.
Bend and mark county map; review article
on Baker'’s Kansas testimony; emails re:
data to H. Daniels and P. Colbert and review
responses.

Meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits;
telephone conference with T. Wolff re: new
data exhibits; review, format, and print new
exhibits for counsel.

Invoice # 41109

2.05 hrp

0.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

5.00 hrs

0.45 hrs

13.25 hrs

3.00 hrs

6.25 hrs

$ 92250

N/C

$ 8i2.50

N/C

$ 7875

$5,962.50

$ 975.00

$1093.75

Page 6



06/13/2012

06/13/2012

06/13/2012

06/14/2012

06/14/2012

06/14/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Work re: exhibits; conference with attomeys 7.95 hrs
and Equity Center re: exhibits; review W.
Pierce emails; review D. Thompson email;
correspond to D, Thompson and M.
Trachtenberg via email re: 6/14 conference;
review D. Thompson reply; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenberg reply; reply to
same; work on exhibit preparation; travel to
The Woodlands; prepare for 6/14
conference.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Notice of Intent to (025 hrs
Comply with Protective Order and FERPA
Notice; prepare draft of same.

Conference with R. Gray re: Hurley 7.30 hrs
deposition and county distribution of focus
district; attend meeting at Equity Center re:
exhibits; prepare list of trial witnesses for R.
Gray; meet with R. Gray re: exhibits; review
our districts for candidates for early
childhood and class size focus; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re: Scott
deposition; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: Scott deposition; telephone
conference with D. Thompson/left message.
re: Scott deposition; email to J. Finn re:
including our districts in kis réviews; review
several emails form M. Trachtenberg and H.
Mclntosh re: Agreed Caia Set; send email to
all Plaintiff attorney: re: telephone
conference to diicuss State’s proposal for
seminar for Judge; review responses, email
to C. Diamcnd ve: State’s proposal; email to
R. Blincot re: preparation for testimony on
facilities.

Review and reply to emaii from counsel re: 3.95 hrs
meeling with W. Pierce re: exhibits;
teiephone conference with T. Wolff re: data
exhibits; email counsel re: same; telephone
conference with W, Pierce re: data meeting;
conference with counsel re; same; email
counsel re: same; travel to Capitol for
legislative research; legislative research;
review email from counsel re: speeches by
R. Scott; search for same; review email
from T. Wolff re: data.

Confergnce with attorneys re: trial strategy; 6.00 hrs
work re: exhibits; review emails.
Efile and serve Notice of Intent to Comply 1.00 hrs

with the Protective Order; review article and

Invoice # 41109

$3,577.50

NIC

$2,372.50

$691.25

$2,700.00

N/C

Page 7



06/14/2012

06/15/2012

06/15/2012

06/15/2012

06/15/2012

06/16/2012
06/16/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

RGIV

charts posted on Texas Tribune website;
confer with T. Hunter re: same.

Schedule meeting with J. Kracht; review El
Paso Times article of Damon Murphy;
telephone conference with J. Finn; email to
H.D. Chambers, M. French and R. Blincoe
re: class size; draft Notice to Court on
FERPA and Protective Order; telephone
conference with D. Thompson, left
message; email to D, Thompson re: Scott
deposition; review literature on class size;
confer with R. Gray I'V re: various matters;
review response to Ft. Bend and Cathoun
City discovery in preparation for Scott
deposition.

Review data notes; research re: speeches
and articles regarding R. Scott; review email
from M. Trachtenberg re: litigation
schedule; print same for counsel; save all
new data; review emails re: deposition
dates, review legislative research findings,
email counsel re: same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; work re:
exhibits; review M. Mclntosh emaul:
conference call with attorneys re: status;
review J. Turner email; revicw 8. Dahlberg
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review
deposition notice for Staies Board; review J.
Tumer email; review C. Diamond email;
correspond to T hunter via email re:
depositions; review J. Turner email; review
D. Hinojosa'emaii; review J. Finn
engagement letter; correspond to W. Pierce
via emaii e status; review emails re;
expeits; work re; exhibit preparation.
Revizw State Defendants’ documents
responsive to Fort Bend ISD's Second RFP,
confer with attorneys re; same.

Telephone conference with all Plaintiff
attorneys re: seminar for Judge, experts and
other matters; emails (2) to S. Dahiberg re:
seminar for Judge, telephone conference to
S. Dahlberg re: same, left message.
Meeting with counsel re; data and exhibits.
Review J. Tumer email with deposition
notice; review emails re: superintendent
depositions; review email re: J. Finn; review
email re: R. Scott deposition; review email
re: conference with Dr. Kracht; review W.

Invoice # 41109

2.40 hrs

2.85 hrs

2.55 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.30 hrs

1.15 hrs
4.75 hrs

$ 780.00

$498.75

$1,147.50

$50.00

$ 42250

$201.25
$2,137.50
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06/17/2012
06/17/2012

06/182012

06/18/2012

06/18/2012

06/18/2012

06/19/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Pierce email; reply to same; work on
exhibits.

Meeting with counsel re: trial exhibits,
Conference with R, Gray I'V re: exhibits;
work on exhibits.

Format, print, and put together exhibit
notebooks; telephone conference with T.
Wolff re: data; meeting at Equity Center re:
expert report and exhibit notebook.

Review email re: serninar for judge; work
re: exhibits preparation; review S, Dahlberg
email; review D. Thompson email; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review J. Tomer
email; review email re: 6/19 committee
hearing; review W, Pierce email; review T.
Hunter reply; review email from W. Harvey
re: report; review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with T. Hunter, W. Pierce, W.
Fraissinet, and R. Gray IV re: B. Baker
report and exhibits; review email re;
depositions; reply to same.

Review and calendar Calhoun Countv's
Notice of Intent to Take Oral Deposition of
Organizational Representative©of the TEA,
review and calendar various deposition
dates.

Email to Plaintiff attorneys re: telephone
conference to Shelly; i=view emails from H.
Daniels and forward to B. Baker; respond to
emails from H. Daniels, B. Leslie and B.
Baker; attend meeting to hear B. Baker
presentatior and review exhibits with W.
Pierce and .. Freeman; confer on budget
with R. Gray, W, Pierce and R. Freeman;
confea:nce with Anorney General attorneys
on seminar for Judge.

Keview emails re: data requests and
deposition recording service; conference
with counsel re: House Public Education

Committee Hearing on STAAR, research re:

same; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: interdistrict comparisons;
format data for particular counties and print
for counsel; attend Public Hearing on
Education; conference with counsel re:
same; review email from counse] re: focus
districts; meeting with counsel re: same and
superintendent testimony; review exhibit
notebook; telephone conference with T.

Invoice # 41109

0.75 hrs
0.75 hrs

9.10 hrs

6.55 s

0.75 hrs

6.30 hrs

7.25 hrs

$131.25
$ 337.50

$1592.50

$2,947.50

$2,047.50

$1268.75
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06/19/2012

06/19/2012

06/19/2012

06/20/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Wolff re: changes that need to be made
{voicemail}.

Work re: data analysis and exhibits; 2.00 hrs
conference with R. Gray IV re: Hurley
education hearing; review emails re:
conference on 6/2 at Texas A&M; review C.
Nickel email; review deposition notices {5);
draft email to atiorneys re: status; review
emai} from MALDEF, review email re: call
with State; conference with R, Gray IV re:
Education Committee hearing; work on
exhibits; review comrespondence to
Superintendent J. Knight; review B. Woods
email; reply to same (2); correspond to W.
Pierce via email re: status; review R.
Freeman email; reply to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Second Amended 0.50 hrs
Petition; draft same.
Conference with R. Gray re: budget, sharing 5.30 hrs

Haney and superintend depositions; edit
chart on focus districts and email to B,
Baker; listen to House Committee on
Education hearing; review Nationi-Keport
Card; several emails to A. Brown;on getting
information for Finn and Baker; email to
Plaintiff attorneys summaxizing
conversation with S. Dalhberg; review
emails from A. Vasquez r¢: meeting with J.
Kracht and respond; review several emails
from J. Finn and respond; several emails to
T. Robertson rs: email to superintendents;
telephone coniference with P. Colbert re:
data and what he is doing.

Review aid reply to email from counsel re; 4.55 hrs
telepihone conference with P. Colbert, W.
Picwoe, and R, Freeman; update Exhibit
Notebooks with updated exhibits; format
and print new data set for counsel re: focus
districts; telephone conference with P.
Colbert, W. Pierce, R. Freeman, and T.
Hunter re: data concerns; calculate gaps in
revenue for counties ranked aiphabetically
with gaps larger than $800; telephone
conference with T. Wolff re: exhibit
changes; meeting with counsel re: telephone
conference with P. Colbert; update Exhibit
Notebook for counsel, telephone conference
with R. Freeman re: inter-district
comparisons; conference with counsel re:

Invoice # 41109

$ 900.00

NiC

$1,722.50

$796.25

Page 10



06/20/2012

06/20/2012

06/20/2012

06/21/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

same,

Review R. Fraissinet emails (2); review 4.80 hrs
email re: facilities survey; review D,
Thompson email; reply to same same,
review draft agreement with Moak/Casey;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; correspond to attorneys via email re:
6/22 conferences; review B. Wood email;
review W. Pierce email; review scope of
work of Moak/Casey; prepare for telephone
conference with Dr. Kracht; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same;
telephone conference with Dr. Kracht and T.
Hunter re: freshman class of Texas A&M:
review A. Kaoffiman email; telephone
conference with M. Trachtenberg and J.
Turner re: L. Moak; telephone conference
with J. Turner re: experts; review R.
Freeman email; conference with T. Hunter
and B. Wood re: budget and deposition
schedule; conference with R. Gray IV aun
T. Hunter re: P. Colbert call; review I,
Turner email; review 8. Dahlberg #mail;
review . Diamond email; confetznce with
T. Hunter re: R. Scott deposition; reply to
emails; review D. Thompson-email; review
R. Freeman email; conference with R. Gray
IV re: same; review states discovery
responses; review M. Trachtenberg emails
(2¥; reply to sare.

Review and revise Superintendents’ contact 1.75 hrs
informatin; conver with T. Hunter re: same;
review Stete Defendants’ responses to
Interveno:s’ RFP; review email from T.
Rohertson re: updated list of districts; email
Superintendents material for deposition
oizparation; review email from T. Wallis re:
same.

Conference with R. Gray re: J. Kracht, 5.50 hrs
budget and other matters; telephone
conference with P. Colbert and W. Pierce
and R. Freeman and Richard Gray IV re:
data; conference with B. Wood and R. Gray
re: budget; email to T. Robertson re:
superintendent summer schedules; emails to
Plaintiff attorneys re: Haney and deposition
schedules; prepare for Scott deposition.
Review exhibit notebook; update same for 2.65 hrs
counsel; format and print updated exhibits;

Invoice #41109

$2,160.00

$175.00

$1,787.50

3463.75
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06/21/2012

06/21/2012

06/21/2012

06/22/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

mark updated exhibits for W. Pierce,
telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
inter-district comparisons; telephone
conference with W, Pierce re: data and
exhibit runs; print discovery attachments for
counsel; review notes for meeting monday
at Equity Center.

Prepare for 6/25 conference; conference
with T. Hunter re: same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review D. Thompson email; review
C. Wooley email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
email re: confidentiality agreement;
conference with T. Hunter re: 6/22 hearing;
review additional emails; reply to same;
work on exhibits; review draft advisory by
State; review T. Hunter email re;
depositions; reply to same; review emails re:
Plaintiff’s advisory to court; review and
revise draft advisory.

Revise superintendents’ contact informatiun
and availability for depositions; telephune
conference with R. Knight re: same; review
and return email from T. Robetson re:
litigation deadlines; review revised Focus
Districts spreadshest.

Review emails from W. Pierce and respond;
email to B. Wood, W. Pierce, R. Freeman
and P. Colbert re: Wait Haney; email to B.
Wood re: covering depositions; review
information from our superintendents to
schedule depositions; conference with R.
Gray on various matters; prepare for Scott
deposition; review Defendant's Advisory to
court aud draft response; email to all
Plaintiff attomeys re: same; review email
tiom H. McIntosh on expert for teacher prep
and respond; review vitae of proposed
expert; review emails from other Plaintff
attomeys re: same; conference with Richard
Gray IV about articles for Scott deposition;
telephone conference with L. Moak re:
weights and target revenue.

Review emails re: presentation to Judge
Dietz; conference with counsel re:
scheduling conference; status conference
with Judge Dietz; telephone conference with
counsel re: same; review Edgewood's Plea
to the Jurisdiction and Motion to Dismiss

Invoice # 41109

3.35 hrs

0.60 hrs

5.40 hrs

3.90 hrs

$1,507.50

NC

$1,755.00

$682.50
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06/22/2012

06/22/2012

06/24/2012

06/24/2012

06/25/2012

06/25/2012

06/25/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV

REG

REG

Intervenors; conference with counsel re:
same.

Review emails re: advisory; review articie
re: NAEP scores; review L. Lacy email re:
depositions; work on exhibits; conference
with attomeys re: status conference; review
additional emails; review exhibits;
conference with atiorneys re: status
conference.

Review emails from W. Pierce and respond;
email to H. Kelier and J. Kracht and R,
Rhodes re: college ready; attend meeting
with Plaintiff’s attorneys and L. Moak and
A, Branson; attend scheduling conference
with J. Dietz.

Qutline trial testimony of superintendents;
conference with counsel re: same,

Review D. Thompson email; review L. Lacy
email; review P. Colbert email; reply to
same; review P. Colbert response; review
M. Sisle email; review plea to jurisdiction
filed by MALDEF, review C. Diamcnd
email; review TEA maierial, prepare for
6/26 conferences.

Equity Center Annual Breakfast; meeting at
Equity Center re: data ans exhibits;
cenference with counsel re: same; email
Charles re: weights; telephone conference
with T. Wolff re: exlubit and data; meeting
with counsel re:'moving forward, case
status, deposition assignments and dates;
calendar desesition dates; conference with
legal assistant re: same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Focus Districts
and a'torney contacts; set up same; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Conference with superintendents of
coalition; conference re: exhibits;
conference with R. Gray IV and T. Hunter
re: 6/22 status conference; conference with
R. Gray IV and T. Hunter re: Judge Dietz
status conference and new developments;
review J. Turner email; review plea to
jurisdiction filed by Edgewood; review
material on NAEP; review TEA deposition
notice; review L. Lacy emails (3); review
message from J. Turner; review test
summary information; telephone conference
with J. Tumer re: TAKS signs.

Invoice # 41109

2.25 hrs

5.00hrs

3.00 hrs

2.25 hrs

6.40 hrs

0.75 hrs

5.85 hrs

$1,012.50

$1,625.00

$525.00

$1,012.50

$1120.00

$ 337.50

$2,632.50
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06/25/2012

06/26/2012

3102-01

TBH

REG

Attend meeting of Equity Center members 9.60 hrs
and Coalition members; meet with W.
Pierce, C. Akki, R. Freeman, R. Gray, R.
Gray IV re: data systems; review Money
Matters by B. Leslie and comment;
conference with R. Gray re: conference with
Judge and follow-up tasks, deposition
schedule; expert; telephone conference with
S. Kline and R. Levin potential experts;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
scope of testimony for W. Haney and
deposition coverage; emails to various
Plaintiff attorneys re: working group on
Final Order and on Seminar for Judge,
email to L. Moak re: SAT and ACT data;
review response; email to W. Pierce re:
same; begin scheduling deposition
preparation for our superintendents,

Review email re: B. Duncombe; reply to 6.00 hrs
same; review P. Colbert email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review attachment; reply to M.
Trachtenberg email; review J. Turacr email;
review D. Thompson email; review D,
Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; review R. Frecman email;
review D. Thompson emal; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenbers email; review
superintendents list; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; review S, Dahlberg email,
review P. Fraizsinet email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review census data re:
funding; raview D. Hinojosa email; review
J. Torner email: review emails re; additional
depnsuions; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
exnibits; review J. Tumer emails (2); review
=inail re: testing data; review email re:
experts; emaii all parties re: trial schedule;
email D. Thompson and M. Trachtenberg
re: trial scheduling; review A. Brownson
email; review P. Fraissinet email; review
deposition notice for TEA; review W.
Haney report {prior}); review B, Leslie work
product; review W, Haney article "the Myth
of the Texas Miracle in Education”™; review
J. Turmer emails (2); reply to same (2);
review D. Thompson email; email attorneys
re: adequacy issues; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa

Invoice # 41109

$3,120.00

$2,700.00
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06/26/2012

06/26/2012

06/27/2012

06/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

email; review D. Thompson email; review J.
Tumer email; review D. Thompson email;
Review L. Moak email; reply to same;
review J. Tumer email; reply to same;
review J. Tumer email re; R. Scott
deposition; review analysis of STARR test
results; review D. Hinojosa email; review
petition of charter schools; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa email.

Review W. Haney email; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
email team re: Perales deposition; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review D,
Hingjosa email; reply to same; partial
attendance at R. Scott deposition;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: Texas
Workforce Coalition; telephone conference
with T. Hunter re: R. Scott deposition and
witness schedule; work re: exhibit
preparation; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
same; conference with R. Gray, IV r:
Workforce Coalition contacts and ©5thibits;
review J. Dietz letter of 6/28; conference
with team re: same; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits and weight issues.
Review and respond to several emails from
Plaintiffs’ attomeys on various issues;
review emails and #:ached articles from W.
Pierce; draft erail to superintendents re:
deposition preparation and deposition
schedule; review email from Adam re: tech
aspects of video conference and respond;
conference with R. Gray re: B. Leslie report
and.other matters; prepare for Scott
depasition.

Revise and update Superintendent
testimony; conference with counsel re:
same; telephone conference with T. Wolff
re: Yield data; review and update
Superintendent testimony; email counsel re:
same; review emails re: high stakes testing
and school district resolution on same;
review emails re: data formulas; review
emails re: community college expert on the
readiness of students coming in to
community college.

Review email from various superintendents
and respond; review emails from Plaintiff

Invoice # 41109

.85 hrs

3.20 hrs

2.25 hrs

3.30 hrs

$1,732.50

$1,040.00

$393.75

$1,072.50
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06/28/2012

06/28/2012

06/26/2012

06/26/2012

3102-01

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

REG

attomeys on teacher expert, seminar for
Judge, charter schools and other matters and
respond; review outline of superintendent
testimony and edit; adjust schedule for
superintendent deposition; conference with
R. Gray re: same; email to superintendents
re: same; prepare for Scott deposition;
conference with W, Pierce and R. Freeman
re: Leslie report and equal protection.
Telephone conference with T. Wolff re:
Yield run data; conference with counsel re;
same; format and print Litigation Requests
018A, 0194, and 020A; meeting with
counsel re: Yield data; conference with
counse! re: Texas Coalition for a
Competitive Workforce; research same;
telephone conference with T. Wolff re;
updated data; format and print updated data;
review letter from Judge Dietz re: trial days
and seminar for the court; conference with
counsel re: Superintendednt testimony;
email legal assistant re: same,

Attend deposition of R. Scott; review
Judge’s letier; conference with Praintiff's
attorneys about same; conference with R.
Gray re: same; edit outling of testimony of
superintendents; review emiail from R.
Rhodes and superintendcats.

Update Exhibit bina=rs with new data;
telephone confecence with W. Pierce re:
same and exhibit meeting; meeting with
counsel re: case status, trial time, expert
reports, business leadership, meeting at
equity center.

Review State’s production requests; review
S. Klein email; review email to
superintendents; review M. Trachienberg
emails (3); reply to same; review article re:
D. King; review I. Tumer emails (2); review
S. Dahlberg emails; review D. Hinojosa
email; review email re: 3 presentation
districts; work re: exhibits; conference with
T. Hunter re: completion of R. Scout
deposition; review L. Moak email; reply to
same; review M. Trachienberg email;
review D. Hingjosa email; work on exhibits;
conference with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: trial preparation matters, exhibits,
depositions, and trial time; review M.,

Invoice # 41109

5.25rs

8.20 hrs

3.10 hrs

4.90 hrs

391875

$2,665.00

$542.50

$2,205.00
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06/29/2012

06/29/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same (2);
review P. Fraissinet email; review emails re:
additional experts; conference with T.
Hunter re: call re: experts; conference call
with Plaintiffs group re: trial time;
conference call with attorneys re: trial time;
conference with T. Hunter re: trial issues.
Review M. Trachtenberg emails (4); reply 4.75 hrs
to same; review Hinojosa emails {3); reply
to same; review material re: charter school
suit; review A. Kauffman email; review
emails re: teacher experts; review J. Tumer
email; conference with T. Hunter re;
depositions; work re: W. Haney expert
designation; review R. Freeman email;
telephone call to B. Hammond - left
message; review A. Kaufman email; reply
to 5. Dahlberg email; review testing data
analysis; review W. Pierce email; review R.
Freeman email; review R. Blincoe email;
conference with T. Hunter re:
Commissioner Scott deposition; review I,
Tumer email; reply to same; revieo/ D).
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachienberg
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; confer=iice with T.
Hunter re: drop out rate; review reports re:
drop out rate; review vroduction material;
telephone conference with D, Thompson re:
status; telephore conference with A.
Kauffman re: W. Haney; conference with T.
Hunter re: stlieduling of depositions;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: experts;
review emails re: community college
witneiss; review D. Thompson email.
Atend continuation of R. Scott’s deposition; 8.60 hrs
conference with L. Moak; review emails
form Plaintiff’s attomeys and others and
respond; conference with R. Gray re: time
needed to present case and scheduie for
superintendents depositions; email to all
superintendents re: deposition preparation
and schedule for depositions; telephone
conference with Plaintiff’s attorneys re:
experts; telephone conference with all
Plaintiff's attomeys re: time needed to
present case.

Invoice # 41109

$2,137.50

$2,795.00

$93,195.00
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PIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn

Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

10520 his @
7440 hrs @
97.00 hrs @
1300 hrs @

0.00 s @

289.70

Invoice #41109

450.00 /br
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$47,340.00
$13,020.00
$31,525.00
$ 1,310.00

3 0.00

$93,195.00
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GRAY & BECKER. P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
July 31, 2012
Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 41271-1
Our filedt: 3102
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing thimagh:
cfo Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
07/01/2012 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: deposition 0.20 hrs
dates; review deposition notices re; same.
07/01/2012 REG Review email re: graduation programs; 3.00 hrs

email R. Gray, IV re: course content for
same; review M. Trachtenberg emails;
review D. Thompson emails; review email
discovery; work re: discovery; veply to
emaiis re: depositions; revicw P. Colbert
email; reply to same; reviews M.
Trachtenberg emails (2 review D.
Hinojosa emails; review witness outlines;
review revised exhibits; review message
from T. Hunter re: TEA depositions; work
on draft lettcr 1o Judge Dietz,
07/01/2012 TBH Draft lett¢r to Judge re: time estimate; 1.00 hrs
conference with R. Gray re: discovery and
othermnatters; emails to and from other
Plaintiff attomeys to schedule telephone
cunference with Vigdor and Fuller re:
payment tc Moak, Casey.
07/02/2012 RCIV)  Update exhibit notebook; update same for 4.55 hrs
Wayne Pierce; meeting at Equity Center
with Wayne Pierce re: database, exhibits,
and case status; review emails re: deposition
dates, and letters to Judge Dietz re: trial day
allotment.
07/02/2012 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; review M, 8.40 hrs
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.
Hunter re: draft letter re: trial time; review
production request; review P, Colbert email;

74-2427406
REG

00001
07/31/2012

$ 35.00

$1,350.00

$ 325.00

$ 796.25

$3,780.00



07/02/2012

07/02/2012

3102-01

SEY

TBH

review and revise draft letter to J. Dietz;
conference with S. Jennings and T. Hunter
re: discovery; review emails re: expert
witnesses; conference with T. Hunter re: R,
Ried changing districts; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review C.
Diamond email; review 1. Pina email;
review J. Turner email; Review I. Tumer
emails (2); review D. Hinojosa emails;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
S. Dahlberg email; review 8. Klein email;
review T. Craven email; conference call
with B. Duncomb and attorneys re: expert
report and analysis; work on superintendent
witness outlines; review P, Fraissinet email;
review J. Tumer email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review W. Pierce {2)
emails; reply to same (2); review message
from B. Hammond; review C. Enoch letter
to Court; review State’s letter to Court;
review deposition notices; review J. Cumer
email; reply to same; review D, Hirwjosa
email; reply to same; review M
Trachtenberg email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review J.
Turner email re: testing deposition; review
testing deposition notices; finalize letter to
Court; conference with T. Hunterre: B,
Baker call; review: article re; Kansas trial;
telephone cali-io B. Hammond - left
message; conference with T. Hunter re: K.
O'Hanlon :all; review T. Hunter email re:
depositions; telephone conference with B.
Hezminond re: testing

£mail Discovery Superintendents re: State 1.25 hrs
Defendants’ RFP; confer with T. Hunter re:
same; email Superintendents deposition
notices.

Telephone conference with R. Reid re: 5.80 hrs
Tyler/Keller; draft contract letier to Haney;
distribute discovery to districts; conference
with R. Gray re: deposition schedule; email
to B. Wood re: deposition coverage and
review response; telephone conference with
B. Duncomb; telephone conference with B.
Baker; conference with R. Gray re:

Invoice # 41271

N/C

$1,885.00

Page 2



074032012

07/03/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

telephone conference with B. Baker,
amended petition and other matters; review
state’s designation of district’s and circulate;
revise letter to Judge; email to other
Plaintiff attomeys; review comments and
finalize letter; review letters to Judge from
all parties; email to all Plaintiff attomeys re:
districts for presentations; telephone
conference with L. Halpem re: San Antonic
ISD: telephone conference with R. Rhodes,
left message.

Review emails re: deposition notices and 4.00 hrs
deposition needs; review email re: meeting
with Paul Colbert on July 15 at Equity
Center; conference with counsel re:
discovery; meeting at Equity Center re:
database, exhibits, case status; review
emails re: deposition of Robert Scott,
Discovery Objections and Responses;
conference with counsel and legal assisiaiit
re: deposition dates, flight, hotel; telénhione
conference {voicemails) with Bem:is Francis
and Jim Windham re: Texas Coalition for a
Competitive Workforce; update exhibit
book for counsel.

Review and reply to M: Trachtenberg 5.60 hrs
emails {5); review and 1eply to D.
Thompson emails (3); review and reply to P.
Fraissinet emails (4); review and reply to T.
Hunter emails {3); review and reply to W.
Pierce email; review emails re: depositions
(3); review P, Fraissinet email re: witnesses;
confrrence with W. Pierce and staff re:
daiabase and exhibits; review A. Brownson
email re: focus districts; review D. Hinojosa
email; review L. Lawrence email;
conference with attorneys re: discovery;
review J. Tumer emails (2); review H.
Mcintosh email; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; conference with T,
Hunter re: discovery; review additional
production by State; telephone conference
with D. Thompson, J. Tumer and M.
Trachtenberg re: Moak contract and
discovery; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; review L. Moak email; reply

Invoice # 41271

$ 700.00

$2,520.00

Puge 3



07/03/2012

07/03/2012

07/03/2012

07/04/2012

07/04/2012

07/05/2012

07/05/2012

3102-01

SEJ

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

RGIV

to same; email re: L. Moak meeting; review
replies; email attorneys re: L. Moak
meeting; review C. Diamond emails (2);
reply to same; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same.

Email Hillsboro ISD, Kaufman ISD, San
Antonio ISD, and Belton ISD
Superintendents re: State Defendants’
Request for Production.

Draft Plaintiffs’ Response to State
Defendants’ First RFP,

Attend meeting at Equity Center re: data
and exhibits; telephone conference with
experts on teachers quality; telephone
conference with A. Tekell general counsel
for Belton re: discovery request; schedule
deposition; email from C. Diamond re:
same; respond to emails from C. Diamond:
begin drafting objections to Defendanis
discovery; review State’s focus districts,
emails to and from P. Colbert re: sante;
telephone conference with B. Bakaore:
Intervenor approach; email to Xausas
attomeys re: Podgursky; reviev response.
Meeting with counsel re:(da‘abase and
exhibits.

Review D. Thompson email; review A.
Brownson email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review
emails re: B. Raker report (4); work re:
exhibit preparation; work with database.
Telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
re: mesting on exhibits and database;
meeting with counsel re: database;
conference with Ellen Boydstun re: Excel;
conference with counsel re; exhibit
completion; telephone conference with
Wayne Pierce re: meeting; conference with
counsel re: discovery; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review State’s First
Request for Production; review emails re:
same with superintendents; email
superintendents re: email address.

Review H. Keller email; review

email; reply to same; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits; conference with R.

Invoice # 431271

.50 hrs

1.0C jurs

6.60 hrs

1.75 hrs

2.25 hrs

2.60 hrs

3.35 hrs

$ 50.00

$100.00

$2,145.00

$ 30625

$1,012.50

$ 455.00

$2,407.50
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07/05/2012

07/05/2012

3102-01

TBH

Gray, IV re: exhibits; review D. Thompson
emails (3); conference with T. Hunter re: H.
Keller call; telephone call to M.
Trachtenberg re: L. Moak call; conference
with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV re: exhibits;
review C. Hammond email; conference with
and T. Hunter re: status and
strategy; review L. Moak email; conference
call re: L. Moak testimony; review D,
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review message from
W. Pierce; telephone call to W. Pierce re:
exhibits and model; review M. Trachtenberg
emails; conference with T, Hunter re;
discovery responses; review article re:
STEM; review D. Thompson email;
conference with T. Hunter re: discovery
responses; Conference with T. Hunter re:
discovery responses; review J. Tumer eimail;
review S. Klein email; review J. Pfeiler
email; review R, Luna email; revi¢s State
letter re: discovery; review M. Trichtenberg
email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same,
Telephone conference with B. Gilcrease re: 0.25 hrs
State’s RFP to Hillshoro ISD; email T.
Hunter re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:
responses to State Defendants’ RFP.
Conference with R. Gray re: discovery; 6.20 hrs
telephorie conference with R. Gray, M.
Tracki=aberg and J. Tumer re: Moak
contract, conference with and
. Gray re: trial strategy and equal
protection; telephone conference with D.
Thompson, M. Trachtenberg, J. Turner, L.
Moak, D. Casey, R. Gray re: scope of work
for Moak; telephone conference with H.
Lawrence and H. McIntush re: coordinating
discovery response to State; review emails
from J. Turner re: experts on testing and
respond; draft objects to State's discovery
request; several emails to superintendents
re: discovery request of State; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: same.

Invoice # 41271

$ 25.00

$2,015.00

Page 5



07/06/2012

07/06/2012

07/06/2012

07/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Review emails re: Rule 11 Agreement; 2.85 hrs
meeting at Equity Center with Ray
Freeman, Charles Aki, and Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits and database; telephone conference
with counsel re: expert report; review emails
re: discovery, mini trial, depositions.
Review D. Thompson email; review A. 2.25 hrs
Brownson email; email T. Hunter re: 7/11
meetings; review L. Moak contract; email
parties re: same; review H. Keller letter;
review H. McIntush email; review D,
Thompson email re: experts; email T.
Hunter re: shared experts; email parties re:
experts; telephone call to D, Hinojosa - left
message; review D. Thompson email;
review J. Turner email; review A. Brownson
email; reply to same; review emails re:
document production; reply to same; review
G. Salazar email re: discovery; review T.
Hunter email re: amended petition and
database; review R. Gray, IV emails re:
database; review B. Wood email; roview
emails re: experts; review R. Freeman
email; review A. Brownson email.

Revise Plaintiffs’ response to State 1.25 hrs
Defendants’ RFP; draft Plaintiffs’
Designation of Expert Witnesses,

Respond to requestfrom expert re: scope of 4.80 hrs
testimony; telephione conference with B.
Baker re: rebisttal; email to D, Hinojosa re:
same; revicw objection to State’s RFP and
circulate smong Plaintiff attomeys;
telephone conference with L. Halpern, left
message; email to L. Halpem and S.
ahlberg re: various matters; telephone
conference with R. Rhodes, left message;
email to Richard Gray IV re: same; emails
to superintendents re: deposition preparation
and discovery from State; emails to A.
Tekell re: same; telephone conference with
R. Reid re: dropping Tyler; email to S.
Jennings re: same; telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: report and B. Leslie bill;
email to R. Gray re; amending petition;
email to R. Gray outlining trial order; email
to W. Pierce re: thumb nail sketch on

Invoice # 41271

$ 49875

$1,012.50

$125.00

$1,560.00

Page §



07/07/2012

07/08/2012

07/08/2012
07/09/2012

07/09/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

TBH
RGIV

REG

Calhoun City superintendents and State's
focus district.

Review T. Hunter emails re: mini trial;
review D. Thompson re: same; review J.
Zyskowski email re: same; review B. Wood
email; review T. Hunter reply; review L,
Halpern email; review emails re: database;
review R. Freeman email; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same (2);
review J. Zyskowski email; review 1. Turner
email; review 8. Dahlberg email; review D.
Hinojosa email; email S. Dahlberg re:
testing analysis.

Review N. Henderson email; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; begin
preparation for testing depositions; review
email re: L. Dawn Fisher presentation;
review J. Turner emails (2); review N.
Henderson email; review D. Thompson
emails (2}, work on testing depositions.
Review various emails.

Review email from HD Chamberc 2
discovery requests to districts; Telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: Focus
Districts for Texas Taxpzyer, MALDEF,
and Fort Bend; conference with legal
assistant re: same; telephone conference
(voicemail) with covnsel re: Superintendent
discovery responces; email Lacy Lawrence
and Holly Mclntush re: same; review and
reply to emait from Holly McIntush re:
Responte to Request for Discovery; forward
same io counsel; review State’s Discovery
Responses to Intervenors, conference with
cnunsel re: exhibits; forward emails re:
superintendent discovery to counsel; format
and print focus district information;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with legal assistant re:
deposition of superintendents; conference
with counsel re: State’s Responses to our
Discovery.

Review email re: H.D. Chambers; email S.
Jennings re: same; review discovery
responses; conference with R. Gray, I'V re:
same; review J. Tumer email with

Invoice # 41271

1.25 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.70 hrs
3.30 hrs

3.50 hrs

$ 56250

$ 562.50

$ 22750
$ 57750

$1,575.00
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07/09/2012

077092012

07/10/2012

3102-01

SEJ

SEJ

RGIV

attachments; review testing material;
deposition preparation; review D. Hinojosa
email; review D, Thompson email; Review
correspondence re: W. Haney; conference
with R. Gray, [V re: exhibits; review A.
Brownson email; review L. Halpern email,
review N. Henderson correspondence;
telephone call to D. Hinojosa - left message;
review email correspondence to
superintendents; review J. Zyskowski email;
review S. Dahlberg email; review M.,
Trachtenberg email; review W. Pierce
email; review analysis of focus districts;
review D. Hinojosa email; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same.
Review State Defendants/TEA’s Response 0.25 hrs
to TX Taxpayer & Student Faimess
Coalition Plaintiffs’ First Set of
Interrogatories.

Confer with R. Gray re: MALDEF, Fori 1.30 hrs
Bend, Coalition Plaintiffs’ designatica of
focus district; review file re: same;
telephone conference with 1. Pita re:
MAIDEF's designation; confer with R.
Gray re: same; email W. Pierce re; same;
telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
discovery requests to superintendents;
telephone conference with H.D. Chambers
re: August 15tk d=position; email R. Gray
re: same

Review preposed "Responsive Documents” 4.90 hrs
list; email Hoily Mcintush and Lacy
Lawrcnce re: same; forward same to
counsel; review and reply to email from
(avid Hinojosa re: print documents for
deposition; print same and have delivered to
deposition; draft email to discovery
superintendents re: responsive documents;
email same to Angela Tekell; telephone
conference with Toni H. re:same; review
and reply to email from Jerilyn Pfeifer re:
discovery responses; telephone conference
(ieft message) with Reece Blincoe re:
returned his call; telephone conference with
Reece Blincoe re: discovery; review and
reply to email from Angela Tekeli re: Dr.

invoice # 41271

$ 2500

NIC

$ 85750

Page §



07/10/2012

07/10/2012

0771072012

07/11/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Kincannon as a deponent; conference with

legal assistant re: same; review State's

response tc Texas Taxpayer's

Interrogatories.

Review R. Freeman email; reply to same; %.00 hrs
review J. Wisnowski email; review L.

Halpemn email; review R. Freeman email;

review R. Freeman email; reply to same;

attend deposition of Dr. Zyskowski; review

T. Hunter email re: mini trial; review Notice

of Intent to Comply With Protective Order.

Confer with R. Gray re: H.D. Chambers 0.55 hrs
deposition prep; telephone conference with 1.50 hrs
H.D. Chambers’ office re; same; review and

print Fort Bend RFP Response re: Pearson

Studies 3-8; telephone conferences with T,

Hunter re: rescheduling superintendents’

depositions; review deposition schedule and

email T. Hunter re: same; draft Belton ISL’c

responses to Defendants’ RFP; confer witli

R. Gray re: same; review email from ‘court

reporter re: standing order; review Siate

Defendants’ responses to RFP; review

emails from court reporter re: depositions

and status,

Review various emails ie; deposition 0.50 hrs
scheduie, Tyler 1.S.1)}, experts and respond.

Status conference with Judge Dietz; meeting 9.05 hrs

at Moak Casey 1e: trial; listen to voicemails
re: superintendent depositions, counsel
request to oail Karen Garza, Everman video
conferer.ces, conference with legal assistant
re: deposition dates of superintendents;
review and respond to email from Micheal
i’rench re: discovery responses; telephone
conference with Los Fresnos re: responding
to discovery; review and reply to email from
HD Chambers re: discovery deadlines;
telephone conference with Charles at Equity
Center re: exhibits; telephone conference
with Ray Freeman re: case status; telephone
conference with Darlene Brouillette from
Pflugerville ISD re: deposition dates for
Charles Dupree and Video conference
setup; email Karen Garza re: changing the
time of her deposition; reply to email from

Invoice # 41271

$4,050.00

$ 55.00
N/C

$ 16250

$1,583.75

Page ©



07/1172012

07/112012

07/11/2012

07/12/2012

07/12/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

LVS

REG

SES

Holly McIntush re: district questions on
responding to discovery; review and reply to
email from HD Chambers and all discovery
superintendents re: information the State has
access to and forms of responsive
documents; read and review West Orange
Cove II.

Prepare for 7/11 hearing; attend 7/11 status
conference; conference with Plaintiffs
attorneys re: trial strategy and presentation;
review T. Hunter email; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review 5. Murdoch presentation;
review J. Stone presentation; conference
with S. Jennings re: H.D. Chambers call.
Review email from T. Hunter re: charter
districts; email T. Robertson re: same;
telephone conference with H.D. Chamber:z
office re: depo prep; email R. Gray re: saine.
Review voice messages (5) from various
ISD personnel; email to T. Hunter“with
synopsis of each message with'copy to S.
Jennings, R. Gray and R. Gray, IV,

Review D. Thompson emails; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenberz emails; reply to
same; review D. HinGicsa emails; reply to
same; review P. Fratssinet email; reply to
same; telephone conferences with W. Pierce
re: report statux and report issues; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review M. Carr email;
reply to same; review M. Trachtenberg
email; teview J. Vigdor email; review
suppiemental discovery responses; review
uaia from focus districts; complete review
of West Orange opinion; review J.
Wisnowskd email; reply to same.

Review voice messages (2) from L. Massey,
Everman ISD, re: video conference; review
message from G. Salazar re: deposition;
telephone conference with Debbie, H.D.
Chambers’ office, re: deposition preparation
and deposition; review email re: HD,
Chambers’ deposition prep., Pflugerville
ISD questions re: production requests, G.
Salazar deposition prep., San Antonio ISD

Invoice # 41271

7.80 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.25 hrs

3.00 hrs

2.45 hrs

$3,510.00

NIC

NIC

$1,350.00

Page 10



07/13/2012 RGIV

07/13/2012 RGIV

0771372012 SEJ

07/14/2012 REG

07/15/2012 RGIV

3102-01

questions re: production requests, L.

Massey, Everman ISD, questions re: video

conferencing; confer with R. Gray re:

discovery; email W. Pierce re: same; email

R. Gray, IV re: consolidation of charter

schools; confer with R. Gray re: same,

Read and review West Orange Cove II; 1.55 hrs
review and reply to email from Karen Garza

re: rescheduling of her deposition and

meeting to prepare; review and reply to text

message from legal assistant re: video

conference with superintendents; review

email from Lonnie Massey re: same;

telephone conference with legal assistant re;

same; review and reply to email from Reece

Blincoe re: discovery responses; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: exhibits,

Legal research re: student graduation 4.20 hrs
requirements; telephone conference with

Phillip Marzec re: discovery and

depositions; telephone conference with

Gonzalo Salazar re: depositions; telophone

conference (voicemail) for Dadin Hathcock

re: discovery; conference with legal

assistant re: follow up with Lonnie Massey

re: video conference; online research re:

James Kallison; conference with legal

assistant re: depogitions on the 25th and

26th in Dallas; conference with counsel re;

James Kallisen: review Recommended High

School Graduation requirements and

Distinguished High School Graduation

requiicinents and compare; meeting with

Charies Aki at the Equity Center re:

ualabase exhibits.

Telephone call to L. Massey, Everman ISD, 0.30 hrs
re: video conference (left message); email

R. Gray, IV re: same; review State

Defendants’ Third Supplemental Response

to Ft. Bend RFP.

Review of caselaw; review material on K. 2.25 hrs
Kallison; review curriculum material for

recommended program/advanced program.

Format and print new exhibits; conference 8.00 hrs
with counsel re: same; meeting at equity

center with R. Gray I, Wayne Pierce, and

Invoice # 41271

$ 271.25

$ 735.00

NIC

$1,01250

$1,400.00

Page 11



07/15/2012

07/15/2012

07/16/2012

07/16/2012

07/16/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

Paul Colbert re: same; review notes from

meeting,

Conference with W. Pierce, P. Colbert, and 375 hrs
R. Gray, IV re: status, strategy, and exhibits,

Review various emails re; State’s RFP; .50 hrs

deposition perpetration and schedules;
meeting of all attomeys re: trial
presentations and respond.

Review and respond {o emails from various 5.80 hr=
superintendents and plaintiff's counsel re:
deposition dates and scheduling for
preparation and discovery responses;
telephone conference with Todd Williams at
Kaufman ISD re: discovery responses;
review emails from Karen Garza and Reece
Blincoe re: same and depositions; meeting
at equity center re: exhibits.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to 3.60 hrs
same; review D. Thompson email; review
D. Hinojosa emails (2); email T. Hunter re;
same; review Cathoun ISD's Interrogatories
to the State; work re: exhibits; review M.
Trachtenberg email reply to same, review S.
Dahlberg email; forward to 2xperts; review
additional deposition notices; review D.
Thompson email; conference with P.
Colbert, W. Pierce, ata R. Freeman re:
expert reports; review Moak Casey memo;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review email re:
deposition; teview W, Pierce email; email
D. Thomwson re: TASB letter; review
amerni=d TEA deposition notices (2);
review L. Halpern email; reply to same.
reiephone conference with M Carr re: status 2.65 hrs
of maiters; work re: exhibits; review emails;
email J. Turner re: J. Twining deposition;
review J. Tumer reply; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: consulting experts; review T.
Roberts email; review J. Wisnowski email;
review J. Turner emails (2); reply to same
(2); review J. Turner email; reply to same;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review J. Turner email;
review material re: J. Kallison; telephone
conference with J. Turner re; J. Twining

Invoice # 41271

$1,687.50

$ 16250

$1,015.00

$1,620.00

$1,192.50

Page 12



07/16/2012

07/16/2012

071712012

07/17/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

REG

deposition and additional depositions;
review J. Wisnowski email; email T. Hunter
re: same; email W, Pierce re: J, Wisnowski;
review W, Pierce reply; email J. Wisnowski
re: presentation.

Prepare and serve Amended Deposition
Notice - Karen Garza, Lubbock ISD; revise
and serve letter to counsel re: Tyler ISD;
confer with T, Hunter re: same; review
email from L. Halpem re: same; review
email from L. Lawrence cancelling July
25th and 26th depositions in Dallas; email
R. Gray re: H.D. Chambers deposition
preparation date; review email re: Charles
Dupre’s deposition preparation date; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: State’s document
production; review documents produced.
Conference with R. Gray, IV re: Protective
Order; conference with S. Jennings re;
same; telephone conference with W. Plerce
re: timing of meeting today.

Telephone conference with Tim V/olif re;
Revenue Seeking Runs; review eynail from
Adam Pierce re: superintendent conference;
forward same to counsel; conference with
counsel re: same; telephinne conference with
Charles Aki re: database update; telephone
conference with Pav) Colbert re: State’s
Response to our Nequest for Production;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
telephone conference (voicemail) with
Presidert Rhodes at ACC re: student
readicass for college; conference with
counsel re: expert reports; email Wayne
rierce, Ray Freeman, and Paul Colbert re:
same; review and reply to email from legal
assistant re: Los Fresnos discovery.

Review J. Tumer email with attachment;
review D. Thompson email; review
information on focus districts; work on
amended petition; review A. Pierce email
re: 7/20 meeting; conference with R, Gray,
IV re: same; review R. Freeman email;
email attomeys re: J. Walch records; review
D. Thompson email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; email clients re:

Invoice # 41271

2,25 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.35 hrs

3.10 hrs

$225.00

NAC

§ 236.25

$1,385.00

Page 13



07/1772012

0%/1772012

07/18/2012

07/18/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

REG

schools explorer; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review
focus district information; review W, Pierce
email; review emails re: video conference;
review subpoena for Walch Educational
Consultants; email W, Pierce re: same;
conference with R. Gray re: P. Colbert call
and discovery; telephone call to J. Walch -
left messages (2); conference with R. Gray,
IV re: exhibit status; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
telephone conference with J. Waich re:
subpoena; email J. Walch re: same; review
email re: expert report; conference with R,
Gray, IV re: W. Pierce and R. Freeman
1EpOrts.

Review email from S. Dahlberg re: Pearson
confidential documents; telephone
conference with A. Pierce re: video
conference; confer with R. Gray re: sanze;
review email from court reporter; telcphone
conference with Minerva, Los Frezuos ISD,
re: documents for production; email T.
Hunter re: R. Scott deposition transcript.
Review T. Hunter voice tnessages; email to
Hunter re: same; email in R. Gray re:
O'Hanlon cali.

Review email from HD Chambers re: Harris
County Superintendents meeting; forward
same to counss!; meeting with Ray Freeman
re: Expert 2 eport; email counsel re: same;
teiephore conference with Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits and data; telephone conference with
Charies Aki re: same; telephone conference
with Paul Colbert re: data; format and print
zxhibits.

Review L. Lawrence email; review M.
Trachtenberg emails; review D. Thompson
emails; review D. Hinojosa emails; reply to
same; review H.D. Chambers email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same; conference with S. Jennings re:
class size information; review D, Hinojosa
email; reply to same; review message from
R. Freeman; work on document production
from Los Fresnos; review R. Freeman start

Invoice # 41271

1.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

6.55 hrs

3.80 hrs

N/C

$1,146.25

$1,710.00

Page 14



07/18/2012

G7/18/2012

07/19/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

of report; telephone call to R. Freeman re:
report; review C. Nickell email; reply to
same; telephone conference with C. Madrid
at Rep. Fischer's office; conference with S.
Jennings re: class size information; review
D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with S. Jennings re: information
to Rep. Fischer; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: exhibits;, work on amended petition;
work re: preparation of superintendent
testimony; review Dr. Dupre email; review
H.D. Chambers emaiis (2); reply to same
(2); review H.D. Chambers email; reply to
same; review emails re: class size data;
review . Hinojosa email; reply (o same;
review message from B. Schulman;
telephone call to B. Schulman and J. Hoffer
re: background, charters, and consolidation:
Telephone conference with Minerva, Los 2.50 brs
Fresnos ISD, re: document production;
confer with R. Gray re: same; confer'with R,
Gray re: email to Focus Districts 120 Prof.
Schanzenbach; email Focus Disticts re:
documenits for Prof. Schanzenbach review;
telephone conference with C. Nickell re:
request from Rep. Fisclier for pleadings;
confer with R. Gray 1= same; confer with R.
Gray re: sending picadings to Rep. Martinez
Fischer; email C. Madrid re: same; review
and return emall from J. Knight re: materials
for deposiiion; review and return email from
S. Kincannon re: Prof. Schanzenbach
request for data; review and return email
from C. Dupre re: same; email T. Hunter re:
R. Scott deposition transcript; review
correspondence from S. Dahiberg re:
clarification of documents produced
responsive to Ft. Bend ISD's RFP; review
email from R. Gray re: census reports;
review same; confer with R. Gray re: same.

Review various email re: expert reports; 0.50 hrs
class size data; conference with

superintendents and respond.

Format and print all data exhibits; telephone 7.95 hrs

conference with multiple superintendents re:
discovery, meeting with Wayne Pierce and

Invoice # 41271

N

$ 16250

$1,391.25

Page 15



07/19/2012

07/19/2012

07/19/2012

07/20/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Ray Freeman re: exhibits.

Email D. Hinojosa re: depositions; review 3.65 hrs
D. Hinojosa response; review P. Fraissinet

emails (2); reply to same; review K. Garza

email; conference with S. Jennings re: same;

review J. Knight report; review Fraissinet

email; reply to same; review M.

Trachtenberg email; review D. Thompson

emails (2); conference with R. Gray, I'V re:

exhibits; review supplemental discovery

responses from State; review class size

information from Quinlan ISD; conference

with S. Jennings re: same; review emails re:

interlocutory appeal and stay; reply to same;

email correspondence with D. Hinojosa re:

same; review PBS story re: Pharr-San Juan;

complete preparation for video conference

with superintendents.

Telephone conference with T. Wallis, Bryan 2.50 hrs
ISD, re: RFP; telephone conferences (2) 2.50 hrs
with M. Sisler re: index of State’s

documents produced; confer with &, Gray,

IV re: same; email P. Colbert came; confer

with R. Gray re: documenits received from

school districts for Prof. Diene

Schanzenbach’s review; email D. Hinojosa

documents from Quinlan ISD; review email

from D). Hinojosa 1¢* same; review and

return email from T. Hunter re: discovery

responses; revisw and organize State

Defendan’s’ documents produced; confer

with R. Gay, IV re: production index;

telephone conferences with M. Sisler re;

sawme; email P. Colbert re: same; review

cmail from P. Colbert: review email from

Lufkin ISD re; status of discovery

1esponses.

Review various emails re: class size data; 1.00 hrs
Fuller contract; discovery from and to the

State and respond; review R. Freeman

report and W. Pierce report; email to R.

Blincoe re: report; email to J. Knight re;

report; review email from Van re: facilities

and email from Everman re: varety of

issues,

Format, print, and bind all exhibits; 7.10 hrs

Invoice # 41271

$1,642.50

$250.00
N/C

$ 325.00

$1,242.50

Page 16



07/20/2012

07/20/2012

07/20/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Charles Aki and Wayne
Pierce at the Equity Center re: same.
Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; 3.75 hrs
review Efficiency Intervenors’ response to
jurisdiction plea; conference with T. Hunter
re: staius and 7/20 meetings; review W,
Henry email; email attomeys re: plea status;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review emails re: conference call;
conference call with Superintendents re:
testimony; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; video conference with T. Hunter
re: B. Baker, W. Pierce, and R. Freeman re;
expert report; conference with R. Gray, IV
re: data to B. Baker; REVIEW Edgewood’s
supplemental brief; work on amending
petition; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review amicus of TCTA.

Review email from T. Hunter re: July 24 2.00 hrs
hearing and litigation calendar, revised 2.50 hrs
deposition schedule; review emailse: three
districts chosen to provide data for Prof.
Schanzenbach’s review; revisw and return
email from T. Hunter re: data for Prof.
Schanzenbach’s review, review and return
email from T. Hunter re: superintendent
depositions, summary of testimony;
telephone conference with M. Sisler re:
discovery indcy; work on Second Amended
Petition; conier with T. Hunter re: status of
various matters; emails (3) to Prof.
Schaozenbach re: data from several school
disiricts; telephone conferences with M.
Sisler, AG’s office, re: discovery index;
confer with T. Hunter re: requests for data
from appraisal districts; confer with T.
Hunter re: recent discovery responses
received from the State Defendants.
Conference with R, Gray re: meetings with 5.30 hrs
superintendents; attend telephone
conference with superintendents and Equity
Center; send summary of testimony and
Interviews pleadings to superintendents;
amend petition; emails to R. Blincoe and G.
Salazar re: expert report; review J. Knight's

Invoice #4127]

$1,687.50

$200.00
N/IC

$1,722.50

Page 17



07/21/2012

07/22/2012

07/23/2012

07/23/2012

07/23/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SEI

report and send comments; review
Edgewood’s Plea to Jurisdicton; review
Intervenor’s response; attend telephone
conference with B, Badar re: report, work
on re-scheduling depositions; telephone
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys re:
designation of common experts.

Format and print Revenue Seeking Runs
and Weight Change Runs; deliver binders to
counsel.

Review West Orange II; email T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: proof issues; review
data re: census; review data on focus
districts; work on exhibits.

Conference with counsel and legal assistant
re: discovery responses; telephone
conference with Loraine Cline ai Bryan ISD
re: same; save email discovery responses (o
Bryan ISD on pdrive; review discovery
response forms from Los Fresnos, Lufkin,
and Bryan ISD; meeting with Bamringe:
copying service re: copying and bites
labeling responsive documents; draft email
to Bruce Baker re: testing data.

Review T. Hunter emails (3); review J.
Turmer email; review . Hinojosa email;
reply to same; review T. Hunter emails (3);
review J. Tumer etrzils (2); review L. Moak
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review P.
Fraissinet (2); veview TSTA Amicus;
review depasition notice for J. Pfeifer, R.
Blincoe; (3. Salazar, Mr. French, J. Witte.
Conference with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: discovery responses; revise and serve
deposition notices; review and return email
from L. Pina re: same; review email from T.
Hunter re: TSTA Amicus brief; telephone
conference with K. O’'Hanlon re: same;
review and return email from Everman ISD
re: 14 boxes of production; confer with R.
Gray re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:
letters to appraisal districts; research contact
information for each district; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: signed
Acknowledgements re: confidential
documents; review email from W. Pierce re:

Invoice # 4127]

1.00 hrs

2:25 hrs

245 hrs

1.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

$ 175.00

$1,012.50

$ 42875

$ 675.00

NiC
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07/23/2012

07/24/2012

07/24/2012

07/24/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

same; confer with attorneys re: advantages
of creating an FTP site for document
production; confer with T. Hunter re:
preparing K. Garza for deposition; review
email from R. Freeman re: appraisal
districts; review email from P. Colbert re:
production index.

Conference with Richard Gray Il and S.
Jennings re: organization of discovery
responses; telephone conference with B.
Leslie re: fees and progress on report; email
to W. Pierce re: amended petition;
conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman
re: their reports; review additional
objections to discovery requests; amend
deposition notices for 5 superintendents;
review emails from Richard Gray IV re:
various matters and respond; email to D.
Hinojosa re: Plea to Juris; several emails to
R. Gray re: same; review response;
telephone conference with K. O’'Hanlon re:
amicus brief; email to W. Henry ré: dropout
rates.

Review emails from Bryan JSD re:
responsive discovery documents; meeting
with Everman Superiniendent re: responsive
discovery documents; telephone conference
with Todd William¢ at Kaufman re: same;
telephone conferonce with Debra Crosby re:
same; confercrice with legal assistant re:
same; dov/niocad responsive documents for
QuinlanI5D from dropbox; conference with
counszire: same and plea to the jurisdiction
heanng.

Review J. Tumner email; review D. Hinojosa
emails (2); review 1. Pina emails (2); review
S. Rosen email; review T. Hunter emails
{2); review S. Dahlberg email; review
Motion to Consolidate; telephone
conference with T. Hunter re: expert
reports; review L. Lacy email; review
engagement letter from Dr. Klein; telephone
conference with T. Hunter re: jurisdiction
hearing status; work re: exhibits.

Review voice message from Supt. K. Garza
re: document production; revise, finalize,

Invoice # 41271

4.80 hrs

2.35 hrs

2.50 hrs

5.00 hrs
2.05 hrs

$1,560.00

5 411.25

$1,125.00

$500.00
N/C
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0712412012

07/25/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

and email letters to appraisal districts;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; telephone
conferences with document services re: bids
on production; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; telephone call to K. Garza - left
message; confer with R, Gray, IV re:
production from Lufkin, Los Fresos, Bryan,
Everman, and Quinlan ISD’s; review email
from Nueces County Appraisal District;
review email from Pecos County Appraisal
District; email R. Freeman re; same; work
on written responses to RFP's; review email
from Harmridge County Appraisal District;
review email from Harrison County
Appraisal District; telephone conference
with R. Freeman re: same; email Harrison
County re: same; review email from K.
Morgan, Wheeler CAD re: records for R.
Freeman report; review email from Gaines
CAD re: fee for data; prepare leiters and
checks to Harrison Central Appraisal
District and Gaines County Appraisal
District re: data request for R. Sreeman;
email J. Sheehan re: Lubbock ISD
production of documents; work re:
responses to RFP’s; confer with T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: same; review email
from I. Pina re: deposition schedule; review
email from Quinian ISD re: removing
names from production; confer with T.
Hunter re; came; email Quinlan ISD re:
same.

Telepihone conference with Plaintiff's 3.10 hrs
attorney re: plea to jurisdiction and hearing
on same; review emails from L. Pina and D,
Hinojosa re: same; telephone conference
with W. Haney re: report; review and sign
letters to appraisal districts; telephone
conference with 3 appraisers re: letter;
review W, Pierce’s report; draft response of
Anton to RFP; telephone conference with
W. Pierce re: Anton.

Review emails from Loraine Cline from 2.00 hrs
Bryan ISD re: discovery responses; save
same to server; review proposed Motion to
Consolidate the Flores Plaintiff’s; review

Invoice # 41271

$1,007.50

$ 35000

Page 20



07/2572012

072512012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

mail from Hillsboro and Pflugerville ISD re:
discovery responses; conference with legal
assistant re: same; telephone conference
with Debra Crosby re: responsive
documents; review and reply to email from
counsel re: meeting time and expert reports;
review email from Debra Crosby re: student
name redacted data; conference with legal
assistant re: same; conference with counsel
re: formal responses to State’s Request for
Production; conference with legal assistant
re: same; email discovery superintendents
re: same; review and reply to email from
Alicia Gonzales from Bryan ISD re: same;
review and reply to email from HD
Chambers re: when he will testify;
conference with legal assistant re: formal
responses to the State’s Request for
Production.

Review J. Turner email; review T. Hurier 1.15 hrs
emails (2); review P. Fraissinet email;
review L. Moak email; reply to saze;
review T. Hunter emails (3) re: expert
reports; reply to same; review emails re:
7129 working meeting; reply to same;
review J. Wisnowski email.

Review email from Houston CAD; email T, 4.50 hrs
Hunter re: same; re'uew and return email 1.25 hrs
from Alief ISD re: encrypted data; review
text from Alic! ISD re: password; forward
data to Professor Schanzenbach; telephone
call to Professor Schanzenbach re: password
for evcrypted data; review and return email
from Prof. Schanzenbach; text password to
£rof. Schanzenbach; email T. Hunter re:
Houston CAD data response; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: status of districts’ discovery
responses; email court reporter re: amended
deposition notices (7); review and return
email from coun reporter re: HD.
Chambers deposition status; review and
reply to C. Woods email re: DVD of
documents; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; email 1. Pina re: deposition schedule;
review email from 1. Pina re: B. Wiggins
postponement; confer with T. Hunter re;

Invoice # 41271

$ 51750

$450.00
N/C
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07/25/2012

07/26/2012

07/26/2012

07/26/2012

07/26/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

same; review email from T. Hunter re:
Anton ISD response; review and revise
response; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.
Review Moak Casey report and comment;
finalize Anton response to RFP; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: same; conference
with R. Freeman re: Itasca and B. Leslie
bill; telephone conference with B. Leslie re:
bill and report; review emails from several
appraisal districts and respond: telephone
conference with several appraisal districts;
review email from D. Young and respond;
begin drafting designation of experts;
conference with R. Gray re: various matters.
Conference with legal assistant re:
discovery responses; review and reply to
email from Jerilyn Pfeifer and Joddie Witte
re: same; review skeleton responses; review
and finalize Discovery Responses for
Quinlan ISD and Lubbock ISD; conference
with counsel re: same; meeting with Reece
Blincoe re: Brownwood discovery
responses.

Review I. Pina email; review Motice to
Comply with Protective Order; review J.
Tumer email; review I Hinojosa email,
reply to T. Hunter; review J. Tumer email;
review P. Fraissine{ 2mail; review D.
Thompson emaiis (5); review J. Tumner
emails (2); review D. Hinojosa emails (2);
review T.ilunter emails (5); review C.
Diamond zmail; reply to all; review J.
Turnes emails (3) re; Vigdor/Fuller report.
Review email from J. Knight re: responsive
gdocuments; email T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: discovery districts; confer with R. Gray,
IV re: documents received from districts
responsive to the State Defendants’ RFP’s;
review email re: Pflugerville documents;
review Everman ISD documents; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: status.

Review report from J. Knight; meet with R.
Blincoe and review report; add to expent
designations begin review of emails from
M. French and J. Pfiefer and respond;
review emails from D. Thompson and

Invoice # 41271

4.90 hrs

4.75 hrs

2.00 hrs

4.15 hrs
2.00 hrs

6.40 hrs

$1,592.50

$ 831.25

$ 900.00

$415.00
N/C

$2,080.00
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07/27/2012

07/27172012

07/27/2012

07/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

others re: expert extension; telephone

conference with all Plaintiff attomeys re:

same; conference with Richard Gray IV re:

discovery responses; review deposition

notices for Humble, Belton, Edgewood and

Aldine; email to 8. Dalhberg re: same.

Formally Respond to State’s Request for 4.50 hrs
Discovery to Brownwood ISD; conference

with legal assistant re: same; review and

reply to email from Reece Blincoe re: same;

formally respond for Everman ISD.

Review J. Tumer emails (6); review P, 1.50 hrs
Fraissinett emails (5); review T. Hunter

emails (5); review D. Hinojosa emails (2);

review M. Sisler emails (5); review S,

Dahlberg emails (3); review D. Thompson

emails (3); review C. Diamond email; reply

to above emails.

Review email from T. Hunter re: Ft. Bend 3.50 hrs
Third Amended Petition; review email ftom 3.00 hrs
T. Hunter re: Belton ISD deposition coiice;

review email from M. Sisler re: acditional

deposition notices; email T. Huafer re: four

additional deposition notices from the State

Defendants; review emai’l from T. Hunter

re: same; email superiniendents 1e: same;

review and revise deposition schedule and

calendars; efile and'serve Plaintiffs’ Second

Amended Original Petition; review

documents piciduced by Belton ISD; confer

with R. Gray; IV re: same; review email

from M Sisler re: deposition notice for

Weatnierford ISD; review email from M.

Sisier re: Walch Educational Consulting;

review email from Ellis CAD re: data for

Freeman report; review email from S.

Dahlberg re: FTP site; review and confirm

deposition schedule.

Review emails from R. Gray and respond; 4.00 hrs
email to B. Wood re: telephone conference

and review response; telephone conference

with W. Pierce re: data from J. Wisnowski;

review several ernails re: extending

deadlines; review report of B. Leslie and

email B. Leslie re: same; email and

telephone conference with W. Pierce re:

Invoice #41271

$ 787.50

$ 675.00

$350.00
NIC

$1,300.00

Page 23



07/28/2012

07/29/2012

07/29/2012

07/29/2012

07/30/2012

07/30/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

checking B. Leslie’s data; begin preparing
for K. Garza'a deposition; conference with
P. Colbert re: his report; review P, Colbert’s
report; file Amended Petition; review
proposed Rulell Agreement on extending
deadlines and comment; email to Plaintiff
attorneys re: same; review letter to other
districts Notice by State; email to G. Salazar
re: report; review response; request
supporting information from Equity Center;
conference with Richard Gray IV re:
discovery responses.

Review TSTA brief in support of Motion to 3.50 hrs
Dismiss; review R. Colbert draft report;
review B. Baker report; review B. Lesley

report.

Review Justice Brister’s dissent; meeting, 3.00 hrs
with counsel re: same and case strategy.

Conference with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV 2.75 hrs

re: status of depositions and discovery; wurk
re: deposition preparation; conference with
T. Hunter and K. Garza re: deposidon

preparation.

Prepare for Garza deposition: meet with K. 3.00 hrs
Garza in preparation for lier deposition.

Review and reply to emiail from 7.80 hrs

superintendents re: discovery responses;
formally respond toRequest for Production
to Alief ISD; email superintendents re:
extracurricular activities; conference with
counsel re:-same; conference with legal
assistant.n2: discovery responses and status;
formally respond to Regquest for Production
to Pliugerville ISD; telephone conference
with Ray Freeman re: Buck Gilcrease
deposition and issues; telephone conference
with Todd Williams re: his deposition;
review all discovery disks from Advanced
Discovery; conference with legal assistant
re: same; email Ray Freeman re: open
records request on weights; email Todd
Williams and Buck Gilcrease re:
depositions; email Shelly Dahlberg re: fip
site; conference with counsel re: same,
Review deposition notices; review J. Walch 9.30 hrs
subpoena; conference with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 41271

$1,575.00

$ 525.00

$1,237.50

$ 975.00

$1,365.00

$4,185.00
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07/30/2012

07/30/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

deposition; conference with T. Hunter re:
review of reports; attend K. Garza

.deposition; prepare for meeting with R.

Knight; review amended plea to the
jurisdiction; review Ft. Bend Third
Amended Petition; review amended
pleadings; review subpoena for J. Walch;
review deposition notices (4); review Rule
11 agreement; review Moak Casey report re;
weights and facilities; review Vigdor draft
report; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
discovery; prepare R. Knight for deposition;
review D. Thompson email; review R.
Blincoe email; review M. Sisler emails (2);
review draft disclosure requests; review S,
Dahlberg email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review J. Tumer email; review C. Wooten
email; review State’s supplemental
discovery responses; review message frotu

J. Witte.
Review email re: status of documernt 4.00 hrs
production; confer with R. Gray, IV re: 3.15 hrs

same; confer with T. Hunter ce: letter to
Judge Dietz and partial desiznation of
experts; draft letter and designation; confer
with T. Hunter re: saine; finalize and fax
letter to Judge Dietz; review email from T.
Hunter re: G. Saiazar, telephone conference
with B. Gilcresse re: deposition; email T.
Hunter re;caine; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; review email from M. Sisler re:
Edgev:uod production and Intervenors
production; review emails re: State
Pefendants’ initial disclosures; review erail
from S. Dahlberg re: same; review email
from Hutchison CAD re: response to request
for data for Freeman report; review email
from T. Hunter re: T. Wallis depo prep.;
continue work re: document production.
Conference with R. Gray re: Garza 10.00 hrs
deposition; conference with K. Garza re:
same; attend deposition of K. Garza;
conference with P. Fraissinet and M. Bone
re; deposition; brief R. Gray on State and
Intervenor approach; draft letter to Judge re:

Invoice # 41271

$400.00
N/C

$3,250.00
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07/31/2012

07/31/2012

07/31/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

experts; review various emails and respond,;
review report of G. Salazar; emails to W.
Pierce re: checking numbers in B. Leslie’s
report; conference with S. Jennings re:
various matters.

Formally Respond to the State’s Request for 9.05 hrs
Production to Lufkin ISD, Hillsboro ISD,
and Van ISD, Los Fresnos ISD, Belton ISD;
review and reply to emails from Belton ISD
and Bryan ISD re: responses; conference
with counsel and legal assistant re: all;
conference with counsel re: deposition dates
and covering of depositions; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: case status;
review and reply to email from Alicia
Gonzales re: discovery responses; print
same; conference with legal assistant re:
same; conference with counsel re:
depositions; email counsel re: same.

Attend R. Knight deposition; review ernails 10.75 bhrs
re: Rule 1] agreement; review letter o J.
Dietz; conference with T. Hunter ) same;
review D). Thompson emails (£); review L.
Lacy email; review J. Tumer emails (2);
reply to D. Hinojosa email; review C.
Diamond email; reviev disclosure
responses; review emais re: depositions;
review 5. Dahlbergemail; prepare T. Wallis
for deposition testimony; outline T. Wallis
deposition testmony.

Confer with T, Hunter re: rescheduling R. 2.00 hrs
Blincoe; rzview email to R. Blincoe re: 5.25 hrs
same;=mail attomeys re: same; email court
reporier re: staius; review email from court
1eporter re: same; review email re: Fort
Bend ISD experts; review email re:
depositions being covered by B. Wood;
telephone conferences (3) with G. Salazar
re: depo prep.; email T. Hunter re: same;
review email from T. Hunter re: same; email
G. Salazar re: same; revise and finalize
Plaintiffs’ Partial Designation of Experts;
serve attorneys re: same; continue work re:
revisions to responses to RFP; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: same; review email from G.
Salazar re: responses; review email to Dr.

Invoice # 41271

$1,583.75

$4,837.50

$200.00
N/C
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07/31/2012

3102-01

TBH

Gilcrease re: deposition prep.; telephone
conference with S. Perez, San Antonio ISD,
re: discovery responses; email T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: same; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; email attorneys re: letter
to Judge Dietz re: P. Colbert; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: objections; email T. Hunter re:
same; review email from T. Hunter re:
same; review email from 8. Dahlberg re:
partial designation, deposition schedule;
review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental response to Edgewood; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
response to Ft. Bend; review email from M.
Sisler re: supplemental response to
Coalition Plaintiffs’ RFP; review email from
S. Dahlberg re: Kanfman extension to
respond to RFP; confer with R, Gray, IV re.
same; review email from L. Lawrence re:
postponing B. Wiggins deposition; corier
with T. Hunter re: deposition schedule;
review and revise calendar and schedule re:
same; review email re; Belton 1S))
preparation for deposition; review email
from T. Hunter re: status(of discovery
responses; review emai and letter from S.
Hemandez re;: FTP sile; review email from
T. Hunter re: T. Williams and B. Gilcrease
depositions; review email from T. Hunter
re: status of vroduction from Bryan ISD;
email attcaneys re: status of discovery
responses!

Conference with R. Gray and R. Knight re: 7.50 hrs
R.Knight's deposition; telephone
conference with Superintendent Gilcrease
re: deposition; telephone conference with
Superintendent Williams re: deposition;
email to Superintendent Fincannon and A.
Tekell re: deposition; email to Witliams,
Kincannon and Gilcrease with attachments
re: depositions; email to all superintendent
re: State’s questions on deposition; review
email from State re: canceling deposition of
Blincoe, J. Knight and G. Salazar; respond
to same; several telephone conferences and
emails to G. Salazar re: his report; finalize

Invoice # 41271

$2437.50
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partial designation of experts; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: discovery; several
emails with Plaintiff attorneys on extension
of expert reports; conference with R. Gray
and T. Wallis in preparation for T. Wallis's
deposition; schedule deposition coverage;
draft letter to Judge re: P. Colbert; email to
R. Blincoe re: cancelling his deposition;
conference with B. Wood re: deposition
coverage; telephone conference with Larry
at San Antonio I.5.D. re: discovery
responses; telephone conference with
Kaufman 1.S.D. re: discovery responses.

FIMERELPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 116.40 hrs @
RGIY  Gray, IV, Richard E. 112.60 hrs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 76.60 hrs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 3370 hs @
LvVS von Stemberg, Lynn 000 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 339.30

3102-01 Invoice # 41271

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /br
100.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$100,350.00

$52,380.00
$19,705.00
$24,895.00
$ 3.370.00

_3 000

$100,350.00
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

August 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition
cfo Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
08/01/2012 RGIV  Organize Discovery Responses; conference
with counsel and legal assistant re: same;
formally respond to discovery sent to Firyan
ISD and San Antonio ISD; telephone

conference with Loraine Cline at Bryan ISD

re: responses, review and reply to email

from Angela Tekell re: Belton Supplemental

documents; conference wath iegal assistant
re: same,

08/01/2012 REG Review email re: discovery; review H.
Mclntush email re: discovery; review L.
Lacy email re: discovery; review discovery
responses; present T. Wallis for deposition;
work re: discovery; review C. Diamond
email; conference with C. Diamond re:
same; work re: discovery; review J.
Wisnowski part of presentation; review
discovery responses; review A, Rolle report
(vartial); review W. Pierce draft report.

08/01/2012 SEJ Confer with R. Gray, IV re: documents
produced by Bryan ISD; prepare and
forward same to S. Dahlberg and all
counsel; review email from R. Gray re:
cumrent draft of W. Pierce report; review
email from T. Hunter re: service of

documents on counsel; finalize and serve all

District responses to State’s RFP.
08/01/2012 TBH Coordinate discovery response; email to W.

Haney re: report; email to J. Knight and H.

Keller re: summary of testimony; review

Tax ID No.:

Invoiced#: #1573-1

Qur filed:

Billinz through:

3.15 hrs

5.65 hrs

5.25 hrs

9.00 hrs

74-2427406

REG
00001

08/31/2012

$551.25

$2,542.50

NC

$2,925.00



08/02/2012

08/02/2012

(8/02/2012

08/02/2012

3162-01

RGIV

SEJ

Rule 1] Agreement; attend deposition of T.
Wallis; conference with T. Wallis and R.
Gray re: deposition; telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: Lesley report; review
emails from S. Dahlberg re: extensions and
other matters.

Review email from counsel re: Moak Casey
email blasts; conference with counsel re:
same; emai}l Holly Mclntush re: same;
conference with legal assistant and Office
Manager re: Adobe; review and reply to
email from Holly McIntush re: Moak Casey
email blasts; conference with counsel re:
meeting with David Hinojosa re: data;
conference with counsel re: letter to the
State re: Moak Casey email blasts;
conference with legal assistant re: same.
Work on expert reports; work on draft
exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re:
expert designations and reports; review W.
Pierce report; conference with T. Hunter re;
8/3 status conference; conference with T.
Hunter re: charter school consolidations;
prepare for 8/3 hearing; telephone
conference with P. Fraissinet re: deposition
and B. Duncomb analysis; rcview D,
Thompson emails (2); reply to same.
Review and retum emzil from L. Halpem
re: service list; amend service list; review
Ft. Bend ISD letter to Judge Dietz; review
Ft. Bend ISD'c responses to State’s First
RFP; review cmail from C. Diamond re:
deposition schedule; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; telephone conference with M.
Sislerve: Hillsboro ISD deposition; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: Bryan ISD documents;
forward correspondence and CD of Bryan
documents to counsel; confer with R. Gray
re: letter to S. Dahlberg re: Moak Casey
emails; email T. Hunter re: sable review
Calhoun County's responses to State's First
RFP.

Follow up with other superintendents on
Wallis deposition; meet with W, Pierce, R.
Freeman and B. Lesley re: reports; review
B. Lesley report and B. Baker's for conflict;
email to R. Blincoe re: scheduling his
deposition; email to S. Dahlberg re: various
matters; review email from L. Halpern re:

Invoice # 41573

2.05 hrs

2.15 hrs

3.50 hrs

6.00 hrs

$358.75

$ 967.50

NIC

$1,950.00

Page 2



08/03/2012

08/03/2012

08/03/2012

08/03/2012

31062-01

RGIV

REG

SE}

Blincoe deposition and respond; email to D,
Hinojosa re: meeting and review responses;
conference with Richard Gray IV re:
discovery; email to P. Colbert re: resume;
review emails from A. Tekell and respond;
review email from W. Haney and respond.
Review and reply to email from counsel re:
meeting with David Hinojosa re: equity
data; conference with legal assistant re;
letter to State re: Moak Casey email blasts;
conference with counsel re: meeting over
exhibits; status conference with Judge Dietz.
Review W, Haney emails; conference with
T. Hunter re: expert reports; review D.
Thompson emails {2); conference with R.
Gray, IV re: meeting with D. Hinojosa;
review . Hinojosa email; reply to D.
Thompson email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review supplemental discovery
responses; conference with M.
Trachtenberg, D. Thompson, and P,
Fraissinet re: depositions and 8/3
conference; review S. Dahlberg enail;
conference with T. Hunter re: sarae; prepare
for 8/3 status conference; attend status
conference; review messuge from P.
Colbert; conference with 1. Hunter re:
same; telephone conference with P. Colbent
re: status; review V. Haney email.

Review email fromn 8. Dahlberg re:
consolidating charter plaintiffs; confer with
R. Gray re:rescheduling J. Witte depo.
prep.; telephione conference with J. Witte re:
same; teiephone conference with C. Nickell
re:-denosition questions for J. Witte; review
enwils to K. Garza, et al. re: same; email P.
Colbert re: supplemental discovery
responses; telephone conference with M.
Sisler re: deposition schedule; email T.
Hunter re: same; review voice message from
M. Sisler; review email from T. Hunter re:
same; review email from R. Gray re:
Intervenors' supplemental responses for P.
Colbert and W. Pierce review; emait P.
Colbert and W. Pierce re: same.

Email to B. Lesley re: report; review email
from G. Salazar re: weights and respond,;
conference with W, Pierce re: same; atiend
status conference; several emails to B.

Invoice # 41573

1.65 hrs

3.55 has

2.30 hrs

3.00 hrs

$288.75

$1,597.50

NiIC

$ 975.00

Page 3



08/04/2012

08/04/2012

08/05/2012

08/05/2012

08/05/2012

08/06/2012

08/06/2012

08/06/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

SEJ

Baker re: scheduling his deposition; draft

auditor letter for districts; review voice mail

and email from J. Witte,

Review Intervenors' disclosure responses; 2.50 hrs
review E. Hanushek report; review material

for I. Witte, review J. Witte message;

review Moak Casey draft reports; review

supplemental amicus of Texas Teachers

Association.

Begin drafting brief for the Judge on the law 1.00 ks
of the case.

Meeting with counsel re: exhibits. 2.00 hrs
Work with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; work re: 2.75 hrs

J. Witte deposition preparation; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same (2);
review P. Fraissinet email re: B. Duncomb
analysis,
Continue drafting law of the case brief; 1.50 hrs
review emails re: Duncomb's preliminary
numbers; review emails from Plaintiff's
attorneys re: superintendent depositions;
review several emails from R. Gray and
respond.
Review email re: deposition schedule; 1.55 hrs
review same for the week; review
Efficiency Intervenor's First Amended
Response to Request for Disclosure; review
emails from legal assistant re: email service
list and depositions; review Moak Casey
Expert Report; Ceicphone conference with
Charles Aki re: exhibits.
Review P, Cclbert email; reply to same; 3.30 hrs
review D Thompson email; review J.
Tumer email; review M. Trachtenberg
email: review emails re: depositions;
conference with J. Witte re: deposition
mieparation; review J. Hoffer email;
telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
depositions; review P, Fraissinet email;
review D. Thompson email review S.
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review anticle re; Edgewood tax rate;
ernail re: potential testing;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter re:
; review emails re: Rule 1}
agreement.
Review email from R. Gray re: updating 2.50 hrs
charter districts with deposition schedules;

Invoice # 41573

$1,125.00

$ 32500

$350.00

$1,237.50

$ 487.50

$271.25

$1.485.00

NC

Page 4



08/06/2012

08/07/2012

08/07/2012

08/07/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

review and retum email from court reporter
re: deposition schedule; email T. Huater re:
rescheduling R. Blincoe; review email from
court reporter; confer with R. Gray re:
charter district parties; email counsel for
charter districts re: service list and
deposition schedule; review emails from T.
Hunter re: deposition schedule; review
email from J. Hoffer; review email from M.
Sisler re: supplemental production; confer
with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV re: response
to State Defendants' RFP 139, revise letter
to S. Dahlberg re: same; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:
discovery districts, focus districts,
deposition schedule; confer with T. Hunter
re: Aldine ISD deposition; email D.
Thompson re: representation of Aldine ISD;
review email from D. Thompson re: same,
Telephone conference with R. Freeman re.
Lesley report; review emails from R,
Blincoe and M. French re: depositior
scheduling and respond; email to Plantiff
attomeys re: questions asked by the State in
depositions; finish Ist draft of brief to Judge
on law of the case; amend peution; review
deposition schedule; telephione conference
with B. Wood re: Ft. E=id depositions;
telephone confererce with B. Baker re:
Duncomb and Fanushek

Print emails from Joddie Witte for counsel
re: Van IS, review same; email Holly
Mclntush 've: depositions; conference with
counsel re: same; review emails; continue
reviewing Moak Casey Expert Repor;
review emails re: deposition of Dr. Eric
Hanushek; review and reply to email from
counsel re: deposition of Dr. Gilcrease;
review email from counsel re: Everman
ISD's AEIS data and 2010-201} 1&S tax
rate; find same and reply to email.

Review email; reply to same;
complete preparation of J. Witte for
deposition; present J. Witte for deposition;
review emails re: Hanushek deposition (10);
review S. Dahlberg email; review D,
Thompson email,

Review email from C. Nickell re: board
meeting; confer with R. Gray re: expedited

lnvoice #41573

4.90 hrs

4.75 hrs

8.50 hrs

3.75 brs

$1,592.50

$831.25

$3,825.00

N/IC

Page 5



08/07/2012

08/08/2012

(8/08/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

transcript of T. Wallis's deposition; email
court reporter re: same; telephone
conference with Haynes & Boone re: 1.
Witte deposition; review email from court
reporter re: expedited handling of T. Wallis
deposition; telephone conference with court
reporter re: same; telephone conferences (2)
with J. Knight re: deposition; confer with R,
Gray re: status; revise Salazar and Blincoe
deposition notices; serve counsel re: same;
email court reporter re: same; review and
calendar Ft. Bend deposition notices; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Review several emails from L. Halpem re: 6.25 hrs
rescheduling Salazar and Blincoe
depositions; respond to same; several emails
to G. Salazar re: same, several emails to R.
Blincoe re; same; review several emails
from various Plaintiff attomeys re:
Hanushek deposition; respond to same; eait
trial brief on law of the case; telephone
conference with R. Freeman re: varicus
matters; telephone conference with S,
Kincannon re: deposition; telephone
conference with all attomeys re: Rule 11
Agreement; review new depositions
scheduled by State and schedule coverage;
prepare for J. Pfeifer d=position; prepare J.
Pfeifer for her deposition.

Review emails 7e: STAAR data and 3.05 hrs
depositions; conference with counsel re:
Tarrant covaiy data; organize, format, and
print same Yor counsel; continue reviewing
Moak Casey Expert Report; meeting at
Equity Center re: exhibits; review discovery
recnonses from San Antonio ISD;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review and reply to email from San Antonio
ISD re: same; conference with counsel re;
Belton Supplemental Responses; conference
with counsel re: Sap Antonio ISD
responsive documents; conference with
counsel re: depositions.

Prepare for meeting with J. Knight; review 3.50 hrs
emails re: Rule 11 agreement; review emails
re: Hanushek deposition; review D.
Hinojosa emails; review emails re: STAAR;
review J, Tumer emails; review P, Fraissinet
email; reply to same; email attomeys re:

Invoice # 41573

$2,031.25

$533.75

$1,575.00

Page 6



08/08/2012

08/08/2012

08/09/2012

08/09/2012

08/09/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

preparing witnesses for depositions; partial
attendance at J. Pfeifer deposition; review
deposition (amended) notice for Dr.
Hanushek; review 5. Dahlberg email;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (3); reply to
same( 3); review J. Knight postings on
website; conference with J. Knight re:
deposition preparation; telephone
conference with A. Penn re: J. Knight's

deposition.
Review email from court reporterre: T, 2.39 hrs
Wallis transcript; email D. Thompson, D. 2.75 hrs

Hinojosa, and M. Trachtenberg re: same;

review email from M. Sisler re: Hanushek

deposition; review email from S. Dahlberg

re: scheduling order; review CD of

documents from Nolan CAD; email R.

Freeman re: same; review message from

San Antonio ISD re: document production;

review email from L. Payton re: Fort Beng

ISD Plaintiffs’ Deposition Notice of Dr.

Terry Grier; review and calendar notice;

review documents produced by Sim Antonio

ISD; confer with R. Gray re: s«mg; confer

with R. Gray, IV re: supplemental

documents produced by Belion ISDy; prepare

letter to counsel re: same; review email

from L. Lawrence re: Cathoun County and

Frisco ISD's resporses to State Defendants’

RFP.

Meet with J. Pfeifer in preparation for her 9.50 hrs
deposition; aitead deposition of J. Pfeifer;

conference with J. Pfeifer.

Conference with legal assistant re: Calhoun 1.15 hrs
Cownty Discovery Responses; conference

with counsel re: depositions; review, format,

aud print data for 2010, 2011, and 2012 for

Hillsboro, Kaufinan, and Belton ISD.

Review report on Aransas Pass deposition; 8.75 hrs
review P. Colbert email; reply to same;

review deposition notice of San Benito ISD;

complete preparation of J. Knight for

deposition; present J. Knight for deposition;

review W. Pierce email; review email re:

STARR test; review emails re: Hanushek

deposition; review emails re: Rule 11

agreement.

Review email from M. Sisler re: San Benito 3.20 hrs
ISD deposition; confer with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 41573

$250.00
N/C

$3,087.50

$201.25

$3,937.50

NIC

Page 7



08/09/2012

08/10/2012

08/10/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGtY

REG

same; emai} counsel re: Belton ISD
supplemental production; update deposition
schedule; review email from Nueces CAD;
email R, Freeman re: same; review email
from court reporter re: K. Garza transcript;
confer with T. Hunter re: response from
Collin CAD; telephone conference with and
email M. Rohloff, Collin CAD, re: open
records request; confer with T. Hunter re:
depositions; review deposition schedule re:
district information; review email from T.
Robertson re: Gaines CAD); review file re:
contact person for Gaines CAD; email T.
Robertson re; same.

Edits to trial brief; schedule deposition 7.00 hrs
coverage; telephone conference with B.
Wood re: deposition of Aransas Pass
superintendent; email to D. Hinojosa re:
same and review response; telephone
conference with R. Rhodes, left message;
email to B. Lesley re: strategies for FLY;
review response and forward to G. Salazar;
telephone conference with W. Pierc re;
weights; attend part of J. Knight's
deposition; review college readiness
material; review Hanushek niaterial;
conference with R. Gray re: various matters;
conference with M. Tiechtenberg re:
amending pleadings, review ermail from S,
Dahlberg re: Rute 11 Agreement and order
on Motion to Consolidate and respond; draft
Motion for Lvave to Amend and respond;
review pleadings of Charter Schools; email
to B. Raker re: same; review status of
discovery; review emails from R. Freeman
ve. facilities and Collin County; telephone
conference with Collin County appraiser re:
information request.

Review email from Shelley Dahlberg re: 0.75 hrs
Motion to Consolidate; review same; review
proposed Rule 11 Agreement re:
designation of experts and expert reports
and deadline for discovery; review emails
re: amended petitions; review and reply to
email from Belton ISD re: supplemental
discovery documents; conference with legal
assistant re: Belton ISD supplemental
discovery responses,

Review emails re: conference call (6); 2.00 hrs

Invoice # 41573

$2,275.00

$131.25

$ 900.00

Page 8



08/10/2012

08/11/2012

08/12/2012

08/13/2012

08/13/2012

08/13/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

SEJ

review P. Fraissinet email; reply to same;
review S. Dahlberg emails (2); review B.
Schulman’s emails; conference call with
attorneys re: equity issues and case
presentation; review C. Diamond email;
review emails re: Rule 11 agreement;
review R. Schulman email; review W.
Haney email; email D. Thompson re: status;
review message from P. Fraissinet.
Conference with R. Gray re: Calhoun
County’s notice of adversity and filing
Amended Petition and trial brief; edit trial
brief; review emails from Charter School
attorneys re: telephone conference and
respond; review amended consolidation
order and emails re: same; telephone
conference with L. Moak; review emails
from J. Pfeifer re; Charter Schools; email to
B. Baker re: same; review deposition
coverage; email to R. Gray re: same.
Review emails; reply to same; review
discovery; review amended pleading:.
Review emails; reply to same; corference
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits,
Conference with counsel re: Max Revenue
Exhibits; review same; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: same and
meeting re: same; review and reply to email
from counsel re: Fort.Bend and Calhoun
County Plaintif{ Liistricts ATR and Revenue
per WADA; compile, format, and print
same for coavsel; telephone conference with
counsel re: 2xhibits and meeting.
Review J. Turner email; review P. Fraissinet
email. review W. Haney email; work with
R.'Gray, IV re: exhibits; review emails re:
depositions; email B, Baker re: B.
Duncomb’s report; conference with T.
Hunter re: 8/13 meeting; review H.D.
Chambers email; reply to same; travel to
Houston; conference with attorneys re:
strategy; return to Austin; review email re:
W. Haney; review W. Haney report; review
notice for Hanushek deposition; review
email; reply to same; review J.
Turner email; reply to same; review L. Lacy
email; review M. Trachtenberg email.
Email A. Cochran-McCall, AG's office, re;
TEA’s 8-10-12 responses to First Set of

Invoice # 41573

1.80 hrs

0.75 hrs

0.75 hrs

3.60 hrs

10.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

$ 585.00

$ 337.50

$ 33750

$630.00

$4,837.50

NIC
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08/13/2012

08/14/2012

08/14/2012

08/14/2012

08/14/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Interrogatories of Calhoun County; review
email from A. Cochran-McCall re: same;
review amended deposition notice of Dr.
Hanushek.

Review edits to brief on law of the case;
conference with R. Gray re: same and
meeting with D. Thompson and M.
Trachtenberg; review emails from appraisal
district and forward to R. Freeman; review
W. Haney report; telephone conference with
W. Haney; review deposition notice for
Hanushek; review Duncomb’s results;
review email from R. Schulman re:
telephone conference and respond; prepare
for €. Dupre deposition; meet with C.
Dupre re: deposition; conference with R.
Gray re: meeting; review data on Ft. Bend
group and on Calhoun County group.
Meeting at Equity Center with Charles Aki
and Wayne Pierce re: exhibits; review
State’s Supplemental Responses to
Discovery for Intervenors, Edgewood. and
Fort Bend Plaintiffs; conference with
counsel re: same; conference vatl counsel
re: Wayne Pierce’s expert report.

Review MALDEF discovery responses;
work on gap briefing; work on Haney
report; meeting with Eauity Center re:
exhibits; review L. Hapern email; review
D. Hinojosa emails; review L. Halpern
email; review I. Tumer email; review P.
Fraissinet emails (2); reply to same (2);
partial attcndance at C. Dupre deposition;
review report of W. Pierce; review material
re: inter-county comparisons; conference
withyR. Gray, IV re: discovery; conference
with H.D. Chambers re: deposition
preparation.

Prepare and serve additional documents
produced by Belton ISD; confer with T.
Hunter re: deposition schedule; review and
update deposition calendars; email P.
Colbert re: additional documents available
for review from the State Defendants;
review and return email from 1. Pina re;
deposition schedule.

Conference with C. Dupre re; deposition;
review email from S. Dahlberg re: Order to

Consolidate and respond; review email from

Invoice # 41573

5.80 hrs

6.05 hrs

6.50 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.80 hrs

10.50 hrs

$1,885.00

$1058.75

$2,925.00

$ 80.00

N/C

$3,412.50
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08/15/2012

08/15/2012

08/15/2012

08/15/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

W. Pierce re: Canyon & El Paso ISDs;
review email from P. Fraissinet re:
Duncomb/Moak; attend deposition of C.
Dupre; conference with R. Gray re: Haney
report; data produced by Calhoun County;
conference with C. Dupre re: email from R.
Schulman and respond; review emails from
S. Dahlberg and H. McIntush re: discovery
responses and forward to Richard Gray IV;
review email from B. Wood re; Haney
report; email to W. Haney to set up
telephone call; email to S. Jennings re:
updating my calendar.

Legal research re: Texas Education Code
and Target Revenue; conference with
counsel and legal assistant re: deposition
review by clients; telephone conference
with Wayne Pierce re: most recent testing
data; review Brief on Law of the Case for
counsel; review WOC II decision; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data for
same; review and reply to email from
Wayne Pierce re: status of testing data;
forward same to counsel.

Email exchange with W. Haney re: report;
review P. Colbert email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review J. Tumer email; review L.
Lacy email; conference with HD.
Chambers re: deposiion; present H.D.
Chambers for deposition; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review J. Turner email;
conference ‘with R. Gray, IV re: research on
target revenue; review emails re: Duncomb
testimony; review M. Trachtenberg email;
re: Duncombe analysis.

Enizil T. Wallis re: review of deposition
transcript; review email from T. Hunter re:
same; email K. Garza re: review of
deposition transcript; email R. Knight re:
review of deposition transcript; review and
calendar deposition notice for M. Miles;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; email P.
Colbert additional documents from the
State.

Review email from P. Colbert and respond;
email to W. Haney attaching contract; email
to B. Lesley re: report; email to W. Pierce
and B. Baker re: deposition dates; telephone
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys, L.

Invoice # 41573

4.80 hrs

12.00 hrs

1.00 hrs

7.30 hrs

$840.00

$5,400.00

NAC

$2,372.50
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08/16/2012 RGIV

08/16/2012 REG

08/16/2012 SEY

08/16/2012 TBH

08/17/2012 RGIV

3102-01

Moak, A. Bronson & B. Duncomb re:

Duncomb report; conference with R. Gray

re: various matters; meet with L. Moak re;

status and Duncomb report; begin drafting

designation of experts; review Moak report;

prepare M. French for deposition.

Review Expert Report of Wayne Pierce; 5.10 hrs
conference with counsel re: same; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: data;

research accountability rating for Rockwall

ISD; conference with counsel re: same;

review emails re: discovery; telephone

conference with Wayne Plerce re: expert

report; telephone conference with Charles

Aki re: exhibits; conference with legal

assistant re: Kaufman Discovery, download

same.

Review L. Lacy email re: depositions; 2.75 hrs
review L. Moak email; review deposition

notice for M. Miles; review D. Casey email;

review D, Thompson email; review P.

Fraissinet email; review discovery

responses; partial attendance at M Trench

deposition; review L. Moak draft report;

review D. Casey draft report: email B.

Wood re: W. Haney; review L. Halpem

email; review J. Tumer email; telephone

conference with D. Hingjosa re: status and

expert reports; con{erence with R. Gray, IV

re: expert reporis and exhibits; review L.

Lacy email; review additional deposition

notices; review J. Turner emails (2); review

P. Fraissine: emails (2); review revised Rule

11 agreenient; review new test score data;

review emails re: Duncomb report.

Review email from M. Sisler re: Rule 11 0.90 hrs
agreement; review and calendar Waddell

and Youngblood deposition notices; review

and calendar Wiggins deposition notice;

review and return emails from H. McIntush

(3), review and calendar new scheduling

deadlines.

Review and respond to several emails from 8.50 hrs
J. Turmer re: Duncomb report; attend

deposition of M. French; conference with

M. French,

Formally Respond to the State’s Request for 4.90 hrs
Production to Kaufman ISD; conference

with counsel and legal assistant re: same;

Invoice # 41573

$892.50

$1,237.50

NC

$2,762.50

$857.50

Page 12



08/17/2012

08/17/2012

08/17/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
expert report; telephone conference with
Ray Freeman re: expert report of Bill
Duncomb; telephone conference with
Charles Aki re: exhibits; meeting with
counsel re: case status; email David
Thompson re; target revenue; review email
re: discovery responses; legal research re:
Target Revenue; conference with counsel
re: same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: same; email Holly McIntush re:
same.

Review Vigdor repont; review Moak report;
review J. Turner emails (3); review M,
Trachtenberg emails (3); review D.
Hinojosa emails (3); review P. Fraissinet
email; review Klein/Linn reports;
conference call with attorneys re: status;
review order of consolidation; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); review A. Branson
email; work on expert reports; review K.
Kallison report; review and edit W_I'ierce
report; review amended deposition potices;
telephone conference with W, ®ierce re:
expert reports; conference with attorneys re:
expert reports; review emails re: discovery;
review S. Murdoch email; review emails.
Review and calendar amended deposition
notices for Dr. Ponce, A. Limon, Dr.
Cervantes; revicw email from court reporter
re: J. Witte; review email from R. Gray re:
State’s suppiemnental production; telephone
conference ‘with M. Sisler re: status of
State’> FERPA website; email attomeys re:
same; review additional documents
produced; email attorneys re: same; email
W. Pierce re: State’s 2013 numbers; review
email from W. Pierce re: same; confer with
R. Gray re: same; review and update
deposition schedule; email J. Witte re:
review of deposition transcript.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
1V re: various matters; participate in
telephone conference with other Plaintiff
attorneys re: Duncomb report; participate in
telephone conference with R. Schulman and
D. Hinojosa re: facilities; review Moak
report; telephone conference with Moak re:
Target Revenue; telephone conference with

Invoice # 41573

5.75 hrs

0.70 hrs
1.50 hrs

6.20 hrs

$2,587.50

$ 70.00
N/C

$2,015.00
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08/18/2012

08/19/2012

08/19/2012

08/20/2012

08/20/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

TEH

RGIV

REG

L. Moak, D. Casey, A. Brownson and

Plaintiff attorneys re: Moak report and other

expert reports; telephone conference with B.

Baker re: Duncomb report; review P,

Colbert report; email to P. Colbert re: same.

Review P. Colbert report; review 1.50 hrs
Intervenors’ response to jurisdiction motion,

review I, Tumer emails; review J. Turner

emails; review C. Diamond emails; review

L. Moak emails.

Review emails; review Picus report; review 3,59 hrs
final L. Moak report; review edits to reports;

review A. Kauffman email; work re: expert

reports; review D. Hinojosa emails; review

P. Colbert emails; review W_ Pierce emails;

review J. Tumer email re; Moak report;

email W, Pierce re: report; review L. Moak

email; review J. Turner email: conference

call with attorneys re: L. Moak report,

review emails; reply to same; telephone

conference with W. Pierce re: report,

Review and comment on several export 2.00 hrs
reports; review W, Pierce's repont cud

suggested edits; review suggesied language

for L. Moak’s report; review emails from R.

Gray and from Plaintiff's atvuineys re:

experts report and respond.

Conference with counssi re: expert reports 6.80 hrs
and data; conference with legal assistant re:

discovery; Telephone conference with

Wayne Pierce,; Charles Aki, Tim Wolff, and

Toni Hunter12:'data for Wayne's report;

email Charlis Aki re: same; review Report

of Wavne Pierce; conference with counsel

re: faree; telephone conference with Charles

Aki and Wayne Pierce re: same; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: same; review

and reply to email from Charles Aki and

Tim Wolff re: data for Appendix to Wayne

Pierce's Report; conference with counsel re;

same; telephone conference with Adam

Pierce re: County Appraisal District

information; review same; review letter

from Judge Dietz re: contact with legislative

budget board; email Adam Pierce re:

documents’ review emails re: expert

designations,

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 8.50 hrs
report status; review J. Turner emails (2);

Invoice # 41573

$ 675.00

$1,575.00

$ 650.00

$1190.00

$3,825.00
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08/20/2012

08/20/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
L. Moak emails (2); review W, Pierce
emails (3); review D. Thompson emails (2);
review P. Fraissinet emails (2); reply to ali;
review P. Colbert draft report; email P.
Colbert re: same; review P. Fraissinet email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; conference
with T. Hunter re: report status; review
emails re: B. Duncomb report; review L.
Halpem email; review W, Pierce report as
final; forward to P. Colbert; review D.
Hinojosa email re: depositions; review D,
Hinojosa expert designation; review J.
Tumer emails (5); review expert designation
of Calhoun County; work re: all
designations of experts; review emails re:
experts; review M. Trachtenberg emails (3);
review D. Thompson emails (2); review C.
Diamond email; work re: expert
designations; review W. Pierce emails;
review B. Schulman email; review J. Chetz
correspondence; review M. Trachtenverg
email; reply to same; review D. Himnjosa
emails (2); review H. MclIntusl: einail;
review D. Thompson email; review message
from J. Witte; telephone conierence with 1.
Witte re: deposition; review Dr.
Schanzenbach email; ieview D. Hinojosa
email; review addi@cnal expert
designations; review C. Diamond disclosure
responses; review expert reports of C.
Diamond; raview A. Cortez expert report.
Work re:-dzsignation of experts; confer with 4.00 hrs
attorneys re: same; efile and serve Third 4.50 hrs
Amerded Petition; finalize and serve
Coztition Plaintiffs’ Designation of Experts
and Addendum to Designation of Experts;
review and return email from J. Pfeifer re:
deposition transcript; review and calendar
meeting with J. Dietz; review email from J.
Reich re: depositions scheduled for the
week; review emails from R. Gray and T.
Hunter re: appendices to report of W.
Pierce.

Review emails from R. Gray re: Colbert and 2.80 hrs
Pierce reports; email to B. Lesley re;
formating problems; conference with R.
Gray re: Pierce report; conference with W.
Pierce re: report and appendix; review

Invoice # 41573

$400.00
N/C

$ 91000
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08/21/2012

08/21/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

edited reports from various experts; finalize
designation of experts; conference with A.
Pierce re: conformation for Appendix to W,
Pierce's report; conference with Richard
Gray 1V re: production of reports; telephone
conference with P, Colbert re: report;
telephone conference with W, Pierce re:
report; begin review of A. Cortez report;
conference with R. Gray re: Amended
Petition; finalize 3rd Amended Petition and
file.

Review and reply to email from Holly 5:30 hrs
Mclntush, Lacy Lawrence, Toni Hunter re:
responding to State’s Discovery Requests;
review Discovery Responses; conference
with counsel re: same; conference with
counsel re: case status, witness files, and
exhibits; conference with legal assistant re:
all; draft witness list; research percentile of
wealth for Los Fresnos CISD; review and
add edits to Brief on Law of the Case for
counsel; conference with counsel re: same;
find, format, and print data on Hairis
County districts for counsel’s deposition
preparation.

Review D. Hinojosa emaii; review B. Baker 8.25 hrs
email; review L. Halpem email; reply to
same; conference with K. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review D/ 1linojosa emails (4);
reply to same; review C. Diamond emails
{3); review P. Hill file; review T. Moe file;
review Edgewood designation of experts
with repnits; email D. Hinojosa re: B. Baker
call; email W. Pierce/R. Freeman re: status;
review L. Lacy comrespondence; review
Calhoun County material; review A,
HBranson email; telephone conference with
D. Hinojosa re: 8/21 hearing; review J.
Knight deposition transcript; review D,
Hinojosa email; conference with attorneys
re: discovery matters; review draft
discovery; review L, Moak emails; review J.
Tumer emails; review P. Fraissinet email;
review B. Duncomb email; review J. Tumer
emails; attend hearing on jurisdiction
motion; post-hearing conference with
attorneys re: Hanushek deposition and
strategy; review MALDEF email; work re:
preparation for E. Hanushek deposition.

Invoice # 41573

$927.50

$3,712.50
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08/21/2012

08/21/2012

08/22/2012
08/22/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

Review email from T. Hunter re: supporting
documents for Dr. Baker's report; forward
same to all counsel; review repons produced
by the Edgewood Plaintiffs; confer with R.
Gray re: same; finalize and serve Kaufman
ISD response to RFP; review CD of
additional documents from Calhoun County;
review and organize expert reports and
supporting documents; confer with R. Gray
re: same; telephone conference with C.
Diamond re: data produced by Intervenors;
confer with R. Gray re: same; review and
update deposition schedule; confer with R,
Gray, IV re: same; review email from R.
Gray, IV and T. Hunter re: same; review
email from court reporter re: transcript of J.
Knight and J. Pfeifer depositions.

Review email from L. Halpern re: Baker's
backup documents and respond; email to
Baker re: Hanushek deposition; review
response; email to D. Hinojosa re: same;
review several emails from Plaintiff's
attorneys re: Hanushek deposition;
conference with Richard Gray €V and Holly
Mcintush re: responding to State’s request
for better identification of documents;
several emails back and forth to L. Halpemn
re: Baker's deposition dates; draft
Interrogatories and REP to Intervenor and
Charter School Plaintiffs; begin drafting
Supplemental Response to all RFD;
conference With Richard Gray IV re: WCC
II and bricfo Court; edit brief to Court.
Review discovery.

Revievr C. Diamond email; review TREE
discovery; review A. Branson emails;
review Judge's comments; email R.
Freeman re: 8/21 hearing; review additional
transcripts of depositions; email team re:
trial schedule; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa and B. Baker re: Hanushek
deposition; email D. Hinojosa re: Hanushek
deposition; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review article re: B. Hammond; review
supplemental discovery responses;
conference with T. Hunter re: Humble
deposition; review T. Robertson email;
reply to same; work on brief to court re:
disparity; review P. Colbert email; with

Invoice # 41573

4.00 hrs
4.25 hrs

6.00 hrs

0.70 hrs
4.75 hrs

$400.00
N/C

$1,950.00

$122.50
$2,137.50
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08/22/2012

08/22/2012

08/23/2012

08/23/2012

08/23/2012

08/23/2012

082472012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

attached article; conference with T. Hunter
re: status,

Review email from R. Gray re: trial
schedule; review and organize MALDEF
expert witness files; review email from T.
Hunter re: filing Brief; revise list of persons
with knowledge; review Interrogatories and
RFP’s from the Intervenors group.

Attend deposition of Humble
superintendent, Dr. Sconzo; edit brief on
law of the case; prepare J. Gilcrease for
deposition; respond to emails from
Plaintiff's attorneys; conference with R.
Gray re: brief; review Joe Wisnowski
report.

Review emails re: presentation to Judge
Dietz; review presentation; review
discovery responses and email counsel re:
same.

Review emails; review J. Wisnowski
presentation; review Calhoun County
discovery; review Ft. Bend discovery;
attend deposition of Dr. Hanushek;yeview J.
Wisnowski emails; conference with D.
Hinojosa re: trial testimony,

Review and return email froin C. Diamond
re: expent CV's produced; review email re:
Ft. Bend RFP to Defendants; review email
re: Calhoun County’s discovery requests;
review Efficiency intervenor’s RFP's and
Interrogatories to the Plaintiff Groups; draft
responses to saine; work on supplemental
response to Request for Disclosure;
continue work on responses to Efficiency
Intervenors’ discovery requests; draft
responses to State Defendants Request for
Production; telephone conference with T,
Wallis's office re: deposition transcript;
review and return email from T. Wallis re:
same; finalize and serve supplemental
response to RFD; review email from R.
Gray re: additional discovery requests from
the State Defendants.

Autend deposition of J. Gilcrease; review
presentation by J. Wisnowski and comment.
Review emails re: presentation to Judge
Dietz; conference with counsel re: data;
review State’s responses to Calhoun County
plaintiff's interrogatories; review State’s

Invoice # 41573

2.10 hrs

6.50 les

1.40 hrs

7.25 hrs

3.25 hrs
3.00 hrs

5.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

N/C

$2,112.50

$245.00

$3,262.50

$325.00
N/C

$1,787.50

$245.00
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08/24/2012

0872472012

08/24/2012

08/25/2012

3162-01

REG

REG

SEJ

REG

response to Fort Bend plaintiff's request for

production; summarize and email counsel

re: same; review counsel’s letter to Todd

Williams and Susan Kincannon re: what to

expect in your deposition; conference with

legal assistant re: same; conference with

counsel re: Exhibit 1012 to Dr. Hanushek’s

deposition; email David Hincjosa re: same.

Review J. Wisnowski revised presentation, 2.85 ks
email D. Hinojosa re: same; email W. Pierce

re; same; review emails re: bifurcation of

fees; review D. Thompson email; review M,

Trachtenberg emails; reply to same; review

discovery; review D. Thompson email;

review D. Thompson email; review P,

Fraissinet email; review D. Hinojosa email;

work re: exhibits; review M. Trachtenberg

email.

Review H. Mclntush email; review new 1.50 hrs
discovery; review H. McIntush email;

review W. Pierce email (2); review R.

Freeman email; email L. Moak and J.

Wisnowski re: presentation; email’R.

Freeman and W. Pierce; revieve ],

Wisnowski email; reply to same; telephone

conference with W. Pierce re; presentations.

Review email from C. Diamond re: CV's; 2.25 hrs
telephone conference wich T. Hunter re: J. 3.00 brs
Wisnowski and D. Fisher factual

presentations; tciephone call to W. Pierce

re: same (left message); email W. Pierce re:

same; teleplione conference with W, Pierce

re: same; c2lendar factual presentations to

the Court; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same;

review email from T. Hunter re: scheduling

meeling with Taxpayer and Parent

Plaintiffs; review and organize T. Moe

expert reports and supporting documents;

review and organize P. Hill documents;

review and organize D. McAdams report

and documenis; review email re: Ft. Bend

discovery requests; telephone conference

with M. Sisler re: J. Witte original

deposition transcript; email attorneys re:

same; review email from M. Sisler re: same;

review and return email from W. Pierce re;

current pleading.

Review P. Colbert email; reply to same; 1.50 hrs
review R. Freeman email; review W. Pierce

Invoice # 41573

$1,282.50

$ 675.00

$225.00
N/C

$ 675.00
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08/26/2012

08/27/2012

08/27/2012

08/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

email; review J. Wisnowski email; review
M. Trachtenberg email; work on "gap”
brief; review Ft. Bend designation of expert
witnesses; review additional discovery (6
sets).

Review J. Wisnowski revised presentation;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (3); reply to same;
review P. Colbert email; review W. Pierce
emails (2); reply to same; work re: exhibits;
complete brief re: GAP; review W. Pierce
emails (2); reply to same (2).

Review emails re: revenue secking exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: same;
telephone conference with numerous
individuals from Houston Community
College re: knowledgeable individual on
student readiness for college; email Dr.
Charles Cook re: same and time for
telephone conference; meeting at Equity
Center with Wayne Pierce, Ray Frecman,
and Charles Aki re: exhibits and cas? status;
Telephone conference with Dr. Charles
Cook re: high school graduates not being
college ready; conference wiih counsel re:
same; email Dr. Charles Cook re: areas and
questions for our upcoming telephone
conference.

Conference witi: K. Gray, IV re: exhibits;
review emails; work re: brief to court;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: Community
College witaess; review R. Freeman email;
email-I. Wisnowski re: same; review R.
Freentan email; reply to same; email D.
Thomnpson re: brief; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; telephone conference
with W. Pierce, R. Freeman, and C. Ak re:
exhibits; review D. Thompson emails (2);
review draft email to Dr. Cook; review H.
Mclntush emails (2); review S. Rosen
emails; review D. Hinojosa email; review
Dr. Cook email; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: same; review email re: H.D.
Chambers deposition; work re: exhibits;
work re: 8/28 mini trial.

Continue work re: expert designation sand
supporting documents; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: G. Salazar

Invoice # 41573

2.00 hrs

5.05 hrs

2.95 hrs

175 hrs
1.00 hrs

$ 500.00

$883.75

$1.327.50

$175.00
N/C
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08/28/2012

08/28/2012

08/28/2012

08/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

deposition; email T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: same; telephone conference with T.
Robertson re: court presentation schedule;
email C. Dupre re: review of deposition
transcript; email H.D. Chambers re: same;
review email from R. Gray re; joint experts;
review email from R. Gray, IV re: same.
Travel to courthouse; Joe Wisnowski’s
presentation to Judge Dietz; return to office
from courthouse.

Review L. Halpemn email; review deposition
schedule; review L. Moak emails; review R.
Freeman email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D, Thompson
email; review D. Thompson briefing; review
deposition transcript of M. French; attend
mini-trial Day {; review message from B.
Wood; review State’s disclosure requests;
conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman
re: exhibits; review R. Freeman email; repiy
to same; telephone call to B. Wood - left
message; review status brief; review 0.
Thompson brief; telephone conferznce with
B. Wood re: status; review stat=’s
disclosures; review message from T.
Hunter; telephone call to/T. Hunter - left
message; email T. Hunter re: status.

Review email from T, Hunter re: G. Salazar
video presentation; ielephone conference
with G. Salazarve: same; email T. Williams
and S. Kincannon re: deposition
preparation| 1zview email from court
reporter re:- M. French transcript; review,
update, and calendar deposition schedule;
review email from R. Knight re: corrections
to depositien transcript; review State’s
amended initial disclosures; efile and serve
Brief on Law of the Case; review email
from G. Salazar re: video; review video;
email M. French re: review of deposition
transcript.

Travel to courthouse for presentation of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher and Charter Schools;
presentation with Judge Dietz; meeting with
Wayne Pierce and Ray Freeman re: exhibits;
return to office; review State’s brief on law
of the case; meeting with counsel re:
depositions, witnesses, discovery, and
overall case status; draft email to Discovery

Invoice # 41573

5.70 hrs

835 hrs

2.75 hrs

6.10 hrs

$997.50

$3,757.50

W

$1067.50
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08/29/2012

08/29/2012

08/29/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

Superintendents re: interrogatories from the
State; conference with counsel re: same.
Review R. Freeman email; reply to same; 6.00 hrs
attend day 2 of the mini-trial; review T.
Hunter email re: B. Baker; review matenal
re: calculations; review L. Lacy email; work
on discovery; conference with R. Gray, IV
and T. Hunter re: discovery, depositions,
and trial preparation; review M, Sisler
email; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review order granting bifurcated trial;
review TEA website; email R. Freeman re:
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: deposition 1.70 brs
schedule; review email from S. Rosen re:
order granting motion for bifurcated tnial;
review email from I. Pina re: deposition
schedule; review and retum email from T.
Hunter re: status of Superintendents’
revisions to transcripts; review emails re:
travel arrangements for B, Baker; review
and calendar list of additional dep=sitions to
be scheduled by the State; emai] 4. Sisler
G. Salazar video link; review emails from T.
Hunter re: same; confer vath'T. Hunter re:
Coalition Plaintiffs’ discovery deadlines;
telephone conference with A. Tekell,
general counsel for 2elton ISD, re: latest
pleading and B<ton ISD's response to RFF;
email A. Tekell re: same; prepare
documents for G. Salazar deposition; review
email frora M, Sisler re: from Calhoun ISD,
Ft. Bend and Edgewood ISD depositions;
review email from T. Hunter re: report from
Dan'Casey; review documents produced by
%1, Bend re: same; review email from M.
Sisler re: revised deposition notices,

Draft objections to discovery from State and 5.80 hrs
Imerveners; several emails to B. Baker re:
his deposition; emails to B. Lesley, P.
Coibert re: depositions; review material
provided for presentation by L.D. Fisher;
conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV re: discovery issues,discovery responses,
expert deposition schedule, trial witnesses
and other matters; conference with Richard
Gray IV re: directives to superintendents;
review Richard Gray IV email to

Invoice # 41573

$2,700.00

NIC

$1,885.00
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08/30/2012

08/30/2012

08/30/2012

08/30/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SE!

superintendents.

Meeting with counsel re: case status,
depositions, data, exhibits, etc.; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: exhibits;
telephone conference with David Thompson
re: Houston Community College; telephone
conference {voicemai}) with El Centro
Community College re: college readiness of
students coming straight from high school;
conference with legal assistant re: expert
reports and depositions; conference with
counsel re: discovery responses to the state;
conference with counsel re: possible dates to
meet with Taxpayer plaintiffs; telephone
conference with Ray Freeman re:
inter-district comparisons; email discovery
superintendents re: interrogatories from the
State and Intervenors.

Review 8. Murdock supplemental report;
email D. Hinojosa re: Court's ruling; review
M. Bono email; reply to same; review M.
Bono email; review D. Hinojosa ematil;
review correspondence from S. Réaen;
review additional deposition notices; review
M. Sisler email; review notice from court
reporter.

Review L. Lawrence email; review D.
Hinojosa email; reply io'L. Lacy; review C.
Cook email; conference with R. Gray, IV re;
same; conferenc= with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; telephone cail to L. Moak - left
message; revizw email; reply
to same; 1oview S. Rosen email; reply to
same; email R. Freeman re: data analysis;
review additional deposition notices; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review

ermail; reply to same; telephone conference
with L. Moak re: 1994 standards.

Prepare Plaintiffs’ deposition notice for Dr.
Bonnie A. Lesley; confer with T. Hunter re:
same; review emails re: discovery
responses; review email from court reporter
re: transcripts; review email from T. Hunter
re: Murdock supplemental report; review
email from T. Hunter re: K. Garza review of
transcript; telephone conference with M.
Sisler re: same; email K. Garza re: 10 day
extension to return transcript; review email
from C. Pacheco re: deposition schedule;

Invoice # 41573

2.50 hrs

175 hrs

2.25 hrs

1.00 hrs
3.25 hus

$437.50

$ 787.50

$1,012.50

$100.00
N/C
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08/30/2012

08/31/2012

08/31/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

review email from D. Hinojosa re: memo to
the judge on Plea to the Jurisdiction; review
file re: same; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review email re: A. Parker deposition;
telephone conference with court reporter re:
G. Salazar deposition and depositions going
forward; review email from M. Sisler re:
additional depositions; review email from S.
Rosen re: case style; review email from M.
French re: errata sheet; review email from S.
Rosen re: IT training; review email from L.
Lawrence re: additional expert designation;
email M. Sisler re: A. Odden deposition
notice.
Prepare for deposition of G. Salazar; 5.50 hrs
conference with R. Gray re: deposition B.
Baker; telephone conference with L.,
Halpern re: deposition of Lesiey and Baker;
telephone conference with S. Dahlberg re;
our responses to the State’s 1st RFP; email
to several superintendents re: same; meée!
with G. Salazar in preparation for his
deposition; email to all focus distiic:
superintendents requesting information from
State’s Interrogatories and Intervenor
Interrogatories.
Review emails re: deposition notices; 1.15 hrs
conference cail with aitomeys re: case
status; conference with legal assistant re:
discovery.
Review M. Trachtenberg email; conference 5.05 hrs
with T. Hunter re: discovery; review H.
Mclntush email; review S. Murdock
supplcmental report; review D. Hincjosa
emails; review email; reply to
sane; review emaii re: 5. Murdock; reply to
came; review 1. Pena email; review article
by B. Hammond; telephone call to D.
Hinojosa re: depositions status; review L.
Halpern email; review M. Sisler email;
review additional deposition notices;
telephone conference with attorneys re;
discovery, trial strategy, and status; review
email; reply to same; review
M. Trachtenberg email; partial attendance at
G. Salazar deposition; work re: exhibit
selection; review S. Dahlberg email; reply
to same; review D. Hincjosa email; email
attorneys re: discovery; review J. Hoffer

Invoice # 41573

$1,787.50

$201.25

$2,272.50
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08/31/2012 SEJ

08/31/2012 TBH

TIMEREEPER RECAP

email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review M. Sisler emails (2); review T.
Robertson emails (3); reply to same (3);
review 8. Rosen email; reply to same;
conference call with attorneys re: witnesses
and depositions; review D. Hinojosa email.
Review and calendar additional deposition 1.50 hrs
notices from the State Defendants: review
and return emai from T. Hunter re:
discovery responses; confer with R. Gray re:
same; review email from L. Pena re:
deposition schedule; review email from
counsel re: Murdock supplemental report;
review email re: amended deposition notice
for A. Parker; review and calendar email re:
TASE convention; telephone conference
with C. Pacheco re: deposition schedule;
review email from D. Sawvel re: trial
transcript; review email from R. Gray re:
same.

Attend deposition of Gonzalo Salazar; 10.00 hrs
conference with Gonzalo Salazar; review
emails from M. Trachtenberg and #. Gray
re: discovery, review email frocm L. Halpern
re; Lesiey back up data; email to B. Lesley
re: same telephone confercnce with
B.Lesley re: same.

REG W, Richard B. Gray Parmer
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

14985 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
80.65 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
13235 hrs @ 325.00 /by
20.25 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
383.10
Invoice # 41573

N/C

$3,250.00

$126,585.00

$67,432.50
$14,11375
$43,013.75
$ 2,025.00

$126,585.00
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

Septernber 30, 2012

Tax ID No.: T4-2427406
Invoiced: 41884-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through; 09/30/2012
¢fo Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROEESSIONAL SERVICES
0970172012 REG Work re: exhibit designation; conference 3.25 hrs $1.462.50
with re: testing.
090272012 REG Review D. Thompson emails (2); review L. 2.75 brs $1,237.50
Halpern emails (2); reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; work re: exhibit designations.
09/02/2012 TBH Several emails to B. Baker, L. Halpern and 0.40 hrs $130.00
D. Thompson re: scheduling Baker
deposition.
09/03/2012 REG Review C. Enoch email; review D. Hinojosa 1.85 hrs $ 83250
email; work on exhibits; review emlais;
reply to same.
09/03/2012 SEJ Review email from G. Salazar =o: review of 0.50 his NIC
transcript, review emails from attorneys re:
deposition transcripts; teleplione conference
with court reporter rel saine; review email
from 1. Pina re: scheduled depositions;
review email from T, Hunter re: document
produciion.
09/04/2012 RGIV  Meeting with counsel re: trial strategy and 5.90 hrs $1032.50

case statvs: meeting with counsel re:
exhibits, meeting at Equity Center re:
exhitits, create folder re: trial witnesses and
their exhibits; review data re; focus districts;
huiid spreadsheet for counsel re: 1&S Yield
ver Penny for our focus districts and
comparative districts.

09/04/2012 REG Review transcript of Sconzo deposition; 5.45 hrs $2.452.50
review L. Halpem email; work with R.
Gray, 1V re: exhibits; review emails re;
depositions; status meeting with T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV; review draft
correspondence; review 1. Pina email,
review M. Sisler email; conference with W.
Pierce, R. Freeman, C. Aki, and R. Gray, IV
re: exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re:
B. Baker deposition dates and exhibits;



0%/04/2012

09/04/2012

09/05/2012

Fh0a01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

prepare for D. McAdams deposition; review
M. French email; with attachments;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
Charter Schools’ expert designations; review
email re: L. Harris deposition; review 6630
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email; review
additional C. Belfield exhibits; review S.
Dahlberg emall; review D. Hinojosa emails.
Telephone conferences (3) with P. Cox,
Hillsboro ISD re: N. Baker deposition,
confer with R, Gray, IV re: same; email T.
Robertson re: meeting scheduled for Parent
Plaintiffs; review email from D. Hinojosa
re: C. Belfield reports; review email from C.
Pacheco re: expert designations: review
email from L. Young re: J. Pfeifer
corrections to deposition transcrpt; review
email from L. Young re: amended minutes
from the Board of Trustees’ meeting 2011,
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review file
re: same; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
Kaufman ISD documents; prepare and serve
copies of document production to counsel;
review email to Discovery Superintendents
re: bates number references; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review email from T.
Hunter re: report of L. Harris; review filoye:
same; confer with T. Hunter re: Plaintiiv
Groups expert depositions; review email
from D. Hinojosa re: additional documents
re: C. Belfield expert report; roview email
from §. Dahlberg re: same; review email
from 1. Pina re: tables used 7or Dr. Cortez's
report and deposition: review and return
email from J. Knight re: deposition changes
and signature pages; review email from M.
Sisler re: suppleniental document
production.

Meet with R. Gray and Richard Gray IV re:
status, wilnesses, exhibits; draft responses to
State’s discovery and to Intervenor's
dissovery; direct staff on mailing
insiructions to Superintendents; review
emails to D. Thompson and L. Halpem re:
Baker deposition; review email from T.
Williams re: deposition preparation; email
to S. Dalhberg re: Williams and Kincannon
depositions; review response; request 1 & S
chart from R. Gray IV, email to B. Baker re:
backup for report; review report of L.
Harris.

Meeting with counsel re: underlying data for
exhibits; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce and Ray Freeman re: same; meeting
with Todd Williams and Susan Kincannon

Invoice # 41884

2.00 brs
375 hrs

6.10 hrs

3.80 hrs

$ 200.00
N/IC

£1982.50

$665.00

Page 2



09/05/2012

09/05/2012

09/05/2012

0910612012

09/06/2012

EH R0

SEI

RGIV

REG

re: deposition preparation; conference with
legal assistant re: Belton supplemental
production.

Review Gilcrease deposition transeript;
review emails; review Charter School expert
designations and reports; partial attendance
of D. McAdams deposition; conference with
T. Hunter re: B. Baker deposition; review H.
MclIntush email; review S. Rosen email;
review M. Sisler email; review deposition
notices for B. Duncombe and B. Baker;
review A. Cortez deposition notice; review
emails re; depositions (5); review emails re:
J. Wisnowsky report (4); reply to same;
review email re: A. Cortez report; review L.
Moak email; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; conference with D,
Thompson re: exhibits; conference with L.
Halpern re: depositions; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same.

Review email from 1. Pina re: A. Cortez
deposition and reports; confer with R. Gray
re: same; confer with R. Gray, IV re; W,
Pierce supporting documents produced;
review file re: same; review email from T.
Robertson re: conference of Plaintff
Parents; review emai! from M. Sisler rz:
revised deposition notice for A. Cortez,
update and calendar deposition schedule;
review and calendar additional amended
deposition notices; review emails re: B.
Baker travel to Austin; make veservations
re: same; review and respond to email from
C. Woods re: discovecy vesponses.

Edit | & S chart; review emails from B.
Baker and respopd; wiephone conference
with W. Pierce ver underlining data; prepare
for deposition of T, Williams and S.
Kincannon; telephone conference with D
Hathcock ot Pllugerville re: discovery
requesic review emails from Plaintiff
attomeys on variety of matters and respond.
Denosition of Dr. Susan Kincannon of
Selton 18D, telephone conference with
Wayne Pierce re: underlying data for
exhibits, telephone conference with Charles
Aki re: exhibits; conference with counsel re:
same; Telephone conference with Tedrah
from the Bquity Center re: meeting with
taxpayer plaintiffs; meeting with counsel re:
expert depositions.

Review B. Baker email; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; review D. Sewall emails;
reply to same; conference with R. Gray, IV
re: Belton deposition; review emails re;

Invoice # 41884

4.20 hrs

3.75 hrs

4.50 hrs

6.65 hrs

3.75 hrs

$1,890.00

NIC

$1462.50

$1163.75

$1,687.50

Page 3



09/06/2012

05/06/2012

09/07/2012

10307

SEI

TBH

RGIY

State witnesses; review Motion for
Substitution of new party (Comm.
Williams); review emails re: same; reply to
same; review L. Moak emails (3); review L.
Lacy emails, review material re; L. Harris
deposition; review Charter School discovery
to State; review P. Fraissinet email; review
email re: L. Harris deposition; work re:
exhibits; conference with attorneys re:
depositions; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re; exhibits; review L. Halpem
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review H. Mclintush email; review P,
Fraissinet email; review B. Schulman email;
review D. Hinojosa email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.
Hunter and R. Gray, 1V re: depositions.
Review emails re: depositions; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; review email from M.
Sisler re: Motion to Substitute Defendant;
review email from R. Gray re: expert L.
Harris; review email from C. Nickell re:
current list of districts; review email from C.
Pacheco re: Charter Plaintiffs’ discovery
requests, email Dr. Baker re: travel
arrangements; review email from Dir. Bakes
re: same; email court reporter re: handling
of deposition transcripts; review emails 1!
deposition exhibits; review emails irom C.
Pacheco re: discovery reguests; review
email from T. Hunter re: deposition notices
for Linda Roska for 9/25 hereat 9, and for
Ron Coleman on 9/26 hete at 9; prepare,
serve, and calendar notices; confer with R,
Gray re: Plaintiffs’ responses to RFD;
review file re: same; review email re:
cancelled Grier deposition; revise deposition
calendars re:(szme; review State's responses
to Plaintifty’ RFP; confer with R. Gray re:
same.

Conferzice with T, Williams re; deposition;
atvend deposition of T. Williams; conference
wita R. Gray IV re: data from W. Pierce;
telephone conference with W, Pierce, leRt
message; conference with R. Gray re:
scheduling depositions for Staie’s witnesses;
schedule same; conference with S. Jennings
re: depositions and other matters; review
emails from Plaintiff's attorneys re:
depositions and other matters,

Telephone conference with Tedrah at the
Equity Center re: taxpayer meeting;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: exhibits; review
emails re: depositions; put together 1&S

Invoice # 41884

1.00 hrs
5.35 hrs

9.30 hrs

4,45 hrs

$ 10000
N/C

$3022.50

$778.75

Page 4



09/072012

09/07/2012

09/08/2012
09/09/2012
09/09/2012

09/09/2012

08/10/2012

09/10/2012

B3 rRi)

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

RGIV

Yield Per Penny Run for counsel; meeting
at Bquity Center re: data and exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same.

Work re: 6630 exhibits; work re: 4.25 hrs
depositions; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D, Hinojosa emails; reply to same;
conference with R. Gray, TV re: exhibits;
teview Charter School discovery; work re:
disclosure requests; review S. Rodriguez
email; review email; review
disclosure responses; review deposition
notices; review 8. Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review §.
Dahlberg email; reply to same; review J,
Turner email; reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa emails; reply to same; review J.
Turner email; review J. Schulman email;
review supplemental discovery responses by
the State; review K. Kallison article; review
1. Turmner email; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: researching K. Kallison; review B,
Baker email; review A. Givens deposition
notice; work with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits
and K. Kallison; review additional
deposition notices,

Review email re: K. Kallison article; review 1.20 hrs
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
discovery responses for Plaintiff Groups;
review email from R. Gray re: same’; yeview
email from J. Turer re: deposition bf A.
Givens; review email from R, Gray re:
same; review email from J. Turner re:
extension to designate rerponsive experts.

Work re: exhibits. 0.75 hrs
Review, format, and print exhibits for 5.00 hrs
counsel.

Work re: exhibii oreparation; conference 1.50 hrs
with T. Hunt2r and B. Lesley re: 9/10

deposition.

Prepase for meeting with B. Lesley; meet 3.00 hrs
with B. Lesley in preparation for deposition.

Review emails re; deposition notices, 2.65 hrs

discovery; meseting at equity center re;
oxhibits; meeting with counsel re: same;
telephone conference with Roy Knight re:
discovery, telephone conference with
Charles Aki re: exhibits.

Work re: exhibits; conference with Equity 5.90 hrs
Center personnel re: exhibits; review J.
Turner email; review D. Hinojosa email;
email J. Tumer re: K. Kallison; partial
attendance at B. Lesley deposition; work re:
P. Colbert deposition preparation; work re:
R. Coleman deposition; email L. Moak re:
deposition and status; review message from

Involce # 41884

$1,912.50

i T

$ 33750
$875.00
$ 675.00

$975.00

$463.75

$2,655.00

Page 5



09/10/2012

09/10/2012

05/11/2012

3a2at

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

P. Colbert; review T. Robertson email;
review H.D. Chambers email; review
material re: P. Colbert deposition
preparation; review amended deposition
notice; review review invoice from court
reporter; review J. Knight correspondence;
review B. Bender notice of appearance;
review L. Moak email; review R. Coleman
interview; reply to L. Moak interview,
review discovery from Charter Schools;
review supplemental discovery responses;
review J. Strohmeyer expert report; review
W. Pierce emails; reply to same; email M.
Trachtenberg re: exhibits; review M.

Trachtenberg email.
Review and calendar Charter Schools’ RFP 2.25 hrs
to Plaintiffs; prepare Second Supplemental 3.00 hrs

Response to all Parties’ RFD; review email
from J. Knight re: supplemental discovery
responses; email J. Vigdor re: W-9 form;
review email from T. Hunter re: Second
Supplemental Response to All Parties
RFD's; review email from R. Gray, 1V re:
Everman ISD supplemental response to
State Defendants’ RFP; review email from
T. Hunter re: expert fees; review and
calendar S. Coultress deposition notice;
review and calendar V. Day deposition
notice; review email from J. Tumer tv:
extension to designate responsive eperts,
review email from B. Hinojosa re: H.D.
Chambers deposition revision:; prepare
Second Supplemental Response to All
Parties’ Request for Disclosure; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; review email from C.
Pacheco re: Noties o Appearance of
Co-Counsel; emaii court reporter and
counsel re: J( Pteifer's revisions to
deposition transcript; telephone conference
with M. Sizsler re: email to C. Meyers re: 1.
Pfeif=1 deposition revisions; email S.
Dihluerg re: same; review Charter Schools’
Interrogatories to Coalition Plaintiffs;
review email from C. Pacheco re: expert
witness report for I. Strohmeyer; review
email from C. Pacheco re: Wood Rolle
expert witness report; confer with T. Hunter
re: answers to Charter Plaintiffs
Interrogatories; confer with T. Hunter re:
deposition of A. Givens.

Attend deposition of B.Lesley; conference 11.00 hrs
with B. Lesley; respond to emails from R.
Gray re: various matters.

Conference with counsel re: exhibits; 4.60 hrs
research re: James Kal Kallison; meeting at

Invoice # 41884

$ 22500
NAC

$3575.00

$805.00

Page &



09/11/2012

0571172012

09/11/2012

09/12/2012

0o/12/2012

EELir s i

REG

SEI

RGIV

Equity Center re: data and exhibiis; review
emails from Wayne Pierce re: max revenue
exhibits; review email from counsel re:
backup data; review, format, and print
exhibits.

Email W. Pierce re: exhibits; conference
with R, Gray, IV re: exhibits; review emails
re: B. Lesley; review B. Wood emails;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg email, conference with T.
Hunter re: B. Baker; review P. Fraissinet
email; review L. Lacy email; email B.
Wood re: status; email W. Pierce re: status;
prepare P. Colbert for deposition; review L.
Moak email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review J. Tormer email; telephone call to 1.
Turner - left message; review status of
supplemental discovery responses; review
D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; review
W. Pierce email; work re: exhibit
preparation; review Charter report; review
L. Lacy emails; review M. Bono email with
attachments; review J. Turner email,
telephone conference with J. Tumer re: P.
Colbert deposition.

Diraft Plaintiffs’ Answers to Charter Schooi®’
Interrogatories; confer with T. Hunter ie:
trial exhibits and discovery responses;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: Pflugerviile
1SD's amended responses to RF2; email
counsel re: same; review emati from C,
Dupte re: review of transcript; review email
from T. Hunter re: same;review email from
I. Reich re: supplemeatal production;
review email from .. Lawrence re:
deposition exhibits; 1=view email re: State
Defendants responze to Ft. Bend's RFP.
Review emails from various people and
respond; review exhibits; review expent
witness }si; review discovery requests from
the Charter schools; review discovery
responses from districts; go through Baker's
weort for potential exhibits.

Conference with counsel re: exhibits and
case status; review emails re: supplemental
discovery; conference with legal assistant
re: same; review, format, and print exhibits;
telephone conference with Reece Blincoe
re: supplemental discovery responses;
meeting with counsel re: case status,
telephone conference with Charles Aki re:
Exhibits,

Attend P. Colbert deposition; review D,
Hinojosa email; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review

Invoice # 41884

3.00 hrs

1.00 hrs
1.75 hrs

2.30 has

3.90 hrs

7.75 hrs

$1,350.00

§ 100.00
N/C

$747.50

$682.50

$3,487.50

Pagn 7



09/12/2012

09/12/2012

310201

SEJ

TBH

deposition notice for AISD; review A,
Givens deposition notice; review L. Lacy
email; reply to same; conference with T.
Hunter re: document production; work re:
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with S. Jennings re: document
production; review P. Colbert email; reply
to same; work re: exhibit preparation;
review |, Pina emails; email W. Pierce re:
deposition; review Lopez report; review
backup data for Cortez report; email P.
Colbert re: data; conference with T. Hunter
and R. Gray 1V re: depositions exhibits and
trial preparation.

Email P. Colbert re: B. Lesley and B. Baker 5.25 hrs
reports, confer with R. Gray re: same; email
counsel supplemental responses of Hillshoro
18Dy; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; work
re: depositions; review emails from C.
Pacheco re: Hillsboro supplemental
response to RFP; email court reporter re:
how to proceed going forward re:
transcripts, etc.; telephone conference with
5. Kelly, AG's office, re: original exhibits of
Dr. Gilcrease; review email from R. Gray,
IV re: Hillsboro 1SD's supplemental
response to State Defendants’ RFP; serve all
counsel with Hillsboro ISD supplement
response; email court reporter re: déposition
transcripts going forward; revie'v enail
from L Pina re: revised P. Lopez expert
report; telephone conferencs with court
reporter re: original trans¢ripis and exhibits;
email counsel re: T. Wailis's revisions to
deposition; review email from 1. Pina re;
Schanzenbach ana izquierdo depositions;
confer with T. Iluster re: depositions;
review email from 5. Rodriguez re; Ft. Bend
ISD Plaintiffs’ deposition notice of Dr.
Carstarphea; review email from A.
Sandoval re: Dr. Karen Garza's revisions to
deposition; telephone conference with AG's
cffice re: Odden deposition; review email
confirrnation of R. Blincoe deposition;
review email from court reporter re: G.
Salazar depo. transcript; email counsel re:
Dr. Garza revisions to deposition; email
counsel re: revisions to T. Wallis deposition.
Attend deposition of B. Wiggins; begin 6.60 hrs
outlining testimony from B. Baker and
identifying Statements of Fact from his
report; conference with R. Gray, Richard
Gray IV re: data to be forwarded over to the
State from Equity Center; review witnesses
and discovery; review data provided by W.

Invoice # 41884

NIC

$2145.00

Page: 4



09/13/2012

09/13/2012

08/13/2012

05/13/2012

097142012

IHR-a1

RGIV

REG

SEI

TBH

REG

Pierce; review emails from other Plaintiff
attomeys re: discovery and respond; review
emails from W. Pierce re: forwarding
articles of interest.

Review, format, and print data re: exhibits,
conference with counsel re: backup data;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
revise 1&S Revenue per Penny analysis for
counsel; telephone conference with Charles
Ald at the Equity Center re: revenue
seeking; telephone conference with Ray
Freeman at the Equity Center re:
inter-district comparisons; review, format,
and print revenue seeking exhibits;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
and Charles Aki re; same.

Travel to and from Houston; speak at Harris
County Superintendent’s meeting;
conference with Richard Gray, IV re:
exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re:
depositions; review R. Rice email; review T.
Fraissinet email.

Review email re: Lubbock ISD
supplemental response to State Defendants’
RFP; review emails re: Hillsboro ISD
supplemental response to State Defendants
RFP; review email from C. Woods re; Allef
ISD¥'s supplemental response to State
Defendants’ RFP; email T. Hunter ‘e Odden
deposition; review email from cour! reporter
re: deposition schedule going forward;
confer with T. Hunter re: samy; review
email from 1. Pina re: Edgervood ISD
documents; confer with T. Hunter re; R,
Blincoe report; review email from D,
Hinojosa re: suppleme=ntal document
production; revicw 9/14 email from C.
Woods re: document production; review
email from 1. Lawrence re: deposition
exhibits; toview email from . Pina re:
Edgewcod ISD updated document index;
review email from P. Fraissinet re: amended
notice of 8. Murdock; email counsel re: R.
Slincoe’s dissertation; email counsel re;
Alief ISD supplemental response to RFP,
email counsel re: Quinlan I1SD supplemental
responses.

Preparation for deposition of R. Blincoe;
conference with Richard Gray 1V re: data to
produce; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: same; meet with R. Blincoe in
preparation for his deposition.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; review
outline of findings; reply to M.
Trachtenberg; work re: exhibits; review

invoice # 41884

5.25 hrs

8.25 hrs

6.10 hrs

5.60 hrs

5.15 hrs

$218.75

$3,712.50

WA

$1820.00

$2,317.50

Page %



09/14/2012

09/14/2012

09/14/2012

09/16/2012

09/16/2012

05/17/2012

09/17/2012

3R

SEJ

VHV

REG

RGIV

REG

material re: K. Kallison; review [. Pifia
email; review M, Trachienberg email;
review draft conclusions; reply to M.
Trachtenberg email; review L. Lawrence
email; review M. Bono email; review 1, Pifia
email; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review L. Lacy email; review email
re: deposition transcript; review material re:
K. Kailison; work re: exhibit preparation
and organization; review I. Pifia email.
Review email from L. Lawrence re: Dr.
Klein's invoice, review email from L. Pina
te: Harlingen ISD documents.

Attend deposition of R. Blincoe; conference
with R. Blincoe; review emails from various
superintendents re: discovery responses and
respond; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: sharing data with A. Coriez.
Conference with R. Gray, 11l re: meeting,
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
same, calendar re: same.

Work re: exhibits; review emails; reply to
emails.

Work on Baker's testimony; telephone
conference with Plaintiffs attorneys and Bill
Duncomb re: support to his report and
conferring with Baker; email to W, Pieqs
re: maximum tax rates in 2003; review
response.

Review emails re; interrogatory responses
from Focus Districts; conferenca with legal
assistant and counsel re: same; email same
to counsel; meeting at BEqoity Center re:
exhibits; telephone coaterence with Wayne
Pierce re: same; review deposition
transcripts and exhibits from same,
conference with cvunsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: exhibits; review
inter-distnot comparisons.

Review L. Lacy email; review B.
Duncomoe additional analysis; review H D.
Chombers email, reply same; review R.
Fre:man email, conference with R. Gray IV
ve: exhibits; review J. Winte email; review S.
Dahlberg email; review D. Thomson email;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to S..
Dahlberg email; review R. Schulman email;
review C. Diamond email; review Hanushek
Supplemental Report, review P. Fraissinet
email; review D). Thompson email;
conference with W. Plerce and staff re:
exhibits; telephone conference with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman re: exhibits; review
S. Dahlberg email; reply to same; work re:
additional exhibits; review Hanushek

Invoice # 41884

0206 hrs

9.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.50 hrs

4.00 hrs

6.30 hrs

6.25 hrs

NiC

$2925.00

N/C

$ 675.00

$1300.00

$1102.50

$2,812.50

Fage 10



0971772012

09/17/2012

09/18/2012

09/18/2012

I

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

supplemental report; review M. Sisler email;
review Duncomb revised analysis; review
W. Pierce report; email S. Dahlberg re:
expert designations and reports; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review supplemental
discovery responses; review State's expert
designations; review expert reports of L.
Guthrie, G. Whitehurst, and Podgursky;
review L. Ayala report; review resumes;
review State’s expert designation; review L.
Davis report and resume.

Review email from L. Lawrence re; 5.75 hrs
deposition exhibits; review email from 1.
Pina re: [zquierdo addendum report; review
email from S. Rosen re: orders entered by
the Court; seview email from N. Wills re:
Defendants expert reports and CV's; review
email from Lubbock 18D re: supplemental
response to to RFP; confer with T. Hunter
re: revisions o interrogatory responses;
review email from R. Gray, 1V re: Los
Fresos 18D supplemental responses; review
emails re: Pflugerville ISD supplemental
response; review email from C. Dupre re:
revisions to transcript; review email from
M. Sisler re: deposition of V. Day: review
emails re: Focus Districts Superintendeais’
deposition transcript for trial; review emuil
from R. Gray, 1V re: Belion 1SD
supplemental responses and respontes to
interrogatories; confer with R Gray, 111 re:
additional documents produced afier
deposition; continue work re: organizing
and preparing reportsand discovery for
agiorney review,

Finish outlining Raker's testimony; 6.70 hrs
conference with K Gray re: various
discovery responses; begin reviewing
District responses to discovery from State
and Intervenors and begin assembling our
response; telephone conference with J.
Kazcit and H. Keller, left message; email to
Eaber re: State's experts.

Meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits; 8.15 brs
conference with counsel re; same; organize
exhibits and exhibit folder on server;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits; conference with legal assistant re:
discovery; review districts responses to
Intervenors and State’s interrogatories;
meeting with counsel and legal assistant re:
same; meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits.
Review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review 5.00 hrs
D. Hinojosa email; review L. Lawrence
email; review L. Davis report; reply to email

Invoice # 41884

NIC

$2177.50

$1426.25

$2,250.00

Page 11



06/18/2012

09/18/2012

e

SEJ

TBH

re: depositions; conference with R, Gray, IV
re: exhibit status; conference with T. Hunter
re: depositions and expert wilness; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review D,
Thompson email; review P. Fraissinet
email; review D. Hinojosa email; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: exhibits (2);
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; review status of
supplemental disclosure request; review W,
Pierce email; reply fo same; review exhibits
fe: property tax comparisons; review A.
Penn email; review 8. Dahlberg email re:
witness list; review emails re: State’s
experts; review background material re:
State’s experts; review D. Hinojosa emails
{2); conference call with attorneys re: State’s
experts.

Review L. Lawrence email re: deposition 9.00 hrs
exhibits; email H. McIntush re: original
deposition transcripts; review email re:
same; review email from T. Hunter re:
Lufkin 18D supplemental response to RFP;
ermail counsel re: same; email A. Penn
additional deposition responses from J.
Witte; conference with attorneys re:
discovery responses; email counsel re: Los
Fresnos 1SD supplemental responses 1o
RFP; email counsel re; Kaufman ISD
supplemental response to RFP; review email
from M. Sisler re: Kaufman msponse;
review response and email M. Sisler re:
same; review email from 0. Sisler re:
amended response 10 RXD’s; review email
from M. Sisler re: H.D. Chambers' errata
sheet; review and cawndar email from B.
Baker re: attorucy telephone conference;
confer with ¥, Hunter re: same; review
email from T. Williams re: Kaufman 18D
exhibit; review email from C. Diamond re:
Intervenors’ expert designations; review
emaii from court reporter re: Kincannon
trauscript; confer with R, Gray, IV re:
Bverman's response to State’s RFP; review
email from S. Dahlberg re: L. Davis’s report
and CV; confer with T. Hunter re: same.
Conference with R. Gray re:State’s experts; 7.60 hrs
review emails from other Plaintff attorneys
re: same; email to B. Baker re: telephone
conference and testimony,; review response;
finish drafting responses to the State’s
Interroggs and RFP and Intervenors
Interoggs and RFP; conference with R, Gray
IV and 8. Jennings re: same; begin
preparing for deposition of Linda Roska;

Invoice # 41884

NIC

$2470.00

Pagei2



09/19/2012

09/19/2012

091972012

Jio2a)

RGIV

REG

SEJ

review cross-examination of C. Foster in
WOC I telephone conference with
Plaintiffs' attorneys re: State’s experts.
Conference with counsel re: exhibits,
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re;
same; deposition of Wanda Bamberg;
meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits,
review, format, and print exhibits; travel to
kinkos re: copying of exhibits; travel back
from kinkos.

Conference with R. Gray, IV re: W. Plerce
exhibits; review Duncombe supplemental
report; review S. Barnett email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Hinojosa
email; conference with R. Gray, [V re:
Aldine deposition; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D, Thompson email; review M.
Trechtenberg email (2); reply 10 same;
review and revise discovery responses;
conference with T. Hunter re: same;
conference with T. Hunter re: J. Kratsch call
and testimony; conference with R. Gray IV
re: Aldine deposition; review and finalize
discovery response to Intervenors; work on
exhibits; work re: discovery responses;
work on Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; conference with T, Hunterre;
discovery and depositions; review

deposition notice for 8. Murdoch; review M.

Trachtenberg emails (2); review D,
Thompson email; review 5. Rodriguez
email; review suppleraental report; review
order changing defendanis; conference with
R. Gray, IV re: exhilits; review M.
Trachtenberg eqail; review L. Lacy email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same (2}; wview D. Hinojosa email,
conference with R. Gray, IV exhibits.
Confeswith R. Gray, IV re: Everman
TAAR test results; confer with R, Gray re:
same; telephone conference with J. Pfeifer’s
office re: same; review email from A. Tekell
re: revisions 0 5. Kincannon transcript;
email court reporter re: same; review and
retorn emails from court reporter re: errata
sheet; review email from Everman ISD re:
replacement exhibit; email A. Tekell re:
errata sheet; organize State experts in Texas
litigation reports for REG review, revise
discovery responses {cont.); confer with
TBH re: same; review email from §,
Rodriguez re: supplemental Duncombe
report; review email from J. Witte re:

Invoice # 41884

15.25 hrs

4.50 hrs

4.00 hrs
4.00 hrs

$2668,75

$2,025.00

$ 400.00
N/C

Page 13



09/19/2012

09/20/12012

09/20/2012

eRLieR ]

TBH

RGIV

REG

interrogatory answers; review and return
email from C. Pacheco re: Blincoe report
and CV; review and calendar amended
deposition notice for §. Murdock; review
email from L. Robbins re: documents
provided by Dr. Kincannon after her
deposition; review email from L. Robbins
re: revisions to Dr. Kincannon's deposition;
review R. Gray, IV email to Discovery
Superintendents re: answers to
interrogatories; review email from M.
Trachtenberg se: State and Intervenor expert
reports; confer with T. Hunter re; revisions
to answers 10 interrogatories; review email
from A. Tekell re: revisions to Dr.
Kincannon's deposition; review Kaufman
ISD attachment to interrogatory responses;
review email from R. Gray, IV re: Everman
STAAR test results; telephone conference
with Everman ISD staff re: same; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same; email counsel re:
Belton 15D supplemental response to RFP.
Edit discovery responses to State and
Intervenors; respond to email from M.
Trachtenberg re: FOF and COL and review
his proposal; Telephone conference with €
Jensen at court re: questions re: FOF aud
COL; prepare mock cross of W. Pierce.
Conference with counsel re: exhibits,
conference with legal assistant 12 same,
title pages, and table of conterire; telephone
conference with Tedrah Robinson at Eguity
Center re: taxpayer plains{f% addresses;
telephone conferencewith Ray Freeman at
Equity Center re: 6630 exhibits; review
email from Tedrsh Robinson re: taxpayer
plaintiffs addreszes; review and mark
inter-district comparisons re: taxpayer
plaintiff's homes; conference with counsel
re: exhibiis; conference with legal assistant
re: new-exhibits, review, print, and format
sane, meeting with counsel re: review
¢xhibits; conference with counsel re: backup
data questions; review backup data sent 1o
the State; conference with legal assistant re:
same, telephone conference with Adam
Pierce re: exhibits,

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review
supplemental report; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits; research B.
Hammond; review Trachienberg email;
reply {0 same; review transcript of L.
Dawn-Fisher presentation; conference with
T. Hunter re: discovery responses; review

Invoice $ 41884

6.00 hrs

5.40 hrs

8.40 hrs

$1850.00

$545.00

$3,780.00

Page 14



09/20/2012

09/20/2012

09/21/2012

09/21/2012

09/217/2012

B3 1reiy]

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter and W. Pierce re:
deposition preparation; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
L. Lawrence email; review M. Trachtenberg
emails (8); review L. Halpermn email; review
P. Fraissinet emails (3); review 8. Dahlberg
email; review S. Bamnett email; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); work on exhibits;
finalize discovery responses; review data for
lzquierdo report; review 8. Dahlberg email;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
exhibits and deposition; review L. Picus
emails; review L. Dawn-Fisher report, data,
and resume.

Review email from 1. Pina re: underlying
data for expert lzquierdo; review email from
court reporier re: W. Plerce deposition;
review email from T. Hunter re: revisions to
responses to RFD; review email from M.
Trachtenberg re: transcripts from
Wisnowsky and L. Dawn-Fisher
presentations; confer with R. Gray re: same;
continue work re: organizing and preparing
reports and discovery for attomey review.
Conference with R. Gray re: discovery
responses, review emails from M.
Trachtenberg re: same; prepare W. Pierce
for deposition; finalize discovery responses;
email to all superintendents re: sams,
several telephone conferences with W,
Pierce re: data; respond to several emails
from 8. Dahlberg re: datz Tor Pierce report;
review emails from W, Merce re: same;
respond 10 5. Dahlberg; prepare for
deposition of L. Rossa.

Deposition of Wayme Pierce; create
spreadsheet of taxpayer plaintiff
inter-district comparisons.

Review L. Lawrence email; review D.
Hinoives email,; review M. Trachtenberg
emai; review D. Thompson email; email §,
Danlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher deposition;
present W. Pierce for deposition; finalize
deposition notice for L. Dawn-Fisher;
review correspondence from J. Dietz;
review additional deposition notices; review
discovery responsas; review correspondence
re: Kingsville ISD; review emails re: FAST
Report; review emails re: L. Moak/D. Casey
deposition preparation; review J. Turner
email; review D. Thompson emails, (2);
reply to same.

Review email from S. Rosen re: Findings of
Fact; confer with T. Hunter re: same; review

Invoice # 41884

0.75 hrs
1.50 hrs

6.50 hrs

6.15 hrs

8.35 hrs

3.00 hrs
3.75 hs

$ 7500
N/C

$2112.50

$1076.25

$4,207.50

$§ 300.00
N/IC

Page 15



09/21/2012 TBH

09/22/2012 RGIV

09/22/2012 REG

ez

email from M. Sisler re: Defendants’
response to Edgewood discovery; review K.,
Garza verification; review J. Pfeifer
verification; review email from L. Peyton
re: deposition notice of Dr. Podgursky,
review and calendar L. Avala and W.
Grover deposition notices; review email
from H. McIntush re: withdrawal of Focus
District; review T, Williams verification;
review L. Lawrence email re: amended
resporses 10 discovery reguests and
deposition notice of J. Guthrie; review email
re: R. Blincoe answers to interrogatories;
confer with T. Hunter re: Alief ISD
documents responsive {o State’s
interrogatories; review H.D. Chambers
verification; review additional Podgursky
reports; review R. Knight verification;
review FAST report re: Coalition Focus
District; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review eimail from K. Garza re; document
production; confer with R. Gray, 1V re:
same; review H.D. Chambers verification;
prepare deposition notice for L.
Diawn-Fisher; review email from L.
Lawrence re: deposition exhibits; review
email from M. French re: discovery
questions; review email from N.
Bunker-Henderson re: documents fcom Dr.
Blincoe; confer with T. Hunter 1e: same;
review email from C. Pachecore: 8.
Kincannon documents agreed <0 produce
after deposition and 8. Kincannon
deposition notice; review email from R.
Gray, 1V re: documents from Belton ISD,
email counsel re; smie; review email from
counsel re: export deposition schedule;
review email from J. Knight re: attachment
for interroxatory responses; confer with T.
Hunter relverifications; email counsel re: L.
Dawn-Fisher deposition.

Telaphone conference with B. Baker re: 3.00 hrs
exparts; follow up with emails to all
atiorneys; attend deposition of W, Pierce;
finalize discovery responses; respond to
emails re: discovery, telephone conference
with Plaintiff atiorneys, Duncombe, Oddeon
and Moak re: experts.

Prepare for meeting with Taxpayer 3.00 hrs
Plaintiffs; meeting with Taxpayer Plaintiffs;
conference with counsel re: same.
Conference with attorneys re: meeting with 2.50 hrs
witness; review L. Lawrence email;
conference with attorneys re: depositions
and expents; conference with client witness,

Invoice # 41884

$975.00

$525.00

$1,125.00

Page 16



09/22/2012

09/23/2012

09/23/2012

09/23/2012

09/24/2012

(9/24/2012

Jua

RGIV

REG

R. Gray, 1V, and T. Hunter re: testimony
and stafus.

Meet with Taxpayer Plaintiffs; conference
with R. Gray re: same.

Meeting with counsel re: exhibits; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: case status.
Work re: exhibit preparation; review L.
Dawn-Fisher report.

Prepare for deposition of Linda Roska
respond to email from L. Mcintosh re:
discovery responses; review and respond 1o
email from M. Trachienberg re: Findings of
Fact and Conclusions of Law.

Review and reply to email from Karen
Garza re; responses to interrogatories;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits; review and reply to email from
Ray Freeman re: Inter-District Comparison
Report; conference with counsel re: all;
review and update exhibit folder with
Gonzalo Salazar documents; conference
with legal assistant re: same; review Charter
School's Interrogatories; email counse] re:
same; review and reply to email from
counsel re; curriculum vitae of or Harrison
Keller and James Kracht; research re: samz;
conference with legal assistant re: responces
to Districts’ interrogatories; review
Intervenors’ responses 1o our interrogatories
and request for production; ema.l counsel
TE: same.

Review email; review L. Dawa-Fisher
report; review P. Colbert Gaposition email;
telephone conferencewith P. Colbert re:
same; prepare for B. Harnmond deposition;
review material re” J. Guthrie; review M,
Podgursky matenal; prepare for Coleman
deposition; conterence with R. Gray, 1V re;
W. Pierce vall; review FAST Report 2012,
review . Rosen email; review H. Mclntush
correspondence; review email re: W. Pierce
degosition; review P. Colbert email; email
S. Dahlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher; email P.
Colbert and W. Pierce re: same; review T.
Robertson email; reply to same; review 8.
Dahlberg email; forward same to P. Colbert;
review L. Dawn-Fisher database;
cenference with L. Molk re: deposition;
review Everman STAAR results; review W.
Pierce email; review Fort Bend amended
discovery responses; review discovery
responses; review Charter discovery
fesponses; review discovery responses;
review notices re: B. Hammond deposition;
review 8. Dahlberg email; reply to same;

Invoice # 41884

2.00 hrs

1.50 brs

1.50 hrs

2.00 hrs

5.15 hrs

6.60 hrs

$650.00
$262.50
$ 67500

$650.00

$901.25

$2,970.00



09/24/2012

09/24/2012

3l

SEJ

TBH

review M. Trachtenberg email; review L.
Lawrence email, review documents
produced; review D. Thompson email;
review T. Robertson email; reply to same.
Finalize and serve responses to State
Defendants and Intervenors Inferrogatories
and Reguests for Production; review email
from C. Pacheco re: Charter Schools
response to Plaintiffs’ RFD; review email
from 8. Rodriguez re: Ft. Bend 18D
objections and responses (o Defendants’
interrogatories and RFP's; review email
from S. Rodriguez re: deposition revisions
from Dr. Sconzo; review email from C.
Diamond re: Intervenors' answers and
responses to discovery requests; review
email from C. Pacheco re: Charter Schools’
responses (o discovery; review email from
C. Diamond re: document preduction;
telephone conference with D. Kitsos, Alief
ISD, re: response to interrogatories; review
email from A. Tekell re: Belton 18D data;
review email from B. Trevino re: G. Salazar
verification; review J. Knight verification;
review email from 8. Rosen re:
identification badges; confer with R. Gray
re; same; review M. French verification:
confer with T. Hunter re: forwarding copy
of Guthrie report to R. Blincoe forreview;
review Intervenors’ discovery respenses;
review C. Pacheco email re: Charter School
responses, confer with T. Hunger re:
verification; review email irom 8.
Rodriguez re: Ft. Berd discovery responses;
confer with T. Hunter re: Intervenors’
discovery responses, review email from T.
Hunter re; Plaintils’ General Objection;
revise interrogntory responses re: same;
confer with T. Hunter re: upcoming
depositions; review email from L. Lawrence
re: devcsition exhibits; review email from
G.‘Salazar re: interrogatory responses; email
VW Pierce and P. Colbert State's response to
Edgewood RFP; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
video link produced at G. Salazar
deposition.

Prepare for L. Roska's deposition; finalize
responses 1o the State’s and Intervenor
Interrogatories; review emails from R, Gray
on various matters and respond; email to B.
Baker re: conference on other expert
repotts; review response and invite other
Plaintiff atorneys; meet with L. Moak and
R. Gray re: L. Dawn-Fisher's report; review
discovery responses from Intervenor and

Invoice # 41884

3.50 brs
7.00 hrs

6.00 hrs

$ 350,00
NIC

$1950.00

Page 38



09/2512012

09/25/2012

09/25/2012

Jan

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Charter schools; review response of State to
Ft. Bend and Calhoun City discovery,
telephone conference with R. Schuiman re:
extension.

Review mail re: verification pages for Karen 4.15 hrs
Garza (Lubbock); conference with legal
assistant re: same; review, scan, and file
STAAR resulis for Everman ISD;
conference with counsel re: same; meeting
at Equity Center re: data and exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Charles Aki re: same;
review and format updated exhibits; print
same; conference with counsel re: same;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
re: 6630 runs; conference with counsel re;
same; review and reply 0 email from
Wayne Pierce re: deposition transcript.
Review M, Trachtenberg email; reply to 5.75 hrs
same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review L. Lawrence email; review W,
Pierce email; email 8. Dahlberg re: data
request; review C. Diamond email;
complete preparation for R. Coleman
deposition; review K. Kallison report with
data; email W, Pierce re: Kallison and L.
Dawn-Fisher, partial attendance at L. Rocka
deposition; conference with Argie for re.
exhibits; begin work on Findings of Facts;
email W. Pierce and R. Freemar re! meeting
re: depositions; review Intervenors’
discovery responses; review ¥ Fraissinet
email; review S. Dahlberg omail; email L.
Moak re: same; revie'w message from L.
Moak; telephone conference with L. Moak
re: R. Coleman deposition; review A. Contez
deposition notice; teview P. Colbert emails
(2); review V. Pierce emails (3); reply to
same, revicw S, Dahlberg email; email W.
Pierce ro: same; review amended discovery
respenses; review deposition notice for Dr.
Foiks; review W. Pierce emails (3); reply to
same (2); review deposition notice for T.
Currah.

Revise Proposed Findings of Fact (cont.); 4.80 hrs
review and calendar Dr. Folks deposition
notice; review email re: D. Cuorrah
verification; confer with R. Gray, IV re: W,
Pierce deposition transcript; telephone
conference with court reporter re: status of
transcript; confer with R. Gray re: status;
review email from C. Diamond re:
documents; review email from M. Sisler re:
amended response to Calhoun Co.
interrogatories; review and email R. Gray

Invoice # 41884

$728.25

$2,587.50

W

Page 19



09/25/2012

09/26/2012

09/26/2012

0972612012

kvl

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

re: specific objections and answers, confer
with T. Hunter re: Findings of Fact and
expert reports; confer with R, Gray, 1V re:
transcript of W. Pierce deposition; email C.
Diamond re: document production; review
email r¢: same; continue work on draft
Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; continue work re: organizing and
preparing reports and discovery for attorney
review,

Attend deposition of L. Roska; work on 700 tirs
Findings of Fact; emails to H. McDaniel re:
discovery; review email from B. Schulman
re; extension.

Deposition of Rob Coleman; revise and 6.00 hrs
update exhibit binder; conference with
counsel re: same; conference with counsel
re: Findings of Fact; create digital version of
exhibit binder.

Complete preparation for R. Coleman 6.90 hrs
deposition; review L. Lawrence email;
secuse R. Coleman deposition; review email
re: Equity Center meeting; conference with
§. Jennings re: same; review A, Kauffman
email; reply to same; review W. Pierce
email; review T. Robertson email; review
(partial) P. Guthrie report; review additicnal
exhibits; review C. Diamond email; revicw
additional exhibits for A. Parker; cotiference
with W, Pierce and R. Freeman e: L.
Dawn-Fisher and K. Kallison reports; email
§. Dahlberg re: data.

Review and calendar depozition notices; 6.75 hrs
confer with T. Hunter re: Proposed Findings
of Fact; review emails from C. Woods
{Alief 1SD) re: char responses to State
Defendants’ inforrogatories; review email
from T. Hun'er re: Podgursky documents;
continue revising Proposed Findings of
Fact; conder with T. Hunter re: same; review
email fom C, Diamond re: Intervenors'
revponses to State Defendants’ discovery;
neview email from I Pina re: Edgewood
Plaintiffs’ responses to Intervenors’ RFP to
Plaintiff Groups; review email from [. Pina
re: Edgewood Plaintiffs’ responses to
Intervenors’ interrogatories to Plaintiffs;
review Edgewood Plaintiffs’ responses to
Intervenors’ RFP; review email from 1. Pina
re: Edgewood Plaintiffs’ responses to
Intervenors’ Interrogatories; email court
reporter re; transcript and exhibits for R.
Blincoe; confer with R. Gray, IV re;
responses to Charter Schools'
interrogatories; review email from C.

Invoice # 41884

$2275.00

$1050.00

$3.105.00

Page 20



09/26/2012

0912112012

092712012

09/27/2012

09/27/2012

09/28/2012

EELir Rl

RGIV

SE1

RGIV

Pacheco re: Charter School witness
depositions; review email from C. Diamond
re: withdrawal of App. Ato A, Parker
report; confer with R. Gray re: same; review
B. Gilerease verification; continue work re:
all parties discovery responses and expert
designations.

Prepare for Podursky and Gutherie
deposition; review email from AG re:
Blincoe notes; email to Blincoe re: same;
email to Equity Center re: Board meeting,
review responses; conference with Richard
Gray IV re: Findings of Fact; continue to
draft Findings of Fact,

Prepare Trial Witness Exhibit notebooks;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: 2012 Revenue
Per WADA numbers; review expert report
of Lisa Dawn-Fisher,

Review email re: charter school experts;
review M. Trachtenberg ermail; review T.
Hunter email; travel to San Antonio; attend
deposition of A. Cortez; conference with D.
Hinojosa re: scheduling; return to Austin;
review emails re: scheduling and trial
presentation (8); review L. Lacy email;
review MALDEF discovery (supplemeiai)
objections; review S. Dahlberg email; reply
to same; review C. Diamond email noview
Intervenor’s discovery responses: review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same.

Review email from court reporter re: R,
Biincoe deposition transcrint; email R.
Gray, 1V re: same; coafer with T. Hunter re:
draft Proposed Conclusions of Law; review
and reply to T. Hunicr email re: Podgursky
deposition and answers to Charter Schools
interrogatoriss; review and return email
from T. Hunter re: B. Baker deposition;
email couw.t reporter re: deposition schedule;
review email from T. Hunter re: Proposed
Canciusions of Law; prepare initial drafi;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review
email from L Pina re: revised Coriez expent
report; review from [ Pina re: Edgewood
Plaintiffs objections and responses to
Defendants’ interrogatories and RFP’s.
Attend Board meeting at Equity Center;
prepare for Podgursky deposition; work on
Findings of Fact; exchange emails with
Plaintiff attorneys re: planning meeting.
Review email from Ray Freeman re:
2011-2012 PEIMS Summer collection data
anomaly; create trial exhibit binder for Roy
Knight, Thomas Wallis, and Joddie Witte;

Invoice #41884

6.50 hrs

6.10 hrs

10.50 hrs

3.25 hrs

4.40 hrs

4.55 hrs

$2112.50

$1067.50

$4.725.00

N

$1430.00

$796.25

Page 2}



09/28/2012

(9/28/2012

09/28/2012

09/26/2012

09/30/2012
05/30/2012

ozl

REG

SEJ

RGIV

prepare summary sheet for counsel re: all
plaintiff’s experts.

Review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); reply 4.50 s
to same; review R. Freeman email; email
attorneys re: Duncomb preparation; review
deposition notice for A. Parker; review P,
Fraissinet email; reply to same; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits and follow up
with W. Pierce and R. Freeman; review P.
Colbert email; review expert witness list;
review expert witness list for Charter
Plaintiffs; review D. Hinojosa emails (2},
reply to same; review L. Halpern email;
review supplemental report of Podgursky;
review email re; backup material for
Podgursky. review P. Fraissinet emails (2);
reply to same (2); review §. Dahlberg email;
review additional L. Halpern email; prepare
for presentation to coalition; review P,
Fraissinet email; review D. Thompson
email.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Podgursky 4.25 hrs
deposition schedule; email court reporter re:
same; review email from court reporter re:
same; email M. Sisler re: security clearance
for T. Hunter on 10/2; review and calenda’
email re: Duncombe deposition preparation;
review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental discovery responses; teview
ernail from L. Halpem re: supplemental
report of Dr. Podgursky; telepisane
conference with court reporier re: transcript
of Dr. Lesley; review emasi from court
reporter re: same; email court reporter re: R.
Blincoe transcript; review email from court
reporter re: same;-confer with T. Hunter re:
review of Focvs Wistrict Superintendent
depositions; email court reporter re:
Podgursky deposition; continue work re:
discoveiv iesponses and expert reports.
Telephene conference with B. Baker and 1.50 hrs
Pluinuiff attorneys re: Pidgursley:s
azposition; respond to emails and vasious
natters.

Make presentation to Coalition; prepare for 4.00 hrs
A. Parker deposition; review L. Moak
supplemental report; review A. Podgursky
supplemental report; review Vigdor
supplemental report; review D. Hinojosa
email; review A. Bronson email; reply to
same; review J. Turner email; reply to same,

Meeting with counsel re; exhibits. 0.35 hrs
Work re: exhibits; review emails re: Vigdor 3.50 hrs
report.

Invoice # 41884

$2,025.00

$487.50

$1.800.00

$61.25
$1,575.00

$123416.25
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JIMEKEEPER RECAPR

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner

SEY Jennings, Susan Paralegal
VHV  Vuy, Vincent Paralegal

Fee Recap Totals

B3R

13855 hrs @
11425 hrs @
12100 s @
17.50 hrs @
0.00 hrs @

391.30

Invoice # 41884

450,00 /hr
175.00 ftw
325.00 for
100.00 /hr
100.00 fhr

$62,347.50
$19,993.75
$39,325.00
$ 1,750.00
$ 0.00

$123,416.25
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

October 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition
cfo Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVIUES

10/01/2012 RGIV  Meeting with counsel re: exhibits; meeting
at Equity Center re: same; prepare
spreadsheet re: James Kallison deposition;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
and Ray Freeman re: exhibits.

10/01/2012 REG Review W, Pierce email; reply to same;
review emails re: L. Moak supplements;
reply to same; review L. Lacy email re:
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email re-
exhibits; review emails re: Podgursky data
and deposition; review W. Pierce ¢mail;
review email re: depositions; conference
with RGIV re: Kallison research; review D.
Hinojosa email re: deposititas; review §.
Dahiberg email re: depodidons; reply to
same; conference wits RGIV re: exhibits;
review Vigdor supplemental report; review
deposition notices; review §. Flores
deposition notice; conference with T.
Hunter re: Podgursky deposition; work with
W. Pierce ro: exhibils; prepare status report;
compleis preparation for A. Parker
deporuion; review H. McIntush email;
review amended D. Casey report.

10/0172012 SEJ smail court reporter re: exhibits; review
email from M. Sisler re: deposition of N.
Cortez; review email from R, Gray re:
supplemental Vigdor report; review and
return email from court reporter re: original
deposition transcripts; review email from M.
Sisler re: deposition of Flores; review email
from H. McIntush re: Moak supplement and
Casey amended report; review email from
D. Hinojosa re: Ayala report and
attachments; review email from L.
Lawrence re: deposition exhibits; review
email from L. Lawrence re: Odden

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#t: 42145-1
Qur file# 3102
Billing through:

5.50 hrs

4,75 hrs

2.40 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
10/31/2012
$ 96250
$2,137.50
NIC



10/01/2012
10/01/2012

10/02/2012

10/02/2012

10/02/2012

18/02/2012

3030

TBH
LVS

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

materials; review email from L. Lawrence

re: Cathoun County ISD's second

supplemental designation of experis and

supplemental report of Dr. Vigdor; review

email from C. Diamond re: backup data for

Hanushek; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

confer with T. Hunter re: Odden materials;

prepare for 10/2/12 Plaintiff attorney

meeting; confer with R. Gray re; same;

review email from H. McIntush re: Ft. Bend

ISD supplemental designation of experts;

confer with R. Gray re: backup data for

Hanushek; confer with R. Gray re:

Whitehurst article on class size.

Attend deposition of M. Podgursky. 10.00 hrs
Telephone conference with T. Hunter; 0.10 hrs
review emails from B. Baker; pull and

prepare for delivery to Hunter.

Meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits; 10.25 hrs
conference with counsel re: same.
Review and reply to emails re: 10/2 lawyers’ 10.50 hrs

meeting; complete preparation for A. Parker
deposition; review emails re: 1(0/2
depositions; review supplemental expert
designation; review emails re: exhibits;
review emails re: J. Vigdor; review L.
Lacey email; review C. Diamond emai?;
reivew W. Pierce email; reply to same;,
attend A, Parker deposition; partial
attendance at B. Duncombe depisition
preparation; review 5. Dahlberp email;
review L. Dawn-Fisher datz set; review L.
Lawrence email; review . Lxiamond email;
review 5. Dahlberg eraall; review J, Tumer
email; reply to §. Dahlberg; review D.
Hinojosa email; review C. Diamond email;
review W_ Pierce omail;, conference with R.
Gray IV re: exlibits; review L. Lawrence
email; conference with attorneys re: trial
scheduling, exhibits, strategy and

depositions.
Eizail B. Baker re; backup data for 0.75 hrs
Fanushek; confer with T. Hunter re; same; 0.75 hrs

prepare for 10/6/12 deposition; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher report; email
P. Colbert re: same; review email from S.
Rosen re: upcoming court training session;
confer with T. Hunter re: D. Casey and L.
Moak deposition; review emails from L.
Lawrence re: deposition exhibits; confer
with T. Hunter re: Moak draft supplemental
report re: FAST,

Work on Findings of Fact and Conclusions 7.80 hrs
of Law,; draft responses to Charter

Invoice # 42145

$3,250.00
N/C

$1,793.75

$4,725.00

$ 75.00

N/C

$2,535.00

Puge 2



10/03/2012

1040372012

10/03/2012

i eeetil]

RGIV

REG

SEJ

interrogatories; respond to several emails
from other Plaintiff attomeys re: exhibits;
review article by B. Baker criticizing
Hanuschek; meet with Plaintiff attomneys re;
trial plan and other matters; conference with
R. Gray re: same; create list of Baker
exhibits for Richard IV.

Format and print final exhibit binders; 9.15 hrs
organize digital exhibits; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re; same;
review and reply to email from counsel re:
data run;, meeting at equity center re: exhibts
and Kallison deposition preparation; format,
print, and bind new and final exhibit
binders.

Review R. Schulman email, review H. 0.25 hrs
McIntosh email; review D. Thompson
email; attend B. Duncombe deposition;
attend D, Casey deposition; review emails;
reply to same; review deposition notice of I,
Folks; review correspondence re: Charters;
conference with R, Gray, 1V re: Findings of
Fact; review additional deposition notices;
review D. Hinojosa email; review material
re: L. Dawn-Fisher; conference with W.
Pierce, P. Colbert, and R. Freeman re:
preparation for K. Kallison deposition;
review emails; review deposition transciipts

re: exhibits,
Confer with R. Gray, 1V re: revisions to 2.00 hrs
exhibit notebook; conference with R. Gray, 2.45 hrs

1V re: same; conference with 7. Hunter re:
deposition schedule; reviev and revise
current schedule; corterconce with R, Gray
re: deposition transcripts received and
reviewed,; review-=mail re: W, Pierce
deposition transcnnt;, email W. Pierce re:
review of satne; confer with T. Hunter re:
depositions; work re: Podgursky exhibits;
review enail from S. Rodriguez re:
correcied Moak Casey report; review email
re. R Blincoe dissertation corrections;
confer with T. Hunter re: charts from
Podgursky reporn; prepare charts for
exhibits; confer with T. Hunter re: letter to
superintendents re: trial testimony; email
superintendents re: same; review and
¢alendar Defendants’ notice of continuation
of Dr. Izquierdo deposition; review email
from Superintendent Chambers re:
availability for trial testimony; review and
return email from H.D. Chambers; review
and return email from M. French re; trial
testimony; review emails from J. Pfeifer re:
trial testimony and scheduling.

Invoice # 42145

$1,601.25

$4,162.50

$200.00
NIC

Page 3



10/03/2012

10/04/2012

10/04/2012

10/04/2012

10/04/2012

10/05/2012

3

RGIV

REG

SEI

TBH

RGIV

Attend depositon of W. Duncombe;
conference with R. Gray re: various matters;
draft letter to focus district superiniendents;
work on Baker deposition preparation; work
on Findings of Fact and Conclusion of Law.
Review, format, and print appendix to
James Kallison's expert report; conference
with counsel re: same and deposition
transcripts of Todd Williams and Reece
Blincoe; review emails re: exhibits; research
re: Eanes 1SD; review inter-district
comparisons; conference with legal assistant
re: same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: exhibits; review Kallison
Appendix data and compare 10 discovery
responses; email counsel re: same; meeting
with Ray Freeman re: testing exhibits;
create digital folders of the deposition
exhibits of Todd Williams and Reece
Blincoe; conference with legal assistant re:
same.

Review D). Thompson emails (2); reply to
same; review D, Hinojosa email; review S,
Dahlberg email; review J. Turner email;
work re: exhibits; review M. Trachtenberg
email, telephone call to M. Trachtenberg -
left message; work re: deposition
preparation; review B. Schulman email,
review 8. Dahlberg email; reply tosame;
prepare for K. Kallison deposition.

Review discovery correspondence from M,
Sisler; review email from M_ Sisler re:
supplemental responses 1o discovery; review
emails from J. Pfeifer re: court testimony;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; confer with
R: Gray re: expert report of 1. Knight; work
on exhibit notebacks (cont.).

Prepare B. Baker for deposition; conference
with P. Fraissinet and A. Brownson re:
same; iclephone conference with M.
Trachierberg re: Picus/Baker; work on
Fizding of Fact; review L. Moak
supplements; review exhibits from R.
Blincoe and Williams deposition; review D,
Casey supplement report; email to R,
Blincoe re: same; conference with R. Gray
re: depositions and exhibits.

Finish preparing trial binders for testimony
of Reece Blincoe and Todd Williams;
conference with legal assistant re: exhibit
numbering; meeting with Ray Freeman re:
exhibits; review and reply to email from
Wayne Pierce re: same; draft and send email
to Discovery Superintendents re: Charter
School’s Interrogatories.

Invoice # 42145

5.80 hrs

7.10 hrs

6.25 hrs

3.25 hrs

5.80 has

3.70 hrs

$1,885.00

$1,242.50

$2,812.50

$325.00

$1,885.00

$ 64750

Page 4



10/05/2012

10/05/2012

10/05/2012

10/06/2012

10/06/2012
10/06/2012

10/06/2012

1070772012

10/07/2012

10/08/2012

10/08/2012

ERLE e

SET

REG

SEJ

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

Review and reply to emails; attend and
secure deposition of K. Kallison; review
emails; review deposition transcripts.
Review email to P. Colbert re: review of
deposition transcript and exhibits, return of
original to court reporter; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review invoices for
depositons; work re: trial exhibits.

Attend deposition of L. Moak; conference
with Plaintiff's attorneys re; Baker
depositions; conference with R. Gray re:
Kallison deposition.

Pre-deposition meeting with B. Baker and
T. Hunter; present B. Baker for deposition;
work re: deposition designations; work re:
exhibits; email attorneys re: trial strategy;
review replies.

Continue work re: trial exhibits.

Continue work re: trial preparation and
exhibits.

Conference with B. Baker and R, Gray re:
deposition; attend deposition of B. Baker;
conference with B. Baker re: follow up at
trial.

Draft findings of fact; conference with
counsel re: same; conference with legal
assistant re: marking of exhibits.
Conference with R. Gray, IV re: exhibi;
email H.D. Chambers re: status (2); veview
H.D. Chambers reply (2); work re:
deposition designations; review emails;
reply to same.

Telephone conference witls Kay Freeman re:
6630 exhibits; confersnce with legal
assistant re: trial badges; conference with
counsel re: findings of fact and conclusions
of law; continie drafting findings of fact;
meeting with counsel re: case status;
cotrect, revise, and update exhibits.
Review H.1. Chambers email; reply to
same;, work re: exhibits; work re: deposition
designations; work re: preparation for R.
Dawn-Fisher deposition; review P. Colbert
email with attachinents; review J. Witte
email; reply 10 same; review M. Sisler email
cancelling S. Murdoch deposition; email D.
Thompson re: 8. Murdoch; email M.
Trachtenberg re: Currah; conference with
staff re: trial preparation; review L.
Lawrence email; review 5. Murdoch
material; review C. Diamond email; review
deposition notices of Wood & Rolle; review
D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter re: additional
exhibits; review State responses to Charter

Invoice # 42145

10.25 hrs

5.75 hrs

9.50 hrs

11.00 hrs

3.50 hrs
6.25 hrs

13.00 hrs

9.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

6.70 hrs

775 hes

$4.612.50

$575.00

$3,087.50

$4,950.00

$350.00
$625.00

$4,225.00

$1,662.50

$ 675.00

$1,172.50

$3,487.50

Page 5



10/08/2012

10/08/2012

10/09/2012

10/05/2012

e

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

School discovery; review discovery
produciion re: Charter Schools; conference
with T. Hunter re: witness order; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: Findings of Fact;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D,
Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson email;
review J. Turner email; review deposition
notice of S. Beaulieu; review Fi. Bend
discovery, review P. Colbert email; reply to
same.

Confer with R. Gray, 1V re: exhibits; 6.15 nrs
conference with attorneys re: status and trial
preparation; confer with T. Hunter re: travel
for B. Baker; confer with R. Gray re: trial
badges; telephone conference with Justice
Center re: same; email attorneys re: same;
email B. Lesley re: review of deposition
transcript; confer with T. Hunter re: same,
review and calendar S. Bealieu deposition;
review email from L. Payton re: Dr. Bumns
errata; continue work on trial exhibits.
Conference with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re: 7.50 hrs
trial exhibits, trial order, trial logistics;
conference with L. Moak re: Baker
deposition, his deposition, the State’s case
and alternate way to look at the
disadvantage to our districts; conference
with W, Pierce re: latter; telephone
conference with T. Robertson re: #miended
Petition and updating superintendents
during wrial; review Ft. Bend rd State’s
response to Charter Interrogaiories; review
Education Code for Char(z> Authorization;
edit Baker testimony; review Baker
exhibits; several emails with Baker and
Moak re: issues that came up in Baker's
deposition; review Los Colonia's video;
email to G. Salazar re: same; review
response; tolephone conference with S.
Dahlberg re: depositions; begin preparation
for Avala deposition; email to D. Hinojosa
re.*rial order; same to P. Fraissinet.
Continue drafting findings of fact, 7.75 hrs
conference with legal assistant re: exhibit
marking; conference with counsel re:
exhibits; review same; review and reply to
email from superintendents re: response to
Charter School interrogatories.

Prepare for T. Currah deposition; attend T, 10.75 hrs
Currah deposition; review email re; A.
Cortez deposition; review Kallison
transcript; review L. Lawrence email;
conference with P. Colbert and W. Pierce
re: L. Dawn-Fisher deposition; review
MALDEF discovery responses; review L.

Invoice # 42145

N

$2.437.50

$1,356.25

$4,837.50

Page b



10409/2012

10/0972012

10/10/2012

10/10/2012

10/1072012

MO

SEJ

TBH

RGLV

REG

SEJ

Lawrence emails; review D. Hinojosa email;

reply to same; review Calhoun County

objection to Charter discovery.

Review and organize 1.. Dawn-Fisher 10.00 hrs
exhibits and reports; continue work re: trial

preparation; review emails from counsel re:

deposition exhibits and trial exhibits; confer

with T. Hunter re: Podgursky bubble charts;

review email from L. Lawrence re: Calhoun

County ISD's response to Charter Schools’

interrogatories.

Finalize discovery responses to Charters; 6.20 hrs
email 1o A. Brownson re: LDF's data and

Podgusky data; review responses; review

several email from B. Baker and respond,

review email from D, Hinojoas re: trial

witnesses; layout schedule for Ayala

deposition; telephone conference with W,

Pierce re: target revenue; get badge for

Court.

Continue drafting findings of fact and 7.40 hrs
conclusions of law; continue work on

exhibits; conference with legal assistant re:

exhibits; review findings of fact and fill in

exhibit numbers; conference with counsel

re: exhibits.

Review P. Colbert emails; complete 5.25 hrs
preparation for L. Dawn-Fisher deposition,

email W. Pierce re: testimony; review D,

Hinojosa email; reply to same; 1avicw W,

Pierce email; reply to same; conference with

R. Gray, 1V re: exhibits, depocitions and

witness preparation; revi<w.D. Thompson

ermails (4); reply to szme (4); review 1.

Turner email; review B. Baker revised

analysis of 36630 review D. Hinojosa

email; reply tos50ite; conference with D,

Thompson aid P. Fraissinet re: §. Murdoch

testimony: review draft Rule 11 agreement;

confererce with T. Hunter re: witness list;

review F, Mcintush emails (2); review D,

Hicojosa email; review W, Pierce email;

review J. Turner email; review W. Pierce

email; complete preparation for L.

Dawn-Fisher deposition.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; work 4.00 hrs
re: responses to Charter Schools’ RFP's; 4.00 hrs
confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits;

continue work re: responses to RFPs;

review and return email from court reporter

re: confirmation of L. Dawn-Fisher

depasition; review email from T. Hunter re:

Los Fresnos responses to RFP; review

emails re: depositions; review email re:

Cathoun Co, responses to Charter Schools’

Invoice # 42145

$1000.00

$2,047.50

$1,295.00

$2,362.50

$400.00
N/C

Page 7



10/10/2012

171172012

10/11/2012

10/1142012

I

RGIV

g

interrogatories; review Rule 11 agreement
re: deadlines; finalize and serve response to
Charter Schools’ interrogatories; confer with
T. Hunter re; same; continue work re;
exhibits; telephone call to Los Fresnos ISD -
left message; review emails from R.
Freeman re: meeting with Steering
Committee; review emails re: revisions to
master exhibit lst; review email from W.
Pierce re: table for T. Hunter review; review
email re; Dr. Hanks errata; review email
from C. Pacheco re: documents produced by
Charter Schools; review email from J.
Wittte re: additional discovery answers;
review email re: Intervenors’ interrogatory
answers as exhibits; review email from and
confer with R. Gray, I'V re: B. Lesley CV
and report as additional exhibits; confer
with attorneys re: revisions and additions to
Findings of Fact; confer with T. Hunter re:
status of revisions to Findings of Fact.
Attend deposition of L. Ayala; conference
with D. Hinojosa re: same and trial order;
draft Findings of Fact; meet with P,
Fraissinet re: trial order; conference with K.
Gray re: ). Wisnowski; finalize response t¢
Intervenor; telephone conference with ).
Freeman re: update on litigation commiuiee;
conference with L. Halprin re: Bakér
exhibits; review exhibit list; rev.ew state aid
1o wealthy districts.

Finalize findings of fact; conicrence with
counsel re; same; continve work on exhibits;
test technology in covirtroom; conference
with office manager and legal assistant re:
same; conference with counsel re: exhibits,
Review emails; veply (o same; review
Charter discovery responses; review
responses vo Charter discovery, review W.
Pierce email; review K. Freeman email;
reply 1o same; review P. Colbert emails;
secure deposition of L. Dawn-Fisher; review
erails; reply 1o emails.

Review emails from counsel re: additional
exhibits; telephone conference with M.
Sisler re: Plaintiffs’ document production;
telephone conference with G. Salazar re:
questions re: trial preparation; confer with
T. Hunter re: Findings of Fact; continue
work re: trial preparation; review email
from H. McIntush re; Joint Motion for
Leave 1o Amend Disclosures; review email
from D. Hinojosa re: same; review emails
from T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV re:
additional exhibits; review email from I.

involce # 42145

8.50 hrs

8.75 hrs

11.50 hs

2.50 hrs
1.75 brs

$2,762.50

$1,531.25

$5.175.00

$250.00
N/C

Page B
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106/12/2012

10/12/2012

10/12/2012

ez

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Pina re: Dr. Lopez’s errata; review email
from L. Medina re: applications for badge
access; confer with R, Gray, 1V re: Everman
reports; confer with T. Hunter re: including
additional superintendent testimony to
Findings of Fact, R. Blincoe CV as an
exhibit; review Findings re: testimony of J.
Knight; review email from N. Mills re:
Defendants’ supplement to third amended
disclosures.

Draft Findings of Fact for superintendents; 7.00 &irs
telephone conference with W, Pierce re:
Target Revenue; review emails from R.
Gray IV re: exhibits and witness list;
respond o same; email 1o B. Baker re: C.
Wood,; review email from B. Baker re:
$3,500.00; email to R. Gray IV & W. Pierce
e same.

Conference with office manager re: trial 178 hrs
exhibit technology; conference with counsel
re: same and exhibits; review trial pad
presentation.

Review P. Fraissinet emails (2); reply to 6.75 brs
same; review 5. Murdock email; reply to
same; review W. Plerce email; reply to
same; review P. Colbert supplemental
reporty; conference with 8. Jennings re;
supplemental report; review P. Fraissine!
email; reply to same; review W. Pidtoe
email; reply to same; review supolémental
disclosures; review L. Lacy email; review .
Dahlberg email; email attomeys re: same;
review email from T. Rolsorison; review P.
Fraissinet email; revi<w M. Trachtenberg
emails (2); work oo Findings of Fact &
Conclusions of Law,; review W. Pierce
email; re: Averape; review P, Fraissinet
email; review B, Freeman email; review
new exhibits; telephone conference with W.
Pierce ra: exhibits; begin outline of W.
Pierce testimony.

Ruview email re: supplemental Murdock 2.50 hrs
reports; review email from P. Fraissinet re: 1.75 hrs
same; confer with R. Gray re: supplemental
Murdock reports; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: status of trial exhibits; confer with R.
Gray re: supplemental report of P. Colbert;
email counsel re: same; work re: deposition
transcripts and files for trial; confer with R.
Gray re: revision of 6630 charts; confer with
R. Gray, I'V re: Blincoe deposition as an
exhibit; review email from M. Sisler re:
Defendants’ supplemental responses to
Charter Schools and Edgewood’s RFF,;
telephone conference with W, Pierce re:

Invoice # 42145

$2,275.00

$ 306.25

$3,037.50

$250.00
N/C

Page ¥



1071272012

10/13/2012

10/13/2012

10/13/2012

1011472012

1071472012

10/14/2012
10/15/2012

10/15/2012

Mgt

REG

SEJ

SEJ

TBH
RGIV

REG

revisions to 6630 comparison charts; confer

with R, Gray, IV re: same; review and serve

second supplemental response to all parties’

RFD; confer with atiorneys re: preparation

of witness list; review email from R,

Freeman re: 5576 exhibits; confer with R.

Gray re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:

H.D. Chambers’ availability and Dr. Kratch

exhibit.

Continue to draft Findings of Fact; review 6.50 hrs
calendar provided by Phillip; conference

with R. Gray re: same; review emails from

various Plaintiff's re: order of witnesses.

Review §. Murdock power point; review 8. 5.25 hrs
Murdock report; cutline W._ Pierce

testimony; review M. Trachtenberg email;

reply to same; review P. Fraissinet email.

Continue work re: revisions to Findings of 2.75 hrs
Fact; review email from L. Halpem re:

additional docs generated by Duncombe,

Draft Finding of Facts and Conclusion of B.00 hrs
Law; review emails from various Plaintiff

attorneys and respond.

Work on 8. Murdock outline; email W. 3.00 hrs
Pierce re: exhibits; telephone conference

with W. Pierce re: exhibits and status;

review emails (15); reply to same; review J.

Kracht exhibit; review draft order,

Email T. Hunter re; Chambers’ availebility; 1.75 hrs
review email from R. Gray re: addilional 3.00 hrs
5576 exhibit; review email from W. Pierce

re: same; review email from R. Gray re:

preparation of additional 3576 exhibit for

trial; continue work re: irial exhibits; review

email from B. Lesley re: review of

deposition transcnpi; review ernail from H.

McIntush re; proposed order on motion for

additional disclosures; review errata from B.

Lesley.
Diraft Findings of Facts. 6.00 hrs
Finalize exhibits and serve on all parties; 12.00 hrs

ceting with counsel and Wayne Pierce re:
trizl testimony run through; Telephone
conference with Elizabeth Medina in Judge
Dietz’s court re: trial schedule.
Review list of common exhibits; work re: 10.75 has
exhibit list and witness list; review emails;
reply to same; review M. Trachienberg
email; reply to same; review 8. Murdock
email; email attorneys re: S. Murdock;
review L. Lacy email; review M. Bono
email; review message from W. Pierce re;
[&S rates; review emails; review L. Moak
email; telephone call to W. Pierce re: Dean
final data; work re: exhibits; conference

Invoice # 42145

$£2,112.50

$2,362.50

N/C

$2,600.00

$1,350.00

$175.00
N/iC

$1,950.00
$2,100.00

$4,837.50

Page 10
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10/15/2012

10/16/2012

310283

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

with W. Pierce re; trial testimony; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review notice from
court reporter; review L. Payton email;
review Edgewood witness list; review S,
Dahlberg email; conference with R. Gray,
IV re; call to Court; review Third Amended
Petition of Intervenors; review exhibits of
other parties; review W. Pierce deposition
corrections; conference with . Jennings re:
same; review emails re: conclusions of law;
review M. Trachtenberg email; email State
re: witness order.

Review email from P. Fraissinet re: 4,00 hrs
potential additional Murdock slides; confer 3.50 hrs
with attormeys re: revisions to exhibit and
witness lists; continue work re: exhibit and
witness lists; review email from L. Lacy re:
Vigdor exhibits; review email from court
reporter re: L. Dawn-Fisher exhibits; email
court reporter re: comprehensive list of
depositions; review email from L. Moak re:
Guthrie article; confer with R. Gray re: W.
Pierce errata; review email from W. Pierce
re: same; email counsel re: same; email
counsel re; Plaintiffs’ Exhibit and Witness
Lists; review email from L. Payton re: Holz
errata; review email from M, Lorber w:
Intervenors’ Second Amended Pleain
Intervention; review email from C.FPacheco
re; Charters’ First Amended Petition; confer
with T. Hunter re: final review and revision
of exhibit and witness lists; veview email
from M. Sisler re: designeiion of deposition
testimony; confer with aitomeys re:
deposition designations; efile and serve
Exhibit and Witnoss Lists; review email
from 8. Rodrigusz re: Fr. Bend ISD trial
filings; confer with R. Gray, 1V re:
preparation of exhibit binders; review email
re: Caltioun County 1SD's trial documents;
review cmail re; Defendants’ Master Exhibit
List and proposed witness list; review email
tvom M. Henderson re: witness list; review
email from R. Schulman re: designation of
experts and witnesses, exhibits, and
depasition designations; confer with
attorneys re: all parties’ exhibits; confer with
R. Gray re: review of Defendants’ exhibits.
Attend deposition of 1. Gutherie; draft 10.00 hrs
Findings of Fact; conference with Plaintiff
attorneys re: various matters; attend trial
preparation for W. Pierce,

Conference with counsel and legal assistant 4.70 hrs
re: exhibits of all parties; meeting with legal
assistant re: same; test technology in Judge

Invoice # 42145

$400.00
N/C

$3,250.00

$ 82250

Page 11



10/16/2012

10/16/2012

10/16/2012

303

REG

SEJ

TBH

Dietz’s courtroom.

Review emails; reply to emails; conference
with staff re: exhibits, depositions, and W.
Pierce notebooks; review Charters Amended
Petition; email C. Diamond re: B.
Hammond; review P. Fraissinet emails (2);
reply to same; review revised L. Moak
report; review D. Hinojosa email; telephone
cail with M. Trachtenberg and P, Fraissinet
re: Murdock deposition preparation; review
charter schools’ witness list; review draft of
Guthrie deposition; review J. Tumer email;
review D. Hinojosa email; attend J. Folks
deposition; review emails re: witness order;
work re: opening; review J, Turner email;
review P, Fraissinet email; review email to
H.D. Chambers; review Whitehurst
deposition transcript; review H.D.
Chambers email; review J. Turner email;
begin exhibit review; review amended
deposition designations; review M. Bono
email; review P. Fraissinet email; review
updated trial calendar; telephone conference
with attorneys re: exhibits objections;
additional review of exhibits.

Email J. Pleifer re: Podgursky bubble
charts; review email from J, Pfeifer re:
same; confer with T. Hunter re: same;
review Intervenors’ exhibits; confer with R.
Gray re: same; review email re: Rdgewood
exhibit list; confer with attormneys re:
deadline to object to exhibits; review email
from H. Mclntush re: Mozl reports; review
email re: Dr. Guthrie iranscript; efile and
serve amended exhibit list; review email re:
Whitehurst depositiva exhibits; confer with
T. Hunter re: Podgursky charts for
superintendeats review,; email
superintendents re: same; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: trial exhibits;
review email from J. Pieifer re; Podgursky
churts; review email re: Ft. Bend ISD's first
amended depo. designations; review email
from T. Hunter re: Podgursky charts; email
counsel re: Plaintiffs’ exhibits; review email
from counsel re: receipt of same; confer
with T. Hunter re: Findings of Fact; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: forwarding trial exhibit
to Judge's staff attorney; confer with T.
Hunter re: witness schedule; review email
re: Defendants’ amended Master Exhibit
List and corrected list; confer with T.
Huaster re: revisions to Findings.

Finalize trial schedule for 1st week; uncode
Podgusky's scatter charts and email to J.

Invoice # 42145

10.00 hrs

3.00 hrs
3.50 hrs

9.00 hrs

$4,500.00

$300.00
N/C

$2.925.00

Pags 12



10/17/2012

10/17/2012

10/1772012

310244

RGIV

REG

SE]

Pfeifer to review, review emails from 1.
Pfeifer re: same and respond; conference
with all Plaintiff's attomeys and R. Gray re:
objection to exhibits; edit Conclusion of
Law and Findings of Fact.

Conference with counsel re: preparation and 4.20 hrs
case status, exhibits, and deposition
designations; review emails re: State
defendant’s amended exhibit list and
corrected witness kist; print same for
counsel; review discovery and exhibit lists;
meeting with Wayne Pierce re: trial
testimorny.

Review emails; reply to same; complete 7.00 hrs
review of exhibits; conference with R. Gray,
IV re; exhibits and Court schedule; review
C. Diamond email; reply to same; review P.
Fraissinet email; reply to same; review
notice from Court; reply to same; review C.
Diamond email; email W, Pierce re: Friday
meeting; email attomeys re: opening
statements; review draft conclusions of law;
review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review D.
Thompson email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review State’s supplemental
discovery; review P. Fraissinet email;
review 5. Murdock material; review
amended witness list; outline opening; einail
W. Pierce re: testimony, review D.(Binojosa
email; review M. Sisler email; review H.
Mclntush email; review L. Moak
Supplemental material; review S. Dahlberg
emails; conference with '»' Pierce re:
witness reparation; conierence with T.
Hunter re; witness preparation; review L.
Halpem email; review B. Baker
supplemental repott; review T. Hunter
email; conference with 8. Jennings re:
exhibits; continue review of exhibits.
Review aiail re: Kallison transcript and 375 hrs
exhibiis; review email re: Dr. Baker
transeript and exhibits; review email re:
Eeulicau depo. and exhibits; review email
from M. Sisler re: data files; confer with
attorneys re: preparation for trial; review
email from E. Medina re: Judge’s request for
conference with all counsel; confer with T.
Hunter re: revisions to Findings; review
email from M. Sisler re: Defendants’
supplemental response to RFP; review
emails from M. Sisler re: corrected witness
list; confer with T. Hunter re; revisions 1o
Findings of Fact; review email re: backup
data for corrected Moak supplemental
report; review email from 5. Hemandez re:

Invoice # 42145

$ 73500

$3,150.00

NIC

Pags 13



10/17/2012

10/18/2012

10/18/2012

10/18/2012

k31284

TBH

RGIV

REG

b <3

State’s exhibits; review email from T.
Robertson re: list of Coalition districts;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: Intervenors’
exhibit list.

De-code Podgusky charts; edit Findings of 6.00 hrs
Fact; edit and revise Conclusion of Law;
draft overtime for Findings of Fact; review
Intervenors exhibits for possible objections;
telephone conference with B, Baker re:
supplemental report; email to parties re;
Baker supplement; telephone conference
with L. Halpem re: Baker supplement.
Conference with office administrator re; 6.05 hrs
technology for trial; conference with legal
assistant re: exhibits; review trial
presentation; format and print data for
counsel; email Linda Halpern re: Podgursky
data; travel to courthouse re: test trial
technology; test technology in Judge Dietz's
courtroom; review emails re: discovery;
review and print same; email Tedrah
Robertson re: contact information for
taxpayer plaintiffs; conference with counsel
re: same.

Travel to and from Houston; conference 10.75 hrs
with S. Murdock and P. Fraissinet re:
testimony; review emails; reply to same;
review E. Medina email; review W, Pierée
emails (2); review L. Lawrence eman;
review master exhibit kist; review €,
Diamond email; review H. McIntush email;
teview D .Hinojosa email; conference with
R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; coview D,
Thompson email; rept (o same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review L.
Payton email; review supplemental
discovery, revicw A. Cortez supplemental
report; email ©. Hinojosa re: same; outline
opening and outline Murdock testimony;
work on V. Pierce direct.

Revimwemail from T. Robertson re: 2.15 hrs
litipaiion meeting; confer with T. Hunter re;
status of Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; continue work re: revisions to
same; confer with T. Hunter re: Fourth
Amended Petition; email B, Baker re:
review of depo. transcript; review and return
email from L. Pina re: depo. designations;
review H. McIntush email re: amended
exhibit list; review email from L. Payton re:
D, Cain’s errata; review email from M,
Sisler re: supplemental responses o
discovery requests; revise, efile and serve
Fourth Amended Petition; review email
from C. Pacheco re: amended exhibit list.

Invoice # 42145

$1,950.00

$1,058.75

$4,837.50

8O

Page 14



10/18/2012

1071942012

10/19/2012

10/719/2012

1041972012

310241

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEI

TBH

Draft supplement t¢ Response to RFD; draft
Amended Answer; collect material to
response of L. Halpern challenges, B.
Baker's supplemental report; finish ordering
Findings of Fact; finalize Conclusion of
Law; draft emails to superintendents re:
Pogursky's charts; review Charter School
exhibits.

Review emails re: exhibits, discovery,
supplemental expert reports; conference
with Judge Dietz re: trial; print and review
STAAR reports; meeting with counsel and
Wayne Pierce re: trial testimony; conference
with counsel re: defendant’s objections to
our exhibits.

Prepare for 10/19 hearing; review emails;
veply to same; review W. Pierce email; reply
to same; email D. Hinojosa re; same; work
re: W. Pierce testimony; review H.
McIntush email; reply to same; review
amended disclosure responses; review
emails re; Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review Charts Supplemental exhibit list;
review MALDEF deposition designations;
review pro hac vice motion; review emails
re: exhibits objections; attend status
conference; email 8. Murdock re:
presentation; review W. Pierce emul) reply
to same; email D. Hinojosa re: same;
conference with B. Wood, R.Cray, IV and
W. Pierce re: trial testimony; review
additional material re: Chiurter Schools;
work re: 8. Murdack ‘esiimony; review D.
Ray email; review P. Fraissinet email;
review MALDEF objections; review Fr.
Bend objections; iaview State’s objections;
review additional production.

Review emnil from C. Pacheco re: exhibits;
review cmail from T. Robertson re;
additivnal questions from M. French; confer
wrth T. Hunter re: additional information for
sugerintendents re: Podgursky charts;
review email from M. Sisler re; amended
exhibit kist; confer with T. Hunter re: further
corrections and revisions to Findings of
Fact; confer with R, Gray re: status; review
email from C. Pacheco re: supplemental
documents; review email from M. Sisler re:
Defendants’ objections to exhibits; review
email from 8. Rodriguez re: objections.
Prepare for conference with Judge; attend
meeting of Legislative Comumittes;
conference with R. Freeman; edit and drafi
Findings of Fact; emails to M. Trachtenberg

Invoice # 42145

6.00 hrs

8.15 hrs

9.25 hrs

1.60 hrs

8.00 hrs

$1,950.00

$1,426.25

$4,162.50

K&

$2,600.00

Page 15



10/202012

10/20/2012

10/20/2G12

102072012

1/21/2012

1072172012

10/21/72012

1072172012
10/22/2012

1072272012

10/22/2012
10/22/2012

30N

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

DI

RGIV

SEJ

re: same; review objection of other parties,
review Plaintiff’s emails on objection to
exhibits.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff and
Wayne Pierce re: exhibits and backup data
for same; conference with counsel re: same;
draft memo re: same; telephone conference
with Shelley Dahlberg re: same,

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review 5. Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review W, Pierce deposition; work re:
exhibits; review P. Fraissinet email; reply to
samne; work re: objections; work re; exhibits;
wark re: opening.

Review email from T. Hunter re: revisions
to Findings of Fact; review emails re:
objections to exhibits and deposition
exhibits; confer with T. Hunter re: Plaintiffs’
exhibits; review email from P, Fraissinet re:
findings re: Murdock report; continue work
re: revisions and preparation of Findings;
review email from counsel re; Findings of
Fact, confer with attorneys re: sending
Findings to Judge's staff attormey.

Draft additional Findings of Fact; edit
Findings of Fact document; conference with
R. Gray re: Wayne's exhibits; conferepce
with other Plaintiff attormeys re: witness
order; drafi trial brief; instruct legai assistant
on pleadings for Monday, revie'v einails
from L. Halpern re: Bruce Baker's
supplemental report; confersnce with B.
Baker re: same.

Conference with courisel re: exhibits;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce,
Tim Wolff, and Chailes Aki re: same;
continue reviewing STAAR results.

Prepare $. Murdock testimony; review and
reply to emails; complete opening;, work re:
exhibits. and W. Pierce testimony.

Review tmail from T. Hunter re: witness
sciegule; email C. Jenson re: Plaintiffs’
Findings of Fact; email C. Dupre re: charts;
confer with T. Hunter re: revisions to Trial
Brief; review email from L. Lawrence re:
master exhibit list and preadmitted exhibits,
Prepare for trial.

Draft Confidentiality Agreement between
the Equity Center and Calhoun County.
School Finance trial; meeting with Micah
Skidmore re: exhibit backup data.

Trial Day 1; prepare for Day 2.

Email Superintendents re: review and
testimony re: Podgursky bubble charts;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review

Invoice # 42145

6.15 hrs

6.50 hrs

6.15 hrs

6.00 hrs

6.00 hrs

7.50 hrs

1.20 hrs

6.00 hrs
1.00 hrs

9.80 hrs
12.00 hrs

0.60 hrs
1.50 hrs

$1,076.25

$2,925.00

N/C

$1,9506.00

$1,050.00

$3375.00

N/C

$1,950.00
N/IC

$1,715.00
$5,400.00

$ 60.00
N/IC

Page 16



10/22/2012

1042312012

10/23/2012

1042372012

1042372012

KRR

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

email from J. Reich re: additional exhibits,;
efile and serve Trial Brief, confer with
attorneys re: same; review email re:
Bamberg errata; review email from T.
Robertson re: trial schedule; review email
from C. Nickell re: Colbert invoice; review
email from T. Hunter re: Chambers’ trial
testimony; review email re: report of Dr.
Cortez; email superintendents re: Podgursky
charts; review email from M. French re:
same; confer with T, Hunter re: G. Salazar
trial prep and testimony; review email from
T. Hunter re: ). Pleifer testimony; review
email fromT. Hunter re: taxpayer testimony
and preparation; telephone conference with
T. Robertson re: taxpayer prep and
testimony; review G. Salazar email re:
Podgursky chans; review email re: Casey
errata; review email from M. French re: trial
prep.

Conference with R. Gray re: pre-trial issues;
finalize trial brief; attend trial, draft Pfeiffer
testimony; several emails to M. French
responding 1o his questions; email to Pfeifer
re: frail testimony, instruct staff on
arranging meeting with taxpayer Plaintiffe’
conference with B. Wood.

Trial; conference with counsel re:
unweighted averages exhibits; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce ra: data
supporting exhibit; email same o Micah
Skidmore.

Trial Day 2, prepare for Day 3; review
Findings of Fact & Condlysions of Law,
Review emails re: Everman STAAR
reports; review emaii from M. French re:
State's export chianis; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; review email from court reporter
re: L. Dawi-Fisher depo. exhibits; email G.
Salazar Pudgursky charts; email court
reporter re: B, Lesley depo. exhibits; review
emali from M. French re: Podgursky charts;
review email from M. Jacobs re: Calhoun
County exhibits; review email re; Frost and
Ray erratas; email J. Pfeifer re: outline of
testimony; review email from M. Jacobs re:
supplemental exhibit list; review email from
L. Lawrence updated master exhibit list.
Conference with R. Gray re: Murdock;
attend trial; work on J. Pleifer testimony;
review email from A. Brownson and L.
Moak re: Podgursky charts; email same 1o
all superintendents; respond to email from
other attorney’s calendar; conference with L.
Halpren re: Baker supplemental report;

invoice # 42145

6.50 hrs

10.30 hrs

9.75 hrs

1.60 hrs

7.50 hrs

$2,112.50

$1,802.50

$4,387.50

NIC

$2.437.50

Pages 17
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10/24/2012
1072442012

1072472012

10/25/2012

10/25/2012

10/25/2012

5 LR

RGIV

REG
SEJ

RGIV
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forward backup data 1o L. Halpern;
conference with S. Dahlberg re: taxpayer
witnesses.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Jerilyn
Pleifer for testimony.

Trial Day 3, prepare for Day 4.

Review email from L. Lawrence re:
Waggoner demonstrative exhibit; review
email from T. Robertson re: meeting with
Plaintiff parents; review emails re: Moak
district data reports; review email from L.
Lawrence re: revised Master Exhibit List;
review emails from court reporter re: efratas
for M. Miles, Schroder, and Duncombe;
review and retum email from W. Pierce re:
testifying witinesses and schedule; confer
with T. Hunter re: same; email testifying
superintendents re: trial transcript; review
email from §. Kincannon re: same; confer
with attorneys re: same; telephone
conferences, confer with attorneys, re:
meetings and trial prep. for H.D. Chambers;
confer with R. Gray re: trial transcript for
testifying superintendents’ review and
preparation for trial; confer with R. Gray re;
H.D. Chambers trial prep.; review email
from R. Gray, [V re: Everman reports;
review Everman STAAR reports; confer
with T. Hunter re: same; review and
compare Everman STAAR reports and trial
exhibits re: same; confer with'T. Hunter re:
same; efile and serve amended Exhibit List;
confer with attomeys re: sume; review email
from M. Sisler re: revised exhibit list;
review email from court reporter re; Pompa
errata; confer with T, Hunter re: W. Pierce
trial prep.; revicw emails re: Podgursky
bubbile charts; review email re: Limon
demonstraiive exhibit.

Attend irici; prepare J. Pleifer for testimony;
review saveral emails from superintendents
d respond,; conference with R.Gray re:

tin]; review several emails from Plaintiff
attorney and respond.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with plaintiff
counsel re: trial schedule.

Trial Day 4, conference with attorneys re:
schedule.

Organize and prepare Moak reports and
exhibits for T. Hunter review; email court
reporter re: transcript and exhibits; review
email from court reporter re: same; confer
with R. Gray re: 10/24 trial transcript; email
testifying superintendents re: review of
transcript; review and retum email from T.

Invoice # 42145

12.00 hrs
12.50 hrs

1.60 hrs
2.00 hrs

7.50 his

10.65 hrs

11.60 hrs

2.25 hrs

$2,100.00
$5,625.00

$160.00
N/C

$2,437.50

$1,863.75
$4,950.00

NiC
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10/25/2012

10/26/2012

1072612012

10/26/2012

10/26/2012

1072772012
10/28/2012

10/28/2012

1072872012

10/29/2012

310201

TBH

RGIV

REG
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RGIV

Robertson re: scheduling Plaintiff parents
for trial prep; confer with T. Hunter re:
saine; review and organize H.D. Chambers
and C. Dupre reports and exhibits for
attorney review; confer with R. Gray re:
same; review email re: K. Waggoner
demonstrative exhibit; confer with T.
Hunter re: same.

Attend trial; conference with J. Pfeifer and
R. Gray re: Pfeifer testimony; meeting of
Plaintiff's attorneys re: schedule and
strategy.

Review emails re: discovery, trial schedule;
exhibits; create powerpoint for testimony of
HD Chambers; email same to counsel and
witness; meeting with counsel and Wayne
Pierce re: testimony; conference with
counsel re; schedule,

Conference with attomeys re: trial
presentation; conference with R. Gray, [V
re: demonstratives; review D. Thompson
emails (2); reply to same {2); review P.
Colbert message; review Power Point;
conference with P. Colbert re: status and
testimony; conference with W. Pierce, R.
Freeman, R. Gray, IV and T. Hunter re:
status, exhibits, and testimony.

Confer with T. Hunter re: trial witness
schedule; email W. Pierce and P. Coibert re:
same; revise, efile, and serve amended
exhibit list.

Draft outline for Pfeifer testucony; draft
outline for taxpayer (4) téutimony; attend
preparation of W. Pircrce; conference with
R.Gray re: weekend schedule.

Outline H.D. Chzmuzrs testimony,
Conference with counsel re: powerpoint for
superintendent, testimony; revise
powerpoin:; legal research re: taxpayer
fairness Ciaim.

Prep=ue for call with H.D. Chambers;, work
re.'W. Pierce exhibits; review H. Mcintush
email; review amended witness lst and
deposition list for Ft. Bend; review L.
Lawrence email re: exhibits; telephone call
to H.D. Chambers re: status and trial
testimony,; prepare for Day 5.

Prepare I. Pfeifer for testimony on Monday;
review L. Moak’s slides and comment; send
back up data from B.Baker to L.Halpern;
email 10 all Plaintiff attorneys re: witness
order.

Prepare for trial; wrial; meeting with counsel
re: case status and testimony of HD
Chambers; preparation of Brad King for

Invoice # 42145

11.00 hrs

7.10 hrs

4.25 hrs

0,70 hrs

3.80 hrs

4.75 hrs
2.00 hrs

3.50 hrs

1.5G hrs

10.25 hrs

$3.575.00

$1,242.50

$1,912.50

W

$1,235.00

$2,137.50
$ 350.00

$1,575.00

% 48750

$1,793.75
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10/29/2012
1072972012

1072512012

10/30/2012

1073042012
1073072012

10/30/2012

1073172012

1043172012

1013172012

1043172012

IR

REG
SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

testimony; telephone conference with

Wayne Pierce re: exhibits.

Trial Day 5; prepare for Day 6. 9.75 hrs
Confer with T. Hunter re: M. French trial 0.00 hrs
testimony, email M. French re: same; confer

with attorneys re: revised Moak

presentation; review email from M. Sisler

se: supplemental discovery responses;

review email from L. Lawrence re: revised

exhibits; review email from R. Gray re:

change of plans for H.D. Chambers; revise

travel plans for H.D. Chambers; telephone

conference with H.D. Chambers’ office re:

satne; review email from M. French re: trial

schedule; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

telephone conference with G. Salazar re:

date of testimony; confer with T. Hunter re:

same; review email re; cancelled

depositions; confer with T. Hunter and R.

Gray, IV re: Taxpayer testimony outlines;

confer with T. Hunter re: B. King trial prep.

Conference with I. Pfeifer re: testimony; 9.40 hrs
attend trial; review PFinding of Facts for

edits and additions for J. Pfeifer;s

testimony; edit outline for taxpayer

testimony; conference with L. Halpern re:

Baker cross; email to Baker re: trial

preparation; respond to emails from M.

French and G. Salazar, meet with i, King,

taxpayers witness for trial preparation.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with Wayne 12.85 hrs
Pierce re: testimony; meeting with Chip

Langston re: testimeny; ioceting with Randy

Pittenger re: testimony; meeting with

Norman Baker re: testimony, conference

with counsel re: sans.

Trial Day 6, prepare for Day 7. 11.00 hrs
Review email from L. Lawrence re: 0.00 hrs
amended cxhibit list;

Edit testunony of taxpayers; review 9.70 hrs

calencar of witnesses; attend wial; meet with

taipayers in preparation for their testimony.

Prepare for trial; trial; review state’s 9.90 hrs
amended answers to Calhoun County

interrogatories; conference with counsel re:

same.
Trial Day 7, prepare for Day 8. 10.75 hrs
Confer with T. Hunter and R. Gray, 1V re: 1.00 brs

adding Kracht exhibit; review and revise

exhibit list; efile and serve Third Amended

Exhibit List; confer with R. Gray, IV re:

same.

Conference with taxpayer witnesses; aftend 8.50 hes
trial; conference with H.D. Chambers and

other staff from Alief, review Findings of

Invoice # 42145

$4,387.50
N/IC

$3,055.00

$2,248.75

$4.950.00
NIC

$3,152.50

$1,732.50

$4,837.50

N/C

$2,762.50
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Fact; finalize trial testimony for M. French.

TIMERKEEPER RECAP

REG U, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner

DI Jacks, John D. Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
LYS  von Stemberg, Lynn

Fee Recap Totals

1G24

254.75 hrs @
209.65 hrs @
21810 hrs @
0.00 hrs @
5145 hrs @
0.00 hrs @

733.95

Invoice # 42145

450.00 fr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
275.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
100.00 /br

$227.353.75

$114,637.50
$36,688.75
$70,882.50
$ 0.00
$ 514500
$ 0.00

$227,353.75



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

November 30, 2012

Tax [ No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#. 42173-1 REG
QOur file# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fajrness Coalition Billing thzough: 1173072012
¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
11/G1/2012 RGIV  Prepare for trial; trial; conference with 7.580 hrs $1365.00
counsel re: case status and trial schedule.
1170172012 REG Trial Day 8; work re: prepare for Day 9; 8.75 hrs $3,937.50
review emails.
110172012 SEJ Confer with R, Gray, IV re: amended 1.20 hrs N/C

exhibit list; confer with T. Hunter re:
objections to Baker exhibits; review updated
Master Exhibit List re; same; review emai!
from L. Lawrence re: amended Master
Exhibit List and additional discovery
responses; email W. Pierce CV 1o 4.
Bennett; review and return emal fiom J.
Knight re: testimony schedule; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: Baker CV and objections by party;
prepare summary; er.ail M. French re:
testimony outline; confer with T. Hunter re:
summary of objeciions.

110172012 TBH Conference with R. Gray re: wilmesses and 8.00 hrs $2,600.00
trial testimony, attend trial; prepare for M.
French's tzztimony; review Findings of Fact;
email (o Plaintif's attorneys re: next week's
witiass order,

11/02/2012 RGIV  (Owpanize file and case structure; prepare 2.00 hrs $350.00
vowerpoint for Quinlan 18D testimony;
email same to counsel and Michael French
for review; conference with counsel re: case
status; conference with legal assistant re:
amending exhibit list and adding exhibits.

1140272012 REG Review W, Pierce emails; reply to same; 375 hrs $1,687.50
conference with R. Gray, I'V re: Power
Points; work re: deposition designations;
review discovery responses; review new
database produced by State; review T.
Robertson emails; review emails; review
additicnal exhibits; review depositdon



11/02/2012

11/02/2012

11/03/2012
110472012

11/05/2012

110572012

11/05/2012

11/05/2012

1140672012

1106/2012

30201

SEJ

TBH

REG
REG

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

notices of D. Pierce and . Dunn;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
R. Freeman email; reply (o same; review B.
Baker outline; telephone conference with
W.. Pierce and R. Freeman re: 1&8 data;
review additional emails; review W, Pierce
email with 1&S chart; reply to email.
Confer with R. Gray, IV re: Murdock Power
Point presentation, Alief Power Point
presentation, and amended exhibit list,
review and revise exhibit list; efile and
serve amended exhibit list; confer with T.
Hunter re: revisions to master exhibit list;
revise, efile, and serve Fouwrth Amended
Master Exhibit List; confer with T. Hunter
re: Baker trial testimony outline; review
emai} from M. Sisler re; Pierce and Dunn
deposition notices, amended notices, and
second amended notices; review and update
deposition calendars.

Review news coverage of yesterday's
testimony; review several emails to and
from Plaintiffs attorneys re: witnesses for
Monday and Tuesday, edit draft of Baker's
testimeny; email o Baker re: same.

Work on Kallison cross.

Review emails; reply to same; email 8,
Dahiberg re: 1&S data; prepare for Day 9;
review 8. Dahlberg email; reply 16 same;
review emails; review STAAK Power Point.
Prepare for trial; trial; prepae Michael
French for testimony; revise powerpoint for
samie and send to all parties.

Trial Day 9; prepaie for Day 10; review
emails; review tiat Power Points.

Review email from L. Lawrence re:
amended =:hibit list; review email from H.
Mclniush re: Casey and Hoke trial
presentations; review and retum email from
T. Robertson re: trial schedule; confer with
R.Gray re: amended Duncombe report;
review and email R. Gray re: same; review
email from C. Pacheco re: notice of
appearance and withdrawal; review email
from T. Hunter re: trial schedule; review
email re: Edgewood exhibits; review emails
from J. Knight re: testimony schedule.
Conference with R. Gray re: witnesses;
attend trial; prepare M. French for trial.
Prepare for trial; trial; conference among
attorneys re: trial status and scheduling.
Trial Day }10; prepare for Day 11.

Invoice # 42173

1.00 hrs
.75 hrs

3.65 hrs
0.25 hrs

3.25 hrs
3.00 hrs

10.95 hrs

9.50 hrs

0.75 hrs

10.00 hrs

10.15 hss

10.75 hrs

$100.00
N/C

$1,186.25
NIC

$1,462.50
$1,350.00

$1916.25

$4,275.00

N/C

$3,250.00

$1776.25

$4,837.50

Page 2



11/06/2012

110672012

11/07/2012
110772012
11/07/2012

110772012

11/08/2012
11/08/2012

11/08/2012

3001

SEJ

TBH

RGIV
REG
SEJ

RGIV
REG

SEJ

Review email from T. Hunter re: findings of
fact atiributable to H.D. Chambers and W,
Pierce; prepare excerpts; review email from
L. Payton re: Carstarphen errata; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
response to RFP; review email from L.
Lawrence re: updated master exhibit list;
review email from D. Sawvel, court
reporter, re: invoice for transcripts; review
email from M. Patterson re; Defendants’
Seventh Amended Master Exhibit List;
confer with T. Hunter re: Defendants’
witness lists.

Conference with M. French re: testimony,
attend trial.

Prepare for trial; trial,

Trial Day L1; prepare for Day 12.

Review emails from 1. Pina re: deposition
schedule; review emails from attomeys re;
deposition schedule; email H. Keller re: wial
testimony and preparation; telephone
conference with H. Keller re: same; review
email re; trial transcript; review and
calendar Wisnoski deposition notice; review
email re: Moak errata, review deposition
schedule re: J. Wisnoski; review and (evise
calendar re: same; review and calendar
amended Wisnoski notice; review criail
from L. Pina re: Bast, Trotter ana Moe
deposition notices; confer witn R. Gray, IV
re: exhibits; review Fourth Amended Master
Exhibit List; email atioineys re: same; email
T. Hunter re: objections 10 exhibits; review
TTSFC master exiiibit list re; same; email T.
Hunter re: sams: raview email from C.
Diamond re:deposition schedule; review
email from T. Hunter re: scheduling Dr,
Kracht and H. Keller; email Dr. Keller re:
schedulc; email T. Hunter re: Dr. Kracht's
availability; confer with T. Hunter re:
tescheduling M. French; email T. Hunter re:
£. Kracht and H. Keller availability; review
email from C. Pacheco re; depositions.
Attend trial; email exchange with B. Baker
re: trial preparation; review exhibit list.
Prepare for trial; trial.

Trial Day i2; review emails; work re: prep
for Day 13.

Review email from L. Pina re: corrected
deposition notices; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: withdrawal of Dr. Baker's supplemental
report; review exhibit list re: same; review

Invoice # 42173

1.35 hrs

9.50 hrs

8.00 hrs
8.50 hrs
1.75 hrs

7.00 hrs

T.00 hrs
900 hrs

0.25 hrs
1.00 hrs

Wi

$3,087.50

$1400.00
$3,825.00
N/C

$2,275.00

$1225.00
$4,050.00

$ 25.00
NC
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11/08/2012

11/09/2012

11/0972012

1170972012

11/09/2012

11/10/2012

11/1172012

11/1142012

11272012

g

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

and calendar Moe and Veneble depositions;
prepare list of excerpts from Findings of
Facts re: C. Dupre; review emails re:
rescheduling depositions.

Attend trial; edit Baker testimony; review
email from Baker re: preparation and
respond; conference with Richard Gray IV
re: admission of exhibits; conference with
R. Gray re: witnesses,

Conference with counsel re: exhibits;
conference with counsel re: telephone
conference with Bruce Baker and exhibits
re: same; conference with legal assistant re:
expert reports of Bruce Baker, meeting at
Equity Center re: Bruce Baker testimony;
conference with counsel re: case status and
calendar.

Conference with R. Gray, IV re:
demonstratives; review emails re:
depositions; conference with attorneys re:
schedule; work re: J. Kracht outline; review
invoice for Dr. Schanzenbach; email 8.
Dahiberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher exhibits;
review emails; work re: trial scheduie;
review D. Thompson email; review §,
Dahlberg email; reply to same; email ‘W,
Pierce re: same; review D. Hinojosa email.
Review emails from A. Vasque re: travel
arrangements for Dr. Kratch; review email
from R. Gray, IV re: Plaintiifs" exhibit list
and Dr. Baker exhibits; review email from
T. Hunter re: Schanzenoach invoice for
payment; review emails re: amended
deposition notices: igview email from 1.
Pina re: Schanzondach invoice; confer with
R. Gray, IV te) Baker report and supporting
documenzs.

Conference with B. Baker re: trial
tesdinony; conference with R, Gray re:
various matters; highlight Duncomb
astimony for B, Baker; edit B. Baker
testimony.

Read and outline C. Dupre deposition.
Create Pllugerville powerpoint for
testimony of Charles Dupree; conference
with counsel re: same.

Conference with R, Gray, 1V re: Power
Point; outline C. Dupre testimony; review
B. Baker Power Point; review L.
Dawn-Fisher new data charts.

Revise testimony PowerPoint re: Charles
Dupre; create PowerPoint for Dr. Kallison

Invoice # 42173

7.50 hirs

3.750rs

3.65 hrs

0.75 hrs

5.00 hrs

2.25 hrs
1.75 hrs

3.50 hrs

4.65 hrs

$2,437.50

$656.25

$1.642.50

NAC

$1,625.00

$1,012.50
$306.25

$1,575.00

$813.75

Page 4



11122012

F171272012

1171272042

1171312012

3

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

cross examination; conference with counsel
re: all; conference with counsel re: Dr.
Baker travel schedule; Telephone
conference with plaintiff's counsel re: trial
schedule.

Work re: C. Dupre testimony: review 3.75 hrs
emails; reply to same; work re: analysis of
STAAR daua; prepare for call with C.
Dupre; telephone call 1o C. Dupre re:
testimony and status; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: Kallison cross preparation;
review P. Colbert email; review J. Tumer
email; review emails re: W. Duncombe;
conference with T. Hunter re: B. Baker
direct; telephone canference with attorneys
re: scheduling witness depositions and
strategy; review M. Patterson email re:
exhibits; review emails; reply to same.
Email C. Dupre re: Pflugerville campus 175 hrs
data; review confirmation of travel for Dr.
Baker; review email from C. Pacheco re:
deposition exhibits; review emails from T.
Hunter re: Dr. Baker's schedule; review
email from T. Hunter re: Podgursky charts
reviewed by G. Salazar; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review and calendar
Wolters deposition; review Ayala ervata;
review email from G. Salazar re: charts for
discussion; email T. Hunter re: Dr. Baker's
testimony outline; review emaii re: Dr.
Baker's trial testimony scheaule; review
email from M. Patterion re: exhibits and
deposition schedule; review email from L.
Lawrence re: udpated Master Exhibit List;
review email firom court reporter re: Dunn
deposition erhibits; revise, efile, and serve
Fifth Amcnded Master Exhibit List; confer
with B. Cray re: same; review email re: trial
calendar; review email from R, Coutore:
exncrts' Power Point presentations; review
and calendar EC board meeting; review
email from M. Patierson re: Defendants’
amended Master Exhibit List.

Prepare Baker testimony; email to Baker re: 5.50 hrs
same; review response; review Baker
deposition; telephone conference with G.
Salazar re: Podgursky's charts; telephone
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys re:
witness order and coverage of deposition.
Prepare for trial; trial; conference with 8.85 hrs
counsel re: Kallison cross examination
exhibits; revise same; Telephone conference

Invoice # 42173

$1,687.50

NAC

$1,787.50

$1548.75

Page 8



1171372012

1171372012

111372012

1171472012

1141472012

11/14/2012

L1/14/2012

F1/15/2012
F1/15/2012

1371572012

IR

REG

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

with Dr. Bruce Baker re: travel and airport
pick-up.

Tral Day 13; prepare for Day 14; review
emails; outline J. Kracht testimony.

Review and return email from C. Jenson re;
B. Baker Power Point presentation; review
email from H. Mclntush re: same; review
email from R. Gray re: same; review email
from M. Patterson re; exhibits,

Attend trial; conference with R. Gray re:
witnesses; read Baker deposition; email to
Baker re: various issues in preparation for
trial; review Baker slides and outline of
testimony.

Prepare for trial; triak; prepare for testimony
of Bruce Baker; travel to airport to pick up
Dr. Baker; take Dr. Baker to hotel; return
home.

Trial Day 14; prepare for Day 15; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review
emails re: §, Klein; reply to same.

Review amended deposition notices; review
email from R. Gray re: Keller and Kracht
designations; review Plaintiffs' designations
and witness lists; email R. Gray re; same;
review email from 1. Pina re: Trotter and
Hammond deposition notices; review smail
from M. Patterson re: additional exiibits;
email Dr. Kracht testimony outline and
Plaintiffs live pleading for roview; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: data fics; review email
from T. Hunter re: trial scnedule; review
email from 1. Pina re: Wolters deposition
notice; review emaii from T. Robertson re:
frial schedule.

Attend trial; ©ipalize Baker testimony; email
to Baker r=. changes; review response; draft
Blinco#'; iestimony;, conference with R.
Grzy re; Bakers power point.

Prepare for trial; trial,

Tiial Day 15; review emails; reply to same;
prepare for B. Hammond deposition.

Email R. Blincoe re: schedule and
preparation; review emails from R. Blincoe
re: saime {2); review amended deposition
notices; email K. Reeves re: Dr. Baker's
repott; review email from §. Rodriguez re:
Joint Motion to Supplement; review email
from M. Sisler re: Ninth Amended Master
Exhibit List; confer with T. Hunter re: R.
Blincoe trial testimony and draft outline of
testimony, review emails from 1. Pina re:

Invoice # 42173

8.75 hus

0.40 hrs

8.00 rirs

10.75 hrs

9.25 hus

.60 hrs

9.00 hrs

8.00 hrs
8.50 hrs

1.40 hus

$3,937.50

N/C

$2,600.00

$1881.25

$4,162.50

N/C

$2,925.00

$1400.00
$3.825.00

N/IC

Page &



11/15/2012

11/16/2012

11/16/2012

11/16/2012

11/16/2012

11/17/2012

11/17/2012

11/18/2012

11/18/2012

11/19/2012

11/19/2012

11/19/2012

ELES ]

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

T8H

RGIV

SEJ

deposition schedule; review and return
email from M. Sisler re: Plaintiffs’ exhibits;
email Dr. Kracht ve: travel arrangements;
review emails from R. Gray, 1V re: Baker
Power Point presentation; review email
from M. Sisler re; amended deposition
notices; review emails from R. Gray re: C.
Dupre availability and preparation schedule;
review email from C. Dupre re: same.
Conference with B. Baker re: testimony;
attend trial; review emails from various
people and respond; meset with B. Baker,
Revise and update Kallison cross
PowerPoint; conference with counsel re:
same.

Prepare for B. Hammond deposition; attend
Hammond deposition; review emails; reply
10 same.

Draft Keller testimony; draft Blincoe
testimony; send emails to Blincoe re: same;
emails to Richard Gray IV re; Power points
for Keller and Blincoe,

Review email from T. Hunter; respond to
same, {(n/c)

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
Harrison Keller and Reece Blincoe
testimony presentations; build both
presenations; print same for coynsel,

Work re: Pflugerville Power Point
presentation; work re: Kallison
cross-examination; revies h. Mclntush
email; review D. Hinojusa emails (2);
review emails re: A. Odden repost; review
D. Hinojosa emsil voply to same.

Review emails; prepare for meeting with C.
Dupre; work re: Power Point presentation;
conferenz= with C. Dupre re: preparation for
testimony,

Prepure for R. Blincoe's testimony; edit
Bhiicoe testimony outline; meet with H.
Xeller; conference with R. Gray re: same.
Prepare for trial; revise Brownwood
PowerPoint; trial; prepare Reece Blincoe for
testimony.

Trial Day 16; prepare for Day 17, review
emails; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
deposition summaries.

Review email from R. Gray re: rescheduling
Dr. Kracht's testimony; telephone
conferences with Dr. Kracht's office re:
same; telephone call to Dr. Kracht - left
message; telephone conference with Dr,

Invoice # 42173

10.00 Yers

075 hrs

2,75 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.05 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.75 hrs

3.50 hrs

4.00 hrs

11,70 hrs

10.50 hrs

1.85 hrs

$3,250.00

$131.25

$1,237.50

$ 975.00

NfC

$262.50

$1,237.50

$1,575.00

$1,300.00

$2047.50

$4,725.00

Page 7



1171972012

11/20/2012

11720/2012

11/20/2012

31020

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Kracht re: rescheduling testimony and
attorney meeting; confer with R. Gray re:
same; review email from R. Gray, IV re:
downloading Picus study for attomey
review; prepare Findings of Fact excerpts
pertaining to R. Blincoe; review emails
from M. Sisler re: Motion for Leave; review
email from S. Rodriguez re: exhibits: review
email from 1. Pina re: supplemental
deposition designations; review email from
A. Vasquez re: Dr. Kracht's expenses;
review Defendants’ supplemental responses
to Calhoun County’'s RFP; confer with R.
Gray re: same; review updated Kallison
report; confer with R. Gray re: same; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
responses to Edgewood RFP; review email
from court reporter re: Folks errata; review
email from M. Jacobs re: supplement to
Odden report; review email from C. Dupre
re: schedule; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review email from Dr. Kracht re: testimony
outline; review Kallison appendices.
Attend trial; outline R. Blincoe testimony;
review Blincoe deposition; meet with R,
Blincoe to prepare for trial.

Prepare for trial; trial; revise Kallison cross
slides; conference with counsel re: same;
meeting of plaintiff attorneys re: schedule.
Review Abeline Power Point review
emails; review La Fiera Fower Point; Trial
day 17.

Review emails from R. Gray re: updated
Kallison report for W, Pierce review; email
W. Pierce re: samc; review emails from R.
Gray re: M. Srench testimony and
preparaticn for testimony; telephone call 1o
M. French re: same - Jeft message; review
emaiitrom M. French re: availability; email
B. Cray re: same; confer with R. Gray, IV
=’ W, Pierce exhibits; review email from T.
Hunter re: C. Wood report for Dr. Baker's
review; email C. Dupre re: Odden expert
presentation; prepare G. Salazar trial
notebook; review and organize updated
Kallison report, appendices, and CV for
attomey review; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review Master Exhibit List re:
same; email R. Gray, IV re: same; review
emails from A. Vasquez re: Dr. Stephenson
contact information, Dr, Kracht's expenses,
and Dr, Kracht's schedule for testimony;

Invoice #42173

10.00 hrs

10.20 hrs

10.15 his

175 hes

$3,250.00

$1785.00

$4,567.50

NiC

Page 8



11/20/2012

1172172012

1172172012

11/21/2012

11/23/2012

11/24/2012

1142572012

1142572012

1172572012

11/25/2012

11/26/2012

Ey L SE

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

RGIV

REG

REG

RGIV

confer with attomeys re: counties map;
prepare map as exhibit; confer with R. Gray,
1V re: same; confer with R. Gray, 1V re: R.
Blincoe testimony schedule.

Attend trial; conference with R. Blincoe;
exchange emails with B. Baker re: Craig
Wood; review email from D. Hinojosa re:
testimony of Winsowski; conference with R.
Gray re: witness schedule; email to M.
French re: same; email to G. Salazar re:
same; review emails from Plaintiff attomeys
re: Guthrie.

Revise Kallison PowerPoint; conference
with counsel re: same; print same:
conference with legal assistant re: Sixth
Amended Exhibit list; meeting at Equity
Center re: Kallison cross examination and
case status.

Conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman
re: K. Kallison testimony; review emails;
reply to same.

Review email from C. Pacheco re:
supplemental report; revise, efile, and serve
Sixth Amended Master Exhibit List; confer
with R. Gray, 1V re: same; review and
calendar L. Taylor deposition notice; vaview
email from court reporter re: Dunn
transcript; email B. Baker ve: C/ Wuod
report and related documents,

Review reports re: Charter exgerts; review
emails; reply to same; begin outline of K.
Kallison cross-examioation.

Review emails; reply to same; work re:
schedule; work r=: Rallison cross; work re:
Lisa Dawn-Fisticr examination.

Meeting with counsel re: prepare for cross
examinatis: of James Kallison; build
exhibits re: same.

Review 8. Dahlberg emails (2); reply to
s2me (2); review J. Tumer emails; work re:
vower Point; complete Kallison cross
preparation; review A. Kauffman email;
reply to same; telephone call to A.
Kauffman re: status and A. Cortez
testimony.

Review emails; reply to same; trial Day 18;
prepare for Day 19.

Prepare trial testimony of (3. Salazar; review
Plaintiff attomey emails re; Scott proffer
and Bum’s testimony.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Michael
French for testifying; meeting with counsel

Invoice # 42173

9.50 hrs

4.25 hrs

3.50 hrs

1.25 his

3.75 hrs

275 hrs

560 hrs

4.75 hrs

10.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

11.00 hrs

$3,087.50

$74375

$1,575.00

$1,687.50

$1.237.50

$920.00

$2,137.50

$4,837.50

$ 32500

$1925.00
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1112672012

1112672012

1172772012

11/27/2012

11/27/2012

1172772012

11/28/2012

11/28/2012
11/28/2012

10201

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

re: cross examination of James Kallison;
prepare PowerPoint for Los Fresnos 1SD.
Confer with R. Gray re: Dr. Kracht's trial 1.00 hrs
testimony; lephone conference with Dr.
Kracht's office re: same; confer with R.
Gray, 1V re: Los Fresnos newsclip; review
deposition schedule; email court reporter re:
same; email C. Pacheco re: Taylor
deposition; review emails re: same; confer
with T. Hunter re: Pfeiffer errata sheet;
review file re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: revisions to Master Exhibit List; confer
with R. Gray re: expert designation and
documenis received from Charter Schools.

Attend trial; draft Salazar trial testimony,; 9.50 hrs
email to Salazar re: same; meet with M.

French to prepare for trial.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Gonzalo 9.75 hrs
Salazar for testimony.

Trial day 19; prepare for day 20; review 9.00 hrs
emails; reply to same.

Review and retum email from R. Gray, 1V 1.15 hrs

re: current exhibit numbers; confer with R.

Gray, 1V re: Kallison Power Point

presentation; review email from J. Knight

re: irial estimony, confer with T, Hunter're:

same; review email from 1. Pina re: Cortez

supplernental report; revise Master Exhibit

List; confer with T. Hunter re: same,

Conference with M. French v=! testimony; 9.00 hrs
attend trial; prepare G. Salazar for trial;

conference with Plairtiif attomeys re:

schedule.

Prepare for trial and cross of James 10.95 hrs
Kallison; trial; prepare for tomorrow's trial;

conference vt counsel re: schedule:

continue tilding Los Fresnos PowerPoint;

emails-Sielley Dahlberg and John Tumer

re: Kallison slides; conference with counsel

ressame.
Trial Day 20; prepare for Day 21. 10.25 hrs
Review message from R. Gray re: 3.30 hrs

rescheduling C. Dupre; ielephone
conference with C. Dupre’s office re: same;
email attomeys re: same; review and revise
Master Exhibit List; review email from C.
Pacheco re: additional exhibits; review
documents re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: Whitchurst deposition transcript; review
file re: same; review email from C. Pacheco
re; Charter Plaintiffs’ field wimess trial
prep: continue work preparing witness files

Invoice # 42173

$3,087.50

$1706.25

$4,050.00

NAC

$2,925.00

$1916.25

$4,612.50
N/C

Pags 10



11/28/2012

1142972012

11/25/2012
111292012

11/29/2012

11/30/2012

11/30/2012

11/30/2012

nazm

TBH

RGIV

REG
SE)

RGIV

REG

SEJ

for attorney review.

Attend trial; prepare Podgursky bubble
rebuttal for Los Fresnos; prepare proffer for
Lesley and Colbert; conference with W,
Pierce, R. Freeman and R. Gray re; trial;
review C. Wood report; review Whitechurst
report; email to B. Baker re: same.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel
re: schedule.

Trial Day 21, review emails; reply to same.
Review email re: Woode Rolle
supplemental report for Charter Plaintiffs;
review amended master exhibit list; review
email re: trial transcripts; confer with R,
Gray re: same; revise P. Colbert proffer
{cont.).

Attend wrial; review Whitchurst deposition;
edit proffer; conference with R. Gray and
Richard Gray 1V re: witness order and
Findings of Fact; conference with Plaintiff
attorneys re: responsibility for State’s
witnesses; email to G. Salazar re: when he
will iestify.

Organize file; review Kallison cross
examination PowerPoint; review amicus
brief of The Texas State Teachers
Association; conference with counsel re:
findings of fact; research inter-couniy
district comparisons for cross examination
of Lisa Dawn-Fisher; conference with
counsel re: same; review otucle from Ray
Freeman re: Texas Higi: School Graduation
Rates; finalize and email Los Fresnons
PowerPoint preseniation to counsel for
review; confercince with legal assistant re:
same.

Review emails ; reply to same; conference
with artcrneys re: exhibits, cross
excnidnation preparation; prepare for Equity
Center meeting; attend Bquity Center Board
meeting; review amended discovery; review
State’s amended exhibit list; review emails;
reply to same; work re: witness scheduling;
review emails; reply to same.

Review email from T. Hunter re: C. Dupre

trial testimony schedule; telephone call to C.

Dupre re: same - left message; email C.
Dupre re: status; review email from T.
Hunter re: Bealieu and Housson; review file
re: documents pertaining to same; email S.
Dahlberg re: expected testimony; confer
with R. Gray re: same; review and revise

Invoice # 42173

8.50 hrs

8.65 hrs

2.00 s
070 hrs

9.00 brs

3.50 hrs

2.75 hus

$2,762.50

$1513.75

$4,050.00
$ 70.00

$2,925.00

$551.25

$1,575.00

Fage 13



Master Exhibit List; review email from L.
Lawrence re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; confer with T. Hunter re: adding
superintendent errata sheets as exhibits;

continue work organizing and preparing file

for attomey trial prep.

ARIEREEPER RECAR

REG 111, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray. IV, Richard E.

TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
LVS  von Sternberg, Lynn

Fee Recap Totals

EEbr o]

0.00 s @

18305 hrs @
161.13 hrs @
14665 s @

195 hrs @

492.80

Invoice # 42173

450.00 /hr
175.00 Mr
325.00 fhr
100.00 /-
100.00 /hr

$158,430.0

$82,372.50
$28,201.25
$47.661.25
$ 19500
$ 0.00

$158,430.00

Page 12



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

December 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition
¢fo Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERMVICES

12/01/2012

12/02/2012

12/02/2012

12/0312012

12/03/2012

12/03/2012

12/04/2012
12/04/2012

12/04/2012

1270572012

12/05/2012

kRS i1

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

Review emails; reply to same; review C.
Dupre outline; outline R. Coleman
deposition; outline R. Coleman cross;
review State’s disclosures.

Finalize Los Fresnos and Pflugerville
PowerPoints; conference with counsel re:
same; build Lisa Dawn-Fisher cross
examination PowerPoint; conference with
counsel re: cross of Rob Coleman,
Conference with R. Gray, IV re: Fower
Points; work re: cross-examination
preparation; review emails;i=ply to same.
Prepare for trial; trial, prepare Gonzalo
Salazar for testimony; piopare and build
PowerPoints for proffers of Bonnie Lesley
and Paul Colbert.

Review emails;veply to same; trial Day 22;
prepare for Day 23.

Attend trial; review Whithurst deposition;
review raaierials on S. Housson; meet with
G. Salazar to prepare for trial.

Prepare for trial; trial.

Tral Day 23; prepare for Day 24;
conference with L. Moak re: S. Beaulieu.
Attend trial; conference with G. Salazar;
review P, Colbert’s supplemental report;
review master exhibit list; telephone
conference with P. Colbert re: supplemental
report.

Prepare for wial; trial; conference with legal
assistant re: case file; Telephone conference
with Joe Wisnoski re: Legislative Budget
Board fiscla report; email Holly McIntush
re: Dan Casey materials.

Review emails (17); reply to same; trial Day

Invoice # 42673

Tax ID No.:

Invoice#: 42673-1

Our file

Billing through:

2.75 hrs

2.00 hrs

2.25 hrs

10.75 hrs

10.00 hrs

9.00 hrs

8.50 hrs

9.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

9.05 hrs

8.50 hrs

T4-2427406

REG
00001

12/31/2012

$1237.50

$350.00

$1012.50

$1881.25

$4500.00

$2925.00

$1487.50
$4050.00

$2600.00

$1583.75

$3825.00

Page |



12/05/2012

12/05/2012

12/06/2012

12/06/2012

12/06/2012

12/06/2012

12/07/2012

12/07/2012

12/0772012

12/08/2012

12/08/2012

3o

SEI

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

24; prepare for Day 25.

Review notice and calendar Bast deposition; 1.55 hrs
review Master Exhibit List; review M.

Sisler emails re: Gallegos deposition;

review M. Patterson email re: Whitehurst

Power Point Presentation; review and

calendar deposition notice for Gallegos;

review T, Hunter email re: notice to the

Court re: J. Knight de-designation; draft

notice and email T. Hunter re: status; review

T. Hunter email re: AG representative for 1.

Knight deposition; review transcript and

email T. Hunter re: same.

Attend trial; finalize proffers; conference 7.00 hrs
with P. Colbert re: his reports; outline cross

of Whitehurst; conference with R. Gray and

Richard Gray IV re: status.

Prepare for trial; trial; research members of 9.25 hrs
Legislative Budget Board; conference with

counsel] re: cross examinations.

Trial Day 25; prepare for Day 26; review 8.75 hrs
emails; reply to same.
Review email re: deposition exhibits; email 0.60 hrs

court reporter re: L., Davis deposition

transcript; review email re: same; reviey

and retum email from R. Gray, IV e

Davis transcript; review email from S

Rodriguez re: Wisnoski transcripi-and L.

Davis transcript; review T. Huntor email re:

superintendents’ replies re: Podgursky

bubble charts; review files r<: same.

Attend trial; edit cross ©F Whitehurst; 8.00 hrs
review NCLE goal=: conference with

R.Gray re: cross of Whitehurst.

Meeting at Equity Center re: cross 3.15 hrs
examination of Lisa Dawn-Fisher; review

admitted exbibits; revise same; confercnce

with legat assistant re: same.

Review W. Pierce email; prepare for 3.00 hes
meetusg re; L. Fisher; conference with W,

Ficrce R. Freeman, P. Colbert, and R. Gray,

iv re: L. Fisher testimony; review emails;

reply to same.

Review email from court reporter re: 0.80 hrs
exhibits; review Defendants’ designation of

L. Davis; email R. Gray re: same; review S.

Rodriguez email re: Podgursky transcript;

review 8. Dahlberg email re: State’s

proposed trial calendar.

Review L. Davis report; review L. Davis 2.00 hrs
deposition; review emails; reply to same.

Build PowerPoint for cross examination of 2.15 hrs

Lisa Dawn-fisher; review emails re: State'’s

Invoice # 42673

NC

$2275.00

$1618.75

$3937.50

N/C

$2600.00

$551.25

$1350.00

NI

$900.00

$376.25

Fage 2



12/09/2012

12/09/2012

12/10/2012

12/10/2012

1271012012

12/10/2012

12/11/2012

12/11/2012

3

SEJ

RGIV

SHEI

TBH

RGIV

REG

exhibits.

Review emails; reply to same; review Power
Point presentations; review L. Halpem
email with new material re: Podgursky.
Review email re: supplement to Podursky
report; review S. Dahlberg email re: trial
presentation for Zyskowski and Davis.
Prepare for trial; trial; continue building
PowerPoint for cross examination of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher, conference with counsel re:
same; review email from Ray Freeman re:
same.

Trial Day 26; prepare for Day 27; review
emails; reply to same.

Review C, Pacheco email re: additional
exhibit designations; review Master Exhibit
List; review emails re: deposition exhibits;
review L. Halpem email re: errata and
revisions to Podgursky's report; review M.
Sisler email re: deposition of M. DiBella;
calendar deposition; review M. Patterson
email re: Defendants’ Eleventh Master
Exhibit List; email court reporter re:
Zyskowski transcript; review email from
coutt reporter re: same; confer with R, Gray,
V1 re: deposition transcript for Zyskowska;
review email from R. Gray, Vi re:
Podgursky documents for attomey review;
review email re: 11/ final tridd transcript;
review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
article for Coleman cross<ezamination;
review email from S. Dallverg re: Givens
trial presentation; review email from J.
Turner re: Whitehurst exhibit; review T.
Hunter email re: Findings attributable 1o W,
Pierce; review ®ndings re: same; confer
with R. Grayv) IV re: same; review amended
DiBella seposition notice; calendar EC
school finance workshop event; review T.
Hunter email re: trial transcript containing
Crambers’ testimony; review L. Lawrence
cinail re: master exhibit list.

Attend trial; review Podgusky report and
deposition in preparation for cross;
conference with P. Fraissinet re: Podgusky
cross; conference with Plaintiff attomeys re:
closing arguments; conference with Richard
Gray IV re: Findings of Fact.

Prepare for wrial; trial; conference with
counsel re: findings of fact; revise findings
of Wayne Pierce.

Trial Day 27; prepare for Day 28; review
emails; reply to same; work re:

Invoice # 42673

2.25 hrs

0.20 hrs

9.30 hrs

8.75 hrs

2.60 hrs

7.00 hrs

12.50 hrs

9.75 hrs

$1012.50

N/IC

$1627.50

$3937.50

N/C

$2275.00

$2187.50

$4387.50

Page 2



12/1172012

12/11/2012

12/12/2012

12/12/2012

12/12/2012

12/12/2012

12/13/2012

12/13/2012
1271372012

3

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

cross-examination exhibits.

Review email re: amended Master Exhibit
List; revise Findings of Fact; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review C. Pacheco email
re: cancelling Patridge deposition; review
Master Exhibit List; review M. Patierson
email re: State’s trial presentation for Dr.
Podgursky; review email from R. Gray, IV
re: college remediation report; email M.,
Trachtenberg re: same; continue work re:
revising Findings; review emails re: trial
transcripts containing Pfeifer and Chambers
testimony; review file re: same; review R.
Freeman email re: slides for L. Dawn-Fisher
cross-examination; review email from R,
Gray re: college remediation report; review
email re: cancelling Trotter and S. Partridge
depositions; review T. Hunter email re:
Vigdor Power Point presentation; review
Vigdor file re: same.

Attend trial; review emails on Dr. Podgusky
from P. Fraissinet and respond; finalize
Podgusky cross; meet with Plaintiff
attomeys to discuss Findings of Fact; edit
Findings of Fact; conference with Richarg
Gray IV and R. Gray re: same.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel
re: findings of fact.

Trial Day 28; prepare for Day 29; work on
findings.

Revise Findings of Fact; review email from
C. Pacheco re: revisions to service list;
review emails re: drati trial transcripts;
review M. Patterson emails re: State’s trial
presentation re;-Ur, Podgursky, review W,
Pierce email sc; Hammond news releases.
Attend trial: veview material for Podgusky
cross; cenference with R.Gray and Richard
Gray IV re: Findings of Fact.

Mectiig with counsel re: equity findings of
fact; revise and update equity findings of
iact; conference with counsel re: same and
case schedule; email counsel re: headings
for same.

Trial Day 29; work on findings.

Review emails re; depositions; confer with
attomeys re: Pfeifer trial testimony
transcript; email H. McIntush re: same;
review email from M. Sisler re: depositions:
review emails from M. Patierson re:
Podgursky Power Point presentation and
State’s amended presentation; confer with T.
Hunter re: Focus Districts’ Power Point

Invoice # 42673

4.60 his

9.00 hrs

10.00 hrs

9.50 hrs

4.70 hrs

9.00 hrs

10.00 hrs

8.25 hus
1.50 hrs

NAC

$2925.00

$1750.00

$4275.00

NiC

$2925.00

$1750.00

$3712.50
N/C

Fage §



1271372012
12/14/2012

12/14/2012

12/14/2012

12/14/2012
1271512012

12/15/2012
12/16/2012

12/16/2012
12/16/2012

1271772012

1271742012

12/17/2012

g

TBH
RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

TBH

RGIV

REG
SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

presentations used at trial; confer with R,
Gray, IV re; same; review and calendar M.
DiBella deposition natice; review and
calendar R. Wolters deposition; review C,
Diamond email re: revised exhibit; review
M. Patterson email re: Housson trial
presentation and data; review R. Gray email
re: same; review email from court reporter
re: revised admitted exhibit list.

Draft Findings of Fact.

Review revised findings; email counsel
heading and subheadings from same,
conference with counsel re: James Kallison
findings; print powerpoint of Bruce Baker
for counsel; continue building PowerPoint
for cross examination of Lisa Dawn-Fisher
re: focus district AEIS and STAAR results;
draft findings of fact regarding Wealth
Hold-Harmiess/Target Revenue; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; work on
findings; outline L. Fisher deposition;
review Charter trial calendar; conference
with T. Hunter re: findings.

Review email from C. Pacheco re: 8.
Partridge deposition; review email froin C,
Pacheco re: Charter Plaintiffs' propos=d trial
calendar; review email from C. Paclieco re:
D. Dunn's errata; review emails rz:
deposition exhibits; calendar S. Partridge
deposition; email 5. Rodrignez re: final trial
transcripts; review emeil re: same; review T.
Hunter emails re: wasi=r exhibit list and
revisions to Findings.

Draft Findings ot tact.

Work re: findingz; work re: L. Fisher
cross-examination.

Draft Findings of Fact.

Review and edit findings of fact; conference
with counsel re: same.

Waork on findings of fact.

rnevise Findings of Fact; review emails re:
deposition exhibits.

Meeting with counsel re: review and revise
findings of fact; draft findings of fact for
focus districts.

Work on findings; review emails; reply to
same; telephone conference with M.
Trachtenberg re: findings; review deposition
naotice.

Work re: findings attributable to
Superiniendents; review email from L. Pina
re: Eissler deposition; review and calendar

Invoice # 42673

7.00 hrs
4.59 hrs

4.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

5.00 hrs
3.75 hrs

3.00 hrs
3.25 his

5.50 hrs
4.00 hrs
13.15 hrs

8.75 hrs

3.95 hrs

$2275.00

$787.50

$2137.50

w/C

$1625.00
$1687.50

$1625.00
$568.75

$2475.00
N/C

$2301.25

$3937.50

N

Page 5



1271772012

1271872012

12/18/2012

12/18/2012

12/18/2012

12/19/2012

12/15/2012

1271972012

12/20/2012

30204

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

SEJ

TBH

deposition; continue work re: revising
Findings of Fact; review and calendar
deposition notices; review and calendar
Eissler, D. Pierce, 8. Partridge, and M.
DiBella deposition notices; review M. Sisler
re: email re: Pierce and Flemister
depositions; review T. Hunter email re:
revisions to Findings.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV to edit Findings of Fact.

Conference wuth connsel re: exhibit and
deposition numbers for findings of fact;
review Master Exhibit Lisr re: same; email
legal assistant re: findings and chart used in
testimony of Charles Dupre.

Work on findings; work on conclusions of
law; prepare bullet point submission to
Court; review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with T. Hunter re: witness
examinations; reply to emails; work on
conclusions of law; review W, Pierce emails
(2); reply to same (2).

Continge work re: revising Findings of Fact;
review emails re: contact information for
Judge Dietz and C. Jenson; review email
from court reporter re: 11/7 trial trapsiipt;
confer with attorneys re: de-designation of
J. Knight as expert; T. Hunter ermail re:
findings attributable to Focus Districts;
review T. Hunter email re: de-designation of
J. Knight.

Draft TTSEC submission to Common
Findings; review praposed Conclusions of
Law,

Work on findings and conclusions; review
emails; reply o same; review W. Pierce
email; revicw analysis re: L. Fisher;
telephope conference with W. Pierce - left
message; telephone call to W. Pierce re: L.
Firheranalysis; edit and revise Focus
Dnztrict findings and conclusions of law,
work re: revisions to Findings of Fact;
review emails re: deposition exhibits;
review emails re: proposed joint findings of
fact; review T. Hunter email re; exhibits and
additional revisions to findings.

Review emails from M. Trachtenberg re:
Joint Findings.

Review emails; reply to same; work on
findings and conclusions; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; work re:
cross-examination; telephone conference
with re: status and strategy;

Invoice # 42673

11.00 hrs

125 hrs

525 hos

425 hrs

11.00 hrs

7.50 hrs

7.10 s

0.50 hrs

7.25 hrs

$3575.00

$218.75

$2362.50

$3575.00

$3375.00

wC

$162.50

$3262.50

Pape &



12/20/2012

1272012012
1272172012

12/2212012
12/26/2012

12/2712012

12/27/2012

1272872012

1212912012

12/26/2012
12/30/2012

12/31/2012

12/31/2012

12/3172012

12/31/2012

3eR01

SEl

TBH

TBH

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

REG

SEJ

draft letter to Court re; findings.

Revise Findings of Fact; confer with
attorneys re: same; email Judge Dietz re:
proposed Findings and correspondence from
R. Gray.

Edit Findings

Work re: L. Fisher cross, work on findings;
work re: R. Coleman cross and S, Bielicu
cross; review W. Pierce email; review
emails; reply to same.

Review and reply to emails.

Review and reply to emails; work re; R,
Coleman cross.

Review emails; reply to same; work re: 8.
Bielien testimony; review additional emails;
reply to same; work re: findings; review
material provided by L. Fisher.

Conference with R. Gray re: Findings of
Fact, intervenor and State witnesses and
Lisa Dawn Fischer; organize file for Linda
Roska's cross examination.

Work re: findings and cross-examination;
review emails; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email.

Review emails; conference with R. Gray, I
re: exhibits for cross-examination; revigw
W. Pierce email; reply to same.

Prepare for cross of Linda Roska:

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
email S. Dahiberg re: L. Figher; review §.
Dahiberg auto reply.

Meeting with counsel re: cross examinations
of Rob Coleman; Shincy Beaulieu; and Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; review report of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher re: average tax rate
comparison.

Build PowerFoint re: 41 v 42 comparison;
conferer:ce with counsel re: same.

Work 1o cross-examination preparation;
revicw emails; reply to same; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits.

neview email from C. Pacheco re: C. Wood
grrata; review T. Hunter email re: Parker
and McAdams deposition transcripts and
Roska transcript; review M. Patterson email
re: Defendants Twelfth Amended Master
Exhibit List; review email from court
reporter re: 11/8 final transcript; review M.
Bono email re: Pierce deposition; review
calendar re: same; review email from court
reporter re: amended exhibit list; review and
compare amended exhibit list to TTSFC
exhibit list; review email from court reporter

Invoice # 42673

7.00 s

2.00 hrs
3.25 hrs

€35 hrs
1.50 hrs

2.25 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.00 hrs
0.35 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.35 hrs

2.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

N

$650.00
$1462.50

$157.50
$675.00

$1012.50

$650.00

$787.50

$675.00

$650.00
$157.50

$262.50

$236.25

$1125.00

N/C

Page ¥



TIMERKEEPER RECAP

re: corrected 11/8 trial transcript; review
emails from T. Hunter re: findings; Review
and calendar M. Flores deposition notice;
review and calendar B. Flemister deposition
notice.

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 140.95 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 11i65hs @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 10250 s @
SEJ Jenmings, Susan Paralegal 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 355.10

Fraza Invoice # 42673

450.060 /hr
175.00 Mr
325.00 /hr
100.00 fy

$116,278.75

$63,427.50
$19,538.75
$33,312.50
$ 0.00

$116,278.75

Page &



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
Januwary 31, 2013
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 42738 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpaver and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 0173172013
cfo Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austn, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
01/02/2013 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: exhibits; print 0.25 hrs $ 4375
same,
01/02/2013 REG Work re: cross-examination of R. Coleman, 5.00 hrs $2,250.00

S. Beaulieu and L. Dawn-Fisher; review
ermails; reply to same; conference with R,
Gray, IV re: depositions; review C.
Diamond email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review J. Turner email; reply to same; email
attorneys re: cross-examination: review 8.
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Hinojosz email; review D.
Thompson email; review P. Fraissinet
email; review D. Thomipson email; review
S. Beaulieu deposition transcript; telephone
conference with ' W. Pierce re: analysis of L.
Dawn-Fisher data and examination;
telephone cail to D. Hinojosa - left message;
telephoue call to D. Hinojosare: L.
Dawri-risher cross-examination.

0140242013 SEI Eeview and update trial transcript files; 0.00 hrs N
email! 5. Rodriguez re: 11/1/12 transcript
and Parker and McAdams deposiiion
transcripts; review emails from S.
Rodriguez re: same; review deposition
exhibits produced by Parker and McAdams;
prepare for attorney review.

01/02/2013 SEJ Review emails re: S. Beaulieu deposition (.70 hrs NI
transcript; telephone call to B, Schulman's
oifice re: transcript and exhibits - left
message; email 8. Rodriguez re: same;
confer with R. Gray re: same; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: Beaulicu

3102-01 Invoice # 42738 Page 1



01/02/2013

01/03/2013

01/03/2013

01/03/2013

01/03/2013

01/04/2013

01/04/2013

01/04/2013

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

exhibits; review emails from A, Herrera re:
Beaulieu transcript and exhibits.

Research on L. Roska; conference with R.
Gray re: trial schedule.

Meeting with counsel re: intervenors and
charter school witnesses and findings of
fact; review expert report of Allen Parker;
meeting at equity center re: Lisa
Dawn-Fisher cross examination; conference
call with plainaffs counsel re: intervenor
and charter witnesses.

Conference with attorneys re: findings of
fact and witness cross-examination;
conference with R. Gray, IV and W. Pierce
re: L. Dawn-Fisher examination; review
emails; reply to same; work re: preparation
for cross-examination; telephone conference
with attorneys re: cross-examination and
trial strategy; work re: cross-examination of
S. Beaulien and R. Coleman; outline cross
of R. Coleman; outline cross of 8. Beaulieu,
Review emails re: findings to send to
co-counsel; review emails re: deposition
exhibits; review emails re: Parkcr aeposition
transcript; review 11/13/12 wial transcript;
revise common findings.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV re: Intervenor and Charter witnesses and
Final Findings of facts; telephone
conference withilalatiff attorneys re: cross
of intervenor witnesses.

Meeting at Equity Center with Adam Pierce
re: Tunnirg data for cross examination of
Lisa Dawn-Fisher; meeting with counsel,
Wayne Pierce, Ray Freeman, and Adam
Pictce re: cross examination of Lisa
Cawn-Fisher; review and reply to email
irom Sheliey Dahiberg re: exhibits used
with James Kallison; print exhibits for
counsel; review Lisa Dawn-Fisher cross;
meeting with counsel re: cross of Rob
Coleman and Shirley Beaulicu.

Meeting re: L. Dawn-Fisher examination;
work with R. Gray, IV re: Beaulieu and
Coleman cross-examinations; work re:
outline of L. Dawn-Fisher examination;
review emails; reply to same.

Review emails re: M. Hurley deposition

Invoice # 42738

1.00 hrs

5.35 hrs

$.00 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.50 hrs

8.20 hrs

8.50 hrs

2.55 hrs

$ 325.00

$936.25

$4,050.00

$180.00

$ 48750

$1435.00

$3,825.00

N

Page 2



01/05/2013

01/05/2013

01/06/2013

01/06/2013

01/06/2013

01/07/2013

01/07/2013

01/07/2013

01/07/2013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEl

TBH

transcript; review status of trial transcripts;
confer with attorneys re: same; telephone
conference with M. Patterson re; W, Pierce
Power Point presentation; telephone
conference with M., Sisler re: same; review
email from R. Gray, IV re: W. Pierce trial
presentation; review R. Gray, IV email re:
additional admitted exhibits; review
Efficiency Intervenors' designations re:
upcoming trial witnesses; email T. Hunter
re: admitted exhibits; review and calendar J.
Strohmeyer deposition; prepare files re:
Intervenors’ designations and depositions
for attorney review; telephone conference
with M. Patterson re: trial exhibits; email R,
Gray, IV re: same.

Meeting with counsel re: prepare for cross
examination of Lisa Dawn-Fisher.

Outline L. Dawn-Fisher cross-examination;
review R. Freeman email; reply to same.
Meeting with counsel re: prepare for crods
examinations of Lisa Dawn-Fisher, Rob
Coleman, and Shirley Beaulieu.

Work re: preparation for cross-exanination
of State’s witness; review emails; reply to
same; review Power Point presentations.
Review exhibit list and determine what we
need to admit.

Prepare for trial; trizh, prepare for cross of
Lisa Dawn-Fisher: review powerpoint to be
used during direct examination of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher.

Trial Day 52, prepare for Day 31; review
emails, reply to same.

Review and organize trial ranscripts; email
aitowneys re: status of trial ranscripts;
toview file re: Intervenors’ live pleading;
email T. Hunter re: same; review email re:
Ft. Bend exhibiis; review email re: Coleman
and Beaulieu trial exhibits; review email
from T. Hunter re: admitted exhibits; review
master exhibit list re: exhibits withdrawn;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; prepare
slide exhibits from dropout report; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Attend trial; prepare for Eissler deposition;
prepare for L. Roska cross; edit Findings of
Fact.

Invoice #42738

3.00 hrs

6.50 hrs

3.40 hrs

5.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

10.25 hrs

11.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

$525.00
$2,925.00

$595.00

$2,587.50

$ 487.50

$1753.75

$5,175.00

$300.00

$2,600.00

Page 3



01/08/2013

01/08/2013

01/08/2013

01/08/2013

01/09/2013

01/09/2013

01/09/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Prepare for trial; wrial; conference with legal 12.30 hrs
assistant re: trial exhibits; review, revise,
and prepare for cross examination of Lisa

Dawn-Fisher,

Trial Day 31; prepare for Day 32; review 11.75 hrs
emails; reply to same.

Review R. Gray email re: documents 3.20 hrs

provided by Efficiency Intervenors; review

file re: same; review emails re: admiued

exhibits; review court reporter’s list of

admitted exhibits; revise Plaintiffs' Eighth

Amended Master Exhibit List; review

emails re: same; prepare exhibits for

submission; review email from M. Sisler re:

Defendants amended exhibit list; confer

with T. Hunter re: index of trial transcripts;

review and calendar T. Sage deposition;

review emails from R. Gray, IV re: admitted

exhibits; review emails from R. Gray re:

Intervenors’ documents produced with

disclosures; emai! R. Gray, IV re: Baker

trial presentation; review emai! from R.

Gray, IV re: same; review email fromM.

Patterson re: additional exhubits; email M.

Patterson re: Baker trial presentation and

supplemental report; review ewail from S.

Dahlberg re: Fisher trial nresentadon,

Attend trial; review Mov deposition in 10.00 hrs
preparation for Eisslei's deposition; figure

out computation/in Edgewood IV; email to

P. Colbert and 1. Moak and review

comments,

Prepare for wial; trial; email admitted 9.15 hrs
TTSFC Exhibit to Shelley Dahlberg and

Carc! lonson.

Trial' Day 32; prepare for Day 33; review 10.50 hrs
cmails; reply to same; conference with T,

Hunter re: R, Eissler deposition.

Review emails re: Intervenors' expert 1.00 hrs
reports and responses to requesis for 0.70 hrs
disclosure; email C. Diamond re: same;

prepare reports and exhibits for attorney

review; review email from T. Hunter re:

rough draft of trial wanscript containing L.

Dawn-Fisher testimony; review email from

M. Patterson re: G. Day presentation;

review email from R. Gray, [V re: L.

Dawn-Fisher Power Point, revised exhibit

Invoice # 42738

$2152.50

$5,287.50

N/C

$3,250.00

$1601.25

$4,725.00

$100.00
N/C

Page d



01/09/2013 TBH
01/10/2013 RGIV

01/10/2013 REG

01/10/2013 SEj

01/10/2013 TBH

01/11/2013 RGIV

01/11/2013 REG

310201

list, and USB flashdrive; review emails re:

Currah excerpts; review State's disclosures

re: testimony of L. Roska; email T. Hunter

re:; same; review email from M. Jacobs re:

Beaulieu exhibits; review email from M,

Patterson re: Coultress trial exhibits; review

email re: Ft. Bend Plainiffs’ amended

exhibit list; review and organize additional

trial transcripts.

Attend deposttion of Rob Eissler. B.50 lis
Review findings of fact for Wayne Fierce; 4. 65 hrs
conference with legal assistant and counsel

re: same; conference with counsel re: cross

examination of Roska.

Trial Day 33; review emails; reply 1o same; 8.50 hrs
begin preparation of cross for intervenor

witnesses.

Review and return ernail from C. Jenson re: 1.30 hrs
TTSFC proposed findings; email T. Hunter 1.30 hrs

re: L. Roska designation; confer with T,
Hunter re: transcript containing B. Baker’s
trial testimony; review file re: same; cenfer
with attorneys re: Power Point preseniation
for L. Roska cross-examination;review
email from T. Hunter re: Intervenors'
exhibits; review exhibits re: 8/22 report;
ernail T, Hunter re; same: review email from
T. Hunter re: R. Eissler deposition transcript
and exhibits; telephons conference with
court reporier re;'same; email T. Hunter re:
status; review email from T. Hunter re:
Intervenors' aarmutted exhibits; review
master exhibit list re; same; email T. Hunter
re: same; prepare slides for Roska
cross-¢xamination; review email from court
reporeer re: R. Eissler transcript; revise,
iinalize, e-file and serve Plaintiffs' Eighth
Amended Exhibit List; review email from
L. Lawrence re: deposition exhibits.

Attend trial; continue preparing Roska 9.00 hrs
cross; begin preparing Eissler cross.
Review testimony of Wayne Pierce; review 4.80 hrs

and compare findings of fact for same;

conference with counse! re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; conference 3.75 hrs
with attorneys re: findings of fact; review

exhibit list; work re: exhibits; begin outline

of closing brief.

Invoice # 42738

$2,762.50
$813.75

$3,825.00

$130.00
N/C

$2,925.00

$840.00

$1,687.50

Page 5



01/11/2013

01/11/2013

01/12/2013

01/13/2013
01/13/2013

01/14/2013

01/14/2013

01/14/2013

01/14/2013

0171572013

3102-01

SEI

REG
REG
TBH

RGIV

REG

SE}

TBH

RGIV

Review email from H. McIntsh re: 1.80 hrs
admitted exhibits; review email re:

corrected 10/25 trial transcript; review email

from T. Hunter re: State's additional

exhibits; review exhibiis and prepare for

attorney review; review email from T.

Hunter re: State's exhibits; review email

from C. Pacheco re: Rolle errata; review

email from T, Hunter re; additional slides

for Roska cross-examination; review

dropout report and prepare slides; review

email from court reporter re: Eissler

exhibits.

Conference with R. Gray re:trial progress; 4.00 hrs
conference with L. Lawrence re: Roska

testimony; begin gathering material for

Eissler cross; begin editing common

Findings of Fact.

Review M. Huriey deposition; outline 1.75 hrs
examination of M. Hurley.

Review emails; reply to same. 0.50 hrs
Prepare for trial; review State's exhibits: 3.00 hrs
conference with L. Lawrence re: Roska

Cross.

Prepare for trial; rial; meeting with counsel 9.05 hrs
re: findings of fact.

Trial Day 34; prepare for Day 35; review 9.25 hrs
emails; reply to same; roview T. Sage

report.

Review email frem T. Hunter re: trial 0.90 hrs

transctipts; review email re: L. Ayala trial

presentation and exhibits; review email re:

L. Roska n1i2] presentation; review email

from court reporter re: Moe deposition

transctipt; review email from C. Pacheco re:

Sage expert report; review emails re:

coulition meeting; review email from R,

Uray, IV re: admitted exhibits; review

exhibit list re: same; review A. Penn email

re: Coleman testimony and exhibits.

Attend trial; finalize cross of L. Roska; 9.00 hrs
conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray

IV re: Findings of Fact.

Review findings of fact and trial testimony 6.80 hrs
of Wayne Pierce; revise findings of fact;

conference with counsel re: same; review

email re: corrected master data set of Lisa

Dawn-Fisher; conference with counsel re:

Invoice # 42738

NiC

$1,300.00

$ 78750

$ 225.00
$ 975.00

$1583.75

$4,162.50

NC

$2,925.00

$1190.00

Page



01/15/2013

01/15/2013

01/15/2013

01/16/2013

01/16/2013

01/16/2013

01/17/2013

01/17/2013

01/17/2013

01/17/2013
01/18/2013

3102-0t

REG

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

TBH
RGIV

same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: same; review data set.

Trial Day 35; prepare for Day 36; review
emails; reply to same; work re: findings of
fact; review new database; tclephone
conference with W. Pierce re; same.
Review email from M. Patterson re:
additional exhibits; review email from R,
Gray re: 1/22 counsel meeting.

Draft Findings of Fact; conference with R.
Gray and Richard Gray IV re: same and trial
deadlines.

Review corrected master dataset from Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; do cross examination
calculations on same; telephone conference
with Wayne Pierce and Ray Freeman re:
same; conference with counsel re: same;
draft affidavit re: same and differences
between master datasets.

Trial Day 36, prepare for Day 37; review
emails; reply to same; work re: affidavit re:
new Lisa Dawn-Fisiher database.

Review email from court reporter re: tlissler
transcript.

Review language for affidavit of Wayne
Pierce re: corrected master dataset for Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; conference with counsel re:
same; review and reviss findings of fact for
Wayne Pierce re: equity exhibits;
conference with Counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Toni Hunter re: focus
district findirigs.

Trial Day 37, review emails; reply to same;
conference with attorneys re: findings and
exhibitc, review material re: T, Sage
deposition; telephone conference with T.
exunter re: findings.

Review email from M. Sisler re: Sage
deposition notice; review email from C.
Pacheco re: T. Sage report and documents;
prepare initial draft of W. Pierce affidavit;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review
master exhibit list; review emails re: timing
for updated findings.

Work on Findings of Fact.
Review and revise findings of fact for

Wayne Pierce; review and revise affidavit of
Wayne Pierce re: Lisa Dawn-Fisher's

Invoice # 42738

10.50 hes

0.20 hrs

8.00 ks

7.20 hrs

8.75 hrs

0.10 hrs

5.45 hrs

8.00 hrs

1.10 hrs

2.00 hrs
5.80 hrs

$4,725.00

NC

$2,600.00

$1266.00

$3,937.50

N/C

$953.75

$3,600.00

2
%)

$ 650.00
$1015.00

Page 7



01/18/2013

01/18/2013

01/19/2013

01/19/2013

01/20/2013

01/20/2013

01/20/2013
01/21/2013

0172172013

01/21/2013

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH
RGIV

REG

SEI

corrected master dataset; telephone

conference with Wayne Pierce re: same;

testimony of Wayne Pierce; conference with

counsel re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; work on 275 hrs
findings of fact; work re: revised data; work

re: W. Pierce affidavit.

Review email from T, Hunter re: status of 1.50 hrs
findings; review email from M. Jacobs re:

district-specific findings; review email from

H. Mclntush re: equity findings; continue

revising findings.

Review and revise findings of fact for 2.00 hrs
Wayne Pierce; review defendant’s cross

exarination of Wayne Pierce.

Review emails; reply to same; work on 3.50 brs
findings; work on cross of Parker; work on

W. Pierce affidavit,

Review and revise findings of fact for 2.75 hrs
Wayne Pierce; review cross examination of

Wayne Pierce by Calhoun County Plaintiifs;

conference with counsel re: findings of fact.

Review emails; reply to same; confirence 2.75 hrs
with R. Gray, IV re: findings; work re:

Daubert motion (Parker); work re: Parker

Cross.
Work on Findings of Fact, 3.00 hus
Conference with counse! ve: findings of fact; 4.80 hrs

review affidavit of Yayne Pierce; telephone

conference with "Wayne Pierce re: same;

meeting with counsel re: causes of action;

proposed order; andings of fact; daubert

motion re* Allen Parker; review, revise, and

update findings of fact for Lisa

Dawn-*isher; conference with counsel re:

same,

‘Work re: findings, Daubert challenge and 4,50 hrs
Parker cross-examination; review and reply

to emails; work re: W. Pierce affidavit;

work re: attorney fee affidavit; prepare for

Day 38 of mial; review C. Diamond email;

conference with attorpeys re: 1/22 meetings;

review Hurley Power Point.

Review email re: Gallagos, Abbott erratas; 3.00 hrs
revise findings for common document; 4.00 hrs
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review

emails from T. Hunter re: revised findings;

review emails from H. Mclntush re:

Invoice # 42738

$1,237.50

N

$525.00

$1,575.00

$481.25

$1,237.50

$ 975.00
$840.00

$2,025.00

$300.00
N/C

Page 8



G1/21/2013

01/22/2013

01/22/2013

G1/22/2013

01/22/2013

01/23/2013

01/23/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

findings; finalize inserts to common
findings; email attorneys te: same.

Work on Findings of Fact; review email
from P. Colbert; conference with R. Gray
and Richard Gray IV re: Plaintiff meeting
tomorrow; Daubert motion, Findings of
Fact, and Amended Petition; email to T.
Robertson re: Amended Petition; review
revised Common Findings.

Drafi Motion to Exclude for Allan Parker;
conference with counsel re; same; review
deposition of Allan Parker re: same; review
Gammill v. Jack Williams; review Daubert
v. Robinson; meeting with plaintiff's
counsel re: relief, findings of fact, and
attorneys fees.

Trial Day 38; prepare for Day 39; review
and reply to emails; conference with
attorneys re: findings/judgment.

Revise findings {cont.); confer with
attorneys re: same,; confer with R. Gray, 1V
re: admitted exhibits; review and compare
most recent list of admitted exhibits‘with
Plaintiffs' Eighth Amended Exhinit List;
email R. Gray re: same; review email from
C. Pacheco re: amended exnibit list; review
email from M. Patterson re: amended
exhibit list; review trial iranscripts re:
Kallison testimony; feview email re: 11/19
mal transcript; roview emails re: amended
petition, updated list of districts; confer with
R. Gray, IV te;) L. Dawn-Fisher inserts to
findings; review and revise inseris; review
email from I. Pina re: exhibits.

Review and edit Common Findings; Review
firal version of Common Findings; review
i.. Dawn-Fisher Findings; review and edit
Equity Findings of Fact; meet with Plaintiff
attorney re: relief, Findings,

Review testimony of Lisa Dawn-Fisher,
James Kallison, and Wayne Pierce re:
findings of fact; conference with counsel re:
same; meeting with Wayne Pierce and Ray
Freeman te: case status; continue drafting
motion to exclude re: Allan Parker.

Trial Day 39, prepare for Day 40, review
and reply to emails; work re; Parker cross;
work re: findings; conference with W,

Invoice # 42738

5.00 hrs

9.15 Jus

10.50 hus

1.50 hrs
6.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

7.10 has

6.75 hrs

$1,625.00

$1601.25

$4,725.00

$150.00
N/C

$2,600.00

$1242.50

$3,037.50

Paga 9



01/23/2013

01/23/2013

01/24/2013

0172412013

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

Pierce and R. Freeman re: status.

Review email from 1. Pina re: motion to 1.30 hrs
exclude expert; review email from R. Gray, 1.30 hrs
IV re: West Orange Cove 11 attorney fee

affidavit; review file re: same; revise

amended petition; confer with T. Hunter re:

same; email T. Robertson re: same; revise

findings; confer with T. Hunter re:

submission date; review emails from C.

Pacheco re: exhibits; review notice and

emails re: D. Casey deposition; review

emails re: additional ranscripts; review

email re: filing amended petition; review

email from T. Hunter re: revisions to

petition; revise petition; revise findings as to

L. Dawn-Fisher and Kallison; confer with

attorneys re: same; email clients re:

findings; confer with attorneys re: same;

confer with T. Hunter re: filing and serving

amended petition; review email from M.

Patterson re: Partridge presentation.

Work on cites for Findings of Fact; creaie 4.50 hrs
document to send to Judge’s law clerk; meet

with W. Pierce and R. Freeman to discuss

various matters; merge facilities Findings

into Common document; emaito H.

Mclntosh re: same.

Review and reply to email from rebecca 3.60 hrs
Couto de Silvare: Los Fresnos STAAR

Reports; conferezsice with counsel re: same;

review deposition exhibits for Gonzalo

Salazar re: samz; conference with legal

assistant r=. case files; review Motion to

Exclude testimony of Allan Parker;

confer¢nice with legal assistant re: seventh

amnended petition; review Edgewood IV

vpinion; draft findings of fact re: same;

ineeting with counsel re: same and other

findings of fact; review and print

defendant’s plea to the jurisdiction.

Finalize, efile and serve TTSFC Plaintiffs’ 1.50 hrs
Seventh Amended Petition; email C. Jenson

re: same; email clients re: joint findings and

amended petition; review emails re:

revisions to amended petition; revise and

efile TTSFC Plaintiffs’ Eighth Amended

Petition; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

review email from C. Pacheco re: L. Roska

Invoice # 42738

$130.00
N/C

$1,462.50

$630.00

NiC

Page 10



01/24/2013

01/25/2013

017252013

01/25/2013

01/26/2013

01/26/2013

017262013

0172712013

01/28/2013

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

SEJ

REG

RGIV

exhibit; review email from H. MclIntush re;

exhibits.

Attend trial; review Common Findings of 6.50 hrs
Fact; conference with R. Gray and Richard

Gray IV re: Edgewood IV,

Review State Defendant’s Plea to the 4.85 hrs
Jurisdiction and Order on same; conference

with counse! re: Report of Allan Parker;

conference with counsel re: scheduling and

closing argument; review Edgewood IV

create findings of fact from same;

conference with counsel re: same and

overall findings of fact; review testimony of

Wayne Pierce and tax payer plainuffs re;

findings of fact; conference with counsel re:

same.

Review plea to jurisdiction filed by the Sate; 4,50 hrs
conference with attorneys re: same; begin

drafting closing; additional work re:

findings; review emails; reply to same;

review emails re: Charter exhibits; work ce:

attorney’s fees.

Draft response to Defendant’s Plea t1o7he 6.00 hrs
Jurisdiction; email edits and suggesions for

Common Findings of Fact to Plaintiffs; edit

our insert to Common Findings of Fact.

Review and reply to emails; conference call 1.00 hrs
with attorneys re: findings.
Review emails re: updated list of coalition 0.50 hrs

districts; review <mails from T. Hunter re:
joint submission of findings; review emails
re: deposition transcripts; review email re:

irial calepdar.

Telephone conference with Plaintiffs 1.00 hrs
attorreys to discuss financial findings.

Waik re: preparation for meetings with 7.75 hrs

Coalition members; meetings with Coalition
members; prepare for Day 41; work re:
findings; review and reply to emails.
Review emial from David Thompson re: 4.45 hrs
findings of fact on the issue of the cost of a
Geneal Diffusion of Knowledge; draft
findings re: saime; conference with legal
assisant re: drafied findings; meeting with
plaintiffs counsel re: findings of fact; revise
findings of fact; conference with counsel re:
same; review number of districts that can
get to $6576 at $1.00 and $1.04.

Invoice # 42738

$2,112.50

$848.75

$2,025.00

$1,950.00

$ 45000

N/C

$ 325.00

$3,487.50

$778.75

Page 11



01/28/2013

01/28/2013

01/28/2013

01/29/2013

G1/29/2013

01/29/2013

01/29/2013

01/29/2013

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Trial Day 41; prepare for Day 42; review 8.00 hrs
and reply to emails; work re: draft findings.
Review emails re: Charter Plaintiffs’ 1.00 hrs

exhibits and deposition designations; review

emails re: Charter Plaintiffs’ trial exhibits;

review email re: Rule 11 agreement and

stipulations; review email re: T. Sage

deposition and exhibits; review email from

court reporter re: 11/26 wrial transcript;

review emails re: updated list of coalition

districts; review emails from T, Hunter re;

joint submission of findings; review emails

re: deposition transcripts; review email re:

mial calendar,

Edit Common Findings; meet with Plaintiff 8.50 hrs
attorneys to discuss financial findings;

conference with R. Gray re: same; review

Moak report.

Review number of districts achieving $6576 0.55 hurs
at a $1.04 or less tax rate; conference with

counsel re: same; revise and update findiags

re: same; conference with counsel re: James

Kallison cross examination; review £10ss

examination.

Review Wayne Pierce testimony re: 225 hrs
findings of fact; conference wiih counsel re:

same; review emails from Ray Freeman re:

same; meeting with counsel re: case status.

Trial Day 47, prepare for Day 43; review 9.25 hrs
and reply to emails; work re: findings of

fact; work on closing argument.

Review C. Pacheco email re: witness 0.75 hrs
presentations; review email from court 0.35 hes
reporter re: admitted exhibits; review email

re: Edgewood exhibits and Cortez

supplemental report; review email from M.

Sisler re: objections to Charter Plaintiffs'

amended petition; review C. Pacheco email

re: corrected trial exhibits; review C.

Pacheco email re: documents uploaded to

the AG FTP server; review M. Sisler email

re: notice of withdrawal of objections;

confer with T. Hunter re: additional

proposed findings; review C. Pacheco email

re: Rolle presentation; review emails re;

additional proposed findings; review emails

re: admitted exhibits.

Work on Findings of Fact; conference with 8.30 hrs

Invoice # 42738

$3,600.00

N/C

$2,762.50

$ 9625

$393.75

$4,162.50

$ 75.00
N/C

$2,697.50
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01/30/2013

01/30/2013
01/30/2013

01/30/2013

01/31/2013

01/31/2013

01/31/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG
SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

K. Gray on pleadings; conference with R,
Gray on Common Findings on Level of
Finding needed;emails to M. Trachtenberg
re: same; email to Lt, McIntosh re: facility
findings.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
Bruce Baker Supplemental Report and
exhibits; review Baker Report and exhibits;
conference with legal assistant re: equity
center redlined findings of fact; conference
with counsel re: meeting re: same; review
redlined findings; telephone conference with
Ray Freeman re: findings of fact;
conference with counsel re: same; draft
same; meeting with Wayne Pierce, Ray
Freeman, and Toni Hunter re: findings of
fact.

Trial Day 43; review and reply to emails.
Revise findings (cont.); confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review emails from C.
Pacheco re: expert presentations; review
emails re: exhibits; confer with T. Hun'er re:
J. Pfeifer contact information; reviewsmail
from R. Freeman re: revisions tefindings;
review email re: Calhoun County and Fort
Bend wrial brief; review email fiom C.
Pacheco re: Dunn presentation; review
emails re: Cortez supplemiental report;
review email from M0 Patterson re: trial
exhibits; review tmails re: Baker exhibits;
review email from R. Gray re: 11/27 wial
transcript.

Work on Faindings of Fact; meet with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman on same; review trial
brief o adequacy/suitability; review State’s
exhibits,

Review and revise findings of fact;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
meeting with counsel re: review edits to
findings of fact.

Work on file cleanup; work on findings;
review emails; reply to same; review
additional exhibits; work on closing; work
re: fee issues; review Edgewood plea to
jurisdiction and motion to dismiss; email D.
Hinojosa re: same.

Revise findings (cont.); review updated list

Invoice # 42738

5.30 hrs

8.00 hrs
1.50 hrs

2.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

3.70 hrs

4.75 hrs

3.00 hrs

$927.50

$3,600.00
$150.00
N/C

$2,600.00

$647.50

$2,137.50

$300.00
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of admitted exhibits from court reporter;

review email from C. Pacheco re: additional
exhibits; confer with T. Hunter re: revisions

to common findings; review email re:

Edgewood exhibits; review email from M.

Patterson re: additional exhibits.
0173172013 TBH Edit Findings of Fact; conference with R.

Gray re: same; review Edgewood’s Plea to

Jurisdiction; conference with R, Gray re:
same; emails exchange with M,

Trachtenberg re: same.

TIMERKLEEPER RECAP

REG  Iil, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

193.50 hrs @
14715 hrs @
129.30 hrs @
18.15 hrs @

488.10

Invoice # 42738

1.40 hrs

5.00 hrs

450.00 hr
17500 fhr
32500 /hr
{00.00 fhr

N/C

$1,625.00

$156,663.75

$87,075.00
$25,751.25
$42,022.50

$ 1,815.00

$156,663.75
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Aunstn, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

February 24, 2013

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#; 42921-1 REG
Curfilet 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing w=cough: 02/24/2013

¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSIONAL SERVICES

01/14/2013 TEH Read Edgewood findings; exchange several 3.50 hrs $1,137.50
emails with D. Hinojosa re: Edgewood
findings and how to coordinate working
together on equity findings; conference with
R. Gray and Richard Gray 1V re: same;
review proposed findings from W. Fierce
and P, Colbert; conference with R, Gray and
Richard Gray |V re: same; exchange eraails
with M. Trachtenberg re: formatting and
generating final document.

01/16/2013 TBH Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray 0.50 hrs $ 162.50
IV re: Edgewood Findings of Fact.
02/01/2013 RGIV Review emails re: exhibits: review Wayne 2.30 hrs $402.50

Pierce’s edited and propcoed findings of
fact; conference with counsel re: findings of
fact; meeting with.counsel re: PowerPoint
for closing argumnent; create same; review
findings of fact
02/01/2013 REG Work re: findings; work re: closing; review 4.75 hrs $2137.50
emails; ®ply to same; review additional
state cxhibits; review M. Sisler email with
additional production; review Edgewood

supplemental exhibits.
02/01/2013 SE] Revise findings; review current lis: of 2.50 hrs $250.00
admitted exhibits and compare to TTSFC 3.00 hrs N/C

Plaintiffs’ exhibit list; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental responses to RFP; review
email from M. Patterson re; exhibits; review
email from M. Patierson re: documents
produced; review email from T. Hunter re:
revisions to findings; review email from 1.
Pina re: trial exhibits; confer with T. Hunter
re: revisions to common findings; review
email re: Plaintiffs’ Plea to the Jurisdiction

gzt Invoice # 42921 Page



02/01/2013

02/02/2013

02/02/2013

02/0272013

02/03/2013

02/04/2013
02/04/2013

02/04/2013

02/04/2013

02/05/2013

02/05/2013

02/05/2013

0201

TBH

RGIV

REG

TBH

REG

RGIV
REG

SE)

RGIV

REG

SE3

and Motion 0 Dismiss; review email re:
11726 trial transcript; revise common
findings; confer with T. Hunter re:
combining Plaintiffs’ findings with common
findings; revise commeon findings; review
email from A. Penn re: Defendants’ exhibits;
review email from M. Lorber re: Efficiency
Intervenors’ Trial Brief; review email from
H. Mcintush re: partial joinder.

Finalize common documents; conference
with R. Gray re: same.

Continue building closing PowerPoint;
email to counsel for review,

Work re: closing; review additional
exhibits; review additional pleadings;
review and reply to emails.

Conference with R, Gray and Richard Gray
1V re: closing argument.

Work re: closing argument; review and
reply to emails.

Trial re: closing arguments.

Altend last day of wial (Day 44); present
clsoing argument; receive Court's ruling;
post decision analysis with clients.

Review emails from T. Hunter re: revisions
to comimon findings; review emails re: FL
Bend 1SD wial exhibits; review enil from
L. Lawrence re: Calhoun County exhibits;
review email from H. Mclntush re: amended
exhibir list; review email fvom T. Hunter re:
forwarding redlined common findings to
counsel; revise findings; confer with T.
Hunter re: additionc] revisions to common
findings; revizw ¢mail from court reporter
re: | 1/28 vial transcript; review email from
H. Mclntich re: exhibits; revise findings.
Anend trial; conference with W. Pierce; R.
Gizy; A. Kaufman and others re: ruling; edit
Fding of Fact; conference with S.Jennings
re: Finding of Fact.

Email Carol Jenson and Della Sawvel re:
exhibits.

Work re: findings; email attorneys re:
meeting with Judge; review emails; reply to
sarne; email findings to M. Trachtenberg.
Confer with R. Gray, 1] re: emailing
common findings to counsel; email counsel
re: same; review and return email from S.
Rosen re: flashdrive left in courtroom;
confer with R. Gray re: Moak engagement
letter; review file re: same.

Invoice # 42921

4(50 hrs

0.35 hrs

3.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

4.75 hrs

7.15 hrs
8.50 hrs

1.70 hrs

7.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

375 hrs

0.40 hrs

$1,462.50
$ 6125

$1687.50

$ 32500
$2137.50
$1251.25
$3825.00

NI

$2,275.00

$ 17.50

$1687.50

KIC
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02/06/2013

02/06/2013

02/0772013

02/07/2013

02/0712013

02/08/2013

02/11/2013

02/12/2013

02/12/2013

02/12/2013

02/13/2013

02/1372013

02/13/2013

02/14/2013

Jozat

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

Review emails; reply 10 same; work re:
findings; review additional exhibits.
Review email from 8. Rodriguez re: D,
Casey deposition changes and signature
pages.

Review file; conference with legal assistant
re: same; organize file.

Review emails; reply to same; work re:
affidavit on attomey fees; review email
from S. Rosen re: 2713 meeting; review 1.
Pena email; review withdrawal of R. Couto.
Confer with R. Gray re: call from M.
Asofsky, Texas ACLU; email M. Asofsky
Plaintiffs’ current pleading; review email
and notice from 1. Pina re: withdrawal of
attomey, R. Couto.

Review emails; reply to same; work re:
attomney fees affidavit.

Review and reply to emails; work re:
attomey fee claim; review R. Freeman
email; reply to same.

Review and reply to email from Tedrah
Robertson re: article for equity center and
STAAR; create exhibit re: FIRST rating for
focus districts; review and reply to emarl
from counsel re: same; review email from
Mark Trachtenberg re: counse!'s edits 1o
omnibus findings of fact; review omnibus
findings of fact.

Review and reply to emsis re: Judge Dietz's
ruling; review emails 12: findings of fact and
exhibits.

Review emails; r2p.y to same; work re:
exhibits; telephons conference with M.
Gallindo rel srhool finance issues; work re:
findings:

Conference with counsel re: atiomeys fees;
miziing with counsel and Judge Dietz re:
findings of fact, final judgment, and time
Hnes for ail.

Review emails; reply to same; review M.,
Trachtenberg email; re: attomey fees;
prepare for 2/13 meeting with Court;
conference with R. Gray re: findings;
review W, Pierce email; reply to same.
Review email from court reporter re: 11/29
transcript; telephone conference with court
reporter re: outstanding invoices; review
emai] from court reporter re: same.

Review emai] from Wayne Pierce re;
ASATR email from Superintendent of

Invoice # 42921

2.75 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.65 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.10 hrs

$1237.50

NIC

$ 87.50

$787.50

NIC

$675.00

$675.00

$280.00

$113.75

£675.00

$437.50

$1170.00

NAC

$367.50

Paped



02/14/2013

02/1572013

02/15/2013

02/15/2013

02/16/2013

02/17/2013

02/18/2013

02/18/2013

02/18/2013

02/19/2013

3024

RGIV

SEJ

REG

REG

RGIY

REG

TBH

RGIV

Ch.41 district; legal research re: attomeys
fees; conference call with counsel re; media.
Review M. Galindo email; review W. Pierce
email; review P. Colbert email; with
findings; conference with T. Hunter re;
findings; review A, Kauffman email with
attachment; review W. Pierce emails (2);
reply to same (2); work re: attomey’s fees
proof and affidavit; reply to various calls.
Emiail exhibits to media; conference with
legal assistant re: Kallison Tour of Texas
and other exhibits; review emails re:
findings of fact,

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
findings; review all bills re: redaction
necessary for attomey's fees affidavit; work
on affidavit; review emails; reply 10 same;
research recovery of expenses.

Confer with R. Gray, 1V re: exhibits; review
admitted exhibits; email C. Jenson and D.
Sawvel re: Ex. 3236; amend TTSFEC exhibit
list; efile and serve amended exhibit list;
confer with T. Hunter and R. Gray, 1V re:
same; review email from D. Sawvel re:
same; review email from Clerk re: amended
exhibit list; review ermail from C. Pacheco
te: letier to Court; review erna’l from 1. Pina
re: amended exhibit list; email M. Jacobs re:
Ex. 3240; confer with R. Gray, 1V re: same.
Brief meeting with attorneys re: findings
and attomey’s fees rroof.

Complete review and redaction of bills re:
attomey’s fees proof,

Legal research re: recovery of attomey's
fees; telephare conference with Mark
Trachtenberg re: same; review and reply to
email-tiom Lacy Lawrence re: same;
teiephone conference (voicemail) with Chris
Piamond re: same; conference with counsel
re: same; meeting with counsel re:
MALDEFs findings of fact and conclusions
of law,

Work re: atiomey’s fees: work re: findings;
review emails; reply to same; review D.
Thompson email re: findings; conference
with T. Hunter re: same.

Work on Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law.

Legal research re: attomey's fees; email Fort
Bend plaintiffs re: same; conference with
counsel re: same; meeting with T, Hunter

Invoice # 42021

1.75 hrs

(.30 hrs

2.15 hrs

(.65 hrs
1.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

4.80 hrs

6.25 hrs

4.00 hrs

4.60 hrs

$787.50

$ 52.50

$967.50

$65.00
N/C

$225.00

$675.00

$840.00

$2812.50

$1,300.00

$805.00

Paged



02/192013

02/19/2013

02/19/2013

0272072013

02/26/2013

02/20/2013

02/20/2013

02/21/2013

SR

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

and D. Hinojosa re: equity findings of fact;
review email from Shelley Dahlberg re:
TTSFC exhibit 3240; revise same and email
to counsel for review; review and revise
redlined version of omnibus equity section;
conference with counsel re: same.

Work re: findings and attorney's fees
claims; review emails; reply to same.
Review emails from C. Wooten re: D. Ray
and B. Wood CV's; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: revised exhibit list.

Work on consolidating equity findings with
Edgewood and Ft. Bend; conference with D.
Hinojosa re: same; edit Conclusions of Law
edits; exchange emails with M. Tractenberg
re: several Findings of Fact.

Review and make comments 1o Paul
Colberst proposed additional findings of
fact and conclusions of law: telephone
conference with Paul Colbert re: same;
email Paul Colbert comments re: same;
conference with counsel re: same; review
emails re: findings of fact; review finding:
of fact and edits to document; email connsel
re: same.

Review and reply to emails; work re:
findings; work re: attomey's fees affidavit;
telephone conference with various
legislators re: status.

Review email from couri reporter re:
admitted exhibits; canpare to TTSFC
Plaintiffs” master exhibit list; review email
from 8. Rosen 127 b, Wood security badge;
telephone conforence with B. Wood's office
re: same; televhone conference with §.
Rosen rz: same; confer with T. Hunter re:
revisions to findings; revise findings.

E¢'t Findings of Fact and conclusions of
Law; exchange emails with D. Hinojosa and
D). Thompsom re: same; exchange emails
with D. Thompson and P. Fraissinet re:
facility findings.

Review and reply to email from Tedrah
Robertson re: article for equity center on
Judge Dietz's ruling; review and reply to
email from Wayne Pierce re: case status;
conference with counsel re: all; legal
research re: attorney’s fees; review caselaw
fe: same; email Wayne Pierce re: State
average M&O revenue per WADA;
telephone conference with Paul Colbert re:

Invoice # 42921

2.75 hrs

G.15hrs

700 hrs

1.80 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

6.00 hrs

3.80 hrs

$1237.50

N/C

$2,275.00

$315.00

$500.00

N/C

$1,950.00

$663.00
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proposed findings of fact and conclusions of
law; revise same; email same o counsel for
review,
02/21/2013 REG Review emails; reply to same; work re: 2.00 hrs $900.00
findings; work re: attorney's fees affidavit
and proof; review calls; retum calls.

02/21/2013 SEJ Review emails re: attomey's fees affidavits. 0.10 hrs N/C
02/21/2013 TBH Draft Findings of Fact. 4.00 hrs $1,300.00
0272242013 RGIYV  Conference with counsel re: exhibts to use 3.600 hrs $630.00

in presentation to the Mexican American
Legislative Caucus; print same; email Marty
Golando re: same and presentation of
exhibits; conference call with plaintiffs
counsel re: findings of fact; conference with
T. Hunter and R. Gray 111 re: same;
conference with counsel re: revisions to
STAAR findings of fact; revise findings of
fact re: focus district STAAR results;
conference with counsel re: same.

02/22/2013 REG Work re: preparation for MALAC meeting; 2.00 hrs $900.00
review emails; reply to same; work re: 0.25 hrs NAC
findings; work re: attomey's fees proof;
telephone call to W. Pierce - left message:
various telephone conferences with
attomeys re: findings.

02/22/2013 SEJ Review email and attachments from M. 0.20 hrs $20.00
Patterson re: additional exhibits; r=view
email from C. Pacheco re: amended exhibit
list and supplemental discavery responses.

02/22/2013 TBH Draft and edit Findings of Fact; patriciate in 6.00 hrs $1,850.00
telephone conference with all Plaintiff
attomey re: FL. Bend Equity Findings;
patriciate in telephone call with M.

Tractenberg, P. Fraissinet, M. Jacobs and
M. Bono re; chiarter findings.

02/23/2013 REG Review araft findings; review and reply to 1.50 hrs $675.00
emails:
0272372013 TBH Centinue 1o edit Findings of Fact; email to 4,00 hrs $1.300.00
M. Jacobs, H. Mclntush and Richard Gray
1V re: same.
02/24/2013 REG Work on findings/conclusions; work re: 1.50 hrs $675.00
attorney's fees affidavit; review and reply to
emails.
T $49,54875
TIMERKEFPER RECAY
REG  llI, Richard E. Gray Parner 61.00 hrs @ 450.00 /r $27.450.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 36.15 hrs @ 175.00 fhr $ 632625
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 4750 hrs @ 325.00 Mr $15,437.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 335 hrs @ 100.00 fr $ 33500
Fee Recap Totals 148.00 $49,548.75

0201 Invoice # 42921 Page &



Exhibit “G”
Gray & Becker Time Records (Reopening of the Evidence)




GRAY & BECKER. P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

February 28, 2013
Tax ID No.: 74-24277406
Invoice#: 43077-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billing througi: 02/28/2013

¢fo Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSTONAL SERVICES
02/25/2013 RGIV  Review findings of fact and make redlined 8.00 hrs $1.400.00
changes to same; meeting with Mexican
American Legisiative Caucus re: status of
Case.
02/25/2013 REG Prepare for meeting with Mexican 3.25 hrs $1,462.50
American Legislative Caucus; work on
findings; work re: attorney's fees: Teview
and reply to emails; work re: final
judgment; conference with mmewmbers of
Mexican American Legislative Caucus re:
status.
02/25/2013 TBH Continue editing Findiags of Fact; emails to 4.50 hes $1,462.50
and from M. Traciitenberg on same; emails
to and from H. Mclntush and D. Hinojosa
re: equity fingings.

02/26/2013 RGIV  Review, revise and check citations for 8.00 hrs £1,400.00
findings of fact.
02/26/2013 REG Review emails; reply to same; work re: 325 hrs $1,462.50

firdings; work re: attorney's fees; telephone
cali with attorneys re: findings and
attorney's fees.

02/26/2013 TBH Review edits made to equity section by H. 8.00 hrs $2,600.00
McIntush; conference with R. Gray and
Richard Gray IV re: same; emails to H.
McIntush and D. Hinojosa re: same; emails
with M.Jacobs re: moving some Findings of
Fact into focus district section; telephone
conference with Plaintiff attorneys re:
deadline for Findings of Fact; correct
citations in equity section of Findings of

2 Invoice #43077 Pags §



02/27/2013

02/27/2013

02/27/2013

02/27/2013

02/28/2013

02/28/2013

TIMERKEEDPER REC AP

RGIV

REG

TBH

REG

SEJ

Fact and continue editing.

Review, revise, and redline changes to
findings of fact; conference with counsel re:
same.

Work re: findings and attorney's fees proof;
prepare notice of filing; review emails; reply
to same.

Continue to check Equity Finds of Fact and
edit Common Findings of Fact; review and
respond to emails re: extension and new
exhibits from State; review LBB chart sent
by W. Pierce.

Work on Findings of Fact; conference with
R. Gray.

Finalize and file attorney’s fees affidavit and
proof; review emails; reply to same; work
re: editing and review of draft findings;
conference with attomeys re: same; review
8. Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same.

Finalize, e-file, and serve Notice of Filing
R. Gray, IlI affidavit on attorney's fees.

REG Il Richard E. Gray Partner 1G.5% hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 18.65 hrs @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 22.50 hes @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal oe 0.50 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 52.15

Wiz Inveice #43077

450.00 /hr
175.00 /br
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

2.65 hrs

225 hrs

7.00 hrs

3.00 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.50 hrs

$463.75

$1,012.50

$2,275.00

$975.00

$787.50

$50.00

$15,351.25

$4,725.00
$3,263.75
$7,312.50

$50.00

$15,351.25

Page 2




GRAY & BECKER. P.C.
900 West Avenue

Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

March 31, 2013

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice #: 43208-01 REG
Our file #: 3102 00001

Tx Taxpayer & Student Faimess Coalition Billing through: 03/31/2013

email to Carolyn Nickell

nickell @equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIHONAL SERVICES

03/01/2013 REG Review and reply to emails; work re: 1.25 hrs $562.50

findings.
03/01/2013 TBH Continue to work on Findings of fact, 2.00 hrs $650.00

review outline for inclusion of MALUDEF
findings and comment; emails ic M. Burn
and H. McIntush about incluzion of our
findings in new section.

03/03/2013 REG Review and reply to varicus emails. 0.75 hrs $337.50

03/03/2013 TBH Respond to M. Jacobs edits; correct anc 3.00 hrs $975.00
Findings of Fact.

03/04/2013 RGIV  Review revised {indings of fact and 5.65 hrs $988.75

conclusions of law; telephone conference
with Wayne 2ierce re: same and case status;
meeting with counsel re: revised findings of
fact; review and revise latests version of
ommibus findings of fact.
03/04/2013 REG Review emails; reply to same; work re: 2.50 hrs $1,125.00
tfindings; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: findings; review email from
court reporter.
03/04/2013 SEJ Email H. McIntush re: revisions to find 0.25 hrs $25.00
review email from H. McIntush re; same;
review email from court reporter re: 12/4
trial transcript; confer with T. Hunter re:
additional revisions to findings; revise
findings.
03/04/2013 TBH Review Equity Findings edited by Ft B 8.00 hrs $2,600.00

- Invoice #43208 Page |




03/05/2013

03/05/2013

03/05/2013

03/05/2013

03/06/2013

03/06/2013

03/06/2013

03/07/2013

03/07/2013

03/07/2013

03/07/2013

03/08/2013

03/08/2013

03/08/2013

o

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

SEJ

RGIV

conference with R. Gray and richard Gray
IV re: same; edit Equity Findings.

Review and revise equity findings of fa
conference call with Thompson & Horton
re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; work on
findings.

Confer with T. Hunter re: revisions to
findings; revise findings.

Continue to edit Findings of Fact;
conference call with Ft, Bend attomey re:
Equity Findings.

Redline equity findings of fact and
conclusions of law; email same to counsel.
Work re: findings; review affidavits re:
review emails; reply to same.

Update Findings of Fact and cross chec
different versions.

Review and revise equity findings ot fa
review emails from Holly Mclrtush re:
same; conference with counseaive: same;
review email from counsel 1e: proposed
findings; review email from Holly McIntush
re: findings of fact.

Review email; rep!y.io same; review ar
edit findings; revicw attomney fee affidavits;
work re: judginents.

Review and retum email from D. Swer

re: trial trauscripts and invoice for same.
Review proposed judgment and edit Eq
Findings; review Ft. Bend edits to Findings
of Fact Equity section; respond to H.
MclIntush re: same; review proposals for
final order.

Review Conclusions of Law; review an
reply to email from counsel re: same.
Review emails; reply to same; review
summary; conference with M. Trachtenberg
re: same; conference with T. Hunter re:
findings; work re: conclusions of law.
Edit Conclusions of Law and Executive
Summary.

Invoice #43208

5.90 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

6.00 hrs

5735 hrs

2.25 hrs

4.00 hrs

2.30 hrs

2.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.85 hirs

1.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

$1,032.50

$675.00

$20.00

$1,950.00

$1,006.25

$1,012.50

$1,300.00

$402.50

$1,125.00

$20.00

$650.00

$148.75

$787.50

$325.00

Pape 2




03/10/2013

03/10/2013

03/11/2013

03/11/2013

03/11/2013

03/12/2013

03/12/2013

3t

REG

RGIV

RGIV

REG

Review and reply to emails; review
summary statement; edit same; review
additional findings; edit same.

Review MALDEF edits to equity findir
and respond; review emails from M.
Trachtemberg re: issues in adequacy
documents.

Review and add cites to equity findings
fact; email same to H. McIntush, D.
Hinojosa, and M. Bono; conference with
counsel re: same; review citations for
findings of fact relating to Wayne Pierce;
conference call re: all findings of fact.
Review emails; reply to same; finalize
findings, judgment, and summary;
conference with attomeys re: same;
telephone conference with attomeys re:
findings, judgment, and summary.

Final edits to Common Findings of Fac
equity section; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa, H. McIntush, D. Thoinpson,
Richard Gray IV re: equity findings and
Conclusions of Law; tel¢rhone conference
with all attorneys re: issues in adequacy
section; conference with R. Gray and
Richard gray IV alout same; email to W.
Pierce and R! Ifreeman re: Anton: review
response.

Review emails re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; review email exchange
between M. Trachtenberg and R. Gray III
re:-findings of fact regarding weights;
review findings of fact re: same; conference
with counsel re: same; review completed
edition of equity findings of fact; review
email from counsel re: same; review
testimony of Wayne Pierce re: weights;
conference with counsel re: same; review
and reply to emails re: finalizing findings of
fact and final judgment.

Review emails; reply to same; last worl
findings, judgment, and summary;

Invoice #43208

1.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

3.45 hrs

3.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

2.05 hrs

3.00 hrs

$787.50

$325.00

$603.75

$1,350.00

$2,600.00

$358.75

$1,350.00

Page 3




03/12/2013

03/13/2013

03/13/2013

03/14/2013

03/14/2013

03/15/2013

03/15/2013
03/15/2013

03/15/2013

03/16/2013

03/17/2013
03/18/2013

03/18/2013

ke

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

REG
SEJ

REG

REG
RGIV

conference with attomeys re: same.
Consider suggested edits to Findings of
and respond; final edits to Proposed
Judgment and Executive Summary.
Review Proposed Final Judgment;
conference with counsel re: same and
findings of fact; telephone conference with
Amy Saberian from Craig Enoch's office re:
filing of proposed final judgment.

Email W, Pierce re: findings and
conclusions; email W. Pierce re: Intervenor
findings; review emails; reply to same;
review completed version of findings.
Telephone conference with Ray Freem:
and Wayne Pierce re: legislative happenings
and questions; email counsel re: same and
scheduling; review emails re: findings or
fact.

Review findings and conclusions ¢f
Intervenors; review draft judgm=nt of
Intervenors; review and reply ¢ emails.
Review email from M. Jacous re: findii

of fact; review and reply to email from
counsel re: same; emati counsel re: fixing
issue with 3189-A.

Review emails; izply to same.

Confer with k. Gray, IV re: Baker exhi
admitted and withdrawn; review Eighth
Amended Cxhibit List; email R. Gray, IV
re: same.

Review edits to Findings of Fact and
Conclusions of Law; email from M. Jacobs
re: Pierce cuts and respond.

Review M. Jacobs email; review revise
findings; review T. Hunter email; reply to
same; review Edgewood findings; review
State's objections.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same
Review emails re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; conference with legal
assistant re; exhibits.

Review emails; reply to same; review {

Invoice #43208

2.00 hrs

0.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.60 hrs

2.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.65 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.15 hrs

0.80 hrs

$650.00

$131.25

$675.00

$105.00

$1,125.00

$52.50

$225.00
$20.00

$130.00

$292.50

$90.00
$26.25

$360.00

Puge 4




03/19/2013

03/19/2013

03/19/2013
03/20/2013

03/20/2013

03/20/2013

03/21/2013

03/21/2013

03/22/2013

3102081

RGIV

TBH
RGIV

REG

SEJ

SEJ

REG

Diamond email; review to C. Diamond
letter to Court; review State's request for
findings and conclusions.

Meeting with counsel, Wayne Pierce, a
Ray Freeman re: case status and legislative
action.

Conference with W, Pierce, R. Freema
Hunter, and R. Gray, IV re: status,
legislative action, and new developments;
review material provided.

Meet with W. Pierce and R. Freeman.
Telephone conference (voicemail) with
Mark Trachtenberg re: attomeys fees
reposne filed by that State; same re: David
Hinojosa; Telephone conference with with
Mark Trachtenberg re: same.

Review amended opposition to attorney
fees filed by State; review amended reqaest
for findings; review emails re: attomey's
fees; conference with S. Jennings re:same;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: attomey's
fees opposition.

Review emails re: State's yesponse to
request for attorney's fees; confer with R.
Gray re: same; review State's exhibit; email
R. Gray re: same; telephone call to S.
Hemandez re: State's exhibit - attempted,
left message: telephone conference with S.
Hemandcz; email attormeys re: same.
Review 5. Dahlberg email; reply to san
review email from court reporter; review
aimznded objections of State to attomney's
tees.

Review email from S. Hemandez re:
amended response to request for attomey's
fees and amended exhibit.

Review emails from court reporter; rev:

S. Dahlberg emails; reply to same; review
emails; review findings (draft); review M.
Thompson email; review HB3S; email W.
Pierce and R. Freeman re: same; review R.
Freeman email; reply to same; reply to D.

Invoice #43208

0.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.80 hrs
0.25 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.55 hrs

0.10 hrs

2.00 hrs

$131.25

$450.00

$260.00

$43.75

$315.00

$90.00

$247.50

$10.00

$900.00

Page 5




03/23/2013

03/24/2013

03/25/2013

03/26/2013

03/26/2013

03/27/2013

03/27/2013

03/27/2013

3001

RGIV

REG

RGIV

Thompson email; review P. Fraissinet
email; reply to same; review emails; reply to
same.

Review email from Rep. Strama's offic
reply to same; review Intervenors’ brief;,
review P. Fraissinet email; review attormey
fee joint response; email R. Gray, IV and T.
Hunter re: same.

Review T. Hunter email; review M.
Thompson email.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review
Pierce email; review R. Freeman email;
review memo; review C. Nickel email;
review S, McCown email; reply to same;
reply to emails; review P. Colbert emails
with attachments; review M. Troop email.
Review TREE Intervenors brief on
proposed findings of fact; review propesed
draft reply of plaintiffs; conference with
counsel re: same; reply to all plamtiffs re:
TTSFC are ok with the response; review
plaintiff's response to defendant's second
amended response to plamtiff's motion for
attorney fees; review einail from H.
Mclintush re: draft teply to Defendant's
response to Plainti ff's Motion for Attorneys
Fees.

Review J. Turner email; review H.
McIntusix email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review Y. Tumer email.

Review redlined version of Plaintiff's d
reply on attommey fees; review emails from
counsel re: same; review inserts to plaintiffs
draft reply to defendants response to
plamtiffs request for attorneys fees.
Review emails; reply to same; review e
from T. Martinez-Fisher's office; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review and
reply to emails; work re: attomey's fees
response; conference with T. Hunter re:
same.

review joint reply to the State's objectic

Invoice #43208

0.75 hrs

0.15 hrs

1.45 his

1.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.15 hrs

0.85 hrs

2.50 hrs

$337.50

$67.50

$652.50

$227.50

$180.00

$201.25

$382.50

$812.50

Page &




03/28/2013

03/28/2013

03/29/2013

RGIV

REG

REG

fee response; draft insert on TTSFEC fees;
review objection to Intervenors Findings of
Fact.

Review and redline changes to plamtiff
draft reply to defendant's second amended
response to plaintiffs request for attorneys
fees; conference with counsel re: same;
review and reply to emails re: same; review
emails re: changes to travel expense
language; review exhibits to MALDEF
portion of reply to defendants second
amended response to plaintiff's request for
attorneys fees.

Review emails; reply to same; review js
reply on attorney fees; review joint reply on
Intervenors’ claims.

Review Edgewood supplemental filing
affidavits.

1.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

FIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals

EELEARH

35250 @
32.60 hrs @
40.70 hrs @
__l8shse@
110.40

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

Invoice #43208

$245.00
$225.00
$225.00
$34,980.00
$ 15,862.50
$ 5,705.00
$ 13,227.50
$  185.00
$ 34,980.00

Page?




GRAY & BECKER, P.C,

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
April 30,2013
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 43596-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 04/30/2013

email to Carolyn Nickell
nickell@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERMICES
04/01/2013 REG Review emails; reply to same; email M. 0.40 hrs $180.00
Trachtenberg re: status; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same.
04/03/2013 REG Review message from D. Thompson; 0.40 hrs $180.00
telephone call to D. Thompson re:
legislative action; review emails t¢: exhibits
(3).
04/04/2013 RGIV  Review email and attached chart from 0.15 hrs $26.25
Wayne Pierce re: 2014-2015 funding of
school districts.
04/04/2013 REG Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 2.00 hrs $500.00
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review additional emails; reply to same;
review M. Cavcia email; email W. Pierce re:
same; reply to M. Garcia re: same; review
emaiis (4); reply to same; review message
from M. Garcia; telephone conference with
M. Garcia re: same; review M. Galindo
email; reply to same; conference call with
attorneys re: legisiative action; review
message from D. Hinojosa; telephone
conference with D. Hinojosa re: final
judgment issues.

04/05/2013 RGIV Conference with counsel re; case status and 0.15 hrs $26.25
telephone conference re: legislative action.
04/05/2013 REG Work re: legislative matters; review emails; 1.90 hrs $855.00

reply to same; conference with T. Hunter re:
status; conference call re: legislative action.

Az Invoics #43506 Page 1




04/07/2013

04/08/2013

04/08/2013

04/09/2013

04/09/2013

04/10/2013

04/10/2013

04/11/2013

It

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

REG

REG

Review T. Hunter email; review M.
Trachtenberg email.

Review emails from counsel, Ray Freeman,
and Wayne Pierce re: meeting to discuss
legislative action and case status.

Review D, Stewart email; email W. Pierce
and R. Freeman re: status; review M.
Trachtenberg email; telephone conference
with M. Trachtenberg re: status.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
meeting with Wayne Pierce and Ray
Freeman; meeting with Wayne Pierce and
Ray Freeman re: case status, legislative
action, and moving forward; email counsel
re; same,

Review and reply to emails from R.
Freeman and W. Pierce; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: status and 4/9
meeting; review L. Moak email; review T.
Hunter email; reply to same; coni=rence
with R. Gray, IV, W, Pierce and R. Freeman
re: status, possible exhibits, and possible
hearing; review R. Freeman emails (2);
reply to same (2).

Conference with legal assistant re: filing for
post trial; review West Orange Cove [l re:
court allowed ‘2ap number; review emails
amongst plaintiff counsel re: potential basis
for new heecings and whether or not equity
will be'a topic of argument or discussion.
Reviaw and reply to emails; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same (2);
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to
same (2); review D. Thompson email,
review T. Hunter email re: findings.
Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; email W. Pierce re: status and new
developments; review R. Freeman email;
review D, Thompson email; telephone
conference with W. Pierce, R, Freeman and
P. Colbert re: status; review R, Freeman

Invoice #43596

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.75 hrs

1.89 hrs

2.35 hrs

0.75 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.15 hrs

$225.00

$35.00

$337.50

$315.00

$1057.50

$131.25

$540.00

$517.50

Page 2




04/12/2013

04/12/2013

04/13/2013
04/15/2013
04/16/2013

04/16/2013

04/16/2013

04/17/2013

04/17/2013

ez

RGIV

RGIV

REG

email; review message from 8. McCown;
review 5. McCown email; telephone call to
S. McCown re: status,

Review email from T. Robertson re: Equity
Center Litigation Update; conference with
counsel re: same.

Review and reply to emails; review T.
Robertson email; reply to same; review T.
Robertson email; reply to same; review
additional emails; reply to same.

Review T. Hunter email; reply to same.
Review and reply to emails.

Review emails among plaintiff's counsel re:
hearings with Judge Dietz.

Meeting with Wayne Pierce, Ray Freeman,
and counsel re: case status and status of
legislature; review Charter Plaintiff's
Response to State's 2nd Amended Re<ponse
to Attorneys Fees.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; review draft

letter to Court; review D. Hinojosa email;
reply to M. Trachtenberg eirall; review W.
Pierce emails (2); reply to same; review P.
Fraissinet emails (2); review D. Hinojosa
emails (2); review M. Trachtenberg emails
(2); reply to same: review W. Pierce emails
(2); reply to sanie; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; conference with W.
Pierce and R, Freeman re: status and draft
letter to . Dietz; review Charter Schools'
reply on fees.

Tzlcphone conference with Plaintiff's
counsel re: findings and

Jjudgment and possibility of additional
hearings; conference with R. Gray 1l re:
same; review email from Ray Freeman re:
additional hearings exhibits; review email
from Wayne Pierce re: article regarding
school finance legislation and the adequacy
case.

Review R Freeman email; reply to same;

conference with R. Gray, IV re: conference call;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same; review R.

Invoice #43596

0.45 hrs

0.95 hrs

0.25 hrs
0.50 hrs
0.20 hrs

1.35 hrs

2.80 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.65 hrs

$78.75

$427.50

$112.50
$225.00
$35.00

$236.25

$1260.00

$175.00

$292.50

Page 3




04/18/2013

04/18/2013

04/19/2013

04/19/2013

04/21/2013
04/22/2013

04/22/2013

04/22/2013

04/23/2013

Moz

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

REG

RGIV

Freeman email.
Review email from Mark Trachtenberg re:
findings of fact and final judgment; review
findings of fact with highlighted areas.
Review updated transcript; review M.
Trachtenberg email.
Review emails from R. Gray Il and D.
Hinojosa re: position on further hearings,
issuing of findings of fact and final
judgment.
Forward M. Trachtenberg email to W.
Pierce; email D. Hinojosa and D. Thompson
re: same; review M. Bono email; review S.
McCown email; reply to same; review
message from W. Pierce; telephone
conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman
re: status; email M Trachtenberg re: post
trial hearing; review D. Hinojosa email: review
R. Freeman email; review M. Trachteaberg
email; reply to same; review W 1'ierce
email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
reply to same.
Review T. Hunter emails; reply to same,
Review highlighted findings of fact
regarding possible ciianges as a result of
legislative action.
Review email from Wayne Pierce re:
Legislative Rudget Board analysis on fixing
the systemn:; continue reviewing highlighted
findings of fact re: possible changes due to
impsct of legislative action.
Review emails; reply to same; review W.
Pierce emails (2); review LBB memo to
Senator Davis; review P. Colbert email.
Review letter from Calhoun County
re: affect of possible legislation;
draft reply letter; conference with counsel
re: same; review and reply to email from D.
Hinojosa re: reply letter; revise letter;
review email from D. Thompson re: same;
email revised letter to counsel for
comments; review edits made by Fort Bend
Plaintiff's; conference with counsel re:

Invoice #43596

1.63 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.25 hrs
1.65 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

3.10 hrs

$288.75

$225.00

$35.00

$720.00

$112.50
$288.75

$455.00

$270.00

$542.50

Paged



04/23/2013

04/24/2013

04/25/2013

04/25/2013

04/26/2013

3102-01

RGIV

same; reply to email; conference with legal
assistant re: finalizing of letter; review
highlighted findings of fact and conclusions
of law re: legislative changes.

Review M. Trachtenberg email;

email W, Pierce and R. Freeman;

email D. Hinojosa and D.

Thompson; review draft reply to

Calhoun County letter; review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; finalize letter

email M. Trachtenberg re: same;

review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Hinocjosa email; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: same; review D. Thompson email.
Finalize and send letter re: findings

and judgment; review B. Schulman emails
(2); reply to same (2); review W. Pierce
email; review J. Tumner email; review D/
Hinojosa email; review J. Turner email;
review draft letter; forward same

to W. Pierce and R. Freeman; iéview D.
Hinojosa email; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to sarae; review P,
Fraissinet email; reply tc same.

Review email from 2. Hinojosa re: Calhoun
County reply letter in

response to our ietter; conference with
counsel re: ¢conference call with all counsel
of record; Telephone conference with
plaintiffs counsel re: letters

and imoving forward; conference with
counsel re: same; email P. Fraissinet re:
dates that will not work to meet with Judge
Dietz.

Conference with R. Gray, IV re: attorney
conference call; review emails re; meeting
with Court; review emails re: letter

and conference call; conference with

R. Gray, IV re: same; review emails re:
conference calls (8); review

R. Freeman emails (2); reply to same (2).
Review T, Hunter emails (2); reply to same
(2); work re: findings.

Invoice #43596

1.40 hrs

1.65 hrs

0.80 hrs

1.05 hrs

0.50 hrs

$630.00

$742.50

$140.00

$472.50

$225.00

Page §




04/29/2013 REG Review P. Fraissinet email; review C. 0.65 hrs $292.50
Jenson email; conference with attorneys re:
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same.

04/30/2013 REG Telephone conference with attorneys re: 0.60 hrs $270.00
status; review M. Trachtenberg email;
conference with attorneys re: same; review
D. Thompson email; reply to same.

$13,878.75
HIMEREEPER RECAP
REG Il Richard E. Gray Partner 24.60 hrs @ 45000 fhr $11,070.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 16.05 hrs @ 17500 /hr $2,808.75
Fee Recap Totals 40.65 $13,878.75

kHertid invoice #43506 Page &




GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

May 31, 2013

Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition

email to Carolyn Nickell
nickell@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

04/05/2013

05/01/2013

05/01/2013
05/02/2013

05/03/2013

05/04/2013

05/05/2013
05/06/2013

05/06/2013

05/07/2013

05/07/2013

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG
REG

REG

REG

REG
RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

PROFESSION AL SERVICES

Telephone conference regarding

timing of judgment and legislative actions.
Telephone conference with Ray Freemari re:
Education Group meeting and proposat of
new legislative money; telephone
conference with R. Gray 11l re: same.
Review emails; reply to same.

Conference with R. Gray, 1V re/ R. Freeman
call and legislative status.

Review C. Nickell email; reply to same;
review C, Nickell email.

Email C. Nickell r<: 6/24 meeting; review
W. Pierce emaii; review legislative analysis;
reply to W. Picrce email.

Review W_Pierce email; reply to same.
Review cmail and articles within re:
self-segregation of underfunded and
underperforming Texas Public Schools;
review email from Wayne Pierce re:
updated $3500 figure.

Review C. Nickell email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email with attachments;
review C. Nickell email.

Review email from counsel re: updated
$6576 figure.

Review C. Nickell email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter
email; reply to W. Pierce and T. Hunter
emails; review C. Nickell email; email D.

Invoice # 43643

Tax ID No.:
Invoice: 43643-1
Our file 3102
Billing through:

0.50 hrs

0.55 hrs

0.25 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.35 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.85 hrs

74-2427406

REG
00001

05/31/2013

$162.50

$96.25

$112.50
$90.00

$90.00

$157.50

$90.00
$140.00

$180.00

$17.50

$382.50

Page 1




05/08/2013

05/08/2013
05/08/2013

05/08/2013

05/09/2013

05/10/2013

05/10/2013

05/11/2013

05/13/2013

05/13/2013

05/13/2013

05/14/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG
REG

REG

RGIV

REG

REG

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

Thompson re: status; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; conference with T. Hunter re:
contacting B. Baker.

Review email from counsel re: Bruce
Baker's Report and Supplemental Report re:
$6,630 and $6,576; review both Reports;
email pertinent parts to T. Hunter.

Review T. Robertson email; reply to same.
Review emails; reply to same; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: analysis of
legislation.

Review emails from W. Pierce and R. Gray
regarding $3,500; review B. Baker report;
email to B. Baker.

Review T. Robertson email; reply to same;
email T. Hunter re: same; review email
correspondence; reply to same.

Review email from Ray Freeman re:
legislative update and billing.

Review message from M. Galindo;
telephone conference with M. Gatindo re:
budget issues; review R. Freeman email;
reply to same; review R. Froeman email.
Review T. Hunter email; reply to same;
email T. Robertson restatus; email W.
Pierce re: status of analysis; email T. Hunter
re: B. Baker.

Review email re: conference of Equity
Center and mesting with Wayne and Ray re:
exhibits,

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review T. Robertson email; reply to same;
confer with R. Gray, 1V re: briefing; review
T. Hunter email re: B. Baker; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
conference with attorneys re: status; review
T. Hunter email re: B. Baker call; forward
same to W. Pierce.

Telephone conference with B. Baker re:
Cost Wage Index for 2012; email to R. Gray
re: same.

Review email from Della Sawvel re: trial
transcript; review email from Wayne Pierce
re: rescheduling of meeting; conference

Invoice # 43643

1.35 hrs

0.15 hrs
0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.15 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.25 hrs

$236.25

$67.50
$225.00

$65.00

$135.00

$35.00

$112.50

$180.00

$17.50

$517.50

$65.00

$43.75

Page 2




05/14/2013

05/14/2013

05/15/2013

05/16/2013

05/16/2013

05/16/2013

05/17/2013

05/18/2013

05/19/2013

05/20/2013

05/21/2013

05/21/2013

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

REG

REG

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

with counsel re: same.

Review emails; email D. Thompson re:
status; review D). Thompson email; reply to
same; review email from court reporter;
confer with S. Jennings re: transcript; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: 5/15 meetings; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email.

Respond to email from M. Hunter re: update
of status of case.

Review D. Thompson email; reply to same;
telephone conference W, Pierce re: data
analysis and model; review emails; reply to
same.

Meeting at Equity Center re: database and
legislative update.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: 5/16 meeting
preparation; confer with W, Pierce and stai¥
re: analysis of new legislation and funding.
Attend meeting on legislative action &t
Equity Center with R. Gray, R. Gray; 1V,
W. Pierce, P. Colbert, and R. Freeman.
Review emails; reply to same; tclephone
conference with attorneys re: budget status.
Review W. Pierce email, reply to same;
review D. Thompson einails (4); review P.
Fraissinet email; repiy to all.

Review emails /8); reply to same; review T.
Hunter email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson «nail; reply to same; review T.
Hunter eniail; reply to same.

Review emails re: budget; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: model;
wanous emails and calls re: status of
findings and judgment; review W. Pierce
emails (2); reply to same (2); review emails;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
budget analysis and model to evaluate;
prepare for 5/21 meetings; review T. Hunter
email; reply to same.

Travel to MoakCasey re: meeting with Fort
Bend plaintiffs re: legislative update and
action; return to office; email MoakCasey
analysis to Wayne Pierce and Ray Freeman.
Review articles re: budget status; confer

Invoice # 43643

0.85 hrs

0.10 his

G.€5 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.60 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.70 hrs

2.05 hrs

2.20 hrs

$382.50

$32.50

$292.50

$306.25

$720.00

$520.00

$180.00

$540.00

$540.00

$765.00

$358.75

$990.00

Page 3




05/23/2013

05/24/2013
05/24/2013

05/28/2013

05/28/2013

05/28/2013

05/29/2013

05/29/2013

05/30/2013

05/31/2013

3102-01

RGIV
REG

RGIV

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

with attorneys re: status and legislative
outlook; review T. Hunter emails (2); reply
to same (2).

Review L. Moak email; reply to same;
review L. Moak reply; review P. Fraissinet
email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; confer with attorneys
re: status of matters.

Meeting at Equity Center re: post-trial data.
Review W. Pierce emails (2); rely to same;
confer with R. Gray, 1V re: 5/24 meetings;
review R. Freeman emails (4); reply to same
(4); confer with W. Pierce, R. Freeman and
R. Gray, IV re: potential exhibits for
potential hearing; review L. Moak email;
review R. Freeman emails; reply to same.
Review email from Ray Freeman re:
legislative update; review email from
counsel re: same.

Review email from Tedrah Robertson re:
status of Judge Dietz's ruling.

Review emails; reply to same; review R
Freeman material provided; roview T.
Robertson email; reply to same.

Review email and attacked articles from
Wayne Pierce re: Lobwo v. State - Colorado
Supreme Court education decision.

Review P. Fraissinct email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review W. Pierce
emails (2); repiy to same; review material
re: Coloredo decision; review R. Freeman
email; reply to same; review P. Fraissinet
emoii; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review R. Freeman email; email M.
Trachtenberg email re; status; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
D. Hinojosa email; review P. Fraissinet
email.

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review emails re: 5/30 call; prepare for call;
telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:
Colorado case and 5/30 conference call;
conference call with attorneys re: status and
strategy.

Review email from Stacey Rosen re:

Invoice # 43643

0.40 hrs

2,00 hrs
2.85 s

0.15 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.15 hrs

1.85 hrs

0.30 hrs

$180.00

$350.00
$1,282.50

$26.25

$17.50

$630.00

$52.50

$517.50

$832.50

$52.50

Page 4




conference with Judge Dietz; email counsel
re: same; review emails from counsel of
record re: conference availability with Judge
Dietz.

05/31/2013 REG Confer with T. Hunter re: status and status 2.40 hrs $1,080.00
conference; review emails re: scheduling;
review email correspondence; telephone
conference with attorneys re: status and
strategy; review S, Rosen email; confer with
R. Gray, IV re; same; email W, Pierce re:
same; review W, Pierce email; reply to
same; review N. Bunker-Henderson email;
review other emails re: status hearing;
confer with T. Hunter re: status conference;
telephone conference with W. Pierce and R.
Freeman re: status conference; review R,
Freeman email.

0573172013 TBH Review email from court re: conference 0.50 hrs $162.50
with attorneys; conference with R, Gray 1=
same; telephone conference with R. Gray,
W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: same.

$14,030.00
LIMEREEPER RECAY
REG  III, Richard E. Gray Partner 2505 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $11,272.50
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 10.00 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $1,750.00
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner \ 3.10 brs @ 325.00 /hr $1,007.50
Fee Recap Totals 38.15 $14,030.00

3102-01 Invoice # 43643 Page 5




GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

June 30, 2013

Tx Taxpayer & Student Faimess Coalition

ematl to Carolyn Nickell
nickell @equitycenter.org

Re: Schoeol Finance Litigation

PROLESSIONAL SERVICES

06/03/2013

06/04/2013

06/04/2013

06/04/2013
06/05/2013

06/05/2013

06/05/2013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

TBH
RGIV

REG

TBH

Conference with counsel re: meeting with
Judge Dietz; review emails re: same; review
and reply to email from Kavita Desai from
Children at Risk re: amicus brief.
Telephone conference with David
Thompson re: hearing with Judge Dictz on
post legislative action; email counsel e
same; telephone conference wiih counsel re:
same; telephone conference with David
Hinojosa re; same.

Review S. Dahlberg emails (2); review S.
Rosen email; review C. Diamond email;
review R. Freeman‘eimail; review emails
(5); reply to same.

Conference with R. Gray IV re: hearing,
Review and repiy to email from counsel re:
hearing wiii Judge Dietz on legislative
action. hearing with Judge Dietz; email
recovtit of hearing to R. Gray I and T,
Hunter; meeting with Wayne Pierce and
kay Freeman re: same; draft summary of
hearing for coalition members; email same
to counsel for review and approval; email
sommary to Ray Freeman for distribution.
Review R. Gray, IV email; review R, Gray,
IV email re: hearing; review D. Hinojosa
email; review D. Thompson email; review
R. Gray, IV emails; reply to same; review
email re: transcript; review T. Hunter email.
Review R. Gray IV's summary of hearing
and comment; review transcript of hearing

Invoice # 44022

Tax ID No.:

Invoice# 44022-1
Cur file# 3102
Billing through:

0.50 hrs

1.05 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.20 hrs
3.20 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.50 hrs

74-2427406

REG
00001

06/30/2013

$87.50

$183.75

$360.00

$65.00
$560.00

$270.00

$162.50

Page |




06/06/2013

06/08/2013

06/10/2013

06/10/2013

06/11/2013

06/11/2013

06/11/2013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

and conference with R. Gray and R. Gray
1V re: same via e-mail.

Review case file; conference with counsel
re: same; Telephone conference with L.
Londergan re: case status; review email and
attached spreadsheet from Mark T. re:
hearing availability.

Review R. Gray, IV email; review R,
Freeman email; reply to same; email R.
Gray, 1V re: meeting and exhibits; review
reply; review M. Trachtenberg email; email
R. Gray, IV re: same; review email re:
meeting re: exhibits; email W. Pierce re:
same.

Conference with counsel re: case status;
review email from counsel re: hearing
availability; update spreadsheet re: same;
email spreadsheet to T. Hunter re:
availability; telephone conference with
Wayne Pierce re: same.

Review R. Freeman email; review message
from D. Thompson; confer with R. f3ray, IV
re: status and 6/19 hearing; work re:
exhibits; review M. Trachtenberg email;
reply to same; review D. Cawes email;
review Starr results; email W. Pierce re:
same; review W. Pierce email; review M.
Trachtenberg emaii; cmail R. Gray, IV re:
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same; review M. Trachtenberg email;
reply to sarie re: equity position; review M
Trachteriberg email; reply to same;
telephone conference with B. Schulman re:
statns.

Telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
hearing availability; meeting with counsel
re: hearing availability and strategy.
Review B. Schulman email; reply to same;
email D. Hinojosa re: strategy; review D.
Hinojosa email; reply to same; confer with
R. Gray, IV and T. Hunter re: hearing dates,
strategy, and status; review emails; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same.

Conference with R. Gray and R. Gray TV re:
open days for hearing,

Invoice # 44022

0.50 hrs

0.75 hrs

0.55 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.65 hrs

0.85 hrs

0.20 hrs

$87.50

$337.50

$96.25

$787.50

$113.75

$382.50

$65.00

Pape 2




06/12/2013

06/12/2013

06/12/2013

06/13/2013

06/13/2013

06/14/2013
06/14/2013

06/15/2013
06/17/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV
REG

REG
RGIV

Review and reply to email from Tedrah 0.35 hrs
Robertson re: Ray Freeman’s hearing

availability; calendar same; review emails

between counsel of record re: Motion to

Reopen the Evidence and conferencer call

regarding same.

Review T. Robertson email; reply to same; 2.35 birs
telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:

strategy; review M. Trachtenberg email;

review additional emails; review W. Pierce

email; review T. Hunter emails (2); review

B. Schulman email; review draft motion to

reopen; review M. Trachtenberg email;

review T. Hunter email; reply to same;

review D. Hinojosa email; review emails re:

conference call; reply to same.

Attend meeting at Equity Center re: 2.60 hrs
preparation for potential hearing; conference

with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re: same;

telephone conference with W. Pierce re:

strategy.

Meeting at Equity Center with Wavne and 2.10 hrs
Adam Pierce re: status of new exhibits;

conference with counsel re: hearing

availability; email M. Trachienberg re:

same.

Confer with T. Huntes, K. Gray, IV and W, 1.90 hrs
Pierce re: hearing aud exhibits; review M.

Trachtenberg etnail; reply to same; email M.

Trachtenberg ve: schedule; review M.

Trachtenberg'reply.
Review Motion to Reopen the Evidence. 0.35 hrs
Review W. Pierce email; telephone 1.05 hrs

coni=ience with P. Fraissinet re; status and

A4 call; reply to W, Pierce email,

conference call with attomeys re: Motion to

Reopen; review W. Pierce email; reply to

same; review M. Trachtenberg email,

review D. Hinojosa emails (2).

Work on position statement. 0.75 hrs
Review and reply to email from D. Hinojosa 0.80 hrs
re: Judge Dietz comments regarding the use

of 2011-12 data during trial; review trial

testimony re: same; review emails re: topics

for post-legislative hearing; review and

reply to email from Kavita Desai re: Amicus

Invoice # 44022

$61.25

$1,057.50

$845.00

$367.50

$855.00

$61.25
$472.50

$337.50
$140.00

Page 3




06/17/2013

06/18/2013

06/18/2013

06/19/2013

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV

Bref.

Work re: preparation for 6/19 hearing;
telephone call to W. Pierce - left message;
review and revise answers for spreadsheat;
email W, Pierce re: same; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same (2); review W, Pierce
emails (2); reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa email; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; email M.
Trachtenberg re: spreadsheet response;
review M. Trachtenberg email; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: status of
matters; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D. Thompson email; review B.
Schulman email.

Review emails between R. Gray Il and D.
Hinojosa re: response to motion {o recpen
the evidence; conference with counsel re:
bearing with Judge Dietz; review
Edgewood’s Response to Calhoun County’s
Motion to Reopen the Evidence; review
spreadsheet on parties positiors pertaining
to potential hearing; review Fort Bend
plaintiff's Response to Caihoun County’s
Motion to Reopen the Evidence.

Review message from L. Moak; telephone
call to L. Moak - lefi message; review M.
Trachtenberg eqail; review D. Hinojosa
emails (2); renly to same; review D.
Hinojosa Cuourt filing; email W. Pierce re:
same; prepare for 6/19 hearing; review
Motiot to Reopen; forward same to W.
Piercs; review R. Freeman emiail; reply to
zame; review W. Pierce emails (2); reply to
same (2); email W. Pierce re: exhibits;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce emails (2); reply to same
(2); review Ft. Bend pleading.

Conference with counsel re: hearing with
Judge Dietz and meeting with TTSFC

Coalition; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: same; prepare for hearing; hearing

with Judge Dietz; review emails from
counsel, D. Hinojosa and Shelly Dhalberg
re: data to use for hearing and experts;

Invoice # 44022

2.20 hrs

1.60 hrs

3.00 hrs

3.00 hrs

$990.00

$280.00

$1,350.00

$525.00

Page 4




06/19/2013

06/19/2013

06/20/2013

06/21/2013

06/21/2013
06/23/2013
06/24/2013

06/24/2013

06/24/2013

3102-01

REG

TBH

REG

TBH
REG
RGIV

REG

SE]

telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
update on hearing with Judge Dietz,
Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 3.80 hrs
review Edgewood filing; prepare for
hearing; attend hearing on Motion to
Reopen; post hearing conference with
attorneys and clients; email S. Dahlberg re:
database; email D. Hinojosa re: experts;
review D. Hinojosa emails (3); review S.
Dahlberg email; review advisory to Court;
email W. Pierce re: exhibits; review T.
Hunter email; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review Court

Order.

Review order on hearing; review emails 0.20 hrs
from various attomeys discussing upcoming

hearing.

Confer with T. Hunter re: pleadings and 2.00 hrs

January hearings; review W. Pierce email,
reply to same; review W. Pierce email;
review TEA website; begin work on bill
analysis; review S, Dahlberg emaii; teview
C. Diamond email; reply to sarae; review D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; email T. Hupter rel saine; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review B.
Schulman email.

Review additional twanscript; review court 1.00 hrs
reporter email; veview emails (7) re:
spreadsheet and scheduling order; reply to

same.

Review cranscript of 6/19 hearing. 0.20 hrs
Prepaie for 6/24 presentation. 0.75 hrs
Travel to Equity Center conference; 3.15 hrs

conierence; retum to office; meeting with

counsel re: same and case status; Telephone

conference with Wayne Pierce re: CFO

witness and compiling of bills having an

impact on equity.

Make status presentation to the Coalition; 2.25 hrs
conference with attomeys re: Scheduling

Order and legislation; review transcript of

6/19 hearing; review D. Hubbard email;

review W, Pierce email; reply to same;

review emails ; reply to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: amended 0.20 hrs

Invoice # 44022

$1,710.00

$65.00

$900.00

$450.00

$65.00
$337.50
$551.25

$1,012.50

$20.00

Page 5




06/24/2013

06/25/2013

06/25/2013

06/25/2013

06/26/2013
06/26/2013

06/27/2013

06/27/2013

06/27/2013

06/27/2013
06/28/2013

06/28/2013

06/30/2013

3102-01

REG

SEJ

SEJ
TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

pleadings; review file re: same; telephone
conference with District Clerk re: same;
confer with T. Hunter re: updated list of
districts; email T. Robertson re: same;
review email form T. Robertson re: same;
review and compare representative districts
in 7th amended petition with current list of
districts.

Attend meeting at Equity Center;
conference with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re:
preparation for January hearings; begin
amending pleadings.

Review emails; reply to same; confer with
attomeys re: exhibits and trial strategy.
Review emails from T. Hunter re; ISD
Plaintiffs’ FOFs and COLs; review
documents submitted; email T. Hunter re:
same.

Draft Amended Petition; email R. Pierce
with questions.

Revise Eighth Amended Petition.

Draft Amended Petition; conference with R,

Gray IV re: numbers.

Review email from T. Hunter re: TTSFC
eighth amended petition; review email from
W. Pierce re: data to use,

Review draft amended petition; review W.
Pierce email; replyio same; review R.
Freeman email; review C. Gaynor email;
reply to same.

Revise Eighth Amended Petition; email T.
Hunter rg; same; telephone conference with
Advanced Discovery re: Houston local
offive, confer with attomeys re: same,
Review draft of Petition.

Review Order on Motion to Reopen the

Evidence; review and reply to email from
Tedrah Robertson re: 13th Annual Seminar
on School Finance and Legal Issues.
Review draft pleading; telephone
conference with J. Garza re: status and
settings.

Review emails; reply to same; work on
compliance with 7/17 deadline.

Invoice # 44022

2.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.50 hrs

1.00 hrs
1.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.9C brs

0.70 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.75 hrs

0.50 brs

0.50 hrs

$812.50

$225.00

$20.00

$812.50

$0.00
$585.00

$17.50

$405.00

$0.00

$65.00
$131.25

$225.00

$225.00

$19,536.25

Page 6




FIMERERPER RECAL

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

2820 hrs @
18.65 hrs @
10.90 hrs @

2.10 hrs @

59.85

Invoice # 44022

450.00 fr
175.00 /hr
32500 fr
100.00 /hr

$12,690.00
$3,263.75
$3,542.50

S 4000

$19,536.25

Page7




GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

July 31, 2013

Tax ID No.: 74-24277406
Invoice#: 44215-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 07/31/2013
email to Carolyn Nickell
nickell@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERNVICES

07/01/2013 RGIV  Review email from D. Hinojosa re: meeting 0.65 hrs $113.75
of plaintiff's counsel at Thompson &
Horton; telephone conference with Kavita
Desai re; Amicus Brief: review email from
H. MclIntush re: meeting tomorrow.

07/01/2013 REG Review H. McIntush email; review 1.85 hrs $832.50
attachments; reply to same; review 1.
Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa
emails (2); reply to same (2); confer with R.
Gray, IV re: potential amicus brief; prepare
for 7/2 meeting with attormneys; telephone
conference with B. Schuiman re: 7/2

meeting.

07/02/2013 RGIV  Review and reply io email from T. Hunter 0.10 hrs $17.50
re: amended petition.

07/02/2013 RGIV  Review propased scheduling order; 2.95 hrs $516.25

conferenc2 with counsel re: same; meeting
at Thomuson & Herton re: case status,
schednling order; telephone conference with
B.D: Chambers office re: effects of
legislative changes.

07/03/2013 RGIV - Review email sent from R, Gray Il to S. 0.85 hrs $148.75
Dahlberg re: data base to use during trial;
conference with counsel re: case status;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
re: data base; telephone conference with T.
Hunter re: meeting yesterday; review email
from 8. Dahlberg re: data base, discovery,
scheduling order; review email from D.
Hinojosa re: availability for meeting; review
revised scheduling order.

3102-01 Invoice # 44215 Page 1




07/03/2013 REG Review draft amended petition; review S. 1.90 hrs $855.00
Dahlberg email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: W, Pierce
call; review 8. Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to S.
Dahlberg email; review D. Dahlberg emails
;reply to same; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
scheduling order; review D. Hincjosa emails
(2); reply to same; review M. Trachtenberg

email.

07/03/2013 REG Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 0.45 hrs $202.50
email S. Dahlberg re: database.

070512013 REG Review emails re: scheduling; review S. 0.30 hrs $135.00
Dahlberg email.

07/07/2013 REG Review S. Dahlberg emails (2); review 0.35 hrs $157.50
proposed scheduling order.

07/08/2013 RGIV  Review email from Wayne Pierce re: 0.35 hrs $61.25

TTSFC 8th Amended Petition; review
emails from S. Dahlberg re: proposed
scheduling order.
07/08/2013 REG Review W. Pierce email; review T 1.05 hrs $472.50
Robertson email; review emails w:
scheduling order; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review S. Dahiberg
email; review emails (6) te: pleadings.
07/09/2013 RGIV ~ Review emails frora R. Gray I, D. 0.60 hrs $105.00
Thompson, and M. Trachtenberg re: list of
bills to consider at hearing; review emails
from counsel of record re: meeting on
proposed scheduling order; review emails
from piaintiffs counsel re: hist of legislation
affecting Judge Dietz decision; review email
from W. Pierce re: STAAR retake passing
rate.,
07/09/2013 REG Confer with R. Gray, IV re: W. Pierce 1.35 hrs $607.50
report and exhibits; email attomeys re:
spreadsheet; review various attomey emails;
review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;
review S. Dahlberg email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review C. Diamond
email; review D. Thompson email; review
D. Hincjosa email; review emails (4); reply
to same,
07/10/2013 RGIV  Review email from H. Mclntush re: 0.15 hrs $26.25

3102-01 Invoice # 44215 Page 2




0771072013 REG

07/11/2013 RGIV

07/11/2013 REG

07/12/2013 REG

07/13/2013 REG
07/15/2013 RGIV

3102-01

spreadsheet of major bills; print same for

counsel.

Review §. Dahlberg email; work on 1.00 hrs
scheduling order; review L. Moak email,;

review D. Thompson email; review H.

McIntush email with attachments; forward

same to W. Pierce.

Review email from W. Pierce and R. Gray (.45 hrs
I re: spreadsheet of legislative bills; review

spreadsheet.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same (2); 145 hrs

review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review draft spreadsheet; review L. Moak
email; forward same to W. Pierce; review

D. Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review Ft. Bend's production
requests; review Ft. Bend amended Petition;
review W. Pierce email.

Review emails (5); reply to same; review T, 3.40 hrs
Hunter email; reply to same; review drafi
scheduling order; review H. Mclntush
email; email W. Pierce re: status ;prepare
for conference call with attorneys; review

D. Hinojosa email; review P. Fraissinet
email; review M. Trachtelbeig email;
conference call with attorneys re:
spreadsheet and scheduling order; review T.
Robertson emails (2} reply to same (2).
Outline deadlines 0.50 hrs
Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 1.55 hrs
amended peiition and data to use at trial;
conference with counsel re: scheduling
order, amended petition, and exhibits and
expeit report; review emails from counsel of
y=vord re: scheduling order, bill list, and
ameneded petition; review Fort Bend
Plaintiff's request for production to
defendants; review email from W. Pierce re:
summary of data to use at January trial;
forward same to counsel for comment;
review proposed scheduling order; email
pertinent dates to W. Pierce; conference
with counsel re: data base to use for trial;
review and reply to email from W. Pierce

re: FY 14 data pitfalls and one page
summary on data to use; email W. Pierce re:

Invoice # 44215

$450.00

$78.75

$652.50

$1,530.00

$225.00
$271.25

Page 3




07/15/2013 REG

07/16/2013 RGIV

07/16/2013 REG

0711772013 RGIV

3102-01

legislative bills list.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: amended 1.35 hrs
pleadings, bill list, and expert reports;
review correspondence; review H. McIntush
email; review draft scheduling order; reply
to H. McIntush email; review W. Pierce
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: database
and call to D. Hinojosa; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review W. Pierce analysis of data to
be used; review H. McIntush email; reply to
same.

Review and reply to email from Wayne 5.15 hrs
Pierce re: legislative bills; review summay
of proposed data to use in trial; revise same;
conference with counsel re; same; send
same to D. Hinojosa for review; review and
reply to email from T. Robertson re:
scheduling order; review and reply to email
from H. McIntush re: scheduling order And
legislative bilis list; review Fort Bend Sixth
Amended Petition; review emails froun W,
Pierce and R. Gray IIl re: data and exhibits
to chare with MALDEF; review emails re:
proposed scheduling ordes; 1cview emails
from counsel of record re: proposed
scheduling order and <isclosure of trial
testimony; review TTSFC eight amended
petition; revise same.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: 7/17 deadline; 1.75 hss
work re: agiced upon database; review D.
Hinojosa email; review W. Pierce email;
reply tG same; review 8. Dahlberg email;
review draft scheduling order; reply to S.
Dahlberg email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review H. McIntush email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review S. Dahlberg
email; reply 10 same; review other emails;
review P. Fraissinet email; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D,
Hinojosa emiails (2); review P. Fraissinet
email; review M. Lober email.

Review and revise TTSFC eighth amended 2.60 hrs
petition; add current coalition facts to same;
conference with counsel re: same; review
emails from counsel of record re: proposed

Invoice # 44215

$607.50

$901.25

$787.50

$455.00

Page 4




01717/2013 REG

07/18/2013 RGIV

07/18/2013 REG

077192013 RGIV

07/19/2013 REG

3102-01

scheduling order and list of proposed bills;
email revised eighth amended petition to
counsel, W. Pierce, and R. Freeman for
review and approval.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review M,
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
B. Schulman email; review M. Lober email;
review emails (6); reply to same re:
scheduling order; review D. Hinojosa email;
reply to same; review L. Schwartz email;
review 5. Dahlberg email; review emails
(13); reply to same re: scheduling and bills;
review draft amended petition; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: same; review M. Lorber
emails (2); review H. McIntush email;
review additional emails (5).

Conference with counsel re: case update and
Equity Center Summer Conference; outline
comments for Equity Center Summer
Conference; telephone conference with wW.
Pierce re; same; review and reply to email
from T. Hunter re: eighth amended petition.
Review S. Hemandez emails (2); review
advisory to Court with attachments; review
abjections by State to schaduling order;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review
advisory to Court by ISUs re: legislation;
confer with R, Gray, IV re: superintendent
presentation; review H. Mclntush email,;
review D, Thampson advisory to Court;
review State’s advisory re: legislation.
Confererice with counsel re: trial data use
agreement with the parties; equity center
suruiner conference; TTSFC eighth
amended petition; email W. Pierce and R.
Yreeman re: TTSFC Eighth Amended
Petition, data for Summer Conference, and
vocational bill number; review emaiis from
W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: data to use
and legislative bills list; conference with
counsel re: same.

Work re: exhibits and database; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: amended petition; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: superintendent
presentation and exhibits; review D,
Hinojosa email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:

Invoice # 44215

2.20 brs

1.75 hrs

1.70 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.20 hrs

$990.00

$306.25

$765.00

$87.50

$540.00

Page §




077222013 RGIV

0772212013 REG

07/23/2013 RGIV

077232013 REG

07/24/2013 RGIV

07/24/2013 REG

31902-01

same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to

same; review W, Pierce email; reply to

same.

Review emails from W. Pierce and R. 1.20 hrs
Freeman re: TTSFC Eighth Amended

Petition; telephone conference with W.

Pierece and T.Wolf re: same; revise

comments for Equity Center Summer

Conference; review and reply to email from

W. Pierce re: difference between TEA and

LBB data and gaps with both; review and

reply to email from counsel re: same;

review and reply to email from counsel re:

Eighth Amended Petition; review and reply

to email from W. Pierce re: same; review

and reply to email from W. Pierce re:

amending of petition.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 0.55 hrs
email R. Gray, IV re; same; review R. Gray,

IV emails (2); review W. Pierce email.

Review and reply to email from W, Picrce 2.70 hrs
re: TTSFC Eighth Amended Petition; email

D. Hinojosa re: data to use at trial: review

emails re: data to use during trial; review

and reply to email from ¥/ Pierce re:

summer conference and data in amended

petition; review and rsply to email from

David H. re: data to vse at trial; review

comments madz by R, Freeman re: Eighth

Amended Petition; reply to same with

comiments; ieview comments for Summer

Conferenice; conference with counsel re: all;

listen to. voicemail from H.D. Chambers re:

vocaiional track; telephone conference with

‘W Pierce re: summer conference comiments

and data numbers; telephone conference

with H.D. Chambers re: vocational track

expert.

Review W, Pierce email; review T. Hunter 0.55 hrs
email; review R. Gray, IV email; reply to

same; review W. Pierce email,

Review and revise TTSFC Eighth Amended 1.15 hrs
Petition; email same to counsel, W. Pierce,

and R. Freeman for review; go over remarks

for Summer Conference.

Review emails; review draft amended 0.30 hrs

Invoice # 44215

$210.00

$247.50

$472.50

$247.50

$201.25

$135.00

Page 6




07/25/2013

G7/25/2013

07/26/2013

07/26/2013

07/26/2013

07/21/2013

07/2772013

07/29/2013

07/29/2013

07/29/2013
07/30/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

SEJ
RGIV

petition.

Review comments for Summer Conference;
review legisiative bills list; travel to surnmer
conference; give trial update; return from
summer conference.

Review amended petition; email clients re:
same; review W. Pierce email.

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce
re: summer conference and amended
petition and filing of same.

Review email from counsel re: eighth
amended petition; telephone conference
with counsel re: same.

Telephone conference with R. Gray, I'V re:
amended petition; review W. Pierce email;
review W. Pierce email.

Review emails from counsel of record re:
8/23 meeting.

Review D. Thompson emails (2); review 1.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
D. Thompson email; reply to same; review
D. Thompson email; reply to same; review
W. Pierce email; review D. Hinojosa email;
email R. Gray, IV re: same.

Review, revise and finalize Y1SFC Eighth
Amended Petition; conference with legal
assistant re: filing of came; review notice of
filing of Eighth Asmizirded Petition;
telephone conforence with W, Pierce re:
meeting on Wednesday re: data.

Confer with ., Gray, IV re: Petition; review
message from D. Thompson; telephone call
to D. Thompson - left message; telephone
conterence with D. Thompson re: equity
ssue and testimony; review W, Pierce
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: W, Pierce
meeting.

E-file and serve Eighth Amended Petition.
Review edits and comments made by P.
Colbert to TTSFC Eighth Amended
Original Petition; comment on same and
email to W. Pierce; review Proposed
Scheduling Order; conference with legal
assistant re: same and calendaring of same;
review email from Carol Jenson re:
proposed scheduling order and Rule 11

Invoice # 44215

4.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

020 hrs

0.35 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.85 hrs

0.50 hrs
1.25 hrs

$857.50

$135.00

$35.00

$35.00

$157.50

£17.50

$337.50

$262.50

$382.50

$0.00
$218.75

Page 7




07/30/2013 REG

07/31/2013 RGIV

07/31/2013 REG

07/31/2013 SEJ

07/31/2013 SEJ

Agreement.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: W. Pierce
meeting and report status; review message
from M. Bono; telephone call to M. Bono -
left message; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; review M. Trachienberg
email; review D. Thompson email; review
C. Jenson email.

Review MCA Initial Thoughts summary;
review email from W, Pierce re: same;
email counsel of record re: Proposed
Scheduling Order and Rule 11 Agreement;
review email from H. McIntush re: Rule 11
Agreement and Proposed Scheduling Order;
reply to saine; review same; conference with
counsel re: same; email all counsel of record
re: approving of same; review and reply to
email from W. Pierce re: summer
conference outline.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: Rule 11
agreement re: schedule; work on ameaded
petition; review L. Moak email; revisw L.
Moak memo re; analysis to be undertaken;
review H. Mcintush email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review email Rulz 1 | agreement (2);
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review B. Schulinan email; review W,
Pierce email; roply to same; review W.
Pierce reply.

Confer vith R. Gray, IV re: Scheduling
Order; review and calendar Scheduling
Order deadlines.

Caiendar Scheduling Order deadlines;
review message from M. Bono; telephone
call to M. Bono re: Scheduling Order.

TIMEKEERER RECAP

REG I Richard E. Gray Pariner 27.75 hrs @
RGIV Gray, IV, Richard E. 3210 brs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 2.20 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 62.05
3102-01 Invoice # 44215

0.80 hrs

1.23 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.70 bhrs

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$360.00

$218.75

$675.00

$0.00

$0.00

$18,105.00

$12,487.50
$5,617.50

$ 000

$18,105.00

Page 8




GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

August 31, 2013
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 44451-1 REG
Qur file#: 3102 00001
Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 08/31/2013

email to Carolyn Nickell
nickell@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSION ALSERY 1CES |

08/01/2013 RGIV  Review email from H. MclIntush re: Fort 0.20 hrs $35.00
Bend 5th Request for Production and
scheduling order.

08/01/2013 REG Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 1.30 hrs $585.00
review email correspondence; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re: trial
strategy; review W, Pierce email: reply to
same; review W, Pierce emails (2}; reply to
same (2); review H. Mcintush email; review
D. Hinojosa email; review D. Hinojosa
email re: experts; reply. io/same.

0R/02/2013 REG Review 5th production request; review 0.65 hrs $292.50
email correspondenice; review S. Dahlberg
email; review 8, Dahlberg correspondence.

08/03/2013 REG Review emaii ve: judgment and findings; 3.75 hrs $1,687.50
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review J. Dietz emails (2) re: working
sessions and findings; review D. Thompson
email, review court reporter email; review
sartial transcript; review D, Hinojosa email;
review C. Pacheco email; review Calhoun
County amended petition; forward to W.

Pierce.

08/05/2013 RGIV Review Court's Final Judgment; conference 1.25 hrs $218.75
with counsel re: same.

08/05/2013 REG Review M. Trachtenberg email; review 1.00 hrs $450.00
findings re: equity.

08/06/2013 RGIV  Review Judges proposed findings of fact 1.00 hrs $175.00

and conclusions of law; conference with
counsel re: same.

3102-01 Invoice # 44451 Page |




08/0712013 REG

08/08/2013 RGIV

08/08/2013 REG

08/08/2013 SEJ

08/09/2013 RGIV

08/05/2013 REG

3102-01

counsel re; meeting at Equity Center; email
W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: same; review
email from W. Pierce re: same; review
findings of fact and conclusions of law;
conference with counsel re: same.

Work re: findings and trial preparation;
work re: preparation for 8/8 meetings;
review W. Pierce email; review W. Pierce
email re: Plano TRE; review Efficiency
Intervenors’ amended petition; email W.
Pierce re: same.

Review WOC Il and Edgewood IV re:
suitability; conference with counsel re: same
and parties amended petitions; prepare for
meeting at Equity Center; meeting with W.
Pierce and R. Freeman re: exhibits, trial
strategy, and case status.

Review Charter Intervenors’ amended
petition; forward to W. Pierce; confer with
S. Jennings re: series from Dallas Morning
News; confer with R. Gray re: West Urange
Cove analysis; telephone call to M,
Trachtenberg - left message; mview W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review
amended petitions (Charters; Edgewood,
Efficiency, and Ft. Bend); review M.
Trachtenberg email; repiy to same; confer
with R. Gray, IV, W Pierce, R. Freeman,
and T. Robert=Gn re: database and exhibits;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same.

Confer with R. Gray re: Dallas Moming
News articles re: school finance legislation;
telephone conference with T. Stutz re: same;
cunfer with R. Gray re: status.

Review articel re: Plano ISD TRE; review
emails from W. Pierce re: same; review
article by W. Pierce re: Conflation of M&O
and 1&8; review article for InDepth by Paul
Colbert.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review
M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
confer with S. Jennings re: research
funding/accountability issues; review draft
articles; email W. Pierce/R. Freeman re:
same; review R. Freeman email; telephone

Invoice # 44451

1.30 hrs

4.55 hrs

3.65 hrs

0.75 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

$£585.00

$796.25

$1,642.50

$0.00

$87.50

$675.00

Page 2




08/10/2013 REG

08/11/2013 REG
08/12/2013 RGIV

08/12/2013 REG

08/13/2013 RGIV

08/13/2013 REG

08/14/2013 RGIV

3102-01

conference with M. Trachtenberg re:
findings.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review J. Turmner email.

Work re: database and exhibits.
Review emails from W. Pierce re: exhibits

and data questons; respond to same; review
FOF re: Moak estimate; email H. McIntush
re: same; review scheduling order; email D.
Thompson and P. Fraissinet re: same;
review and reply to email from T. Hunter re:
working sessions with Judge Dietz; review
email from R. Freeman re: Baker $6,576
number; review Baker Report; reply to
email from R. Freeman; review State
Defendants response to Fort Bend plaintiff’s
fourth request for production; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review emails; reply t0 same; review
request or court reporter; review S.
Dahlberg letter; review Star's discoveiy
responses; confer with 8. Jennings ro: same;
review M. Trachienberg emails(2); review
P. Fraissinet email; confer with K. Gray, IV
re: discovery.

Review email from Shelley Kofler re:
school finance article and needed exhibits;
conference with counsel re; same; send
counsel exhibiri: reply to email from
Shelley Kofle: re: attached exhibits; review
article by Shelley Kofler; review email from
M. Trachicnberg re: telephone conference
on 8/156 re: trial strategy; review amended
petitions of parties.

LConfer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review
school finance research; work re: exhibits;
review school finance research; work re:
exhibits; review M. Trachtenberg email;
reply to same; review P. Fraissinet email;
review M. Trachienberg emails (2); reply to
same (2); review P. Fraissinet email; review
M. Trachtenberg emails (2).

Review Calhoun County Plaintiff's Second
Amended Petition; comapre to previous
petition; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: exhibits.

Invoice # 44451

(.20 hrs

0.50 hrs
1.45 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.10 hrs

1.10 hrs

1.60 hrs

$90.00

$225.00
$253.75

$630.00

$192.50

$495.00

$280.00

Page 3




08/14/2013

08/15/2013

08/15/2013

08/16/2013

08/16/2013

08/18/2013

08/19/2013

08/19/2013

08/20/2013

3102-01

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG
RGIV

RGIV

Review emails; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same.

Review Second Amended Petition of
Charters; review emails from W. Pierce re:
data; review emails from D. Thompson re:
meeting of counsel; review email from W.
Pierce re; Moak/Odden numbers; review
Defendant’s Notice of Withdraw of Request
for Findings of Fact and Conclusions of
Law.

Review 1. Pena email; review
correspondence; review D). Thompson
email; reply to same; work re: database;
work re: exhibits; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; review L. Moak email;
review H. McIntush email; review W.
Pierce email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; review D. Thompson email; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review D,
Thompson email; review State’s Motica to
Withdraw Findings and Conclusion
Conference call amongst Plainaits
attorneys re: trial strategy.

Prepare for 8/16 conference call; conference
call with attorneys re: findings, judgment
and 8/20 meeting with Tudge; review W.
Pierce email; review T. Robertson emails
2).

Work re: findings.

Review email from W. Pierce re:

confidential thoughts; forward same to
counsel; conference wtih counsel re: data
emall from W. Plerce; reply to same; review
nroposed findings of fact and conclusions of
law,

Review W. Pierce emails (2); confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review email re: status
conferences; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
Scheduling Order and W. Pierce report;
review email re: 8/23 meeting; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: 8/20 meeting with Court.
Review Conclusions of Law; meeting with
counsel of record and Judge Dietz re:
findings of fact and conclusions of law;
email W. Pierce re: Moak’s Tax Rate Seek

Invoice # 44451

0.45 hrs

2.15 hrs

1.80 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

1.00 hrs
1.35 hrs

0.95 hrs

3.90 hrs

$202.50

$376.25

$810.00

$87.50

$562.50

$450.00
$236.25

$427.50

$682.50

Page 4




08/20/2013

08/20/2013

08/21/2013

08/21/2013

082212013

08/23/2013

08/23/2013

08/23/2013

08/25/2013

08/26/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

REG

REG

RGIV

numbers.

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce
re: inefficiency of the system,

Prepare for working session with Court;
attend working session with Court and
counsel; review 8. Rosen email.

Review email from Isable Pina re:
conference call on findings of fact; check
calendar re: same; review emails from R.
Gray I and D. Thompson re: availability
for conference call; review email from M.
Trachtenberg re: same; review Judge Dietz's
memo re: findings of fact.

Review W. Pierce email; review Court's
memo re: findings; confer with attormeys re:
status; review 1. Pena email; reply to same;
review D. Thompson email; review M,
Trachtenberg email.

Review W. Pierce email; review findings;
review Judge memo; prepare for 8/23
meeting; review emails; work re:
preparation for 8/23 meeting.

Conference with counsel re: Juage Dietz’s
memo on findings of fact and meeting of
counsel re: same; review ineio and notes
made on same; meeting with plaintiff's
counsel and Moak Caosey; email I. Pfifer, T.
Wallis, M. French, %/, Pierce, and G.
Salazar re: designation of fact witnesses;
conference with counsel re: same.
Telephone vontference with Jerilyn Pfifer re:
fact witriess.

Prepare for meeting with attorneys; confer
with-U. Thompson, P. Fraissinet, H.
MicIntush, J. Tumer, M. Trachtenberg, L.
Moak, C. Mayfield, and D. Casey re:
hearing preparation, reports, witnesses, and
findings of fact; work re: witness
designations.

Work re: witness designation; review
findings.

Review and reply to email from T. Hunter
re: first working session with Judge Dietz;
scan Judge Dietz's memo and email same to
T. Hunter; conference with legal assistant
re: designation of fact witnesses; draft

Invoice # 44451

0.10 hrs

3.10 hrs

1.55 hrs

1.10 hrs

1.25 brs

4.05 hrs

0.30 hrs

3.75 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.15 hrs

$17.50

$1,395.00

$271.25

$495.00

$562.50

$708.75

$52.50

$1,687.50

$225.00

$376.25

Page 8




08/26/2013 REG

08/26/2013 SEJ

08/27/2013 RGIV

08/27/2013 REG

08/28/2013 RGIV

08/28/2013 REG

3102-01

Designation of Trial Witnesses; telephone
conference with secretaries of Gonzalo
Salazar and Tom Wallis re: same; telephone
conference with H.D. Chambers re:
vocational track and conference call with R.
Gray III re: same; review and reply to email
from W. Pierce re: funding; email counsel
re: designation of fact witnesess; review and
reply to email from W, Pierce re:
fundraising; conference with legal assistant
re: filing of Designation of Trial Witnesses;
review email re: Fort Bend ISD witness
designation.

Review T. Hunter email; review W. Pierce 1.00 hrs
emails (2); email R. Gray, IV re: same;
review designation of fact witnesses; review
Fi. Bend witness designation; review
Charter's fact witness designation; review
Calhoun County witness designations;
review Edgewood witness designation;
review Efficiency Intervenors’ witness

designation.

Efile and serve Plaintiffs’ Designiation of 0.50 hrs
Trial Witnesses.

Review all parties of recoid designations of 1.95 hrs

fact witnesses; review emails from H.
Mclntush and D. Hinojosa re: revised
findings of fact; review edited findings of

fact.

Review emails; reply to same; review W, 0.50 hrs
Pierce emails/(2); reply to same (2).

Telephoue conference with plaintiff's 1.55 hrs

counse! re: findings of fact; conference with
conigel re: same; review D. Hinojosa's
moposed ELL and ED outline; review and
reply to email from M. Trachtenberg re:
Order on Defendant’s Objection to have
documents distributed in in camera
meetings public record; review email from
H. Mcintush re: same; review emails from
D. Hinojosa, D. Thompson, and M.
Trachtenberg re: same; review email from
M. Trachtenberg re: judicial privilege.
Review 8, Dahlberg email; review H. 1.55 hrs
Mcintush emails (2); review revised outline
for findings; review D. Hinojosa email;

Invoice # 44451

$450.00

$0.00

$341.25

$225.00

$271.25

$697.50

Page &




0872972013 RGIV

08/29/2013 REG

3102-01

review 1. Pena email; review C. Pacheco
email; review D. Hinojosa email; confer
with R, Gray, I'V re: conference call on
findings; review M. Trachtenberg emails
(2).

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce 2.20 hrs
re: data; forward same to counsel;
conference with counsel re: same; review
email from Stacey Rosen re: proposed order
of Judge Dietz re: State’s Objection to
privileged documents concerning working
sessions of findings of fact; review email
from S. Dahlberg re: agreed upon data set;
review email from D. Hinojosa re: data to
use at trial; review propsed email to Judge
Dietz and revised proposed order re: judicial
privilege; conference with counsel re: same;
review emails from counsel of record re:
sealing of records; Telephone conference
with Tom Wallis re: possible testimony,
review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
letter to Judge Dietz; telephone conterence
with W, Pierce re: meeting on daia
presentation and expert report.

Review M. Trachtenberg enizils (5); review 4.25 hrs
M. Jacobs email; review D. Thompson
emails (3); review D..ilinojosa emails (2);
review H. McIntush cmail; review message
from M. Trachtenberg; telephone call to M.
Trachtenberg - left message; email L. Moak
re: data; review L. Moak reply; reply to
same; review additional emails re: draft
order; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review T. Hunter email; review T.
Qoberison email; reply to same; review T.
kobertson email; review W. Pierce email;
email S. Dahlberg re: database; telephone
call to M. Trachtenberg - left message;
review email from J. Dietz re: PIA; review
S. Dahlberg email; email W. Pierce re:
same; review W. Pierce emails (2; reply to
same; email S. Dahlberg re: database; email
M. Trachtenberg re: draft order; review M.
Trachtenberg; review D. Hinojosa email,
reply to same; review K. Jaime email; reply
to same; calendar 9/5 meeting re: report;

Invoice # 44451

$385.00

$1,912.50

Page 7




08/30/2013 RGIV

08/30/2013 RGIV

08/30/2013 REG

review R. Freeman email; review L.
Schwartz email; review letter to Court;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review
revised draft order; review draft email to
Court; confer with R. Gray, IV re: response;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hinoiosa email; review L.
Moak email; reply to same; review S,
Dahlberg email re: FIA letter/order; review
D. Thompson email.

Review email from S. Dahlberg re: State's
proposed order and view on first working
session with Judge Dietz.

Review email from M. Trachtenberg to
Judge Dietz re: proposed orders on judicial
privilege.

Review D. Hinojosa email with findings;
review S. Dahlberg email; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); review D.
Thompson email; reply 10 same; review M,
Trachtenberg emails (2); review M. Bano
email; review D). Thompson email.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG [, Richard E. Gray Partner 2085 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 35.70 hrs @
SEJ] Jennings, Susan Paralegal 1.25 hrs @

Fee Recap Totals 76.80
3102-01 Invoice # 44451

040 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.05 hrs

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
100.06 /hr

$17.50

$17.50

$472.50

$24,180.00

$17,932.50
$ 6,247.50

$ 0.00

$24,180.00
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

200 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

September 30, 2013

Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition
email to Carolyn Nickell

nickell@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROEESSTONAL SERVICES

09/0212013 REG

09/03/20i3 RGIV

09/03/2013 RGIV

09/03/2013 REG

3102-01

Review S. Dahiberg correspondence; review
disclosure requests; review interrogatories;
email clients re: same; email R. Gray, IV re:
responding to same; review Edgewood
disclosure requests.

Review emails from counsel re: State’
Second Request for Disclosure and 5zcond
Set of Interrogatories; conferenca with legal
assistant re; same review email from D,
Hinojosa re: findings of fact; conferencw
with counsel re: same; review State's
Second Set of Interrocatories; review WOC
i1 for definitions of terms in Second Set of
Interrogatories; review Brief in Support of
Reopening the Evidence; review TTSFC
Second Requezt for Disclosure to
Defendants; conference with legal assistant
re: saric; review emails from M.
Trachtenberg and C. Diamond re: status
mesting availability; review supplemental
expert report of W, Pierce; review State's
objections and responses to Fort Bend's
Fifth Request for Production.

Review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
status conferences and findings of fact;
review email from D. Thompson re: same.
Review M. Trachtenberg email; review D,
Thompson email; review P. Fraissinet
email; reply to same; review W. Pierce
email; review D. Hinojosa email; email S.
Dahlberg re: status meeting; confer with R.

Invoice # 44680

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 44680-1
Our file#: 3102
Billing through:

0.65 hrs

2.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.90 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
09/30/2013

$292.50

£507.50

$35.00

$1,305.00

Page 1




09/03/2013 SEJ

09/04/2013 RGIV

09/04/2013 REG

09/04/2013 SEJ

3102-01

Gray, IV re: call on findings; review email
from court reporter; review additional
transcript; review 5. Dahlberg email; email
attomeys re: status meetings; review C.
Diamnond email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
disclosure request; review W. Pierce email;
review draft report; review D. Hinojosa
email; review H. McIntush email.

Confer with Richard E. Gray, IV re: 1.25 hes
Request for Disclosure to State Defendants,
Response to Defendant’s Second Set of
Interrogatories and Second Request for
Disclosure; prepare Request for Disclosure;
calendar discovery deadlines; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; finalize and serve
Request for Disclosure to Defendants.
Review Supplemental Expert Report of W. 4.25 hrs
Pierce; Telephone conference with H.D.
Chambers and counsel re: HB 5
Endorsements; conference with counsel re:
same; review emails from plaintiffs counsel
re: findings of fact and conferencze call;
email W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: data on
districts of Superintendents-vee may call at
trial; review Defendant’s Request for
Disclosure; draft and finzlize response to
same; review Defendant’s responsive
documents to Fo«t 2end ISD Fifth Request
for Production; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review scheduling order;
review apa reply to email from M., Jacobs
re: updated service list; review email from
B. Chester re: State's responses to Fort
Bend’s Request for Disclosure.

Review email re: disclosures; review 2.10 hrs
correspondence re: Ft. Bend discovery;
review M. Jacobs email; review emails re:
call on findings; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
pretrial matters; review D Thompson email;
review H. MclIntush emails (2); review D,
Hinojosa email; telephone conference with
H.D. Chambers re: HBS effects; review
additional transcripts; telephone conference
with L. Moak re: data analysis.

Serve Plaintiffs’ Responses to Defendants’ 0.20 hrs

Invoice # 44680

$125.00

$743.75

$945.00

$0.00

Hage 2




09/04/2013 SEJ

09/05/2013 RGIV

09/05/2013 REG

09/06/2013 RGIV

09/06/2013 REG

3102-01

Request for Disclosure.

Draft Response to Defendants’ Requests for
Disclosure; draft Objections and Answers to
Defendants’ Second Set of Interrogatories.
Meeting at Equity Center re: data, exhibits,
and W. Pierces's expert report; conference
with counsel re: dates for status conferences
with Judge Dietz; email counsel of record
re: same; review emails from D. Hinojosa,
C. Diamond, and D. Thompson re: same.
Confer with R. Gray, IV, W. Pierce, A.
Pierce and R. Freeman re: report and
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same; review additional
transcripts; work on scheduling status
conferences; review D. Hinojosa email;
review D). Thompson email; review
additional discovery responses.

Review Thompson & Horton's edits to brie’
on reopening the evidence; review email
from W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: same;
reply to emails and send my edits op same;
conference with counsel re; all; revisw
affidavits of Lynn Moak and Joe Wisnoski;
review and reply to email from'W. Pierce
re: edits to expert report; review edits and
comments to proposes findings of fact and
conclusions of law; conference with counsel
re: same, confersnce call with Calhoun, Fort
Bend, and MAIDEF re: structure of
findings; tel¢phone conference with Ray
Freeman re: ial brief; conference with
counse! re: same; email 5. Dahlberg and N.
Bunler-Henderson re: status conference
avauability; email B. Schulman re: same;
telephone conference with W. Pierce and R.
Freeman re: brief to Judge Dietz re:
reopening of the evidence; redline edit and
comment on draft trial brief; email same to
counsel of record.

Review State’s response to Ft. Bend
discovery; review brief re: reopening
evidence; email clients re:; same; review W,
Pierce emails (2); reply to same(2); review
R. Freeman's emails; confer with R. Gray,
IV re: same; email L. Moak re: data review;

Invoice # 44680

1.00 hrs

3.75 hrs

347 hrs

5.40 hrs

2.60 hrs

$100.00

$656.25

$1,552.50

$945.00

$1,170.00

Page 3




09/07/2013

09/07/2013

09/08/2013
09/09/2013

09/09/2013

09/10/2013

310201

RGIV

RGIV

REG

RGIV

confer with L. Moak re: data analysis; email
W. Pierce re: same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review W. Picrce email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review C. Diamond
obiections re: work sessions; review
revisions to Brief re: new trial.

Review email from M. Jacobs re: brief in
support of reopening the evidence; forward
same to W, Pierce and R. Freeman;
conference with counsel re: same.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; review M.
Jacobs email; review revised Brief, confer
with R. Gray, I'V re: same.

Review Brief; work re: findings.

Review Brief in Support of Reopening the
Evidence; reply to counsel of record for
Calhoun and Fort Bend re: same with one
edit; conference with counsel re: same;
review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
availability for status meetings with Judgs
Dietz; email all counsel] of record re: saue
and new proposed date; conference with
counsel re: same; review and repiv o emails
from C. Pacheco and M. Bono re:status
meeting availability; review email from M.
Jabobs re: changes to afficavit of J.
Wisnoski; review same: ieply to email
approving changes; ~uuil W, Pierce and R.
Freeman re: changes to affidavit of J.

Wisnoski; conference with counsel re: same.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; confer with
R. Gray, I'Y ye: same; review S. Dahiberg
email; teview 5. Dahlberg email; review D.
Thompson email; review M. Trachtenberg
emails (2); review M. Jacobs email; review
vevised Brief; review L. Schwartz email; re:
scheduling; review D. Thompson email;
review H. McIntush email re: Brief; review
M. Jacobs email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Thompson email.

Email Cathoun County and Fort Bend re:
status meeting availability; review
responsive email from M. Trachtenberg re:
same; review email from D. Thompson re:
same; conference with counsel re; October
meeting date; email all counsel of record re:
agreed upon dates; review email from D.

Invoice # 44680

0.20 hrs

0,50 hrs

0.50 hrs
1.35 hes

1.25 hrs

1.75 hrs

$35.00

$225.00

$225.00
$236.25

$562.50

$306.25

Page 4




09/1/2013 REG

09/11/2013 RGIV

09/112013 RGIV

09/11/2013 REG

09/12/2013 RGIV

3102-01

Hinojosa re: brief in support of reopening
the evidence; review same; review email
from H. MclIntush re: proposed revisions to
findings of fact and conclusions of law
structure; review, edit, and revise same;
conference with counsel re: same; email
revosed version to plaintiff parties.

Review M. Jacobs email to Court with brief; 1.30 hrs
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review H. Mclntush emails (2) re: findings;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review M.
Jacobs emails (2); review emails re; findings
(5); reply to same; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: equity findings.

Review email from M. Jacobs re: Calthoun 3.15 hus
edits to proposed findings of fact structure;
review email from D. Hinojosa re: same;
reply to email re: TTSFC edits; review edits
to structure of findings of fact by Calhoun
County plaintiffs; review emails re:
conference call; review MALDEF's edits o0
proposed structure of findingd of faci;
conference call with plaintiff's covusel re:
proposed structure to findings of Jact;
conference with counsel re: sarne; email
plaintiff’s counsel re: follow-up comment
from call re: equity langusge; Telephone
conference with D. Imojosa re: proposed
structure of findiags of fact; review revised
structure; reply to email with approval of

same.

Review email from H. McIntush re: redlined 0.10 hrs
version of proposed findings of fact

structure,

Review M. Jacobs email; review revised 1.35 hrs

tindings; review D. Hinojosa email; review
emails re: edits to findings; review emails
re: findings; review M. Bono email; review
revised outline; review W, Pierce email;
reply to same; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
conference call on findings.

Conference with counsel re: proposed 5.10 hrs
structure to findings of fact and status
conference hearing dates; review State's
motion to tale Judicial Notice; conference
with counsel re: same; review Edgewood

Invoice # 44680

$585.00

$551.25

$17.50

$607.50

$892.50

Page 5




09/12/2013 REG

09/13/2013 RGIV

09/13/2013 RGIV

09/13/2013 REG

09/152013 REG
09/16/2013 RGIV

3102-04

Plaintiff's Motion in opposition to reopening
the evidence; print all motions; status
conference with Judge Dietz; conference
with counsel re: same and response to
State’s Request for Disclosure; revise same;
calendar all dates; Telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: expert report, data to use,
due date; telephone conference with W.
Pierce and R. Freeman re: data and timing
of expert report; review email sent by H.
McIntush re: revised proposed scheduling
order; reply to same; conference with
counsel re: same; reply to email from H.
Meclntush re: proposed revision.

Review emails re: findings; reply to same;
review revised findings outline; prepare for
9/12 hearing; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: 9/12 hearing; review State’s
Motion to Take Judicial Notice; email W,
Pierce and R. Freeman re: same; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: same,; attend hearing with
Court; review email from court reponer;
work re: disclosures; work re: amcnded
pleadings; review R. Freeman emuil; confer
with R. Gray, I'V re: expert reoort; review
revised scheduling order.

Conference with counsei re: data to use at
trial; conference call with W. Pierce and R.
Freeman re: samr# and case status; scan and
email exhibit 104 of model 115 to W, Pierce
and R. Freerfan; email T. Hunter update and
summary of status hearing.

Review and reply to emails re: proposed
schediling order; telephone conference with
Skelley Dahlberg re: same; conference with
counsel re: same.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
report and data; confer with R. Gray, I'V re:
report and advisory; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review T. Hunter
email; reply to same; confer with R. Gray
re: scheduling order and expert report;
review W. Pierce email; review emails re:
scheduling order.

Work re: exhibits and scheduling order.
Review emails re: proposed scheduling
order and language on disclosure of expert

Invoice # 44680

4.10 hrs

1.95 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.50 hrs
3.30 hrs

$1,845.00

$341.25

$87.50

$630.00

$225.00
$577.50
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09/16/2013 REG

09/16/2013 TBH

09/17/2013 RGIV

3102-01

opinions; conferene with counsel re: same;
email M. Jacobs and M. Trachtenberg re:
same; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa (message left) re: same; review
and reply to email from M. Jacobs re: same;
review email from M. Jacobs re: same;
revise proposed language; email proposed
language to counsel for review; reply to
plaintiffs counsel re: proposed language;
revise language; revise proposed scheduling
order; conference with R. Gray Ill and T.
Hunter re: case status; review and reply to
email from H. Mclntush re; proposed
scheduling order language; review
defendant’s designation of trial witnesses;
review ans reply to email from H. McIntush,
. Hinojosa re: proposed language in
scheduling order.

Review email correspondence; work re: 1.60 hrs
expert report; review M. Jacobs email;
review Scheduling Order language (2);
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same (2); review
M., Trachtenberg email; confer with K.
Cray, IV and T. Hunter re: status and
pleadings; work on languags re: Scheduling
Order; review D. Thompsoi-email; reply 1o
same; review Charters’ second disclosures
request; review State’s witness designations;
confer with R. Geay, IV re: same; notify
client re; same.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray 1.20 hrs
IV re: Japuary hearing; review recent

filings:

Review Defendant’s Amended Preliminary 4.15 hrs

Diesignation of Fact Witnesses for 2014
irial; conference with legal assistant re:
same and differences between First
Designation and Amended Designation;
email W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: data
regarding changes to potential witness
districts: review email from M.
Trachtenberg re: letter or brief to Judge
regarding scope of January trial; conference
with counsel re: Defendant’s Designation of
Witnesses; email plaintiff's counsel re:
response to interrogatorries; email T. Hunter

Invoice # 44680

$720.00

$390.00

$726.25
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09/17/72013 REG

09/17/2013 SHI

09/18/2013 RGIV

3102-01

re: same; Telephone conference (message
left) with L. Halpern re: proposed
Scheduling Order; Telephone conference
with Linda Halpern re: proposed scheduling
order; revise same; conference with counsel
re: same; email Linda Halpern revised
version; email S. Dahlberg re: responses to
State’s Request for Disclosure; review and
reply to email from S. Dahlberg re: same;
conference with counsel re: revised
language of proposed scheduling order and
October trial transcripts and deposition
transcripts of the Defendant’s designated
witnesses; conference with legal assistant

re; same; email L. Halpern re: revised
language of proposed scheduling order;
review emails from D. Hinojosa and M.
Trachtenberg re: responses to State’s Second
Set of Interrogatories,

Review additional parts of record; review 1.25 hrs
M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
review amended fact witness designavion by
the State; work re: Scheduling Order; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: interrogatorics;
telephone conference with L. Halpern re:
Scheduling Order; confer with R, Gray, IV
re: same; review M., Trachtenberg email;
review S. Dahlberg cuil; review L.
Halpern email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; review D). Hinojosa email; reply to
same.

Confer with R. Gray, I'V re: State’s witness 0.50 hrs
list; review witness files and transcripts re:
same; confer with R, Gray, IV re: same.
Telephone conference with L. Schwartz re: 1.60 hrs
dzposition of Lisa Dawn-Fisher (joint notice
and splitting of costs); review emails from
M. Jacobs and H. McIntush re: cites to
Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law;
Telephone conference with H. McIntush re:
scheduling order; Telephone conference
with R. Freeman re: Coalition Meeting
Saturday September 28 and Go To Meeting
meeting Friday September 20; reveiw
emails from M. Jacobs and M. Trachtenberg
re: citations for findings of fact; conference

Invoice # 44680

$562.50

$50.00

$280.00

Page &




09/18/2013 REG

(09/19/2013 RGIV

3102-G1

with counse] re: meeting with Coalition
Executive Committee and Dallas
conference; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: same; email L. Halpern and S.
Dahlberg re: proposed scheduling order;
review and respond to email frow L.
Halpern re: same; review redlinded edits of
State to Scheduling Order; conference with
counsel re: same; reply to L. Halpern re:
agreeing to edits; forward to H. Mclntush
re: finalize and send to all parties for
approval; review and reply to email from H.
MeclIntush re: proposed scheduling order.
Review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); reply 1.60 hrs
to same (2); review W, Pierce email re:
database; review M. Jacobs email; review
M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
review message from L. Schwartz; review
M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
confer with R, Gray, IV re: depositions;
work re: Scheduling Order; review H.
MclIntush email; review M. Jacobs email;
review T. Robertson email; telephosie
conference with T. Robertson re: 9/20
meeting; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review emails re: Coalition meeting and
status (3).

Review email from H Mclntush re: 2.75 hrs
scheduling order; review email from C.
Pacheco re: deposition of Lisa Dawn-Fisher;
review counsei’s reply to same; review
email from T. Hunter re: Dr. Baker exhibits;
find and zend same to L. Halpern; email H.
Mclnwish re: edits to proposed scheduling
orcer; review emails re: deposition of Lisa
Lawn-Fisher; review and reply to email
trom H. McIntush re: scheduling order;
review revised proposed scheduling order;
revise same and reply to email; review
emails from counsel of record re: proposed
scheduling oder; review and reply to email
from T. Hunter re: Dr. Baker exhibits;
review and reply to email from L. Schwartz
re: expert reports; conference with counsel
re: same; review emails of other counsel re:
same; review email from M. Trachtenberg

Invoice # 44680

$720.00

$481.25
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09/19/2013 REG

09/20/2013

09/20/2013

09/21/2013

09/22/2013

09/22/2013

09/23/2013

09/23/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

re: brief on limiting scope of hearing as to
charters and intervenors.

Review H. McIntush email; review M. 2.25 hrs
Trachtenberg email; review D. Hinojosa
email; rely to same; review L. Schwartz
email; reply to same; review email re:
Scheduling Order; review S. Dahlberg
email; reply to same; review L. Schwartz
email; reply to same; review S. Dahlberg
emails (3); reply to same (3); review L.
Schwartz email; reply to same; review L.
Halpern email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review [). Thompson email; review H.
McIntush email; review L. Schwartz emails
(2); confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; reply
to same; email W, Pierce re: data; review 8.
Dahlberg email; review L. Schwariz email;
review S. Dahlberg email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same.

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce 0.20 hrs
re: data glitches and district information.
Meeting at Equity Center re: status and 245 hrs

exhibits; attend Coalition board mzeting re:
status; review M. Trachtenberp email;
review W_ Pierce email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; rezow H. Mclntush
email; review S. Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hincjosa email; review L.
Schwartz email; review C. Diamond email;
review M. Tracitenberg email.

Review M Bono email; review S. Dahlberg 1.90 hrs
email; revicw H. McIntush email; brief
review of L. Moak report; forward to W.
Picrce and R. Freeman.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; complete 1.25 hrs
veview of L. Moak report.
Review Judge's memorandum on Finding of 2.00 hrs

Fact and revise 8th Amended Petition;

review Moak draft report; review various

emails.

Review and reply to email from counsel re: 0.20 hrs
updating petition for scope; review email

from W. Pierce re: data.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 1.30 hrs
review M. Trachtenberg email; review

Invoice # 44680

$1,012.50

$35.00

$1,102.50

$450.00

$562.50

$650.00

$35.00

$585.00
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09/24/2013

09/24/2013

09/24/2013

09/24/2013

09/25/2013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

report edits; review M. Jacobs email; review
L. Moak email; review D. Thompscn email;
work re: findings and W, Pierce report;
review H. MclIntush email re: revisions to L.
Moak report.

Telephone conference {message left) with 2.15 hrs
Adam Pierce re: formatting of exhibits;
review and reply to email re: interrogatory
responses; conference with counsel re:
same; listen to voicemail from M. Bono re:
same; review proposed interrogatory
responses; conference with counsel re:
answers to State’s Second Set of
Interrogatories; draft TESFC responses to
State’s Second Request for Interrogatories;
conference with counsel re: same.

Review and reply to email from M. Bone re: 0.20 hrs
responses to State's Second Set of

Interrogatories.

Review H. McIntush email; review M, 0.80 hrs

Trachtenberg email; email R. Gray, IV ra:
same; review L. Schwartz email; review H.
McIntush email; confer with T. Huurer re:
Moak report; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
discovery responses.

Finalize suggested changes to 8th Amended 2.00 brs
Petition; review T& Hand H & B’s
comments to Moak renort; conference with
Richard Gray IV ou answers to Defendant’s
Interrogatories.

Conference wiin: counsel re: service list; 2.15 hrs
email W. Ficree re: same; review emails re:
updating citations; review and reply to email
from ¢ounsel re: Ninth Amended Petition;
review interrogatory responses of
Ydgewood Plaintiffs and compare to TTSFC
Plaintiffs; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: status of data; conference with
counsel re: all; revise responses to State’s
Second Set of Interrogatories; email counsel
re: same; review and edit redlined Ninth
Amended Original Petition; review and
reply to email from M. Bono and M.
Trachtenberg re: conference cail on State’s
Motion to Take Judcial Notice and expert
testimony.

Invoice # 44680

$376.25

$35.00

$360.00

$650.00

$376.25
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09/25/2013 REG

09/26/2013 RGIV

09/26/2013 REG

09/27/2013 RGIV

3102-01

Review M. Bono email; confer with R. 1.10 hrs
Gray, IV re: interrogatory responses; review
Moak Casey proposal; email W. Pierce re:
same; review M. Bonoe email; review M.
Jacobs email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; review T, Hunter email re; amending
petition; confer with R. Gray, IVre: W.
Pierce call.

Finish reviewing and revising Ninth 6.45 hrs
Amended Petition; review and reply to

email from M. Bono re; conference call on
State’s Motion to Take Judical Notice and
supplementing expert testimony; email
counsel re: edits and revisions made to
Ninth Amended Petition; review scheduling
order and Rule 11 Agreement; Telephone
conference with Plaintiff's counsel re:
Motions to Take Judicial Notice,
Interrogatory responses, and expert
testimony; conference with counsel re:
same; conference with counsel re: ediiz to
Ninth Amended Petition; revise and edit
same in redline and email to counsel for
review; review findings of fact and
conclusions of law re: citations; conference
with counsel re: data issves; email Shelley
Dahlberg re: same.

Review revised Petition; confer with 3.30 hrs
attorneys re: same; review emails re: Motion
for Judicial Nutice (6); review email from
Moak Cascy; review revised L. Moak
report; furward to W. Pierce; review M.
Trackacuberg email; review revisions to
Muaalk report; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
call on Motion for Judicial Notice; review
W, Pierce email; review M. Bono email;
prepare for presentation to Coalition; review
H. Mclntush email; review message from
W. Pierce; telephone conference with W,
Pierce re: data issues; confer with R. Gray,
IV re; data issue; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; review email re: data; review
S. Dahlberg email; forward same to W.
Pierce.

Telephone conference with counsel re: 1.45 hrs

Invoice # 44680

$495.00

$1,128.75

$1.485.00

$253.75
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09/27/2013 REG

09/28/2013 REG

09/29/2013 REG

09/29/2013 TBH

09/30/2013 RGIV

09/36/2013 RGIV

3102-01

TASA/TASB conference, attorney fees, and
data; review and reply to email from Shelley
Dahlberg re: turnover of data by TEA;
Telephone conference with legal assistant
re: attorney fees and superintendent
witnesses; review and reply to email from
M. Jacobs re: Response to State’s Motion to
Take Judicial Notice; review Intervenor’s
Plea to the Jurisdiction.

Travel to and from Dallas; attend and speak 9.35 hrs
at Coalition meeting; review H. Mclntush
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.

Review Intervenors’ Plea to the Jurisdiction; 0.35 hrs
review 5. Dahlberg emails re: data.
Review edits to amended petition; review T. 0.50 hrs

Hunter email re: L. Moak report; email T.
Hunter re: same.

Revise Richard Gray I'V's edits to 9th 1.20 hrs
Amended Petition and make final edits;
review Moak’s revised report; review
Intervenor’s Plea to the Jurisdiction.

Review email from counsel re: edits o 5.55 hus
Ninth Amended Petition; revise san# and
reply to email; review email froin rounsel

re: Moak Report; review samc; review email
from H. McIntush re: Judi~ial Notice;
review Motion to Take Tizdicial Notice;
review email from W. Pierce re: expert
report; reply to same with revisions to
paragraph; revise Response to State’s
Request for Disclosure; conference with
legal assistani re: same and Response to
Interrogatories; review email from W,

Pierce re: revision; review and reply to

emai! re: relevency arguments for
gecuments subject to Judicial Notice;
review email from S. Dahlberg re: expert
report backup data; reply to same; review
and reply to email from W. Pierce re: same;
forward revised response to the State’s
Request for Disclosure to counsel for review
and comment; review and reply to email
from W. Pierce re: back up data.

Review and reply to email from H. 0.20 hrs
Mclntush re: Motion to Take Judicial
Notice: review same,

Invoice # 44680

$4,207.50

$157.50

$225.00

$390.00

$971.25

$35.00

Page 13




09/30/2013 REG

09/30/2013 SEJ

Review email correspondence; reply to 2.70 hrs
same; review Edgewood discovery

responses; review Motion for JudiBcial

Notice; review various emails; review

emails re: State’s Motion for Judicial

Notice; confer with K. Gray, I'V re: same;

review M. Trachtenberg email; review 8.

Dahlberg email; review R. Gray, IV email

re: same; review emails re: Motion for

Judicial Notice; review emails re: TEA data;

review R. Gray, IV emails; review S.

Dahlberg emails; review T. Hunter email re:

Moak report; review W. Pierce emails;

review emails re: Intervenors’ Plea to the

Jurisdiction; review emails re; discovery

responses; review notice of hearing,

Finalize and serve Answers to Second Set of 0.50 hrs
Interrogatories.

FINEREEPER RECAP

REG IO, Richard E. Gray Partner 53.40 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 60.95 hry @ 175.00 /br
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 6.40 s @ 325.00 /hr
SEF Jennings, Susan Paralegal 3.45 his @ 100.00 /hr
Fee Recap Totals 124020
3102-01 Invoice # 44680

$1,215.00

$0.00

$37,051.25

$24,030.00
$10,666.25
$ 2,080.00

$ 27500

$37,051.25

Page 14




GRAY & BECKER. P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
October 31, 2013
Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 44909-1
Our file#: 3102
Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through:
email to info@equitycenter.org
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROEESSIONAL SERN ICEN
10/01/2013 RGIV  Review Expert Report of Lynn Moak; 5.70 hrs

10/61/2013 RGIV

10/01/2013 REG

3102-01

conference with counsel re: data issues;
review and reply to email from H. McIntush
re: Motion to Take Judicial Notice; review
email from M. Jacobs re: response to State’s
Motion to Take Judicial Notice; review
Response and reply to emaill; review and
reply to email from D. Hincjosa re:
admission of exhibits which we oppose
Judge taking judicial notice of; review
State’s Motion to Take Judicial Notice;
continue checking citationsin findings of
fact related o TTSFC focus districts; review
email from B. Chestcr te: September 30 NF
data; conference wiih legal assistant re:
same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: sarae; email W, Pierce and Tim
Wolf re: same,

Review email from M. Jacobs re: Response 0.60 hrs
to State’s Motion to Take Judicial Notice;
review Response; review email from M.
Trachtenberg re: Response to Intervenor's
Plea to The Jurisdiction; review Response;
ematil counsel re: same; review email re:
Charter Plaintiff's Response to State’s
Request for Disclosure.

Review C. Schwartz email; confer with R. 1.75 hrs
QGray, IV re: discovery, Motion for Judicial
Notice, and data issues; review Notice of
Setting; review Motion to Take Judicial
Notice; review draft response to State’s
Motion for Judicial Notice; review M.

Invoice # 44509

74-2427406
REG

00001
10/31/2013

$997.50

$105.00

$787.50

Page 1




10/02/2013 RGIV

10/02/2013 RGIV

10/02/2013 REG

10/02/2013 SEJ

3102-01

Trachtenberg email; review M. Jacobs
email: review M. Bono email: review D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review emails re: 10/4
hearing; review State’s disclosure responses;
review Charter School discovery responses;
review Edgewood disclosure responses.
Review and reply to email from M. Jacobs 2.05 hrs
re: Motion to Take Judicial Notice; review
email from R. Gray IIl re: Response to
Intervenor’s Plea to the Jurisdiction; email
counsel re: Ninth Amended Original
Petition and injunction language; email
counsel re: Moak Report and total capacity
versus enrichment; continue checking
citations in findings of fact; review and
reply to email from T. Hunter re: Moak
Report and capacity in the system versus
enrichment; review email from T. Hunter re:
Ninth Amended Petition and relief section;
review email from H. Mcintush re: call prior
to hearing on Judicial Notice; review I'ort
Bend Plaintiff’s response to state’s. 1cquest
for disclosure; conference with izgal
assistant re: filing TTSFC response to state’s
request for disclosure; file same.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 0.10 hrs
data.
Review email from Charters re; experts; 2.50 hrs

review emails re: 1indings, Motion for
Judicial notice, Moak report, Amended
Petition ana 11/4 hearing; reply to same;
review L. Moak email; review T. Hunter
email; confer with attorneys re: Amended
Petition: review H. McIntush email; review
M. Bono email; review M. Jacobs email;
review P. Fraissinet email; reply to all;
review C. Pacheco email; review S.
Dahlberg email re: data; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review Ft. Bend
discovery; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
disclosure responses; review disclosure
responses; review Efficiency Intervenors’
supplemental disclosure responses; review
M. Trachtenberg email.

Finalize and serve responses to Defendants’ 0.70 hrs

Invoice # 44909

$358.75

$17.50

$1,125.00

$0.00

Page 2




1070272013 TBH

10/03/2013 RGIV

10/03/2013 REG

3102-01

Requests for Disclosure; revise and serve
amended responses to Defendants’ Requests
for Disclosure.

Email conference with Richard Gray I'V re: 0.20 hrs
Amended Petition and Moak report.
Review email from S. Dahlberg re: 4.15 hrs

September 30 NF data provided to
plaintiffs; forward same to counsel; review
email from W. Pierce re: Updated Service
List and MoakCasey proposal; email M.
Jacobs re: Updated Service List; Telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: needed data;
draft email to Shelley Dahlberg re: same;
review and reply to emai! from S. Dahlberg
re: September 30 Near Final Data;
conference with counsel re: same, review
emails re: correspondence regarding
September 30 Near Final data and it's
prodcution; review email from 8. Dahiberg
re: missing zipped file in produced
September 30 Near Final data; email W
Pierce re: data and backup plan if nezessary;
review and reply to email from L. Halpern
re: data still to be uploaded to Scoure FIP
site; conference call with plaintiif’s counsel
re: hearing on State’s Motion/to Take
Judcial Notice, Plaintiff’s Motion to Take
Judicial Netice, and Intervenor’s Plea to the
Jurisdiction; review Secure FTP site for
September 30 Near Final Data; conference
with legal assiziant re: downloading same;
telephone Cunierence with W. Pierce re:
same anc new data; forward email to W.
Piercc and T. Wolff re: data; review State’s
Joinder to Intervenor's Plea to the
Jurisdiction and State’s Response to
Plaintiff's Motion to Take Judicial Notice;
review email re: change to updated data;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
email W. Pierce re: same; review Efficiency
Intervenor’s Motion to Take Judicial Notice.
Review emails re: data; review emails: 2.10 hrs
confer with R. Gray, IV re: W, Pierce call
and data issues; review W. Pierce email;
review T. Templeton vita; review M. Jacobs
email; review § Dahlberg email; confer with

Invoice # 44909

$65.00

$726.25

$945.00

Page 3




10/04/2013

10/04/2013

10/06/2013

10/06/2013
10/07/2013

10/07/2013

10/08/2013

310201

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

R. Gray, IV re: same; review L. Halpern

email; review W. Pierce message; review R.

Gray, IV re: W. Pierce call; review State’s

Joinder on Plea to the Jurisdiction; confer

with R. Gray, I'V re: conference call re: 10/4

hearing; review M. Jacobs email; review H.

McIntush email; review C. Diainond email;

review Edgewood motion; review S.

Dahlberg comrespondence.

Review email from W, Pierce re: emrors with 4.35 brs
FM 13 files produced; email 8. Dahlberg and

L. Halpern re: same; email W. Pierce re:

email to the State; review and reply to email

from L. Halpern re: FM 13 files and which

10 use; email W. Pierce and T. Wolff re:

same; telephone conference with W. Pierce

and R, Freeman re; data and Expert Report;

review all emails and make chronology of

data production; conference with counsel re:

same; prepare for hearing with Judge Dietz;

hearing with Judge Dietz.

Confer with R, Gray, I'V re: data statuy and 3.45 hrs
10/4 hearing; review M. Jacobs emat;

review H. McIntush email; review W,

Pierce ermail; review L. Halperm email;

review court reporter emails; review

hearing transcripts; revi¢w additional

pleadings; telephone conference with W,

Pierce, R. Freemar: and R. Gray, I'V re: data

and report; atiend hearing with J. Dietz re:

Motion for Indicial Notice and scheduling.

Review and veply to email from W. Pierce 0.25 hrs
re: Expeit Report; review and reply to email

from &{. Jacobs re: telephone conference re:

revising findings of fact.

Work re: findings and trial preparation. 0.75 tus
Review and reply to email from M. Jacobs 0.35 hus
re; telephone conference on findings of fact;

review email from W. Pierce re: Expert

Report.

Review M. Jacobs email re: findings; 0.60 hrs
review M. Bono email; review H. McIntush

email; review D. Thompson email; confer

with R. Gray, IV re: report/data analysis

status; review M. Jacobs emails (2).

Review email from §. Dahlberg re: 4.40 hrs
superintendent depositions; email W. Pierce

Invoice # 44509

$761.25

$1,552.50

$43.75

$337.50
$61.25

$270.00

$770.00

Page 4




10/08/2013 REG

10/08/2013 TBH

10/09/2013 RGIV

3102-01

and R. Freeman re: district information;
review Ninth Amended Petition; review and
reply to email from H. Mclntush re: revising
findings of fact and conclusions of law;
conference call with plaintiff's counsel re:
findings of fact and conclusions of law;
conference with counsel re: same and
superintendednt depositions; email plaintiffs
counsel re: superintendent depositions;
email W, Pierce and R. Freeman re: Ninth
Arnended Original Petitionl; email
plaintiff's counsel and respond to same re:
times for conference call on superintendent
depositions; review email from H. McIntush
re: legisiative appendix; forward same with
comment to R. Gray III and T. Hunter;
review findings of fact and conclusions of
law re: cite check; email W. Pierce re: data
needed for focus districts.

Review §. Dahlberg email; review H. 1.55 hrs
MclIntush email; confer with R, Gray, IV.re:
status of report and data; review ema‘l re:
discovery; review M. Trachtenberg eznails
(2); review M. Jacobs email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review T. Hunter email re:
Moak report; review H. Mclntush emails
(2); review M. Trachtenccrg emails (4);
review L. Moak emails: confer with R. Gray
re: depositions; review W, Pierce email;
confer with R. Gray re: exhibits.

Email confereucs with Richard Gray IV re: 0.20 hrs
Finding of Fact and conclusion to Moak

Report.

Review Tindings of fact re: update citations; 4.05 hrs

emai} same to H. McIntush; review email
from H. McIntush re; same; conference with
counsel re: findings of fact; review and
reply to emai! from W. Pierce re: data
comparison spreadsheet using FY'13 data
with FY 14 parameters; draft questions for
Superintendents re: how appropriations of
the 83rd Legislature afftected their districts;
email questions for counsel for review;
review and reply to email from T. Hunter re:
same; review email from W. Pierce re:
exhibits; review exhibits and reply to email;

Invoice # 44909

$697.50

$65.00

$708.75

Page 5




10/09/2013

REG

10/09/2013 TBH

10/10/2013

10/10v2013

1071172013

1071172013

10/11/2013

10/12/2013

10/14/2013

3102-61

RGIV

RGIV

SE]

RGIV

telephone conference with R. Gray Il re:

exhibits; telephone conference with W.

Pierce and A. Pierce re: same.

Review S. Dahlberg email; confer with R. 0.60 hrs
Gray, IV re: depositions and trial

preparation; review C. Nickel email; reply

to same; review emails re: witness

preparation; review draft Moak report.

Work with Richard Gray I'V on questions 0.50 has
for superintendents.
Review, format, and print exhibts; prepare 3.15 s

for meeting with R. Gray Il re: same;
review and print emails for meeting;
meeting with R. Gray I re: exhibts; review
email from H. McIntush re: appendices to
Moak’s Report; review appendices and reply
to email approving same; review email from
M. Trachienberg re: same; Telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: expert report,
exhibits, and Ninth Amended Original
Petition.

Review W, Pierce email; confer with R 1.35 hrs
Gray, IV re: exhibit status; review (partial)
of draft exhibits; confer with R Gray, IV re:
same; work re: exhibits and t7ial
preparation; confer with T. Hunter re:
superintendent testimony; review H.
McIntush email; revievs draft appendix to E.

Moak report.

Review Ninth Amcended Original Petition; 0.55 hrs
conference wiik legal assistant re: same and

filing of saive:

Review emiail re: Amended Petition; review 0.75 tus

Chartecs Petition; review W. Pierce email;

review M. Trachtenberg email, review Ft.

bend amended pleading; review W. Pierce

emails (2).

Efile and serve Ninth Amended Original 0.50 hrs
Petition,

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same; 0.50 hrs
review Charter Petition; review additional

transcripts.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 5.60 hrs
expert report and exhibits; conference with

counsel re: same; review tables in expert

report; review report of Dan Casey; draft

Invoice # 44900

$270.00

$162.50

$551.25

$607.50

$96.25

$337.50

$0.00

$225.00

$980.00

Page 6




1071412013

10/14/2013

10/14/2013

10/14/2013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

REG

Expert Designations; conference with
counsel re: all; revise expent designations;
telephone conference with Adam Pierce re:
exhibits; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: revised expert report and exhibits;
review expert report of Curtis Culiwell;
review and reply to email from plaintiff's
counsel re: same; conferecne with counsel
1e: same.

Review emails re: expert report of Curtis
Cullweli; review edits made by M. Jacobs;
review email from T. Hunter re: conference
call with plaintiffs counsel re:
superintendents; review and reply to email
from M. Jacobs re: service list.

Conference call re: Curtis Cullwell report on
HBS; review edits to same; conference with
counsef re: same.

Review Expert Report of W. Pierce; review
emails from H. Mclntush re: L. Moak
Expert Designation.

Review W. Pierce email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: report; review court raporter
transcripts (2); review H. McIntush emails
{2) with attachments; review {partial) of W.
Pierce report; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review draft tables; review and
finalize expert witness designation; confer
with R. Gray, IV ra: same; review C.
Diamond email with attachment; review D.
Casey report; reyiew L. Moak report;
review Staee’s responses to document
request; raview draft C. Coldwell report;
review M. McIntush email; review M.
Jacobs email; review D, Hingjosa email;
review Edgewood supplemental reports;
review D. Hincjosa additional email; email
D. Hinojosa re: A. Cortez; review H.
MclIntush email; review emails re: C.
Coldwell report and D. Casey report; review
H. McIntush emails; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Thompsen
emails (2); review M. Trachtenberg emails
(2); review J. Turner email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: Coldwell report; review
additional emails; review Charter

invoice # 44909

0.40 his

1.25 hrs

0.90 hrs

4.65 hrs

$70.00

$218.75

$157.50

$2,092.50

Page 7




1071472013

1071472013

1071572013 RGIV

10/15/2013 RGIV

1071572013

3102-01

SEI

SEJ

REG

designations and reports; review Ft. Bend
designations; review Calhoun designations.

Efile and serve Plaintiffs’ First 0.25 hrs
Supplemental Designation of Expert

Witnesses.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: supplemental 0.25 hrs
designation; draft designation.

Review emails from W. Pierce re: expert 3.45 s

repert; review email re: spam content
regardign MALDEF expert reports; email
D. Hinojosa re: same; Telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: Westhoff issue, expert
report, and deposition availability; review
parties expert designations; meeting with R,
Gray III and T. Hunter re: superintendent
testimony and expert report of W. Pierce;
Telephone conference with plaintiffs
counsel re: superintendent testimony in
reopening hearing, exclusion of charters,
and depositions; meeting with R, Gray Il
and T. Hunter re: conference cali and
vetting of superintendents; email Dr. ¥ feifer
re: same and conference cali avaiiob:lity;
review email from S. Dahlberg anu
plaintiffs counsel and C. Dianiond re:
superintendent deposition dates; revise list
of questions for superinizadents; email list
to 1. Pfeifer prior to call; review email from
J. Preifer re: conference call; email counsel

re: same.

Review, revice, and edit expert report of W. 3.00 hrs
Pierce.

Review D Hinojosa expert reports and data; 3.60 hrs

review . Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review H. MclIntush email re: expert reports;
review Calhoun County expert designations;
review T. Hunter email; reply to same;
review Charter Plaintiffs' data and report;
partial review of exhibits; review D,
Hinojosa emails (2); reply to same (2);
review W, Pierce email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; confer with T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: Superintendent
testimony and 10/15 call; review W. Pierce
report, edit same; review M. Beno emails

Invoice # 44909

$0.00

$25.00

$603.75

$525.00

$1,620.00

Page 8




10/15/2013 TBH

10/16/2013 RGIV

10/16/2013 REG

10/16/20i3 TBH

3102-01

(2); review C. Pacheco email; review M.
Jacobs email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review Edgewood supplemental
designation; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review email re: W. Pierce report;
review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;
review D, Hinojosa email; review C.
Diamond email.

Review recent pleadings; conference with 2.30 hrs
R. Gray and Richard Gray IV re: using
superintendents at January hearing;
conference call with other plaintiff attorneys
re: same; review Pierce report.

Finish review expert report of W. Pierce; 6.65 hrs
review emails from D. Hinojosa and M,
Jacobs re: expert report of Curtis Cullwell;
research Everman ISD's website, annual
repert, and trial testimony of Dr. J. Pfeifer;
telephone conference with W, Pierce re:
revisions to expert report; conference with
REG Il re: same; email all counsel re:
deposition availability for W. Pierce;
conference with T. Hunter re: conference
call with J. Pfeifer; telephone conference
with J. Pfeifer re: status of Evennan and
potential deposition testimony; conference
with counsel re: same; review emails from
W. Pierce re: expert revort; telephone
conference with W, Pierce re: revisions to
same; check experi deposition calendar;
review depogition availability for J. Pfeifer;
email T. Haater re: same.

Confer wita R. Gray, IV re: deposition 1.75 hrs
dates; work re: witness designations; review
D. Hinojosa email; review M. Jacobs email;
review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review M.
Jacobs emails (2); review 1. Pena email;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: Pierce report;
review H. McIntush email; re: deposition
dates; confer with R. Gray, IV re: W. Pierce
call; review additional wanscript portions;
confer with R. Gray, IV and T. Hunter re; I,
Pfeifer conversation and possible
deposition.

Review Dr. Pfeifer’s testimony from 2.20 hrs
October trial and prepare for telephone

Invoice # 44909

$747.50

$1,163.75

$787.50

$715.00

Page 9




10/17/2013 RGIV

10/17/2013 REG

10/18/2013 RGIV

10/18/2013 RGIV

10/18/2013 REG

3102-01

conference with her; telephone conference
with Dr. Pfeifer and Richard re: effect of
actions of the 83rd Legislation.

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce 2.75 hrs
re: expert report; review and reply to email
from A. Pierce re: exhibits; review email
from A. Pierce re: updated exhibits; review
and reply to emails from W. Pierce re:
coalition funds and updated expert report;
review and revise current version of W,
Pierce expert report; telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: issue with Max I&S data;
conference with counsel re: same; review
and reply to email from W. Pierce re:
revisions to expert report; review exhibits,
Review emails; reply to same; work re; 1.60 hrs
expert report; telephone call to M. Gallindo
1e: status of matters; review expert reports
{partial); confer with R. Gray, IV re:
preparation of Dr. Pfeifer for testimony and
de-designation of other witness; review ‘W,
Pierce emails (2); confer with R. Gray, IV
re: report status; review D. Thompson
correspondence; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
Pierce report; review D). Hingyosa email.
Review emails from W. Pierce re: data issue 4.90 hrs
and Westhoff problem; conference with
counsel re: same; Televhone conference
with W. Pierce re: Westhoff problem,
MAIDEF data issues, and expert report;
review and reniy to email from H. McIntush
re: amendiayg cxpert report of Curtis
Culwell; review email from H. McIntush re:
finding: of fact; email all counsel re:
depontion availability of Dr. Pleifer; review
21aail from C. Diamond re: 1. Pfeifer
deposition availability; review email from
H. Mclntush re: filing of clarification of
Culwell expert report; review emails from
S. Dahlberg and D. Hinojosa re: dates for
expert depositions; review and print all
exhibits; conference with counsel and W,
Pierce re; same and expert report.

Review and revise final draft of expert 1.00 hrs

report of W. Pierce.

Confer with R, Gray, I'V re: data issues; 2.95 hrs
Invoice # 44909

$481.25

$720.00

$857.50

$175.00

$1,327.50

Page 10




10/19/2013

1071972013

10/19/2013

10/20/2013
10/21/72013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

REG
RGIV

telephone call to W. Pierce - left message;
telephone conference with W. Pierce and R.
Freeman re: MALDEF data analysis,
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
report; work on report; review message
from D. Hinojosa; telephone cail to D.
Hinojosa re: A. Cortez report; telephone call
to W. Pierce - left message; review H.
McIntush emails (2); review revised
findings and conclusions; review M.
Trachtenberg email; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: Dr. Pfeifer deposition; review
supplement to C. Culwell report; review C.
Diamond email; review 8. Dahlberg email;
review D. Hinojosa email; review M. Jacobs
email; review S. Dahlberg email - forward
to W. Pierce; review D. Hincjosa email;
review S. Dahlberg email; review H.
Mclntush email; review additional transcript
portions.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce and
R. Freeman re: revisions to expert report;
text message o A. Pierce re: exhibiis.
Finish reviewing and editing final Jdraft of
expert report of W. Pierce; eraail W. Pierce
and counsel re: conference czll on same.
Read and edit W. Pierce roport; review and
revise €xhibits and tahiss,

Review exhibits ard 'W. Pierce report.
Review emails from A. Pierce and W.

Pierce re: data; conference with counsel re:
expert repoit of W. Pierce; telephone
conference with A. Pierce re: district by
districi teports; telephone conference with
W. Pwrce re: expert report and adding
language regarding compensation and
publications and exhibts; conference with
counsel re: status of all; review and reply to
emai! from S. Dahlberg re: availability for
deposition of J. Pfeifer; format and print
district by district data for FY'13, FY14(13),
and FY 15(13); conference with counsel re:
same; review and reply to emai! from W,
Pierce re; finished report; conference with
counsel re: serving expert report of W,
Pierce; telephone conference with W, Pierce
re: same; review email from S. Dahlberg re:

Invoice # 44909

2.10 hrs

1.25 hrs

3.50 hrs

0.75 hrs
4.15 hrs

$367.50

$218.75

$1,575.00

$337.50
$726.25
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1072172013 REG

10/21/2013 SEJ

10/21/2013 TBH

10/22/2013 RGIV

10/22/2013 REG

310201

data issues; review email from W. Pierce re:
expert report email number 5; notice the
deposition of J. Pleifer; conference with
counse! re: same; review email from R,
Schulman re: TEA data issues; review email
from counsel to W. Pierce re; same.

Work re: W. Pierce report and exhibits; 2.10 hrs
review S. Dahlberg email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: expert report; review 5.
Dahlberg email; review H. Mclntush email;
work re: expert report; review W. Pierce
email re: report; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
report and exhibits; review emails re: expert

report.

Confer with R. Gray, I'V re: deposition of J, 0.50 hrs
Pfeifer; prepare and serve notice of

deposition.

Review emails re: data ; set up date for 1.30 hrs

Pfeiffer depositon, conference with Richard
Gray IV re: preparation for Pieiffer
deposition; review Wayne Pierce report!
Review and reply to email from W. Picrce 3.95 hrs
re: expert report; review email from counsel
re: TEA data issue; conference with legal
assistant re: expert reports of Catherine
Clark and Albert Cortez; 1=view Everman
data for FY 14(13); ema® same to T. Hunter;
review email from L. Walpern re: revised
ASATRI4 base don LPE data; forward
same to W. Pierce; forward all expert
reports to W.Fierce and R. Freeman; review
email fron(3V. Pierce re: ASATR revisions;
review and reply to email from T. Hunter re:
W. Pirice's expert report; review data on
Everman ISD; create spreadsheet re: same
and email to T. Hunter; review expert report
of Catherine Clark: review email from S.
Dahlberg re: witness deposition dates;
forward same to counsel with comment;
conference with counse! and legal assistant
re: de-designation of R. Freeman; review
and reply to email from R. Freeman re:
same.

Review C, Clark report; review A. Cortez 3.35 hrs
report; forward to W. Pierce; review M.
Bono email; review 8. Dahlberg email;

Invoice # 44909

$945.00

$50.00

$422.50

$691.25

$1,507.50

Page 12




10/22/2013 SEI

10/23/2013 RGIV

10/23/2013 REG

10/23/2013 TBH

10/24/2013 RGIV

3102-01

forward to W. Pierce; review State
disclosure responses; review C. Davis
email; review B. Schulman email; review
notice for J. Pfeifer deposition; review S.
Dahlberg email; review W. Pierce email;
review L. Halpern email re: revised data;
review R. Gray, IV email; review additional
transcripts; review W, Pierce email; reply to
same; review D). Hinojosa email; review S.
Dahlberg email; review W. Pierce email;
review de-designation of trial witness;
review H.D. Chambers text; reply to same;
review J, Pfeifer email.

Draft, finalize, efile, and service Notice to
the Court re: de-designation of
superintendents as trial witnesses.
Telephone conference (message left) with
Tarren Glass re: witness testimony; draft
questions for testimony of Tarren Glass;
review expert report of Albert Cortez;
review expert report of Dr. Roberto Zanwra;
review email from S. Hernandez re:
deposition dates; conference with lcgal
assistant re: calendaring of same.

Review J. Pfeifer email; confor with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review S. Dahlberg
email; reply to same; coafer with R, Gray,
IV re: de-designating R. Freeman; review R.
Freeman email; revicw M. Bono email;
review L. Schwanz email; review C.
Diamond emii re: depositions; review
email re: deposition dates; review D.
Hinojosa email.

Exchaige emails with Richard gray IV,
Wayne Pierce and Jerilyn Pfeifer re: data for
Everman ISD and neighboring districts;
veview Clark report.

Review email from D. Hinojosa re: State's
witness deposition availability; review email
from ]. Pleifer re: conference call; email T.
Hunter re: same; review expert report of Dr.
Roberto Zamora; review email and article
from R. Gray III re: National Report Card
and the South's majority of high-poverty
students; review email from S. Dahlberg re:
State’s witness deposition availability;

Invoice # 44909

0.50 hes

295 s

1.00 hrs

1.00 hrs

2.65 hrs

$50.00

$481.25

$450.00

$325.00

$463.75

Page 13




review email from T. Hunter re: conference
call with J. Pfeifer; reply to email from J.
Pfeifer re: same; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: W. Pierce’s expert report
backup data and SAS model; conference
with counsel re: same; email W. Pierce re:
same; review and reply to email from J.
Pfeifer re: conference call; update calendar
re: same; telephone conference with W,
Pierce re: SAS program and turning same
over o State.

10/24/2013 REG Review emails re: depositions; reply to 2.25 hrs $1,012.50
same; review education law report card;
forward to attorneys and clients; review D,
Hinojosa email; review email re: D. Casey
deposition; review email re: C. Clark
deposition; review email re: A. Cortez
email; review email re: C. Cullwell
deposition; review email re: R, Eisler
deposition; review email re: D. Frost
deposition; review email re: B. Hammornd
deposition; review email re: L. Moak:
deposition; review email re: W. Pi=ice
deposition; review email re: R. Zanora
deposition; review email re: 1. Pleifer
deposition; review email re; A. Rolle
deposition; review emaiiqz: T, Templeton
deposition; review T.Robertson email;
confer with R. Gray, 1V re: glitch in State’s
database; review 5. Dahlberg email; confer
with R. Gray, 1V re: same; review amended
list of factwitnesses; confer with R. Gray,
IV re: samne; confer with R. Gray, IV re; W.
Pierccvall and data analysis; review R,
Freeman email; review State’s Motion to
Strike Duncan Klusman; review S. Dahlberg
¢mails (2); confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same.

10/25/2013 RGIV  Review email from W. Pierce re: Tim's SAS 0.35 hrs $61.25
program and State’s similar program; review
email from T. Hunter to J. Pfeifer re:
Everman specific data and comparing to W.
Pierce’s data; review email from S. Rosen
re: Scheduling Order; email W. Pierce re:
Tim's SAS model and the State’s similar
model,

3102-01 Invoice # 44909 Page 14




10/25/2013 REG

16/26/2013 TBH
10¢27/2013 RGIV

10/27/2013 TBH

10/28/2013 RGIV

10/28/2013 REG

10/28/2013 TBH

10/29/20613 RGIV

10/29/2013 REG

3102-01

Review deposition schedule; review S.
Rosen email with Scheduling Order; review
W. Pierce email.

Review Moak report and Cortez report.
Review, forward, and reply to email from
W. Pierce re: SAS model.

Review TEA data on Everman in
preparation for telephone conference with
Dr. Pfeifer.

Review email from R. Freeman re: data on
Everman ISD and contiguous districts;
review email from J. Pfeifer re: same;
review emails from W. Pierce re; SAS
Model; review and reply to email from T.
Robertson re: W. Pierce’s expert report;
conference with legal assistant re: amended
deposition notices; review Everman ISD
STAAR Results for Spring 2013; email
counsel re: same, telephone conference with
W. Pierce re; SAS model; conference with
counsel re: same; email 5. Dahlberg re: SAS
program data.

Review W. Pierce email; review R _TGuray,
IV reply; review emails re: depocitions and
data; confer with R. Gray, IV v2: amending
pleadings; review depositidn notice of Dr.
Cavazos; review H. Mclptush email re:
deposition; review amended deposition
notices (7); review V. Pierce email, confer
with R. Gray, IV rc: same; review expert
reports; review Jeposition notice of J.
Wisnoski.

Review exhibits fro Dr. Pleifer from
Qctoter irial; prepare for ielephone
corference with Dr. Pfeifer.

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce
re: Tim's SAS Model and 3 district error
information; review Everman ISD data re:
conference call with J. Pfeifer; telephone
conference with J. Pfeifer re: testimony;
review email from S. Hernandez re:
amended deposition notice for W, Pierce.
‘Work re: depositions; review email re: W
Pierce deposition; review amended
deposition notice for W. Pierce; confer with
T. Huater and R. Gray, IV re; Dr. Pfeifer
deposition; confer with attorneys re:

Invoice # 44909

0.40 hrs

1.00 hrs
0.20 brs

1.50 hrs

1.55 hrs

2.10 hrs

1.00 hrs

2.10 hrs

1.25 hrs

$180.00

$325.00
$35.00

$487.50

$271.25

$945.00

$325.00

$367.50

$562.50
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10/29/2013
10/29/2013

10/30/2013

10/30/2013
10/31/2013

10/31/2013

16/31/2013

SEJ
TBH

RGIV

REG
RGIV

RGIV

REG

deposition; review T. Hunter email; review
L. Schwartz email.

Review and calendar deposition notices.
Telephone conference with J. Pleifer and J.
Gainer in preparation for J. Pfeiffer’s
deposition;conference with Richard Gray IV
and R. Gray re:same.

Review and reply to emails from W. Pierce
re: SAS Model and Everman data; review
email from counsel re: Everman ISA
comparisons; review comparisons.

Review deposition notice of D. Duna.
Review emails from counsel of record re;
scheduling order.

Review article re: Education Week, Critics
See Risks in Use of Bonds for School Tech
Projects; email counsel and R. Freeman re:
thoughts on same; review and reply to email
from counsel and J. Pfeifer re: Carroll ISD;
research Carroll ISD re: TRE failure.
Review R. Freeman email; review article re:
use of bond funds; review emails; review
documents; work re: deposition prepsration,
review S. Dahlberg email; reply'to same;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review S.
Dahiberg email; review H/Mcintush email;
review D. Hinojosa email: reply to same;
review R. Freeman email; review B.
Schulman emaii.

TIMEREEPER RECALP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partacr 48.80 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 82.90 hrs @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 12.90 hrs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan - Paralegal 3.45 hrs @

Fee Recap Totals 148.05
3102-01 Invoice # 44909

450.00 /fhr
1'75.00 for
325.00 Mr
100.00 Mr

0.75 hrs
1.70 hrs

1.15 hrs

0343 hrs
0.10 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

$0.00
$552.50

$201.25

$67.50
$17.50

$175.00

$675.00

$40,785.00

$21,960.00
$14,507.50
$ 4,192.50

$ 125.00

$40,785.00
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GRAY & BECKER. P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

MNovember 30, 2013

Tax ID No.: T4-2427406
Invoice#: 45121-1 REG
Ouwr file#: 3102 00001
Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 11/30/2013

Atin: Ray Freeman
email to ray@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROELESSHINATL SERMICES
11/01/2613 REG Review (partial) of expert reports; review R. 1.45 hrs $652.50
Freeman emails (2); reply to same (2);
review R. Freeman email; review S.
Dahlberg correspondence re: Scheduling

Order.

11/01/2013 TBH Review information provided by W. Pierce: 0.20 hrs $65.00
on Carroll ISD and Eagle Mt. Saginaw.

11/03/2013 REG Review Cortez report; review Zamors 2.25 hrs $1.612.50

report; review Charters’ expert regorts and
slides; review J. Merifield report; review C.
Clark expert report; review C. Cullwell
report.
11/04/2013 RGIV  Review and reply to emaii from W, Pierce 2.95 hrs $516.25
re; corrections to be made and data review;
conference with counsel re: upcoming
depositions; review information on
upcoming depcnents; email T, Hunter re:
same; telephone conference with W. Pierce,
T. Wolff; and R. Freeman re: data;
confercuce with counsel re: same.
11/04/2013 REG Woik re: deposition preparation; confer 1.10 hrs $495.00
with R. Gray, IV re: depositions; review W,
Lierce email; review C. Diamond email;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: call with W.
Pierce and Tim re: data calculations and

analysis.

1140572013 RGIV  Review emails from counsel re: deposition 0.35 hrs $61.25
of J. Pfeifer; review data re: same.

11/05/2013 REG Confer with R, Gray, IV re: D. Frost 0.50 hrs $225.00

deposition; review emails; reply to same;
telephone conference with D. Thompson re:
deposition strategy.
117052013 TBH Review Writ of Mandamus, plaintiffs let to 0.20 hrs $65.00

3102-0] Invoice # 45121 Page ]




11/06/2013 RGIV

11/06/2013 REG

11/07/2013 RGIV

11/07/2013 REG

3102-01

3rd Court and emails concerning same.
Review emails from counsel of record re: 5.80 hrs
mandamus, motion to stay, deposition dates,
defending depositions. etc; attend deposition
of Dr. Diane Frost; review Intervenor's
Motion for Stay and Mandamus; review
email from counsel of record re: motions o
compel.

Review M. Jacobs email; review S. 4.95 hrs
Dahlberg emails (2); review M,
Trachtenberg emails (3); reply to same;
review 5. Dahlberg emails (4); reply to
same; review Writ of Mandamus; review
Motion to Stay; email W. Pierce re: same;
review H. Mclntush email; review exhibits
for Dr. Frost deposition; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: deposition; review D. Hinojosa
emails (9); reply to same; review M, Lober
email; review M. Jacobs email; review
response to State’s Motion to Strike Dr.
Klusmann; review T. Hunter email; review
P. Fraissinet email; review A. Saberian
emails (2); review C. Pacheco email re. Unr.
Rolle; review State’s amended witpess iist;
email clients re: same; review 1. Pera email;
review Calhoun discovery to Sate; review
R. Freeman emails (3); review T. Robertson
email; reply to same; revi¢w S. Rosen email
re: scheduling; review revised report of Dr.
Cortez: review R. Freeman emails (2);
review M. Trachtenverg correspondence;
telephone call t6 8. Freeman and W. Pierce
re: status; revissw C. Pacheco email; review
E. Vinson =mail; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
D. Frosiaeposition; review C. Diamond
emai}; 1eply to 5. Rosen email.

Peview email from M. Trachtenberg re: 2.75 hrs
cunference call; conference with counsel re:
same and depositions; telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: data issues; conference
call with plaintiff's counsel re: State's
witnesses and depositions of same; review
testimony of J. Pfeifer re: cross examination
and deposition preparation.

Review T. Roberison email; reply to same; 2.35 hus
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
P. Fraissinet email; reply to same; review H.
MciIntush email; review T. Robertson email;

Invoice # 45121

$1,015.00

$2,227.50

$481.25

$1,057.50

Page 2




11/07/2013 SEJ

11/08/2013 RGIV

11/08/2013 REG

11/09/2013 REG

11/09/2013 TBH
11/10/2013 REG

1171172013 RGIV

3102-01

confer with R. Gray, IV re: deposition
coverage; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review 5. Rosen email; review M.,
Trachtenberg email; review amended
scheduling order; telephone conference with
attorneys re: status and strategy; review C.
Diamond email; review D. Hinojosa emails
(2); review B. Schulman email; review 8.
Dahlberg email; review H. MclIntush email;
review correspondence re: mandamus
action; review amended deposition notice
for A. Rolle.

Review and calendar amended notice of 0.50 hes
deposition for A. Rolle; review an compare
Amended Scheduling Order; calendar

additional deadline.

Email T. Hunter re: deposition preparation 3.45 hrs
of J. Pfeifer; prepare for deposition prep of

J. Pleifer.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review 1.55 hrs

emails; reply to same; review M. Jacobs
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
deposition dates; review H. McIntush ¢mail;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review M,
Jacobs emails (2) re: depositions; review L
Pena email; review H. MclIntusi email;
review H. McIntush email; 1eview D.
Hinojosa emails (2); review M. Jacobs
email; review M. Jacobs email; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: same: review M. Jacobs
emails (2); review k. Fraissinet.

Review Motion for Stay and Writ of 1.25 hrs
Mandamus; ~9:& re: reply to same.

Prepare for deposition of Jerilyn Pfiefer. 1.50 hrs
Review ¢, Moreno email; review H. Q.75 hrs
Mclrtush email; work re: responding to stay

application.

acview MALDEF discovery; email M. 4.80 hrs

Bono and D. Hinojosa re: same; review
response 1o Intervenor’s Motion for
Emergency Stay; conference with counsel
re: same; review email from T. Hunter re:
deposition of I. Pfeifer and preparation for
same; reply to email from H. McIntush and
plaintiff's counsel re: edits and comments to
Response to Intervenor's Emergency Stay;
review emails from H. McIntush re: back up
data for report of Lynn Moak; prepare for

Invoice #45121

$0.00

$603.75

$657.50

$562.50

$487.50
$337.50

$840.00

Page 3




1171172013 REG

11/11/2013 SEJ

11/11/2013 TBH

11/12/2013 RGIV

11/12/2013 REG

310201

deposition preparation of J. Pfeifer; review

and reply to email from T. Hunter re:

Response to Intervenor’s Motion for Stay;

deposition preparation with T. Hunter and J.

Pfeifer; meeting with T. Hunter re: same;

create exhibits for deposition.

Review D. Hinojosa email; confer with R. 2.45 hrs
Gray, IV re: deposition preparation; review

emails; reply to same; review revised draft

reply to stay request; confer with R. Gray,

IV re: same; review M. Trachienberg email;

reply to same; review M. Bono email;

review message from P. Colbert; telephone

call to P. Colbert - left message; review M.

Trachtenberg email; telephone conference

with P. Colbert re: trial status; review L.

Pena email; review material re: Dr. Zamora

report; review H. Mclntush email; review D.

Hinojosa emails (2); review revised brief;

review D, Thompson emails (2); reply to

same (2); review final draft of stay reply;

review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); reply.ic

same.

Review email from court reporter re..I: 0.40 hrs
Pleifer deposition; confer with R. Cray, IV

re: status; email court reporter (¢ same;

review message from J. Gaynor re:

documents for Dr. Pfeifer| t:lephone call to

J. Gaynor - left messags

Review response to Motion for Stay; 3.00 hrs
conference with Richard Gray I'V re: same;

conference with Jerilyn Pfiefer and richard

Gray IV in preparation for J. Pliefer's

deposition!

Deposition of 1. Pleifer; conference with 4.55 hrs
legal assistant re: same; format and print

exiibits; conference with counsel re: same;

elephone conference (message left) with M.

Bono and D. Hinojosa re: Moak Report.

Email client re: 3rd Court filing; partial 1.90 hrs
attendance at deposition of Dr. Pleifer;

review H. McIntush emails (5) re: L. Moak

data; review correspondence from M.

Trachtenberg; review Edgewood’s amended

admissions; review S. Rosen email; review

message from D. Hinojosa; review State’s

amended disclosures; review B. Chester

email; review Rule 11 agreement; review

Invoice # 45121

$1,102.50

$0.00

$975.00

$796.25

$855.00

Page 4




1171212013 TBH
11/13/2013 RGIV

1171372013 REG

11/14/2013 RGIV

11/14/2013 RGIV

11/14/2013 REG

3102-01

W. Pierce email.

Attend deposition of Jerilyn Phiefer.
Telephone conference with W. Pierce and
R. Gray Il re: data and deposition; format
and print exhibits; Telephone conference
with D. Hinojosa and M. Bono re: Moak
Report; conference with counsel re: same;
telephone conference with W. Pierce and A.
Cortez re: 1.17 data; send same to M. Bono
and D. Hinojosa; review State’s Motion to
Strike Superintendent of Spring Branch as a
witness; review Fort Bend's reply to same.
Confer with R. Gray, IV re: expert reports;
review State's amended disclosure replies;
review T. Robertson email; review D.
Hinojosa email; telephone conference with
W. Pierce and R. Gray, I'V re: deposition
preparation, exhibits and status; review 1.
Pena email; review revised report of A.
Cortez; forward to clients; review M. Jacobs
email; review H. McIntush email re:
exhibits; review L. Halpern email; forward
to W, Pierce; confer with R. Gray, [V r=. D.
Hinojosa and M. Bono call; review Ii.
Hinojosa email; review M. Bono cmwail;
review 5. Dahiberg email; revicw emails re:
backup data; review W. Pierce emails (2);
reply to same (2); review ¥ Bono email.
Reviéw and reply to ematt from T. Hunter
re: sending of Moak Report to J. Pfeifer;
send Moak Report io J. Pfeifer; prepare for
deposition of Alhart Cortez; conference
with counsel r¢: same; telephone conference
with D. Hiacjosa re: expert report of Lynn
Moak; conference with counsel re: same;
email ). Hinojosa questions for A, Cortez
denusition; conference with legal assistant
ro; deposition notice of M. Martinez; review
and reply to email from D. Hinojosa re:
same; review and reply to emails from
counsel re: deposition dates; review and
reply to email from W. Pierce re: deposition
of A. Cortez.

Review and reply to email from D.
Thompson re;: Culwell withdraw;
conference with counsel re: same.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); reply to
same; confer with R. Gray, IV re: 11/14

Invoice # 45121

2.50 hrs
4.15 hrs

2.10 hus

3.05 hrs

0.10 hrs

3.40 hrs

$812.50
$726.25

$945.00

$533.75

$17.50

$1,530.00

Page 5




11/14/2013 SEI
11/15/2013 RGIV

11715/2013 REG

11/16/2013 REG

11/18/2013 RGIV

310201

hearing; confer with R. Gray, IV re: A,
Cortez deposition; review S. Dahlberg email
re: deposition; review M. Jacobs emails (3);
review M. Bono email; review D. Hinojosa
email; telephone conference with D,
Hinojosa re: L. Moak report and testimony;
telephone call to L. Moak - left message;
review H. MclIntush emails (2); review M.
Bono emails (2); review M. Jacobs emails
(2); telephone conference with L. Moak re:
deposition preparation and report; review L.
Schwartz email; review S. Dahlberg email;
email D. Hinojosa re: deposition; review
notice re: mandamus denied; email client re:
same; review C. Pacheco email; reply to
same; review M. Jacobs email; review S.
Dahlberg email; review emails re:
depositions; review H. McIntush email;
review D. Hinojosa email re: depositions.
Review and calendar deposition notices.
Travel to San Antonio for the Deposition of
Albert Cortez; deposition of Albert Cortez:
return to office from San Antonio;
conference with counsel re: same; review
and reply to email from plaintiff's counsel
re: deposition of Shannon Houscon.

Review D. Thompson emails (2); review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same;
review S. Beaulieu depostiion notice;
review Grusendorf deposition notice; review
email from court ceporter; review M. Wills
email; review deniosition notice of M.
Martinez; revicw D. Hinojosa emails (3);
review M. Jzcobs email; review P.
Fraissipeit email; review C. Pacheco email;
review M. Skidmore email; review L.
Helpern email; review H. McIntush emails
{2); review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review M. Jacobs emails (5); review
D. Hinojosa email; review Motion to
Amend filed by Charters; confer with R.
(iray, IV re: A. Cortez deposition.

Review emails re: L. Moak deposition;
reply to same.

Review emails from W. Pierce re: TIF in
Carroll and Northwest ISD; forward same to
R. Gray III; review emails from various
counsel re: rescheduling of depositions.

Invoice # 45121

0.20 hrs
9.80 hrs

2.35 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.85 hrs

$0.00
$1,715.00

$1,057.50

$135.00

$148.75
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1171872013

11/19/2013

11/19/2013

11/16/2013

11/20/2013

11/20/2013

11/20/2013

310201

REG

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

Review T. Hunter email re: L. Moak
deposition; review W. Pierce email re:
Carroll 1SD; review W, Pierce email re:
Northwest ISD and TIF (3); review H.
MclIntush email; review email re: B.
Hammond deposition; review email re: L.
Moak deposition; review deposition notice
for J. Merifield; review C. Diamond email
re: R. Eisler; review 8. Hernandez email;
review H. McIntush email; review L.
Schwartz email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review L. Halpern email; review S.
Hemandez S. Hernandez emails (2); reply to
S. Dahlberg email; review State’s expert
designation.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
deposition preparation and report and
backup data for Lisa Dawn-Fisher; review
same; conference with legal assistant re;
same; format and print backup data for
expert report of L. D. Fisher; telephone
conference with W, Pierce re: same;
conference with legal assistant re:
deposition notice for L. Dawn-Fishep:
review, format, and print backup aata for
report of L. Dawn-Fisher of Ocwober trial;
begin review and comparison of both
datasets; conference with counsel re; same.
Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review S. Dahlberg email; review H.
MclIntush email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
L. Dawn-Fisher docurnents; review email
re: L. Dawn-Fisher deposition; confer with
R. Gray, I'V re: noticing deposition; prepare
for B. Fammond deposition.

Prepare and serve deposition notice for Lisa
Diuwi-Fisher.

®eview and compare dataets of L.
Dawn-Fisher for 2012 trial and 2014
reopening.

Review emails from A. Siberian re:
intervenors motion for emergency relief and
petition for mandamus; review email from
M. Trachtenberg re: plainsiffs response to
same.

Review D. Thompson emails (2); review D.
Hinojosa email; review emails re: B.
Hammond deposition; attend B. Hammond

Invoice # 45121

2.30 hrs

6.85 tus

1.50 hrs

0.25 hrs

2.45 hrs

0.20 hrs

3.75 hus

$1,035.00

$1,198.75

$675.00

$25.00

$428.75

$35.00

$1,687.50

Page 7




1172172013 RGIV

112172013 RGIV

11/21/2013 RGIV

112122013 REG

1172272013 RGIV

11/22/2013 REG

3102-01

deposition; review H. Mcintush email re: G.
Sconzo; review 3. Rosen email.

Review plaintiff's response to intervenor’s
writ of mandamus; conference with counsel
te: same.

Review Writ of Mandamus; email counsel
Te: comunents on same.

Review emails from plaintiffs counsel re:
plaintiffs response to intervenors motion for
emergency relief and writ of mandamus;
review intervenors motion for emergency
relief and writ of mandamus.

Review A, Saberian emails (5); review
Motion to Stay; review Petition for
Mandamus; review M. Trachtenberg emails
{3); reply to same; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; email
clients re: Supreme Court filings; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review M.
Jacobs email; review M. Trachtenberg letter
to Supreme Court; review email from Clerk
re: Supreme Court filing; review C. Pachecs
email; review Fifth Amended Petition Gf
Charters; review D. Hinojosa emajl: review
H. Mclntush email; review deposition notice
of D. Casey; work re: exhibits.

Review and compare backup data for L.
Dawn-Fisher testimony from October trial
and present; review and forward email of
Dr. Pfeifer depositica wanscript to counsel;
send same to Dr. Pieifer for review and to
make any necessary changes; review email
from M. Trachwenberg re: edits to
Mandamus rzsponse; review edits to same
and reply o email; email W. Pierce re:
telephoine conference re: deposition; review
and reply to email from legal assistant re:
same.

Review Mandamus Petition; review and
revise reply; prepare for C. Clark
deposition; review notice from Supreme
Court; review H. McIntush email; review D.
Hinojosa emails; review J. Pleifer
deposition; attend deposition of Dr. Clark;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
H. McIntush emails (2); review M. Bono
emails (3); review D. Frost deposition
transcript; review M. Trachtenberg email;

Invoice # 45121

0.75 hss

0.90 hrs

1.30 brs

2.15 hes

1.60 hrs

5.05 hrs

$131.25

$157.50

$227.50

$967.50

$280.00

$2,272.50
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11/23/2013 REG

1172412013 REG
1172512013 RGIV

11/25/2013 REG

11/26/2013 REG

11/27/2013 REG

3102-01

email clients re: same; review S. Dahlberg
email; review S. Hernandez email; review
revised charts.

Review H. McIntush email; review J.
Wisnoski presentation; review S. Dahlberg
email; review L. Schwartz email; review
State's Petition for Mandamus; review E.
Vinson emails (2); review M. Trachtenberg
emails (2); review D. Thompson emails;
reply to same; review D. Hinojosa email,
review P. Fraissinet emails (2); review S.
Dahlberg email; work re: preparation and
organization of exhibits; work re:
preparation for W. Pierce deposition.

Work re: exhibits.

Review deposition testimony of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; review and reply to emails re:
deposition of W. Pierce; email with counsel
Fe: saime.

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;

work re: mandamus reply to Supreme Cour:

confer with W. Pierce and staff re:
deposition preparation; review L. Halpera
email; reply to same; review S. Dahlherg
email; review deposition notice ot G.
Sconzo; review email from cowa? reporter;
review S. Dahlberg email; review revised
Mandamus Petition; telepbane conference
with 1. Pena re: phone devosition; review C.
Pacheco email; review 2. Vinson email
review I, Pena email.

Review C. Diamond emails (2); reply to
same; reviev-E. Vinson emails (2); review
B. Schulman emails (2); review email from
Suprems Court; review M. Trachtenberg
emails {2); reply to same; review D.
Hincjosa emails (3); reply to same; review
©, Thompson email; confer with W. Pierce
pre-deposition; present W. Pierce for
deposition; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D, Hinojosa email,

Email W. Pierce re: deposition follow up;
review M. Trachtenberg emails {3); email
clients re: mandamus; reply to M.
Trachtenberg; review D. Hinojosa email;
review D. Thompson email; review J.
Turner email; review email re: Dr. Cortez
deposition; review W. Pierce email; reply to

Invoice # 45121

3.50 tus

0.75 hus
4.00 hrs

5.40 hrs

9.55 hrs

1.80 hrs

$1,575.00

$337.50
$700.00

$2,430.00

$4,297.50

$810.00

Page 9




same; review W. Pierce email; begin review
of L. Dawn-Fisher material.
117292013 REG Review notices from Supreme Court (2) re: 1.35 hus $607.50
mandamus and stay request denied; begin
review of L. Dawn-Fisher material.

11/30/2013 REG Work re: L. Dawn-Fisher analysis. 1.25 hrs $562.50
$43,193.75

TIMERKEEPER RECAT
REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 67.00 lus @ 450.00 /hr $30,150.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 60.65 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $10,613.75
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 7.40 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $ 240500
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal ].35 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 2500
Fee Recap Totals 136.40 $43,193.75

3102-01 Invoice # 45121 Page 10




GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512,482.0061

December 31, 2013

Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition
Atm: Ray Freeman
email to ray@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROVESSIONAL SERVICES |

12/01/2013 REG Work re: deposition preparation; additional
work re: L. Dawn-Fisher analysis; review
designation of fact and expert witnesses.

12/02/2013 RGIV  Review emails re; deposition dates, backup
data for L. Dawn-Fisher; conference with
legal assistant re: same; conference with
counsel re: differences in new backup data
for L. Dawn-Fisher; review changes;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review and reply to email from T. Hunter re:
corrections to deposition of J. Pleifer; email
J. Pfeifer re: same; email S. Dahlberg re:
omitted tabs from previous L. Dawn-Fisher
dataset; email 5. Dahlberg re: needed
programs to analyze L. Dawn-Fisher's
numbers and calculations; review exhibits
for reonening; meeting with R, Gray Il re:
L. Diawn-Fisher backup data.

12/02/2013 REG Pewiew updated charts from L.
Dawn-Fisher; review A, Cortez deposition;
review T. Hunter email; review email re: L.
Dawn-Fisher materials; review S. Dahlberg
emails (2); review H. McIntush email;
review J. Wisnoski presentation; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Thompson
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits
and L. Dawn-Fisher data.

12/02/2013 SEJ Review and calendar Sconzo deposition.

12/02/2013 TBH Make corrections on Pfeifer deposition;

3102-01 Invoice # 45419

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 45419-1
Qur file# 2102
Billing through:

1.75 hrs

5.15 hrs

1.65 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.50 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
12/31/2013

$787.50

$901.25

$742.50

$0.00
$162.50

Page 1




12/03/2013

12/03/2013

12/03/2013

12/04/2013

12/04/2013

12/05/2013

12/05/2013

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

REG

e-mail conference with R. Gray re: same.
Review and reply to email from J. Pfeifer
re: deposition review; email W, Pierce re:
meeting on exhibits; review email from T.
Hunter re: deposition corrections; fill out
correction sheet for deposition of J. Pfeifer;
email TSG Reporting re: same; review and
reply to email from W. Pierce re: meeting;
conference with legal assistant re: tabs for
exhibit binders and deposition of Monica
Martinez; prepare for deposition of M.
Martinez; meegting with W. Pierce and R.
Freeman re: exhibits and backup data of L.
Dawn-Fisher; make exhibit binders; email
W. Pierce re: L. Dawn-Fisher dataset for
October trial.

Work on exhibits; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: same; confer with R. Gray re: status.
Review email to W. Pierce; review M. Bouo
email; review Power Point; review H.
MclIntush email; confer with R. Gray, 1V re:
preparation for M. Martinez deposidon.
Reply to email from W, Pierce r=:2012
backup data for L. Dawn-Fisher, search for
same; conference with legal assistant re:
same; attend deposition of Monica
Martinez; conference with counsel re: same.
Review B. Hammornd deposition transcript;
review L. Moak report and data; review
State’s response to Edgewood discovery;
confer with ®, Gray, IV re: M. Martinez
deposition; review errata pages for D. Frost
deposition.

Review and reply to email from W. Pierce
te: programs for LDF backup data; review
cmail from S. Dahlberg re: Rule 11
Agreement on databases; review responsive
emails re: same.

Confer with attorneys re: S. Beaulieu
deposition; review J. Turner email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review §.
Dahlberg email; review S. Dahlberg email;
reply to same; review M. Jacobs email;
review C. Diamond email; review 8.
Dahlberg email; reply to same; review H.
McIntush email; review S. Dahlberg emails

Invoice # 45419

5.25 hrs

7.00 hrs

0.90 hrs

4.25 hrs

1.15 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.60 hrs

$918.75

$3,150.00

$405.00

$743.75

$517.50

$70.00

$720.00

Page 2




12/05/2013 SEJ

12/06/2013 RGIV

12/06/2013 REG

12/08/2013 REG

12/09/2013 RGIV

12/09/2013 REG

3102-01

(2); review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to

same; review D. Hinojosa emails (2);

review amended deposition notice; review

L. Schwartz email; review D, Thompson

email.

Review and calendar amended deposition 0.10 hrs
notice for J, Wisnoski,

Review emails from counsel of record re: 0.30 hrs
deposition of J. Wisnoski and Findings of

Fact.

Review S. Dahlberg emails (2); review D. 0.5% hrs
Hinojosa email; reply to same; review H.

McIntush email re; findings; confer with

attorneys re: same; review M. Jacobs email.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; review M. 0.35 hrs
Bono emails (2); review H. McIntush

emails.

Review emails from counsel of record re: 3.95 hrs

findings of fact and conclusions of law,
reply to H. Mcintush re: same; review
emails re: Rule 11 Agreement on expetic
programs; review email and article irom W,
Pierce re: mootness and ripeness; teview
State’s Response to Edgewood’s Request for
Production, Admissions, and
Interrogatories; conference with legal
assistant re: October trial exhibit list; review
outline of proposed FOF and COL,; review
and reply to emzdi from H, Mclntush re;
same; review and reply to email from office
manager re:@xhibit binders; review email
from J. Pfcifer re: deposition corrections;
fill out comrection sheet to deposition of J.
Fieifer, review emails from plaintiffs
counsel re: FOF and COL; research re:
Zhannon Housson; review email from S.
Hemmandez re: Rule 11 Agreement on
Computer Programs; conference with
counsel re; same; reply to all re: edits and
comments on Rule 11 Agreement; review
and reply to email from W, Pierce re: L.
Dawn-Fisher data and deposition
corrections; continue corrections on
deposition of J. Pfeifer; review and reply to
email from T. Hunter re: same.

Review Motion to Strike Charier's Amended 2.20 hrs

Invoice # 45419

$0.00

$52.50

$225.00

$157.50

$691.25

$990.00

Page 3




12/09/2013 SEJ

12/10/2013 RGIV

12/10/2013 REG

12/10/2013 SEJ

3102-01

Petition; review H. McIntush emails (4);
review M. Jacobs emails (2); review D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review S. Dahlberg email; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same; review W. Pierce
email; review M. Jacobs email; review C,
Diamond email re: de-designation of
witnesses; review D. Hinojosa email; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: 8. Housson deposition;
review emails re: exhibits; review D.
Hinojosa email; review L. Schwartz email.
Review email from C. Diamond re: 010 hrs
cancelling depositions of Dr. Merrifield and
K. Grusendorf; revise calendars.

Review email from TSG Reporting re: 4.50 hrs
deposition of W. Pierce; forward same to
W. Pierce for review and corrections;
review and reply to email from S. Dahlberg
re: Rule 11 Agreement; review and reply to
email from J. Pfeifer re: signature page for
deposition corrections; order exhibis for
January reopening of the evidepco; review
email from counsel re: conference call on
order of witnesses amongst oiaintiffs
counsel; email S, Dahlbeizie: exhibits of
LDF; review same; review email from J.
Pfeifer re: depositien signature page; draft
Protective Order ior Computer Programs
and Computer Program Backup Fies;
conference with legal assistant and counsel
re: same.

Review W. Pierce deposition transcript; 4.65 hrs
attend deposition of S. Housson; email
attorneys re: strategy meeting; review D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review H. McIntush email; reply to
same; review D. Thompson email; review S.
Dahlberg email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson emails (2); confer with R. Gray,
IV re: protective order; reply to emails;
review draft protection order; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re:; L. Dawn-Fisher 0.70 hrs
trial exhibits; review Defendants’ exhibits,
L. Dawn-Fisher trial testimony; confer with

Invoice # 45419

$0.00

$787.50

$2,092.50

$70.00

Page 4




12/11/2013 RGIV

12/11/2013 REG

12/11/2013 SEJ

12/1272013 RGIV

12/12/2013 REG

3102-01

R. Gray, IV re: same; confer with R. Gray,

IV re; errata for J. Pfeifer; telephone

conference with court reporter re: A, Cortez

transcript; confer with R, Gray, IV re: same;

email court reporter and counsel re: J.

Pfeifer Errata.

Draft summary and proffer of Dr. Pfeifer's 4.45 hrs
deposition testimony for reopening hearing;

email T. Hunter and legal assistant re:

additional cormrections to be made; email W.

Pierce re: exhibits to deposition transcript;

conference with counsel re: same; review

and reply to email from D. Hinojosa re:

protective order langauge; review email

from W. Pierce re: data needed to verify

backup data and tabs for LDF; email S.

Dahiberg re: same; review and reply to

email from W. Pierce re: deposition

corrections; review and reply to email frora

S. Dahlberg re: presentation used in the

direct of LDF.

Work re: exhibits and L. Dawn-Fisher 1.20 hrs
deposition preparation; review d«pusition

transcript; confer with R. Gray, TV re: same;

review emails re: protective order,

Confer with R. Gray, IV 1evexhibits to W. 0.20 hrs
Pierce deposition; prepare CD of exhibits

and forward to W. Picice.

Review and rep'y to email from D. Hinojosa 5.90 hrs
re: Protective Order and wording of same;

review email from W. Pierce re: exhibit;

insert tabs.into exhibit binders and organize

same; Teview any reply to emails from

plaintiifs counsel re: findings of fact and

conclusions of law; review and reply to

cmail from H. McIntush re: cross-references

in equity section of same; highlight

cross-references and email back to H.

MclIntush; conference with counsel re;

witnesses for January reopening and order

of same; review and reply to D. Hinojosa re:

same; review email from T. Hunter and W.

Pierce re: deposition testimony of J. Pfeifer;

conference with legal assistant re: exhibit

binders.

Review State’s response to Calhoun County; 2.05 hrs

Invoice # 45419

$778.75

$540.00

$0.00

$1,032.50

$922.50

Page §




12/1372013

12/13/2013

12/13/2013
12/14/2013

12/14/2013

12/15/2013

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

email W. Pierce re: same; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); review W. Pierce
email; confer with R, Gray, IV re: protective
order issues; review H. McIntush email;
review W. Pierce email; review D. Hinojosa
emails; review emails re: programs and
database; review court reporter
correspondence re: A, Cortez deposition;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: witness
presentation and order; review H. McIntush
email; review H. Mcintush email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review M. Jacobs email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: findings; review W, Pierce
email; reply to same; review M. Jacobs
email.

Review emails re: Protective Order; 3.85 hrs
conference with legal assisant re: exhibit
binders; review emails re: witness list;
telephone conference with plaintiffs covasel
re: witnesses and order of witnesses fox
trial; conference with counsel re: same;
email M. Trachtenberg, H. Mcntusia, M,
Bono, and M. Jacobs re: FOF; roview Hanes
and Boone sections to FOF and edit same;
email same to plaintiffs.

Review M. Jacobs emaiis (2); review M., 1.60 hrs
Trachtenberg emai); icview M. Bono email
with Findings (), review M. Jacobs email;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; conference call
with attorneys re: scheduling and witnesses;
review M. Jacobs email.

Work'on exhibit notebooks; confer with R. 2.00 hrs
Cray, IV re: same.
Review emails re: Findings (3); work re; L. 2.50 hrs

Dawn-Fisher deposition preparation; work

re: exhibits preparation.

Email to W. Pierce and review response re; 2.00 hrs
discrepancy in Pfeifer testimony; review

RGIV’s summary of Pfeifer deposition;

make redline comments to same; draft

alternative summary.

Review email from M. Jacobs re: edits to 2.15 hrs
MAILDEF's draft of FOF, review and edit

same; email same to H. Mcintush.

Invoice # 45419

$673.75

$720.00

$200.00

$1,125.00

$650.00

$376.25

Page 6




12/15/2013 REG
12/16/2G13 RGIV

12/16/2013 REG

12/17/2013 RGIV

12/17/2013 REG

12/18/2013 RGIV

3102-01

Review emails re: Findings.

Review email and attached petition from W.
Pierce re: Seguin lawsuit on bond election;
conference with counsel re: same; reply to
email from W. Pierce re: same; email W.
Pierce re: protective order program
language; email §. Dahlberg re: same;
format and print backup data for LDF;
conference with counsel re: same; revise
Protective Order to add language regarding
protected programs and spreadsheets;
review and reply to email from H. McIntush
re: same; meeting at equity center re:
deposition of LDF; review and reply to
email from H. McIntush re: protective .
order; email plaintiffs counsel re: findings
of fact.

Review W. Pierce email; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review emails re:
protective order; review errata sheet for L.
Moak deposition; review M. Jacobs em.ail;
review C. Jenson email; confer with W.
Pierce and R. Freeman preparaticn for L.
Dawn-Fisher deposition; review zourt
reporter correspondence re: b) Hammond
deposition; review J. Diewz email re:
Findings; review D. Hicojosa email; review
M. Trachtenberg email.

Review emails frcm H. MclIntush re:
findings of fact and additions to Equity
section; drafi-new findings of fact re:
compresscdtax rate section; conference
with counsel re: same; telephone conference
with W' Pierce re: same; review all findings
of f2¢t in preparaion for conference call;
Telephone conference with plaintiffs
counsel re: findings of fact and conclusions
of law.

Review emails; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
Findings; review W. Pierce emails (2); work
re: L. Dawn-Fisher deposition preparation;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce emails.

Create FOF for Compressed Tax Rate gaps;
review Protective Order language sent by H.
McIntush; forward same to D. Hinojosa and

Invoice # 45419

0.50 hrs
5.15 hrs

3.40 hrs

6.93 hrs

1.05 hrs

6.35 hrs

$225.00
$901.25

$1,530.00

$1,216.25

$472.50

$1,111.25
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12/18/2013

1211972013

12/19/2013

12/19/2013
1212012013

12/20/2013

3102-01

REG

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

REG

M. Bono for review and comment; review
emails from W. Pierce re: Tier | findings of
fact and FY 15 numbers; review email from
S. Dahlberg re: updated master dataset for
L. Dawn-Fisher; forward same to W, Pierce
and R. Freeman; review and reply to email
from H. McIntush re: additional findings of
fact; review and reply to email from W,
Pierce re: 313 Agreements and LDF updated
data; review and reply to email from D.
Hinojosa re: deposition of L. Dawn-Fisher;,
telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:
same; review L. Dawn-Fisher revised data
set from January of 2013; compare to
current data set; review and reply to email
from D. Hinojosa re: same.

Review H. McIntush email; review G. 2.35 hrs
Sconzo email exhibits; confer with R. Gray,
IV re: Findings; complete preparation for L.
Dawn-Fisher deposition; review H.
Mclntush email; confer with R. Gray, 1V re:
same; review emails re; scheduling and
Findings; review 8. Dahlberg email; email
R. Gray, IV re: same; review R. Gray, IV
email; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa emails (2); reply
to same; review emails t2: protective order;
review R. Gray, IV euiail; review D.
Hinojosa email;reply to same.

Prepare for deposition of L. Dawn-Fisher; 8.00 hrs
attend depositicn; meeting with D. Hinojosa
and W. Pierce re: data year to use.

Review court reporter correspondence; 7.80 hrs
coirpizie preparation for L. Dawn-Fisher
devusition; attend L. Dawn-Fisher
Jdeposition; review M. Jacobs email and
Rule 11 agreement; review M. Bono; review
L. Schwariz email.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; begin 1.50 hrs
marking exhibits.

Review and reply to email from S. Dahlberg 0.20 hrs
re: Protective Order.

Review D. Thompson email; review M. 1.25 hrs

Bono email; work re: findings; review H.
Meclntush email; review D. Casey revised
report; review S. Dahlberg email; review C.

Invoice # 45419

$1,057.50

$1,400.00

$3,510.00

$0.00

$35.00

$562.50

Page 8




12/21/2013

1212272013

12/23/2013

1272372013

12/24/2013

1272472013

12/26/2013

12/26/2013
12/27/2013

12/27/2013

12/27/2013

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

SEJ
RGIV

SEJ

Diamond email; review M. Jacobs emails
(2); review emails re: Rule 11 agreement on
confidential programs.

Review H. McIntush emails (2); review M.
Jacobs email; reply to same; review Rule 11
re: demonsirative exhibits; work re: exhibit
preparation.

Continue work re: exhibits, findings, and
Power Point presentation.

Meeting with counsel re: Reopening
Exhibts; conference with legal assistant re:
marking of same; create demonstratives;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
data and exhibits.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review
errata sheet re: Zamora deposition; review
M. Bono email; work re: exhibits, ﬁndings,
and Power Point; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: same; review draft slide for Power Poirn;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; work re:
exbibits and findings.

Build demonstrati ve irial exhibits; ¢mail
same to W. Pierce for conferenca <all;
telephone conference with W, Ficrce re:
possible data issues.

Review W. Pierce email; review D.
Thompson email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; confer with B, Gray, IV re: W, Pierce
call and Power Point presentation.

Review W. Pierce email; confer with R.
Gray, IV rexYower Point; work re: findings
and exhihits,

Work re: marking exhibits.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
exnibits; conference with counsel re: same.
Cunfer with R. Gray, IV re: proffer of J.
Pfeifer deposition; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: exhibits; telephone conference with W,
Pierce re: revisions to exhibits; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: exhibits and Power Point;
review email re: C. Clark deposition; review
W. Pierce email; work re: Power Point;
review H. McIntush email re: findings;
work re: findings.

Work re: marking exhibits {cont.); confer
with R. Gray, IV re: revised exhibits.

Invoice # 45419

3.75 hrs

2.50 hrs

585 hs

1.70 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.75 hrs

3.00 brs
0.35 hrs

1.25 hrs

3.00 hrs

$1,687.50

$1,125.00

$1,023.75

$765.00

$140.00

$225.00

$337.50

$0.00
$61.25

$562.50

$0.00

Page ©




12/28/2013 REG

127292013 REG

12/30/2013 RGIV

12/30/2013 REG

12/30/2013. SEJ

12/31/2013 RGIV

1273172013 REG

3102-01

Review C. Pacheo email; review notice of
intent to comply; review T. Hunter email re:
J. Pfeifer; review W. Pierce emails (3);
reply to same.

Review W, Pierce email; telephone call to
W. Pierce — left message; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: data issues
and exhibits,

Review email from W. Pierce re: deposition
corrections; review and edit same;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
meeting with R. Gray Ill, W. Pierce, and R.
Freeman re: data and exhibits; conference
with legal assistant re: same; review and
reply to email from D. Hinojosa re: Eratta
sheets and extension of same.

Review R. Freeman text; telephone
conference with R. Freeman re: 12/30
meeting; review W, Pierce email; review
data reports; review email re: Rule 1 ;
review message from R. Freeman; televhone
conference with R. Freeman re: exhihits;
confer with W. Pierce, R. Freeman and R.
Gray, IV re: data issues and exhibits; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review S,
Dahlberg email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
L. Dawn-Fisher progsain; review S.
Dahiberg email.

Review Notice »f Intent to Comply; confer
with R. Gray, TV re: revisions to W, Pierce's
deposition transcript; prepare errata sheet;
confer with R. Gray re: same; meet with
client re: errata sheet and verification;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.

Review and reply to email from M. Bono re:
oxhibt numbers.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review
I. Pena email; review L. Schwariz email;
review C. Diamond ermail; review D.
Thompson email; telephone conference with
W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: exhibits;
telephone call to R. Gray, IV - left message;
telephone conference with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa emails (2);
review M. Jacobs emails (2); reply to same;
(2); review errata sheet for W. Pierce

Invoice # 45419

0.75 hrs

0.35 hrs

3.55 hrs

2.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.90 hrs

$337.50

$157.50

$621.25

$1,125.00

$125.00

$17.50

$855.00
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deposition; review W. Pierce email; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same; reply to W,
Pierce email.
12/31/2013 SEJ Email counsel re: correction and signature 0.50 hrs
page for the deposition of W. Pierce; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same.

FIMERELPER RECAL

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 61.40 hrs @ 456.00 /br
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 7745 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 250 hs @ 325.00 /hr
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 12.55 hrs @ 100.00 fhr
Fee Recap Totals 153.90
310201 Invoice # 45419

$0.00

$42,391.25

$27,630.00
$13,553.75
$ 81250

_$ 30500

$42,391.25
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

January 31, 2014

Tax ID No.:
Invoice# 45595-1
Cur file# 3102

Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through:

Attn: Ray Freeman

email to ray(@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

 PROFESSION AL SERVICES

01/02/2014 RGIV

01/02/2014 REG

ARG

Review and rey to email from A. Pierce 4.65 hrs
re: updated FY14(13) and FY15(13) data;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
same; telephone conference with legal
assistant re: exhibits; telephone conference
with R. Gray III re: updated data and Sxpert
Report; email counsel of record re: same.
Review email re: exhibits; review email re: 3.10 hrs
L. Dawn-Fisher deposition; review W.
Pierce email; review R. Gray, IV email;
confer with S. Jennings re: exhibits; review
email re: data (WADA) changes; reply to
same; telephone conierence with R. Gray,
1V re: updated data exhibits; review C,
Diamond email: review S, Dahlberg email;
review H. Meintush email; reply to all;
review [, Hinojosa email; review S.
Dahlberg email; review emails re: exhibits
and data changes; telephone conference
with R. Gray, IV re: W. Pierce report update
and data; review M. Jacobs email re:
deposition exhibits; review S. Dahlberg
email; review M. Jacobs email re: exhibit
list (3); review W. Pierce email; review
supplemental report; email S. Jennings and
R. Gray, IV re: same; review errata sheet of
M. Martinez; review email from court
reporter; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review M. Jacobs emails (2); confer
with 8. Jennings re: exhibits; review W,

Invoice #43503

74-2427406
REG

01
01/31/2014

$813.75

$1,395.00

Page 1




01/03/2014

01/03/2014

(41/03/2014

01/04/2014

01/04/2014
01/05/2014
01/06/2014

3

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

SEJ

SEJ
RGIV

Review and reply to email from M. 0.65 hrs
Skidmore re: corrected data; telephone

conference with W. Pierce re: same;

telephone conference with legal assistant re:

exhibits; review and reply to emails re:

exhibit lists and exchanging of same;

telephone conference with legal assistant re:

same and marking of exhibits.

Review S. Dahlberg email; confer with R, 1.65 hrs
Gray, IV re: same; reply to S. Dahlberg

email; review T. Hunter email; reply to

same; review T. Hunter email; reply to

same; review L. Toenjes email with

attachments; forward to W. Pierce; forward

to W. Pierce; review errata sheet re: 8.

Housson; review L. Pena email; review

Maldef exhibit list; review T. Hunter email;

reply to same.

Continue work on exhibits; confer with R 7.00 hrs
Gray, IV re: status,

Review W. Pierce report re: W. Piercs 1.50 hrs
testimony; review M. Jacobs email; review

I. Pena email.

Work on exhibits and exhibit iist. 5.00 hrs
Work re: exhibits and exhibit dist. 1.75 hrs
Review emails from W. Pierce, A. Pierce, 8.25 hrs

and R. Gray Il re: dats and exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same; review
and edit Master Dieposition Exhibit List;
review emails from counsel of record re:
same; email sujted document to M. Jacobs;
conference with legal assistant re:; exhibits
and filing and serving of same; review
emaiis irom counsel of record re: exhibit
numbers and supplementing Master
Dieposition Exhibit List; review email from
M. Jacobs re: same; conference with
counsel re: status of exhibits; review
exhibits for service; conference with legal
assistant re: same and Exhibit List; revise
Deomstratives re; new exhibits; Telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: new data and
WADA counts; review email from State
Defendants re: Amended response to
Calhoun’s 3rd Interrogatory; conference
with counsel re: same; review attached

Invoice #45595

$113.75

$742.50

$700.00

$675.00

$500.00
$175.00
$1,443.75

Pape




01/06/2014 REG

01/06/2014 SEJ

01/07/2014 RGIV

01/07/2014 REG

FIGEARE

spreadsheets; sort and send same to counsel;
review all exhibts; prepare same for service
on all parties; serve exhibits, expert witness
list, fact witness list, and CDs on all parties
and file with court; conference with counsel
re: same and findings of fact.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review 5.50 hrs
emails re; exhibit list (5); review State’s
additional production; review D. Hinojosa
email; email S. Dahlberg re: production;
review D, Hinojosa email; work re: outline
of W. Pierce testimony; work re: review of
L. Dawn-Fisher deposition; analysis of
State’s production; review S. Dahlberg
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same;
review exhibit list; review master exhibit
list; review C. Diamond email with filings;
work re: demonstrative exhibits; review
response to Motion to Strike; review M.
Jacobs ematil; review master exhibit list;
review 3. Dahlberg email; review Rule 'l
agreement; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same.

Revise Exhibit List; draft, revice, finalize, 1.00 hrs
e-file and serve Designation of Expert
Witnesses and Fact Witness,

Review all parties pre‘irial filings of 6.95 hrs
Witness lists and exhibits; email legal
assistant re; bipdirs; conference with legal
assistant re: CD issues; conference with
counsel re: same; meeting with counsel re;
findings of fact; draft same; conference with
legal assistant re: exhibits; draft findings of
faci; aneeting with counsel re: cross
axamination of L. Dawn-Fisher.

Review Charter designations; review 6.25 hrs
Edgewood designations; review State’s
designations; review Ft. Bend designations;
review Calhoun designations; work re:
findings; review C. Diamond email; reply to
same; review L. Schwartz email; review P,
Fraissinet email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review S. Dahlberg email; review D,
Hinojosa email; work re: findings; work re:
W. Pierce direct; work re: opening
staternent; review Edgewood exhibits;

Invoice #45595

$2,475.00

$0.00

$1,216.25

$2,812.50

Page 3




review T. Hunter email; email M.
Trachtenberg and D. Thompson re: 1/9/14
meeting; review exhibit notebook; review
M. Jacobs email; review revised exhibit list.

01/07/2014 SEJ Work on exhibit notebocks; confer with R. 6.00 hrs $0.00
Gray, IV re: same.
01/08/2014 RGIV Draft findings of fact; conference with 7.65 hrs $1,338.75

counsel re: same; review and reply to email
from S. Dahlberg re: SAS Rule 11
Agreement; conference with counsel re:
same; forward subject programs to W.
Pierce; conference with counsel re: pretrial
hearing; email S. Dahlberg re: same;
meeting with counsel re: exhibits, findings
of fact, and trial strategy; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: exhibits;
review and reply to email from S. Dahlberg
re: TTSFC exhibits and possible redeposing
of Wayne; create more demonstratives for
trial.

01/08/2014 REG Review emails re: findings (9); reply ' 5.75 hrs $2,587.50
same; review S. Dahlberg email; review
Rule 11 agreement; confer with K Gray, IV
re: sending files and programs tc W. Pierce,
trial preparation activity; email D.
Thompson and M. Trachterberg re: trial
preparation; review [, .Thompson email;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to
same; review Rulz 11 agreement; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: findings; review S.
Dahlberg emai; review additional data;
review S. Oahlberg email re: pretrial
conference; review M. Trachtenberg email;
reply to'S. Dahlberg email; review L.
Sctiwartz email; review D. Hinojosa email;
work re: L. Dawn-Fisher cross; review S.
Dahlberg email; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; review message from S. McCown;
review C, Diamond email; review D.
Hinojosa email; telephone call to S.
McCown re: trial strategy and evidence;
review S. Rosen email; review P. Fraissinet
email; work re: trial preparation; review
emails (9); reply to same.

01/09/2014 RGIV  Review, edit, and comment on Thompson 8.05 hrs $1,408.75
Horton’s draft findings of fact and Hanes

3oz Invoice #45395 Page 4




01/09/2014 REG

01/09/2014 SEJ

01/10/2014 RGIV

01/10/2014 REG

01/10/2014 SEJ

01/11/2014 RGIV

201

and Boones findings of fact; conference
with counsel re; same, State’s exhibits, and
witness list; email all plaintiff's counsel re:
email issues and findings of fact; create
Tour of Texas Power Point for cross
examination of L. Dawn-Fisher; review and
comment on draft findings of fact edits by
MALDEF; email same to all parties.

Travel to and from Houston; meet with 8.90 hrs
Harris County superintendents re: briefing;
confer with D. Thompson and M.
Trachtenberg re: trial strategy issues; work
re: trial preparation; review R. Freeman
email; reply to same.

Review and download State exhibits; confer 1.00 hrs
with attorneys re: same.
Review State's amended response to 9.40 hrs

Calhoun plaintiffs interrogatories i.e. excel
spreadsheets; do tax rate and revenue
calculations for top and bottom 15 percent
of districts for years 2004, 2013, 2014, and
201 5; determine how many districts can
achieve $6,000, $6,576, $6,176, cod $6,562
while taxing at $1.04 and $1.17 re: same;
meeting with counsel re: saime; telephone
conference with W. Pierce and P, Colbert
re: same; conference viith counsel re: Rule
11 Agreement on Wayne's data correction;
conferecne with W. Pierce re: same; draft
Rule 11 and email to W. Pierce for review;
create demonsuative exhibits re: 1.04
analysis coupied with 6000, 6176, 6562, and
6576 anaiysis; email W. Pierce State’s
exhibits; conference with counsel re: same.

Work re: trial preparation; review emails; 7.00 hrs
reply to same.
Prepare notebook of State exhibits; confer 2.70 hrs

with R. Gray, IV re: discovery to

Defendants; review file re: same; review

email and Rule 11 agreement re: expert

program files; organize the parties’ exhibit

lists for attorney review.

Create demonstrative exhibitre; 1,17 3.25 hrs
analysis with 6000,6176,6562, and 6576

analysis; conference with counsel re: same;

telephone conference with plaintiffs counsel

nvoice #45595

$4,005.00

$0.00

$1,645.00

$3,150.00

$0.00

$568.75

Pope 5




01/11/2014
01/12/2014

01/12/2014

01/13/2014

01/13/2014

01/13/2014

31020t

REG
RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

re: findings of fact; conference with counsel
re: same; review findings of fact.

Work re: trial preparation. 4.75 hrs
Upload and organize trial exhibits; order 4.00 brs
exhibits for direct examination of W. Pierce;

go through direct examination of W. Pierce

with R. Gray Il

Review P. Colbert email and material; 4.25 hrs
review W, Pierce emails; reply to same;

complete outline of W, Pierce testimony;

outline opening statement; work re:

preparation of cross on L. Dawn-Fisher.

Confer with R. Gray IV re: pfoffer of Dr. 2.10 hrs
Pfeifer; confer with R. Gray Il regarding

W. Pierce’s testimony.

Review email from H. McIntush re: focus 7.85 hrs
district findings of fact; draft updated

findings of fact for focus districts;

conference with counsel re: same; finalize

proffer of Dr. Pfeifer; conferecne with

counsel re; same; draft findings of faci re:

adeguacy, Dr. Dawn-Fisher, 83rd

Legislatures actions; and new dalx) create

excel spreadsheet on 1.04 and 1,17 analysis

with charters removed seeing how many

districts can obtain 600C. 6176, 6562, and

6576; conference withcgal assistant re:

marking of exhibits; veview and reply to

email from L. Halpem re: Rule 11

Agreement on Wayne's corrected data;

execute same and file; email file marked

copy of szwe to S. Dahlberg and L.

Halpern; update exhibits for direct

examination of W. Pierce; meeting with R.

Gray I re: direct examination of W. Pierce;

review and reply to email from W. Pierce

re: State’s exhibits being locked; email S.

Dahlberg re: same; conference with legal

assistant re: same; review and revise proffer

of Dr. Pleifer; email H. McIntush updated

focus district findings of fact.

Work re: trial preparation, W. Pierce direct, 4.50 hrs
opening, and L. Dawn-Fisher cross; review

emails; reply to same; review and revise

proffer for Dr. Pleifer; review W. Pierce

email; telephone conference with W. Pierce

Invoice #45595

$2,137.50

$700.00

$1,912.50

$682.50

$1,373.75

$2,025.00

Page b




01/13/2014 SEJ

01/14/2014 RGIV

01/14/2014 REG

01/15/2014 RGIV

3oz-n1

re: State’s data.
Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; efile
Rule 11 agreement re: W. Pierce Data

" Correction; review submitted exhibits;

confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review
confirmation from District Clerk re:
file-marked copy of Rule 11 agreement;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review
and return email from S. Rosen re: TTSFC
exhibits; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
spreadsheets produced by Defendants;
review spreadsheets re: password: confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same.

Review and reply to email from S. Dahlberg
re: accessibility of State’s exhibits; email W.
Pierce re: same; review and reply to email
from R. Freeman re: tour of texas power
point; review same; insert equity findings of
fact in to common document; conference
with counsel re: same; email H. McIntusi
and D. Hinojosa re: same; create excel
backup of exhibits for direct of W tierce;
meeting at equity center re: go 0vér same;
email R. Freeman data for tous of texas
powerpoint; email E. Boydsiun and legal
assistant re: attorneys fecs affidavit; email
H. Mcintush and D. Hinojosa re: equity
findings.

Review W. Pierce emails; confer with R,
Gray, IV re: same; review H. McIntush
email; review araft findings; work re: trial
preparaticn; work re: findings; review and
analysis of State’s exhibits; review P.
Fraissinet emails {2); reply to same (2},
wark with W, Pierce re: trial preparation
and testimony.

Conference with legal assistant re: attorneys
fees affidavit; review Wayne's direct
examination binder; have same sent to W.
Pierce; conference with counsel re: same;
incorporate new findings of fact in to
existing document; conference with counsel
re: same; review and reply to email from M.
Jacobs re: charter plaintiff depositions;
email incorporated equity findings to H.
McIntush and D. Hinojosa; review Findings

Invedce #43595

2.70 hrs

9.55 hrs

5.75 hrs

6.05 hrs

$270.00

$1,671.25

$2,587.50

$1,058.75




01/15/2014 REG

01/15/2014 SEJ

01/16/2014 RGIV

01/16/2014 REG

01/16/2014 SEJ
01/17/2014 RGIV

314201

of Fact; incorporate in same and email to all
plaintiffs.

Prepare for 1/16 pretrial; confer with E.
Boydstun re: attorney fee proof; work re:
trial preparation; review emails; reply to
same; work re: W. Pierce direct; work re:
findings; work re: L. Dawn-Fisher cross;
review State’s exhibits; review §. Dahlberg
email; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same;
review analysis of 4] v 42 with different
scenarios; email P. Fraissinet re: L. Moak
preparation and power point; preview
emails re: exhibits.

Review email from R. Gray, IV re;
attorney’s fees affidavit; review filed
affidavit; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same;
create additional notebook of W. Pierce

testimony; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.

Review emails re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; conference with legai
assistant re: hearings with Judge Dietz;
meeting with Lynn Moak re: testimuny
preparation; hearing with Judge Diitz;
conference with plaintiffs coussel re: same:
review urban power point 2nd make map of
same; review emails from plaintiffs counsel
re: findings of fact and fnal judgment.
Work re: L. Moak preparation: review W.
Pierce email; review emails (6) re: findings;
confer with R, Gray, IV re: same; review D.
Hinojosa email) reply to same; confer with
L. Moak anl attorneys re: testimony;
complete preparation for pretrial; review
errata‘vage for Dr. Dawn-Fisher; attend
prairial hearing.

repare file for 1/16/14 hearing.

Prepare for meeting with W, Pierce re:
testimony preparation; conference with
counsel re: tour of texas power point;
meeting with W. Pierce re: trial testimony;
review and reply to email from R. Freeman
re: tour of texas power point; review emails
from plaintiff's counsel re: final judgment;
review drafts of same; reply to M.
Trachtenberg re: same; courtroom
technology check; review email from R.

Invoice #45595

4.80 hrs

1.50 hrs

7.35 hrs

5.25 hrs

0.50 hrs
7.05 hrs

$2,160.00

$0.00

$1,286.25

$2,362.50

$0.00
$1,233.75

Page 8




01/17/2014 REG

01/18/2014 TBH

01/18/2014 RGIV

01/18/2014 REG
01/19/2014 REG

01/20/2014 RGIV

I

Freeman re: tour of texas power point;
revise same; review findings of fact; email
M. Jacobs re: same; review Objections to
exhibtis and deposition designations for
State, Calhoun County, and Fort Bend
County; conference with counsel re: same.
Review emails re: judgment and findings:
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; work re:
attorney fees affidavit; confer with R. Gray,
IV re: same; confer with W. Pierce and R.
Gray, IV re: preparation for testimony; reply
to M. Trachtenberg email re: judgment;
review S, Dahlberg email; work re: Tour of
Texas.

Prepare sumnmary of findings re: deposition
of Dr. Pleifer. Email same to R. Gray [l
and R. Gray IV.

Review and reply to email from S. Dahlberg
re: SAS; forward same to W, Pierce; review
emails re: findings of fact; review and reply
to ermail from T. Hunter re: findings based
on Dr. Pleifers deposition.

Review slides re: Urban Tour of Texas.
Review emails re: judgment; review emails
re: findings; reply to same; review emails
re: opposition to State’s Motion to Strike;
reply to same; review Fdgewood's
objections; review S. Dahlberg email;
review M. Jacobs'emails; review H.
MclIntush emails; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; work re: L. Dawn-Fisher
Cross.

Review and reply to emails re: findings of
fact and conclusions of law; review same;
review and reply to emails re: response to
State’s motion to strike consideration of
2012-2013 data; review same; meeting with
D. Hinojosa and counsel re: findings of fact
and data of Dr. Dawn-Fisher; review and
revise tour of Texas power point; meeting
with counsel re: trial tomorrow; review and
print master dataset of Dr. Dawn-Fisher;
review equity findings; revise and edit same
and email to H. McIntush and D. Hinojosa,
conference with counsel re: first day of trial;
review and reply to email from 8. Dahlberg

Inveice #45595

4.75 hrs

3.40 hirs

0.45 hrs

0.75 hrs
2.75 hrs

7.25 hrs

$2,137.50

$1,105.00

$78.75

$337.50
$1,237.50

$1,268.75
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01/20/2014

01/20/2014

01/21/2014

01/21/2014
01/21/2014
01/22/2014

01/22/2014
01/23/2014

01/23/2014

01/24/2014

01/24/2014

01/25/2014

01/26/2014

Iyt

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG
SEJ
RGIV

REG
RGIV

RGIV

REG

RGIV

re: conference call on SAS,

Work re: trial preparation matters; review
emails; reply to same; work re: findings and
judgment; review draft response to State’s
objections; complete opening; work on L.
Dawn-Fisher cross; review W. Pierce emails
(2); reply to same (2); confer with D.
Hinojosa and R. Gray, IV re: findings;
review various emails; reply to same;
review T. Hunter email; reply to same.
Prepare files for trial; confer with attorneys
re: same; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: transcript of L. Dawn-Fisher
testimony; review file re: same; email
transcript to R. Freeman.

Prepare for trial; meeting with S. Dahlberg
and L. Halpern re: SAS; trial.

Trial Day 1, prepare for Day 2.

Prepare files for trial (cont.).

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with R. Gray
I re: cross examination of Dr.
Dawn-Fisher.

Trial Day 2, prepare for Day 3.

Prepare for trial; trial; conferenc: with
counsel re: same and witness preparation.
Trial Day 3; work on Tour of Texas; work
on L. Dawn-Fisher cross.

Email A. Cochran_McCall re: telephone
conference on obiections to deposition of
Dr. Pfeifer; conference with counsel re:
same and crnss examination of Dr.
Dawn-Fisher, meeting with counsel re;
cross exaruination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher.
Work eo: L. Dawn-Fisher cross; review W,
Pierce direct; review R. Freeman email;
ceply to same; review M. Jacobs email;
veview S. Dahlberg email; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2}); review S. Dahlberg
email; review M. Trachtenberg emails (2).
Work re: W. Pierce direct; review emails re:
test data; review email re: exhibits; reply to
all; review M. Trachtenberg emails; review
D. Hinojosa emails; work re: L.
Dawn-Fisher cross.

Meeting with R. Gray Il re: Equity Center
Legislative Conference; attend same;

Invoice #45595

7.00 hrs

6,00 hss

7.75 hrs

10.00 hrs
2.00 hrs
9.25 hrs

9.50 hrs
745 hrs

7.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

3.75 hrs

3.50 hrs

5.85 hrs

$3,150.00

$0.00

$1,356.25

$4,500.00
$0.00
$1,618.75

$4,275.00
$1,303.75

$3,375.00

$437.50

$1,687.50

$1,575.00

$1,023.75
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01/26/2014

01/27/2014

01/27/2014

01/27/2014

01/28/2014

01/28/2014

01/29/2014

01/29/2014

31201

REG

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

meeting with W. Pierce re: direct
examination; meeting with counsel re: cross
examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher.

Prepare for Day 4; work with W. Pierce re:
testimony; work re: cross exam preparation;
speak at TASB/Coalition meeting.

Prepare for trial; trial; conference with
counsel re: direct of W. Pierce and cross of
Dr. Dawn-Fisher.

Trial Day 4; prepare for Day 5; review
emails re: trial progress and deposition;
work re: W. Pierce direct.

Prepare flash drive of exhibits for D.
Sawvel; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.
Review and reply to email from A.
Cochran-McCali re: conference on State’s
objections to deposition of Dr. Pleifer;
review and reply to email from A. Pierce re:
county map; review email from D. Hinojosa
re: errors in Dr. Cortez’s data; review direst
examination of W. Pierce; review State’s
data and W. Pierce’s data re: districiz which
can reach 6176, 6562, and 65761102013,

2014, and 2015; conference with counsel re:

same; telephone conference with W, Pierce
re: testimony.

Review W. Pierce dire<i; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: cross; review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; work re: L.
Dawn-Fisher cross; work re: W. Pierce
direct; review S. Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review R. Freeman emails (2); reply
to san'e (2); review Rule 11 agreement;
revicw emails re: depositions and Pearson
tepresentation,

Attend trial. Conference with R. Gray IV
re: 1. Pfeifer’s deposition.

Prepare for trial; trial;telephone conference
with A. Cochrn-McCall re; objections to
deposition of 1. Pfeifer; review deposition
transcript of J. Pfeifer re: objections; email
A. Cochran-McCall re: same; conference
with legal assistant re: redacting same;
conference with counse] re: exhibits to be
admitted for Calhoun plaintiffs; review

Invoice #45595

5.50 hrs

7.35 hrs

7.23 hes

0.25 hrs

2.85 hrs

3,70 hrs

6.80 hrs

8.65 hrs

$2,475.00

$1,286.25

$3,262.50

$0.00

$498.75

$1,665.00

$2,210.00

$1,513.75
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same; review proffer and presentation for J.
Pfeifer; email same to all parties.
01/29/2014 REG Trial Day 5; prepare for Day 6; review G.25 hrs $4,162.50
emails; reply to same; review S, Rosen
email with orders; review deposition

notices.

01/29/2014 SEJ Confer with R. Gray, IV re: redacting J. 0.75 hrs $0.00
Pfeifer deposition transcript; redact
transcript,

01/30/2014 RGIV Prepare for trial; trial; conference with legal 8.40 his $1,470.00

assistant re: deposition transcript of J.
Pfeifer; review and reply to email from A.
Cochran-McCall re: same; conference with
counsel, W. Pierce, and R. Freeman re:
meeting on redirect.

01/30/2014 REG Trial Day 6; review emails; reply to same; 8.25 hrs $3,712.50
work re: Day 7.

01/30/2014 SEJ Confer with R. Gray, IV re: further 0.20 hrs $0.00
redactions of J. Pfeifer deposition transcripy;
redact transcript.

01/31/2014 RGIV Prepare for meeting with W, Pierce and R. 5.45 hrs $953.75

Freemand; meeting with W. Pierce and R.
Freeman; email A. Cochran-McCall re:
marked deposition transcript of J. Pfeifer;
review email from S. Dahlberg re: revised
Master Dataset for Dr, Diavn Fisher; save
and print same; forward same to W. Pierce;
review email from A Pierce re: Exhibits
with Westhoff removed; review new
Westhoff exhibits; format and save same.
01/31/2014 REG Work with Y. Pierce, R. Freeman, and R. 3.75 hrs $1,687.50
Gray, IV re, re-direct and additional
exhibits; work re: L. Dawn-Fisher
examination; review and reply to emails;
review S. Dahlberg email; review M.
Skidmore email; review new database and

slides.

$104,592.50

TINHKEEPER RECAR
REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 156.15 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $70,267.50
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 16390 hrs @  175.00 /hr $28,682.50
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 1230 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $3,997.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 3835hrs @  100.00 /hr $1,645.00
Fee Recap Totals 370.70 $104,592.50

3302404 Invoice #4535935 Page 12




GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
February 27, 2014
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 45695-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Tx Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 212712014

Attn: Ray Freeman
email to ray@equitycenter.org

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICEN
© 02/01/2014 RGIV  Telephone conference with A. Pierce re: 0.85 hrs $148.75
Westhoff exhibits; telephone conference
with R. Gray re: re-direct of W. Pierce;
format and print Westhoff exhibits.
02/01/2014 REG Work re: W. Pierce re-direct; work re: L. 3.00 hrs $1,350.00
Dawn-Fisher cross; work re: ciosing
argument; review emails; reply to same;
review and reply to additicnal emails.
02/02/2014 RGIV ~ Meeting with R. Gray Ill re: redirect of W. 7.30 hrs $1,277.50
Pierce and cross examination of Dr.
Dawn-Fisher; meedng with W, Pierce and
R. Freeman re: same; review and reply to
emails from F. Gray III and L. Haplern re:
backup data for WesthofT Exhibits;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
same; review and make same ready for
distribution; email same to counsel of
fecord.
02/02/2014 REG Prepare for Day 7; work re: W. Pierce 6.25 hrs $2,812.50
re-direct; work re: L. Dawn-Fisher cross;
work re: closing; review and reply to 16

emails.

02/02/2014 SEJ Work re: amended exhibits; confer with R. 4.50 hrs $450.00
Gray, IV re: same; revise exhibit list.

02/03/2014 RGIV Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel 5.35 hrs $936.25

re: cross examination exhibits for Dr.
Dawn-Fisher; create same and review with
counsel.

TR Invoice #45695-1 Fage




02/03/2014 REG

02/03/2014 SEJ

02/04/2014 RGIV

02/04/2014 REG

02/05/2014 RGIV

02/05/2014 REG

02/06/2014 RGIV

310240

Trial Day 7; prepare for Day 8; work re:
attorney fees affidavit and submission;
review and reply to emails; review State’s
Motion to Strike L Moak testimony; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review
Charters’ amended exhibits; review S.
Dahlberg emails (2); telephone conference
with D. Hinojosa re: status.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: amended
exhibits; convert exhibits to JPEG for Power
Point presentation.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with W,
Pierce, P. Colbert, and R. Gray IlI re: cross
examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher; review
Urban Tour of Texas PowerPoint and
accompanying excel spreadsheet; review
Calhoun County’s Motion to Strike paris of
the testimony of W. Pierce; email R, Gray
II1 re: same; meeting with W. Pierce re:
same and Weighted Average approach in
Tier 1; meeting with counsel~e; cross
examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher; review
email from B. Chester r¢: 2mended answers
to Calhoun County intcrrogatories; review
and revise urban tour of texas powerpoint
and backup datz; send both to R. Freeman;
conference with counsel re: all; print and
upload Agreed Scheduling Order and emails
from State.

Trial Diay 8; prepare for Day 9; review
emails; reply to same; review revised
database; confer with W. Pierce re: status
and same.

Prepare for trial; meeting with counsel re:
cross examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher; trial;
meeting with counsel re: revise cross
examination of Dr. Dawn Fisher; review
proffer of Shannon Housson; reply to email
from M. Jacobs re: same.

Trial Day 9; prepare for Day 10; review and
reply to emails.

Review emails re: witness order and

Invoice #45695-1

6.25 hrs

0.75 hrs

10.70 hrs

12.50 hrs

11.15 hrs

11.25 hrs

9.20 hrs

$2,812.50

NC

$1,872.50

$5,625.00

$1,951.25

$5,062.50

$1,610.00
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02/06/2014 REG

02/06/2014 SEJ

02/07/2014 RGIV

02/07/2014 REG

02/07/2014 SEJ
02/10/2014 RGIV

02/10/2014 REG

02/11/2014 RGIV

IIE-0%

weather; conference with counsel re:
exhibits; cross examination of Dr.
Dawn-Fisher; and W. Pierce testimony;
trial; conference with legal assistant re:
exhibit list and accompanying USB drive;
meeting with counsel re: closing argument;
review emails re: admitted exhibits and
findings of fact.

Trial Day 10; prepare for Day 11; review
emails; reply to same; work re: closing.
Confer with R. Gray, 1V re: additional
exhibit, revised exhibit list; mark exhibit,
revise exhibit list; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: filing amended exhibit list.

Conference with legal assistant re: exhibits
and filing of case documents; organize and
file case files; review case files; email
plaintiff's counsel re: findings of fact; emnail
M. Skidmore re: objections to TTSFC 3542;
email D. Sawvel re: same; conference with
counsel re: USB drive to provide to D.
Sawvel; review exhibit lists and list of
admitted exhibits provided by D. Sawvel.
Complete closing argument; trial Day 11;
review and reply to emails; work re: file
organization; work r¢; findings.

Efile and serve First Amended Exhibit List.
Review and reply to emails from plaintiffs
counsel re: findings of fact and conclusions
of law; conference with counsel re: same;
print eguity findings for review; review
equity findings of fact; edit and revise same.
Raview emails; reply to same; confer with
& Gray, IV re: findings and attorney’s fees
affidavit; review H. McIntush email; review
M. Jacobs email; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: same; review draft equity findings.
Conference with counsel re: closing
arguments, attorneys fees, and findings of
fact; email D. Hinojosa and H. McIntush re:
realtime of closing arguments; review
equity findings of fact and edit/revise same;
review and revise affidavit for attorneys

Invoice #45695-1

9.25 hrs

1.00 hrs

3.35 hrs

6.25 hrs

1.00 hrs
4.30 hrs

2.00 hrs

5.15 hrs

$4,162.50

N/C

$586.25

$2,812.50

N/C
$752.50

$900.00

$901.25
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02/11/2014

02/12/2014

02/12/2014

02/13/2014

02/13/2014

02/14/2014

I

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

fees; review email from H. Mclntush re:
closing argument transcript; forward same
to T. Robertson; review and revise R. Gray
II's affidavit on attorneys fees; conference
with R. Gray III re: same; conference with
E. Boydstun re: same.

Review T. Roberts email; reply to same;
confer with R. Gray re: findings; review T.
Roberts email; review W, Pierce emails (2);
review closing; work re: findings and fees;
review and revise draft affidavit re:
attorney's fees.

Review and reply to email from A. Pierce
re: exhibits used in direct examination of W,
Pierce; draft response to Calhoun County
Motion to Strike Testimony of W. Pierce;
review email from D. Hinojosa re: equity
findings of fact.

Review emails; reply to same; work r=:
attorney's fees affidavit; review D. Hinojosa
email; confer with R. Gray, IV rc- same;
review M. Jacobs email; review H.
McIntush email; work on findings; review
T. Roberts email.

Review emails re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; reply to D. Hinojosa re:
proposed sequerice of equity findings; draft
response to Calhoun County Motion to
Strike portions of W, Pierce testimony.
Review 7. Hinojosa email; review M.
Jacobg @mail; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
sams; work re: findings.

Raview and reply to emails from H.
vicIntush re: trial transcripts and findings of
fact; conference with counsel re: response to
Calhoun County motion to strike testimony
of W. Pierce; continue drafting response to
Calhoun County Plaintiff's Motion to Strike;
conference with legal assistant re: same and
exhibits for same; conference with R. Gray
III re: attorneys fee affidavit; email response
motion to W. Pierce for review; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: same.

Invoice #45695-1

1.70 hrs

3.20 hrs

1.60 hrs

7.40 hrs

0.95 hrs

5.35 hrs

$765.00

$560.00

$720.00

$1,295.00

$427.50

$936.25
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02/14/2014 REG

02/15/2014 REG

02/17/2014 RGIV

02/17/2014 REG

02/18/2014 RGIV

02/18/2014 REG

02/19/2014 RGIV

310243

Review and revise response to Motion to 1.40 hrs
Strike; review and revise affidavit on

attorney's fees.

Work re: attorney's fees affidavit and claim; 0.90 hrs
review Della Sawell email re: exhibits;

confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.

Review and reply to emails re: findings of 1.15 hrs
fact; conference with R. Gray III re:

attorneys fee affidavit; review and revise

attorneys fee affidavit; conference with

legal assistant and E. Boydstun re: time for

reopening.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: attorney's fees 2.00 hrs
affidavit and findings; review emails; reply

to same; work on findings; review D. Sawell

email re: exhibits; review additional

transcript sections; work re: findings.

Review emails from H. McIntush and IJ. 6.45 hrs
Hinojosa re: Equity Findings of Fact énd

Qutline for same; review same and imake

edits and comments; meeting with counsel

re: same; email H. McIntush «e; transcript

from cross examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher

and edited findings of fact; conference with

legal assistant re: attorseys fees affidavit;

review cross examinaiion of Dr.

Dawn-Fisher; d:ait findings of fact from

same; confererice with counsel re: same;

review replv niotion to our response to

motion tc strike.

Conferwith R. Gray, IV re: attorney's fees 1.60 hrs
affidavit; work re: findings; work re:

auitorney's fees claim; review email from

court reporter; work re: findings; confer

with R. Gray, IV re: same.

Sum up exhibit "F" from attorneys fees 4.45 hrs
affidavit and confirm accuracy; draft

findings on deposition testimony of Dr,

Pfeifer; email same to T. Hunter; conference

with R. Gray III re: edits to findings based

on cross examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher;

make edits to same; review and reply to

email from D. Hinojosa re: outline of equity

Invoice #45695-1

$630.00

$405.00

$201.25

$500.00

$1,128.75

$720.00

$778.75
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02/19/2014 REG

02202014 RGIV

02/20/2014 RGIV

02/20/2014 REG

g0

section of findings of fact; conference with
R. Gray III re: same; review Calhoun
County's reply motion to our Response on
the motion to strike; conference with R.
Gray I1I re: same; email same to W. Pierce;
insert Dr. Dawn-Fisher findings into equity
section; email plaintiffs counsel re: same;
review and revise attorney fee affidavit;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review findings of fact for Everman ISD;
revise same; email D. Sawvel re: exhibits in
reopening.

Work re: attorney's fees affidavit; review
Calhoun county reply re: Motion to Strike;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review
and edit findings; review W. Pierce email.
Email M. Jacobs re: focus district revisions,
review and revise findings of fact for
Everman ISD; email T. Hunter re: same;
review time sheets re: attorneys fee
affidavit; conference with R. Gray iII and
legal assistant re: same; emaii Fl. McIntush
re: updated findings on Everman and
timeline; review email frorn D. Sawvel re:
exhibits.

Review and revise findings of fact re: 6,576
number; reviewdccument and edits within;
review Equity findings; conference with
counsel, legal assistant, and office manager
re: filing fcr attorneys fees; review and
reply to email from D. Thompson re: Rule
11 Agreement; email S. Dahlberg re: same;
review and reply to email from H. Mclntush
re: same.

Review D. Thompson email; reply to same;
review M., Jacobs email; confirm with R.
Gray IV re: same; reply to M. Jacobs' email;
work re: attorney's fees submission; review
D. Sawvell re: exhibits; review D.
Thompson email; work re: findings; confirm
with R. Gray IV re: same; review S.
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review H. MclIntush email; review D.

Invoice #45695-1

1.20 hrs

1.55 hes

3.15 hrs

2.85 hrs

$540.00

$271.25

$551.25

$1,282.50
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02/21/2014 RGIV

02/21/2014 REG

02/24/2014 RGIV

02/24/2014 REG

B

Thompson email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review L. Schwartz email; review H.
Mcintush email; confer with R. Gray IV re:
same; finalize affidavit on attorney's fees
request; review C. Pacheco email.

Review and reply to email from H.
McIntush re: Rule 11 Agreement and trial
transcripts; review and reply to email from
D. Hinojosa re: transcripts; review and reply
to email from W. Pierce re: reopening
exhibits; review same.

Review emails (21); reply as needed; work
re: attorney's fees submission; finalize
attorney's fees material; review D. Hinojosa
email; work re: findings; review additional
numerous emails.

Review and reply to emails from H.
MclIntush re: Dr. Pfeifer deposition citaiion
and exhibits pertaining to $6,176; review
deposition transcript of Dr. Pfeifer;
conference with R. Gray IIl re: eitorneys
fees affidavit and Equity findinps of fact;
review and reply to email from H. McIntush
re: conference call on edits to equity
findings of fact; review and reply to email
from H. Mclntush r=: exhibit used during
cross examination of Dr. Dawn-Fisher;
review exhibit lists of State and Calhoun
County re: exhibit number for same; review
MALDEEF edits and comments to Equity
Outling; 2dit and comment on same; email
edit¢ end comments to equity plaintiffs.
Review Rule 11 agreement; review errata
sieet for Dr. Clark and Dr. Zyskowski;
confer with R. Gray IV re: attorney's fee
claim; confer with R. Gray IV re: findings;
review D. Hinojosa email; review S. Rosen
email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review H, McIntush email; review C.
Diamond email; review D. Hinojosa email;
confer with R. Gray IV re: reply to same;
review L. Schwartz email; review H.
MclIntush email; review M. Bono email.

Invoice #45695-1

0.40 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.55 hrs

1.50 hrs

$70.00

$787.50

$271.25

$675.00
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02/25/2014 RGIV

02/25/2014 REG

02/26/2014 RGIV

02/26/2014 RGIV

02/26/2014 REG

330Z41

Review emails from H. McIntush and D.
Hinojosa re: edited equity sections and
conference call on same; review,edit, and
comment on Equity findings of fact; email
equity plaintiffs re: same; review Equity
outline in preparation for conference call;
email R. Gray III, legal assistant, and office
coordinator re: filing of attorney's fees
affidavit; Conference call with Equity
plaintiffs re: outline to the equity findings of
fact; review adequacy and tax sections to
findings of fact; edit and comment on same;
email edited and commented redlined draft
to all plaintiffs; review emails from M.
Bono and M. Jacobs re: citation forms;
review and reply to email from M. Jacobs
re: admitted expert reports.

Review P. Fraissinett email; work re:
finding; review S. Rosen email; work re:
attorney's fees; review additional poriion of
transcript.

Review emails from counsel ce:
edits/comments to adequacy and equity
sections of findings of fict, review email
from H. MclIntush re: ¢conference call on
adequacy section; conference with R. Gray
Il re: attorneys fecs affidavit; review
attorneys fee affidavit; conference with
office managsr and R. Gray Il re: same and
filing of same; telephone conference with
plainti{is counsel re: adequacy section of
findings of fact; review exhibit 11359 for
focus district achievement; review emails
from H. McIntush and D. Hinojosa re: edits
to Equity section and equity outline; review
emails from M. Jacobs, M. Bono, and H.
Mclntush re: adequacy sections to findings
of fact.

Review and reply to email from D. Hinojosa
re: equity draft; make edits/comments to
same and email to H. McIntush; review M.

Jacobs re: finding related to Ex 11440.
Work re: findings and attorney's fees filing;
review findings draft; confer with R. Gray

Invoice #45695-1

5.65 hrs

0.75 hrs

3.45 hrs

2.75 hrs

0.65 hrs

$988.75

$337.50

$603.75

$481.25

$292.50
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IV re: revisions to same.

02/27/2014 RGIV Review and reply to email from H. 4.95 hrs $866.25
Mclntush and D. Hinojosa re: Equity draft;
email M., Jacobs re: exhibit 5746; review
equity draft; conference with counsel re:
same and attorneys fees; conference with
legal assistant re: attorneys fees; review and
reply to email from E. Boydstun re: same;
review and reply to email from D. Hinojosa
re: findings related to cross examination of
Dr. Dawn-Fisher; review adequacy draft;
cite check equity and adequacy draft;
finalize attorneys fees affidavit; revise
conclusions of law to match amount in
attorneys fees affidavit.

$53,510.00

TIMEREEPER RECAP
REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 75.60 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $34,020.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 108.80 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $19,040.00
SEJ  Jennings, Susan Paralegal 7.25 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $450.00
Fee Recap Totals 183.95 $53,510.00
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