CAUSE NO. D-1-GN-11-003130

THE TEXAS TAXPAYER & STUDENT §
FAIRNESS COALITION, et al., §
Plaintiffs, §

VS. §
§

MICHAEL L. WILLIAMS, Commissioner ~ §
of Education, et al., §
Defendants. §

NOTICE OF FILING

Filed

13 February 28 A8:56
Amalia Rodriguez-Mendoza
District Clerk

Travis District
D-1-GN-11-003130

IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF

TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS

200™ JUDICIAL DISTRICT

Pursuant to the agreement of the parties and authorizaticn by the Court, the Texas

Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. Plaintiffs hereby give notice of the filing of the

attached Affidavit of Richard E. Gray, III as proof of their ciaim for attorney’s fees in the above-

styled matter.

Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Cozdition, et al. respectfully request that they be

awarded their costs and their reasonable attorney’s fees as set forth in the attached Affidavit.

Respectfully submitted,

GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Ave.

Austin, Tex4s/78701
orfeA512) 482-0061
2-((?4
Tk WG w

Richard E. Gray, M1 /
State Bar No. 08328300
Toni Hunter

State Bar No. 10295900
Richard E. Gray, IV
State Bar No. 24074308



Randall B, Wood

State Bar No. 21905000
Doug W. Ray

State Bar No. 16599200
RAY & WooD

27700 Bee Caves Road #200
Austin, Texas 78746
Telephone: (512) 328-8877
Fax: (512) 328-1156

Attorneys for the Texas Taxpayer & Student
Fairness Coalition, et al.



CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
The undersigned certifies that on February 2§, 2013, a true and correct copy of Plaintiffs’

Notice of Filing was served upon the following counsel of record via email pursuant to the
agreement of the parties and in compliance with the Texas Rules of Civil Procedure and the

Texas Local Rules:

Shelley N. Dahlberg

Assistant Attorney General

Texas Attorney General's Office
General Litigation Division

P. O. Box 12548, Capitol Station
Austin, Texas 78711

Attorneys for the State Defendants

Mark R. Trachtenberg

HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP

1 Houston Center

1221 McKinney St., Suite 2100
Houston, Texas 77010

John W. Turner

Lacy M. Lawrence

HAYES AND BOONE, LLP

2323 Victory Avenue, Suite 700

Dallas, Texas 75219

Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Calhoun Connty
ISD, et al.

J. David Thompson, III
Philip Fraissinet

THOMPSON & HORTON, L.LP
Phoenix Tower, Suite 2000
3200 Southwest Freaway
Houston, Texas 77027

Holly G. McIntush

Thompson & Horton LLP

400 West 15th St., Suite 1430

Austin, Texas 78701

Attorneys for Ft. Bend ISD Plaintiffs

David G. Hinojosa

Marisa Bono

MEXICAN AMERICAN LEGAL DEFENSE AND
EDUCATIONAL FUND, INC.

110 Broadway, Suite 300

San Antonio, Texas 72205

Attorneys for the Edgewood ISD Plaintiffs

J. Christopiier Diamond

The Dianmiond Law Firm, P.C.

17484 (Northwest Freeway, Suite 150
Houston, Texas 77040

Craig T. Enoch

Melissa A. Lorber

Enoch Kever PLLC

600 Congress, Suite 2800

Austin, Texas 78701

Attorneys for Efficiency Intervenors

Robert A. Schulman

Joseph E. Hoffer

Ricardo R. Lopez

Schulman, Lopez & Hoffer, L.L.P.

517 Soledad Street

San Antonio, Texas 78205-1508

Attorneys for the Charter School Plaintiffs

R1charcyE Gray, IIY




CAUSE NO. D-1-GN-11-003130

TEXAS TAXPAYER & STUDENT IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF
FAIRNESS COALITION, et al.,

Plaintiffs,
VS. TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS

MICHAEL WILLIAMS, Commissioner of

§
§
§
§
§
§
Education, et al., §
§

Defendants. 200™ JUDICIAL. DISTRICT

AFFIDAVIT OF RICHARD E. GRAYV, i

STATE OF TEXAS §
§
TRAVIS COUNTY §

Before me, the undersigned authority, personally appeared on this day RICHARD E.
GRAY, III, who, after being by me duly worn on oaih, deposed and said:

l. “My name is Richard E. Gray, Ifl. T am over the age of 18 years of age and am
fully competent to testify to the matters staved in this affidavit. [ have personal knowledge of the
facts and statements contained in this atfidavit, and each of them is true and correct.

2. I am a member of Gray & Becker, P.C. in Austin, Texas and have been practicing
law in Texas for more than 35 years. This affidavit is submitted on the issue of attorney’s fees
for the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. Plaintiffs. I have tried many
complicated and ~document-intensive cases involving many different issues including
constitutional 1ssues, and including the first four cases involving Texas public school finance,
known as Edgewood I, Edgewood II, Edgewood III, and Edgewood IV. I was lead counsel for
the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition, et al. Plaintiffs in this litigation. I testified via
affidavit as the attorney’s fees expert for the plaintiffs in West Orange Cove II. 1 have

represented the State of Texas in numerous matters over the years both in my capacity as former



Executive Assistant to Attorney General Mark White and thereafier in an outside counsel
capacity.

3. I have practiced law in Travis County since September of 1980. I am familiar
with the reasonable and customary rates, charges, and costs for legal services in Austin, Texas
for cases similar to this one. My experience and qualifications are set forth inmore detail in my
resume which is attached to the affidavit as Exhibit “A”. The resumes o iy co-counsel, Toni
Hunter and Richard E. Gray, IV, are attached as Exhibit “B” and Exhibit “C”. The resumes of
my co-counsel, Randall B. Wood and Doug W. Ray, are attached as Exhibits “D” and “E”. I am
very familiar with the experience and qualifications of Ms. Huanter, Mr. Gray, IV, Mr. Wood, and
Mr. Ray.

4. In forming my opinions, not only have i relied on my personal knowledge having
attended every day of trial and personally participated in much of the discovery in this matter,
but I have further reviewed the pertinent pleadings, the attorneys® time records for the Texas
Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs, and I have given substantial thought to the
appropriate fee in this matter. [ém: very familiar with the work that was necessary to prepare
and try this case, and I am alse_familiar with the work that will be necessary to handle an appeal
of this case.

5. The Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs consist of 443
independent scheol districts located throughout Texas. This case was originally filed on October
10, 2011. The preparation of this case for trial involved, among other things, meetings and
interviews with scores of witnesses and client employees; the review, analysis, and production of
an extremely large volume of client documents; the review and analysis of an extremely large

volume of documents produced by the State Defendants; the review and analysis of many expert



reports; the assistance of numerous expert witnesses, written discovery, and depositions of more
than 90 factual and expert witnesses. The trial lasted 45 days during which 80 witnesses testified
in person and more than 5,500 exhibits were admitted into evidence. The trial was conducted in
a “paperless” fashion, which meant that thousands of documents had to be imaged, managed, and
presented electronically at trial. The trial was “fast tracked” which necessitated multiple
attorneys’ involvement and the involvement of legal assistants.

6. The time records of Gray & Becker counsel for the Texas Taxpayer & Student
Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs are attached to this affidavit as Exhibit “F”. I believe the rates set
forth in the attached time records being $450.00 an hour foi-Richard E. Gray, 111, $325.00 an
hour for Toni Hunter, and $175.00 an hour for Richard E. (ray, IV are reasonable and customary
rates in Travis County, Texas for the level of experieice of the lawyers doing the work and the
complexity of the case. I am also familiar with the level of experience of any additional
attorneys reflected in the time records and-it is my belief that the rates charged for said work is
reasonable given the level of experience of the individuals performing the services within Travis
County, Texas. The number of hours expended by the attorneys listed above and reflected in
Exhibit “F” were reasonable aud necessary for the complexity of the case. The legal assistant
primarily assigned by Gray & Becker to work on this case was Susan Jennings. Ms. Jennings
has worked with Gray & Becker in excess of 20 years and has worked on many large document-
intensive cases. (She is very familiar with rnanaging large document productions, drafting
pleadings, and doing things that a lawyer would otherwise have to do. I ave carefully reviewed
the time records of Gray & Becker attached as Exhibit “F” and adjusted the billings for Ms.
Jennings to no-charge any billing that I felt was not substantive legal work done under the

direction of an attorney. Ms. Jennings’ rate of $100.00 an hour is reasonable and customary for



the work of a legal assistant of her experience in Travis County and the hours that are billed by
Ms. Jennings in the attached Exhibit “F” were in my opinion reasonable and necessary.

The total amount reflected on the attached Exhibit “F> for attorney’s fees of Gray &
Becker in the representation of the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition is
$1,499,171.75, all of which I believe to be reasonable and necessary.

The time records of Ray & Wood, co-counsel for the Texas Taxpayer & Student
Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs are attached to this affidavit as Exhibit “G”. I believe the rates set
forth in the attached time records (Exhibit “G”) being $375.00 an hour for Randall B. Wood and
$375.00 for Doug Ray are appropriate rates in Travis Couniy, Texas for the level of experience
of the lawyers doing the work. I am also familiar with the level of experience of Mr. Ray and
Mr. Wood and know them to be outstanding lawyers in their own capacity. The total amount
reflected on the attached Exhibit “G” (the billings of Ray & Wood) is $87,435.00 and I am of the
opinion that all of that was reasonable and necessary in the prosecution of this matter.

I estimate that an additional $1¢,000.00 in recoverable fees will be incurred through the
end of February 2013 in connecticn with finalizing the findings and conclusions requested by the
Court.

In my opinion, taking into consideration the factors set forth in Rule 1.04 of the Texas
Disciplinary Rules for P'rofessional Conduct and the factors set forth in Arthur Andersen & Co.
v. Perry Equipmer Corporation, 945 S.W.2d 812, 818 (Tex. 1997), the fees set forth in Exhibits
“F” and “G” are reasonable and necessary. More specifically, I have taken into consideration the
novelty and difficulty of the questions involved, the significance of the issues involved, the fee
arrangement with the clients, the skill required to perform the legal services, the time limitations

imposed by the circumstances, the experience, reputation, and ability of the attorneys, the benefit



conferred and the time and labor required. Based on all of these and all of the factors set forth in
Rule 1.04 of the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct and the Arthur Andersen
factors, it is my opinion that all of the services rendered by counsel for the Texas Taxpayer &
Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs in the prosecution and trial of this case were necessary and
the amount of time spent and rates charged for such services (as reflected in the time records) are
reasonable and that a reasonable and necessary fee for the Texas Taxpayer & Student Faimess
Coalition Plaintiffs for the prosecution of this matter by Gray & Becker is $1,509,171.75 (the
amount reflected in Exhibit “F” plus $10,000.00) and that a reascnable and necessary fee for the
Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs for the prosecution of this matter by Ray
& Wood is $87,435.00 bringing the total fee that I believe 10 be reasonable and necessary for the
prosecution of this matter by the Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition to be
$1,596,606.75.

7. I am, however, aware of the Supreme Court decision in Tony Gullo Motors I, L.P.
v. Chapa, 212 S.W.3d 299 (Tex. 2006) regarding segregation of fees. The Texas Taxpayer &
Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs had two claims set forth in their pleadings that they did not
vigorously pursue and, in faci, nonsuited one prior to the close of evidence. In my opinion,
virtually no time was spent in the preparation or prosecution of these claims, however, out of an
abundance of cauticn, it is my opinion that the total bill of the Texas Taxpayer & Student
Fairness Coalitior for fees in the amount of $1,596,606.75 be reduced by 5% to more than cover
any time that was spent on the prosecution of the claims for which the Texas Taxpayer &
Student Fairness Coalition either nonsuited or did not prevail on, any non-recoverable time and

further to cover any potential duplication of effort.



Consequently, I believe that the reasonable and necessary fee incurred by the Texas
Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition Plaintiffs in the preparation and prosecution of this
matter, after taking into consideration all of the factors set forth in Rule 1.04 of the Texas Rules
of Disciplinary Procedure and the factors set forth in the Arthur Andersen case as well as taking
into consideration the issue of segregation as set forth in the Tony Gullo, Motors case is
$1,516,776.41.

8. It is further my opinion that in the event this case is-appealed directly to the
Supreme Court, the sum of $325,000.00 would be a reasonable fz¢ for the representation of the
Texas Taxpayer & Student Fairness Coalition in such appeal | If this case is first appealed to the
Court of Appeals, it is my opinion that an additional fee of $325,000.00 would be reasonable and
necessary for the work at the Court of Appeals and'$100,000.00 would be a reasonable and

necessary fee should the case be appealed thereafier to the Texas.Supreme Court.”

L A

/ Richard E. ay,It‘I Affiant

Further Affiant sayeth not.

Sworn to and subscribed before me by Richard E. Gray, III on Februaryé?, 2013.

L3

SUSIN & JENNINGS

MY CO2URSSION EXPIRES
#ovomber 25, 2013

ubli¢” Statd of Texas —



Gray & BECRER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
00 WEST AVENUE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701-2210
i(512) 482-008(
TELECOPIER (B12) 4820924

Richard E. Gray, III -- Preparatory education: Washington and Lee University,
B.A. with honors (1973); legal education: University of Texas Schocis of Law,
J.D. with honors (1976). Private practice of law with BUTLER, B!~NiON, RICE,
Cook & KNaPP, Houston, Texas, specializing in litigation (197€-80); Executive
Assistant to Attorney General Mark White (1980-82); has served as Special
Counsel to Attorney General Jim Mattox (1983-86) and Special Counsel to
Attorney General Daniel Morales (January 1991-92). Admitted to practice before
the United States Supreme Court, Texas Supreme Court, Uinited States Court of
Appeals for the Fifth Circuit, and the United States District Courts for the
Northern, Southern, Eastern, and Western Districts of Texas. Member; Omicron
Delta Kappa; American Bar Association; State Bar of Texas; Travis County Bar
Association; and American Board of Trial Advocates. Listed in: Who's Who
Among Students in American Universities and Colleges; Who's Who in American
Law; Who's Who Among Rising Young Americans; “The Best Lawyers in
America”; and “Texas Super Lawyers”.

Notables:

o Lead counsel for the poor school districts in the school finance litigation
case Edgewood v. Kirby;

o Represented the State of Texas in the prison reform litigation case Ruiz v.
Estelle;

¢ Represented (the State of Texas in the higher education school finance
litigation LI/LAC v. Richards,

o Represented elected officials in redistricting litigation froml1980 to
present.

Exhibit “A”



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 WEST AVENUE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701
(512) 482-0061
(512) 482-0924-rax

Toni Hunter- Preparatory education: Rosary Hill College, B.A. with honors
(1965); legal education: Cleveland State University, Marshall Collcge of Law,
J.D. cum laude (1979). Chicago Title Company Award in Real Property Law.
Staff Attorney, Texas Senate Jurisprudence Committee (1980-81); Texas Senate
State Affairs Committee (1980-83). Assistant Attorney General of Texas (1983-
2003); Section Chief for Health and Human Services Civil Kights Section (State
& County Affairs Division); Deputy Chief, General Litigation Division (formerly
State & County Affairs Division) (1988-93); Division Chief, General Litigation
Division (1993-2003). Admitted to practice before the United States Supreme
Court, Texas Supreme Court, United States Court of Appeals for the Fifth Circuit,
and the United States District Courts for the Morthern, Southern, Eastern and
Western Districts. Travis County Women Lawyer’s Association Government
Attorney Award, 1993. Board Certified, Civil Appellate Law—Texas Board of
Legal Specialization. Trained mediator—-American Academy of Attorney-
Mediators, Inc. Member: State Bar of Texzas and Travis County Bar Association.

Exhibit “B”



GraY & BECXER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
900 WEST AVENUE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701-2210
I1%12) 482-008%
TELECOPIER (B12) 4a82-0924

Richard E. Gray, IV - Preparatory education: University of T¢xas at Austin
(B.A., 2007); legal education: Baylor Law School (B.A., 2010). . Member: State
Bar of Texas.

Exhibit “C”



RANDALL BUCK WOOD

Education:

Career:

General:

The University of Texas, Austin, Texas
B.A. - History, 1966

The University of Texas School of Law, Austin, Texas
LL.B. - 1968

1968-1972, Director, Elections Division, Office of the Secretary of State

1972-1975, Executive Director, Common Cause of Texas

1975-1977, Deputy Comptroller and Chief Clerk, Office of e
Comptroller of Public Accounts

April 1977-Present, Partner and Co-founder, Ray & Wood

Mr. Wood was admitted to the Bar in 1968 after receiving his B.A. and LL.B.
from The University of Texas at Austin. He servad as Director of the Elections
Division of the Office of the Secretary of State trom 1969 to 1972 where he
was in charge of enforcement of the State’s 2iection laws. In this capacity, he
oversaw all general and special elections aixd assisted local government
bodies with their elections. After leaving the Secretary of State’s Office, Mr.
Wood became the Executive Director cf Common Cause, a public interest
lobby group chartered to maintain rairness in the governmental process.
While serving Common Cause, Mr. Wood drafted and helped pass much of
the legislation dealing with open. meetings, open records and numerous
election laws that govern the operation of public entities today.

Mr. Wood is acknowledzed nationally as one of the foremost authorities on
public law including election law. As such, he represents many elected
officials including Fouse and Senate members and several prominent state
judges. In addition, Mr. Wood served in various top level positions in the
State Comptrolier’'s Office, including Deputy Comptroller and Chief Clerk.

In the early 1980s, Mr. Wood began representing school districts. In 1989 he
became the general counsel for the Equity Center, an organization of low
wealth school districts and continues in that position to the present. He was
an expert witness in the Edgewood II case, a counsel of record in the
Edgewood IV case and lead counsel in the West Orange Cove I and II cases in
which he represented low wealth school districts associated with the Equity
Center.

Exhibit “D”



DOUG W. RAY

Education:

Career:

General:

B.B.A. University of Texas (Accounting, with highest honors) 1986

J.D. University of Texas School of Law (with honors) 1989
Executive Editor, Texas Law Review
Note, 67 Texas Law Review 1295 (1989)

1989-1990, Law Clerk to the Honorable David R. Thompson
United States Court of Appeals, Ninth Circuit

1990-1991, Associate with Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher
Newport Beach, California

June 1991-Present, Associate and Partner, Ray & ‘Wood

Mr. Ray worked for Ray & Wood for over six years prior to joining the firm
as an Associate. While attending undergraduate and law school at the
University of Texas, Mr. Ray worked in all areas of the firm, including
delinquent property tax collections and defaulted student loan collections.
Since joining the firm as an attorncy Mr. Ray has continued working in the
defaulted student loan collectictis area and also has extensive experience in
elections, campaign finance and appellate practice.

Exhibit “E”
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GRAY & BECKER. P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin. Tx 78701
512/482-0061
August 31, 2010
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 35094-1 REG
Equity Center Qur file#: 3102 00001
Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D. Billing through: 08/31/2010
1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
06/29/2010 REG Conference with W. Pierce, and 1.90 hrs . $855.00
R. Freeman re: school finance issues; .
telephone call to L. Moak - left message;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
factual background and status; telephone
call to D. Hinojosa - left message; fclephone
call to D. Thompson - left message;
telephone conference with D. Thompson re:
status of matters; review msssage from D.
Hincjosa.
06/30/2010 REG Telephone call to L..Moak - left message. 0.05 hrs $ 2250
07/01/2010 REG Telephone call to .. Moak - left message; 0.30 hrs $135.00

telephone call4o D. Hinojosa - left message;
review message from L. Moak; review
message from1 D. Hinojosa; review message
from B Wood on status conference.
07/02/2010 REG Telephone call to L. Moak - left message; 0.20 hrs $ 90.00
tetepnone call to D. Hinojosa - left message;
correspond to clients via email re: status.

07/06/2010 REG Telephone conference with L. Moak re: 0.25 hrs 3112.50
school finance issues and possible litigation.
07/09/2010 REG Review message from D, Hinojosa; 0.20 hrs $ 90.00

telephone call to D. Hinojosa - left message;
review message from W. Pearce; conference
with M. Bolen re: scheduling 7/20

conference.

07/13/2010 REG Review L. Cook email; reply to same; 0.15 hrs $ 67.50
review W. Pearce email.

07/19/2010 REG Telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re: 0.15 hrs $ 67.50

school funding issues.



07/19/2010

07/20/2010

07/21/2010

0772212010
07/22/2010
07/28/2010

07/29/2010
07/30/2010

08/01/2010

08/02/2010

08/02/2010

08/03/2010
08/04/2010
08/05/2010

08/06/2010

08/07/2010

08/08/2010

08/09/2010

08/09/2010

08/09/2010

3102-01

REG
TBH
REG

REG

REG

REG

TBH
TBH
REG

TBH
REG

REG

Telephone call to B. Wood’s office re:
canceling today’s meeting - left voice
message; telephone conference with
Carolyn re: same.

Axtend conference at Equity Center re:
school finance matters.

Telephone call to W. Pierce re: setting up
conference with R. Gray and T. Hunter - left
message; telephone conference with W,
Pierce re: same; conference with R. Gray re:
same; telephone conference with W. Pierce
re: moving time to 10:30.

Begin review of all school finance cases.
Gather Edgewood cases and documents.
Begin review of school finance case law in
Texas.

Complete review of prior cases.

Set up file; prepare correspondence to W.
Pierce; forward to R. Gray for review.
Conference with T. Hunter re: preparation
of pleadings and law suit thereof; review
case law.

Conference with T. Hunter ard V. Pierce
re: pleadings and possible theories;
conference with T. Hunter re; pleading
issues.

Meet with Equity Ceunier; conference with
R. Gray; review documents.

Begin drafting Patition.

Research and draft petition.

Conference with T. Hunter re: status of
pleadinas.

Revissv material sent by R. Freeman; emal
back with questions; draft petition.

Uraft petition.

Complete review of Supreme Court cases;
work on pleadings.

Work re: pleading preparation; conference
with T. Hunter re: revisions and additional
input.

Work re: pleadings preparation; conference
with T. Hunter re: revisions and additional
input.

Telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
questions; edit petition and email to Equity
Center for comments; conference with R.

Invoice #35094

0.20 hrs

3.75 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs
1.00 hrs
1.50 hrs

1.50 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.75 hrs

1.75 hrs

2.00 hrs

2.70 hrs
5.00 hrs
0.10 hrs

2.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.80 hrs

NIC

$2587.50

N/C

$225.00
$325.00
$675.00

$675.00
N/C

$337.50

$787.50

$650.00

$877.50
$1625.00
$ 45.00

$682.50

$162.50
$225.00

$562.50

$562.50

$260.00

Page 2



08/09/2010

08/10/2010

08/10/2010

08/10/2010
08/11/2010

08/12/2010

08/12/2010

08/12/2010

08/13/2010

08/13/2010

3102-01

LVS

LVS
REG

LVS

REG

LVS

Gray re: same.

Prepare 2nd draft revisions to POP for T.
Hunter.

Conference with T. Hunter re: revisions to
pleading; additional work re: original
petition; conference with T. Hunter re:
securing input from and B.
Wood; review T. Hunter email.

Review materials sent by R. Freeman:
Telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
same; conference with R. Gray re: Petition;
edit petition; email to Buck Word,

re: petition; review email from W, Pierce
and respond.

Conference with T. Hunter re: case status.
Review emails re: petition; follow up with

T. Hunter re: revisions to petition; review R.

Bonillo email.

Review email; conference with
T. Hunter re: same; review message froni B.
Wood; telephone call to B. Wood - =it
message; conference with T. Hunter re:
revisions to petition and confcrence with B.
Wood.

Telephone conference with R. Gray re:
telephone call from B Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: meeting and
petition; review roniments from

Conference with R. Gray re: contacting B.
Wood toschedule meeting; telephone
conferenze with Wood re: Tuesday meeting,
disciss Ray Bonilla attendance; email POP

tc¢. T. Hunter for review; email to R. Gray re:

delay in scheduling meeting for Tuesday.
Review Equity Center email re: gaps;
review T. Hunter email; review email re:
8/17 conference re: petition; schedule
conference.

Conference with R. Gray re: Tuesday
meeting; telephone conference with B.
Wood re: same; email to Gray and T.
Hunter confirming August 17, 2010, 9:00
meeting; telephone conference with Hunter
re: slide show and meeting; fax to Hunter
forwarding slide show for review.

Invoice #35094

1.00 hrs

0.65 hrs

1.20 hi=

0.10 hrs
0.35 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

(.35 hrs

0.30 hrs

$100.00

$292.50

$390.00

N/C
$157.50

$225.00

$195.00

NAC

$157.50

Page 3



08/14/2010

08/15/2010
08/16/2010

08/16/2010

08/16/2010

08/17/2010

08/17/2010

08/18/2010

08/19/2010

08/20/2010

08/21/2010

08/21/2010

08/22/2010
08/24/2010
08/24/2010

08/25/2010

3102-01

LVS

REG

REG

REG

REG

REG

REG
REG
TBH

REG

Review material from W. Pierce re: gaps;
exchange emails with W. Pierce re: same.
Work re: revisions to petition.

Review emails re: petition; review T.
Hunter email; reply to same; conference
with S. Jennings re: red-lined version s of
petition.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
gap examples; edit petition, email to S.
Jennings with instructions; more editing;
email petition to with question.
Receipt and review email from T. Hunter re:
drafts 2 and 3 of Original Petition; convert
and lable Draft #2; receipt and review of
vanous emails from Hunter to S. Jennings
re: same; reply to Hunter's emails as to
status of revisions.

Review email; review T.
Hunter email; review W. Pierce email;
conference with B. Wood, R. Bonallic and
T. Hunter re: petition.

Telephone conference with R. Gray, B.
Wood. R. Bonilla; review W. Picrce’s
comments on 3rd draft; review B. Wood and
R. Bonilla memerandum,

Work with T. Hunter re: revisions to
petition.

Review message frcm B. Wood; telephone
conference with 3. Wood re: 8/20
conference with W. Pierce; work re:
pleading icvisions.

Conference with W. Pierce and B. Wood re:
petitiva, funding and plaintiffs.

Raview W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter
emails (2).

Review comments from R. Freeman and W.
Pierce and generate 4th draft of petition;
email to all.

Review T. Hunter email re: petition status.
Review T. Hunter email; reply to same.
Telephone conference with Pierce re:
organization of petition and what I need
from them.

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
correspond to W, Pierce via email re: same;
review T. Hunter email; reply to same;

Invoice #35094

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.45 trs

1.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.65 hrs

1.70 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.25 hrs

2.20 hrs

0.35 hrs
0.15 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.55 hrs

$ 65.00

$225.00
$202.50

$520.00

NiC

$742.50

$552.50

$ 67.50

$135.00

$787.50

$112.50

$715.00

$157.50
$ 67.50
$ 65.00

$247.50

Page 4



08/26/2010 REG Review emails re: petition; work re:
preparation of petition.

08/27/2010 REG Review emails re: petition; review T,
Hunter email re: petition.

08/27/2010 TBH Review information sent by W. Pierce;
email to W. Pierce re: same.

08/28/2010 REG Additional work re: revisions to draft
petition.

08/30/2010 REG Review W. Pierce email; telephone
conference with T. Hunter re: petition
issues.

08/31/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:
status, evaluation, D. Thompson call and
status.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG 01, Richard E. Gray Pariner 27.55 hrs @

MLB  Bolen, Marnee Paralegal 0.00 hrs @

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 22.30 hrs @

LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 1.00 hrs @

Fee Recap Totals 50.85

3102-01 Invoice #35094

review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;

review T. Hunter email; review W. Pierce
email; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same.

450.00 /hr
125.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

0.15 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.50 hi=

020 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.90 hrs

$19,745.00

$12,397.50
$ 0.00
$7247.50
$100.00

$19,745.00

$ 67.50

$ 67.50

$162.50

$ 90.00

$ 67.50

$405.00

Page 5



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512/482-0061

September 30, 2010

$1,987.50

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 35394-1 REG
Equity Center Qur filek; 3102 00001
Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D. Billiag through: 09/30/2010
1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
09/02/2010 REG Review R. Freeman email; review T. Hun@r 0.30 hrs $135.00
email; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: litigation issues and thecties.
09/06/2010 REG Work on latest edits to petition. 0.25 hrs $112.50
09/08/2010 REG Correspond to T. Hunter via email re: 0.35 hrs $157.50
petition status; review T. Hunier email,
reply to same; correspond to W. Pierce via
email re: status.
09/09/2010 REG Correspond to W. Pierce via email re: 0.05 hrs $22.50
exhibit.
09/09/2010 TBH Review chart on averages. 0.10 hrs $ 32,50
09/14/2010 REG Review messaga irom B. Wood; telephone 0.30 hrs $135.00
conference with B. Wood re: status; review
R. Bonillo-email; reply to same.
09/15/2010 REG Review K, Bonillo email; reply to same. 0.10 hrs $45.00
09/20/2010 REG Telephioiae conference with T. Hunter re: 0.15 hrs $67.50
stati.c of petition and 9/22 conference.
09/20/2010 TBH Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 1.10 hrs $357.50
status; edit 4th draft of petition.
09/22/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa ernail; reply to same; 0.60 hrs $270.00
conference with T. Hunter re: 89/22
conference with client; conference with T.
Hunter re: conference with W. Pierce re:
status; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same.
09/22/2010 TBH Conference with R. Gray re: MALDEF; 1.80 hrs $585.00
attend meeting at Equity Center re; status;
email to D. Hinojosa re: draft pleading.
09/23/2010 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same. 0.15 hrs $67.50



TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 225hrs @ 450.00 /hr $1,012.50
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 3.00 hrs @ 325.00 fhr $975.00
Fee Recap Totals 5.25 $1,987.50

3102-01 Invoice #35394 Page 2



Equity Center
Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D.

GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512/482-0061

December 31, 2010

1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

08/16/2010 SEJ

10/06/2010 REG

10/07/2010 REG

10/07/2010 TBH

Review emails from T. Hunter re: revisions
to Petition; conferences with R. Gray re:
same; revise petition and email to clients tor
review.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to saive; ;
review email; reply to'same;
review D. Hinojosa emails (2); reply to
same (2).

Review D. Hinojosa emaii; review T.
Hunter email; review W. Pierce email.
Review comments on draft of petition from
D. Hinojasa; emailio W. Pierce re: same;
email to D. Hir&iasa re: same, review email
from W. Pierce.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG 01, Richard E. Gray Pacmer 075hs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partnes 0.40 hrs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 1.00 hrs @

Fee Recap Totals

2.15

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406

Invoice#: >, 36260-1 REG

Our file#: 3102 00001

Billing through: 12/31/2010

1.00 hrs $100.00

0.45 hrs $202.50

0.30 hrs $135.00

0.40 hrs $130.00

$567.50
450.00 /br $337.50
325.00 /hr $130.00
100.00 /hr $100.00
$567.50



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

September 30, 2011

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: (38792-1 REG
Our filex: 3102 00001
Equity Center Billing through: 09/30/2011
Attn: Wayne Pierce, Ph. D.
1220 Colorado Street, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

08/29/2011 TBH Telephone conference with W. Pierce; 0.30 hrs $ 97.50
review material sent by W. Pierce;
conference with R. Gray.

08/31/2011 TBH Review SB 1 and work on Ist draft of 1.40 hrs $455.00
petition.

08/31/2011 LVS Revise "draft #1” of Original Detition. 0.15 hrs N/C

09/01/2011 TBH Read articles re: 82nd Legis!ation and 3.30 hrs $1072.50
update petition.

09/06/2011 TBH Telephone conference with Lynn Moak re: 0.10 hrs $ 32.50
school finance issues.

09/08/2011 TBH Review ; telephone conference 0.20 hrs $ 65.00
with W. Piercc ve: same and other matters.

09/09/2011 REG Review T. Hunter email; reply to same; 0.20 hrs $90.00
review T. Hunter email.

09/12/2011 TBH Review voice mail from W. Pierce; 0.50 hrs $162.50

telephone conference with W, Pierce;
review cases in preparation for meeting.
09/13/2011 TBH Frepare for meeting; telephone conference 2.30 hrs $747.50
with D. Ray; telephone conference with
, left message.

09/14/2011 TB Attend Equity Center meetings with school 5.80 hrs $1885.00
superintendents; edit petition.

09/15/2011 TBH Edit draft petition; review material on ACT 4.00 hrs $1300.00
& STARR; review email from clients and
respond.

09/19/2011 REG Conference with T. Hunter re: status; review 0.75 hrs $337.50

email; review draft petition.

09/19/2011 TBH Attend and participate in webcast; review 2.60 hrs $845.00

comments on petition from ;

email to B. Wood re: editing petition;



09/20/2011

09/21/2011

06/21/2011

06/22/2011

09/22/2011

09/23/2011

09/23/2011

09/24/2011
09/26/2011
09/26/2011

09/26/2011

09/27/2011

09/27/2011

09/28/2011

3102-01

TBH

TBH

REG

TBH

REG

TBH

REG
RGIV
REG
TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

telephone conference with K. O'Hanlon re:
his involvement in school finance; email to
client re: same; review editorial in Lufkin
paper; conference with R. Gray re: status.
Review email from W. Pierce re: taxpayer
Plaintiff and respond; make edits
to petition; review FLASH information and
tax rate information from TEA; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: changes to
petition; review Alvarado’s West Orange
Cove pleadings.

Review T. Hunter memo; review B, Wood
suggestions; review message from B. Wood;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
status of matters and strategy; review
message form B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: 9/26
conference.

Conference with R. Gray re: meeting with
attorneys.

Conference with T. Hunter re: petitior;
telephone conference with B. Wood're: 9/26
conference.

Review voice mail from R. Freeman re:
experience and respond; review West
Orange Cove II in preparation for attomey
meeting.

Conference with T. Huwuiter re: preparation
of petition; review rmail re: petition
preparation.

Conference with R. Gray; telephone
conference wit ; conference
with L. Mecak; prepare for meeting of
attomeys.

Review T. Hunter memos (2) re: pleadings.
Legal research re: School Finance caselaw.
Conference with attomeys re; pleadings and
strategy.

Attend meeting of attomeys; review
publication of LBB and Comptroller.

Legal research re: school finance caselaw;
organize binders re: same.

Review draft co-counsel agreement; review
W. Pierce emails; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email.

Review R. Freeman email; review T. Hunter
email; reply to R. Freeman email; review D.

Invoice # 38792

2.20 hrs

0.95 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.75 hrs
2.50 hrs
2.50 hrs

0.35 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.65 hrs

$715.00

$427.50

$ 32.50

$90.00

$487.50

$225.00

$650.00

$90.00
$131.25
$1125.00

$812.50

$ 61.25

$270.00

$292.50

Page 2



Ray email; review R. Freeman email; reply
to same; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same.
09/28/2011 TBH Review material sent by L. Moak re: 0.50 hrs $162.50
litigation; review email from C. Langston
and respond; review emails from D. Ray re:
costs and transcript of WOE II; review
email from W, Pierce re: organizational
meeting; conference with R. Gray re: ali of
the above.
09/29/2011 RGIV  Travel to meeting; meeting with state .50 hrs $612.50
superintendents re: school finance; travel
back to office from meeting; review draft of
petition re: same.
09/29/2011 REG Review W. Pierce emails; reply to same; 4.75 hrs $2137.50
review C. Langston email; reply to same;
prepare for conference with potential
clients; conference with C. Langston re:
litigation; conference with school
superintendents for potential litigation.
09/29/2011 LVS Email to D. Ray re: copying of testimony 0.10 hrs NAC
and exhibits on Monday, Oct. 3; recaipt of
response from Ray; arrange for ccpying on

Monday.
09/30/2011 REG Correspond to C. Langston via email re: 0.15 hrs $67.50

conference.

$15,480.00

TIMEKLEEPER RECAP
REG 1, Richard E. Gray Partner 11.45 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $5,152.50
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 4.60 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $ 805.00
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 29.30 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $9,522.50
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 000
Fee Recap Totals 45.35 $15,480.00

3102-01 Invoice # 38792 Page 1



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
October 31, 2011
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 39053-1 REG
Ouir file# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billirg thirough: 10/31/2011
c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
10/03/2011 RGIV  Legal research re: Texas school finance law: 1.50 hrs $262.50
10/03/2011 REG Conference with T. Hunter re: pleading 0.65 hrs $292.50
status; review material produced by school
finance.
10/04/2011 RGIV  Legal research re: Texas school finance law. 2.00 hrs $350.00
10/04/2011 REG Review W, Pierce email; reply tc same; 0.75 hrs $337.50

review T. Hunter email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; conference with T.
Hunter re; status; review 7', Hunter email;
review W. Pierce emai}; review
email; reply to same,
10/04/2011 TBH Review several ariails from W. Pierce re: 0.20 hrs $ 65.00
meeting with L. Moak; review email from
L. Moak re:meeting; conference with R.
Gray re:sane.
10/05/2011 REG Revievi T. Hunter revisions; conference 0.85 hrs $382.50
witho'T. Hunter re: same; review emails;
teiephone conference with re:
school finance issues and petition; work re:
preparation of petition.
10/06/2011 RGIV. " Legal research re: Texas school finance law. 1.50 hrs $262.50
10/06/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter 1.65 hrs $742.50
email; reply to same; review
email; work re: petition; conference with T.
Hunter re: petition; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; review W. Pierce email; reply
to same; conference with T. Hunter re: equal
protection claim; review B. Wood insert;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
email; reply to same.



10/06/2011

10/06/2011
10/07/2011

10/07/2011

10/07/2011

10/08/2011

10/09/2011

10/10/2011

10/10/2011
10/10/2011

10/11/2011

10/11/2011

TBH

LVS
REG

TBH

LVS

REG

REG

REG

SEJ
TBH

RGIV

REG

Review emails from client and respond;
review B. Wood'’s insert to petition and edit
petition; conference with R. Gray re:
petition and new agreement.

Revise POP per T. Hunter.

Conference with T. Hunter, B. Wood, R.
Freeman, W. Pierce and L. Mock re: legal
theories; work on petition; review W. Pierce
emails; review T. Hunter emails (2).

Attend meeting with client, attomeys and L.
Moak re: adequacy.

Review email from T. Hunter; revise draft
POP for T. Hunter; email Hunter re: same.
Review email; review D.
Thompson email; correspond to S. Winkler
via email re: school finance.

Correspond to W. Pierce via email re:
status; review W. Pierce email.

Review email; reply to same; work re:
petition; reply to emails; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re: status and
working together; conference with T.
Hunter re: petition; review emaiis; review L.
Cook email; reply to same; work re:
petition; review email; review
D. Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa
email; conference with T. Hunter re: same;
review L. Cook emaiis; reply to same;
review, revise and Yinalize petition.

Efile Plaintiffs  Original Petition.

Review emails and attachments from client
re: facts for petition; meet with W.Pierce
and R. Freeman re: petition edits;
conference with R.Gray; email and
telepinone conference with B. Wood re:
signature on petition; make final edits to
petition and file.

Legal research re: Texas school finance
caselaw.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review T.
Hunter email; correspond to D. Hinojosa via
email re: filings (2); reply to same;
correspond to W. Pierce via email re: same
(2); review W, Pierce emails (2); correspond
to W. Pierce via email re: funding question;
review naotice of filing; correspond to D.
Thompson via email re: same; correspond to
W. Pierce via email re: same; review emails;

0.90 hrs

0.20 hrs
3.00 hrs

2.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.20 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.25 hrs
5.60 hrs

2.30 hrs

5.00 hrs

$292.50

$20.00
$1350.00

$910.00

N/C

$112.50

$ 90.00

$1350.00

N/C
$1820.00

$402.50

$2250.00



10/11/2011

10/11/2011

10/12/2011

10/12/2011

10/13/2011

SEJ

TBH

REG

TBH

REG

reply to same; review messages; reply to
same; telephone conference with B. Wood
re: petition and status; review D. Thompson
email; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same.
Review email confirmation of filing
Plaintiffs’ Original Petition; telephone
conference with District Clerk re: status of
file-marked copy; confer with R. Gray re:
same; email client re: status; confer with T.
Hunter re: service of citations; telephone
conference with District Clerk re: status of
citations; email T. Hunter re: status.
Review emails from client and others re:
petition and respond.
Conference with T. Hunter re: trial outline
and potential witnesses; review messages
and retum calls; review D. Ray email; repiy
to same; review L. Cook email; conference
with T. Hunter re: same; review D. Ray
email; reply to same; review L. Cock email;
review T. Hunter email; review. W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review V. Pierce
email; reply to same; review D, Hinojosa
email; rely to same; correspond to T. Hunter
via email re: same; review D. Hinojosa
email; correspond to re: Equal
Protection issues, rzview message from B.
Wood; telephone conference with B. Wood
re: pieading.
Review eniails from client; &
D. Hinojnsa and respond; conference with
R. Gray.
Correspond to Dr. Folks re: litigating;
teview L. Mock email; review
email; reply to same; review C. Nickel
email; review L. Cook email; correspond to
W. Pierce via email re: data analysis; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review T.
Hunter email re: statistics; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review D. Thompson
material; review email from ;
review message from ; review
message from teiephone call to
- left message; review
email; review email from L.

0.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.55 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.35 hrs

NiC

$162.50

$1147.50

$162.50

$1507.50



10/13/2011

10/13/2011

10/14/2011

10/14/2011

10/15/2011

10/16/2011

10/17/2011

10/17/2011

10/17/2011

10/18/2011

10/18/2011

10/18/2011

10/19/2011

SEJ

TBH

REG

TBH

REG

REG

REG

TBH

LVS

RGIV

REG

RGIV

Magee(2); reply to same (2); review various
messages; retum calis; review W, Pierce
emails; reply to same.
Telephone conference with District Clerk
re: status of citations.
Review emails from D. Hinojosa and

re: equal Protection; travel to San
Antonio for interview at KLRN on school
finance.
Review W, Pierce email; correspond to T.
Hunter via email re; same; work re: 10/14
presentation; attend 10/14 conference with
clients; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; telephone conference with

re: equal protection claim and
status.
Tape interview on school finance; retum to
Austin from San Antonio.
Review L. Cook email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email.
Conference with D. Richards re: legal
theories.
Review W. Pierce email; replv.to same;
review L. Cook email; review emails; reply
to emails; review correspeindence; review D.
Thompson emaii; reply to'same; review D.
Thompson email; repiy to same; review W.
Pierce email; reply o same; review W.
Pierce email; repiv to same.
Draft memorandum to R. Gray re: equal
protection c!xim; review email from client
and attache<( news report.
Preparz draft memo from T. Hunter to R.
Gray',
Meeting with client at Equity Center re: data
and litigation strategy.
Review S. Winkler email; reply to same;
prepare for conference with W. Pierce re:
data analysis; review T. Hunter memo re:
Equal Protection; conference with attomeys
and Equity Center personnei re: data
analysis.
Review email from client; attend meeting
with W, Pierce, R. Freeman, R. Gray and R.
Gray IV on data capacity.
Review data; conference with counsel re:
same; calculate average wealth per WADA,
calculate total wealth per WADA for 2011

0.10 hrs

1.00 hrs
1.00 hrs

1.35 trs

2.00 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.55 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.15 hrs

1.40 hrs

2.15 brs

1.80 hrs

2.05 hrs

N/C

$325.00
N/C

$607.50

N/C

$112.50

$ 90.00

$697.50

$520.00

N/C

$245.00

$967.50

$585.00

$358.75



10/19/2011

10/19/2011

10/19/2011

10/20/2011
10/20/2011

10/20/2011

10/20/2011

10/21/2011

10/21/2011

10/22/2011

10/22/2011

10/22/2011

10/23/2011

10/24/2011

RGIV

REG

RGIV
REG

TBH

LVS

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

REG

RGIV

Region 4; conference with counsel re: data;
legal research re: school finance law.

Excel spreadsheet organization; review
workings of excel. (NO CHARGE)
Review J. Haney email; reply to same;
review W. Pierce email; prepare for 10/20
conference; correspond to S. Winkler via
email re: status; review C. Nickel email;
travel to Houston for 10/20 presentation.
Review email from client re: bios; respond
to same; review TEA data; conference with
Richard re: data; email to W. Pierce re: top
and bottom at $1.17 and $1.04; review
expert bios.

Work re: data analysis.

Attend Region 4 conference; make
presentation; return travel to Austin.
Review bio and approve; prepare for
meeting with R. Gray.

Telephone conference with D. Ray re:
missing documents in West Orange (ise,
help determine which files are missing;
email to T. Hunter re: same; airange for
delivery of 2nd flashdrive; review flashdrive
for documents; email to T-Hunter re: same.
Legal research re: schofl finance caselaw;
create new spreadsheets sorting by 2011
Wealth per WADA and 2011 State and
Local M&O Revenue per WADA; email
Wayne Pierce ie: target revenue data.
Work with printouts re: financial analysis;
review message from B. Wood; telephone
conferénce with B. Wood re; status; review
W. Pierce emails (3); reply to same (3);
review W, Pierce email; reply to same.
Legal research re: Texas Education Code;
meeting with counsel re: litigation strategy.
Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
conference with REGIV and T. Hunter re:
strategy conference and experts.
Conference with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re:
strategy.

Various emails and replies with T. Hunter
re: legal terms and experts.

Review 25 emails re: scheduling of
meetings among plaintiff's attomeys re:
litigation strategy; review email from
counsel re: meeting with expert; legal

1.50 hrs

5.75 hrs

1.20 g

5.30 hrs
8.00 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.05 hrs

1.35 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.90 hrs

$262.50

$2587.50

$390.00

$927.50
$3600.00

$877.50

N/C

$183.75

$607.50

$306.25

$675.00

$487.50
$112.50

$332.50



10/24/2011

10/24/2011

10/25/2011

10/25/2011

10/25/2011

10/26/2011

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

TBH

REG

research re: Texas Constitution; meeting
with counsel and legal assistants re: case
organization and responsibilities; create
spreadsheets for the top 15% and the bottom
15% of FY2011 Wealth per WADA and
State and Local Revenue per WADA;
calculate averages for same.

Review W. Pierce emails (2); reply to same;
review Ft. Worth Agenda; review A.
Kauffman article; correspond to attomeys
via email re: working together; review M.
Trachtenby email; reply to same; review T.
Hunter email re: P. Colbert; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same (2);
review D. Hughes email; review and reply
to emaiis re: P. Colbert; review M.
Trachtenby email; review various emails re:
lawyer conference; work re; P. Colbert
conference; telephone call to Sarah (Sen.
Lugo) re: amicus brief; conference with
staff re: file organization.

Outline proof requirements in Wesi Orange
Cove II; meet with R. Gray and staff;
review emails from D. Thompson, D.
Hinojsa and M. Trachenburg; set up
meeting with P. Colber; rzsearch expert on
history of Texas Constitution.

Conference with counsel re: data; creale
spreadsheets re: ten and bottom 15% of
districts in Adopted M&O Tax Rate and
sum total of top and bottom 15% of districts
in ADA 20d WADA,; create spreadsheets re:
top and bottom 15% based on wealth per
WALA and State and Local Revenue per
WADA and the corresponding average tax
tate, and the corresponding total ADA and
total WADA.

Conference with REGIV re: additional
analysis; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review additional printouts; travel to
Ft. Worth; attend Ft. Worth ISD conference;
retum travel and conference with clients.
Finalize summary of WOCII; review
summary of Murdock testimony and review
exhibits; review current data from State
Demographer.

Review analysis of court decisions; review
witness list in West Orange case; review W,

2.75 hrs

4.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

11.25 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.85 hrs

$1237.50

$1300.00

$288.75

$5062.50

$520.00

$382.50



Pierce email; reply to same,
10/26/2011 TBH Review articles by A. Kaufman on History 3.00 hrs $975.00
of Edgewood and Fundamental Rights
under Texas Constitution; travel to State
Law Library to get 2nd article; create list of
West Orange Cove II witnesses; review
portions of West Orange Cove II transcript.
10/27/2011 RGIV  Telephone conference with Dr. Bill Kelly 1.80 hrs $315.00
re: school finance expert; legal research re:
Texas school finance system.

10/27/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email; review 25 hrs $11250
email; reply to same.
10/27/2011 TBH Review P. Clobert's testimony from WOC II 1.50 hrs $487.50
in preparation for meeting.
10/28/2011 RGIV  Research re: Texas school finance system. 1.20 hrs $210.00
10/28/2011 REG Review R. Freeman email; review W. Pierce 0.85 hrs $382.50

email r: research; review W, Pierce email;
reply to same; review R. Freeman email;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same.
10/31/2011 RGIV Conference with counsel re: experts; email 0.30 hrs $52.50
William Kelly re: school finance expest;
review and reply to email from Dr. Xelly re:

expert.
10/31/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email. 0.15 hrs $ 67.50
10/3172011 TBH Review email from client and respond; 2.10 hrs $682.50

telephone conference with Loren Cook re:
article on equal protection and Senator Ellis;
review transcript of Colbert testimony from

WOC I

$42,207.50
TIMERKELPER RECAP A
REG I, Richard E. Gray Partrier 59.70 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $26,865.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 27.20 hrs @ 175.00 /fhr $ 4,760.00
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 32.50 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $10,562.50
SEl Jennings, Susan, Paralegal 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 0.00
LVS von Stemberg, Lvin 0.20 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 2000

Fee Recap Totals 119.60 $42,207.50



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

November 30, 2011

Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

11/01/2011 REG Review M. Trachtenburg correspondence;
review messages re: school finance; return
calls; review D. Hinojosa email; reply te
same; review W. Pierce email; review D,
Hinojosa email; reply to same; revicw T.
Hunter email; review D. Hinojosa cmail;
review L. Cook email; correspond to T.
Hunter via email re: same.

11/01/2011 TBH Draft language for newsletter on Equal
Protection claim; revievw emails from D.
Hinojosa on equal pratection; review emails
from W. Pierce and respond; conference
with R. Gray re: Hinojosa emails and

request to be involved; email
to L. Cookre: involvement;
review F. Colbert testimony from WOC II
in preparation for meetings.

11/02/2011 RGIV  Revicw email from Dr. Kelly re: expert;
conterence with counsel re: same; meeting
with Paul Colbert re: expert.

11/02/2011 REG Review B. Kelly email re: experts;
conference with T. Hunter re: same;
conference with T. Hunter, R. Gray IV and
P. Colbert re: expert issues.

11/02/2011 TBH Review L. Moak article on cuts to teachers:
review Colbert charts in preparation for
meeting with Colbert; email to W. Kelly re:
experts; review Murdock report from WQOC
II; meet with P. Colbert.

11/03/2011 REG Review message from B. Ward; telephone
conference with B. Ward re: experts.

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 35293-1
Our file# 3102
Billing \hrough:

1.65 hrs

4.50 hrs

1.10 hrs

1.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.25 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
11/30/2011

$ 742.50

$1462.50

$192.50

$ 675.00

$975.00

$ 11250



11/04/2011

11/07/2011

11/07/2011

11/07/2011

11/07/2011

11/08/2011

11/08/2011

11/09/2011

11/09/2011

11/10/2011

11/10/2011
11/10/2011

3102-01

SEI

RGIV

Work re; 11/8 Lubbock trip; review
message from B. Wood.

Review Original Answer; create data
spreadsheet re: Lubbock County; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review notice from C. Nickell; review
Original Answer of State; conference with
T. Hunter re: experts; prepare for Lubbock
trip; review message from B. Wood,
telephone call to B. Wood - left message;
review W_ Pierce email.

Confer with T. Hunter re: contact
information for Paul Colbert; email C.
Nickell re: same.

Review email from P. Colbert and
attachments; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: P. Colbert and other experts;
conference with R. Gray re: experts;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
expert; review resume for O. Lopez; email
to I. Butler; review chart sent by W. Pierce
and respond.

Travel to/from Lubbock; make presentation
to Lubbock ISD Board.

Review emails re: next step from .. Cook
and respond; review audion of B. Lesley re:
money matters; telephone conference with
D. Hinojosa re: experts_c2view expert
resumes.

Conference with atcdyneys re: experts and
pleadings.

Review videc of C. Clark on TASB school
finance plat; search internet for Cook and
Walch resumes; telephone conference with
J. Waich re: expert testimony; review chart
seniby W, Pierce; telephone conference
wili W. Pierce re: experts and TCJL
meeting.

Conference with counsel re: data sorted by
wealth per WADA at $1.04 and $1.17 tax
rate; email Wayne Pierce re: same;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
workbook spreadsheet; create spreadsheets
re: top and bottom 15, 20, 25, and 50
percent wealth per WADA.

Additional analysis of tax/revenue issues.
Review notebook sorted by wealth per
WADA; email to B. Baker, potential expert;
telephone conference with J. Walch,

Invoice # 39293

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.30 hrs

0:20 hrs

2.60 hrs

10.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.80 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.75 hrs
0.60 hrs

$ 135.00

$ 87.50

$ 585.00

NiC

$845.00

$4,500.00

$487.50

$ 360.00

$650.00

$262.50

$ 337.50
$195.00

Pags 2



11/11/2011

11/11/2011
11/14/2011

11/14/2011

11/14/2011

11/14/2011

117152011

11/15/2011
1171512011

11/15/2011

11/16/2011

1171772011

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

potential expert; review website for
American Association of Educational
Finance.

Conference with counsel re: workbook data;
organize spreadsheet re: all 1024 districts
sorted by wealth; email Wayne Pierce re:
workbook data.

Review spreadsheet re; tax rates/revenue.
Conference with counsel re: Bexar county
data; create spreadsheets re: same.

Review email re; expert; conference with T.
Hunter re; same; review email from Water
Valley ISD; work re: preparation for 11/15
conference; review T. Hunter email; review
email; conference with S. Jennings re: 11/15
Northside conference; conference re: school
finance issues.

Telephone conference with J. Lisson,
attorney for Water Valley ISD, re: Original
Petition and possible intervention; confer
with R. Gray re: same; email Mr. Lissonce;
same; confer with R. Gray re: travel to
Northeast ISD; telephone conference with
W. Pierce’s office re: same; confer with R.
Gray re: status; telephone confer=nce with
Caroline re: trip to San Antcnio; confer with
R. Gray re: same.

Set up telephone conference with B. Baker;
review email from P. Colbert and respond.
Conference with connsel re; case status and
experts,

Review emails from counsel re: experts.
Review L. Cook emails: review R. Freeman
email; work re: expert selection; travel
to/froin San Antonio; conference with
Northside ISD Board.

Review various emails from P. Colbert and
respond; contact attorneys re: B, Baker;
review emails from W.Pierce re; W,
Bingham and T. James and meeting of
Coalition committees; conference with R.
Gray re: experts.

Correspond to W. Pierce via email re:
status; review R. Freeman email; reply to
same; review W. Pierce email,

Telephone conference with Bruce Baker re:
school finance litigation expert; conference
with counsel re: same; telephone conference
with John Robb re: working with Bruce

Invoice # 39293

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.35 hrs
4.15 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.25 hrs

$ 52.50

$ 225.00
$ 87.50

$ 697.50

NS

$ 65.00
$ 2625

$ 61.25
$1,867.50

$780.00

$ 112.50

$218.75

Fage 3



11/17/2011

1171772011

11/17/2011

11/18/2011

11/21/2011

11/21/2011

11/21/2011

11/22/2011

11/22/2011

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Baker as an expert.

Review L. Moak email; review T. Hunter 0.55 hrs
email; review L. Moak email; review T.

Hunter emails; review W, Pearce email;

review L. Cook emails.

Confer with T. Hunter re: request for 0.20 hrs
Answer from L. Moak: email L, Moak re;

same.

Review material to prepare for interview 2.60 hrs

with B. Baker; interview B, Baker by
telephone conference; interview J. Robb re:
B. Baker; review material provided by B.
Baker to W. Orange Cove CISD
Defendant’s and material on CEI; review
video of C. Dupre; exchange emails with
W Pierce re: Target Revenue and

Pflugerville.

Conference with attorneys re: experts; 0.50 hrs
review emails; reply to same.

Review Inside Texas Schools Video re: 0.60 hrs

Charles Dupre; review email from counszl

re: districts that have joined the coalition;

revise spreadsheet and print for R. Gray III.

Review additional data; review R Fieeman 1.70 hrs
email; review M. Trachenberg eimail; review

D. Thompson email; reply to-zame; review

M. Trachenberg email; reply to same;

correspond to other attcrreys via email re:

when they expect to fi'e; review emails re:

status; reply to same: conference with T.

Hunter re: status, experts and strategy.

Review emails from client and respond; 1.30 hrs
conference with R. Gray re: experts; email

to P. Coloeit re: starting data analysis;

review response; telephone conference with

P. colbert re: same; telephone conference

wiwi B. Lesley re: expert analysis.

Revise and print spreadsheet re: coalition 0.05 hrs
districts.
Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; 1.05 hrs

review P. Colbert email; correspond to T,
Hunter via email re: same; review T. Hunter
email; review L. Cook email; reply to same;
review B. King email; review T. Hunter
email; review B. Wood email; correspond to
T. Hunter re: 11/30 conference; review
emails; review message frorn R. Freeman,;
telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
Mexican American School Board

Invoice # 39293

$ 24750

N/C

$845.00

$ 225.00

$105.00

$ 765.00

$422.50

$ 875

$ 47250

Pagu 4



11/22/2011

11/22/2011

11/23/2011
11/25/2011

11/25/2011

11/25/2011

11/26/2011

11/27/2011

11/28/2011

11/28/2011

11/28/2011

11/29/2011

11/29£2011

11/29/2011

11/30/2011

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV
RGIV

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

RGIV

conference.

Email W. Pierce re: consulting agreement
with P. Colbert.

Review various emails from client and
respond; email to B. Wood re: meeting of
attorneys; review articles by various
experts; search for bio information on W.
Bingham and T. James; prepare for strategy
meeting with R. Gray.

Review Gannon report of Bruce Baker.
Meeting with counsel re: case status and
litigation strategy.

Prepare for strategy conference; conference
with R. Gray IV and T. Hunter re: status and
strategy.

Prepare for meeting on strategies with R.
Gray and R. Gray IV; review B. Baker's
evaluation of the Texas FSP; meet with R.
Gray and R. Gray IV.

Review T. Hunter email re: legal theories;
reply to same; additional data analysis.
Research study re: SAT/ACT scores; raview
T. Hunter email.

Research re: Interest and Sinking fund tax
rate; review data re; analysis.

Review article re: SAT/ACT score;
correspond to T. Hunter via £mail re:
exhibits; telephone call iz B. Wood - left
message; review message from B. Wood;
conference with T, Hunter re: B. Wood call.
Review TEA stady on preformance on
college tests; review emails from W. Pierce
and responq; telephone conference with B.
Wood re: expert and meeting; email to P.
Colbeirt setting up telephone conference.
Telepione conference with Wayne Pierce
te: Study on district lines splitting
neighborhoods and I&S tax rates; legal
research re: school finance law.

Review W. Pierce email; conference with T.
Hunter re: 11/30 conference with attorneys;
telephone call to B. Wood - left message;
review D. Hinojosa email; review opinion in
Allcot claims.

Review email from W .Pierce and respond;
review spreadsheet on college achievement;
review report on superintendent’s salary.
Research Texas School Finance; review
emails from Wayne Pierce re: District line

Invoice # 39293

0.20 hrs

1.90 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.5 rrs

.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.15 hrs

0.55 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.80 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.85 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.70 hrs

N/C

$617.50

$ 43.75
$262.50

$ 675.00

$812.50

$ 180.00

$ 6750

$ 96.25

$ 225.00

$260.00

$218.75

$ 38250

$162.50

$647.50

Page §



11730/2011 REG

11/30/2011 TBH

TIMEKEEPER RECADP

data; meeting with all attorneys re: litigation
status and strategy; review and reply to
email from Wayne Pierce re: district lines
splitting neighborhoods.

Review report re: SAT/ACT scores; prepare
for 11/30 conference; conference with
attorneys re: litigation issues and strategy;
review message from R. Freeman; telephone
conference with R. Freeman re: Ector
County ISD; review message from B.
Wood; telephone conference with B. Wood
re: experts and strategy; review message
from W. Pierce; telephone conference with
K. Ohlanon re: Edinburg ISD.

Prepare for meeting with attorneys; meet
with attorneys; review emails from client.

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 3430 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 1355 hrs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 29.00 hrs @
SEI Jennings, Susan Paralegal 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 76.85

3102-01 Invoice # 39293

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

4.10 hrs

2.60 hrs

$1,845.00

$845.00

$27,231.25

$15,435.00
$ 2,371.25
$ 9,425.00

_s 0w

$27,231.25

Papge &



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

December 31, 2011
Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 39462-1 REG
OQur file# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 12/31/2011

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
12/01/2011 RGIV  Review email from Wayne Pierce re: 2.10 hrs $367.50
showing neighborhoods split by district
lines; forward same to T. Hunter:
conference with counsel re: Ector data;
create spreadsheet re: same; review siides
re: Ector county presentation; conterence
with counsel re: same; review enuals from
Ray Freeman re: Ector Councy presentation;
check data on Ector Counuy: telephone
conference with Ray Frecman re: same and
Ector county presentation; create
spreadsheet re: same.
12/01/2011 REG Review R. Freeman email; reply to same; 0.85 hrs $382.50
make arrangement for 12/6 conference;
correspond-to-W. Pierce via email re:
Edinburg ISD; review R. Freeman email;
conference with R. Gray IV re: same; reply
to R: Freeman; review W. Pierce email;
review R. Freeman emails (2).
12/01/2011 TBH Review emails from client and respond,; 2.40 hrs $780.00
prepare for telephone conference with P.
Colbert; telephone conference with P.
Colbert re: B, Baker, expert; telephone
conference with re: experts;
telephone conference with H. Daniels, left
message; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: Helen Daniels.
12/02/2011 RGIV Review summary of WADA; print same for 0.90 hrs $157.50
counsel; conference with counsel re: same;
Telephone conference with Ray Freeman re:
Ector county presentation; conference with



12/02/2011

12/04/2011

12/04/2011

12/05/2011

12/05/2011

12/05/2011

12/05/2011

12/06/2011

12/06/2011

12/06/2011

12/07/2011

3102-01

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

MLB

RGIV

RGIV

counsel re: Ector presentation slides; review
slides; review email from Wayne Pierce re;
coalition members being named plaintiffs.
Review message from R. Freeman;
telephone call to R. Freeman re: Ector
County; review information of weights.
Meeting with counsel re: Ector County
presentation; revise presentation; complete
and finalize same.

Prepare for presentation to Ector County
ISD.

Meeting with counsel re: case status;
research school building architects re: cost
of building facilities.

Review R. Freeman email; reply to same;
review W, Pierce email; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; conference with W. Pierce,
R. Freeman and T. Hunter re: status and
strategy; prepare for Ector Co. ISD
conference; conference with T. Hunter re: [
Moak call; conference with attorneys re: zo
forward strategy; review message from .
O'Hanlon; conference with T. Hunte: re:
same; review T. Hunter email re: survey;
review W. Pierce email; review aricle re:
facilities and test scores.

Review emails from clien( and respond;
email to B. Baker re: telzphone conference;
review articles by Baker on equity met with
R. Freeman, R. Gray iand W. Pierce re:
various matters; ineet with R. Gray and
Richard Gray re: status of efforts; internet
search on facility experts; edit questions to
Plaintiff disicicts.

Telephione call to Ector Co. ISDre:
tomearow’s board meeting - no answer;
revisw web site - school closed due to
weather.

Review email and document sent by Mark
Trachtenberg re: TIER and the state of
public education in Texas.

Travel to/from Odessa; conference with
Ector Co. ISD; review paper on construction
COSts.

Review emails from H. Daniels and forward
to client and R. Gray; review Tier article;
telephone conference with O’Hanlon re:
Edinburgh.

Print data for counsel; research school

Invoice # 39462

0.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.25 has

0.50 hrs

2.15 hrs

3.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

12.25 hrs

0.40 hrs

2.75 hrs

$225.00

$262.50

$562.50

$ 87.50

$967.50

$1267.50

NfC

$ 5250

$5512.50

$130.00

$481.25

Paga 2



12/07/2011

12/07/2011

12/08/2011

12/08/2011

12/08/2011

12/08/2011

12/09/2011

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

finance in Texas: review data: review email

and article from Ray Freeman re: Wichita

Falls; compile data re: same; review email

and spreadsheet from Tim Wolff re: Public

Education Data available; conference with

counsel re: same.

Review email update re: analysis and 0.40 hrs
experts; review message from J. Corrales;

telephone call to J. Corrales - left message.

Attend meeting at Equity Center with B. 4.60 ks
Leslie, P. Colbert, W. Pierce, R. Freeman

and staff regarding AEIS data; prepare for

telephone conference with B. Baker; review

email from R. Freeman re: Wichita Falls

article and respond; draft contract for H.

Daniels and email to her; conference with R.

Gray re: telephone conference with O

Hanlon asking to reschedule; email re:

same.

Meeting with counsel re: case status and 2.55 hrs
litigation strategy; review documents re:

Intercultural Development Research

Association; telephone conference witi: Tim

Wolff re: data analysis to run; legal research

re: findings of fact and conclusions of law in

West Orange Cove II; confercnce with

counsel re: same.

Conference with T. Hunier re: new database 1.65 hrs
and expert vetting; conterence with R. Gray

IV and T. Hunter re: exhibits and analysis;

review article by R. Baker; review research;

conference with T. Hunter re: Edinburg

ISD; review ernail re: litigation committee

conference.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Board Resolution; 0.40 hrs
review tile re; same; email L. McCollom re:

same.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re: 2.10 hrs

Edinburgh phone call, meet with R. Gray
and Richard Gray re: data, Edinburgh and
strategy; review Carrollton - Farmers;
telephone conference with B. Baker; review
material from B. Leslie.

Review documents from the Intercultural 3.60 hrs
Development Research Association re:
Texas statewide attrition rates; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: email
address; Telephone conference with Equity
Center re: same; research Texas school

Invoice # 39462

$180.00

$1495.00

$446.25

$742.50

$682.50

$630.00

Page 3



12/09/2011

12/10/2011

12/12/2011

12/12/2011

12/12/2011

12/13/2011

12/13/2011

12/13/2011

1271312011

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

DMB

RGIV

REG

TBH

finance systern re: tier | and tier 2 funding
and basic allotment and student weights.
Review M. Trackenburg email; reply to 1.00 hrs
same; review article by prospective experts;
review school funding article.
Review email re: low income students; 1.25 hrs
review T. Hunter email re: Edinburg; reply
to same; review Calhoun County suit;
correspond to W, Pierce via email re: same.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 3.20 bry
data analysis; review petition filed by Hanes
and Boone; conference with counsel re: data
analysis; email Tim Wolff re: same;
research re: current state of Texas School
Finance System; review article re: Several
Efforts Under Way to Measure Effect of
Texas’ Budget Cuts on Schools; review
studies within article.
Telephone conference with T. Hunter re: 2.70 hrs
Edinburg call; review W. Pierce email,
review K. O’'Hanlon email; telephone
conference with K. O’Hanlon re: confercnce
call; telephone conference with K. CHanlon
and Dr. Gutierrez re: Edinburg; telepnone
conference with T. Hunter re: sama; review
email; review D. Hinojosa email,
review M. Trachenburg ernail; conference
with T. Hunter re: status.
Several telephone conferences with K. 0.90 hrs
O’'Hanlon, R. Gray, ", Pierce and R.
Freeman to arraage telephone conference
with superintendent of Edinburg 1.5.D. re:
joining suit; telephone conference with W,
Pierce re: what was said during conference
call; roview emails and articles from client;
conference with R. Gray.
Conference of attorneys re: lawsuit 0.50 hrs
participation by Wichita Falls ISD;
telephone conferences with K. Hines’s office
and Hines, school board member, re: same.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 0.85 hrs
data analysis; review Wichita Falls data;
conference with counsel re: same.
Conference with D. Richards re: status; 0.80 hrs
review W. Pierce email; review R. Freeman
email; correspond to D. Becker via email re:
Wichita Falls ISD; review emails re:
potential experts.
Review contract with H. Daniels; review 1.30 hrs

Invoice # 39462

$450.00

$562.50

$560.00

$1215.00

$292.50

$175.00

$148.75

$360.00

$422.50

Page 4



12/14/2011

12/14/2011

12/14/2011

12/15/2011

12/15/2011

12/16/2011

3102-01

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

articles sent by client; emails to client about
theme of our case; telephone conference
with P. Colbert re: AEIS data correlated to
wealth; review O. Lopez’s vitae.

Review data re: texas high school exit exam
policies; review data on varying states
expectations on students performance in
science; review data re: coalition districts
eligible for free lunch program; review data
re: district lines splitting neighborhood
study; conference with counsel re; same;
email Wayne Pierce and Josh Haney re:
progress of study; telephone conference
with Buck Wood re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; review HB 1 summary.
Review L. Cook email; reply to same;
review R. Freeman email: review L. Cook
email; review D. Hinojosa email; forward to
clients; reply to same; review L. Cook
email; conference with D. Becker re:
Wichita Falls; correspond to D. Hinojosae:
filing; review summary of exit exam
profiles; review Lobott decision; review
additional articles written by potertiai
experts; review MALDEF press release and
suit; review email re: H. Danials.

Review email from Q. Lopez and respond;
review emails from clierit and respond;
review MALDEF petition; review data on
coalition districts.

Review email from Josh Haney re:
neighborhood eports; review reports;
telephone converence with Cathy at Buck
Wood's ofiice re: findings of fact and
conclusions of law; email Cathy at Buck
Wooed's office re: same; review Property
Tax Relief: The $7 Billion Reality; meeting
with counsel re: inter district comparisons;
¢mail Josh Haney re: same; review The
Adequacy of Educational Cost Functions.
Review data on taxpayer inequity;
conference with Richard re: same; review F
of F from W. Orange Cove.

Review email from Josh Haney re: inter
district comparisons; conference with
counsel re: same; review pertinent statutory
school finance law; review tier 2 funding
analysis; review data sent by Tim Wolff re:
analysis; email Tim Wolff re: same;

Invoice # 39462

2.95 hrs

2.35 hrs

1.30 hrs

3.15 hrs

1.10 hrs

2.60 hrs

$516.25

$1057.50

$422.50

$551.25

$357.50

$455.00

Pupe 3



12/16/2011

12/19/2011

12/192011

12/192011

12/20/2011

12/20/2011

1272172011

12/21/2011

12/21/2011

12/22/2011

12/22/2011

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

REG

conference with counsel re: same.

Review West Orange Cove opinion and
findings; review W. Pierce email.

Review pertinent statutory law on Texas
School Finance,

Status conference with attorneys; review
correspondence.

Review articles sent by client; review
MALDEF petition; email to EC re: target
revenue; review articles on "Overcoming
Rodriquez” by B. Baker; Telephone
conference with O. Lopez re: serving as
expert; review property levels of member
district.

Review pertinent statutory law on Texas
School Finance; review data; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: same and
new analysis; format data; review data re:
district comparison based on revenue per
WADA.

Review property level of coalition districis;
review emails from B. Leslic and W. Pierce
re: Omar Lopez; email to W.Pierce ré:
MALDEEF petition; review respons=; review
equal protection article from ;
email to re: saric; begin
review of Deborah P.

Review data created by 7im Wolff; meeting
with counsel re: litigation strategy and data;
telephone confererc with Tim Wolff re:
analysis.

Review L. Conl email; review W. Pierce
email; reply o same; conference with
attorneys 1 status and strategy.

Meet with R. Gray and R. Gray IV to
discuss progress, data, legal issues; email to
E.Colbert re: what the data shows: review
rasponse; read 11th Circuit case.
‘Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data analysis; conference with counsel re:
data; create filing system re: same; email
Wayne Pierce re: 2012-2013 data and
district data at a $1.00 tax rate; telephone
conference with Paul Colbert re: data; email
data to Paul Colbert.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review P. Fraysetter email; review petition
of Thompson and Horton; review L. Cook
email; review D. Hinojosa email (2); reply

Invoice # 39462

0.60 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.90 hrs

2.95 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

$270.00
$192.50
$225.00

$942.50

$516.25

$455.00

$262.50

$450.00

$585.00

$210.00

$675.00

Puge &



12/22/2011

12/22/2011

12/23/2011

12/26/2011

12/2712011

12/2712011

12/28/2011

12/28/2011

12/28/2011

12/29/2011

12/29/2011

12/29/2011

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

TBH

to same (2); review data on ACT/SAT
scores; review W. Pierce email.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Texas School
Caoalition lawsuit; telephone conferences
with District Clerk re: status of same; email
attorneys and client re: status of same.
Review emails from client re: Texas School
Coalition case and respond; review material
from experts.

Review W. Pierce email; reply to same.
Review T. Hunter email; reply to same;
correspond to D. Hinojosa via email re: 1/12
conference.

Review 5% interval data; conference with
counsel re: same; email Tim Wolff re:
description of analysis; email Josh Haney
Ie: maps.

Review data analysis; conference with R.
Gray IV re: same; review emails re: filings
and 1/12 conference.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data analysis; review emailed data from Tim
Wolff re: data at $1.00 tax rate; emai} same
to Toni Hunter and Paul Colbert; review
data sent by Tim Wolff re: top aud bottom
percentiles; manipulate data aid print for
counsel.

Conference with R. Grzv 1V re: additional
analysis; conference witih T. Hunter re:
Motion to Consolidatz; conference with T,
Hunter re: attoracy conference and
amending pleaclings.

Review emails from client and H. Daniels
re: facility Gata; respond; review materials
on weights and test scores; review bio
infommiation on H. Keller; confer with R.
Gray re: filing Motion to Consolidate and
Amended Petition; review David
Thompson’s petition; respond to client
emails re: same.

Conference with counsel re; data; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: analysis;
review email from Paul Colbert re: Deer
Park and Pasadena analysis; review and
reply to email from counsel re: data.
Review correspondence; conference with R.
Gray IV re: data analysis; work re: data
analysis.

Review data from Equity Center; review

Invoice # 39462

0.25 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.15 ks

0.25 nrs

1.05 hrs

0.60 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.45 hrs

2.40 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.35 hrs

1.90 hrs

N/C

$162.50

$67.50

$112.50

$183.75

$270.00

$350.00

$202.50

$780.00

$192.50

$157.50

$617.50

Page 7



emails from P. Colbert re: data and respond,;
begin drafting 1st Amended Petition and
Motion to Consolidate.
12/30/2011 REG Review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter 0.30 hrs $135.00
email; conference with attomeys re: Motion
to Consolidate and 1/12 conference.

$30,973.75
TINIEREEPER RECAT
REG 1, Richard E. Gray Partner 3285 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $14,782.50
DMB  Becker, Douglas M. Partner 050 hrs @ 350.00 /ir $ 175.00
MLB  Bolen, Mamee Paralegal 000 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 000
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 3785 hrs @ 175.00 /br $6,623.75
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 28.90 hrs @ 325.00 fir $9,392.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 0.00 hrs @ 100,090 ¢hr 3 000
Fee Recap Totals 100.10 $30,973.75

3102-01 Invoice # 39462 Page &



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061

January 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimness Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Augstin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

01/03/2012 RGIV ~ Review email from Wayne Pierce re: data
meeting; review data sent by Tim Wolff:
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: moeting
times; review data; print hard cepy of same
for T. Hunter; meeting at the Equity Center
re: data, case status, and litigation strategy’
review articles re: consequerices of the 4
billion dollar funding cut.

01/03/2012 REG Conference with R. Giay IV re: W, Pierce
conferences and data-analysis; review M.
Trachtenberg einaii; review status answer;
correspond to'W. Pierce via email re: same;
review messaze from D. Thompson; review
D. Hinojo:z email; correspond to W. Pierce
via email re: same; conference with T.
Hupter re: data analysis and equal protection
igsez; telephone call to D. Thompson - left
message; telephone conference with D,
Thompson re: status and strategy; review
W. Pierce email.

01/03/2012 TBH Review emails from L. Cook re: coalition
members and respond; review data by
precincts; work on Amended Petition and
Motion to Consolidate; attend meeting at
Equity Center re: facilities data; conference
with R. Gray re: meetings with other
attomeys and direction of case.

01/04/2012 RGIV  Review email from Wayne Pierce re:
plaintiff groups representative districts and

Tax ID No.:
Invoiced 39235-1
Our file; 3102
Billing through:

4,40 hrs

1.40 hrs

3.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
01/31/2012

$770.00

$630.00

$1072.50

$ 1750



01/04/2012

01/04/2012

01/04/2012

01/05/2012

01/05/2012

01/05/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

TBH

students.

Review email from Josh Haney re: 2.55 hrs
Inter-District Comparisons; print hard

copies to T. Hunter; review top and bottom

15, 20, and 25% data; review data and print

for T. Hunter; meeting with counsel re: all

data review and how to proceed re: same,

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; 0.90 hrs
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.

Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email;

reply to same; review T. Hunter email; reply

to same; review D. Thompson email; reply

to same.

Work on Amended Petition and Motion to 2.30 hrs
Consolidate; review emails from Equity

Center and respond; review data provided

by Equity Center; confer with R. Gray IV

re: data.

Review email from Paul Colbert re: I&S tax 0.25 hrs
rate comparisons for Deer Park and

Pasadena and the rates effect on the overall

Revenue per WADA difference between the

districts; review and reply to emai! from

counsel re: inter-district data.

Review W. Pierce email; review M. 1.70 hrs
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.

Hunter re: correspondence-io Judge

Livingston and Motion to Consolidate;

review T. Hunter draii correspondence to

Judge Livingston = consolidation; review

M. Trachtenberg email; review P. Colbert

email; review Washington decision; review

D. Hinojosa email; conference with T.

Hunter rc:'same; review D. Thompson

email; review M. Trachtenberg email;

review and revise Motion to Consolidate;

conference with T. Hunter re: same: review

M. Trachtenberg emails (2); conference

with T. Hunter re: same.

Exchange several emails with other parties 4.60 hrs
re: letter to Judge Livingston and Motion to

Consolidate; respond; conference with R.

Gray re: same; draft letter to Judge

Livingston and send; draft Motion to

Consolidate and Circulate; edit Amended

Petition; telephone conference with D.

Hinojosa re: witnesses and discovery;

telephone conference with S. Dahlberg re:

agreeing to letter and Motion; telephone

Invoice # 39835

$446.25

$405.00

$747.50

$ 4375

$765.00

$1495.00

Page 2



01/06/2012

01/06/2012

01/08/2012

01/09/2012

01/09/2012

01/10/2012

01/10/2012

01/11/2012

01/11/2012
01/12/2012

310201

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

conference with Mary Ann Whitelar re: new
Plaintiff; telephone conference with Pete
Johnson, new Plaintiff, telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: email
communications; email to W.Pierce re:
Plaintiff.

Review email from Paul Colbert re: State
share of Facilities Spending; print same for
T. Hunter; review Washington news article
re: Washington Supreme Court’s decision.
Finalize correspondence to Judge
Livingston; conference with T. Hunter re:; L.
Mock involvement; review email re:
correspondence to Judge Livingston.
Review updated analysis.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation requests 1, 2, and 3 and revisions
to all; review email from Paul Colbert re:
facilities funding trends by the state; review
email from Wayne Pierce re: state share of
facilities funding; review and reply to email
from Tim Wolff re: litigation request 33.
Review articles emailed by B. Lesiey and
W. Pierce; review facilities da*a provided by
P. Coleman; finalize draft of Amended
Petition and circulate fro comment;
conference with R. Gray re: Motion to
Consolidate; review iaw-joumal article on
adequacy v. equity; review article by B.
Baker on moneY nratters; review email on
Thursday meeting.

Review and v=vise amended petition;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
D. Hinojssa email; reply to same.
Telepaone conference with W. Pierce re:
emaijls; review documents sent by Equity
Center.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation request 002B; review and print
litigation request 001B.

Review and revise amended petition.
Review Plaintiff’s First Amended Original
Petition; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: litigation requests; review funding
gaps of districts within counties; review
emails from Tim Wolff re: litigation
requests 001C and 002B; forward same to
T. Hunter and Paul Colbert; review
litigation request 002B re: no overlap tables.

Invoice # 39835

0.45 hrs

0.25 hrs
1.60 hrs

4.80 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.85 hrs

0.50 hrs
3.10 hrs

$ 7875

$247.50

$112.50

$280.00

$1560.00

$112.50

$ 97.50

$148.75

$225.00
$542.50

Page 3



01/12/2012

01/12/2012

01/13/2012

01/13/2012

01/13/2012

01/16/2012

01/16/2012

01/16/2012

01/17/2012

01/17/2012

01/17/2012

3102-01

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

Conference with T. Hunter re: amended
pleading; review L. Cook email; conference
with T. Hunter re: status and data; telephone
call to A. Kauffman - left message.

Contact 2 taxpayer Plaintiffs; draft
consulting contract for Equity Center; meet
with W Pierce and R. Freeman to go over
Plaintiff district; conference with R. Gray
re: meeting with D. Hinojisa and experts;
review questionnaires filled out by potential
Plaintiff districts.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
clarification on litigation request 002B;
meeting with MALDEEF re: case status,
Conference with T. Hunter, D. Hinojosa, R.
Gray IV and MALDEEF staff re: status,
strategy and experts.

Prepare for meeting with MALDEF; meet
with MALDEF attomeys.

Email David Hinojosa re: data spreadsheets;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: facilities
funding expert; review and make list of
David Thompson’s Below Aveiage Wealth
Level Districts; review Bruce Baker's blog.
Conference with T. Hunter . school
faculty study; conference with R. Gray IV
re: data from D. Hinojota; begin preparation
for 1/18 conference oi attorneys; review
email re; See of Siate Advisory re: name;
conference with 1. Hunter re: same and
solutions to-same.

Review atizles sent by Equity Center;
Telephoiz conference with W. Pierce re:
S0OS8ejection of coalition name; conference
with R. Gray re: same; respond to emails
trom W. Pierce re: facilities study; review
B. Baker materials.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
litigation common interest agreement and
proposed pre-trial exhibits; review email
from David Hinojosa re: data spreadsheets;
review litigation common interest
agreement and proposed pre-trial exhibits;
meeting with counsel re: same.

Review data re: SAT/ACT comparisons
based on wealth range.

Review W. Pierce email; review J. Tumer
email; review D. Thompson email; review

Invoice # 39835

0.65 hrs

3.00 hrs

2.30 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.90 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.60 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.05 hrs

0.35 hrs

1.40 hrs

$292.50

$975.00

$402.50

$787.50

$617.50

$218.75

$270.00

$650.00

$183.75

$ 61.25

$630.00

Page 4



01/17/2012

01/18/2012

01/18/2012

01/18/2012

01/19/2012

01/19/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

draft Litigation Common Interest
Agreement; review draft proposed pre-trial
agreements; reply to J. Turner email; review
D Hinojosa email; conference with
attomeys re: preparation for 1/18 conference
and trial preparation; review correspondence
assigning case to Judge Dietz.

Review email from J. Tumner and attached
documents; finish reviewing B. Baker
documents; conference with R. Gray and R.
Gray IV; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: Texas Taxpayer and Reesearch
Organizations; review Select Committee
Reports.

Conference with counsel re: needed data;
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation requests 002B, 4, 5, 6, and 7;
review agenda for lawyers meeting; lawyers
meeting; meeting with Moak/Casey.
Review W, Pierce email; conference with 2.
Gray IV re: data analysis; reply to W. Pieice
email; prepare for 1/18 conference; raview
W. Pierce email; conference with 2. Gray
IV re: exhibits; review W. Pierce email;
reply to same; telephone call to 5. Dahlberg
- left message; telephone zaj'io B. Echols
re: Judge Dietz assignmeni and scheduling;
telephone call to S. Dahloerg - left message;
conference with atfomeys re: status, experts,
strategy, issues 4nd schedule; review L.
Cook email; reply to same; conference with
attomeys ana M. Casey re: expert
involvemen:.

Prepare ior meeting of attomeys; meet with
attoraeys; review letter from J. Livingston;
mcer with Moak and Casey; conference with
K. Gray.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
meeting on case strategy and experts;
meeting with counsel re: data requests;
review email from Wayne Pierce re: article;
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
litigation requests 8 and 9; organize data,
articles, reports, etc into folders; conference
with legal assistant re: same; review school
finance caselaw.

Conference with R. Gray IV re: additional
analysis; review email correspondence;
review W. Pierce emails (2) re: additional

Invoice # 39835

2.20 hrs

6.65 hrs

7.00 hrs

5.00 hrs

1.95 hrs

0.40 hrs

$715.00

$1163.75

$3150.00

$1625.00

$341.25

$180.00

Page 5



01/20/2012

01/20/2012

01/23/2012

01/23/2012

01/23/2012

01/24/2012

01/24/2012

01/24/2012

01/25/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

RGIV

districts; conference with S. Jennings re:
updating list.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
meeting.

Review additional data analysis; review W.
Pierce email; review email.
Review emails from counsel and John
Tumer re: pretrial agreements; review email
and analysis from Josh Haney re:
inter-district comparisons; review email and
data from Tim Wolff; meeting with counsel
re: case status. case strategy, experts, and
data; review email from counsel re; all
petitions filed, Texas Tribune article,
facilities standards.

Review J. Tumer emails (2); conferences
{2) with T. Hunter re: same; review W,
Pierce email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review message from B. Wood;
review D. Hinojosa email; telephone
conference with B. Wood re; litigation
status; review D. Hinojosa email; review
States answer to MALDEF petitiou;
conference with attomeys re; siaius, exerts
and strategy.

Review emails from W. Pizicz and respond;
prepare for telephone conicrence with B.
Baker; telephone confarence with B. Baker
re: consulting; telephune conference with L.
Moak re: meetirig, meet with R. Gray and R.
Gray IV re: experts and data; review and
revise Comrion Intent Agreement and
Pre-Trial Ajreements; review proposed
scheduliiig order; look for facility standards;
review article by B. Baker on equity issues
in New York; review voice mail from
votential taxpayer Plaintiff,

Review Original Petitions of plaintiffs; draft
summary memorandum for counsel re:
plaintiffs lawsuits; review litigation request
001C:; print and organize same.

Review schedule of conferences; review W,
Pierce email.

Revise amended petition; review suggested
edits from W. Pierce.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
revenue per WADA for Bryan and College
Station ISD; review data re: same; review,
format, and print litigation request 002B,

Invoice # 39835

0.10 hrs

0.25 hrs

3.60 hrs

2.15 hrs

5.60 hrs

4.45 hrs

0.20 hrs

4.60 hrs

5.05 hrs

$ 17.50

$112.50

$630.00

$967.50

$1820.00

$778.75

$ 90.00

$1495.00

$883.75

Page 6



01/25/2012

01/25/2012

01/25/2012

01/26/2012

01/26/2012

01/27/2012

3102-01

REG

LVS

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

003C, 004 A, 005A, 006A, and 007 A;
review First Amended Petition; conference
with counsel re: same; conference with
counsel re: data for the second year of the
cutrent biennium; telephone conference
with Tim Wolff re: same; email counsel re:
same; review haynes and boon petition and
summarize plaintiffs names within.
Correspond to A. Kauffman re: equal
protection claim; review draft amended
pleading; conference with T. Hunter re:
same; review request for disclosure;
conference with T. Hunter re: same;
conference with R. Gray IV re: database
issues; review B. Wood text; reply to same;
correspond to B. Wood and D. Ray via
email re: amended petition.

Do final edits on amended petition and file;
review emails from W. Pierce; review
summary of Plaintiff districts and edit;
conference with L. Moak; conference wiil
R. Gray.

Prepare revised Plaintiff's 1st Amended
POP per T. Hunter; review docainent for
comment as to consistency; email to Hunter
re: same; second revision.of 2ocument per
Hunter; third revisions per dunter; make
final corrections; efile with court.

Review date re: top 15%/Bottom 15%
average revenur. pet WADA and average
ATR ranked by Wealth; conference with
counsel re: sams; conference with counsel
re: data meeting; review data re:
superintenident questionnaire responses and
data rzzarding their districts.

Ccunference with T. Hunter re: First
Amended POP; make notes as to revisions
on future petitions (n/c); calendar due date
for Plaintiff responses to RFD (n/c); prepare
Request for Disclosure to Defendants;
conference with T. Hunter re: revisions and
filing of Corrected First Amended POP;
efile Corrected First Amended with courts.
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
accountability ratings; review and print
litigation requests 008A and 009A;
telephone conference with Josh Haney re:
inter-district comparisons of our taxpayer
plaintiff's districts; email counsel re: same;

Invoice # 39835

0.80 hrs

3.70 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.95 hrs

0.60 hrs

1.60 hrs

$360.00

$1202.50

NiC

$166.25

NiC

$280.00

Paga 7



01/27/2012
01/27/2012

01/29/2012

01/29/2012

01/30/2012

01/30/2012

01/30/2012

01/30/2012

01/31/2012

01/31/2012

01/31/2012

3102-01

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

review email from Tim Wolff re:
accountability ratings; complete spreadsheet
for T. Hunter re: same; organize all data;
draft summary re: same.

Conference with R. Gray IV re: data.

Email parties identified by T. Hunter as to
meeting on February 1, 2012 re: school
finance.

Telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
1/29 conference and 1/30 conference;
review T. Hunter email.

Prepare for presentation at Equity Center
meeting; attend meeting and speak;
conference with M. Rebell and L. Moak.
Review counties ranked by revenue per
WADA and counties ranked by wealth gaps;
meeting with Paul Colbert re: data and case
status; conference with counsel re: same;
email Paul Colbert most recent data.
Conference with litigation committee,
conference with coalition members:
conference with T. Hunter re: "To Do List™:
conference with P. Colbert re; dat+ cnalysis;
review R. Freeman email; confervuce with
W. Pierce, R. Freeman and T. Hunter re:
trial team issues; review M. Rebill paper.
Attend meeting of Litigation Committee,
attend Coalition meesing; meet with P.
Colbert re: data; mezt with R, Gray, W.
Pierce, R. Freerian re: counsel status;
telephone conference with P.Colbert re:

Conference with T. Hunter re: meeting; text
to R. Gray IV re: same,

Revicw all data re: prepare for meeting with
cownsel; review article from Paul Colbert re:
Houston Chronicle Kilday Hart; review and
respond to email from counsel re; Alief ISD
rating; meeting with counsel re: all data.
Review article re: funding; correspond to B.
Wood via email re: status; conference with
T. Hunter re: data analysis; review B. Wood
email; reply to same; conference with R.
Gray IV and T. Hunter re: data and
reporting; review B. Wood email; reply to
same; review article re: finance system,;
review L. Cook email.

Correlate district data with superintendent
answer to questionnaire; telephone

Invoice # 35835

0.15 hrs
0.10 hrs

0.35 hrs

2.50 hrs

3.80 hrs

3.30 hrs

4.30 hrs

0.05 hrs

3.25 hrs

2.15 hrs

3.00 hrs

$ 67.50
N/C

$157.50

$812.50

$665.00

$1485.00

$1397.50

N/C

$568.75

$967.50

$975.00

Page &



01/31/2012 LVS

TIMERKEEPER RECAP

conference with B. Baker re: various things;

review emails from W. Pierce and

and attached articles; conference
with C. Jacob re: blog search; conference

with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re: data.

Final Request for Disclosure; prepare fax

cover to 8. Dahlberg,

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 26.70 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 49.65 hrs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 5310 hrs @
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 bhrs @
Fee Recap Totals 129.45

3102-01 Invoice # 39835

0.10 hrs

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 7iir

N/C

$37.961.25

$12,015.00
$8,688.75
$17,257.50
$ 0.00

$37,961.25

Page 9



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

February 29, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 48087-1 REG
Our file#:' 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing tirough: 02/29/2012

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

02/01/2012 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: litigation 0.75 hrs $131.25
request 005A and 008A; draft questions fox
data meeting; email same to counsel for
review; review inter-district comparisons re:
addresses of those living in poor.sctiool

districts.
02/01/2012 RGIV  Meeting at Equity Center re: data. 3.00 hrs $525.00
02/01/2012 REG Review M. Trachtenberg 2mail; conference 2.75 hrs $1237.50

with T. Hunter re: 2/1 conterence;
conference with W. Picrce, R. Freeman, C.
Aki, P. Colbert, T. Funter, R. Gray IV, T.
Wolff and H. Daniels re: data analysis and
exhibits,
02/01/2012 TBH Email to K..Cruse; telephone conference 3.90 hrs $1267.50
with Cruse, ieft message; conference with
R. Gray re: counsel responsibilities; draft
letter to B. Baker; attend meeting on data at

Enuity Center.

02/01/2012 LVS Tnal letter to B. Baker per T. Hunter's 0.15 hrs N/C
instructions.

02/01/2012 CM1 Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinance101) 9.00 hrs $1260.00

to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.
02/02/2012 RGIV  Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 0.80 hrs $140.00
data requests; review email from counsel re:
facilities standards; telephone conference
with Wayne Pierce re: same.
02/02/2012 REG Review draft scheduling order; conference 0.50 hrs $225.00
with T. Hunter re: same and 2/3 conference



02/02/2012

02/02/2012

02/03/2012

02/03/2012

02/03/2012

02/04/2012

02/06/2012

02/06/2012

02/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SEJ

call; review correspondence to B. Baker;

review emails.

Telephone conference with D. Thompson 1.40 hrs
re: designation of districts and experts;

prepare for telephone conference with

attorneys; review articles on equity from

W.Pierce.

Review Common Interest Agreement; 0.20 hrs
review email from B, Wood and respond.

Review article by John Kuhn re: inequity in 3.10 Grs

school funding; conference with counsel re:
same; bi-weekly telephone conference with
all plaintiffs re: scheduling order, pretrial
agreements, consolidation/coordination,
comrmon interest agreement, and experts;
review Education Week blog; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data request.
Conference with R. Gray IV re: additional 0.75 hrs
data analysis; conference with R. Gray IV
re: conference call results; review draft Joint
Motion for Pre-Trial Conference;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
J. Turner email; review D. Thompson'email;
review T. Hunter emails {2).
Telephone conference with all plaintiff 1.40 hrs
attorneys re: scheduling cenference; joint
proposed scheduling ordei;-and other
matters.
Review emails re: scticduling order and 0.50 hrs
Motion for Statvs Conference; reveiw
email with attached article.
Review email fiom Wayne Pierce re: 2.05 hrs
Facilities Standards; review statutory law re:
same; revizw and reply to email from
counse! re: updated data.
Revizw article re: Finland schools; review 0.95 hrs
U.. Hinojosa email; review P. Fraissinet
i»mail; conference with T. Hunter re; Motion
for Pre-Trial Conference; review emails re:
scheduling conference; review D. Hinojosa
email; conference with T. Hunter re: setting
hearing for status conference; review J.
Turner email; review D. Thompson email;
review D. Hinojosa email; review T. Hunter
emails (3) re: scheduling; review P,
Fraissinet email.
Confer with T. Hunter re: finalizing Joint 1.50 hrs
Motion for Scheduling Conference; confer
with T. Hunter re: revisions to Motion;

Invoice # 40087

$455.00

$ 65.00

$542.50

$337.50

$455.00

$225.00

$358.75

$427.50

$150.00

Page 2



02/06/2012

02/06/2012

02/07/2012

02/07/2012

02/07/2012

02/08/2012

3102-01

CMJ

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

revise and finalize Motion; efile and serve
Motion; email counsel re: same; prepare
letter to Judge Dietz re: same.

Respond to email from W. Pierce re:
amount of time before final opinion; review
suggested edits to proposed pre trial
schedule; make and send our edits and
suggestions; telephone conference with

H Keller; finalize and file motion for
scheduling conference; telephone
conference with L. Moak; coordinate
schedules for possible hearing.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re;
Texas school finance.

Review email from Josh Haney re:
inter-district comparisons; forward email to
counsel and Paul Colbert; review emails
amongst all plaintiff groups re: scheduling
conference motion and proposed scheduliug
order; review email from Tim Wolff ce;
updated data; reply to email from Jesi
Haney re: inter-district comparison;
summarize all current data for counsel;
review all current data; telcphone
conference with Tim Woliire: litigation
request 010 and O11.

Review D. Thompszn email; conference
with B. Wood re; status, strategy and
working relationship; conference with T,
Hunter re: statuy; review T. Hunter email re:
status con{erence; correspond to team re:
status caiis; correspond to parties via email
re: stafllis; review emails re: scheduling
corference; review material provided by D.
Hinojosa.

Telephone conference with Juge Dietz's
office re: scheduling hearing; conference
with R. Gray re: status updates with B.
Wood; conference with Richard Gray re:
data; review emails from attorneys on other
cases and respond.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
cutrent data summary and data to send to
Bruce Baker; review email from Wayne
Pierce re: updated school finance litigation
page; review content re: same; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data

Invoice # 40087

1.00 hrs

8.50 hrs

3.35 hrs

2.90 hrs

0.40 hrs

3.20 hrs

$325.00

$1190.00

$586.25

$1305.00

$130.00

$560.00

Frae 3



02/08/2012

02/08/2012

02/09/2012

02/09/2012

02/09/2012

02/10/2012

02/10/2012

02/10/2012

02/10/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

REG

CMJ

requests; review email from John Tumner re:

revised proposed scheduling order; review

email from David Hinojosa re:

Commissioner Scott’s remarks; draft letter

to inter-district comparison poor district

home owners re: possible testimony.

Review W. Pierce email; correspond to 0.60 hrs
parties via email re: workshop; conference

with R, Gray IV re: comrespondence to

property owners; conference with R. Gray

IV re: correspondence to B. Baker; review J.

Tumer email re: scheduling order; review R.

Freeman email and article.

Review data to send to B. Baker; review 1.00 hrs
edited proposed scheduling order; review

dates for telephone conference with

coalition attomeys.

Review email from Lauren Cook re: 0.50 hrs
STARR test and passing results; review

email from counsel re: data to send to Bruce

Baker and proposed scheduling order;

review proposed scheduling order; review

email from Tim Wolff re: updated iitigation

request 003E; forward same to«counsel and

Paul Colbert; review data to send to Bruce

Baker and begin compiling.

Review emails re: scheduling order; reply to 0.50 hrs
same; review correspondence from L.

Mock; review P. Fraissinet email re:

scheduling orde:.

Review edits to pre-trial agreements; review 0.20 hrs
new data.

Review lelter to inter-district comparison 1.90 hrs

homeowri¢rs; conference with legal assistant

re: sarag; conference with legal assistant re:

saine; comprise and organize data emails to

Byuce Baker; email same to counsel re;

double checking information to be sent.

Review T. Hunter email; review P. 1.00 hrs
Fraissinet email; review D. Thompson

email; status review with team attomeys;

telephone conference with T. Hunter re;

scheduling order.

Telephone conference with plaintiff 0.80 hrs
attorneys re: scheduling, experts, testing,

pre-trial hearing.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinancel 01) 1.00 hrs
to determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Invoice # 40087

$270.00

$325.00

$ 87.50

$225.00

$ 65.00

$332.50

$450.00

$260.00

$140.00

Fape 4



02/10/2012

02/12/2012
02/13/2012
02/13/2012

02/13/2012

02/13/2012

02/16/2012

02/16/2012

02/16/2012

02/17/2012

02/17/2012

02/20/2012

3102-01

CMJ

RGIV

SEJ

CMJ

RGIV

REG

CM]J

RGIV

RGIV

Texas school finance.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.

Email data to Bruce Baker.

Review D. Hinojosa email.

Review email from T. Hunter re: meeting
with K. Cruz and B. Wood; telephone
conference with Cathy, B. Wood's office re:
same; email T. Hunter re: same.

Telephone conference with John Hankason,
school board attorney re; re:
litigation status.

Review Dr. Baker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.

Review emails from Wayne Pierce and Pani
Colbert re: updated and resorted data; prini
same; conference with legal assistant re:.
letter to home owners.

Correspond to T. Hunter and B. Wead via
email re: status; review message irom D.
Thompson; telephone conference with D.
Thompson re; commitmezi i7om Meek
Casey and status; correspond to Texas
Taxpayer/Student Faitress Coalition via
email re: same; review W. Pierce email;
review T. Huntec email.

Review Dr. Bzker's blog (schoolfinancel01)
to determinc; if hie has written anything that
may be usea to impeach his testimony re:
Texas schiool finance.

Reviseand finalize letters to lower wealth
homzowners in district comparisons;
cunference with legal assistant re: same;
review and reply to email from Josh Haney
re: Van-Grand Saline inter-district
comparison.

Review D. Hinojosa emails (2); reply to
same; conference with T. Hunter re:
conference call; review J. Turner email;
review L. Cook email with article on school
finance; review W. Pierce email; review
article by various potential experts; review
W. Pierce email.

Review email from Mark Trachtenberg re:
final proposed scheduling order; review

Invoice # 40087

0.75 hrs

0.15 hrs
0.15 hrs
0.25 hrs

0.10 hrs

4.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.65 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

$105.00

$ 26.25
$ 67.50
N/C

$ 32.50

$560.00

$ 87.50

$292.50

$280.00

$288.75

$630.00

$ 52.50

Fape §



02/20/2012

02/20/2012

02/20/2012

02/21/2012

02/21/2012

02/22/2012

02/22/2012

3102-01

SEJ

CMJ

RGIV

RGIV

REG

same; review and organize file.

Review article re: potential expert; review
M. Trachtenberg email; correspond to T.
Hunter via email re: same; conference with
S. Jennings re: B. Wood call.

Telephone conference with Cathy, Buck
Wood's office, re: meeting with Keith Cruz
on February 23rd; email T. Hunter re: Mr.
Wood's change of plans and attendance at
the meeting; telephone conference with
Cathy re: responses to Request for
Disclosures 2/27/12; confer with R. Gray re:
same.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to
determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach his testimony re:
Texas school finance.

Review emails re: proposed scheduling
order and meeting with the State' review
email from Josh Haney re:
Hillsboro-Milford inter-district comparisnii.
Telephone conference with S. Rosen Oudge
Dietz) re: timing of conference; correspond
to all parties via email re: same’ roview S.
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; revicw Ir. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review >, Thompson email;
telephone conferenc with S. Rosen re:
pre-trial hearing dates; correspond to
attomeys via email re: same; review M.
Trachtenberg smiail; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review D,
Thompsoii email; review D, Hinojosa email;
review 'W. Pierce email; reply to same;
correspond to attomneys via email re:
pre-trial; review S. Dahlberg emails (2);
reply to same; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review P. Fraissinet email; review D
.Hinojosa email; review D, Thompson
email.

Review emails re; scheduling conference
with Judge Dietz; calendar same.

Review emails re: status conference; reply
to same; telephone call to S. Rosen - left
message; telephone conference with S.
Rosen re: status conference; correspond to
all attorneys via email re: same; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review M.

Invoice # 40087

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.35 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

2.10 hrs

$270.00

NI

$280.00

$ 61.25

$1215.00

$ 70.00

$945.00

Page 6



02/22/2012

02/23/2012

02/23/2012

02/23/2012

02/23/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

Trachtenberg email; review S, Dahlberg
email; review D. Hinojosa emails (2).
review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;
review D. Thompson emails {2); review M.
Trachtenberg email; telephone conference
with 8. Rosen re: request for petitions;
correspond to attomeys via email re: court's
request; review D. Thompson email; review
B. Wood text messages (2); reply to same
(2); review D. Thompson email.

Review emails re: scheduling pre-trial
hearing with Judge and respond.

Read and review school finance caselaw;
conference with legal assistant re:
inter-district comparison poor homeowners;
review emails from plaintiff's re: meeting
and 5th lawsuit being filed; review email
from counsel re: Equity Center request;
summarize same.

Review various emails re: scheduling;
conference with T. Hunter re: coordinating
same; review email re: petition; review S,
Rosen reply; review D. Thompson eniail;
review M. Trachtenberg email; cowespond
to S. Dahlberg via email re: 3/2 conference;
review D. Thompson emai!; reply to same;
review D. Thompson emaii re: potential
suit; reply to same; review D. Ray email;
review S. Dahlberg 2uiail; review D.
Hinojosa email; ceview D. Thompson email;
conference with T. Hunter re: potential
expert and scheduling; conference with B.
Wood re: status; review S. Dahlberg email;
reply to saine; review D, Thompson email
re: adcitional suit; review M. Trachtenberg
emai!; reply to same.

LConfer with T. Hunter re: Notice of
P’re-Trial Conference; email all counsel re;
same; telephone conference with Court
Administrator's office re: same; confer with
T. Hunter re: Notice set on Judge’s personal
docket; email Stacy Rosen, Judge Dietz's
Court Operations Officer, Plaintiffs' live
pleading in Word format.

Prepare for meeting with K. Cruse; meet
with K. Cruse re: testing; conference with
B. Wood and R. Gray; prepare for telephone
conference with B. Baker; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re discovery;

Invoice # 40087

1.85 hrs

0.75 hrs

3.90 hrs

$ 65.00

$612.50

$832.50

WiC

$1267.50

HPage 7



02232012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/24/2012

02/25/2012

3102-01

CMJ

RGIV

SEJ

CMJ

CM]J

REG

telephone conference with S. Dalberg re:

extensions for response to RFD; review and

respond to various email from plaintiff

attorneys re: scheduling meeting with state

and new lawsuit; review articles sent by W,

Pierce.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 2.00 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance.

Review email and articles from Wayne 1.2Q hrs
Pierce re: New Jersey school finance and

5th texas lawsuit; find contact information

and call Chris Diamond re: Sth school

finance suit; conference with legal assistant

re: emailing same to Wayne Pierce and Ray

Freeman.

Review W. Pierce email; review articles re: 0.90 hrs
additional suit; review D. Thompson email:

review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review T.

Hunter email; conference with S. Jennings

re: B. Baker trip.

Confer with T. Hunter re: meeting wiih 0.75 hrs
Bruce Baker; research flights arid hotels for

meeting; email B, Baker re: same; email W.

Pierce re: Plea in Interventicn/of the

Efficiency Intervenors in ¢ Fort Bend ISD,

et al. v. Robert Scott, et 2. suit; email client

letter from counsel r=: extending deadlines

to respond to recucsts for disclosures.

Telephone conference with B. Baker; 4.00 hrs
review 5th lawsuit; conference with R. Gray

re: schedu’e for Baker's visit: conference

with R. Gray re: 5th lawsuit; review 5th

lawsuii; review Imagki and Reschovsky

articles on School Finance Reform in Texas;

review R. Reich article on Adequate v,

Zqual Education; review New York Times

article on Education Group Between Rich

and Poor.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 1.50 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter account to 2.00 hrs
determine if he has written anything that

may be used to impeach his testimony re:

Texas school finance.

Analysis of new suit; review 0.65 hrs

Invoice # 40087

$280.00

$210.00

$405.00

N/C

$1300.00

$210.00

$280.00

$292.50

Page 8



02/26/2012

02/27/2012

02/27/2012

02/27/2012

02/27/2012

02/28/2012

02/28/2012

3102-01

RGIV

CMJ

RGIV

email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; review D. Thompson email (2); reply
to same (2).

Review report of L. Darling-Hammond
from Colorado suit; review report of W.S.
Burnett on Pre-School Education from
Colorado suit; review report of C. Belfield
on Fiscal and Social Burden of Inadequate
Education on Colorado from Colorado suit.
Review emails re: intervention lawsuit.
Review email re: B. Baker conference; reply
to same; review ernails re: intervention;
conference with T. Hunter re: securing
consensus re: new answer to intervention;
review information re: B. Baker conference;
conference with T. Hunter re: intervention
and complication of new suit.

Telephone conference with D. Hinojosa re:
5th lawsuit and experts; conference with R
Gray re: same; Telephone conference with
D. Thompson re: 5th lawsuit; review eraaiis
from W Pierce and respond; review atticle
on state testing; conference with C-Jacobs
re: blogs and twitters of B. Baker, review B.
Baker's blog.

Review Dr. Baker's twitter-ac<ount to
determine if he has written anything that
may be used to impeach iiis testimony re:
Texas school finane:.

Review emails r2: agenda for meeting with
the State; review articles re: affect of budget
cuts; review inter-district comparison of
Deer Park'and Pasadena; review emails re:
scheduling order and pre-trial agreements;
review same; review district performance
da(a; format and print same.

Conference with T. Hunter re: conference
with state; work re: proposed scheduling
order; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same; correspond to W. Pierce via email
re: tax/groundwater issue; review emails re:
pre-trial schedule and pre-trial conference;
review W. Pierce email; review D, Hinojosa
email; review J. Turner email; review draft
pre-trial agreernents; review draft
scheduling order; conference with T. Hunter
re: same; review M. Trachtenberg emails
(2); review D. Thompson email; review P.
Fraissinet email.

Invoice # 40087

1.50 hrs

0.10 s

0.73 hrs

1.40 hrs

3.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

1.55 hrs

$487.50

$ 17.50

$337.50

$455.00

$420.00

$288.75

$697.50

Page 9



02/28/2012 TBH

02/28/2012 RGIV

02/29/2012 REG

Review several email between Plaintiffs 1.60 hrs
attorneys re: proposed pre-trial schedule and

pre-trial agreement; conference with R,

Gray and B. Wood re: same; review articles

by M. Rebell re: equal education rights.

Review emails from plaintiff's re; meeting 1.00 hrs
with State and agenda; telephone conference

with Tim Wolff re: litigation request 012A;

review email from counsel re: facilities

SUIveys; review same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review M. 0.50 brs
Trachtenberg email; review draft scheduling

order.

TINMEKEEPER RECATDP

REG M1, Richard E. Gray Partner 2425 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 29.45 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 23.00 hrs @ 32500 mr
CMJ Jacobs, Craig 3575 hs @ 140.00 /hr
SE) Jennings, Susan Paralegal 1.50 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
Fee Recap Totals 11395

3102-01 Invoice # 40087

$520.00

$175.00

$225.00

$28,696.25

$10,912.50
$5,153.75
$7.475.00
$5,005.00
$ 150.00
$ 000

$28,696.25

Page 10



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

March 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROYESSIONAL SERVICES
03/01/2012 RGIV  Review email from Tim Wolff re: Litigation
Request 012B; format and print same;
review emails from Plaintiff's counsel re;
pretrial agreements; review litigaticn
request 012B; review and respord in email
from counsel re: data request G!2B;
Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
top and bottom 15% of liagation request
012B; conference with counsel re:
inter-district comparizons; review data sheet
re: contiguous distircis; telephone
conference withi Tosh Haney re: same.
03/01/2012 REG Review J. Tumer email; review D.
Thompson ¢miatl; review J. Tumner email;
review draft common interest agreement;
conferance with T. Hunter re: same.
03/01/2012 SEJ Confter with T, Hunter re: hotel
artaigements for B. Baker; research
availability; confer with T. Hunter re: same;
review emails from T. Hunter and W. Pierce
re: TASA Daily; telephone conference with
editor of TASA Daily re: amended petition;
email editor re: same.
03/02/2012 RGIV  Review and reply to email from Paul
Colbert re: contiguous districts data; review
and reply to email from Tim Wolff re:
litigation request 01 2C; review contiguous
district data and plaintiff districts; build
spreadsheet re: same; telephone conference
with Josh Haney re: same and surveys;

Tax ID No.:

Invoice##: 42154-1

Our files:

Billirg through:

2.70 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

2.30 hrs

74-2427406

REG
00001

03/31/2012

$472.50

$225.00

$402.50



03/02/2012

03/05/2012

03/05/2012

03/05/2012

03/06/2012

03/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

review article re: affect of budget cuts on
teachers and students; conference with
counsel re: surveys and data; review and
reply to email from Josh Haney re: revised
SUrveys.

Conference with T. Hunter and B. Wood re:
372 conference with attorneys for State;
conference with Plaintiff and Defense
attorneys re: scheduling procedure; review
message form D. Thompson; review
message from M. Hurley re; financial
accountability; telephone conference with
M. Hurley re: white paper; conference with
T. Hunter re: conclusion of conference.
Review email from counsel re: surveys;
forward same to Josh Haney re: revisions to
same; telephone conference with Equity
Center re: surveys; emails Josh Haney re:
same; Telephone conference with Josh
Haney re: surveys; review emails from
plaintiff's re: revised scheduling order ana
pre-trial agreements.

Review emails; review scheduling“Jraft)
order; conference with T. Hunter ve: L.
Moak conference; review draft common
interest agreement; conference with T.
Hunter re; facilities survey; review J. Hurley
email; conference withi. T. Hunter re: same:
review J. Tumner em2il; conference with T.
Hunter re: same review J. Tumer email;
review D, Hinojosa email; review T. Hunter
email re: Mouon to Consolidate; review J.
Turner email; reply to T. Hunter email;
review D "Hinojosa email.

Breakcist meeting with L. Moak;
coifirence with R. Gray; review facilities
survey and comment; review amended
proposed scheduling order and pre-trial
agreements; draft update for Coalition
members; edit proposed Motion to
Consolidate.

Review proposed scheduling order and
pre-trial agreements; conference with
counsel re: trial date; review emails re:
consolidation agreement; create and format
data request for counsel re: Harris County.
Conference with R. Gray IV re: revised
schedule; review draft Motion to
Consolidate; conference with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 40154

3.25 hrs

0.85 hrs

1.30 hrs

3.40 hrs

1.35 hrs

0.80 hrs

$1462.50

$148.75

$585.00

$1105.00

$236.25

$360.00

Pape 2



03/06/2012

03/07/2012

03/07/2012

03/07/2012

03/07/2012

03/08/2012

03/08/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

same; review emails re: scheduling order;

review J. Turner email re: scheduling order;

review additional emails re: scheduling

order and pretrial agreement; review

message re: J. Hammerlin conversation re:

constricting costs.

Conference with R. Gray and D. Ray re: 2.50 hrs
Motion to Consolidate; email to Facilities

expert; telephone conference with W. Pierce

re: superintendent witness and other

matters; comment on proposed pre-trial

schedule and pre-trial agreement; review

comments from D. Hinojosa; telephone

conference with J. Hammerlan re: cost of

facilities; review article on relationship of

facilities to performance.

Review and reformat data for counsel; print 4.40 hrs
same; review emails re: schsduling order

and pre-trial agreements.

Review M. Hurley email; reply to same; 0.40 hrs
review material re: B. Baker prior

testimony.

Review email from W. Pierce re: inoeting 3.10 hrs

with A. Cortez; emails to D. Hinojosa re:

same; reply to W. Pierce re: meeting; read

articles on facilities; search vor facilities

expert; review edits to update to coalition

members; email to B. Raker re: March 12;

telephone conferencz with A. Brownson re:

meeting with B/Baker.

Attempt to locate Martin Eugene Sheets via 0.20 hrs
telephone conference with Texas Tech

personnel, run anywho.com searches;

conference with T. Hunter; email address

and phisne number found.

Review emails and attachments re: proposed 0.75 hrs
motion to consolidate, proposed pre-trial

agreements, and proposed scheduling order;

finalize data for counsel; review email from

Wayne Pierce re: School Business Daily.

Review C. Nickel email; conference with T. 1.40 hrs
Hunter re: scheduling conference; review J.

Turner email; review D. Hinojosa email;

review J. Tumer email; conference with T.

Hunter re: same; review J. Turner email;

review J. Tumer email; telephone

conference with M. Hurley re: white paper

preparation; conference with T. Hunter re:

status.

Invoice # 40154

$812.50

$770.00

$180.00

$1007.50

NIC

$131.25

$630.00

Fagr 3



03/08/2012

03/08/2012

03/08/2012

03/08/2012

03/05/2012

03/09/2012

03/05/2012

03/12/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

MLB

LVS

RGIV

REG

RGIV

Conference with T. Hunter re: change of 0.20 hrs
hotel arrangements for Dr. Baker; email Dr.

Baker re: same.

Review email from W, Pierce and respond; 3.00 hrs
research on facilities and adequate

education; telephone conference with G.

Sheets re: facilities; review revised

scheduling order and pre-trial agreements;

email to J. Tumer re: same; review email

from J. Turner on Motion to Consolidate;

review J. Tumer's edits to Motion to

Consolidate and respond; review

superintendent surveys and begin making a

list of potential witnesses; telephone

conference with M. Hurley re:

accountability; conference with R. Gray,

review index to data.

Research Martin E. Sheets; forward results 1.20 hrs
to L. von Sternberg; research Faith Colbert;

forward results to L. von Sternberg.

Review email from T. Hunter re: M. Shiests: 0.30 hrs
email to M. Bolen requesting search-and

providing information on hand; rescarch

internet for Faith Crampton and/or

Crampton & Associates in Milwaukee;

email to M. Bolen re: seaich-on Crampton.

Review emails re: changes to consolidation 0.35 hrs
agreement; telephone conference with

Kathy and Ray and "Vood re: telephone

conference ameagst attorneys; telephone

conference with Charlie from the equity

center re; surveys.

Review 3. Thompson email; reply to same; 090 hrs
review rnaterial re: B, Baker writings and

testirriony.

Attempt telephone conference with B. 1.50 hrs

Wood; review questionnaire; review emails
from W. Pierce and respond; telephone
conference with G. Sheets; prepare for
meeting with B. Baker.

Conference with counsel re: meeting with 5.50 hrs
Dr. Baker; prepare for same; meeting with
Bruce Baker, Paul Colbert and counsel re:
expert analysis, case strategy and data;
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data; meeting at Equity Center re: Bruce
Baker, case status, case strategy, and data;
meeting at office with counsel and Bruce
Baker re: same and contract.

Invoice # 40154

NAT

$975.00

$120.00

N/

$ 61.25

$405.00

$487.50

$962.50

Page 4



03/1272012

03/12/2012

03/12/2012

03/12/2012

03/13/2012

03/13/2012

03/13/2012
03/13/2012

03/14/2012

03/14/2012

03/14/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

Conference with attorneys and B. Baker re:
potential expert testimony; conference with
B. Baker, T. Hunter, R. Gray IV and Equity
Center panel re: report, analysis and trial
issues,

Telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
March 12th meeting with Bruce Baker;
email and telephone conferences with B,
Wood’s assistance, Cathy, re: same; confer
with T. Hunter re: same; review and return
email from R. Gray re: the date for the end
of discovery in the most recent proposed
scheduling order.

Meet with B. Baker, R. Gray. P, Colbert;
meet with A. Brownston, B. Baker and P.
Colbert; meet with W, Pierce, R. Freeman,
P. Colbert, B. Leslie, H. McDaniels, Equity
Center staff, B. Baker.

Telephone conference with Kathy of Ray &
Woods; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
meeting schedule; conference with S.
Jennings re: Ray Wood.

Telephone conference with Tim Wxlif re:
data; review data sent to Bruce/Buker;
review School Business Daily articles.
Review W. Pierce email; zeply to same;
review W. Pierce reply; conference call with
W. Pierce and T. Hunterre: status and
strategy.

Prepare plan packets for T. Hunter.
Telephone conference with W. Pierce, R.
Freeman, R Gray re: order of testimony;
telephone ‘cunference with G. Sheets re:
phone coiiference tomorrow.

Telzphiine conference with Tim Wolff re:
data; review and reply to email from Tim
Wolff re: litigation requests 008C and 009C;
<rail same to counsel and Bruce Baker;
format and print for counsel; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: revision of
litigation request 008C and (009C;
conference with counsel re: same.

Review email correspondence; review email
re: Motion to Consolidate; conference with
attorneys re: B, Baker; review message from
B. Wood; telephone call to B. Wood - left
message.

Review letter and study from Houston
Endowment; email to P. Colbert and W.

Invoice # 40154

5.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

8.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.55 hrs

2.03 hrs

$2250.00

N/C

$2600.00

NAC

$ 87.50

$180.00

$50.00
$ 65.00

$157.50

$247.50

$659.75

Page §



03/15/2012

03/15/2012

03/16/2012

0371772012

03/18/2012

03/19/2012

03/19/2012

3102-01

REG

Pierce re: summary of hold harmless;
review articles sent by W. Pierce; telephone
conference with G. Sheets re: facilities;
review survey on facilities; review
superintendent survey in prep for choosing
witnesses; telephone conference with F.
Crampton, left message; review background
check on F. Crampton; email to I. Duyar;
telephone conference with F. Crampton.
Conference with T. Hunter re:
Superintendent witness; conference with T.
Hunter re: witness selection; telephone
conference with R. Hooker re: 3/16
conference.

Respond to email from G. Sheets; prepare
for meeting with W. Pierce; meet with W.
Pierce, R. Freeman and J. Haney re:
superintendents and facilities; email to D,
Hinojosa re: facilities,

Review email re: 3/28 conference; review
message from B. Wood; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to sane;
conference with T. Hunter re: S. Mcardoch;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Thompson email; review J. Tumer email;
review D. Thompson emgil; review D.
Hinojosa emails (3); review M.
Trachtenberg email; review M. Bono email;
review M. Trachtenierg email.

Review article 72: new adequacy study;
correspond to attorneys via email re: same.
Review arti¢iz by F. Crampton on facilities;
review vitae of F. Crampton.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
requested data from Dr, Baker and litigation
reguizsts 013 and 014; review and reply to
erinail from counsel re: interdistrict
comparison homeowners and litigation
requests 013 and 014; review email from
Mark Trachtenberg re: electronic service;
format and print litigation requests 009D,
013A, and 014A; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review articles re: Texas
Schools Slash Spending on Technology and
School Districts Statewide Cut 25,000
Positions after Budget Cuts.

Review analysis of new study; conference
with T. Hunter re: open records request for
study; review M. Trachtenberg email;

Invoice # 40154

0.40'his

3.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.25 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.65 hrs

0.95 hrs

$180.00

$1137.50

$562.50

$112.50

$325.00

$288.75

$427.50

Page 6



03/19/2012

03/19/2012

03/20/2012

03/20/2012

03/20/2012

03/21/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

correspond to S. Jennings via email re:
service list; review emails re: experts;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review J.
Tumer email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review J. Turner email; review C. Dupree
email re: superintendent witness; review
emails re: litigation conference.

Review email from M. Trachtenberg re: 0.20 hrs
email service list.
Review facilities survey; review G. Sheet’s 2.20his

dissertation; email to F. Crampton re: he
articles, vitae and experience testifying;
review new data on tax rates without target
revenue; review email from W, Pierce and
respond; review emails from R. Gray and
respond; telephone conference with D,
Thompson re: experts; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: proposed scheduling order;
review Comptroller's 2006 study on
facilities; email to G. Sheets re: facility
survey.

Review and reply to email from Tim Wolff 0.85 hrs
re: data requested by Dr. Baker; fervard
data to Toni H. and Paul Colbeat; review
and respond to email from counsel re: same;
review emails re: numbers 05 students

eaming degrees.

Conference with T. Hunier re: litigation 0.40 hrs
conference; confercace with T. Hunter re: S.

Murdoch integrated testing.

Telephone conference with D. Thompson 0.70 hrs

re: Murdock and our contribution for
experts; conference with R. Gray re: same;
review emails from W. Pierce and R.
Freetruin and respond; review data to be sent
to B, Baker; email to M. Hunter re:
hiigation conference.

Review emails from Wayne Pierce re; 4.10 hrs
improving student dropout rates and Glen
Rose ISD expenditures; telephone
conference with Bill Franz at the Texas
Higher Education Coordinating Board re:
open records request; draft and email same;
review article re: Building a Grad Nation;
telephone conference with Texas Higher
Education Coordinating Board re: seventh
grade completion rate data; email Wayne
Pierce results of request; format and print
same for counsel.

Invoice # 40154

N/C

$715.00

$148.75

$180.00

$227.50

$717.50

Page T



03/21/2012

03/21/2012

03/21/2012

03/22/2012

03/22/2012

03/22/2012

03/23/2012

03/23/2012

3102-01

CMJ

RGIV

RGIV

REG

Conference with T. Hunter re; experts and
faculty issues.

Review various emails from W. Pierce and
R. Freeman and respond; review email from
B. Baker re: facilities study; send study to
G.. Sheets; review email from G. Sheets re:
facilities study.

Research Austin Library availability of
"Journal of Education Finance”

Review and reply to email from Tim Wolff
re: data requested by Dr. Baker; forward
same to counsel and Paui Coibert; format
and print data requested by Dr. Baker for
counsel; review emails re: sending plaintiff's
proposed scheduling order to Judge Dietz
prior to the hearing on the 28th.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review J. Tumer
emails (2); review D. Thompson emaiis (2);
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to all;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review S. Dahlberg email; review J. Turrer
email; reply to same.

Review email from F. Crampton re:
telephone conference with and respond;
review email from Richard Gray IV re: data
and respond; review emaii from W. Pierce
re: TAASB meeting and respond; review
emails from J. Turner ve: proposed pre-trial
schedule and respoed; emails to S. Dahlberg
re: extension foi Response to AFD.
Telephone conference with counsel re:
weekly call‘with Buck Wood; review email
from John Yumer re: proposed letter to
Judge Dietz; review same; telephone
conference with Buck Wood re: weekly
conference; telephone conference with Toni
Hunter re: conversation with Buck Wood;
review and respond to email from counsel
re: meeting with superintendents; review
emails re: proposed conference call and
intervenors proposed changes to scheduling

order; review emails re: conference call with

State re: scheduling order; review proposed
scheduling order and revised letter to Judge
Dietz.

Review J. Tumer email with draft
correspondence to Judge Dietz; conference
with T. Hunter re: status conference; review
J. Tumer email; review P. Fraissinet email;

Invoice # 40154

0.20 hrs

(.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.75 hrs

(.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.00 hrs

$ 90.00

$ 65.00

$42.00

$122.50

$337.50

$ 97.50

$245.00

$450.00

Page 8



03/23/2012

03/23/2012

03/24/2012

03/26/2012

03/26/2012

03/26/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.

Hinojosa emails (2); review C. Diamond

email; review J. Tumer email; review D.

Thompson email; review W. Pierce email,

Draft Plaintiffs' Response to State 0.50 hrs
Defendants' Request for Disclosure; confer

with T. Hunter re: same.

Telephone conference with B. Wood re: 1.20 hrs
conference call; telephone conference with

Richard Gray IV re: problems with

telephone conference; review and respond

to various emails from W. Pierce re:

superintendents meeting and facilities

survey; telephone conference with all

attomeys re: pre-trial order.

Review ematil correspondence; review 1.15 hrs
"Texas K-12 Public Education - No

Financial Accountability” paper.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 1.85 hrs
version 2 of Dr. Baker's requested data;

review email from Chris Diamond re:

intervenors proposed changes to scheduling

order; review and forward email fioim Tim

Wolff re: revised data set requésted by Dr.

Baker; forward same to Dr. Baker; review

emails re: Texas Education Accountability

Project and response to reports findings;

review summary of Texas Education

Accountability Project's report; telephone

conferences with inter-disirict comparison

districts with counsel; review emails re:

plaintiff's mecting prior to scheduling

conference

Review W. Pierce emails (2); reply to same 2.55 hrs
(2); work re: expert selection and expert

revolts; review J. Tumner email; review

scheduling order; review C. Diamond email;

review correspondence with court; review

email re: report (M. Hurley); correspond to

clients re: same; review W. Pierce email;

conference with T. Hunter re; facuity status;

review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review

D. Hinojosa emails (3); review emails re:

Motion to Consolidate; review D.

Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email,;

review M. Trachtenberg email;, work re:

consolidation motion; review D. Thompson

email; review email re: 3/28 conference.

Review email from R. Gray and M. Daniel 0.50 hrs

Invoice # 40154

$50.00

$390.00

$517.50

$323.75

$1147.50

N

Page 9



03/26/2012

03/27/2012

03/27/2012

03/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

2 24

re: preparation for speaking engagement
with Texas School Assessors Association;
email bio information to M. Daniel; confer
with T. Hunter re: further revisions to the
Agreed Motion to Consolidate; revise
Motion; confer with T. Hunter re: same.
Review emails re: facilities study, Hurly
report, superintendents meeting; meet with
Richard Gray IV re: taxpayers in adjoining
districts; attempt to cail such taxpayers;
conference with R. Gray re: Wednesday
meeting; review email from L. Moak re:
TASBY presentation and respond; review
comments on Motion to Consolidate and
edit Motion; email to state re: same.
Review, format, and print all data for
counsel; conference with counsel re: same
and current pieadings; conference with legal
assistant re: all; conference with legal
assistant re: inter-district comparison

homeowner contact information; confecence

with counsel re: live pleadings; conference
with legas assistant re: same; reviev
Houston Endowment 8th Grad# Study.
Review D. Hinojosa email; review amended
petition; conference with R. Gray IV re:
data analysis and conference to review
same; review W. Pierce email; conference
with W. Pierce, R. Breeman and T. Hunter
re: status, witnecses, faculty and litigation
approach; reviesw emails; prepare for 3/28
hearing; review M. Trachtenberg email;
conference with T. Hunter re: 3/28 hearing;
telephone conference with D. Thompson re:
TASE involvement; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; review S. Dahiberg email;
review states correspondence; review states
scheduling order.

Finalize and serve Response to Defendants’
Request for Disclosure; revise Agreed
Motion to Consolidate; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; efile and serve Agreed
Moticn to Consolidate; emaii all counsel
and client re: same; prepare and forward
letter and Agreed Motion to Consolidate to

Judge Dietz; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
email service list; review and revise list for
our group; confer with T. Hunter re: same.

Invoice # 40154

2.60 hrs

4.00 hrs

4.85 hrs

1.15 hrs

$845.00

$700.00

$2182.50

$115.00

Page 10



03/27/2012

03/28/2012

03/28/2012

03/28/2012

03/28/2012

03/29/2012

03/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

MLB

RGIV

Prepare for meeting on facilities; meet with
R. Gray, W Pierce and R. Freeman on
facilities issue; emails to W. Pierce and R.
Freeman following up on meeting; review
emaiils from W. Pierce re: various matiers;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
TASBY funding; prepare for Wednesday
meeting and hearing; conference with R.
Gray re: same; conference with S. Dahlberg
ad D. Hinojosa re: Motion to Consolidate;
edit Motion to Consolidate and file.
Review all proposed scheduling orders;
conference with counsel re: meeting with
plaintiff's attorneys and scheduling
conference; meeting with plaintiff's
attomeys re: scheduling order and
scheduling order hearing; scheduling order
hearing; meeting at MoakCasey re: data.
Conference with Assessors Association;
prepare for pre-trial; attend conference pric:
to pre-trail with Plaintiffs counsel; atterid
pre-trial conference; post hearing
conference with attomeys; review &iiigation
update; conference with attomeys re: data;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
focus group districts.

Prepare for meeting with Piaintiff's
attomeys; review articies by F. Crampton;
telephone conference with F. Crampton re:
possible testimeay on facilities; attend
meeting with Plaintiff's attomeys; attend
pre-trial conterence; conference with L.
Moak, D. Cusey, A. Brownson, D,
Thomgpson, J. Tumer, Richard Gray IV, M.
Trach‘enberg and P. Fraiser re: data on test
surgery; review update to Coalition
members.

Research telephone numbers for five
districts; forward resuits to R. Gray I'V.
Review Texas Education Accountability
Project’s study on Financial Accountability;
review and repiy to email from Dr. Baker
re: data request; email Tim Wolff re: same;
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
same; conference with counsel re: meeting
to outline case.

Review W. Pierce email; review email from
TASB; conference with R. Gray IV re: data
analysis conference; review litigation

Invoice # 40154

3.70 hrs

7.75 hrs

5.90 hrs

6.70 hrs

3.10 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.05 hrs

$1202.50

$1356.25

$2655.00

$2177.50

N/C

$350.00

$472.50

Page 11



update; correspond to T. Hunter via email
re: B. Baker contract and report; review
email re: trial date and builet point
summary; review M. Trachtenberg email;
reply to same; review message from D,
Thompson; telephone conference with D,
Thompson re: status.
03/29/2012 TBH Review emails from J. Fariey and W, Pierce 0.50 hrs $162.50
re: update to coalition members and
respond; draft order on Motion to
Consolidate; email to all attorneys on same;
review data in preparation for Saturday
meeting; email to P. Colbert and W. Pierce
re: data.
03/30/2012 RGIV  Review and reply to email from counsel re; 3.05 hrs $533.75
summary for Judge Dietz; drafi summary
for all plaintiff's cases; emaii same to
counsel for review; review article on
inadequate funding in Texas.
03/30/2012 REG Review D. Hincjosa emails (2); review 1.10 hrs $495.00
amended petition of Ft. Bend plaintiffs:
review emails; conference with T. Hunter
re: expert conference; review emalls re:
consolidated order; telephone Conference
with C. Diamond re: intervention.

03/30/2012 SEJ Email counsel filed Agresd Motion to 0.20 hrs N/C
Consolidate,
03/30/2012 TBH Telephone conference with Plaintiff's 0.80 hrs $260.00

attorneys re: trial dau> and other issues
raised at schedrling conference; conference
with R. Gray re: meeting on trial strategy
and experts; email to W. Pierce and P,
Coibert re: qate; review email from R.
Freeman and J. Freeman re: meetings with

Superatend.
03/31/2012 RGIV  Mesaiing with counsel re: review all data. 3.00 hrs $525.00
03/31/2012 REG Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to 2.75 hrs $1237.50
same; work re: data analysis and exhibits.
03/31/2012 TBH Meet with R. Gray and Richard Gray IV re: 3.00 hrs $975.00

data; edit order on Motion to Consolidate
and email to B. Baker re: telephone

conference.
$42.983.00
TIMEKEEPER RECAP
REG  III Richard E. Gray Partner 39.05 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $17,572.50
MLB  Boien, Mamee Paralegal 1.20 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 12000
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 49.95 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $ 8,741.25
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 5013 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $16,29225

3102-01 Invoice # 40154 Page 12



CMJ  Jacobs, Craig 030 hrs @ 140.00 /hr $ 4200

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 215 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 215.00
LVS von Stemberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 0.00
Fee Recap Totals 142.78 $42,983.00

3102-01 Invoice # 40154 Page 13



GRAY & BECKER. P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

April 30, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFVESSIONAL SERVICES

04/01/2012 REG Review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa emaii;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review M.
Trachtenberg additional email; review ©
Fraissinet email.

04/02/2012 RGIV ~ Review pleadings of Efficiency tntervenors;
update summary of plaintiff's cases for
Judge Dietz; email counsel r¢; same;
telephone conference witi: Tim Wolff re:
data; review emails re: service list; review
Defendant’s Responscs to Plaintiff's Request
for Disclosure.

04/02/2012 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; correspond to T.
Hunter via einal re: conference call; review

emails; review D. Thompson email; review
M. Trachienberg emails (3); reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter re: trial date;
review C. Diamond email; review D.
Hinojosa email; conference with T. Hunter
re: intervention; review email re: conference
with T. Hunter re: same; review M.
Trachtenberg email re: trial date; review C.
Diamond email; review S. Dahlberg email;
review R. Freeman email; conference with
T. Hunter re: faculty study; review
disclosure responses by State; conference
with T. Hunter re: same; conference with T.
Hunter re: our disclosure responses; review
C. Diamond email.

04/02/2012 TBH Prepare for telephone conference with B.

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 40583-1
Our file#: 3102
Billing thiough:

0.60 hrs

1.35 hrs

1.85 hrs

2.80 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
04/30/2012

$270.00

$236.25

$832.50

$ 910.00



04/02/2012

04/03/2012

04/03/2012

04/03/2012

04/03/2012

04/04/2012

3102-01

LVS

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

Baker; telephone conference with B. Baker
re: money matters; review emails from J.
Freeman re: superintendents meeting; re:
emails from G. Sheets re: facilities study;
review emails from R. Freeman re: same;
revise summary for judge; review emails of
various counsel re: final data; scheduling
order and telephone conference to discuss
same; go to court house to get judge to sign
order on Motion to Consolidate,

Review email from T. Hunter; review
schedules; email to M. Trachtenberg re:
availability.

Review edits to Summary of Plaintiff's
cases for Judge Dietz; email counsel re:
same; telephone conference with Tim Wolff
re: data; review email re: summary for
Judge Dietz and Order Granting Agreed
Motion to Consolidate.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review J. Tarmer
email; review M. Trachtenberg emaii;
conference with T. Hunter re: cenfoience
issues; review email re: trial date; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D), Hinojosa
email; review M. Trachtenberg email,;
review message from B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: status
conference; review { Tumer email.

Email C. Nickell ve: list of Superintendents
in the Coalitics; confer with T. Hunter re:
same; review email from C. Nickell.
Prepare {or Telephone conference with
Plainii{7's attomeys and State; telephone
conference with Plaintiff's attomeys and
State re: trial date and scheduling order;
review voice mail from Stacy, Judge Dietz's
clerk, review signed Order; circulate Order
and Summary of case; meet with L. Moak;
email to W.Pierce and R. Freeman re:
various matters; review response; review
emails from G. Sheets; email Baker articles
to D. Thompson.

Telephone conference with counsel re:
reschedule meeting; review counsel’s
calendar re: same; review emails re: case
summary for Judge Dietz; conference with

Invoice # 40583

¢.40 hrs

2.05 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.15 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.75 hrs

M

$358.75

$495.00

NIC

$ 877.50

$131.25

Page 7



04/04/2012

04/04/2012

04/04/2012

04/05/2012

04/05/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

counsel re: data meeting with Wayne Pierce;
review email re: Calhoun plaintiff's
discovery.

Correspond to B. Wood via email,
correspond to T. Hunter via email re: B.
Wood conference; telephone conference
with B. Wood re: status; review 19 emails;
reply to same; conference with T. Hunter re:
conference call re; experts; conference with
T. Hunter re: conference call with experts
and conference with W. Pierce; review
Cachou County discovery; review C.
Diamond email.

Confer with T. Hunter re: list of
superintendents; email C. Nickell re: same;
review and retum email from C. Nickell re:
same.

Review emails from W. Pierce and respond,
review money matters articles by Baker &
Leslie; telephone conference with D.
Thompson; M. Tractenberg; J. Tumer and
D. Fraissinet on experts; call Judge Dietz’s
clerk re: next step on consolidstion, left
message; review email from D. Hinojosa re:
summary; conference with Fichard Gray IV
re: same; conference P Colbert re: target
revenue; telephone couierence with 1L Duyor
re: facilities; review revisions to proposed
scheduling order, review C. Diamond’s
email re: Orde: to Consolidate; respond to
same; teleghone conference with W. Pierce
re: D. King, B. Leslie, data and other
matteyc.

Review Calhoun Plaintiff's first RFP;
conference with legal assistant re: printing
and filing of discovery in hard form and
digitally; review article sent by Wayne
Pierce re: public education by
accountability; review emails re; pre-trial
agreements; review same; review and reply
to email from counsel re; summary for
Judge Dietz; revise and update summary;
review and respond to email from David
Thompson re: same.

Review message from B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re; 4/5

Invoice # 40583

1.80 hrs

0.25 brs

5.20 hrs

225 hrs

325 hrs

$810.00

W

$1,690.00

$393.75

$1462.50

Fage 3



04/05/2012

04/06/2012
04/06/2012

04/06/2012

04/07/2012
04/05/2012

04/09/2012

04/09/2012

04/059/2012

04/10/2012

3102-01

RGIV
REG

SEJ

REG
RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

conference; review R. Freeman email;
review chart re: TEA rankings; conference
with B. Wood and T. Hunter re: trial
preparation, status and strategy; review J.
Tumer email; review J. Tumer emails (2)
with attachments; review D. Hinojosa email;
work on trial outline,

Strategy meeting with B. Wood; review and 2.30 hrs
respond to emails from D. Hinosja;
telephone conference with C. Diamond re:
Order on Motion to Consolidate; review
edits to summary for judge; review Calhom

City discovery.

Email counsel re: summary for Judge Dietz. 0.10 hrs
Work re: witness re: Chamber of Commerce 0.60 hrs
type stuff; review D. Hinojosa email.

Review message from R. Gray re: contact 0.25 hrs

information for the Austin Chamber of
Commerce, Lew Little, Gary Farmer;
research and email R. Gray informatior..

Work on trial outline. 2.50 hrs
Review and reply to email from Chns 0.20 hrs

Diamond re: intervenors oppositidh to

severance in the motion to consolidate;

conference with counsel re; same.

Review D. Hinojosa email and discovery; 2.75 hrs
work on trial outline; prepare

correspondence to (_iamber persons re:

possible testimony; correspond to B.

Hammond re: education system; work re:

expert seleciion; review material re: drop

out rate; review discovery from Haynes &

Boone, review W. Pierce email; reply to

same; review test score data analysis.

Revise Exhibit A to disclosures; confer with 1.20 hrs
T. Hunter re: same; review emails from C.

Nickell re: additional district information;

review email from T. Hunter re: adding the

Equity Center group; email T. Hunter re:

listing attomeys; review email from Dr.

Baker and T. Hunter re: expert fee; prepare

letter to Dr. Baker forwarding same.

Draft outline for trial; conference with D. 1.80 hrs
Hinojosa.
Conference of Attomeys re: case outline; 345 hrs

review and reply to email from Holly

Invoice # 40583

$ 747.50

$17.50
$270.00

N/C

$1125.00
$35.00

$1237.50

$120.00

$ 585.00

$603.75

i*ape 4



04/10/2012

04/10/2012

04/11/2012

04/11/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

McIntush re: case summary for Judge Dietz;
revise summary for judge Dietz; email to
counsel for review; review Calhoun
Plaintiff's Discovery Requests; summarize
same; review email re:; Fort Bend first
request for production.

Review J. Tumer email re: scheduling 375 by
order; conference with attomeys re: status,
strategy and outline of presentation; review
D. Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson
report for productivity; review L. Moak
outline of area to cover; review C. Diamond
email; review summary of various claims to
be presented to Judge; review message from
D. Hinojosa; conference with T. Hunter re:
same.

Meet with B. Wood, R. Gray and Richard 3.50 hrs
Gray IV to structure case; review summary
for Judge; telephone conference with R.
O'Keefe re: proposed Scheduling Order,
review email from D. Hinojosa re: same;
review email from J. Turner re: samie.
Revise and re-format Summary. for Judge 4.65 hrs
Dietz; review emails; finalize re-formatting
of Summary Chart for Judge Dietz;
conference with counse; re: same; review
emails re: Defendant’s changes to proposed
scheduling order 2nd intervenor’s objections
to motion to consolidate; format, organize,
and summarize all data requests of Dr.
Baker.

Review C) Diamond email; review 2.25 hrs
correspondence to Court; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; review intervenors
proposed scheduling order; review States
proposed scheduling order; review C.
Diamond correspondence; review J. Tumer
emails (2); review red-line comparison of
scheduling order; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review T.
Hunter email; review emails re: 4/16
hearing; review emails re: scheduling order
and focus of distribution; review article;
review draft correspondence to Court;
review D. Thompson email; review D,
Hinojosa email; review G. Farmer email re:

Invoice # 40583

$1687.50

$1,137.50

$813.75

$1012.50

Page 5



04/11/2012

04/11/2012

04/12/2012

04/12/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

Chamber of Commerce; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; review J. Tumer
email; prepare for conference with W.
Pierce and R. Freeman; review D. Hinojosa
email.

Review email from C. Nickell re: Crystal 1.75 hrs
City ISD and Excelsior ISD; continue
preparing list of persons with knowledge;
review and retum emails from T. Hunter re:
service of Motion to Consolidate; efile and
serve letter to Judge Dietz; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; email clients re: same;
email attomeys not registered for e-service.
Review letter filed by C. Diamond re: Order 2.70 hrs
on Motion to Consolidate; review emails re:
same; draft letter to Judge Dietz in response;
email to J. Arnold re: testimony; review
studied sent by W. Pierce on early
childhood education; charter schools and
drop out rates; email to F. Crampton re:
testimony; review summary for Judsge:
review State’s proposed changes t¢ proposed
scheduling order; review severzl emails
from D. Hinojsa and C. Diamond re: Order
on Motion to Consolidat¢: ard proposed
scheduling order; review MALDEFs letter
to judge; telephone converence with B.
Leslie re: edits tp Money Matters article;
draft cover letter io Judge for Scheduling
Order.

Format and print all data requests made by 5.50 hrs
Dr. Baker; summarize all requests; prepare
for mesiing with counsel, Wayne Pierce,
and Ray Freeman; data meeting; conference
with counsel re: summary chart for Judge
Dietz; revise Summary Chart for Judge
Dietz; email same to Plaintiff's counsel for
approval; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: data.

Review W. Pierce emails; review emails re: 3.95 hrs
scheduling order and conference call
;review J. Tumer email; review C. Diamond
email; conference with R. Gray IV, R.
Freeman, T. Hunter and W. Pierce re;
exhibits, status, trial outline, scheduling and
testimony; review J. Tumer emails (2);

Invoice # 40583

$175.00

$ 87750

$962.50

$1777.50

Page 6



04/12/2012

04/13/2012

04/13/2012

04/13/2012

04/13/2012

04/14/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

review D. Hinojosa email; review C.
Diamond email.

Meet with W, Pierce, R. Freeman, R. Gray,
Richard Gray IV re: data; telephone
conference with B. Baker re: same; review
summary for Judge and edit; instruct
Richard Gray IV on procedure for getting
Scheduling Order to Judge.

Review and reply to emails re;: Summary for
Judge Dietz; revise Summary for Judge
Dietz; conference call with plaintiff's
counsel and State re: proposed scheduling
order; conference with counsel re; Summary
for Judge Dietz; email counsel re: same;
format and print litigation request 002E;
review emails re: Rule 11 Agreement,
Agreed upon scheduling order.

Work re: scheduling order; review emails;
review D.Hinojosa email; review C.
Diamond email; review D. Hinojosa eriaii;
review J. Tumer emails (2); work onissues
chart; review C. Diamond email; review P.
Fraissinet email; review D. Hiiiojosa email;
review S. Dahlberg emails (2); review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); revicw ). Tumer email;
review P. Fraissinet email; review emails re:
scheduling order; finalize work on
scheduling order; review draft
correspondence t¢ Judge Dietz.

Review emaiis re: 9/29/12 coalition
meeting; ca'endar and email attomeys re:
same; ccnier with R. Gray re: pretrial
heariog; telephone call to Judge Dietz's
clerk re: same (left message); confer with R.
Gray re: same; email S. Rosen re: same;
revise Scheduling Order; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review email from S.
Rosen re: 4/16/12 hearing setting; email
attomeys re: same.

Telephone conference with all Plaintiff
attomeys, interviewers and State attomeys
re: proposed scheduling order and clarifying
order on consolidation; travel to court house
to deliver same to judge.

Review C. Diamond email; review T.
Hunter email; reply to emails.

Invoice # 40583

3.70 hrs

4.15 his

1.70 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.35 hrs

$1,202.50

$726.25

$765.00

$ 487.50

$157.50

Page T



04/15/2012

04/16/2012

04/16/2012
04/16/2012

04/16/2012

04/16/2012

04/17/2012

04/17/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV
REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

Review emails re: scheduling order; review
emails re: 4/16 hearing,
Review emails re: proposed and agreed
upon scheduling order, heating on same;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review and summarize Fort Bend plaintiff's
first request for production.
Calendar Scheduling Order.
Review 8. Rosen email re: 4/16 hearing
cancelled; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review email re: consolidation order;
conference with T. H re: discovery;
conference with

involvement in case; review C.
Diamond email; correspond to T. Hunter via
email re: Dr. Foelks, a potential witness;
review signed scheduling order.
Review email from T. Hunter re: cancelled
pretrial hearing; email S. Rosen re: same;
telephone call to S. Rosen (left message) 1e:
same; email counsel re: cancelled heanng;
review emails re; service list; revicw service
list; email M. Trachtenberg re:‘sajne; confer
with T. Hunter re: signed Scheduling Order;
telephone call to Judge Dietr's clerk,
Elizabeth, re: same (left message); email S.
Rosen re: same; telenhone conference with
District Clerk re: save; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; veview email from S.
Rosen re: sigiiad Scheduling Order; email
signed Ordet o all counsel and clients;
calendar all deadlines.
Instniztlaw clerk on obtaining court’s order;
email to C. Diamond re: clarifying order;
review email to S. Dalhburg and respond;
:elephone conference with W. Pierce re:
scheduling order; telephone conference with
P. Theobald at Texas Tribune re: same;
email to W. Pierce and state attomeys re:
scheduling order; send order to B. Baker
and P. Colbert.
Review files; conference with counsel re:
live pleading; print same for counsel; print
and complete caselaw notebook for Wayne
Fierce.
Work re: data analysis and expert

Invoice # 40583

0.25 hrs

1.80 hrs

0.10 hrs
2.15 hts

1.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.95 hrs

1.25 hrs

$112.50

$315.00

$17.50
$967.50

N/C

$ 9750

$166.25

$562.50

Page 8



04/17/2012

04/18/2012

04/18/2012

04/19/2012

04/19/2012

04/19/2012

04/20/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

SE¥

RGIV

identification; review L. Lacy email re: Rule
11 Agreement; review T. Hunter email;
review L. Mock email.

Review email from L. Moak; review email 0.10 hrs
from L. Lawrence and respond.
Conference with runner re: Caselaw book 0.65 hrs

for Wayne Pierce; have same delivered;

review emails re: depositions and clarifying

order; review and reply to email from

Wayne Pierce re: schedule meeting, and

named defendants.

Review C. Diamond emails (2); review draft 1.00 hrs
Clarifying Order; review D. Hinojosa email;

review W. Pierce email; conference with R.

Gray IV re: conference with W. Pierce re:

data; review C. Diamond email; reply to

same.

Review current data and summary; review 395 hrs
emails re: depositions; prepare for meeting

with Wayne Pierce; conference with counsel

re: same and questions wanted asked,

meeting at Equity Center with Wayre Pierce

and Ray Freeman.

Review W. Pierce email; review r. Freeman 1.65 hrs
email; review T. Hunter emgils; review

emails re: Clarifying Ovder; review article

re; Tatum bond election; review D.

Hinojosa email; revizw S. Dahlberg email,;

review C. Diamond email; reply to same;

review Tatum 1§D web page; review R.

Freeman email; reply to same; review J.

Tumer email; review D. Hinojosa email;

review 'Z. Diamond email; review D.

Hincjosa email; review H. McIntosh email;

conference with R. Gray IV re: conference

with W. Pierce; review J. Tumer email;

conference with R. Gray IV re: status of

exhibits and data analysis.

Review emails re: scheduling depositions; 0.25 hrs
review email from T. Hunter re: same; email

R. Gray re: same.

Review emails from all parties re: 2.35 hrs
deposition dates and availability and

clarifying order; telephone conference with

Tim Wolff re: data; email all

current pleadings; review and respond to

Invoice # 40583

$ 3250

$113.75

$450.00

$691.25

$742.50

Page 9



04/20/2012

04/20/2012

04/21/2012

04/22/2012
04/22/2012

04/23/2012

04/23/2012

04/23/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

RGIV
REG

RGIV

SEJ

email from Dr. Baker re: data requests;
format and print updated data.

Review message from B. Wood; telephone
conference with B. Wood re: status; review
C. Diamond emails; reply to same; review
D. Thompson email;r review J. Tumer
email; review C. Diamond email; review D,
Hinojosa emails (2); correspond to attomeys
via email re: deposition; review C. Diamond
email; review email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review Rule 11 Agreement
as executed.

Review emails from Plaintiffs attomeys and
response.

Review and reformat various litigation
requests; print same in preparation for
meeting tomorrow.,

Meeting with counsel re: data review.
Review revised exhibits; conference with .
Gray IV re: same.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data and expert requests; review.aco file
emails re: use of bond funds t¢ pey M&O
expenses, review emails re: depositions;
format and print litigation requests 012D
and 011B.

Review D. Hinojosa email; correspond to
counsel via email re” deposition dates;
conference with T. Hunter re: M. Hurley
deposition and deposition dates; review text
message from: B. Wood re: deposition dates;
review F. Freeman email; review Eanes
bond zrogram information; telephone call to
C.Heidrick - left message; review T. Hunter
email re: expert witnesses; review S,
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; conference with T. Hunter re: Rule 11
Agreement; review D. Thompson email;
review C, Diamond email; review D.
Hinojosa email; telephone conference with
C. Heidrick re: chamber studies and D.
Scherbele; review discovery; correspond to
D. Scherbele via email re: potential witness.
Prepare Plaintiffs’ Request for Disclosure to
Intervenors; draft Rule 11 agreement re:

Invoice # 40583

1.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

3.00 hrs

0.75 hrs
0.75 hrs

1.35 hrs

1.95 hrs

1.00 hrs

$630.00

$ 6500

$525.00

$131.25
$337.50

$236.25

$877.50

$100.00

Page 10



04/23/2012

04/24/2012

04/24/2012

04/24/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

RE"

SEJ

depositions; confer with T. Hunter re: same;
serve Request for Disclosure to Intervenors.
Telephone conference with P. Colbert; 2.30 hrs
email to B. Baker re: deposition schedule;
review comments from various parties on
proposed Rule 11 Agreement on
dispositions; conference with R, Gray on
various matters; email to W.Pierce, R.
Freeman and B. Baker re: M. Hurley
deposition; review and edit summary for
judge; review list of superintendants for
meeting; email to L. Moak and B. Baker re;
areas of testimony that L. Darling-
Hammond was going to cover; check with
R. Freeman on facilities survey; review
email from G. Sheets and respond; update
R. Gray on contact with J. Amold and
review his email to D. Scheberle; review
material on NEFC conference; review
Eamnes I.S.D. bond information.

Prepare for meeting with counsel re: 3.10 hrs
summary for Judge Dietz, data, iniér-district
comparison homeowners; review and reply
to email from Tim Wolff re: data issues;
review emails re: Rule 11 Azreement
regarding depositions, éxpert reports, etc;
conference with counsel re: litigation
request 008 and 00%; print same for counsel;
meeting with counisel re: changes to
summary for judge Dietz; review and reply
to email f:om Wayne Pierce re: Edgewood
caselaw, Leycite same; telephone
conférence with Bruce Baker re: data
clerification; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: same; print and review Edgewood
Plaintiff's RFP and RFD.

Review message from D. Scherbele; review 0.90 hrs
and sign Rule 11 Agreement; conference
with T. Hunter re: new developments;
review D. Thompson email; telephone call
to D. Scherbele - left message; review
Edgewood Plaintiff discover; conference
with T. Hunter re: target reverse; review
intervenors request for disclosure.

Review email from T. Hunter re: Rule 11 1.75 hrs
agreement re: depositions; revise Rule 11

Invoice # 40583

$ 747.50

$542.50

$405.00

$175.00

Page 11



04/24/2012

04/25/2012

04/25/2012

04/25/2012

3102-01

RGIV

TBH

agreement; prepare working notebook of
discovery and pleadings; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review emails from
counsel re: permission to sign Rule 11
agreement; calendar discovery deadlines.
Meet with P. Colbert; review summary for
Judge; meet with Richard Gray IV re:
summary; finalize Rule 11 Agreement on
depositions; conference with R, Gray re: TR
and meeting with P. Colbert; review
Education Code re: TR; email to W. Pierce,
R. Freeman, B. Baler and R. Gray re:
Edgewood discovery.

Format and print litigation request 007C;
review email from Wayne Pierce and
counsel re: Edgewood Ila; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data and
expert requests; finalize and email final
summary for Judge Dietz for approval;
email Holly Macintush re: same; email
Wayne Pierce re: Edgewood Ila; review
opinion on motion for rehearing; 1cview
emails re: depositions, days necded for each
parties case at trial, EdgewoscdIla, data;
format and print litigation requests 0031,
012E.

Review W. Pierce emaiis (2); review
summary of claims for court; review study
on underfunding costs; review emailr :
scheduling; review emails re: Rule 11;
review S, Dailberg email re; trial time;
reveiw MU Trachtenberg email ; telehpone
call to'U. Scherbele - left message; reveiw
D.(Thompson email; review D. Hinojos
email; review S. Dahlberg email; conference
with T. Hunter re: experts.

Find Edgewood II a and review; email to W,
Pierce explaining Edgewood II a; telephone
conference with H. Keller; review article on
cost of NCLB; prepare for telephone
conference with D. Hinojosa re: various
matters; telephone conference with
Plaintiff's attorneys re: experts; email to D.
Hinojosa and S. Dahlberg re: scheduling of
depositions; review B. Balar's article on
inequity in funding in New York and

Invoice # 40583

3.50 hrs

2.95 hrs

1.45 hrs

3.80 hrs

$1,137.50

$516.25

$652.50

$1,235.00

Page 12



04/26/2012

04/26/2012

04/21/2012

04/27/2012

04/27/2012

04/28/2012

04/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

Illineis.

Review message from D. Scherbele;
telephone calls (2) to D. Scherbele - left
messages (2); review S. Dahlberg email;
review emails re: experts; conference with
T. Hunter re: experts; conference with T.
Hunter re: 4/27 conference call; review
emails re: experts,

Review Blincoe facilities study; email to G.
Sheets re: follow up; email to R. Freeman
re: I & S data; review email from H. Keller
and respond; telephone conference with D.
Ashley from Texas Manufacturing
Association; telephone conference with S.
Dahlberg re: Rule 11 Agreement on
discovery; email and telephone conference
to C. Diamond re: same; email to M. French
re: meeting; review emails from W. Pierce;
email to P. Colbert re: MALDEF.

Review emails re: status conference
availability with Judge Dietz; review and
reply to email re: Summary for Judg: Dietz;
revise Summary for Judge Dieiz; zmail
Calhoun plaintiffs re: same; 2mail final
version of Summary for Judze Dietz to all
plaintiff parties for appieval.

Review emails re: scheduling; review S,
Rosen email; corrzspond to T. Hunter via
email re: same; review P. Fraissinet email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review H.
Mclntosh email; review P. Fraissinet email;
review I\ _Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D, Hinojosa emails (3); review R.
Fréeman email; review emails re: Rule 11
Agreement; review Agreed Order of
Clarification; review P, Fraissinet email re:
5/18 conference; review additional emails
re: 5/18 conference; reply to same.
Telephone conference with B. Wood re:
update; telephone conference with Plaintiff’s
attorneys re: Rule 11 Agreement and other
matters; review emails from R. Gray, W.
Pierce, R. Freeman and respond.

Review email re: status conference; review
additional data and analysis of same.
Review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;

Invoice # 40583

0.85 hrs

2.30 hi

0.60 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.15 hrs

$382.50

$ 747.50

$105.00

$630.00

$ 325.00

$225.00

$ 67.50
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conference with T. Hunter re: same.
04/30/2012 RGIV  Review and reply to email from Holl 0.35 hrs $61.25
Mclntush re: Summary for Judge Dietz;
update and revise same; review articel re:
Tax Shelter.
04/30/2012 REG Conference with T. Hunter re: Dr. John 0.90 hrs $405.00
Foelks; review message from D. Scherbele;
work re: data analysis; review email from B.
Wood; review S. Rosen email re: 3/18 status
conference; forward same to W. Pierce via
email; review W, Pierce email; reply to
same.
04/30/2012 SEJ Review email from D. Ray re: B. Wood 1.25 hrs NiC
contact information; revise service list;
review email from T. Hunter re: meeting
with M. French May 15th. Calendar
meeting; email T. Hunter re: possible
scheduling conflict; review email from S.
Rosen re: status conference and calendar
same; efile and serve Rule 11 agreement 1¢:
depositions; email B. Wood, D. Ray; R.
Freeman, and W. Pierce re: same.
04/30/2012 TBH Make arrangements for NEFC; telephone 4.00 hrs $1,300.00
conference with J. Flokes re: meeting; email
to H. Keller re: meeting; review Rule |1
Agreement and file; prepare for meetings
with superintendents.

T $4223375
TIMEKEEPER RECAP
REG 111, Richard E. Gray Partner 43.00 hrs @ 450,00 /hr $19,350.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 46.35 hrs @ 175.00 /hr $ 8,111.25
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 4370 hrs @ 325.00 /hr $14,202.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 5.70 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 57000
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 0.00
Fee Recap Totals 138.75 $42,233.75

3102-01 Invoice # 40583 Page 14



GRAY & BECKER. P.C.

900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
May 31, 2012
Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 40881-1
Our file#: 3102
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billing through:

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
05/01/2012 RGIV  Review emails between counsel and Drew 0.10 hrs
Scheberle re: Austin Chamber of Commerce
and any studies showing the lack of
preparedness of students for college or for
the workforce.
05/01/2012 REG Review email from Equity Center; “~ork re: 1.35 hrs
witness preparation; conference with T.
Hunter re: school board presentation; review
press release re: school finance discussions;
review D. Scherbele emails (3); reply to
same (3); review Ft. Bend discovery
requests; conference with T. Hunter re;
discovery; review email re; conference with
Dr. Folks.
05/01/2012 TBH Review and iespond to emails from W. 2.00 hrs
Pierce r¢: presentations and testimony;
prepa= for presentation to NEFC; review
emalis from other Plaintiff attorneys re:
variety of topics; review supplemental
discovery request of Ft. Bend.
05/02/2012 RGIV - Attend press release at Capitol re: Texas 1.30 hrs
Association of Business joining the
Intervenor’s lawsuit; review and reply to
email from David Hinojosa re: Summary for
Judge Dietz.
05/02/2012 REG Review amended petition of efficiency 1.25 hrs
intervenors; review R. Freeman email;
review C. Woods email; review W. Pierce
email; review TAB press release; review
email from W. Pierce; review message from

310201 Invoice # 40881

74-2427406
REG

00001
05/31/2012

$ 17.50

$ 607.50

$650.00

$227.50

$ 562.50

Fage |



05/02/2012

05/02/2012

05/03/2012

05/03/2012

05/03/2012

05/04/2012
05/04/2012

05/05/2012

05/06/2012
0510772012

05/07/2012

05/08/2012

05/08/2012

3102-01

SEJ

R. Freeman; telephone conference with B.
Zahn re: lawsuit status.

Review email from T. Hunter re:
Intervenor's Amended Plea in Intervention;
update TBH working notebook re: same.
Drive to San Antonio for NEFC
presentation.

Review email from plaintiffs re; approval
for Summary for Judge Dietz; review email
from counsel to Chris Diamond re: TBA.
Work on discovery; correspond to C.
Diamond via email re: witness; review A.
Kauffman email; reply to same; review A.
Kauffman email (2); review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; review subpoena for
M. Hurley records; review C. Diamond
email; reply to same; review T. Hunter
emails; reply to same.

Presentation at NEFC regarding litigation;
return to Austin from San Antonio.

Review T. Hunter email re: experts.
Review emails from R. Gray, D. Hincjosa
and R. Freeman and respond; mect with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman re: evidence for trial
and meeting with superintcndent.

Review D. Hinojosa email; review
MAILDEEF special exceptions.

Work re: exhibits.

Review email crerespondence; review
notice of setting re: special exceptions;
review R. Freomian email; review article
sent by P. Freeman re: charter school.
Review email from Charles Akida and send
to B. Saker with email; prepare for meetings
willi superintendent,

Deview States response to production
request; review T. Hunter email; reply to
same; telephone conference with D.
Scherbele re: chamber report cards and
conference; review H. Keller email;
conference with T. Hunter and S. Jennings
re: discovery; conference with T. Hunter re;
superintendent interviews.

Review emails re: discovery responses;
review emails from R. Gray and T. Hunter
re: same; conference with R. Gray and T.
Hunter re: documents produced.

Invoice # 40881

0.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.15 hrs

2.90 hrs

0.10 hrs
2.70 hrs

0.25 hrs

0.50 hrs
0.95 hrs

2.70 hrs

1.15 hrs

0.50 hrs

NAC

N/C

$ 26.25

$ 787.50

N/C

$ 4500
$877.50

$ 11250

$ 22500
$ 42750

$877.50

$ 517.50

$ 50.00

Page 2



05/08/2012

05/09/2012

05/09/2012

05/09/2012

05/10/2012

05/10/2012

05/11/2012

3102-01

TBH

SEJ

TBH

REG

Meetings with Superintendents; conference 5.50 hrs
with W. Pierce and R. Freeman re: same;

emails to various experts to set up telephone

conference; telephone conference and email

to H. Keller re: meeting; email to B. Baker

to set up telephone conference; email to W,

Pierce to set up trial preparation meeting;

conference with R. Gray re: all these issues.

Review C. Diamond email; review 2nd 0.60 I
amended plea in intervention; review H.

Keller email; review M. Trachtenberg

email.

Review email from S. Dahlberg re: 1.25 hrs
documents responsive to Calhoun County

ISD’s RFP; review documents and confer

with attorneys re: same.

Meet with Superintendents; conference with 6.00 hrs
W Pierce and R. Freeman; review emails

from M. Tractenberg re: interviewers and

telephone conference and respond; review

emails from D. Hinojosa re: same;

telephone conference with H. Kellzr-re:

college success; telephone conférvnce with

S. Navarro re: comp ed.

Conference with T. Hunter re; expert 2.95 hrs
witness and superintendent witness;

conference with D. Sclierbele re: potential

expert witness; review Austin Chamber

material; reviev/ amended intervention:

conference with T. Hunter re:

superintenduenis conference and conference

with Dr. Keller; review email re: 5/31

confercnce with H. Keller.

Mect with superintendents for trial 5.30 hrs
pieparation; conference with R. Gray re:

witnesses on college and career readiness;

set up meeting with H.Keller; review email

from T. Robertson re: May 15 meeting and

respond.

Work re; witness selection; review R. 1.75 hrs
Freeman email; review attachment re: bond

fund use; review W. Pierce email; reply to

same; review R. Freeman email; review W,

Pierce email; conference with T. Hunter re:

status and 5/11 conference call; review

Callahan County disclosure requests.

Invotce # 40881

$1787.50

$ 270.00

$125.00

$1950.00

$1,327.50

$1722.50

$ 787.50
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05/11/2012

05/12/2012

05/13/2012

05/14/2012

05/14/2012

05/14/2012

05/15/2012

3102-01

TBH

REG

TBH

SEJ

Telephone conference with B. Baker re:
charters and weight; telephone conference
with all Plaintiff attorneys re: intervenor’s
positions; plea to jurisdiction; experts and
managers documents; conference with R,
Gray; review email on class size from M.
Tractenberg and J. Finn; draft memorandum
re: superintends recommendations.

Review P. Fraissinet email; reply to same;
review J. Turner email.

Review Wayne's description of system and
edit; look up Bincoe; email to W. Pierce re:
same; begin reviewing Haney testimony;
review Baker article on Charters and Baker
blog on same.

Review D. Scherbele email: forward to R.
Gray IV with request for analysis; reply to
D. Scherbele; work re: exhibits and witness
selection; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review notes re: Los Fresna ISD and
possible testing; conference with T. Huater
re: same; conference with T. Hunter re:
LBB/TEA conference; review &. Dahlberg
correspondence; review States report and
production requests,

Review and organize State Defendants’
documents responsive io Fort Bend County
ISD’s RFP; confer with attorneys re: same.
Edit summary o superintendents; prepare
for meeting with superintendents,
Telephone conference with R. Bincoe re:
meeting;euiail to G. Sheets re: Telephone
confercnce with Bincoe; review emails from
W_ Pierce and respond; request data from
V. Pierce; review dropouts; conference with
legal assistant about organizing documents
received from State; conference with R.
Gray re: various matters,

Review (partial) of document production;
conference with T. Hunter re: discovery;
review email re: document production;
review D. Anderson presentation to LBB;
review email re: conference with H. Keller;
review S. Hernandez email re: document
production; review email from H. Keller’s
office; reply to same; review and analysis of

Invoice # 40881

6.00 hrs

0.25 tws

0.00 hrs

1.55 hrs

1.20 hrs

4.70 hrs

4.50 hrs

$1950.00

$ 11250

$ 000

$ 697.50

$120.00

$1527.50

$2,025.00

Page 4



05/1512012

05/15/2012

05/16/2012

05/16/2012

05/16/2012

05/16/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

document production; conference with T.
Hunter, R. Freeman and W. Pjerce re:
status, exhibits and testing.

Review documents produced by State
Defendants; confer with attorneys re: same;
telephone conference with AG's office re:
documents produced; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; continue reviewing documents
produced by State Defendants to Calhoun
County ISD.

Telephone conference with Jermey Finn re:
class size; finish memorandum on
superintendent witnesses; email to D.
Hinojosa re: ELS and comp. education;
review response from D. Hinojosa; review
articles on class size matters; review emails
from W. Pierce and respond; meet with J.
Folkas.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:
data; conference with counsel re: same;
Telephone conference with Wayne Picice
re; data and contact information foi 7om
Camby at TASBO; conference with counsel
re: data and meeting; review and reply to
email from counsel re: superintendent
recommendations; update same; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: same.
Conference with R{ Cray IV re: exhibits;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; prepare
for conference with J. Folks; review S.
Dabhlberg ein2il; review additional
production; conference with R. Gray IV re;
exhibuis; telephone call to G. Santiago - left
message; telephone conference with G.
Santiago re: M. Hurley deposition; review
W. Pierce email, review revised exhibits;
conference with T. Hunter and J. Folks re:
possible witness testimony; review memos
re: superintendent witnesses; conference
with T. Hunter re: same.

Continue reviewing and organizing
documents produced by State Defendants;
confer with attorneys re: same.

Telephone conference with B. Wood re:
superintendents and Harney as expert;
review emails from W. Pierce and respond;

Invoice # 40881

2.00 hrs

4.20 hrs

2.25 hrs

3.25 hrs

2.25 hrs

0.80 hrs

$200.00

$1365.00

$393.75

$1,462.50

$225.00

$260.00

Page §



0517172012

05/17/2012

05/17/2012

05/18/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

email to T. Robertson re: scheduling follow
up meetings with superintend; email to D.
Hingcjosa re: meeting.

Review and print data re:; meeting with
counsel; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: litigation requests; email Wayne
Pierce re: funding gap exhibit; conference
with counsel re: correlation between
performance and revenue per WADA,;
review and update 1&S tax rates for
Memerandum on recommendation on
superintendent witnesses; email counsel re:
same; review email from counsel re: same;
email Wayne Pierce, Ray Freeman, and
Toni Hunter re: differences found in data we
have and information given to us by
superintendents; finish formatting and
printing all data and exhibits; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; conference with
T. Hunter re: 5/18 hearing; telephone
conference with G. Santiago re: M Hurley
deposition; conference with R.<nay IV re:
data analysis; review additional analysis;
telephone conference with G.-Santiago re:
5/25 conference; review C. Diamond email;
review request for production from C.
Diamond; review V. Pierce email re:
conference re: xhibits; correspond to T.
Hunter re: samis; conference with T. Hunter
re: superintendents interview conference;
confererice with T. Hunter re: S. Hurley
intervicw; work re: exhibits.

Review Efficiency Intervenor REP; respond
to1. Robertson re: follow up meeting with
superintendents; set up meeting to discuss
data.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
data request; review email from State re:
discovery; meeting with counsel re: data and
exhibits; create exhibit binder; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data
requests; conference with counsel re: exhibit
notebook; conference with counsel re:
summary for Judge Dietz; print same;
scheduling conference with Judge Dietz;

Invoice # 40881

5.60 hrs

2.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

5.40 hrs

$980.00

$ 945.00

$260.00

$945.00

Page 6



05/18/2012

05/18/2012

05/20/2012

05/21/2012

05/21/2012

05/21/2012

05/21/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

SEJ

meeting with R. Gray and T. Hunter re:
debriefing of status conference; telephone
conference with Dr. Baker re: requested
data and discovery.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; conference
with T. Hunter re: data set; prepare for
status conference; conference with R. Gray
IV re: exhibits and working notebook;
review W. Pierce email; reply to same;
review D. Hincjosa email re: testimony on
weights; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D. Hinojosa email; conference with
T. Hunter and B. Wood re: weights and trial
strategy; attend status conference; post
hearing conference with attorneys.

Meet with B. Wood and R. Gray re: status;
attend court pre trial conference; conference
with R. Gray and Richard Gray IV as follow
up to conference; emails to T. Robertson ru:
meeting with superintendents; email to
Plaintiff attorney re: issues raised by Judge.
Review P. Fraissinet email; review I,
Hinojosa email; reply to same.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
Proposed Agreed Data Seq; einail Mark
Trachtenberg re: same; review emails from
Ray Freeman re: charter versus public
school spending; revicw articles re: same;
calendar next s¢iieduling conference with
Judge Dietz; telephone conference with Tim
Wolff re: dat= requests and exhibits;
confererce with counsel re:proposed agreed
data s=i: review email from Mark
Trachienberg re: same; email counsel re:
same.

Keview W, Pierce email; reply to same;
review M. Moses email; conference with M.
Bolen re: reply to same; review R. Gray IV
email re: database; reply to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: School District
Listings; compile information pertaining to
the T. Hunter recommended school districts.
Prepare for presentation at Litigation
Workshop in San Francisco; many emails to
set up telephone conference with Plaintiff's
attorneys re: various matters; email to

Invoice # 40881

4.70 hrs

3.60 hrs

0.35 hrs

1.05 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.20 hrs

4.00 hrs

$2,115.00

$1170.00

$ 15750

$183.75

$ 225.00

NIC

NAC

Papa?



05/22/2012

05/22/2012

05/23/2012

05/23/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

W _Pierce re: Judge's decisions; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: "agreed data”;
review email from T. Robertson re:
superintendents meetings and respond.
Review email from Tim Wolff re: litigation
requests 004C, 006C, and 014B; begin
printing same; telephone conference with
Tim Wolff re: same; meeting at Equity
Center with John Hubbard re: School
Finance System in Texas; conference with
counsel re: data, meeting at equity center,
and conference call; telephone conference
with Supreme Court re: electronic record;
telephone conference with Third Court of
Appeals re: same; format and print litigation
request 005D and 014B; format litigation
request 004D; review proposed exhibit list;
print same.

Respond to various emails from T.
Robertson re: meetings with
superintendents; review email from M.
French and respond; review discovery
responses from State to Ft. Berd «nd
Calhorn County and summerize for R. Gray;
meet with L. Moak re: variols matters:
prepare for presentation at Litigator’s
Workshop in San Francisco; telephone
conference with P. (_slbert re: various
matlers.

Review emai! ftom Wayne Pierce re:
Superintendent M&O and I&S tax rates;
telephore conference with Plainti ff Groups
re: Sewninar to Judge Dietz, disclosing of
experts to Judge; "agreed data set,” class
s122 expent, teacher quality expert, and
aeadline for dispositive motions; conference
with counsel re: same; email Wayne Pierce
and Ray Freeman re: data variables check.
Review revised interview notes with
superintendents; prepare for interviews;
review States discovery responses;
conference with T. Hunter re: cost of
education analysis; work re: discovery and
database; conference with T. Hunter re:
witness interviews, data analysis and 5/23
conference call; review M. Hurley report;

Invoice # 40881

4.50 hrs

1.00 hrs
4.00 hrs

1.25 hrs

2.95 hrs

$787.50

$325.00
N/C

$218.75

$1,327.50

Page 8



05/23/2012

05/24/2012

05/24/2012

05/24/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

S5E]

prepare for conference with G. Santiago and

T. Canby; conference with R. Gray IV re:

5/23 conference call and issues to cover.

Work on presentation for Litigator's 3.00 hrs
Workshop in San Francisco; Telephone 2.00 hrs
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys re:

various matters; conference with R. Gray re:

discovery responses and other matters;

review emails and attachments on I & S

from R. Freeman and J. Hamey; telephone

conference with W. Pierce and others on

discovery requests.

telephone conference with Tim Wolff re: 0.25 hrs
data; review emails re: deposition of Mark

Hurley.

Review W. Pierce email; review T. Hunter 5.45 hrs

email re: conference call; review email re:
M. Hurley deposition; review message form
H. D. Chambers office; conference with S.
Jennings re: same; review T. Hunter emaii
re: B. Baker; review emails re: HD.
Chambers conference; conference #ith T.
Hunter re: presentation to cour? ai,d
methodology for calculation of $3,500 in
today’s values; review inflatiun calculator
calculation re: $3,500; conterence with B.
Wood, T. Hunter, T. Wailis and J. Vaughn
re: potential testimony; conference with B,
Wood and T. Eunter re: witnesses and
$3,500 calculation; review deposition notice
with subpoena for M. Hurley; review Fr.
Bend's discovery responses; review C.
Diamnind email; review intervenors
discovery responses; review A. Brownson
cinail; review chart provided; review D.
‘Yhompson email; review T. Hunter email to
D. Hinojosa; review D, Hinojosa reply;
conference with T. Hunter re: A. Cortez
conference; review C. Diamond email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; conference
with S. Jennings re: travel logistics for M,
Hurley deposition.

Confer with T. Hunter re: response to 1.10 hrs
Efficiency Intervenors’ RFD; prepare draft
of response; confer with R. Gray re: Hurley
deposition; review notice re: same; review

Invoice # 40881

$975.00
N/C

$ 43.75

$2,452.50

NI

Pape 9



05/24/2012

05/25/2012

05/25/2012

05/27/2012

05/28/2012
05/29/2012

05/29/2012

3102-61

TBH

REG

RG l‘Yr

REG

and calendar schedule of meetings with

superintendents; confer with T. Hunter re:

rescheduling H.D. Chambers to June lst,

Telephone conference with Wayne, Buck, 4.00 hrs
and Doug re: Cornyn’s number; review 0.90 hrs
email from W, Pierce re: same and respond;

conference with R. Gray re: seminar for the

judge; telephone conference with W. Pierce

re: same; work on presentation to Litigator's

Workshop; meet with superintendents re:

serving as witnesses; confer with R. Gray

and B. Wood re: Cornyn’s number;

telephone conference with C. Diamond re:

Jjudge’s seminar and revealing our experts;

email to Richard re; FAST; email to S.

Dahlburg re: telephone conference; email to

D. Hinojiocsa re: conferring re: emails from

C. Diamond and D. Hinojosa and respond.

Prepare for conference with 5.55 hrs
superintendents; prepare for conference with

G. Santiago and T. Canby re; M. Hurley;

review analysis of of use of 1&S farM&O

by wealthy districts; conferencs with T.

Canby and G. Santiago re; M. Hurley

report; conference with B Wood, T. Hunter,

J. Cooper and J. Pfeifer re: possible

witnesses and testing; review W. Pierce

correspondence; conerence with T. Hunter

re: 5/29 confercuice; review L. Mock email.

Respond to email from W. Pierce and D. 2.50 hrs
Hinojosa re. maeeting on Tuesday; meet with

superint:ngdents; conference with R. Gray

re: superintendents and M. Hurley

derozition.
Currespond to T. Hunter via email re: 5/29 0.15 hrs
conference.
Work re: exhibits. 3.00 hrs
Online research re: MALDEF potential 4.80 hrs

experts Delia Pompa and Elena Izquierda;

review all data and update and revise

Summary of Litigation Requests; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: litigation

request 014C; Review data sheet Counties

Ranked by Wealth Alphabetically; find all

gaps in revenue per WADA bigger than

$800.00 and indicate same,

Travel to/from San Antonio; conference 5.85 hrs

Invoice # 40881

$1300.00
N/C

$2,497.50

$812.50

$ 6750

$1,350.00
$840.00

$2,632.50

Page 10



05/25/2012

05/29/2012

05/30/2012

05/30/2012

05/30/2012

05/30/2012

05/31/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

with D. Hinojosa, A. Cortez, W, Pierce and

T. Hunter re: school finance and database

matters; review Edgewood discovery

responses; review email re: D. Thompson

call; review discovery responses.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Plaintiffs’ 1.50 hrs
response to Efficiency Intervenor’s RFD;

review and revise response; revise RFP to

Commissioner, TEA, State Education

Board; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

finalize and serve Plaintiffs’ Response to the

Efficiency Intervenors’ Request for

Disclosure.

Travel to San Antonio to conference with D, 6.60 hrs
Hinojosa and A. Cortez re: data and

weights; telephone conference with D.

Thompson re: Moak data and weights;

finalize Response to RFP of Intervenors;

review suggestions for RFP to state; email

to W, Pierce updating him; telephone

conference with T. Wallis re: College

Station’s tax rate; confer with R. Gezyre:

various matters.

Review email from Tim Wolff re: litigation 0.55 hrs
request 014D; format and priiit same;

review emails re: discovery.

Review P. Fraissinet cinail; prepare for 5.35 hrs
conference with superintendents; conference

with R. Gray I'V re: exhibits; conference

with attomeys re: $3,500 figure inflation

adopted; conferences with T. Hunter, B.

Wood and superintendents re: possible trial

testimony; conference with B. Wood re:

stats,

Revise RFP to Rebert Scott, et al.; confer 0.50 hrs
with T. Hunter re: same.

Telephone conference with P. Colbert re: 6.40 hrs

discovery request; edit RFP to State; email

to W. Pierce and R. Gray re: $3500; emails

to D. Hincjosa re: discovery and J. Finn;

review responses from D. Hinojosa; meet

with superintendents; confer with R. Gray

and B. Wood re: same.

Prepare for meeting with counsel re: 2.65 hrs
exhibits; meeting with counsel re: same;

telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:

Invoice # 40881

$150.00

$2145.00

$ 96.25

$2,407.50

$ 50.00

$2080.00

$463.75

Page 11



05/31/2012 REG

05/31/2012 SEJ

05/31/2012 TBH

exhibits discussed in meeting.

Prepare for conference re: exhibits; review 3.70 hrs
M. Sissler correspondence; review States

response to admissions; review States

responses to production request; review W,

Pierce email; review T. Hunter email;

conference with R. Gray IV re: exhibits;

review W. Pierce email; review material re:

H. Keller conference; conference with H.

Keller and T. Hunter re: probable testimony;

conference with R. Gray IV re: additional

exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re;

production request.

Review State Defendants’ documents 1.25 hrs
responsive to Edgewood ISD’s RFP; confer

with R. Gray re: same.

Prepare for meeting with H. Keller; attend 3.60 hrs
meeting with H. Keller and R. Gray; review

discovery requests of other parties; respond

to emails from W. Pierce and T. Robertsou;

email to D. Hinojosa; edit our RFP tc Siate;

telephone conference with H. Daniels re:

same.

TINMEKEEPER RECAY

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 61.80 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 29.85 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 71.40 hrs @ 325.00 /hr
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 10.45 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
Fee Recap Totals 173.50

3102-01 Invoice # 40881

$1,665.00

$125.00

$1170.00

$57,283.75

$27,810.00
$ 522375
$23,205.00

$ 1,045.00

$57,283.75

Page 12



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

June 30, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 41109-1 REG
Our fileit: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing thirough: 06/30/2012

c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFLESSIONAL SERVICES
06/01/2012 REG Prepare for conference with H.D. 1.90 hrs $ 855.00
Chambers; conference with H.D. Chambers;
B . Wood and T. Hunter re: possible
testimony; review M. Trachtenberg zimail;
review state’s proposed agreed datzbase,
06/01/2012 SEJ Confer with T. Hunter re: telephone call 0.25 hrs N{/C
from D. Murphy re: rescheduling
conference; telephone conterence with and
email to D. Murphy re: same; email B.
Wood re: same,
06/01/2012 TBH Conference with B 3V ood re: 2.90 hrs $ 94250
superintendent witiiesses; meet with H.D.
Chambers; telephone conference with B.
Baker re: vanous matters; conference with
R. Gray re: superintendents; review and
respond to various emails from M.
Trachtznberg, D. Thompson, W. Pierce and
D Murphy.
06/02/2012 REG Review M. Trachtenberg email; conference 1.10 hrs $ 495.00
with R. Blink and T. Hunter re: possible
testimony; work on exhibits.

06/02/2012 TBH Meet with R. Blincoe; conference with R. 2.00 hrs $ 650.00
Gray.

06/04/2012 RGIV ~ Meeting with counsel re: exhibits. 0.60 hrs $105.00

06/04/2012 REG Review P. Colbert email; review email re: 2.05 hrs $ 92250

R. Scott deposition; review R. Scott
deposition notice; conference with R. Gray
IV re: exhibits; conference with T. Hunter
re: R. Blincoe conference and weights;
review memo on D. Murphy 6/5 conference;

3102-01 Invoice # 41109 Pags |



06/04/2012

06/04/2012

06/05/2012

06/05/2012

06/05/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

review W, Pierce email; reply to same;
review D. Ray email; review memo
prepared by D. Ray; reply to D. Ray; review
W. Pierce additional email; review email re:
6/8 conference re: B. Blake.

Review Notice of Intention to Take Oral 0.10 hrs
Deposition of Commissioner Robert Scott.
Telephone conference with H. Keller; 2.90 hrs

emails to W. Pierce and B. Baker to set up
telephone conference; review emails from
H. Daniels re: $3,500 figure; draft
recommendation on R. Blincoe; review
recommendations to make cuts; conference
with R. Gray re: various matters; review
emails from W. Pierce on R. Jaklich;
prepare for meeting with D. Murphy;
telephone conference with Charles; edit
RFP; review Baker fairness blog.

Review emails re: discovery; conference (.20 hrs
with counsel re: inter-district comparison.
Review C. Diamond email; review 5.25 hrs

intervenors discovery; review B. Woog
email; reply to same; work re: B, Fass
status; conference with T. Hun‘erand D.
Murphy re: potential testimony; conference
with re: exhibits; raview P,
Fraissinet email with protective order;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
message from D. Maxphy; review R.
Blincoe treatise ¢e. facilities; review FAST
report; conference with R, Gray IV re:
exhibits; revicw property tax exhibit;
conference with R. Gray re: same.

Edit meniorandum on Superintendents; meet 5.90 hrs
with 1 Murphy; review emails from P.
Fraissinet re: notice under TERPA and
orotective order; conference with R. Gray
ve: same; respond to P. Fraissinet’s email;
review email from S. Dahlberg re: seminar
for judge; review varied of school finance
articles; email to B. Baker re: school he
identifies as not getting fair funding and
PAST Report; telephone conference with all
Plaintiff attorneys re: protective order and
notice, focus district, experts, agreed data
set, Hurley deposition, tech person for trial
and deposition notice to TEA; conference
with R. Gray re: same; follow up emails to
all Plaintiff attorneys.

Invoice # 41109

$10.00

$ 94250

$ 35.00

$2,362.50

$1,917.50

Page 2



06/06/2012

06/06/2012

06/06/2012

06/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Review notes from meeting with counsel re; 2.65 hrs
exhibits; prepare for meeting at Equity
Center re: same; review emails re:
discovery; update discovery summary;
review emails re: protective order; review
protective order.

Review J. Tummer email; review P. Fraissinet 2.85 hrs
email; review draft protective order; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review
message re: Equal Protection issue; review
message re: focus districts; conference with
T. Hunter re: same; conference with T.
Hunter re; equal protection claim, protective
order and list of focus districts; review C.
Diamond email; review J. Tumer email;
reply to same; review J. Turner email;
conference with T. Hunter re; R. Scott
deposition; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review C. Diamond email; review W.
Pierce email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same; review
S. Dahlberg email; review emails r2; D.
Hurley deposition; review D. Fanojosa
email; reply to same; review draft
correspondence to Superiatendents;
telephene conference with ' W. Pierce re: B.
Hammond press confereince; correspond to
C. Diamond re: B. IIammond; review B.
Wood email re; 3. Harvey, conference with
T. Hunter re: same; review sigued
protective order; conference with T. Hunter
re; same; review T. Robertson emails (2);
reply to same (2); conference with T. Hunter
re: swre; review J. Reilly emails (2).
Review email from W. Pierce re: telephone 1.50 hrs
cenference with REG; confer with R. Gray
re: same; email W. Pierce re: same; confer
with T. Hunter re: letters to superintendents;
email T. Robertson re: list of all
superintendents T. Hunter met with; review
emails re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:
RFP to the TEA and Interrogatories; revise
and finalize Interrogatories; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; finalize and serve RFP and
Interrogatories.

Draft designation of districts; finalize 4.40 hrs
discovery requests and serve on state;
emails to T. Robertson re: FERPA notice;

Invoice # 41109

$463.75

$1,282.50

AT

$1,430.00

Page 3



06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/07/2012

06/08/2012

06/08/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

review emails on agreed data set from P.

Colbert and from various Plaintiff attorneys

and respond; review emails from H. Daniels

re: information for B. Baker and respond;

review emails from P, Fraissinet and D.

Hinojosa re: teacher testimony and respond;

several telephone conferences with re:

FERPA nectice; email to W. Pierce re: same.

Review discovery; update discovery 4.10 hre
summary; telephone conference with Tim

Wolff re: exhibit requests.

Review various emails re: notice; reply to 2.15 hrs
same; review C. Diamond email; reply to

same; review D. Thompson email; reply to

same; review T, Roberison emails; reply to

same; review discovery request; work re:

preparation for M. Hurley deposition;

review message from T. Hunter; telephone

call to T. Hunter - left message; conference

with S. Jennings re: designation of focus

district; review D. Thompson email; reply to

same; review P. Fraisset email; review T.

Robertson email; reply to same review

email from Hutto; reply to same; review T.

Roberison status email; conference with S.

Jennings re: S. Dahlberg callze: discovery.

Confer with REG re: distncts who need to 7.00 hrs
be called and FERPA tciice; review live

pleading re: same; confer with R. Gray re:

same; confer with T. Hunter re; letters to

superintendents; finalize and send letiers;

confer with T. F.obertson re: same; confer

with R. Gray re: same; telephone conference

with S. Dahlberg’s office re: discovery

requesis in Word format; email same to J.

Reich; confer with R. Gray re: same,

T'ravel to San Francisco for school Finance 7.50 hrs
Litigator's Workshop; prepare for

presentation; review email from S. Dahlberg

re: seminar for Judge.

Review email from T. Hunter re; contacting 0.05 hrs
R. Freeman; email to S. Jennings re: same;

email to Hunter.

Review emails re: deposition exhibits; 0.80 hrs
telephone conference with Tim Wolff re:

data; conference with counsel re: same.

Review emails re: notice; conference with 1.40 hrs
T. Hunter re: protective order; conference

with S. Jennings re: designation of focus

Invoice # 41109

$717.50

$ 967.50

$700.00

NAC

$140.00

$ 630.00
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06/08/2012

06/08/2012

06/08/2012

06/09/2012

06/10/2012

06/11/2012

3102-01

SEJ

SEJ

RGIV

district; review C. Diamond email; reply to

same; review C. Diamond email re:

depositions; review C. Diamond email;

review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;

review J. Turner email; review D. Hinojosa

email; review message from T. Robertson;

conference with S. Jennings re: same;

review email re: designation of focus

districts; work re: exhibit preparation;

review T. Robertson email; review S.

Jennings reply; work re: deposition

preparation.

Continue sending letters to superintendents; 3.75 hrs
efile and serve Designation of Focus

Districts for Trial and Other Purposes;

confer with attorneys re: status of same;

telephone conference with T. Robertson re:

same; review and calendar Coalition

Plaintiffs discovery requests to State

Defendants; confer with T. Hunter re: emai!

from S. Dahiberg; email counsel re: sarne.

Confirm R. Gray 6/12 trip to Dallas; ‘confer 0.25 hrs
with R. Gray re: same; review Calooun

County Cross Notice.

Give presentation on Adequacy, Equality 2.00 hrs
and Efficiency; attend woikshop; 6.00 hrs
conference with D. Hinojosa re: seminar for

Judge; review emails 12 STARR EQOC

results; conference vwnth S. Jennings re:

letters to superiziteids.

Review S. Dahlberg email; review D. 2.65 hrs
Hinojosa email; review analysis of test

results; revizw M. Trachtenberg email;

review cross notice of deposition for M.

Hurley; review date re: early test results;

review documents produced by M. Hurley;

work re: deposition preparation.

Work re: M. Hurley deposition preparation; 1.25 hrs
work on exhibits and expert reports.
Review emails re: deposition notices; 320 hrs

conference with counsel re: scheduling
order; review same; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review plaintiff's
discovery requests; conference with counsel
re: STAAR results; telephone conference

‘with W. Pierce re: same; scan and email

resuits to W. Pierce; review email re:
proposed deposition notices to TEA and
SBOE; telephone conference with W. Pierce

Invoice # 41109

$375.00

N/C

$ 650.00
N/C

$1,192.50

$ 56250

$560.00

Page 3



06/11/2012

06/11/2012

06/11/2012

06/12/2012

06/12/2012

06/12/2012

06/13/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

re: STAAR results and standards;
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with counsel re: scheduling
order and Supplemental Designation of
Focus Districts; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review email re: Fort
Bend County Second Amended Petition;
review same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with R. Gray IV re: exhibits;
complete preparation for M. Hurley
deposition; analysis of EOC scores and
research re: same; outline potential
witnesses and exhibits; review A. Kauffman
emails (3); reply to same; review J. Turner
email; review deposition notice; reply to J.
Turner email; review Second Amended
Petition of Ft. Bend; review and revise
supplemental focus district designation;
review deposition notices; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re:
designation of Aldine as focus district and
M. Hurley deposition; review Ft, Fiend
designation of districts.

Efile and serve Supplemental Designation
of Focus Districts; confer with attorneys re:
same; email Equity Center re: same.

Return from San Francisco; conference with
R. Gray IV re: desiznadon of districts;
review articles cm izacher training.

Review emails re: deposition dates and
subjects; revicw email from W. Pierce re: B.
Baker Kansus testimony article; read article.
Travel to/irom Dallas; secure deposition of
M. Huiey; review W, Pierce, etc.; review T.
Hunier emails.

%cllow-up from conference; emails to
various Plaintiff attorneys and review
responses from Plaintiff attorneys re: agreed
data; seminar for judge, experts on teachers
and class size; review designations by Ft.
Bend and mark county map; review article
on Baker's Kansas testimony; emails re:
data to H. Daniels and P. Colbert and review
responses.

Meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits;
telephone conference with T. Wolff re: new
data exhibits; review, format, and print new
exhibits for counsel.

Invoice # 41109

2.05 hry

0.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

5.00 hrs

0.45 hrs

13.25 hrs

3.00 hrs

6.25 hrs

$ 92250

N/IC

$ 812.50

N/C

$ 7875

$5,962.50

$ 975.00

$1093.75

Page 6



06/13/2012

06/13/2012

06/13/2012

06/14/2012

06/14/2012

06/14/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Work re: exhibits; conference with attorneys 7.95 hrs
and Equity Center re: exhibits; review W.
Pierce emails; review D. Thompson email;
comrespond to D, Thompson and M.
Trachtenberg via email re: 6/14 conference;
review D. Thompson reply; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenberg reply; reply to
same; work on exhibit preparation; travel to
The Woodlands; prepare for 6/14
conference.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Notice of Intent to 025 nrs
Comply with Protective Order and FERPA
Notice; prepare draft of same.

Conference with R. Gray re: Hurley 7.30 hrs
deposition and county distribution of focus
district; attend meeting at Equity Center re:
exhibits; prepare list of trial witnesses for R.
Gray; meet with R. Gray re: exhibits; review
our districts for candidates for early
childhood and class size focus; telephone
conference with D. Thompson re: Scot
deposition; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa re: Scott deposition; telephone
conference with D. Thompson,left message.
re: Scott deposition; email to J. Finn re:
including our districts in kis reviews; review
several emails form M. Trachtenberg and H.
MecIntosh re: Agreed Cata Set; send email to
ali Plaintiff attorney: re: telephone
conference to discuss State’s proposal for
seminar for Judge; review responses; email
to C. Diamond re: State’s proposal; email to
R. Blincoe rz: preparation for testimony on
facilities.

Revicw and reply to email from counsel re: 3.95 hrs
meeting with W, Pierce re: exhibits;
teiephone conference with T. Wolff re: data
exhibits; email counsel re: same; telephone
conference with W, Pierce re: data meeting;
conference with counsel re: same; email
counsel re: same; travel to Capitol for
legislative research; legislative research;
review email from counsel re: speeches by
R. Scott; search for same; review email
from T. Wolff re: data.

Conference with attorneys re: trial strategy; 6.00 hrs
work re: exhibits; review emails,
Efile and serve Notice of Intent to Comply 1.00 hrs

with the Protective Order; review article and

Invoice # 41109

$3,577.50

Ml

$2,372.50

$691.25

$2,700.00

N/C

itage T



06/14/2012

06/15/2012

06/15/2012

06/15/2012

06/15/2012

06/16/2012
06/16/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SE!

RGIV

charts posted on Texas Tribune website;

confer with T. Hunter re: same,

Schedule meeting with J. Kracht; review El 2.40 hrs
Paso Times article of Damon Murphy;

telephone conference with J. Finn; email to

H.D. Chambers, M. French and R. Blincoe

re: class size; draft Notice to Court on

FERPA and Protective Order; telephone

conference with D. Thompson, left

message; email to D. Thompson re: Scott

deposition; review literature on class size;

confer with R. Gray IV re: various matters;

review response to Ft. Bend and Calhoun

City discovery in preparation for Scott

deposition.

Review data notes; research re: speeches 2.85 hrs
and articles regarding R. Scott; review email

from M. Trachtenberg re: litigation

schedule; print same for counsel; save all

new data; review emails re: deposition

dates; review legislative research findirgs,

email counsel re; same.

Review D. Hinojosa email; work r#: 2.55 hrs
exhibits; review M. McIntosh emuul:

conference call with attoreys re: status;

review J. Turner email; review S. Dahlberg

email; review D. Hinocjosa email; review

deposition notice for Staies Board; review J.

Turner email; review: C. Diamond email;

comrespond to T/ Hunter via email re:

depositions; review J. Turner email; review

D. Hinojosaemail; review J. Finn

engagement letter; correspond to W. Pierce

via emaii re; status; review emails re:

expeits, work re: exhibit preparation.

Revizw State Defendants’ documents 0.50 hrs
responsive to Fort Bend ISD's Second RFP;

confer with attorneys re: same.

Telephone conference with all Plaintiff 1.30 hrs
attorneys re: seminar for Judge, experts and

other matters; emails (2} to S. Dahlberg re:

seminar for Judge, telephone conference to

S. Dahlberg re: same, left message.

Meeting with counsel re: data and exhibits. 1.15 hrs
Review J. Turner email with deposition 4.75 hrs
notice; review emails re: superintendent

depositions; review email re: J. Finn; review

email re: R. Scott deposition; review email

re: conference with Dr, Kracht; review W.

Invoice # 41109

$ 780.00

$498.75

$1,147.50

$50.00

$ 42250

$201.25
$2,137.50
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06/17/2012 RGIV
06/17/2012 REG

06/18/2012 RGIV

06/18/2012 REG

06/18/2012 SEJ

06/18/2012 TBH

06/19/2012 RGIV

3102-01

Pierce email; reply to same; work on
exhibits.

Meeting with counsel re: trial exhibits.
Conference with R. Gray IV re: exhibits;
work on exhibits.

Format, print, and put together exhibit
notebooks; telephone conference with T.
Wolff re: data; meeting at Equity Center re:
expert report and exhibit notebook.

Review email re: seminar for judge; work
re: exhibits preparation; review S. Dahlberg
email; review D. Thompson email; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review J. Turner
email; review email re: 6/19 committee
hearing; review W. Pierce email; review T.
Hunter reply; review email from W. Harvey
re: report; review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with T. Hunter, W. Pierce, W.
Fraissinet, and R. Gray IV re: B. Baker
report and exhibits; review email re:
depositions; reply to same.

Review and calendar Calhoun County's
Notice of Intent to Take Oral Deposition of
Organizational Representative ot the TEA;
review and calendar various deposition
dates.

Email to Plaintiff attorneys re: telephone
conference to Shelly; ieview emails from H.
Daniels and forwarg to B. Baker; respond to
emails from H, Daniels, B. Leslie and B.
Baker; attend meeting to hear B. Baker
presentatiori and review exhibits with W,
Pierce and Y. Freeman; confer on budget
with R. Gray, W. Pierce and R. Freeman;
confea:nce with Attorney General attorneys
on seminar for Judge.

Keview emails re: data requests and
deposition recording service; conference
with counsel re: House Public Education

Committee Hearing on STAAR; research re:

same; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: interdistrict comparisons;
format data for particular counties and print
for counsel; attend Public Hearing on
Education; conference with counsel re;
same; review email from counsel re: focus
districts; meeting with counsel re: same and
superintendent testimony; review exhibit
notebook; telephone conference with T.

Invoice # 41109

0.75 hrs
0.75 hrs

9.10 hrs

6.55 s

0.75 hrs

6.30 hrs

7.25 hrs

$131.25
$ 33750

$1592.50

$2,947.50

NAC

$2,047.50

$1268.75
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06/19/2012

06/19/2012

06/19/2012

06/20/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Wolff re: changes that need to be made
{voicemail).

Work re: data analysis and exhibits; 2.00 hrs
conference with R. Gray IV re: Hurley
education hearing; review emails re:
conference on 6/2 at Texas A&M; review C.
Nickel email; review deposition notices (5);
draft email to attorneys re: status; review
email from MALDEF; review email re: call
with State; conference with R. Gray I'V re:
Education Committee hearing; work on
exhibits; review correspondence to
Superintendent J. Knight; review B. Woods
email; reply to same (2); correspond to W.
Pierce via email re: status; review R_
Freeman email; reply to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Second Amended 0.50 hrs
Petition; draft same.
Conference with R. Gray re: budget, sharing 5.30 hrs

Haney and superintend depositions; edit
chart on focus districts and email to B,
Baker; listen to House Committee on
Education hearing; review Nationai Xeport
Card; several emails to A. Brownson getting
information for Finn and Baker; email to
Plaintiff attorneys summazizing
conversation with S. Dalhoerg; review
emails from A. Vasquez re: meeting with J.
Kracht and respond; review several emails
from J. Finn and respond; several emails to
T. Robentson re: email to superintendents;
telephone conference with P. Colbert re:
data and what he is doing.

Review aiid reply to email from counsel re: 4.55 hrs
telephoie conference with P. Colbert, W.
Picroe, and R. Freeman; update Exhibit
Notebooks with updated exhibits; format
and print new data set for counsel re: focus
districts; telephone conference with P,
Colbert, W. Pierce, R. Freeman, and T.
Hunter re: data concerns; calculate gaps in
revenue for counties ranked alphabetically
with gaps larger than $800; telephone
conference with T. Wolff re: exhibit
changes; meeting with counsel re: telephone
conference with P. Colbert; update Exhibit
Notebook for counsel; telephone conference
with R. Freeman re: inter-district
comparisons; conference with counsel re:

Invoice # 41109

$ 900.00

N/C

$1,722.50

$796.25
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06/20/2012

06/20/2012

06/20/2012

06/21/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

same,

Review R. Fraissinet emails (2); review 4.80 hrs
email re: facilities survey; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same same;,
review draft agreement with Moak/Casey:;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; correspond to attorneys via email re:
6/22 conferences; review B. Wood email;
review W. Pierce email; review scope of
work of Moak/Casey; prepare for telephone
conference with Dr. Kracht; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same;
telephone conference with Dr. Kracht and T.
Hunter re: freshman class of Texas A&M:
review A. Kauffman email; telephone
conference with M. Trachtenberg and J.
Turner re: L. Moak; telephone conference
with J. Tumner re: experts; review R.
Freeman email; conference with T. Hunter
and B. Wood re: budget and deposition
schedule; conference with R. Gray IV zna
T. Hunter re: P. Colbert call; review I,
Tumer email; review S. Dahlberg #mail;
review C. Diamond email; conf{et=nce with
T. Hunter re: R. Scott deposition; reply to
emails; review D. Thompson-¢mail; review
R. Freeman email; conference with R. Gray
IV re: same; review states discovery
responses; review M. Trachtenberg emails
(2); reply to sare.

Review and revise Superintendents’ contact 1.75 hrs
informatin; conver with T. Hunter re: same;
review State Defendants’ responses to
Intervenois’ RFP; review email from T.
Robertson re: updated list of districts; email
Superintendents material for deposition
oreparation; review email from T. Wallis re:
same.

Conference with R. Gray re: J. Kracht, 5.50 hrs
budget and other matters; telephone
conference with P. Colbert and W. Pierce
and R. Freeman and Richard Gray IV re:
data; conference with B. Wood and R. Gray
re: budget; email to T. Robertson re:
superintendent summer scheduies; emails to
Plaintiff attorneys re: Haney and deposition
schedules; prepare for Scott deposition.
Review exhibit notebook; update same for 2.65 hrs
counsel; format and print updated exhibits;

Invoice # 41109

$2,160.00

$175.00

$1,787.50

$463.75

Page 11



06/21/2012

06/21/2012

06/21/2012

06/22/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

mark updated exhibits for W. Pierce;
telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
inter-district comparisons; telephone
conference with W, Pierce re: data and
exhibit runs; print discovery attachments for
counsel; review notes for meeting monday
at Equity Center.

Prepare for 6/25 conference; conference
with T. Hunter re: same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review D. Thompson email; review
C. Wooley email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
email re: confidentiality agreement;
conference with T. Hunter re: 6/22 hearing;
review additional emails; reply to same;
work on exhibits; review draft advisory by
State; review T. Hunter email re;
depositions; reply to same; review emails re:
Plaintiff's advisory to court; review and
revise draft advisory.

Revise superintendents’ contact informatiun
and availability for depositions; telephone
conference with R. Knight re: same; review
and return email from T. Robe:tson re:
litigation deadlines; review revised Focus
Districts spreadsheet.

Review emails from W. Picrce and respond;
email to B. Wood, W, Vierce, R. Freeman
and P. Colbert re: Waic Haney; email to B.
Wood re: covering depositions; review
information from our superintendents to
schedule devositions; conference with R.
Gray on various matters; prepare for Scott
deposition; review Defendant’s Advisory to
court and draft response; email to all
Plauntiff attorneys re: same; review email
trom H. McIntosh on expert for teacher prep
and respond; review vitae of proposed
expert; review emails from other Plaintiff
attorneys re: same; conference with Richard
Gray IV about articles for Scott deposition;
telephone conference with L. Moak re:
weights and target revenue.

Review emails re: presentation to Judge
Dietz; conference with counsel re:
scheduling conference; status conference
with Judge Dietz; telephone conference with
counsel re: same; review Edgewood’s Plea
to the Jurisdiction and Motion to Dismiss

Invoice # 41109

3.35 hrs

0.60 hrs

5.40 hrs

3.90 hrs

$1,507.50

i

$1,755.00

$682.50
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06/22/2012

06/22/2012

06/24/2012

06/24/2012

06/25/2012

06/25/2012

06/25/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

REG

Intervenors; conference with counsel re:
same.

Review emails re: advisory; review article
re: NAFEP scores; review L. Lacy email re:
depositions; work on exhibits; conference
with attorneys re: status conference; review
additional emails; review exhibits:
conference with attorneys re: status
conference.

Review emails from W. Pierce and respond,;
email to H. Keller and J. Kracht and R.
Rhodes re: college ready; attend meeting
with Plaintiff’s attorneys and L. Moak and
A. Branson; attend scheduling conference
with J. Dietz.

Outline trial testimony of superintendents;
conference with counsel re: same.

Review D. Thompson email; review L. Lacy
email; review P. Colbert email; reply to
same; review P. Colbert response; review
M. Sisle email; review plea to jurisdiction
filed by MALDEEF,; review C. Diamcnd
email; review TEA material; prepars for
6/26 conferences.

Equity Center Annual Breakfast; meeting at
Equity Center re: data and e xlibits;
conference with counsel re: same; email
Charles re: weights; telephone conference
with T. Wolff re: exlubit and data; meeting
with counsel re:‘moving forward, case
status, deposition assignments and dates;
calendar deposition dates; conference with
legal assistant re: same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: Focus Districts
and @'tumey contacts; set up same; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Conference with superintendents of
coalition; conference re: exhibits;
conference with R. Gray IV and T. Hunter
re: 6/22 status conference; conference with
R. Gray IV and T. Hunter re: Judge Dietz
status conference and new developments;
review J. Tumer email; review plea to
jurisdiction filed by Edgewood; review
material on NAEP; review TEA deposition
notice; review L. Lacy emails (3); review
message from J. Tumner; review test
summary information; telephone conference
with J. Turner re: TAKS signs.

Invoice # 41109

2.25 hrs

5.00rs

3.00 hrs

2.25 hrs

6.40 hrs

0.75 hrs

5.85 hrs

$1,012.50

$1,625.00

$525.00

$1,012.50

$1120.00

$ 337.50

$2,632.50
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06/25/2012

06/26/2012

3102-01

TBH

REG

Attend meeting of Equity Center members 9.60 hrs
and Coalition members; meet with W.
Pierce, C. Akki, R. Freeman, R. Gray, R.
Gray IV re: data systems; review Money
Matters by B. Leslie and comment;
conference with R. Gray re: conference with
Judge and follow-up tasks, deposition
schedule; expert; telephone conference with
S. Kline and R. Levin potential experts;
telephone conference with B. Wood re:
scope of testimony for W. Haney and
deposition coverage; emails to various
Plaintiff attorneys re: working group on
Final Order and on Seminar for Judge;
email to L. Moak re: SAT and ACT data;
review response; email to W. Pierce re:
same; begin scheduling deposition
preparation for our superintendents,

Review email re: B. Duncombe; reply to 6.00 hrs
same; review P. Colbert email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review attachment; reply to M.
Trachtenberg email; review J. Turacr email;
review D. Thompson email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; review R. Frecian email;
review D. Thompson emaui; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenbergemail; review
superintendents list> ~onference with T.
Hunter re: same; review S. Dahiberg email,
review P. Fraissinet email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review census data re:
funding; review D. Hinojosa email; review
J. Tumer email; review emails re: additional
deposzuions; conference with R. Gray, IV re;
exiibits; review J. Turner emails (2); review
=1nail re: testing data; review email re:
experts; email all parties re: trial schedule;
email D. Thompsen and M. Trachtenberg
re: trial scheduling; review A. Brownson
email; review P. Fraissinet email: review
deposition notice for TEA; review W.
Haney report (prior); review B. Leslie work
product; review W. Haney article "the Myth
of the Texas Miracle in Education”; review
J. Turner emails (2); reply to same (2);
review D. Thompson email; email attorneys
re: adequacy issues; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa

Invoice # 41109

$3,120.00

$2,700.00
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06/26/2012

06/26/2012

06/27/2012

06/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

email; review D. Thompson email; review J.
Tumer email; review D. Thompson email;
Review L. Moak email; reply to same;
review J. Tumer email; reply to same;
review J. Tumer email re; R, Scott
deposition; review analysis of STARR test
results; review D. Hinojosa email; review
petition of charter schools; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa email.

Review W. Haney email; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
email team re: Perales deposition; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa email; reply to same; partial
attendance at R. Scott deposition;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: Texas
Workforce Coalition; telephone conference
with T. Hunter re: R. Scott deposition and
witness schedule; work re: exhibit
preparation; conference with R. Gray, 'V, re:
same; conference with R. Gray, IV r¢:
Workforce Coalition contacts and xhibits;
review J. Dietz letter of 6/28; conference
with team re: same; conference with R,
Gray, IV re: exhibits and weight issues.
Review and respond to several emails from
Plaintiffs’ attomeys on various issues;
review emails and 4:tached articles from W.
Pierce; draft ema2il to superintendents re:
deposition preparation and deposition
schedule; review email from Adam re: tech
aspects of video conference and respond;
conference with R. Gray re: B. Leslie report
and.other matters; prepare for Scott
depasition.

Revise and update Superintendent
testimony; conference with counsel re;
same; telephone conference with T. Wolff
re: Yield data; review and update
Superintendent testimony; email counsel re:
same; review emails re: high stakes testing
and school district resolution on same;
review emails re: data formulas; review
emails re: community college expert on the
readiness of students coming in to
community college.

Review email from various superintendents
and respond; review emails from Plaintiff

Invoice # 41109

%85 hrs

3.20 hrs

2.25 hrs

3.30 hrs

$1,732.50

$1,040.00

$393.75

$1,072.50
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06/28/2012

06/28/2012

06/29/2012

06/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

REG

attomeys on teacher expert, seminar for
Judge, charter schools and other matters and
respond; review outline of superintendent
testimony and edit; adjust schedule for
superintendent deposition; conference with
R. Gray re: same; email to superintendents
re: same; prepare for Scott deposition;
conference with W, Pierce and R. Freeman
re: Leslie report and equal protection.
Telephone conference with T. Wolff re:
Yield run data; conference with counsel re;
same; format and print Litigation Requests
018A, 019A, and 020A; meeting with
counsel re: Yield data; conference with
counsel re: Texas Coalition for a
Competitive Workforce; research same;
telephone conference with T. Wolff re:
updated data; format and print updated data;
review letter from Judge Dietz re: trial days
and seminar for the court; conference with
counsel re: Superintendednt testimony;
email legal assistant re: same.

Attend deposition of R. Scott; reviewy
Judge’s letter; conference with Plantiff's
attorneys about same; conference with R.
Gray re: same; edit outlinz of testimony of
superintendents; review emiail from R.
Rhodes and superintendents.

Update Exhibit binders with new data;
telephone confecence with W. Pierce re:
same and exhibit meeting; meeting with
counsel re: case status, trial time, expert
reports, besiness leadership, meeting at
equity center.

Revicw State’s production requests; review
8. Kl'ein email; review email to
superintendents; review M. Trachtenberg
2mails (3); reply to same; review article re:
D. King; review ]. Tumner emails {2); review
S. Dahlberg emails; review D. Hinojosa
email; review email re: 3 presentation
districts; work re: exhibits; conference with
T. Hunter re: completion of R. Scott
deposition; review L. Moak email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D. Hinojosa email; work on exhibits;
conference with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: trial preparation matters, exhibits,
depositions, and trial time; review M.

Invoice # 41109

5.25mrs

8.20 hrs

3.10 hrs

4.90 hrs

$918.75

$2,665.00

$542.50

$2,205.00
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06/29/2012

06/29/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same (2);
review P. Fraissinet email; review emails re;
additional experts; conference with T.
Hunter re: call re: experts; conference call
with Plaintiffs group re: trial time;
conference call with attorneys re: trial time;
conference with T. Hunter re: trial issues.
Review M. Trachtenberg emails (4); reply 4.75 hrs
to same; review Hinojosa emails (3); reply
to same; review material re: charter school
suit; review A, Kauffman email; review
emails re: teacher experts; review J. Tumer
email; conference with T. Hunter re;
depositions; work re: W. Haney expert
designation; review R. Freeman email;
telephone call to B. Hammond - left
message; review A. Kaufman email; reply
to 5. Dahlberg email; review testing data
analysis; review W. Pierce email; review R.
Freeman email; review R. Blincoe email;
conference with T. Hunter re;
Commissioner Scott deposition; review J,
Tumer email; reply to same; revieo, D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trzchienberg
email; reply to same; review D, Hinojosa
email; reply to same; confer=iice with T.
Hunter re: drop out rate; review reports re:
drop out rate; review vroduction material;
telephone conference with D. Thompson re:
status; telephore conference with A.
Kauffman re: W. Haney; conference with T.
Hunter re: sclieduling of depositions;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: experts;
review emails re; community college
witness; review D, Thompson email.
Atiend continuation of R. Scott’s deposition; 8.60 hrs
conference with L. Moak; review emails
form Plaintiff's attomeys and others and
respond; conference with R. Gray re: time
needed to present case and schedule for
superintendents depositions; email to all
superintendents re: deposition preparation
and schedule for depositions; telephone
conference with Plaintiff’s attorneys re:
experts; telephone conference with all
Plaintiff’s attomeys re: time needed to
present case.

Invoice # 41109

$2,137.50

$2,795.00

$93,195.00
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TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG  III Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
LVS von Sternberg, Lynn

Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

10520 hrs @
7440 hrs @
97.00 hrs @
1310 hrs @

0.00 hrs @

289.70

Invoice # 41109

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$47,340.00
$13,020.00
$31,525.00
$ 1,310.00

3 0.00

$93,195.00
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GRAY & BECKER.P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

July 31, 2012

Tax ID No.; 74-2427406
Invoice#: 41271-1 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billing thiough: 07/31/2012

c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

07/01/2012 RGIV  Conference with counsel re; deposition 0.20 hrs $ 35.00

dates; review deposition notices re: same.
07/01/2012 REG Review email re: graduation programs; 3.00 hrs $1,350.00

email R. Gray, IV re: course content fr
same; review M. Trachtenberg emazils;
review D. Thompson emails; review email
discovery; work re: discovery; reply to
emails re: depositions; revicw P. Colbert
email; reply to same; reviews M.
Trachtenberg emails (2} review D.
Hinojosa emails; review witness outlines;
review revised exhivits; review message
from T. Hunter re: TEA depositions; work
on draft lettcs to Judge Dietz,
07/01/2012 TBH Draft lett¢r o Judge re: time estimate; .00 hrs $ 32500
conference with R. Gray re: discovery and
othexmnatters; emails to and from other
Plaintiff attomeys to schedule telephone
conference with Vigdor and Fuller re:
payment to Moak, Casey.
07/02/2012 RGYV)  Update exhibit notebook; update same for 4.55 hrs $ 796.25
Wayne Pierce; meeting at Equity Center
with Wayne Pierce re: database, exhibits,
and case status; review emails re: deposition
dates, and letters to Judge Dietz re: trial day
allotment.
07/02/2012 REG Review D. Hinojosa email; review M. 8.40 hrs $3,780.00
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.
Hunter re: draft letter re: trial time; review
production request; review P. Colbert email;



07/02/2012

07/02/2012

3102-01

5E3

TBH

review and revise draft letter to J. Dietz;
conference with S. Jennings and T. Hunter
re: discovery; review emails re: expert
witnesses; conference with T. Hunter re: R,
Ried changing districts; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; review C.
Diamond email; review 1. Pina email;
review J. Turner email; Review J. Tumer
emails (2); review D. Hinojosa emails;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
S. Dahlberg email; review S. Klein email;
review T. Craven email; conference call
with B. Duncomb and attorneys re: expert
report and analysis; work on superintendent
witness outlines; review P. Fraissinet email;
review J. Tumer email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; review W. Pierce (2)
emails; reply to same (2); review message
from B. Hammond; review C. Enoch lettex
to Court; review State’s letter to Court;
review deposition notices; review J. Curner
email; reply to same; review D, Hirmjosa
email; reply to same; review M
Trachtenberg email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply tc same; review J.
Tumer email re: testing deposition; review
testing deposition notices; finalize letter to
Court; conference with T. Hunter re: B.
Baker call; review: article re: Kansas trial;
telephone cali-io B. Hammond - left
message; cotiference with T. Hunter re: K.
O'Hanlon :zall; review T. Hunter email re:
depositions; telephone conference with B.
Hezmtnond re: testing

£mail Discovery Superintendents re: State 1.25 hrs
Defendants’ RFP; confer with T. Hunter re:
same; email Superintendents deposition
notices.

Telephone conference with R. Reid re: 5.80 hrs
Tyler/Keller; draft contract letter to Haney;
distribute discovery to districts; conference
with R. Gray re: deposition schedule; email
to B. Wood re: deposition coverage and
review response; telephone conference with
B. Duncomb; telephone conference with B.
Baker; conference with R. Gray re:

Invoice # 41271

Wi

$1,885.00

Page2



07/03/2012

07/03/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

telephone conference with B. Baker,
amended petition and other matters; review
state’s designation of district’s and circulate;
revise letter to Judge; email to other
Plaintiff attomeys; review comments and
finalize letter; review letters to Judge from
all parties; email to all Plaintiff attomeys re:
districts for presentations; telephone
conference with L. Halpem re: San Antonio
ISD: telephone conference with R. Rhodes,
left message.

Review emails re: deposition notices and 4.00 hrs
deposition needs; review email re: meeting
with Paul Colbert on July 15 at Equity
Center; conference with counsel re:
discovery; meeting at Equity Center re:
database, exhibits, case status; review
emails re: deposition of Robert Scott,
Discovery Objections and Responses;
conference with counsel and legal assisianit
re: deposition dates, flight, hotel; telénhione
conference (voicemails) with Benti¢ Francis
and Jim Windham re: Texas Coalition for a
Competitive Workforce; update exhibit
book for counsel.

Review and reply to M. Trachtenberg 5.60 hrs
emails (5); review and 1eply to D.
Thompson emails {5); review and reply to P.
Fraissinet emails {4); review and reply to T.
Hunter emails {5); review and reply to W,
Pierce email; review emails re: depositions
{3); reviev P. Fraissinet email re: witnesses:;
conference with W. Pierce and staff re:
daiabase and exhibits; review A. Brownson
email re: focus districts; review D. Hinojosa
email; review L. Lawrence email;
conference with attorneys re: discovery;
review J. Tumer emails (2); review H.
McIntosh email; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; conference with T.
Hunter re: discovery; review additional
production by State; telephone conference
with D. Thompson, J. Tumer and M.
Trachtenberg re: Moak contract and
discovery; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; review L. Moak email; reply

Invoice # 41271

$ 700.00

$2,520.00

Puge }



07/03/2012

07/03/2012

07/03/2012

07/04/2012

07/04/2012

07/05/2012

07/05/2012

3102-01

SEJ

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

RGIV

to same; email re: L. Moak meeting; review
replies; email attorneys re: L. Moak
meeting; review C. Diamond emails (2);
reply to same; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same.

Email Hillsboro ISD, Kaufman ISD, San
Antonio ISD, and Belton ISD
Superintendents re: State Defendants’
Request for Production.

Draft Plaintiffs’ Response to State
Defendants’ First RFP,

Attend meeting at Equity Center re: data
and exhibits; telephone conference with
experts on teachers quality; telephone
conference with A. Tekell general counsel
for Belton re: discovery request; schedule
deposition; email from C. Diamond re:
same; respond to emails from C. Diamond:
begin drafting objections to Defendants
discovery; review State’s focus districts,
emails to and from P. Colbert re: sane;
telephone conference with B. Bakeore:
Intervenor approach; email to Xansas
attomeys re: Podgursky; revievws response.
Meeting with counsel re:(database and
exhibits,

Review D. Thompson email; review A.
Brownson email; review M, Trachtenberg
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review
emails re: B, Baker report (4); work re:
exhibit preparation; work with database.
Telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
re: meaiing on exhibits and database;
meeting with counsel re: database;
vonference with Ellen Boydstun re: Excel;
conference with counsel re; exhibit
completion; telephone conference with
Wayne Pierce re: meeting; conference with
counsel re: discovery; conference with legal
assistant re: same; review State’s First
Request for Production; review emails re:
same with superintendents; email
superintendents re: email address.

Review H. Keller email; review

email; reply to same; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits; conference with R.

Invoice # 41271

0.50 hrs

1.00 irs

6.60 hrs

1.75 hrs

2.25 hrs

2.60 hrs

5.35 hrs

$ 50.00

$100.00

$2,145.00

$ 30625

$1,012.50

$ 455.00

$2,407.50

Page 4



07/05/2012

07/05/2012

3102-01

L Oy

TBH

Gray, IV re: exhibits; review D. Thompson
emails (3); conference with T. Hunter re: H.
Keller call; telephone call to M.
Trachtenberg re: L. Moak call; conference
with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV re: exhibits;
review C. Hammond email; conference with
and T. Hunter re: status and
strategy; review L. Moak email; conference
call re: L. Moak testimony; review D,
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review message from
W. Pierce; telephone call to W. Pierce re:
exhibits and model; review M. Trachtenberg
emails; conference with T, Hunter re;
discovery responses; review article re:
STEM; review D. Thompson email;
conference with T. Hunter re: discovery
responses; Conference with T. Hunter re:
discovery responses; review J. Tumer einail;
review S. Klein email; review J. Pfeifer
email; review R, Luna email; revi¢'s State
letter re: discovery; review M. Trichtenberg
email; review D. Thompson email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same,
Telephone conference with B. Gilcrease re: 0.25 hrs
State’s RFP to Hillshoro ISD; email T.
Hunter re; same; confer with T. Hunter re:
responses to State Defendants’ RFP.
Conferencc with R. Gray re: discovery; 6.20 hrs
telephorie conference with R. Gray, M.
Tracki=aberg and J. Tumer re: Moak
contriact; conference with and
. Gray re: trial strategy and equal
protection; telephone conference with D.
Thompson, M. Trachtenberg, . Turner, L.
Moak, D. Casey, R. Gray re: scope of work
for Moak; telephone conference with H.
Lawrence and H. McIntush re: coordinating
discovery response to State; review emails
from J. Tumer re: experts on testing and
respond; draft objects to State’s discovery
request; several emails to superintendents
re: discovery request of State; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: same,

Invoice # 41271

$ 25.00

$2,015.00

Page 5



07/06/2012

07/06/2012

07/06/2012

07/06/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Review emails re: Rule 11 Agreement; 2.85 hrs
meeting at Equity Center with Ray

Freeman, Charles Aki, and Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits and database; telephone conference
with counsel re: expert report; review emails
re: discovery, mini trial, depositions.
Review D. Thompson email; review A. 2.25 hrs
Brownson email; email T. Hunter re: 7/11
meetings; review L. Moak contract; email
parties re: same; review H. Keller letter;
review H. McIntush email; review D.
Thompson email re: experts; email T.
Hunter re: shared experts; email parties re:
experts; telephone call to D. Hinojosa - left
message; review D. Thompson email;
review J. Turner email; review A. Brownson
email; reply to same; review emails re:
document production; reply to same; review
G. Salazar email re: discovery; review T.
Hunter email re: amended petition and
database; review R. Gray, IV emails re:
database; review B. Wood email; minew
emails re: experts; review R. Freeman
email; review A. Brownson email.

Revise Plaintiffs’ response to State 1.25 hrs
Defendants’ RFP; draft Plaintiffs’
Designation of Exper: Witnesses.

Respond to request from expert re: scope of 4.80 hrs
testimony; telephione conference with B.
Baker re: rebittal; email to D, Hinojosa re:
same; revicw objection to State’s RFP and
circulaté among Plaintiff attomeys;
telepbone conference with L. Halpern, left
message; email to L. Halpem and S.
rahlberg re: various matters; telephone
conference with R. Rhodes, left message;
email to Richard Gray IV re: same; emails
to superintendents re: deposition preparation
and discovery from State; emails to A.
Tekell re: same; telephone conference with
R. Reid re: dropping Tyler; email to S.
Jennings re: same; telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: report and B. Leslie bill;
email to R. Gray re; amending petition;
email to R. Gray outlining trial order; email
to W. Pierce re: thumb nail sketch on

Invoice # 41271

$ 49875

$1,012.50

$125.00

$1,560.00

Page 6



07/07/2012

07/08/2012

07/08/2012
07/09/2012

07/09/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

TBH
RGIV

REG

Calhoun City superintendents and State's
focus district.

Review T. Hunter emails re: mini trial;
review D. Thompson re: same; review J.
Zyskowski email re: same; review B, Wood
email; review T. Hunter reply; review L.
Halpern email; review emails re: database;
review R. Freeman email; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same (2);
review J. Zyskowski email; review J. Turner
email; review S. Dahlberg email; review D.
Hinojosa email; email S. Dahlberg re:
testing analysis.

Review N. Henderson email; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same; begin
preparation for testing depositions; review
email re: L. Dawn Fisher presentation;
review J. Tumer emails (2); review N.
Henderson email; review D. Thompson
emails (2); work on testing depositions.
Review various emails.

Review email from HD Chamberg :
discovery requests to districts; Telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce.re: Focus
Districts for Texas Taxpeyer, MALDEF,
and Fort Bend; confereace with legal
assistant re: same; telephone conference
(voicemail) with counsel re: Superintendent
discovery responzes; email Lacy Lawrence
and Holly Mcatush re: same; review and
reply to emaif from Holly McIntush re:
Responte to Request for Discovery; forward
same to counsel; review State’s Discovery
Responses to Intervenors;, conference with
counsel re; exhibits; forward emails re:
superintendent discovery to counsel; format
and print focus district information;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with legal assistant re:
deposition of superintendents; conference
with counsel re: State’s Responses to our
Discovery.

Review email re: H.D. Chambers; email S.
Jennings re: same; review discovery
responses; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
same; review J. Turner email with

Invoice # 41271

1.25 hrs

1.25 hrs

0.70 hrs
3.30 hrs

3.50 hrs

$ 562.50

$ 56250

$ 22750
$ 577.50

$1,575.00

Prge T



07/09/2012

07/09/2012

07/10/2012

3102-01

SEJ

SEJ

RGIV

attachments; review testing material;
deposition preparation; review D. Hinojosa
email; review D, Thompson email; Review
correspondence re: W. Haney; conference
with R, Gray, IV re: exhibits; review A.
Brownson email; review L. Halpern email;
review N. Henderson correspondence;
telephone call to D. Hinojosa - left message;
review email correspondence to
superintendents; review J. Zyskowski email;
review S. Dahlberg email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review W. Pierce
email; review analysis of focus districts;
review D. Hinojosa email; review M,
Trachtenberg emails (2); reply to same.
Review State Defendants/TEA’s Response 0.25 hrs
to TX Taxpayer & Student Faimess
Coalition Plaintiffs’ First Set of
Interrogatories.

Confer with R. Gray re: MALDEF, Fori 1.30 hrs
Bend, Coalition Plaintiffs’ designaticn of
focus district; review file re: same;
telephone conference with L. Pifia re;
MALDEF's designation; confer with R.
Gray re: same; email W. Pierce re: same;
telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
discovery requests to superintendents;
telephone conference with H.D. Chambers
re: August |5t Geposition; email R. Gray
re: same

Review proosased "Responsive Documents” 4.90 hrs
list; email Holly MclIntush and Lacy
Lawrcnice re: same; forward same to
counsel; review and reply to email from
Lavid Hinojosa re: print documents for
Jeposition; print same and have delivered to
deposition; draft email to discovery
superintendents re: responsive documents;
email same to Angela Tekell; telephone
conference with Toni H. re:same; review
and reply to email from Jerilyn Pfeifer re:
discovery responses; telephone conference
(left message) with Reece Blincoe re:
returned his call; telephone conference with
Reece Blincoe re: discovery; review and
reply to email from Angela Tekell re: Dr.

Invoice # 41271

$ 25.00

M

$ 857.50

Page 8



07/10/2012

07/10/2012

07/10/2012

07/11/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Kincannon as a deponent; conference with

legal assistant re: same; review State's

response to Texas Taxpayer's

Interrogatories.

Review R. Freeman email; reply to same; 9.00 hrs
review J. Wisnowski email; review L.

Halpern email; review R. Freeman email;

review R. Freeman email; reply to same;

attend deposition of Dr. Zyskowski; review

T. Hunter email re: mini trial; review Notice

of Intent to Comply With Protective Order.

Confer with R. Gray re: H.D. Chambers 0.55 hrs
deposition prep; telephone conference with 1.50 hrs
H.D. Chambers' office re: same; review and

print Fort Bend RFP Response re: Pearson

Studies 3-8; telephone conferences with T.

Hunter re: rescheduling superintendents’

depositions; review deposition schedule and

email T. Hunter re: same; draft Belton ISLs

responses to Defendants’ RFP; confer v/ifh

R. Gray re: same; review email from court

reporter re: standing order; review S:ate

Defendants’ responses to RFP; review

emails from court reporter re: depositions

and status.

Review various emails ie; deposition 0.50 hrs
schedule, Tyler I.S.DD., experts and respond.

Status conference with Judge Dietz; meeting 9.05 hrs

at Moak Casey rc: tnial; listen to voicemails
re: superintendznt depositions, counsel
request to caif Karen Garza, Everman video
confererices; conference with legal assistant
re: deposition dates of superintendents;
review and respond to email from Micheal
’rench re: discovery responses; telephone
conference with Los Fresnos re: responding
to discovery; review and reply to email from
HD Chambers re: discovery deadlines;
telephone conference with Charles at Equity
Center re: exhibits; telephone conference
with Ray Freeman re; case status; telephone
conference with Darlene Brouillette from
Pflugerville ISD re: deposition dates for
Charles Dupree and Video conference
setup; email Karen Garza re; changing the
time of her deposition; reply to email from

Invoice # 41271

$4,050.00

$ 55.00
N/C

$ 16250

$1,583.75

Page 9



07/11/2012

07/11/2012

07/11/2012

07/12/2012

07/12/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

REG

8):}

Holly McIntush re: district questions on
responding to discovery; review and reply to
email from HD Chambers and all discovery
superintendents re: information the State has
access to and forms of responsive
documents; read and review West Orange
Cove I

Prepare for 7/11 hearing; attend 7/11 status
conference; conference with Plaintiffs’
attorneys re: trial strategy and presentation;
review T. Hunter email; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review S. Murdoch presentation;
review J. Stone presentation; conference
with S. Jennings re: H.D. Chambers call.
Review email from T. Hunter re: charter
districts; email T. Robertson re: same;
telephone conference with H.D. Chamber:
office re: depo prep; email R. Gray re: saine.
Review voice messages (5) from various
ISD personnel; email to T. Hunter“with
synopsis of each message with'copy to S.
Jennings, R. Gray and R. Gray, IV,

Review D. Thompson emiails; reply to same;
review M. Trachtenberz emails; reply to
same; review D. Hincicsa emails; reply to
same; review P, Fratssinet email; reply to
same; telephone conferences with W. Pierce
re: report statuc and report issues; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review M. Carr email;
reply to same; review M. Trachtenberg
email; teview J. Vigdor email; review
suupiemental discovery responses; review
data from focus districts; complete review
of West Orange opinion; review J.
Wisnowski email; reply to same.

Review voice messages (2) from L. Massey,
Everman ISD, re: video conference; review
message from G. Salazar re: deposition;
telephone conference with Debbie, H.D.
Chambers’ office, re: deposition preparation
and deposition; review email re: HD,
Chambers’ deposition prep., Pflugerville
ISD questions re: production requests, G.
Salazar deposition prep., San Antonio ISD

Invoice # 41271

7.80 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.25 hrs

3.00 hrs

2.45 hrs

$3,510.00

NiC

Ni/C

$1,350.00

NI

Page 10



07/13/2012 RGIV

07/13/2012 RGIV

07/13/2012 SEJ

07/14/2012 REG

07/15/2012 RGIV

3102-01

questions re: production requests, L.

Massey, Everman ISD, questions re: video

conferencing; confer with R, Gray re:

discovery; email W, Pierce re: same; email

R. Gray, IV re: consolidation of charter

schools; confer with R. Gray re: same.

Read and review West Orange Cove II; 1.55 hrs
review and reply to email from Karen Garza

re: rescheduling of her deposition and

meeting to prepare; review and reply to text

message from legal assistant re: video

conference with superintendents; review

email from Lonnie Massey re: same;

telephone conference with legal assistant re:

same; review and reply to email from Reece

Blincoe re: discovery responses; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: exhibits.

Legal research re: student graduation 4.20 hrs
requirements; telephone conference with

Phillip Marzec re: discovery and

depositions; telephone conference with

Gonzalo Salazar re: depositions; t¢fephone

conference (voicemail) for Daiin Hathcock

re: discovery; conference with legal

assistant re: follow up with lLonnie Massey

re: video conference; online research re:

James Kallison; conference with legal

assistant re: depositinns on the 25th and

26th in Dallas; cenference with counsel re;

James Kalliscn: review Recommended High

School Graawation requirements and

Distinguished High School Graduation

requiiztaents and compare; meeting with

Claries Aki at the Equity Center re:

uailabase exhibits.

Telephone call to L. Massey, Everman ISD, 0.30 hrs
re: video conference (left message); email

R. Gray, IV re: same; review State

Defendants’ Third Supplemental Response

to Ft. Bend RFP.

Review of caselaw; review material on K. 2.25 hrs
Kallison, review curriculum material for

recommended program/advanced program.

Format and print new exhibits; conference 8.00 hrs
with counsel re: same; meeting at equity

center with R. Gray III, Wayne Pierce, and

Invoice # 41271

$ 271.25

$ 735.00

NiC

$1,012.50

$1,400.00

Page 11



07/15/2012

07/15/2012

07/16/2012

07/16/2012

07/16/2012

3102-01

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

Paul Colbert re: same; review notes from

meeting.

Conference with W. Pierce, P. Colbert, and 375 hrs
R. Gray, IV re: status, strategy, and exhibits.

Review various emails re: State's RFP; 0.50 hrs

deposition perpetration and schedules;
meeting of all attorneys re: trial
presentations and respond.

Review and respond to emails from various 5.80 hr=
superintendents and plaintiff's counsel re:
deposition dates and scheduling for
preparation and discovery responses;
telephone conference with Todd Williams at
Kaufman ISD re: discovery responses;
review emails from Karen Garza and Reece
Blincoe re: same and depositions; meeting
at equity center re: exhibits.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to 3.60 hrs
same; review D. Thompson email; review
D. Hinojosa emails (2); email T. Hunter r¢:
same; review Calhoun ISD’s Interrogatories
to the State; work re: exhibits; revicw M.
Trachtenberg email reply to same; review S.
Dahlberg email; forward to 2xperts; review
additional deposition notices; review D,
Thompson email; confzrance with P.
Colbert, W. Pierce, atd R. Freeman re:
expert reports; review Moak Casey memo;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review email re:
depositior; review W, Pierce email; email
D. Thomnson re: TASB letter; review
ameraisd TEA deposition notices (2);
review L. Halpern email; reply to same.
reiephone conference with M Carr re: status 2.65 hrs
of matters; work re: exhibits; review emails;
email J. Turner re: J. Twining deposition;
review J. Turner reply; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: consulting experts; review T.
Roberts email; review J. Wisnowski email;
review I. Turner emails (2); reply to same
(2); review J, Turner email; reply to same;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review J. Tumer email;
review material re: J. Kallison; telephone
conference with J. Tumer re: J. Twining

Invoice # 41271

$1,687.50

$ 16250

$1,015.00

$1,620.00

$1,192.50

Page 12



07/16/2012

07/16/2012

07/17/2012

07/17/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

REG

deposition and additional depositions;
review J. Wisnowski email; email T. Hunter
re: same; email W. Pierce re: J. Wisnowski:
review W, Pierce reply; email J. Wisnowski
re: presentation.

Prepare and serve Amended Deposition
Notice - Karen Garza, Lubbock ISD; revise
and serve letter to counsel re; Tyler ISD;
confer with T. Hunter re: same: review
email from L. Halpem re: same; review
email from L. Lawrence cancelling July
25th and 26th depositions in Dallas; email
R. Gray re; H.D. Chambers deposition
preparation date; review email re: Charles
Dupre’s deposition preparation date; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: State’s document
production; review documents produced.
Conference with R. Gray, IV re: Protective
Order; conference with S. Jennings re;
same; telephone conference with W. Pierce
re: timing of meeting today.

Telephone conference with Tim. V/0lff re:
Revenue Seeking Runs; review ernail from
Adam Pierce re: superintendent conference;
forward same to counsel; conference with
counsel re: same; teleptinne conference with
Charles Aki re: database update; telephone
conference with Paw) Colbert re: State’s
Response to our Nequest for Production;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
telephone conference (voicemail) with
Presiderit Rhodes at ACC re: student
readioess for college; conference with
couansel re: expert reports; email Wayne
rierce, Ray Freeman, and Paul Colbert re;
same; review and reply to email from legal
assistant re: Los Fresnos discovery.

Review J. Turner email with attachment;
review D. Thompson email; review
information on focus districts; work on
amended petition; review A. Pierce email
re: 7/20 meeting; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: same; review R. Freeman email;
email attomeys re: J. Walch records; review
D. Thompson email; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; email clients re:

Invoice # 41271

2,25 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.35 hrs

3.10 hrs

$225.00

MIC

$ 236.25

$1,395.00

Page 13



07/17/2012

071712012

07/18/2012

07/18/2012

3102-01

SEJ

LVS

RGIV

REG

schools explorer; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review
focus district information; review W. Pierce
email; review emails re: video conference;
review subpoena for Walch Educational
Consultants; email W. Pierce re: same;
conference with R. Gray re: P. Colbert call
and discovery; telephone call to J. Walch -
left messages (2); conference with R. Gray,
IV re: exhibit status; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
telephone conference with J. Walch re:
subpoena; email J. Walch re: same; review
email re: expert report; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: W. Pierce and R. Freeman
reports.

Review email from S. Dahlberg re: Pearson
confidential documents; telephone
conference with A. Pierce re: video
conference; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review email from court reporter; telcohone
conference with Minerva, Los Fresuos ISD,
re: documents for production; cmail T.
Hunter re: R. Scott deposition transcript.
Review T. Hunter voice tnessages; email to
Hunter re: same; email in R. Gray re:
O'Hanlon call.

Review email from #ID Chambers re: Harris
County Superintendents meeting; forward
same to counss!; meeting with Ray Freeman
re: Expert Report; email counsel re: same;
telephor= conference with Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits and data; telephone conference with
Charies Aki re: same; telephone conference
with Paul Colbert re: data; format and print
zxhibits.

Review L. Lawrence email; review M.
Trachtenberg emails; review D. Thompson
emails; review D. Hinojosa emails; reply to
same; review H.D. Chambers email; reply to
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same; conference with S. Jennings re:
class size information; review D. Hinojosa
email; reply to same; review message from
R. Freeman; work on document production
from Los Fresnos; review R. Freeman start

Invoice # 41271

1.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

6.55 hrs

3.80 hrs

N

NIC

$1,146.25

$1,710.00

Page 14



07/18/2012

07/18/2012

07/19/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

of report; telephone call to R. Freeman re:
report; review C. Nickell email; reply to
same; telephone conference with C. Madrid
at Rep. Fischer's office; conference with S.
Jennings re: class size information; review
D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with S. Jennings re: information
to Rep. Fischer; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: exhibits; work on amended petition;
work re: preparation of superintendent
testimony; review Dr. Dupre email; review
H.D. Chambers emails (2); reply to same
(2); review H.D. Chambers email; reply to
same; review emails re: class size data;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review message from B. Schulman;
telephone call to B. Schulman and J. Hoffer
re: background, charters, and consolidation;
Telephone conference with Minerva, Los 2.50 hrs
Fresnos ISD, re: document production;
confer with R. Gray re: same; confer'with R,
Gray re: email to Focus Districts 120 Prof.
Schanzenbach; email Focus Districts re:
documents for Prof. Schanzeabach review;
telephone conference with C. Nickell re:
request from Rep. Fischier for pleadings;
confer with R. Gray re: same; confer with R.
Gray re: sending pi¢adings to Rep. Martinez
Fischer, email C. Madrid re: same; review
and return email from J. Knight re: materials
for deposition; review and return email from
S. Kincannon re: Prof. Schanzenbach
regusst for data; review and return email
fram C. Dupre re: same; email T. Hunter re:
R. Scott deposition transcript; review
correspondence from S. Dahlberg re:
clarification of documents produced
responsive to Ft. Bend ISD’s RFP; review
email from R. Gray re: census reports;
review same; confer with R. Gray re: same.

Review various email re: expert reports; 0.50 hrs
class size data; conference with

superintendents and respond.

Format and print all data exhibits; telephone 7.95 hrs

conference with multiple superintendents re:
discovery; meeting with Wayne Pierce and

Invoice # 41271

MNAC

$ 162.50

$1,391.25
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07/19/2012

07/19/2012

07/19/2012

07/20/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Ray Freeman re: exhibits.

Email D. Hinojosa re: depositions; review 3.65 hrs
D. Hinojosa response; review P. Fraissinet
emails (2); reply to same; review K. Garza
email; conference with S. Jennings re: same;
review J. Knight report; review Fraissinet
email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Thompson
emails (2); conference with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review supplemental discovery
responses from State; review class size
information from Quinlan ISD; conference
with S. Jennings re: same; review emails re:
interlocutory appeal and stay; reply to same;
email correspondence with D. Hinojosa re:
same; review PBS story re: Pharr-San Juan,
complete preparation for video conference

with superintendents.
Telephone conference with T. Wallis, Bryan 2.50 hrs
ISD, re: RFP; telephone conferences (2) 2.50 hrs

with M. Sisler re: index of State’s
documents produced; confer with & Gray,
IV re: same; email P. Colbert canie; confer
with R. Gray re: documents received from
school districts for Prof. Dizne
Schanzenbach's review; email D. Hinojosa
documents from Quinlan ISD; review email
from D. Hinojosa 1¢" same; review and
return email fron:. T. Hunter re: discovery
responses; reviaw and organize State
Defendantz’ documents produced; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: production index;
telepi:nne conferences with M. Sisler re:
same, email P. Colbert re; same; review
cemail from P. Colbert; review email from
Lufkin ISD re: status of discovery
responses.

Review various emails re: class size data; 1.00 hrs
Fuller contract; discovery from and to the
State and respond; review R. Freeman
report and W. Pierce report; email to R.
Blincoe re: report; email to J. Knight re;
report; review email from Van re: facilities
and email from Everman re: variety of
issues.

Format, print, and bind all exhibits; 7.10 hrs

Invoice # 41271

$1,642.50

$250.00
N/C

$ 325.00

$1,242.50

Page 16



07/20/2012

07/20/2012

07/20/2012

3102-01

REG

SE)

TBH

conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Charles Aki and Wayne
Pierce at the Equity Center re: same.
Review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; 3.75 hrs
review Efficiency Intervenors’ response to
jurisdiction plea; conference with T. Hunter
re: status and 7/20 meetings; review W.
Henry email; email attorneys re: plea status;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review emails re: conference call;
conference call with Superintendents re:
testimony; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; video conference with T. Hunter
re: B. Baker, W. Pierce, and R. Freeman re:
expert report; conference with R. Gray, IV
re: data to B. Baker; REVIEW Edgewood’s
supplemental brief;, work on amending
petition; review M. Trachtenberg email,
review amicus of TCTA.

Review email from T. Hunter re: July Z4ti 2.00 hrs
hearing and litigation calendar, reviscd 2.50 hrs
deposition schedule; review emailsye: three
districts chosen to provide data for Prof.
Schanzenbach’s review; review and return
email from T. Hunter re: data for Prof.
Schanzenbach’s review; review and return
email from T. Hunter re: superintendent
depositions, summary of testimony;
telephone conference with M. Sisler re:
discovery indc:; work on Second Amended
Petition; conier with T. Hunter re: status of
various imatters; emails (3) to Prof,
Schaozenbach re: data from several school
disiricts; telephone conferences with M.
3isler, AG’s office, re: discovery index;
confer with T. Hunter re: requests for data
from appraisal districts; confer with T.
Hunter re: recent discovery responses
received from the State Defendants.
Conference with R. Gray re: meetings with 5.30 hrs
superintendents; attend telephone
conference with superintendents and Equity
Center; send summary of testimony and
Interviews pleadings to superintendents;
amend petition; emails to R. Blincoe and G.
Salazar re: expert report; review J. Knight's

Invoice # 41271

$1,687.50

$200.00
N/C

$1,722.50
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07/21/2012

07/22/2012

07/23/2012

07/23/2012

07/23/2012

3102-01

RGIV

RGIV

SRS

report and send comments; review
Edgewood’s Plea to Jurisdicton; review
Intervenor’s response; attend telephone
conference with B. Badar re: report; work
on re-scheduling depositions; telephone
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys re:
designation of common experts.

Format and print Revenue Seeking Runs
and Weight Change Runs; deliver binders to
counsel.

Review West Orange II; email T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: proof issues; review
data re: census; review data on focus
districts; work on exhibits.

Conference with counsel and legal assistant
re: discovery responses; telephone
conference with Loraine Cline at Bryan ISD
re: same; save email discovery responses to
Bryan ISD on pdrive; review discovery
response forms from Los Fresnos, Lufkin;,
and Bryan ISD; meeting with Barringei
copying service re: copying and bitcs
labeling responsive documents; d:aft email
to Bruce Baker re: testing data,

Review T. Hunter emails(3); review J.
Turner email; review D, Hinojosa email;
reply to same; review T. Hunter emails (3);
review J. Turner errzils (2); review L. Moak
email; review D. Hinojosa email; review P.
Fraissinet (2); veview TSTA Amicus;
review deposition notice for J. Pfeifer, R.
Blincoe; (5. Salazar, Mr. French, J. Witte.
Confzrence with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re; discovery responses; revise and serve
ueposition notices; review and return email
from 1. Pina re; same; review email from T.
Hunter re: TSTA Amicus brief; telephone
conference with K. O'Hanlon re; same;
review and return email from Everman ISD
re: 14 boxes of production; confer with R.
Gray re: same;, confer with T. Hunter re:
letters to appraisal districts; research contact
information for each district; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: signed
Acknowledgements re: confidential
documents; review email from W. Pierce re:

Invoice # 4127]

1.00 hrs

2:25 hrs

245 hrs

1.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

$ 175.00

$1,012.50

$ 42875

$ 675.00

N/C

Page 18



07/23/2012

07/24/2012

077242012

07/24/2012

3102-1

RGIV

REG

SEJ

same; confer with attomeys re: advantages
of creating an FTP site for document
production; confer with T. Hunter re:
preparing K. Garza for deposition; review
email from R. Freeman re: appraisal
districts, review email from P. Colbert re:
production index.

Conference with Richard Gray III and S.
Jennings re: organization of discovery
responses; telephone conference with B.
Leslie re: fees and progress on report; email
to W. Pierce re: amended petition;
conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman
re: their reports; review additional
objections to discovery requests, amend
deposition notices for 5 superintendents;
review emails from Richard Gray IV re:
various matters and respond; email to D.
Hinojosa re: Plea to Juris; several emails to
R. Gray re: same; review response;
telephone conference with K. O’Hanlon re:
amicus brief; email to W. Henry ré: dropout
rates.

Review emails from Bryan JSD re:
responsive discovery documents; meeting
with Everman Superinicndent re: responsive
discovery documents; telephone conference
with Todd William¢ at Kaufman re: same;
telephone conference with Debra Crosby re:
same; confercnce with legal assistant re:
same; downicad responsive documents for
Quinlan(SD from dropbox; conference with
couns2ire: same and plea to the jurisdiction
hearmg.

Review J. Tumer email; review D. Hinojosa
emails (2); review L. Pina emails (2); review
S. Rosen email; review T. Hunter emails
(2); review S. Dahlberg email; review
Motion to Consolidate; telephone
conference with T. Hunter re: expert
reports; review L. Lacy email; review
engagement letter from Dr. Klein; telephone
conference with T. Hunter re: jurisdiction
hearing status; work re: exhibits.

Review voice message from Supt. K. Garza
re: document production; revise, finalize,

Invoice # 41271

4.80 hrs

2.35 hrs

2,50 hrs

5.00 hrs
2.05 hrs

$1,560.00

$ 41125

$1,125.00

$500.00
N/C
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07/24/2012

07/25/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

and email letters to appraisal districts;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; telephone
conferences with document services re: bids
on production; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; telephone call to K. Garza - left
message; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
production from Lufkin, Los Fresos, Bryan,
Everman, and Quinlan ISD’s; review email
from Nueces County Appraisal District;
review email from Pecos County Appraisal
District; email R. Freeman re: same; work
on written responses to RFP’s; review email
from Harridge County Appraisal District;
review email from Harrison County
Appraisal District; telephone conference
with R. Freeman re: same; email Harrison
County re; same; review email from K.
Morgan, Wheeler CAD re: records for R.
Freeman report; review email from Gaines
CAD re: fee for data; prepare letters and
checks to Harrison Central Appraisal
District and Gaines County Appraisal
District re: data request for R. Sreeman;
email J. Sheehan re: Lubbock ISD
production of documents: work re:
responses to RFP’s; confer with T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: same; review email
from I. Pina re: deposition schedule; review
email from Quinian ISD re: removing
names from production; confer with T.
Hunter re; came; email Quinlan ISD re:
same.

Telephone conference with Plaintiff's 3.10 hrs
attorney re: plea to jurisdiction and hearing
on same; review emails from I. Pina and D.
Hinojosa re: same; telephone conference
with W. Haney re: report; review and sign
letters to appraisal districts; telephone
conference with 3 appraisers re: letter;
review W. Pierce’s report; draft response of
Anton to RFP; telephone conference with
W. Pierce re: Anton.

Review emails from Loraine Cline from 2.00 hrs
Bryan ISD re: discovery responses; save
same to server; review proposed Motion to
Consolidate the Flores Plaintiff's; review

Invoice # 41271

$1,007.50

$ 350.00
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07/25/2012

07/25/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

mail from Hillsboro and Pflugerville ISD re:
discovery responses; conference with legal
assistant re: same; telephone conference
with Debra Crosby re: responsive
documents; review and reply to email from
counsel re: meeting time and expert reports;
review email from Debra Crosby re: student
name redacted data; conference with legal
assistant re: same; conference with counsel
re: formal responses to State’s Request for
Production; conference with legal assistant
re: same; email discovery superintendents
re: same; review and reply to email from
Alicia Gonzales from Bryan ISD re: same;
review and reply to email from HD
Chambers re: when he will testify;
conference with legal assistant re: formal
responses to the State’s Request for
Production.

Review J. Turner email; review T. Huriel 1.15 hrs
emails (2); review P. Fraissinet email:
review L. Moak email; reply to sa=;
review T. Hunter emails (3) re: expert
reports; reply to same; review emails re:
7/29 working meeting; reply to same;
review J. Wisnowski emwail.

Review email from Houston CAD; email T. 4.50 hrs
Hunter re: same; re'zew and return email 1.25 hrs
from Alief ISD re: encrypted data; review
text from Alicf ISD re: password; forward
data to Professor Schanzenbach; telephone
call to Frofessor Schanzenbach re: password
for evctypted data; review and return email
from Prof. Schanzenbach; text password to
rrof. Schanzenbach; email T. Hunter re:
Houston CAD data response; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: status of districts’ discovery
responses; email court reporter re: amended
deposition notices (7); review and return
email from court reporter re: H.D.
Chambers deposition status; review and
reply to C. Woods email re: DVD of
documents; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; email 1. Pina re: deposition schedule;
review email from I. Pina re: B. Wiggins
postponement; confer with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 41271

$ 517.50

$450.00
N/C
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0772572012

07/26/2012

071262012

07/26/2012

07/26/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

same; review email from T. Hunter re;
Anton ISD response; review and revise
response; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same.
Review Moak Casey report and comment;
finalize Anton response to RFP; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: same; conference
with R. Freeman re; Itasca and B. Leslie
bill; telephone conference with B. Leslie re:
bill and report; review emails from several
appraisal districts and respond: telephone
conference with several appraisal districts;
review email from D. Young and respond;
begin drafting designation of experts;
conference with R. Gray re: various matters.
Conference with legal assistant re:
discovery responses; review and reply to
email from Jerilyn Pfeifer and Joddie Witte
re: same; review skeleton responses; review
and finalize Discovery Responses for
Quinlan ISD and Lubbock ISD; conference
with counsel re: same; meeting with Reece
Blincoe re: Brownwood discovery
responses.

Review L. Pina email; review: Motice to
Comply with Protective Orcer; review J.
Tumer email; review IV Hinojosa email;
reply to T. Hunter; review J. Tumer email;
review P. Fraissire( ¢mail; review D.
Thompson emails (3); review J. Turner
emails (2); review D. Hinojosa emails (2);
review T.ilunter emails (5); review C.
Diamond zmail; reply to all; review I.
Tumes emails (3) re: Vigdor/Fuller report.
Reiview email from J, Knight re: responsive
documents; email T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: discovery districts; confer with R. Gray,
IV re: documents received from districts
responsive to the State Defendants’ RFP’s;
review email re: Pflugerville documents;
review Everman ISD documents; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: status.

Review report from J. Knight; meet with R.
Blincoe and review report; add to expert
designations begin review of emails from
M. French and J. Pfiefer and respond;
review emails from D. Thompson and

Invoice # 41271

490 hrs

4.75 hrs

2.00 hrs

4.15 hrs
2.00 hrs

6.40 hrs

$1,592.50

$ 831.25

$ 900.00

$415.00
N/C

$2,080.00
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07/27/2012

07/27/2012

0772712012

07/27/12012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

others re: expert extension; telephone

conference with all Plaintiff attomeys re:

same; conference with Richard Gray IV re:

discovery responses; review deposition

notices for Humble, Belton, Edgewood and

Aldine; email to S, Dalhberg re: same.

Formally Respond to State’s Request for 4.50 hrs
Discovery to Brownwood ISD; conference

with legal assistant re: same; review and

reply to email from Reece Blincoe re: same;

formally respond for Everman ISD.

Review J. Tumer emails (6); review P. 1.50 hrs
Fraissinett emails (5); review T. Hunter

emails (5); review D. Hinojosa emails (2);

review M. Sisler emails (5); review S.

Dahlberg emails (3); review D. Thompson

emails (3); review C. Diamond email; reply

to above emails.

Review email from T. Hunter re: Ft. Bend 3.50 hrs
Third Amended Petition; review email ftom 3.00 hrs
T. Hunter re: Belton ISD deposition 1otice;

review email from M. Sisler re: adgjtional

deposition notices; email T. Heufzr re: four

additional deposition notices from the State

Defendants; review emai’ from T. Hunter

re: same; email supeririendents re: same;

review and revise deposition schedule and

calendars; efile andcerve Plaintiffs’ Second

Amended Original Petition; review

documents picduced by Belton ISD; confer

with R. Gray; IV re: same; review email

from M. Sisler re: deposition notice for

Weatiieiford ISD; review email from M.

Sisier re: Walch Educational Consulting;

review email from Ellis CAD re: data for

Freeman report; review email from S.

Dahlberg re: FTP site; review and confirm

deposition schedule.

Review emails from R. Gray and respond; 4.00 hrs
email to B. Wood re: telephone conference

and review response; telephone conference

with W. Pierce re: data from J. Wisnowski;

review several ernails re: extending

deadlines; review report of B. Leslie and

email B. Leslie re: same; email and

telephone conference with W. Pierce re:

Invoice # 41271

$ 787.50

$ 675.00

$350.00
N/C

$1,300.00
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07/28/2012

07/29/2012

07/29/2012

07/29/2012

07/30/2012

07/30/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

checking B. Leslie’s data; begin preparing
for K. Garza'a deposition; conference with
P. Colbert re: his report; review P. Colbert’s
report; file Amended Petition; review
proposed Rulel]l Agreement on extending
deadlines and comment; email to Plaintiff
attorneys re: same; review letter to other
districts Notice by State; email to G. Salazar
TE: FEpOIi; Teview response; request
supporting information from Equity Center;
conference with Richard Gray IV re:
discovery responses.

Review TSTA brief in support of Motion to 3.50 hrs
Dismiss; review R. Colbert draft report;
review B. Baker report; review B. Lesley

report.

Review Justice Brister’s dissent; meeting. 3.00 hrs
with counsel re: same and case strategy.

Conference with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV 2.75 hrs

re: status of depositions and discovery; wurk
re: deposition preparation; conference with
T. Hunter and K. Garza re: deposition

preparation.

Prepare for Garza deposition: meet with K. 3.00 hrs
Garza in preparation for lierdeposition.

Review and reply to email from 7.80 hrs

superintendents re: discovery responses;
formally respond to)kequest for Production
to Alief ISD; email superintendents re:
extracurricular activities; conference with
counsel re;-same; conference with legal
assistan{.r: discovery responses and status;
formal'y respond to Request for Production
to Ptiugerville ISD; telephone conference
with Ray Freeman re: Buck Gilcrease
deposition and issues; telephone conference
with Todd Williams re: his deposition;
review all discovery disks from Advanced
Discovery; conference with legal assistant
re: same; email Ray Freeman re: open
records request on weights; email Todd
Williams and Buck Gilcrease re:
depositions; email Shelly Dahlberg re: fip
site; conference with counsel re: same.
Review deposition notices; review J. Walch 9.30 hrs
subpoena; conference with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 41271

$1,575.00

$ 525.00

$1,237.50

$ 975.00

$1,365.00

$4,185.00
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07/30/2012

07/30/2012

3102-01

SEJ

TBH

deposition; conference with T. Hunter re:
review of reports; attend K. Garza
.deposition; prepare for meeting with R.
Knight; review amended plea to the
jurisdiction; review Ft. Bend Third
Amended Petition; review amended
pleadings; review subpoena for J. Walch;
review deposition notices (4); review Rule
11 agreement; review Moak Casey report re:
weights and facilities; review Vigdor draft
report; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
discovery; prepare R. Knight for deposition;
review D. Thompson email; review R.
Blincoe email; review M. Sisler emails (2);
review draft disclosure requests; review S.
Dahlberg email; reply to same; review D.
Thompson email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review J. Turner email; review C. Wooten
email; review State’s supplemental
discovery responses; review message frotii

J. Witte.
Review email re: status of documernt 4.00 hrs
production; confer with R. Gray, IV re: 3.15 hrs

same; confer with T. Hunter re: letter to
Judge Dietz and partial désiznation of
experts; draft letter and designation; confer
with T. Hunter re: saine; finalize and fax
letter to Judge Dietr; review email from T.
Hunter re: G. Saiazar; telephone conference
with B. Gilcra:se re: deposition; email T.
Hunter re; saine; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
same; review email from M. Sisler re:
Edgev:tod production and Intervenors
production; review emails re: State
efendants’ initial disclosures; review ernail
from S. Dahlberg re: same; review email
from Hutchison CAD re: response to request
for data for Freeman report; review email
from T. Hunter re: T. Wallis depo prep.;
continue work re: document production.
Conference with R. Gray re: Garza 10.00 hrs
deposition; conference with K. Garza re:
same; attend deposition of K. Garza;
conference with P. Fraissinet and M. Bone
re: deposition; brief R. Gray on State and
Intervenor approach; draft letter to Judge re:

Invoice # 41271

$400.00
N/C

$3,250.00
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07/31/2012

07/31/2012

07/31/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SE3

experts; review various emails and respond;
review report of G. Salazar; emails to W.
Pierce re: checking numbers in B. Leslie’s
report; conference with S. Jennings re:
various matters.

Formally Respond to the State’s Request for 9.05 hrs
Production to Lufkin ISD, Hillsboro ISD,
and Van ISD, Los Fresnos ISD, Belton ISD;
review and reply to emails from Belton ISD
and Bryan ISD re: responses; conference
with counsel and legal assistant re: all;
conference with counsel re: deposition dates
and covering of depositions; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: case status;
review and reply to email from Alicia
Gonzales re: discovery responses; print
same; conference with legal assistant re:
same; conference with counsel re:
depositions; email counsel re: same.

Attend R. Knight deposition; review eraaiis 10.75 hrs
re: Rule 1] agreement; review letterio J.
Dietz; conference with T. Hunter &) same;
review D. Thompson emails (Z); review L.,
Lacy email; review J. Tumer emails (2);
reply to D. Hinojosa ematl; review C.
Diamond email: review disclosure
responses; review emuauis re: depositions;
review S. Dahlberg email; prepare T. Wallis
for deposition testimony; outline T. Wallis
deposition testimony.

Confer with T'. Hunter re: rescheduling R. 2.00 hrs
Blincoe, rzview email to R, Blincoe re: 5.25 hrs
same;=inail attorneys re: same; email court
reporier re: status; review email from court
reporter re: same; review email re; Fort
Bend ISD experts; review email re:
depositions being covered by B. Wood;
telephone conferences (3) with G. Salazar
re: depo prep.; email T. Hunter re: same;
review email from T. Hunter re: same; email
G. Salazar re: same: revise and finalize
Plaintiffs’ Partial Designation of Experts;
serve attorneys re: same; continue work re:
revisions to responses to RFP; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: same; review email from G.
Salazar re: responses; review email to Dr.

Invoice # 41271

$1,583.75

$4,837.50

$200.00
N/C
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07/31/2012

3102-01

TBH

Gilcrease re; deposition prep.; telephone
conference with S. Perez, San Antonio ISD,
re: discovery responses; email T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV re: same; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; email attorneys re: letter
to Judge Dietz re: P. Colbert; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: objections; email T. Hunter re:
same; review email from T. Hunter re:
same; review email from S. Dahlberg re:
partial designation, deposition schedule;
review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental response to Edgewood; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
response to Ft. Bend; review email from M.
Sisler re: supplemental response to
Coalition Plaintiffs' RFP; review email from
S. Dahlberg re: Kaufman extension to
respond to RFP; confer with R, Gray, IV re:
same; review email from L. Lawrence re:
postponing B. Wiggins deposition; corier
with T. Hunter re: deposition scheduils;
review and revise calendar and scl:gdule re:
same; review email re; Belton IS))
preparation for deposition; review email
from T. Hunter re; status(of discovery
responses; review emaii and letter from S.
Hemandez re: FTP siie; review email from
T. Hunter re: T. Wilhiams and B. Gilcrease
depositions; revicw email from T. Hunter
re: status of vrvduction from Bryan ISD;
email attcineys re: status of discovery
1eSponses)

Conference with R. Gray and R. Knight re: 7.50 hrs
R.Knight's deposition; telephone
conference with Superintendent Gilcrease
re: deposition; telephone conference with
Superintendent Williams re: deposition;
email to Superintendent Fincannon and A.
Tekell re: deposition; email to Williams,
Kincannon and Gilcrease with attachments
re: depositions; email to all superintendent
re: State’s questions on deposition; review
email from State re: canceling deposition of
Blincoe, J. Knight and G. Salazar; respond
to same; several telephone conferences and
emails to G. Salazar re: his report; finalize

Invoice # 41271

$2,437.50
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TINMEKELPER RECAP

partial designation of experts; conference
with Richard Gray IV re: discovery; several
emails with Plaintiff attorneys on extension
of expert reports; conference with R. Gray
and T. Wallis in preparation for T. Wallis’s
deposition; schedule deposition coverage;
draft letter to Judge re: P. Colbert; email to
R. Blincoe re: cancelling his deposition;
conference with B. Wood re: deposition
coverage; telephone conference with Larry
at San Antonio 1.5.D. re: discovery
responses; telephone conference with
Kaufman 1.S.D. re: discovery responses.

REG IIT, Richard E. Gray Partner 116.40 hrs @
RGIV Gy, IV, Richard E. 11260 hrs @
TBH Hunter, Toni Partner 76.60 hrs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 3370 hrs @
LVS von Stemberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 339.30

3102-01 Invoice # 41271

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$100,350.00

$52,380.00
$19,705.00
$24,895.00
$ 3,370.00

$ 0.00

$100,350.00
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

August 31, 2012

Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition
c/o Equity Center

1202 Colorado, Suite 300

Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

08/01/2012 RGIV  Organize Discovery Responses; conference
with counsel and legal assistant re: same,
formaily respond to discovery sent to Fryan
ISD and San Antonio ISD; telephone
conference with Loraine Cline at Bcyan ISD
re: responses; review and reply.to email
from Angela Tekell re: Belton Supplemental
documents; conference with iegal assistant
re: same,

08/01/2012 REG Review email re: discovery; review H.
MclIntush email re: Giscovery; review L.
Lacy email re: discovery; review discovery
responses; prezent T. Wallis for deposition;
work re: discovery; review C. Diamond
email; cenference with C. Diamond re:
same; work re: discovery; review J,
Wisaowski part of presentation; review
discovery responses, review A. Rolle report
{vartial); review W. Pierce draft report.

08/01/2012 SEJ Confer with R. Gray, IV re: documents
produced by Bryan ISD; prepare and
forward same to S. Dahlberg and all
counsel; review email from R. Gray re:
current draft of W. Pierce report; review
email from T. Hunter re: service of
documents on counsel; finalize and serve all
District responses to State’s RFP.

08/01/2012 TBH Coordinate discovery response; email to W.
Haney re: report; email to J. Knight and H.
Keller re: summary of testimony; review

Tax ID No.:
Invoice#: 1573-1
Qur filed: 3102
Bill:az through:

3.15 hrs

5.65 hrs

5.25 hrs

9.00 hrs

74-2427406
REG

00001
08/31/2012

$551.25

$2,542.50

NAC

$2,925.00



08/02/2012

08/02/2012

08/02/2012

08/02/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Rule 11 Agreement; attend deposition of T.
Wallis; conference with T. Wallis and R..
Gray re: deposition; telephone conference
with W. Pierce re: Lesley report; review
emails from S. Dahlberg re: extensions and
other matters.

Review email from counsel re: Moak Casey
email blasts; conference with counsel re:
same; email Holly McIntush re: same;
conference with legal assistant and Office
Manager re: Adobe; review and reply to
email from Holly McIntush re: Moak Casey
email blasts; conference with counsel re:
meeting with David Hinojosa re: data;
conference with counsel re: letter to the
State re: Moak Casey email blasts;
conference with legal assistant re: same.
Work on expert reports; work on draft
exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re:
expert designations and reports; review W.
Pierce report; conference with T. Hunter te:
8/3 status conference; conference with T.
Hunter re: charter school consolidazjons;
prepare for 8/3 hearing; telephone:
conference with P. Fraissinet re: deposition
and B. Duncomb analysis; review D.
Thompson emails (2); reply to same.
Review and retum emaii from L. Halpem
re: service list; amend service list; review
Ft. Bend ISD leter to Judge Dietz; review
Ft. Bend ISD's responses to State’s First
RFP; review cmail from C. Diamond re:
deposition: schedule; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; telephone conference with M.
Sisterse: Hillsboro ISD deposition; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: Bryan ISD documents;
forward correspondence and CD of Bryan
documents to counsel; confer with R. Gray
re: letter to 8. Dahlberg re: Moak Casey
emails; email T. Hunter re: sable review
Cathoun County's responses to State’s First
RFP.

Follow up with other superintendents on
Wallis deposition; meet with W. Pierce, R.
Freeman and B. Lesley re: reports; review
B. Lesley report and B. Baker's for conflict;
email to R. Blincoe re: scheduling his
deposition; email to S. Dahlberg re: various
matters; review email from L. Halpern re:

Invoice # 41573

2.05 hrs

2.15 hrs

31.50 hrs

6.00 hrs

$358.75

$ 967.50

NiC

$1,950.00

Page 2



08/03/2012

08/03/2012

08/03/2012

08/03/2012

310201

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Blincoe deposition and respond; emai} to D.
Hinojosa re: meeting and review responses;
conference with Richard Gray IV re:
discovery; email to P. Colbert re: resume;
review emails from A. Tekell and respond;
review email from W. Haney and respond.
Review and reply to email from counsel re:
meeting with David Hinojosa re: equity
data; conference with legal assistant re;
letter to State re: Moak Casey email blasts;
conference with counsel re: meeting over
exhibits; status conference with Judge Dietz.
Review W, Haney emails; conference with
T. Hunter re: expert reports; review D.
Thompson emails {2); conference with R.
Gray, IV re: meeting with D. Hinojosa;
review D. Hinojosa email, reply to D.
Thompson email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review supplemental discovery
responses; conference with M.
Trachtenberg, D. Thompson, and P,
Fraissinet re: depositions and 8/3
conference; review S. Dahlberg e1nail;
conference with T. Hunter re: sanie; prepare
for 8/3 status conference; attend status
conference; review message from P.
Colbert; conference with 1. Hunter re:
same; telephone conference with P. Colbert
re: status; review V7. Haney email.

Review email fiom S. Dahlberg re:
consolidating charter plaintiffs; confer with
R. Gray re: fescheduling J. Witte depo.
prep.; telenhone conference with J. Witte re:
same; teiephone conference with C. Nickell
re:-devosition questions for J. Witte; review
emwils to K. Garza, et al. re: same; email P.
Colbert re: supplemental discovery
responses; telephone conference with M.
Sisler re: deposition schedule; email T.
Hunter re: same; review voice message from
M. Sisler; review email from T. Hunter re;
same; review email from R. Gray re:
Intervenors' supplemental responses for P.
Colbert and W. Pierce review: email P.
Colbert and W. Pierce re: same.

Email to B. Lesley re: report; review email
from G. Salazar re: weights and respond;
conference with W, Pierce re: same; attend
status conference; several emails to B.

Invoice # 41573

1.65 hrs

3.55 hrs

2.30 hrs

3.00 hrs

$288.75

$1,597.50

N

$ 975.00

Page 3



08/04/2012

08/04/2012

08/05/2012

08/05/2012

08/05/2012

08/06/2012

08/06/2012

08/06/2012

3102-01

REG

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Baker re: scheduling his deposition; draft

auditor letter for districts; review voice mail

and email from J. Witte,

Review Intervenors' disclosure responses; 2.50 hrs
review E. Hanushek report; review material

for J. Wiltte; review J. Witte message;

review Moak Casey draft reports; review

supplemental amicus of Texas Teachers

Association.

Begin drafting brief for the Judge on the law 1.00 hirs
of the case.

Meeting with counsel re: exhibits. 2.00 hrs
Work with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; work re: 2.75 hrs

J. Witte deposition preparation; review M.
Trachtenberg emails {2); reply to same (2);
review P. Fraissinet email re: B. Duncomb
analysis.
Continue drafting law of the case brief; 1.50 hrs
review emails re: Duncomb's preliminary
numbers; review emails from Plaintiff's
attorneys re: superintendent depositions;
review several emails from R. Gray and
respond.
Review email re: deposition schelule; 1.55 hrs
review same for the week; review
Efficiency Intervenor's First Amended
Response to Request for Dnsclosure; review
emails from legal assistant re: email service
list and depositions; review Moak Casey
Expert Report; Ceicphone conference with
Charles Aki re: exhibits,
Review P. CColbert email; reply to same; 3.30 hrs
review D. Thompson email; review J.
Tumer email; review M., Trachtenberg
email: review emails re: depositions;
conference with J. Witte re: deposition
nieparation; review J. Hoffer email;
telephone conference with T. Hunter re:
depositions; review P. Fraissinet email;
review D. Thompson email review S.
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review article re: Edgewood tax rate;
email re: potential testing;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter re:
; review emails re;: Rule 11
agreement.
Review email from R. Gray re: updating 2.50 hrs
charter districts with deposition schedules;

Invoice # 41573

$1,125.00

$ 325.00

$350.00

$1,237.50

$ 48750

$271.25

$1,485.00

NIC

Page 4



08/06/2012

08/07/2012

08/07/2012

08/07/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

review and retum email from court reporter
re: deposition schedule; email T. Hunter re:
rescheduling R. Blincoe; review email from
court reporter; confer with R. Gray re:
charter district pariies; email counse! for
charter districts re: service list and
deposition schedule; review emails from T.
Hunter re: deposition schedule; review
email from J. Hoffer; review email from M,
Sisler re: supplemental production; confer
with T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV re: response
to State Defendants' RFP 139, revise letter
to S. Dahlberg re: same; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:
discovery districts, focus districts,
deposition schedule; confer with T. Hunter
re: Aldine ISD deposition; email D.
Thompson re: representation of Aldine ISD;
review email from D. Thompson re: same.,
Telephone conference with R. Freeman re:
Lesley report; review emails from R,
Blincoe and M. French re: depositior
scheduling and respond; email to Pluntiff
attomeys re: questions asked kv the State in
depositions; finish 1st draft of brief to Judge
on law of the case; amend peution; review
deposition schedule; telepnone conference
with B. Wood re: Ft. B=id depositions;
telephone conference with B. Baker re:
Duncomb and Fanushek

Print emails from Joddie Witte for counsel
re: Van IS veview same; email Holly
McIntush 're: depositions; conference with
counsel re: same; review emails; continue
reviewing Moak Casey Expert Report;
review emails re: deposition of Dr. Eric
Hanushek; review and reply to email from
counsel re: deposition of Dr. Gilcrease;
review email from counsel re: Everman
ISD's AEIS data and 2010-201 1&S tax
rate; find same and reply to email.

Review email; reply to same;
complete preparation of J. Witte for
deposition; present J. Witte for deposition;
review emails re: Hanushek deposition (10);
review 8. Dahlberg email; review D,
Thompson email.

Review email from C. Nickell re: board
meeting; confer with R. Gray re: expedited

Invoice # 41573

4.90 hrs

4.75 hrs

B.50 hrs

3.75 hrs

$1,592.50

$831.25

$3,825.00

N/C

Page 5



08/07/2012

08/08/2012

(08/08/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIVY

REG

transcript of T. Wallis's deposition; email
court reporter re: same; telephone
conference with Haynes & Boone re: J.
Witte deposition; review email from court
reporter re: expedited handling of T. Wallis
deposition; telephone conference with court
reporter re: same; telephone conferences (2)
with J. Knight re: deposition; confer with R.
Gray re: status; revise Salazar and Blincoe
deposition notices; serve counsel re: same;
email court reporter re: same; review and
calendar Ft. Bend deposition notices; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Review several emails from L. Halpem re: 6.25 hrs
rescheduling Salazar and Blincoe
depositions; respond to same; several emails
to G. Salazar re: same; several emails to R.
Blincoe re: same; review several emails
from various Plaintiff attomeys re:
Hanushek deposition; respond to same; eait
trial brief on law of the case; telephone:
conference with R. Freeman re: varicus
matters; telephone conference wito-S.
Kincannon re: deposition; telephone
conference with all attomeys re: Rule 11
Agreement; review new depasitions
scheduled by State and schedule coverage;
prepare for J. Pfeifer d=position; prepare J.
Pfeifer for her depzation.

Review emails te: STAAR data and 3.05 hrs
depositions; conference with counsel re:
Tarrant covaty data; organize, format, and
print same $or counsel; continue reviewing
Moak Casey Expert Report; meeting at
Equity Center re: exhibits; review discovery
recnonses from San Antonio ISD;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
review and reply to email from San Antonio
ISD re: same; conference with counsetl re:
Belton Supplemental Responses; conference
with counsel re: San Antonio ISD
responsive documents; conference with
counsel re: depositions.

Prepare for meeting with J. Knight; review 3.50 hrs
emails re: Rule 11 agreement; review emails
re: Hanushek deposition; review D.
Hinojosa emails; review emails re: STAAR;
review J, Tumer emails; review P. Fraissinet
email; reply to same; email attomeys re;

Invoice # 41573

$2,031.25

$533.75

$1,575.00

Pape &



08/08/2012

08/08/2012

08/09/2012

08/09/2012

08/09/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

preparing witnesses for depositions; partial
attendance at J. Pfeifer deposition; review
deposition (amended) notice for Dr.
Hanushek; review S. Dahlberg email;
review M. Trachtenberg emails (3); reply to
same( 3); review J. Knight postings on
website; conference with J. Knight re:
deposition preparation; telephone
conference with A. Penn re: J. Knight's

deposition.
Review email from court reporter re: T. 2.30 hrs
Wallis transcript, email D. Thompson, D. 2.75 hrs

Hinojosa, and M. Trachtenberg re: same;

review email from M. Sisler re: Hanushek

deposition; review email from S. Dahlberg

re: scheduling order; review CD of

documents from Nolan CAD; email R.

Freeman re: same; review message from

San Antonio ISD re: document production;

review email from L. Payton re: Fort Bena

ISD Plaintiffs’ Deposition Notice of Dr.

Terry Grier, review and calendar notice;

review documents produced by S Antonio

ISD; confer with R, Gray re: sum; confer

with R. Gray, IV re: supplemental

documents produced by Belion ISD; prepare

letter to counsel re: same; review email

from L. Lawrence re: Cathoun County and

Frisco ISD's respories to State Defendants'

RFP.

Meet with I. Pfeifer in preparation for her 9.50 hrs
deposition; aitead deposition of J. Pfeifer;

conferencz ‘with J. Pfeifer.

Conference with legal assistant re: Calthoun 1.15 hrs
Couny Discovery Responses; conference

with counsel re: depositions; review, format,

atid print data for 2010, 2011, and 2012 for

Hillsboro, Kaufman, and Belton ISD.

Review report on Aransas Pass deposition; 875 hrs
review P. Colbert email; reply to same;

review deposition notice of San Benito ISD;

complete preparation of J. Knight for

deposition; present J. Knight for deposition;

review W, Pierce email; review email re:

STARR test; review emails re: Hanushek

deposition; review emails re: Rule 11

agreement.

Review email from M. Sisler re: San Benito 3.20 hrs
1SD deposition; confer with T. Hunter re:

Invoice # 41573

$250.00
N/C

$3,087.50

$201.25

$3,937.50

NKZ

Pape 7



08/09/2012

08/10/2012

08/10/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

same; email counsel re: Belton ISD
supplemental production; update deposition
schedule; review email from Nueces CAD;
email R. Freeman re: same; review email
from court reporter re: K. Garza transcript;
confer with T. Hunter re: response from
Collin CAD; telephone conference with and
email M. Rohloff, Collin CAD, re: open
records request; confer with T. Hunter re:
depositions; review deposition schedule re:
district information; review email from T.
Robertson re: Gaines CAD; review file re:
contact person for Gaines CAD; email T.
Robertson re: same.

Edits to trial brief; schedule deposition 7.00 hrs
coverage; telephone conference with B.
Wood re: deposition of Aransas Pass
superintendent; email to D. Hinojosa re:
same and review response; telephone
conference with R. Rhodes, left message;
email to B. Lesley re: strategies for ELL;
review response and forward to G. Salazar,
telephone conference with W, Pierce: re:
weights; attend part of J. Knight's
deposition; review college readiness
material; review HanusheXk niaterial;
conference with R. Gray re: various matters;
conference with M. Trachtenberg re:
amending pleadings; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: Rute 11 Agreement and order
on Motion to Consolidate and respond; draft
Motion for Lvave to Amend and respond;
review pleadings of Charter Schools; email
to B. Raker re: same; review status of
discovery; review emails from R. Freeman
re: facilities and Collin County; telephone
conference with Collin County appraiser re:
information request.

Review email from Shelley Dahlberg re: 0.75 hrs
Motion to Consolidate; review same; review
proposed Rule 11 Agreement re:
designation of experts and expert reports
and deadline for discovery; review emails
re: amended petitions; review and reply to
email from Belton ISD re; supplemental
discovery documents; conference with legal
assistant re; Belton ISD supplemental
discovery responses.

Review emails re: conference call (6); 2.00 hrs

Invoice # 41573

$2,275.00

$131.25

$ 900.00

Page 8



08/10/2012

08/11/2012

08/12/2012

08/13/2012

08/13/2012

08/13/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

RGIV

SEJ

review P. Fraissinet email; reply to same;
review S. Dahlberg emails (2); review B.
Schulman’s emails; conference call with
attorneys re: equity issues and case
presentation; review C. Diamond email;
review emails re: Rule 11 agreement;
review R. Schulman email; review W.
Haney email; email D. Thompson re: status;
review message from P. Fraissinet.
Conference with R. Gray re: Calhoun
County’s notice of adversity and filing
Amended Petition and trial brief; edit trial
brief; review emails from Charter School
attorneys re: telephone conference and
respond; review amended consolidation
order and emails re: same; telephone
conference with L. Moak; review emails
from J. Pfeifer re: Charter Schools; email to
B. Baker re: same; review deposition
coverage; email to R. Gray re: same.
Review emails; reply to same; review
discovery; review amended pleading:,
Review emails; reply to same; corfcrence
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits.
Conference with counsel re: Max Revenue
Exhibits; review same; telephione
conference with Wayne Pierce re: same and
meeting re: same; revicw and reply to email
from counsel re: Fort Bend and Calhoun
County Plaintif{ Districts ATR and Revenue
per WADA; compile, format, and print
same for ccaisel; telephone conference with
counsel re: 2xhibits and meeting.
Review J. Turner email; review P. Fraissinet
email review W. Haney email; work with
R.'Gray, IV re: exhibits; review emails re:
depositions; email B, Baker re: B.
Duncomb’s report; conference with T.
Hunter re: 8/13 meeting; review H.D.
Chambers email; reply to same; travel to
Houston; conference with attomeys re:
strategy; return to Austin; review email re:
W. Haney; review W. Haney report; review
notice for Hanushek deposition; review
email; reply to same; review J.
Turner email; reply to same; review L. Lacy
email; review M. Trachtenberg email.
Email A. Cochran-McCall, AG's office, re;
TEA’s 8-10-12 responses to First Set of

Invoice # 41573

1.8 hrs

0.75 hrs

0.75 hrs

3.60 hrs

10.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

$ 585.00

$ 337.50

$ 33750

$630.00

$4,837.50

NAC

Page 9



08/13/2012

08/14/2012

08/14/2012

08/14/2012

08/14/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Interrogatories of Calhoun County; review
email from A. Cochran-McCall re: same;
review amended deposition notice of Dr.
Hanushek.

Review edits to brief on law of the case;
conference with R. Gray re: same and
meeting with D. Thompson and M.
Trachtenberg; review emails from appraisal
district and forward to R. Freeman; review
W. Haney report; telephone conference with
W. Haney:; review deposition notice for
Hanushek; review Duncomb’s results;
review email from R. Schulman re:
telephone conference and respond; prepare
for C. Dupre deposition; meet with C.
Dupre re: deposition; conference with R.
Gray re: meeting; review data on Ft. Bend
group and on Calhoun County group.
Meeting at Equity Center with Charles Akj
and Wayne Pierce re: exhibits; review
State’s Supplemental Responses to
Discovery for Intervenors, Edgewood. and
Fort Bend Plaintiffs; conference with
counsel re: same; conference vath counsel
re: Wayne Pierce’s expert report.

Review MALDEF discovzry iesponses;
work on gap briefing; work on Haney
report; meeting with Eauity Center re:
exhibits; review L. Ilaipern email; review
D. Hinojosa emails; review L. Halpern
email; review 1. Tumer email; review P,
Fraissinet eradils (2); reply to same (2);
partial attcndance at C. Dupre deposition;
review report of W. Pierce; review material
re: inter-county comparisons; conference
withhR. Gray, IV re: discovery; conference
with H.D. Chambers re: deposition
preparation.

Prepare and serve additional documents
produced by Belton ISD; confer with T.
Hunter re: deposition schedule; review and
update deposition calendars; email P.
Colbert re: additional documents available
for review from the State Defendants;
review and return email from I. Pina re:
deposition schedule.

Conference with C. Dupre re: deposition;
review email from S. Dahlberg re: Order to

Consolidate and respond; review email from

Invoice # 41573

5.80 hrs

6.05 hrs

6.50 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.80 hrs

10.50 hrs

$1,885.00

$1058.75

$2,925.00

$ 80.00

N/C

$3,412.50
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08/15/2012

0871512012

08/15/2012

08/15/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

W. Pierce re: Canyon & El Paso ISDs;
review email from P. Fraissinet re:
Duncomb/Moak; attend deposition of C.
Dupre; conference with R. Gray re: Haney
report; data produced by Calhoun County;
conference with C. Dupre re: email from R.
Schulman and respond; review emails from
S. Dahlberg and H. McIntush re: discovery
responses and forward to Richard Gray IV;
review email from B. Wood re: Haney
report; email to W. Haney to set up
telephone call; email to S. Jennings re:
updating my calendar.

Legal research re: Texas Education Code
and Target Revenue; conference with
counsel and legal assistant re: deposition
review by clients; telephone conference
with Wayne Pierce re: most recent testing
data; review Brief on Law of the Case for
counsel; review WOC II decision; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: data for
same; review and reply to email fron,
Wayne Pierce re: status of testing data;
forward same to counsel.

Email exchange with W. Haney re: report;
review P. Colbert email; review D. Hinojosa
email; review J. Turner 2mail; review L.
Lacy email; conference with H.D.
Chambers re: deposiiion; present H.D.
Chambers for dénosition; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review J. Turner email;
conference ‘with R. Gray, IV re: research on
target revenue; review emails re: Duncomb
testimony; review M. Trachtenberg email;
re: Duricombe analysis.

Enzil T. Wallis re: review of deposition
transcript; review email from T. Hunter re:
same; email K. Garza re: review of
deposition transcript; email R. Knight re:
review of deposition transcript; review and
calendar deposition notice for M. Miles;
confer with T. Hunter re: same: email P,
Colbert additional documents from the
State.

Review email from P. Colbert and respond;
email to W. Haney attaching contract; email
to B. Lesley re: report; email to W. Pierce
and B. Baker re: deposition dates; telephone
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys, L.

Invoice # 41573

4.80 hrs

12.00 hrs

1.00 hrs

7.30 hrs

$840.00

$5,400.00

NAC

$2,372.50
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08/16/2012 RGIV

08/16/2012 REG

08/16/2012 SE}

08/16/2012 TBH

08/17/2012 RGIV

3102-01

Moak, A. Bronson & B. Duncomb re:

Duncomb report; conference with R, Gray

re: various matters; meet with L. Moak re:

status and Duncomb report; begin drafting

designation of experts; review Moak report;

prepare M. French for deposition.

Review Expert Report of Wayne Pierce; 5.10 hrs
conference with counsel re: same; telephone

conference with Tim Wolff re: data;

research accountability rating for Rockwall

ISD; conference with counsel re: same;

review emails re: discovery; telephone

conference with Wayne Pierce re: expert

report; telephone conference with Charles

Aki re: exhibits; conference with legal

assistant re: Kaufman Discovery; download

same.

Review L. Lacy email re: depositions; 2.75 hrs
review L. Moak email; review deposition

notice for M. Miles; review D. Casey email;

review D. Thompson email; review P.

Fraissinet email; review discovery

responses; partial attendance at M_Trench

deposition; review L. Moak draft report;

review D. Casey draft report: email B.

Wood re: W. Haney; review L. Halpemn

email; review J. Turner email; telephone

conference with D. Hinojosa re: status and

expert reports; con{rrence with R. Gray, IV

re: expert repors and exhibits; review L.

Lacy email; review additional deposition

notices; review J. Turner emails (2); review

P. Fraissii=. emails (2); review revised Rule

11 agreenient; review new test score data;

review emails re: Duncomb report.

Review email from M. Sisler re: Rule 11 0.90 hrs
agreement; review and calendar Waddell

and Younghlood deposition notices; review

and calendar Wiggins deposition notice;

review and return emails from H. McIntush

(3); review and calendar new scheduling

deadlines.

Review and respond to several emails from 8.50 hrs
J. Turner re: Duncomb report; attend

deposition of M. French; conference with

M. French.

Formally Respond to the State’s Request for 4.90 hrs
Production to Kaufman ISD; conference

with counsel and legal assistant re: same;

Invoice # 41573

$892.50

$1,237.50

NAC

$2,762.50

$857.50
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08/17/2012

08/17/2012

08/17/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
expert report; telephone conference with
Ray Freeman re: expert report of Bill
Duncomb; telephone conference with
Charles Aki re: exhibits; meeting with
counsel re:; case status; email David
Thompson re: target revenue; review email
re: discovery responses; legal research re:
Target Revenue; conference with counsel
re: same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: same; email Holly McIntush re:
same.

Review Vigdor report; review Moak report;
review J. Turner emails (3); review M.
Trachtenberg emails (3); review D.
Hinojosa emails (3); review P. Fraissinet
email; review Klein/Linn reports;
conference call with attorneys re: status;
review order of consolidation; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); review A. Branson
email; work on expert reports; review K.
Kallison report; review and edit W. Iierce
report; review amended deposition ootices;
telephone conference with W. @icrce re:
expert reports; conference with attorneys re:
expert reports; review emails re: discovery;
review S. Murdoch email; review emails.
Review and calendar amuended deposition
notices for Dr. Ponce, A. Limon, Dr.
Cervantes; revicw email from court reporter
re: J. Witte; review email from R. Gray re:
State’s suppiemeantal production; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: status of
State’z FERPA website; email attorneys re:
same; review additional documents
proeduced; email attorneys re: same; email
W. Pierce re: State’s 2013 numbers; review
email from W. Pierce re: same; confer with
R. Gray re: same; review and update
deposition schedule; email J. Witte re:
review of deposition transcript.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV re: various matters; participate in
telephone conference with other Plaintiff
attorneys re: Duncomb report; participate in
telephone conference with R. Schulman and
D. Hinojosa re: facilities; review Moak
report; telephone conference with Moak re:
Target Revenue; telephone conference with

Invoice # 41573

5.75 hrs

0.70 hrs
1.50 hrs

6.20 hrs

$2,587.50

$ 70.00
N/C

$2,015.00
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08/18/2012

08/19/2012

08/19/2012

08/20/2012

08/20/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

L. Moak, D. Casey, A. Brownson and
Plaintiff attorneys re: Moak report and other
expert reports; telephone conference with B.
Baker re: Duncomb report; review P,
Colbert report; email to P. Colbert re: same.
Review P. Colbert report; review
Intervenors’ response to jurisdiction motion;
review J. Turner emails; review J. Tumer
emails; review C, Diamond emails; review
L. Moak emails.

Review emails; review Picus report; review
final L. Moak report; review edits to reports;
review A. Kauffman email; work re: expert
reports; review D. Hinojosa emails; review
P. Colbert emails; review W. Pierce emails;
review J. Turner email re: Moak report;
email W. Pierce re: report; review L. Moak
email; review J. Turner email; conference
call with attorneys re: L. Moak report;
review emails; reply to same; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: report,
Review and comment on several exnoect
reports; review W. Pierce’s report aud
suggested edits; review suggested language
for L. Moak’s report; review emails from R.
Gray and from Plaintiff's attineys re:
experts report and respond.

Conference with counsei re: expert reports
and data; conference with legal assistant re;
discovery; Telephone conference with
‘Wayne Pierce, Charles Aki, Tim Wolff, and
Toni Huntet 12:'data for Wayne’s report;
email Charles Aki re: same; review Report
of Wayvne Pierce; conference with counsel
re: saive; telephone conference with Charles
Akiand Wayne Pierce re: same; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: same; review
and reply to email from Charles Aki and
Tim WolfT re: data for Appendix to Wayne
Pierce’s Report; conference with counsel re:
same; telephone conference with Adam
Pierce re: County Appraisal District
information; review same; review letter
from Judge Dietz re: contact with legislative
budget board; email Adam Pierce re:
documents’ review emails re: expert
designations.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
report status; review J. Turner emails (2);

Invoice # 41573

1.50 hrs

w
i
(&7
o
o

2.00 hrs

6.80 hrs

8.50 hrs

$ 675.00

$1,575.00

$ 650.00

$1190.00

$3,825.00
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08/20/2012

08/20/2012

3102-01

SEI

TBH

review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review
L. Moak emails (2); review W. Pierce
emails (3); review D. Thompson emails (2);
review P. Fraissinet emails (2); reply to all;
review P. Colbert draft report; email P.
Colbert re: same; review P. Fraissinet email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; conference
with T. Hunter re: report status; review
emails re: B. Duncomb report; review L.
Halpern email; review W. Pierce report as
final; forward to P. Colbert; review D.
Hinojosa email re: depositions; review D.
Hinojosa expert designation; review J.
Tumer emails (5); review expert designation
of Calhoun County; work re: all
designations of experts; review emails re:
expernts; review M. Trachtenberg emails (3);
review D. Thompson emails (2); review C.
Diamond email; work re: expert
designations; review W. Pierce emails;
review B. Schulman email; review J. Dietz
correspondence; review M. Trachtenverg
email; reply to same; review D. Hirinjosa
emails (2); review H. McIntus!: emnail;
review D. Thompson email; review message
from J. Witte; telephone conierence with J.
Witte re: deposition; review Dr.
Schanzenbach email; 1eview D. Hinojosa
email; review additcnal expert
designations; review C. Diamond disclosure
responses; review expert reports of C.
Diamond; raview A. Cortez expert report.
Work re:-designation of experts; confer with 4.00 hrs
attorneys re: same; efile and serve Third 4.50 hrs
Amerded Petition; finalize and serve
Cozlition Plaintiffs’ Designation of Experts
and Addendum to Designation of Experts;
review and return email from J. Pfeifer re:
deposition transcript; review and calendar
meeting with J. Dietz; review email from J.
Reich re: depositions scheduled for the
week; review emails from R. Gray and T.
Hunter re: appendices to report of W,
Pierce.

Review emails from R. Gray re: Colbert and 2.80 hrs
Pierce reports; email to B. Lesley re:
formating problems; conference with R.
Gray re: Pierce report; conference with W.
Pierce re: report and appendix; review

Invoice # 41573

$400.00
N/C

$ 910.00
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08/21/2012

08/21/2012

3102-01

RGIV

REG

edited reports from various experts; finalize
designation of experts; conference with A.
Pierce re: conformation for Appendix to W.
Pierce’s report; conference with Richard
Gray 1V re: production of reports; telephone
conference with P, Colbert re: report;
telephone conference with W, Pierce re:
report; begin review of A. Cortez report;
conference with R. Gray re: Amended
Petition; finalize 3rd Amended Petition and
file.

Review and reply to email from Holly 5.30 hrs
MclIntush, Lacy Lawrence, Toni Hunter re:
responding to State’s Discovery Requests;
review Discovery Responses; conference
with counsel re: same; conference with
counsel re: case status, witness files, and
exhibits; conference with legal assistant re:
all; draft witness list; research percentile of
wealth for Los Fresnos CISD; review and
add edits to Brief on Law of the Case for
counsel; conference with counsel re:‘'same;
find, format, and print data on Haizis
County districts for counsel’s deposition
preparation.

Review D. Hinojosa emaii; review B. Baker 8.25 hrs
email; review L. Halpem email; reply to
same; conference with K. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review D/Zlinojosa emails (4);
reply to same; review C. Diamond emails
(5); review P. Hill file; review T. Moe file;
review Edgewood designation of experts
with repmits; email D. Hinojosa re: B. Baker
call; ernail W. Pierce/R. Freeman re: status;
review L. Lacy correspondence; review
Caltoun County material; review A.
Branson email; telephone conference with
D. Hinojosa re: 8/21 hearing; review J.
Knight deposition transcript; review D.
Hinojosa email; conference with attorneys
re: discovery matters; review draft
discovery; review L. Moak emails; review J.
Tumer emails; review P. Fraissinet email;
review B. Duncomb email; review J. Tumer
emails; attend hearing on jurisdiction
motion; post-hearing conference with
attorneys re: Hanushek deposition and
strategy; review MALDEF email; work re:
preparation for E. Hanushek deposition.

Invoice # 41573

$927.50

$3,712.50
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08/21/2012

08/21/2012

08/22/2012
08/22/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

Review email from T. Hunter re: supporting
documents for Dr. Baker's report; forward
same to all counsel; review reports produced
by the Edgewood Plaintiffs; confer with R.
Gray re: same; finalize and serve Kaufman
ISD response to RFP; review CD of
additional documents from Calhoun County;
review and organize expert reports and
supporting documents; confer with R. Gray
re: same; telephone conference with C.
Diamond re: data produced by Intervenors;
confer with R. Gray re: same; review and
update deposition schedule; confer with R,
Gray, IV re: same; review email from R.
Gray, IV and T. Hunter re: same; review
email from court reporter re: transcript of J.
Knight and J. Pfeifer depositions.

Review email from L. Halpern re: Baker's
backup documents and respond; email to
Baker re: Hanushek deposition; review
response; email to D. Hinojosa re: samé;
review several emails from Plaintiff’s
attorneys re: Hanushek deposition;
conference with Richard Gray ¢V and Holly
MclIntush re: responding to State’s request
for better identification of documents;
several emails back and forth to L. Halpern
re: Baker’s deposition. dates; draft
Interrogatories and REP to Intervenor and
Charter School Plaintiffs; begin drafting
Supplemental Response to all RFD;
conference ‘with Richard Gray IV re: WCC
II and bricfio Court; edit brief to Court.
Review discovery.

Revievr C. Diamond email; review TREE
discovery; review A. Branson emails;
review Judge's comments; email R.
Freeman re: 8/21 hearing; review additional
transcripts of depositions; email team re:
trial schedule; telephone conference with D.
Hinojosa and B. Baker re: Hanushek
deposition; email D. Hinojosa re: Hanushek
deposition; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review article re: B. Hammond; review
supplemental discovery responses;
conference with T. Hunter re: Humble
deposition; review T. Robertson email;
reply to same; work on brief to court re:
disparity; review P. Colbert email; with

Invoice # 41573

4.00 hrs
4.25 hrs

6.00 hrs

0.70 hrs
4.75 hrs

$400.00
N/C

$1,950.00

$122.50
$2,137.50
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08/22/2012

08/22/2012

08/23/2012

08/23/2012

08/23/2012

08/23/2012

08/24/2012

3102-01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

attached article; conference with T. Hunter
re: status.

Review email from R. Gray re: trial
schedule; review and organize MALDEF
expert witness files; review email from T.
Hunter re: filing Brief; revise list of persons
with knowledge; review Interrogatories and
RFP’s from the Intervenors group.

Attend deposition of Humble
superintendent, Dr. Sconzo; edit brief on
law of the case; prepare J. Gilcrease for
deposition; respond to emails from
Plaintiff's attorneys; conference with R.
Gray re: brief; review Joe Wisnowski
report.

Review emails re: presentation to Judge
Dietz; review presentation; review
discovery responses and email counsel re:
same.

Review emails; review J. Wisnowski
presentation; review Calhoun County
discovery; review Ft. Bend discovery;
attend deposition of Dr. Hanushek;yeview J.
Wisnowski emails; conference with D,
Hinojosa re: trial testimony.

Review and return email {rom C. Diamond
re: expert CV’s produced; review email re:
Ft. Bend RFP to Defendants; review email
re: Calhoun County's discovery requests;
review Efficiency Intervenor’s RFP’s and
Interrogatories to the Plaintiff Groups; draft
responses to saine; work on supplemental
response-te Request for Disclosure;
continue work on responses to Efficiency
Intervenors’ discovery requests; draft
responses to State Defendants Request for
Production; telephone conference with T,
Wallis's office re: deposition transcript;
review and return email from T. Wallis re:
same; finalize and serve supplemental
response to RFD; review email from R.
Gray re: additional discovery requests from
the State Defendants.

Attend deposition of J. Gilcrease; review
presentation by J. Wisnowski and comment.
Review emails re: presentation to Judge
Dietz; conference with counsel re: data;
review State’s responses to Calhoun County
plaintiff's interrogatories; review State’s

Invoice # 41573

2.10 hrs

6.50 hos

1.40 hrs

7.25 hrs

3.25 hrs
3.00 hrs

5.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

NAC

$2,112.50

$245.00

$3,262.50

$325.00
N/C

$1,787.50

$245.00
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08/24/2012

08/24/2012

08/24/2012

08/25/2012

3102-01

REG

REG

SEJ

REG

response to Fort Bend plaintiff's request for

production; summarize and email counsel

re: same; review counsel’s letter to Todd

Williams and Susan Kincannon re: what to

expect in your deposition; conference with

legal assistant re: same; conference with

counsel re: Exhibit 1012 to Dr. Hanushek’s

deposition; email David Hinojosa re: same.

Review J. Wisnowski revised presentation, 2.85 ks
email D. Hinojosa re: same; email W. Pierce

re: same; review emails re: bifurcation of

fees; review D. Thompson email; review M.

Trachtenberg emails; reply to same; review

discovery; review D. Thompson email;

review D. Thompson email; review P,

Fraissinet email; review D. Hinojosa email;

work re: exhibits; review M. Trachtenberg

email.

Review H. Mclntush email; review new 1.50 hrs
discovery; review H. McIntush email;

review W, Pierce email (2); review R.

Freeman email; email L. Moak and J.

Wisnowski re: presentation; email'R.

Freeman and W. Pierce; reviev: ).

Wisnowski email; reply to same; telephone

conference with W. Pierce re: presentations.

Review email from C. Diamond re: CV's: 2.25 hrs
telephone conference with T. Hunter re: J. 3.00 hrs
Wisnowski and D. Fisher factual

presentations; tclephone call to W. Pierce

re: same (left message); email W. Pierce re:

same; telephione conference with W. Pierce

re: same; c2lendar factual presentations to

the Court; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same;

review email from T. Hunter re: scheduling

meeling with Taxpayer and Parent

Piaintiffs; review and organize T. Moe

expert reports and supporting documents;

review and organize P. Hill documents;

review and organize D. McAdams report

and documents; review email re: Ft. Bend

discovery requests; telephone conference

with M. Sisler re: J. Witte original

deposition transcript; email attorneys re:

same; review email from M. Sisler re; same;

review and return email from W. Pierce re:

current pleading.

Review P. Colbert email; reply to same; 1.50 hrs
review R. Freeman email; review W. Pierce

Invoice # 41573

$1,282.50

$ 67500

$225.00
N/C

$ 675.00
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08/26/2012

08/27/2012

08/27/2012

08/27/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

email; review J. Wisnowski email; review
M. Trachtenberg email; work on "gap”
brief; review Ft. Bend designation of expert
witnesses; review additional discovery (6
sets).

Review J. Wisnowski revised presentation;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (3); reply to same;
review P. Colbert email; review W. Pierce
emails (2); reply to same; work re: exhibits;
complete brief re: GAP; review W. Pierce
emails (2); reply to same (2).

Review emails re: revenue seeking exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: same;
telephone conference with numerous
individuals from Houston Community
College re: knowledgeable individual on
student readiness for college; email Dr.
Charles Cook re: same and time for
telephone conference; meeting at Equity
Center with Wayne Pierce, Ray Frecran,
and Charles Aki re: exhibits and cas2 status;
Telephone conference with Dr. Charles
Cook re: high school graduates not being
college ready; conference wiin counsel re:
same; email Dr. Charles Cook re: areas and
questions for our upcaoming telephone
conference.

Conference witi: K. Gray, IV re: exhibits;
review emails; work re: brief to court;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: Community
College witaess; review R. Freeman email;
email\l. Wisnowski re: same; review R.
Freenvin email; reply to same; email D.
Thornpson re: brief; review D. Thompson
email; reply to same; telephone conference
with W. Pierce, R. Freeman, and C. Aki re:
exhibits; review D. Thompson emails (2);
review draft email to Dr. Cook; review H.
Mclntush emails (2); review S. Rosen
emails; review D. Hinojosa email; review
Dr. Cook email; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: same; review email re: H.D.
Chambers deposition; work re; exhibits;
work re: 8/28 mini trial.

Continue work re: expert designation sand
supporting documents; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: G. Salazar

Invoice # 41573

2.00 hrs

5.05 hrs

2.95 hrs

1.75 hrs
1.00 hrs

$ 900.00

$883.75

$1,327.50

$175.00
N/C
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08/28/2012

08/28/2012

08/28/2012

08/29/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

deposition; email T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV
re: same; telephone conference with T.
Robertson re: court presentation schedule;
email C, Dupre 1e: review of deposition
transcript; email H.D. Chambers re: same;
review email from R. Gray re; joint experts;
review email from R. Gray, IV re: same.
Travel to courthouse; Joe Wisnowski’s
presentation to Judge Dietz; retum to office
from courthouse.

Review L. Halpern email; review deposition
schedule; review L. Moak emails; review R.
Freeman email; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Thompson
email; review D. Thompson briefing; review
deposition transcript of M. French; attend
mini-trial Day 1; review message from B.
Wood; review State’s disclosure requests;
conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman.
re: exhibits; review R. Freeman email; repiy
to same; telephone call to B. Wood - lett
message; review status brief; review 0.
Thompson brief; telephone conferzsice with
B. Wood re: status; review stat=’s
disclosures; review message from T.
Hunter; telephone call to/T. Hunter - left
message; email T. Hunter re: status.

Review email from T. Hunter re: G. Salazar
video presentation; elephone conference
with G. Salazarre: same; email T. Williams
and S. Kincannon re: deposition
preparation{ rzview email from court
reporter re:-M. French transcript; review,
update. and calendar deposition schedule;
review email from R. Knight re: corrections
to deposition transcript; review State’s
amended initial disclosures; efile and serve
Brief on Law of the Case; review email
from G. Salazar re: video; review video;
email M. French re: review of deposition
transcript.

Travel to courthouse for presentation of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher and Charter Schools;
presentation with Judge Dietz; meeting with
Wayne Pierce and Ray Freeman re: exhibits;
return to office; review State’s brief on law
of the case; meeting with counsel re:
depositions, witnesses, discovery, and
overall case status; draft email to Discovery

Invoice # 41573

5.70 hrs

635 hrs

2.75 hrs

6.10 hrs

$997.50

$3,757.50

NC

$1067.50

Page 21



08/29/2012

08/29/2012

08/29/2012

3102-01

REG

SEJ

TBH

Superintendents re; interrogatories from the
State; conference with counsel re: same.
Review R. Freeman email; reply to same; 6.00 hrs
attend day 2 of the mini-trial; review T.
Hunter email re: B. Baker; review material
re: calculations; review L. Lacy email; work
on discovery; conference with R. Gray, IV
and T. Hunter re: discovery, depositions,
and trial preparation; review M. Sisler
email; review W. Pierce email; reply to
same; review order granting bifurcated trial;
review TEA website; email R. Freeman re:
same; review M. Trachtenberg email; reply
to same.

Confer with T. Hunter re: deposition 1.70 hrs
schedule; review email from S. Rosen re:
order granting motion for bifurcated trial;
review email from I. Pina re: deposition
schedule; review and return email from T.
Hunter re: status of Superintendents’
revisions to transcripts; review emails re:
travel arrangements for B. Baker; review
and calendar list of additional depzsitions to
be scheduled by the State; email 1. Sisler
G. Salazar video link; review emails from T.
Hunter re: same; confer vath T. Hunter re:
Coalition Plaintiffs’ discovery deadlines;
telephone conference with A. Tekell,
general counsel for Zelton ISD, re: latest
pleading and Bz!ton ISD’s response to RFP;
email A. Tekell re: same; prepare
documents for G. Salazar deposition; review
email frorx M., Sisler re: from Calhoun ISD,
Ft. Bend and Edgewood ISD depositions;
review email from T. Hunter re: report from
Dan'Casey; review documents produced by
Fi. Bend re: same; review email from M,
Sisler re: revised deposition notices,

Draft objections to discovery from State and 5.80 hrs
Interveners; several emails to B. Baker re;
his deposition; emails to B. Lesley, P.
Colbert re: depositions; review material
provided for presentation by L.D. Fisher;
conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV re: discovery issues,discovery responses,
expert deposition schedule, trial witnesses
and other matters; conference with Richard
Gray IV re: directives to superintendents;
review Richard Gray IV email to

Invoice # 41573

$2,700.00

NiC

$1,885.00
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08/30/2012

08/30/2012

08/30/2012

08/30/2012

3102-01

RGIV

SE!

superintendents,

Meeting with counsel re: case status,
depositions, data, exhibits, etc.; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: exhibits;
telephone conference with David Thompson
re: Houston Community College; telephone
conference (voicemail) with El Centro
Community College re: college readiness of
students coming straight from high school;
conference with legal assistant re: expert
reports and depositions; conference with
counsel re: discovery responses to the state;
conference with counsel re: possible dates to
meet with Taxpayer plaintiffs; telephone
conference with Ray Freeman re:
inter-district comparisons; email discovery
superintendents re: interrogatories from the
State and Intervenors.

Review S. Murdock supplemental report;
email D. Hinojosa re; Court's ruling; review
M. Bono email; reply to same; review M,
Bono email; review D. Hinojosa email,
review correspondence from S. Reaen;
review additional deposition natices; review
M. Sisler email; review notice from court
reporter.

Review L. Lawrence email; review D.
Hinojosa emaii; reply io L. Lacy; review C,
Cook email; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
same; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; telephone call to L. Moak - left
message; revizw email; reply
to same; 1cview S. Rosen email; reply to
same, email R. Freeman re: data analysis;
review additional deposition notices; review
M. 2rachtenberg email; review

email; reply to same; telephone conference
with L. Moak re: 1994 standards.

Prepare Plaintiffs’ deposition notice for Dr.
Bonnie A. Lesley; confer with T. Hunter re:
same; review emails re: discovery
responses; review email from court reporter
re: transcripts; review email from T. Hunter
re: Murdock supplemental report; review
email from T. Hunter re: K. Garza review of
transcript; telephone conference with M.
Sisler re: same; email K. Garza re: 10 day
extension to return transcript; review email
from C. Pacheco re: deposition schedule;

Invoice # 41573

2.50 hrs

1.75 hrs

2.25 hrs

1.00 hrs
3.25 hrs

$437.50

$ 787.50

$1,012.50

$100.00
N/C
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08/30/2012

08/31/2012

08/31/2012

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

review email from D. Hinojosa re: memo to
the judge on Plea to the Jurisdiction; review
file re: same; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review email re: A. Parker deposition;
telephone conference with court reporter re:
G. Salazar deposition and depositions going
forward, review email from M. Sisler re:
additional depositions; review email from S.
Rosen re: case style; review email from M.
French re: errata sheet; review email from 8.
Rosen re: IT training; review email from L.
Lawrence re: additional expert designation;
email M. Sisler re: A. Odden deposition
notice.
Prepare for deposition of G. Salazar; 5.50 hrs
conference with R. Gray re: deposition B.
Baker; telephone conference with L.
Halpemn re: deposition of Lesley and Baker;
telephone conference with S. Dahlberg re;
our responses to the State’s 1st RFP; email
to several superintendents re: same; mcet
with G. Salazar in preparation for his
deposition; email to all focus distiic:
superintendents requesting information from
State’s Interrogatories and Intervenor
Interrogatories.
Review emails re: deposition notices; 1.15 hrs
conference call with aitoreys re: case
status; conference #ith legal assistant re:
discovery.
Review M. Trachtenberg email; conference 5.05 hrs
with T. Hus'ter re: discovery; review H.
McIntush einail; review S. Murdock
suppicmental report; review D. Hinojosa
emails; review email; reply to
smne; review email re: S. Murdock; reply to
same; review I. Pena email; review article
by B. Hammond; telephone call to D.
Hinojosa re: depositions status; review L.
Halpern email; review M. Sisler email,
review additional deposition notices;
telephone conference with attorneys re:
discovery, trial strategy, and status; review
email; reply to same; review
M. Trachtenberg email; partial attendance at
G. Salazar deposition; work re: exhibit
selection; review S. Dahlberg email; reply
to same; review D. Hinojosa email; email
attorneys re: discovery; review J. Hoffer

Invoice # 41573

$1,787.50

$201.25

$2,272.50

Page 24



08/31/2012 SEJ

08/31/2012 TBH

email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review M. Sisler emails (2); review T.
Robertson emails (3); reply to same (3);
review S. Rosen email; reply to same;
conference cail with attorneys re: witnesses
and depositions; review D. Hinojosa email.
Review and calendar additional deposition 1.50 hrs
notices from the State Defendants; review
and return email from T. Hunter re:
discovery responses; confer with R. Gray re:
same; review email from L. Pena re:
deposition schedule; review email from
counsel re: Murdock supplemental report;
review email re: amended deposition notice
for A. Parker; review and calendar email re:
TASB convention; telephone conference
with C. Pacheco re: deposition schedule;
review email from D. Sawvel re: trial
transcript; review email from R. Gray re:
same.

Attend deposition of Gonzalo Salazar; 10.00 hrs
conference with Gonzalo Salazar; review
emails from M. Trachtenberg and #.; Gray
re: discovery; review email frem L. Halpern
re: Lesley back up data; email to B. Lesley
re: same telephone conference with
B.Lesley re: same.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

REG  II, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals

3102-01

149.85 hrs @ 450.00 /hr
80.65 hrs @ 175.00 /hr
13235 hrs @ 325.00 /hr
20.25 hrs @ 100.00 /hr
383.10
Invoice # 41573

N/C

$3,250.00

$126,585.00

$67,432.50
$14,113.75
$43,013.75

__$ 200500

$126,585.00
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

September 30, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoicet: 41884-1 REG
Our filed#: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through; 09/30/2012
¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
09/01/2012 REG Work re: exhibit designation; conference 3.25 hrs $1,462.50
with re: testing.
09/02/2012 REG Review D, Thompson emails (2); review L. 2.75 hrs $1,237.50
Halpern emails (2); reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; work re: exhibit designations.
09/02/2012 TBH Several emails to B. Baker, L. Halpern and 0.40 hrs $130.00
D. Thompson re: scheduling Baker
deposition.
09/03/2012 REG Review C. Enoch email; review D. Hinojosa 1.85 hrs $ 832.50
email; work on exhibits; review emaijs;
reply to same.
09/03/2012 SEJ Review email from G. Salazar =2: review of 0.50 hrs N/C
transcript; review emails from attorneys re:
deposition transcripts; telegione conference
with court reporter re: samne; review email
from 1. Pina re: scheduled depositions;
review email frori 1. Hunter re: document
production.
09/04/2012 RGIV  Meeting with counsel re: trial strategy and 5.90 hrs $1032.50

case statuz: meeting with counsel re;
exhibits, neeting at Equity Center re:
exhibits; create folder re: trial witnesses and
their exhibits; review data re: focus districts;
huiid spreadsheet for counsel re: [&S Yield
ver Penny for our focus districts and
comparative districts.

09/04/2012 REG Review transcript of Sconzo deposition, 545 hrs $2,452.50
review L. Halpem email; work with R,
Gray, IV re: exhibits; review emails re:
depositions; status meeting with T. Hunter
and R. Gray, IV; review draft
correspondence; review l. Pina email;
review M. Sisler email; conference with W.
Pierce, R. Freeman, C. Aki, and R. Gray, IV
re: exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re:
B. Baker deposition dates and exhibits;



09/04/2012

09/04/2012

09/05/2012

LRI

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

prepare for D. McAdams deposition; review
M. French email; with attachments;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
Charter Schools’ expert designations; review
email re: L. Harris deposition; review 6630
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email; review
additional C. Belfield exhibits; review S.
Dahlberg email; review D. Hinojosa emails.
Telephone conferences (3) with P. Cox, 2.00 hrs
Hillsboro ISD re: N. Baker deposition; 3.75 hrs
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; email T.
Robertson re: meeting scheduled for Parent
Plaintiffs; review email from D. Hinojosa
re: C. Belfield reports; review email from C.
Pacheco re: expert designations; review
email from L. Young re: I. Pfeifer
corrections to deposition transcript; review
email from L. Young re: amended minutes
from the Board of Trustees’ meeting 2011;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review file
re: same; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
Kaufman ISD documents; prepare and serve
copies of document production to counsel;
review email to Discovery Superintendents
re: bates number references; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review email from T.
Hunter re: report of L. Harris; review filcys:
same; confer with T. Hunter re: Plaintitc
Groups expert depositions; review email
from D. Hinojosa re: additional documents
re: C. Belfield expert report; review email
from S. Dahlberg re: same; review email
from L. Pina re: tables used vor Dr. Cortez's
report and deposition; review and return
email from J. Knight re: deposition changes
and signature pages; review email from M.
Sisler re: suppleni=ntal document
production.

Meet with R. Gray and Richard Gray IV re: 6.10 hrs
status, wi(nesses, exhibits; draft responses to
State’s discovery and to Intervenor's
diszovery; direct staff on mailing
insiructions to Superintendents; review
emails to D. Thompson and L. Halpem re:
Baker deposition; review email from T.
Williams re: deposition preparation; email
to S. Dalhberg re: Williams and Kincannon
depositions; review response; request I & S
chart from R. Gray 1V; email to B. Baker re:
backup for report; review report of L.
Harris.

Meeting with counsel re: underlying data for 3.80 hrs
exhibits; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce and Ray Freeman re: same; meeting
with Todd Williams and Susan Kincannon

Invoice # 41884

$ 200.00
N/C

$1982.50

$665.00

Page 2



09/05/2012

09/05/2012

09/05/2012

(09/06/2012

09/06/2012

310201

SEJ]

RGIV

re: deposition preparation; conference with
legal assistant re: Belton supplemental
production.

Review Gilcrease deposition transcript;
review emails; review Charter School expert
designations and reports; partial attendance
of D. McAdams deposition; conference with
T. Hunter re: B. Baker deposition; review H.
MclIntush email; review S. Rosen email;
review M. Sisler email; review deposition
notices for B. Duncombe and B. Baker;
review A. Cortez deposition notice; review
emails re; depositions (5); review emails re:
J. Wisnowsky repott (4); reply to same;
review email re: A. Cortez report; review L.
Moak email; review D. Thompson email;
reply to same; conference with D,
Thompson re: exhibits; conference with L.
Halpern re: depositions; review D.
Thompson email; reply to same.

Review email from 1. Pina re; A. Cortez
deposition and reports; confer with R. Gray
re: same; confer with R. Gray, IV re: W,
Pierce supporting documents produced,;
review file re: same; review email from T.
Robertson re: conference of Plaintiff
Parents; review email from M. Sisler rz:
revised deposition notice for A. Cortez,
update and calendar deposition schedule;
review and calendar additional amended
deposition notices; review emails re: B.
Baker travel to Austin; make v2servations
re: same; review and respond to email from
C. Woods re: discove’y r2sponses.

Edit | & S chart; review emails from B.
Baker and respon2: iclephone conference
with W. Pierce ve: underlining data; prepare
for depositioa ot T. Williams and S.
Kincannon; telephone conference with D.
Hathcock at Pflugerville re: discovery
requesic review emails from Plaintiff
atiomeys on variety of matters and respond,
Denosition of Dr. Susan Kincannon of
Belton 1SD; telephone conference with
Wayne Pierce re: underlying data for
exhibits; telephone conference with Charles
Aki re: exhibits; conference with counsel re:
same; Telephone conference with Tedrah
from the Equity Center re: meeting with
taxpayer plaintiffs; meeting with counsel re:
expert depositions.

Review B. Baker email; conference with T.
Hunter re: same; review D. Sewall emails;
reply to same; conference with R. Gray, IV
re: Belton deposition; review emails re:

Invoice # 41884

4.20 hrs

3.75 hrs

4.50 hrs

6.65 hrs

3.75 hrs

$1,890.00

AL

$1462.50

$1163.75

$1,687.50

Fege 3



09/06/2012

09/06/2012

09/07/2012

Jlm-

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

State witnesses; review Motion for
Substitution of new party (Comm.
Williams); review emails re: same; reply to
same; review L. Moak emails (3); review L.
Lacy emails; review material re: L. Harris
deposition; review Charter School discovery
to State; review P. Fraissinet email; review
email re: L. Harris deposition; work re:
exhibits; conference with attorneys re;
depositions; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: exhibits; review L. Halpern
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review H. Mclntush email; review P.
Fraissinet email; review B. Schulman email;
review D. Hinojosa email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.
Hunter and R. Gray, 1V re: depositions.
Review emails re: depositions; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; review email from M.
Sisler re: Motion to Substitute Defendant;
review email from R. Gray re: expert L.
Harris; review email from C. Nickell re:
current list of districts; review email from C.
Pacheco re: Charter Plaintiffs’ discovery
requests; email Dr. Baker re: travel
arrangements; review email from Dr. Baker
re; same; email court reporter re: handling
of deposition transcripts; review emails ie:
deposition exhibits; review emails rom C.
Pacheco re; discovery requests; review
email from T. Hunter re: deposition notices
for Linda Roska for /25 here-at 9, and for
Ron Coleman on 9/26 hep: at 9, prepare,
serve, and calendar notices; confer with R.
Gray re: Plaintiffs’ responses to RFD:;,
review file re: same; review email re:
cancelled Grier deposition; revise deposition
calendars re:(szme; review State's responses
to Plaintifts’ RFP; confer with R. Gray re:
same.

Confarence with T, Williams re: deposition;
attend deposition of T. Williams; conference
with R. Gray IV re: data from W. Pierce;
telephone conference with W. Pierce, left
message; conference with R. Gray re:
scheduling depositions for State’s witnesses;
schedule same; conference with S. Jennings
re: depositions and other matters; review
emails from Plaintiff's attorneys re:
depositions and other matters.

Telephone conference with Tedrah at the
Equity Center re: taxpayer meeting;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: exhibits; review
emails re: depositions; put together 1&S

Invoice # 41884

1.00 hrs
5.35 hrs

9.30 hrs

4.45 hrs

$ 100.00
N/IC

$3022.50

$778.75

Fage 4



09/07/2012

09/07/2012

09/08/2012
09/09/2012
09/09/2012

09/09/2012

09/10/2012

09/10/2012

1103 4]

REG

SEI

RGIV

RGIV

Yield Per Penny Run for counsel; meeting
at Equity Center re: data and exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same.

Work re: 6630 exhibits; work re:
depositions; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D. Hinojosa emails; reply to same;
conference with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits;
review Charter School discovery; work re:
disclosure requests; review S. Rodriguez
email; review email; review
disclosure responses; review deposition
notices; review S. Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review §,
Dahlberg email; reply to same; review J.
Turner email; reply to same; review D.
Hinojosa emails; reply to same; review J.
Turner email; review J. Schulman email;
review supplemental discovery responses by
the State; review K. Kallison article; review
J. Turner email; conference with R. Gray,
1V re: researching K. Kallison; review B.
Baker email; review A. Givens deposition
notice; work with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits
and K. Kallison; review additional
deposition notices.

Review email re: K. Kallison article; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
discovery responses for Plaintiff Groups,
review email from R. Gray re: same’; yeview
email from J. Turner re: deposition of A.
Givens, review email from R. Gray re:
same; review email from J. Turner re:
extension to designate responsive experts.
Work re: exhibits.

Review, format, and print exhibits for
counsel.

Work re: exhibii vieparation; conference
with T. Hunt#r and B. Lesley re: 9/10
deposition.

Prepare €or meeting with B. Lesley; meet
with B Lesley in preparation for deposition.
Review emails re; deposition notices,
discovery, meeting at equity center re:
exhibits; meeting with counsel re: same;
telephone conference with Roy Knight re:
discovery; telephone conference with
Charles Aki re: exhibits.

Work re: exhibits; conference with Equity
Center personnel re: exhibits; review J.
Turner email; review D. Hinojosa email;
email J. Tomer re: K. Kallison; partial
attendance at B. Lesley deposition; work re:
P. Colbert deposition preparation; work re:
R. Coleman deposition; email L. Moak re:
deposition and status; review message from

Invoice # 41884

4.25 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.75 hrs
5.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

2.65 hrs

5.90 hrs

$1,912.50

NiZ

$ 337.50
$875.00
$ 675.00

$975.00

$463.75

$2,655.00

Pagr §



09/10/2012

09/10/2012

09/11/2012

315201

SEI

TBH

RGIV

P. Colbert; review T. Robertson email;
review H.D. Chambers email; review
material re: P. Colbert deposition
preparation; review amended deposition
notice; review review invoice from court
reporter; review J. Knight correspondence;
review B. Bender notice of appearance;
review L. Moak email; review R, Coleman
interview; reply to L. Moak interview;
review discovery from Charter Schools;
review supplemental discovery responses;
review J. Strohmeyer expert report; review
W. Pierce emails; reply to same; email M.
Trachtenberg re: exhibits; review M.

Trachtenberg email.
Review and calendar Charter Schools’' RFP 2.25 hrs
to Plaintiffs; prepare Second Supplemental 3.00 hrs

Response to all Parties’ RFD; review email
from J. Knight re: supplemental discovery
responses; email J. Vigdor re: W-9 form;
review email from T. Hunter re: Second
Supplemental Response to All Parties
RFD’s; review email from R. Gray, 1V re:
Everman 1SD supplemental response to
State Defendants’ RFP; review email from
T. Hunter re: expert fees; review and
calendar S. Coultress deposition notice;
review and calendar V. Day deposition
notice; review email from J. Tumer tv:
extension to designate responsiv= elperts;
review email from B. Hinojosa re: H.D.
Chambers deposition revision:; prepare
Second Supplemental Response to All
Parties’ Request for Dsclosure; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; review email from C.
Pacheco re: Notice of Appearance of
Co-Counsel; eriaii court reporter and
counsel re: J( Pteifer's revisions to
deposition transcript; telephone conference
with M. Sisler re: email to C. Meyers re: 1.
Pfeif= deposition revisions; email S.
Dzhluerg re: same; review Charter Schools’
Interrogatories to Coalition Plaintiffs;
review email from C. Pacheco re: expert
witness report for I. Strohmeyer; review
email from C. Pacheco re: Wood Rolle
expert witness report; confer with T. Hunter
re: answers to Charter Plaintiffs
Interrogatories; confer with T. Hunter re:
deposition of A. Givens.

Attend deposition of B.Lesley; conference 11.00 hrs
with B. Lesley; respond to emails from R.
Gray re: various matters.

Conference with counsel re; exhibits; 4.60 hrs
research re: James Kal Kallison; meeting at

Invoice # 41884

$ 22500
N/C

$3575.00

$805.00

Page &



09/11/2012

09/11/2012

09/11/2012

09/12/2012

09/12/2012

310341

REG

SEI

RGIV

Equity Center re: data and exhibits; review
emails from Wayne Pierce re: max revenue
exhibits; review email from counsel re:
backup data; review, format, and print
exhibits.

Email W. Pierce re: exhibits; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; review emails
re: B. Lesley: review B. Wood emails;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; conference with T.
Hunter re: B. Baker; review P. Fraissinet
email; review L. Lacy email; email B.
Wood re: status; email W. Pierce re: status;
prepare P. Colbert for deposition; review L.
Moak email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review J. Turner email; telephone call to J.
Turner - left message; review status of
supplemental discovery responses; review
D. Hinojosa email; reply to same; review
W. Pierce email; work re: exhibit
preparation; review Charter report; review
L. Lacy emails; review M. Bono email with
attachments; review J. Turner email;
telephone conference with J. Tumner re: P.
Colbert deposition.

Draft Plaintiffs’ Answers to Charter Schoois’

Interrogatories; confer with T. Hunter :e:
trial exhibits and discovery responses;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: Pflugerviile
1SD’s amended responses to RFR?: email
counsel re: same; review emaii from C.
Dupre re: review of transcript; review email
from T. Hunter re: same; review email from
J. Reich re: supplemeatal production;
review email from L.. Lawrence re:
deposition exhibits; 1eview email re: State
Defendants respanze to Ft. Bend's RFP.
Review emails from various people and
respond; review exhibits; review expert
witness lisi; review discovery requests from
the Chazter schools; review discovery
responses from districts; go through Baker's
rweort for potential exhibits.

Conference with counsel re: exhibits and
case status; review emails re: supplemental
discovery; conference with legal assistant
te: same; review, format, and print exhibits,
telephone conference with Reece Blincoe
re: supplemental discovery responses;
meeting with counsel re: case status;
telephone conference with Charles Aki re:
Exhibits.

Attend P. Colbert deposition; review D.
Hinojosa email; reply to same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review

Invoice # 41884

3.00 hrs

1.00 hrs
1.75 hrs

2.30 hrs

3.90 hrs

7.75 hrs

$1,350.00

$ 100.00
N/C

$747.50

$682.50

$3,487.50

Page T



09/12/2012

05/12/2012

Mozl

SEI

TBH

deposition notice for AISD; review A.
Givens deposition notice; review L. Lacy
email; reply to same; conference with T.
Hunter re: document production; work re:
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with S. Jennings re: document
production; review P. Colbert email; reply
to same; work re: exhibit preparation;
review |. Pina emails; email W. Pierce re:
deposition; review Lopez report; review
backup data for Cortez report; email P.
Colbert re: data, conference with T. Hunter
and R. Gray IV re: depositions exhibits and
trial preparation.

Email P. Colbert re: B. Lesley and B. Baker 5.25 hrs
reports; confer with R. Gray re; same; email
counsel supplemental responses of Hillsboro
1SD; confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; work
re: depositions; review emails from C.
Pacheco re: Hillsboro supplemental
response to RFP; email court reporter re:
how to proceed going forward re:
transcripts, etc.; telephone conference with
S. Kelly, AG's office, re: original exhibits of
Dr. Gilcrease; review email from R. Gray,
IV re: Hillsboro ISD's supplemental
response to State Defendants’ RFP; serve all
counsel with Hillsboro ISD supplement
response; email court reporter re: deposition
transcripts going forward; revieiw einail
from 1. Pina re: revised P. Lopez expert
repott; telephone conferencs with court
reporter re: original transciipts and exhibits;
email counsel re: T. Wallis's revisions to
deposition; review email from 1. Pina re:
Schanzenbach and izquierdo depositions;
confer with T. Iluitter re: depositions;
review email from S. Rodriguez re: Ft. Bend
ISD Plaintiffs’ deposition notice of Dr.
Carstarphea; review email from A.
Sandovzl re: Dr. Karen Garza's revisions to
dejosition; telephone conference with AG's
cfice re: Odden deposition; review email
confirmation of R. Blincoe deposition;
review email from court reporter re: G.
Salazar depo. transcript; email counsel re:
Dr. Garza revisions to deposition; email
counsel re: revisions to T. Wallis deposition.
Attend deposition of B. Wiggins: begin 6.60 hrs
outlining testimony from B. Baker and
identifying Statements of Fact from his
report; conference with R. Gray, Richard
Gray IV re: data to be forwarded over to the
State from Equity Center; review witnesses
and discovery; review data provided by W.

Invoice # 41884

NIC

$2145.00

Page 4



09/13/2012

09/13/2012

09/13/2012

09/13/2012

09/14/2012

N24a0

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

REG

Pierce; review emails from other Plaintiff
attomeys re; discovery and respond; review
emails from W. Pierce re: forwarding
articles of interest.

Review, format, and print data re: exhibits,
conference with counsel re: backup data;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
revise [&S Revenue per Penny analysis for
counsel; telephone conference with Charles
Aki at the Equity Center re: revenue
seeking; telephone conference with Ray
Freeman at the Equity Center re:
inter-district comparisons; review, format,
and print revenue seeking exhibits;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
and Charles Aki re; same.

Travel to and from Houston; speak at Harris
County Superintendent’s meeting;
conference with Richard Gray, IV re:
exhibits; conference with T. Hunter re;:
depositions; review R. Rice email; review T.
Fraissinet email.

Review email re: Lubbock ISD
supplemental response to State Defendants’
RFP; review emails re: Hillsboro ISD
supplemental response to State Defendants
RFP; review email from C. Woods re; Alief
1SD’s supplemental response to State
Defendants’ RFP; email T. Hunter re:Odden
deposition; review email from cour! reporter
re: deposition schedule going forward;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review
email from 1. Pina re: Edzzvo0d 1SD
documents; confer wich T. Hunter re; R.
Blincoe report; review email from D.
Hinojosa re: supp!=mzntal document
production; review . 9/14 email from C.
Woods re: dociment production; review
email from L. Lawrence re: deposition
exhibits; rcview email from 1. Pina re:
Edgewcod ISD updated document index;
review email from P. Fraissinet re: amended
natice of S. Murdock; email counsel re: R.
Slincoe’s dissertation; email counsel re:
Alief ISD supplemental response to RFP,
email counsel re: Quinlan ISD supplemental
responses.

Preparation for deposition of R. Blincoe;
conference with Richard Gray IV re: data to
produce; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re: same; meet with R. Blincoe in
preparation for his deposition.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; review
outline of findings; reply to M.
Trachtenberg; work re: exhibits; review

Invoice # 41884

5.25 hrs

8.25 hrs

6.10 hrs

5.60 hrs

5.15 hrs

$918.75

$3,712.50

WAC

$1820.00

$2,317.50

Pag= 9



09/14/2012

09/14/2012

09/14/2012

05/16/2012

09/16/2012

09/17/2012

09/17/2012

-0

SEJ

VHV

REG

RGIV

REG

material re: K. Kallison; review 1. Pifia
email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review draft conclusions; reply to M.
Trachtenberg email; review L. Lawrence
email; review M. Bono email; review 1. Pifia
email; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review L. Lacy email; review email
re: deposition transcript; review material re:
K. Kallison; work re: exhibit preparation
and organization; review 1. Pifia email.
Review email from L. Lawrence re: Dr.
Klein's invoice; review email from 1. Pina
re: Harlingen 1SD documents.

Attend deposition of R. Blincoe; conference
with R. Blincoe; review emails from various
superintendents re: discovery responses and
respond; telephone conference with R.
Freeman re: sharing data with A. Cortez.
Conference with R. Gray, 11l re: meeting,
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
same, calendar re: same,

Work re: exhibits; review emails; reply to
emails.

Work on Baker's testimony; telephone
conference with Plaintiffs attorneys and Bill
Duncomb re: support to his report and
conferring with Baker; email to W. Pieico
re: maximum tax rates in 2003; review
response.

Review emails re: interrogatory cesponses
from Focus Districts; conference with legal
assistant and counsel re: sane; email same
to counsel; meeting at Eqoity Center re:
exhibits; telephone cecaterence with Wayne
Pierce re: same; review deposition
transcripts and exhibits from same;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: exhibits; review
inter-district comparisons.

Review .. Lacy email; review B.
Duncombe additional analysis; review H D.
Chambers email; reply same; review R.
Fres:man email; conference with R. Gray IV
ve: exhibits; review J. Witte email; review S.
Dahlberg email; review D. Thomson email;
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to S..
Dahlberg email; review R, Schulman email,
review C. Diamond email; review Hanushek
Supplemental Report; review P. Fraissinet
email; review D. Thompson email;
conference with W, Pierce and staff re:
exhibits; telephone conference with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman re: exhibits; review
S. Dahlberg email; reply to same; work re:
additional exhibits; review Hanushek

Invoice # 41884

0.20G-hrs

9.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.50 hrs

4.00 hrs

6.30 hrs

6.25 hrs

N/IC

$2925.00

N/C

$ 675.00

$1300.00

$1102.50

$2,812.50

Fage 100



09/17/2012

09/17/2012

09/18/2012

09/18/2012

310201

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

supplemental report; review M. Sisler email;
review Duncomb revised analysis; review
W. Pierce report; email S. Dahlberg re:
expert designations and reports; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review supplemental
discovery responses; review State's expert
designations; review expert reports of 1.
Guthrie, G. Whitehurst, and Podgursky;
review L. Ayala report; review resumes;
review State’s expert designation; review L.
Davis report and resume.

Review email from L. Lawrence re: 4.45 hrs
deposition exhibits; review email from 1.
Pina re: Izquierdo addendum report; review
email from S. Rosen re: orders entered by
the Court; review email from N. Wills re:
Defendants expert reports and CV's; review
email from Lubbock 18D re: supplemental
response 1o t0 RFP; confer with T. Hunter
re: revisions to interrogatory responses;
review email from R. Gray, 1V re: Los
Fresos 18D supplemental responses; review
emails re: Pflugerville ISD supplemental
response, review email from C. Dupre re:
revisions 1o transcript; review email from
M. Sisler re: deposition of V. Day; review
emails re: Focus Districts Superintendeais’
deposition transcript for trial; review email
from R. Gray, 1V re: Belton 1SD
supplemental responses and resgonies to
interrogatories; confer with R Gray, Ill re:
additional documents produceq after
deposition; continue wor’sre: organizing
and preparing reports and discovery for
attorney review.

Finish outlining Rakaer's testimony; 6.70 hrs
conference with K: Gray re: various
discovery responses; begin reviewing
District responses to discovery from State
and Intervenors and begin assembling our
responce; telephone conference with J.
Kizciit and H. Keller, left message; email to
Eaber re: State's experts.

Meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits; 8.15 hrs
conference with counsel re: same; organize
exhibits and exhibit folder on server;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits; conference with legal assistant re:
discovery; review districts responses to
Intervenors and State’s interrogatories;
meeting with counsel and legal assistant re:
samne; meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits,
Review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); review 5.00 hrs
D. Hinojosa email; review L. Lawrence
email; review L. Davis report; reply to email

Invoice # 41884

NIC

$2177.50

$1426.25

$2,250.00

Page 11



09/18/2012

09/18/2012

-

SEJ

TBH

re: depositions; conference with R, Gray, IV
re: exhibit status; conference with T. Hunter
re: depositions and expert witness; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Thompson email; review P. Fraissinet
email; review D. Hinojosa email; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: exhibits (2);
review D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
review D. Hinojosa email; review status of
supplemental disclosure request; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review exhibits
re: property tax comparisons; review A.
Penn email; review S. Dahlberg ¢mail re:
witness list; review emails re: State’s
experts; review background material re;
State’s experts; review D, Hinojosa emails
(2); conference call with attorneys re: State’s
experts.

Review L. Lawrence email re: deposition 9.00 hrs
¢xhibits; email H. Mclntush re: original
deposition transcripts; review email re;
same; review email from T. Hunter re:
Lufkin 18D supplemental response to RFP;
email counsel re: same; email A. Penn
additional deposition responses from J.
Witte; conference with attorneys re:
discovery responses; email counsel re;Los
Fresnos 1SD supplemental responses to
RFP; email counsel re; Kaufman ISU
supplemental response t0 RFP; review email
from M. Sisler re: Kaufman rsponse;
review response and email M. Sisler re:
same; review email from . Sisler re:
amended response t0RFD’s; review email
from M. Sisler re: H.D. Chambers’ errata
sheet; review and <awzndar email from B.
Baker re: attorucy telephone conference;
confer with 7, Hunter re: same; review
email from T. Williams re: Kaufman 1SD
exhibit; review email from C. Diamond re:
Intervenors’ expert designations; review
email from court reporter re; Kincannon
trauscript; confer with R, Gray, IV re:
Everman’s response to State’s RFP; review
email from S. Dahlberg re: L. Davis’s report
and CV; confer with T. Hunter re: same.
Conference with R. Gray re:State’s experts; 7.60 hrs
review emails from other Plaintiff attorneys
re: same; email to B. Baker re: telephone
conference and testimony; review response;
finish drafting responses to the State's
Interroggs and RFP and Intervenors
Interoggs and RFP; conference with R. Gray
IV and 8. Jennings re: same; begin
preparing for deposition of Linda Roska;

Invoice # 41884

MNAC

$2470.00

Page |2



review cross-examination of C. Foster in
WOCII; telephone conference with
Plaintiffs' attorneys re: State's experts.

09/19/2012 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: exhibits; 15.25 hrs $2668.75
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re;
same; deposition of Wanda Bamberg;
meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits;
review, format, and print exhibits; travel to
kinkos re: copying of exhibits; travel back
from kinkos.

09/19/2012 REG Conference with R, Gray, IV re: W. Pierce 4.50-hrs $2,025.00
exhibits; review Duncombe supplemental
report; review S. Barnett email; review M.
Trachtenberg email; review D. Hinojosa
email; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
Aldine deposition; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review D. Hinojosa
email; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review D. Thompson email; review M.
Trechtenberg email (2); reply to same;
review and revise discovery responses;
conference with T. Hunter re: same;
conference with T. Hunter re: J. Kratsch call
and testimony; conference with R. Gray IV
re: Aldine deposition; review and finalize
discovery response to Intervenors; work o7
exhibits; work re: discovery responses;
work on Findings of Fact and Conclusiois
of Law; conference with T, Hunterre;
discovery and depositions; review
deposition notice for S. Murdoch; review M.
Trachtenberg emails (2); review D,
Thompson email; review S Rodriguez
email; review suppleraental report; review
order changing defendants; conference with
R. Gray, 1V re: exhiiits; review M,
Trachtenberg eixail; review L. Lacy email;
review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same (2); review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with R. Gray, I'V exhibits.

09/19/2012 SEJ Confeyavith R. Gray, IV re: Everman 4.00 hrs $ 400.00

TAAR test results; confer with R. Gray re: 4.00 hrs N/C
same; telephone conference with J. Pfeifer’s
office re: same; review email from A. Tekell
re: revisions to S. Kincannon transcript;
email court reporter re: same; review and
return emails from court reporter re; errata
sheet; review email from Everman ISD re:
replacement exhibit; email A. Tekell re:
errata sheet, organize State experts in Texas
litigation reports for REG review; revise
discovery responses (cont.); confer with
TBH re: same; review email from S,
Rodriguez re: supplemental Duncombe
report; review email from J. Witte re:

-0 Invoice # 41884 Page 17



09/19/2012

09/20/2012

09/20/2012

312

TBH

RGIV

REG

interrogatory answers; review and return
email from C. Pacheco re: Blincoe report
and CV; review and calendar amended
deposition notice for S. Murdock; review
email from L. Robbins re: documents
provided by Dr. Kincannon after her
deposition; review email from L. Robbins
re: revisions to Dr. Kincannon’s deposition;
review R. Gray, IV email to Discovery
Superintendents re: answers to
interrogatories; review email from M.
Trachtenberg re: State and Intervenor expert
reports; confer with T. Hunter re: revisions
to answers to interrogatories; review email
from A. Tekell re: revisions to Dr.
Kincannon's deposition; review Kaufman
ISD attachment to interrogatory responses;
review email from R. Gray, IV re: Everman
STAAR test results; telephone conference
with Everman ISD staff re: same; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same; email counsel re:
Belton 1SD supplemental response to RFP.
Edit discovery responses to State and
Intervenors; respond to email from M.,
Trachtenberg re: FOF and COL and review
his proposal; Telephone conference with C
Jensen at court re: questions re: FOF oG
COL,; prepare mock cross of W. Pierce.
Conference with counsel re: exhibits,
conference with legal assistant ra: same,
title pages, and table of conteriis; telephone
conference with Tedrah Robinison at Equity
Center re: taxpayer plain'iif addresses;
telephone conferencewith Ray Freeman at
Equity Center re: 6630 exhibits; review
email from Tedrah Robinson re: taxpayer
plaintiffs addreszes; review and mark
inter-district comparisons re: taxpayer
plaintiff's homes; conference with counsel
re: exhibiis; conference with legal assistant
re: riew cxhibits; review, print, and format
sarne, meeting with counsel re: review
exhibits; conference with counsel re: backup
data questions; review backup data sent to
the State; conference with legal assistant re:
same; telephone conference with Adam
Pierce re: exhibits.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review
supplemental report; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: exhibits; research B.
Hammond; review Trachtenberg email,
reply to same; review transcript of L.
Dawn-Fisher presentation; conference with
T. Hunter re: discovery responses; review

Invoice # 41384

6.00 hrs

5.40 hrs

8.40 hrs

$1950.00

$945.00

$3,780.00

Fage L4



09/20/2012

09/20/2012

09/21/2012

09/21/2012

09/21/2012

i

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

M. Trachtenberg email; reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter and W. Pierce re:
deposition preparation; review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same; review
L. Lawrence email; review M. Trachtenberg
emails (8); review L. Halpern email; review
P. Fraissinet emails (3); review S. Dahlberg
email; review S. Barnett email; review D.
Hinojosa emails (2); work on exhibits;
finalize discovery responses; review data for
lzquierdo report; review S. Dahlberg email;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
exhibits and deposition; review L. Picus
emails; review L. Dawn-Fisher report, data,
and resume.

Review email from 1. Pina re: underlying
data for expert lzquierdo; review email from
court reporter re: W. Pierce deposition;
review email from T. Hunter re: revisions to
responses to0 RFD; review email from M.
Trachtenberg re: transcripts from
Wisnowsky and L. Dawn-Fisher
presentations; confer with R. Gray re: same;
continue work re: organizing and preparing
reports and discovery for attorney review.
Conference with R. Gray re: discovery
responses; review emails from M.
Trachtenberg re: same; prepare W. Piercc
for deposition; finalize discovery responses;
email to all superintendents re: sam,
several telephone conferences with W,
Pierce re: data; respond to several emails
from S. Dahlberg re: datz Tor Pierce report;
review emails from W. Merce re: same;
respond to S. Dahlberg; prepare for
deposition of L. Posxa,

Deposition of Vayne Pierce; create
spreadsheet of taxpayer plaintiff
inter-distnct comparisons.

Review L. Lawrence email; review D,
Hinoitea email; review M. Trachtenberg
en:ail; review D. Thompson email; email S,
Dahlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher deposition;
present W, Pierce for deposition; finalize
deposition notice for L. Dawn-Fisher;
review correspondence from J. Dietz;
review additional deposition notices; review
discovery responses; review correspondence
re: Kingsville ISD; review emails re: FAST
Report; review emails re: L. Moak/D. Casey
deposition preparation; review J. Turner
email; review D. Thompson emails, (2);
reply to same.

Review email from S. Rosen re: Findings of
Fact; confer with T. Hunter re: same; review

Invoice # 41884

0.75 hrs
1.50 hrs

6.50 hrs

6.15 hrs

8.35 hrs

3.00 hrs
3.75 hrs

$ 7500
N/C

$2112.50

$1076.25

$4,207.50

$ 300.00
N/C

Page L5



09/21/2012 TBH

09/22/2012 RGIV

09/22/2012 REG

H02-n

email from M. Sisler re: Defendants'
response t0 Edgewood discovery; review K.
Garza verification; review J. Pfeifer
verification; review email from L. Peyton
re: deposition notice of Dr. Podgursky;
review and calendar L. Ayala and W.
Grover deposition notices; review email
from H. McIntush re: withdrawal of Focus
District; review T. Williams verification;
review L. Lawrence email re: amended
responses to discovery requests and
deposition notice of J. Guthrie; review email
re: R. Blincoe answers to interrogatories;
confer with T. Hunter re: Alief 1ISD
documents responsive to State’s
interrogatories; review H.D. Chambers
verification; review additional Podgursky
reports; review R. Knight verification:
review FAST report re: Coalition Focus
District; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review email from K. Garza re: document
production; confer with R. Gray, 1V re:
same; review H.D. Chambers verification;
prepare deposition notice for L.
Dawn-Fisher; review email from L.
Lawrence re: deposition exhibits; review
email from M. French re: discovery
questions; review email from N.
Bunker-Henderson re; documents feom Dr.
Blincoe; confer with T. Hunter 1=: same;
review email from C. Pacheco re: S.
Kincannon documents agrecd to produce
after deposition and 8. Kir.zannon
deposition notice; review email from R.
Gray, 1V re: documents from Belton ISD;
email counsel re: caie; review email from
counsel re: expert deposition schedule;
review email @rom J. Knight re: attachment
for interrogatory responses; confer with T.
Hunter r=: verifications; email counsel re: L.
Dawn-Fisher deposition.

Telaphone conference with B. Baker re: 3.00 hrs
exparts; follow up with emails to all
attorneys; attend deposition of W, Pierce;
finalize discovery responses; respond to
emails re: discovery, telephone conference
with Plaintiff attorneys, Duncombe, Oddeon
and Moak re: experts.

Prepare for meeting with Taxpayer 3.00 hrs
Plaintiffs; meeting with Taxpayer Plaintiffs;
conference with counsel re: same.
Conference with attorneys re: meeting with 2.50 hrs
witness; review L. Lawrence email,
conference with attorneys re: depositions
and experts; conference with client witness,

Invoice # 41884

$975.00

$525.00

$1,125.00

Pege 16



09/22/2012

09/23/2012

09/23/2012

09/23/2012

09/24/2012

09/24/2012

J:02-0t

RGIV

REG

R. Gray, 1V, and T. Hunter re: testimony
and status.

Meet with Taxpayer Plaintiffs; conference
with R. Gray re: same.

Meeting with counsel re: exhibits; telephone
conference with Tim Wolff re: case status.
Work re: exhibit preparation; review L.
Dawn-Fisher report.

Prepare for deposition of Linda Roska
respond to email from L. Mclntosh re:
discovery responses; review and respond to
email from M. Trachtenberg re: Findings of
Fact and Conclusions of Law.

Review and reply to email from Karen
Garza re: responses {0 interrogatories;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce re:
exhibits; review and reply to email from
Ray Freeman re: Inter-District Comparison
Report; conference with counsel re: all;
review and update exhibit folder with
Gonzalo Salazar documents; conference
with legal assistant re: same; review Charter
School's Interrogatories; email counsel re:
same; review and reply to email from
counsel re: curriculum vitae of or Harrison
Keller and James Kracht; research re: samv:;
conference with legal assistant re: responces
to Districts’ interrogatories; review
Intervenors’ responses {o our interrogatories
and request for production; ema:l counsel
re: same.

Review email; review L. Dawn-Fisher
report; review P. Colbert/Geposition email;
telephone conference with P. Colbert re:
same; prepare for B, Hammond deposition;
review matenial r2: J. Guthrie; review M.
Podgursky matinal; prepare for Coleman
deposition; conference with R. Gray, 1V re;
W. Pierce call; review FAST Report 2012,
review F._Josen email; review H. McIntush
corresyendence; review email re: W. Pierce
degosition; review P. Colbert email; email
S.Dahlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher; email P.
Colbert and W. Pierce re: same; review T.
Robertson email; reply to same; review S.
Dahlberg email; forward same to P. Colbert;
review L. Dawn-Fisher database;
conference with L. Molk re: deposition;
review Everman STAAR results; review W.
Pierce email; review Fort Bend amended
discovery responses; review discovery
responses; review Charter discovery
responses; review discovery responses;
review notices re: B. Hammond deposition;
review 8. Dahlberg email; reply to same;

Invoice # 41884

2.00 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.00 hrs

5.15 hrs

6.60 hrs

$650.00
$262.50
$ 675.00

$650.00

$%901.25

$2,970.00



09/24/2012

09/24/2012

noxy

SEJ

TBH

review M. Trachtenberg email; review L.
Lawrence email; review documents
produced; review D. Thompson email;
review T. Robertson email; reply to same.
Finalize and serve responses to State 3.50 hrs
Defendants and Intervenors Interrogatories 7.00 hrs
and Reguests for Production; review email
from C. Pacheco re: Charter Schools
response to Plaintiffs’ RFD; review email
from S. Rodriguez re: Ft. Bend 1SD's
objections and responses to Defendants’
interrogatories and RFP’s; review email
from S. Rodriguez re: deposition revisions
from Dr. Sconzo; review email from C.
Diamond re: Intervenors' answers and
responses to discovery requests; review
email from C. Pacheco re; Charter Schools
responses to discovery; review email from
C. Diamond re: document production;
telephone conference with D. Kitsos, Alief
ISD, re: response to interrogatories; review
email from A. Tekell re: Belton 1SD data;
review email from B. Trevino re: G. Salazar
verification; review J. Knight verification;
review email from S. Rosen re:
identification badges; confer with R. Gray
re; same; review M. French verificatio:;
confer with T. Hunter re: forwarding copy
of Guthrie report to R. Blincoe forteview;
review Intervenors’ discovery respenses;
review C. Pacheco email re: Charter School
responses; confer with T. Hunter re;
verification; review email from S.
Rodriguez re: Ft. Berd discovery responses,
confer with T. Hunter re: Intervenors’
discovery responces, review email from T.
Hunter re: Plajatifs’ General Objection;
revise interrogatory responses re: same;
confer witii. T. Hunter re: upcoming
depositions; review email from L. Lawrence
re: davesition exhibits; review email from
G. Salazar re: interrogatory responses; email
W Pierce and P. Colbert State’s response to
Edgewood RFP; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
video link produced at G. Salazar
deposition.

Prepare for L. Roska's deposition; finalize 6.00 hrs
responses to the State’s and Intervenor
Interrogatories; review emails from R. Gray
on various matters and respond; email 10 B.
Baker re: conference on other expert
reports; review response and invite other
Plaintiff attorneys; meet with L. Moak and
R. Gray re: L. Dawn-Fisher's report; review
discovery responses from Intervenor and

Invoice # 41884

$ 350.00
N/C

$1950.00

Page 13



09/25/2012

09/25/2012

09/25/2012

A10z-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Charter schools; review response of State to
Ft. Bend and Calhoun City discovery;
telephone conference with R. Schulman re:
extension.

Review mail re: verification pages for Karen 4.15 hrs
Garza (Lubbock); conference with legal
assistant re: same; review, scan, and file
STAAR results for Everman ISD;
conference with counsel re: same; meeting
at Equity Center re: data and exhibits;
conference with counsel re: same; telephone
conference with Charles AKki re: same;
review and format updated exhibits; print
same; conference with counsel re: same;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
re: 6630 runs; conference with counsel re;
same; review and reply to email from
Wayne Pierce re: deposition transcript.
Review M, Trachtenberg email; reply to 5.75 hrs
same; review D. Hinojosa email; reply to
same; review L. Lawrence email; review W.
Pierce email; email S. Dahlberg re: data
request; review C. Diamond email;
complete preparation for R. Coleman
deposition; review K. Kallison report with
data; email W, Pierce re: Kallison and L.
Dawn-Fisher, partial attendance at L. Rozka
deposition; conference with Argie for re.
exhibits; begin work on Findings of Tacts;
email W. Pierce and R. Freemar re’ meeting
re: depositions; review Intervenors'
discovery responses; review. F. Fraissinet
email; review 8. Dahlberz vmail; email L.
Moak re: same; revieww niessage from L.
Moak; telephone conference with L. Moak
re: R. Coleman deposition; review A. Cortez
deposition notice; teview P, Colbert emails
(2); review V. Pierce emails (3); reply to
same; review S. Dahlberg email; email W.
Pierce ro: same; review amended discovery
respenzes; review deposition notice for Dr.
Folks; review W, Pierce emails (3); reply to
same (2); review deposition notice for T.
Currah.

Revise Proposed Findings of Fact (cont.); 4.80 hrs
review and calendar Dr. Folks deposition
notice; review email re;: D, Currah
verification; confer with R. Gray, [V re: W,
Pierce deposition transcript; telephone
conference with court reporter re: status of
transcript; confer with R. Gray re: status;
review email from C. Diamond re:
documents; review email from M. Sisler re:
amended response to Calhoun Co.
interrogatories; review and email R. Gray

Invoice # 41884

$726.25

$2,587.50

M
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09/25/2012

09/26/2012

09/26/2012

09/26/2012

31036

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

re: specific objections and answers; confer
with T. Hunter re: Findings of Fact and
expert reports; confer with R. Gray, 1V re:
transcript of W. Pierce deposition; email C.
Diamond re: document production; review
email re: same; continue work on draft
Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; continue work re; organizing and
preparing reports and discovery for attorney
review,

Attend deposition of L. Roska; work on 700 trs
Findings of Fact; emails to H. McDaniel re:
discovery; review email from B. Schulman
re: extension.

Deposition of Rob Coleman; revise and 6.00 hrs
update exhibit binder; conference with
counsel re: same; conference with counsel
re: Findings of Fact; create digital version of
exhibit binder.

Complete preparation for R. Coleman 6.90 hrs
deposition; review L. Lawrence email;
secure R. Coleman deposition; review email
re: Equity Center meeting; conference with
S. Jennings re: same; review A, Kauffman
email, reply to same; review W, Pierce
email; review T. Robertson email; review
(partial) P. Guthrie report; review additivnal
exhibits; review C. Diamond email; revicw
additional exhibits for A. Parker; conference
with W. Pierce and R. Freeman e: L.
Dawn-Fisher and K. Kallison zeoorts; email
§. Dahlberg re: data.

Review and calendar deposition notices; 6.75 hrs
confer with T. Hunter re: Proposed Findings
of Fact; review emails from C. Woods
(Alief 1SD) re: chati vesponses to State
Defendants’ infcrtogatories; review email
from T. Hun‘er, re: Podgursky documents;
continue revising Proposed Findings of
Fact; confer with T. Hunter re: same; review
email from C. Diamond re: Intervenors’
respoases to State Defendants’ discovery;
nview email from L Pina re: Edgewood
Plaintiffs’ responses to Intervenors’ RFP to
Plaintiff Groups; review email from I. Pina
re: Edgewood Plaintiffs’ responses to
Intervenors’ interrogatories to Plaintiffs;
review Edgewood Plaintiffs’ responses to
Intervenors’ RFP; review email from 1. Pina
re: Edgewood Plaintiffs’ responses to
Intervenors’ Interrogatories; email court
reporter re: transcript and exhibits for R.
Blincoe; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
responses to Charter Schools'
interrogatories; review email from C.

Invoice # 41884

$2275.00

$1050.00

$3,105.00

NAC

Page 20



09/26/2012

092712012

09/27/2012

09/27/2012

09/27/2012

09/28/2012

3igzal

TBH

RGIV

SEl

RGIV

Pacheco re: Charter School witness
depositions; review email from C. Diamond
re: withdrawal of App. A to A, Parker
report; confer with R, Gray re: same; review
B. Gilcrease verification; continue work re:
all parties discovery responses and expert
designations.

Prepare for Podursky and Gutherie
deposition; review email from AG re:
Blincoe notes; email to Blincoe re: same;
email to Equity Center re: Board meeting;
review responses; conference with Richard
Gray IV re: Findings of Fact; continue to
draft Findings of Fact.

Prepare Trial Witness Exhibit notebooks;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with counsel re: 2012 Revenue
Per WADA numbers; review expert report
of Lisa Dawn-Fisher,

Review email re: charter school experts;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review T.
Hunter email; travel to San Antonio; attend
deposition of A, Cortez; conference with D.
Hinojosa re: scheduling; return to Austin;
review emails re: scheduling and trial
presentation (8); review L. Lacy email,
review MALDEF discovery (supplemeawi)
objections; review 5. Dahlberg email; reply
to same; review C. Diamond email; roview
Intervenor’s discovery responses: review M.
Trachtenberg email; reply to same.

Review email from court reporter re: R.
Blincoe deposition transcript; email R.
Gray, 1V re: same; coafer with T. Hunter re:
draft Proposed Conclusions of Law; review
and reply to T. Hunicr email re: Podgursky
deposition and answers to Charter Schools
interrogatorics; review and return email
from T. Hunter re: B. Baker deposition;
email cowit reporter re: deposition schedule;
review email from T. Hunter re: Proposed
Conclusions of Law; prepare initial draft;
canfer with T. Hunter re: same; review
2mail from I. Pina re: revised Cortez expert
report; review from L Pina re: Edgewood
Plaintiffs objections and responses to
Defendants’ interrogatories and RFP's.
Attend Board meeting at Equity Center,
prepare for Podgursky deposition; work on
Findings of Fact; exchange emails with
Plaintiff attorneys re: planning meeting.
Review email from Ray Freeman re:
2011-2012 PEIMS Summer collection data
anomaly; create trial exhibit binder for Roy
Knight, Thomas Wallis, and Joddie Witte;

Invoice # 41884

6.50 hrs

6.10 hrs

10.50 hrs

325 hrs

4.40 hrs

4.55 hrs

$2112.50

$1067.50

$4,725.00

NIC

$1430.00

$796.25

Fage 21



09/28/2012

09/28/2012

09/28/2012

09/29/2012

09/30/2012
09/30/2012

Fierpl

REG

SEJ

RGIV

prepare sutnmary sheet for counsel re: all
plaintiff's experts.
Review M. Trachtenberg emails (2); reply 4.50 hrs
to same; review R. Freeman email; email
attorneys re: Duncomb preparation; review
deposition notice for A. Parker, review P.
Fraissinet email; reply to same; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits and follow up
with W. Pierce and R. Freeman; review P.
Colbert email; review expert witness list;
review expert witness list for Charter
Plaintiffs; review D. Hinojosa emails (2);
reply to same; review L. Halpern email;
review supplemental report of Podgursky;
review email re: backup material for
Podgursky; review P. Fraissinet emails (2);
reply to same (2); review S. Dahlberg email;
review additional L. Halpern email; prepare
for presentation to coalition; review P,
Fraissinet email; review D. Thompson
email.
Confer with T. Hunter re: Podgursky 4.25 hrs
deposition schedule; email court reporter re:
same; review ermnail from court reporter re:
same; email M. Sisler re: security clearance
for T. Hunter on 10/2; review and calenda:
email re: Duncombe deposition preparation;
review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental discovery responses; teriew
email from L. Halpern re: supplemental
report of Dr. Podgursky; telepirone
conference with court reporier re: transcript
of Dr. Lesley; review emiri from court
reporter re: same; em:il court reporter re: R.
Blincoe transcript; review email from court
reporter re: same;-confer with T. Hunter re:
review of Focus Yistrict Superintendent
depositions; =mail court reporter re:
Podgursky deposition; continue work re:
discoveiy iesponses and expert reports.
Telephone conference with B. Baker and 1.50 hrs
PLiniff attorneys re: Pidgursley;s
erosition; respond to emails and various
matters.
Make presentation to Coalition; prepare for 4.00 hrs
A. Parker deposition; review L. Moak
supplemental report; review A. Podgursky
supplemental report; review Vigdor
supplemental report; review D. Hinojosa
email; review A, Bronson email; reply to
same; review J. Turmner email; reply to same.

Meeting with counsel re: exhibits. 0.35 hrs
Work re: exhibits; review emails re: Vigdor 3.50 hrs
report.

Invoice # 41884

$2,025.00

W/C

$487.50

$1,800.00

$61.25
$1,575.00

$123416.25

Page 12



TINEKEEPER RECAP

REG

III, Richard E. Gray Partner

RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
VHV  Vuy, Vincent Paralegal
Fee Recap Totals
310294

138.55 hrs @
114.25 hrs @
121.00 hrs @
17.50 hrs @
0.00 hrs @

39130

Invoice # 41884

450.00 /r
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$62,347.50
$19,993.75
$39,325.00
$ 1,750.00
3 0.00

$123,416.25

Page 23



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

October 31, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoicett: 42145-1 REG
Our file#-. 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billing through: 10/31/2012

¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

10/01/2012 RGIV  Meeting with counsel re: exhibits; meeting 5.50 hrs $ 962.50
at Equity Center re; same; prepare
spreadsheet re: James Kallison deposition;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce
and Ray Freeman re: exhibits.

10/01/2012 REG Review W. Pierce email, reply to same; 4.75 hrs $2,137.50
review emails re: L. Moak supplements;
reply to same; review L. Lacy email re:
exhibits; review D. Hinojosa email re:
exhibits; review emails re: Podgursky data
and deposition; review W. Pierce email;
review email re: depositions; coaference
with RGIV re: Kallison researzly; review D.
Hinojosa email re: depositicns; review §.
Dahlberg email re: deposidons; reply to
same; conference with RGIV re: exhibits;
review Vigdor supplemental report; review
deposition notices; review S. Flores
deposition notice; conference with T.
Hunter re: Podzursky deposition; work with
W, Pierce ro: exhibits; prepare status report;
compleic preparation for A. Parker
depozuion; review H. McIntush email;
review amended D. Casey report.

10/01/2012 SEJ E:mail court reporter re: exhibits; review 2.40 hrs NAC
email from M. Sisler re: deposition of N.
Cortez; review email from R. Gray re:
supplemental Vigdor report; review and
return email from court reporter re: original
deposition transcripts; review email from M.
Sisler re: deposition of Flores; review email
from H. McIntush re: Moak supplement and
Casey amended report; review email from
D. Hinojosa re: Ayala report and
attachments; review email from L.
Lawrence re: deposition exhibits; review
email from L. Lawrence re: Odden



10/01/2012
10/01/2012

10/02/2012

10/02/2012

10/02/2012

10/02/2012

3ta-0]

TBH
LVS

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

materials; review email from L. Lawrence

re; Calhoun County ISD's second

supplemental designation of experts and

supplemental report of Dr. Vigdor, review

email from C. Diamond re: backup data for

Hanushek; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

confer with T. Hunter re: Odden materials;

prepare for 10/2/12 Plaintiff attorney

meeting; confer with R. Gray re: same;

review email from H. McIntush re: Ft. Bend

ISD supplemental designation of experts;

confer with R. Gray re: backup data for

Hanushek; confer with R. Gray re:

Whitehurst article on class size.

Attend deposition of M. Podgursky. 10.00 hrs
Telephone conference with T. Hunter; 0.10 hrs
review emails from B. Baker; pull and

prepare for delivery to Hunter.

Meeting at Equity Center re: exhibits; 10.25 hrs
conference with counsel re: same.
Review and reply to emails re: 10/2 lawyers’ 10.50 hrs

meeting; complete preparation for A. Parker
deposition; review emails re: 10/2
depositions; review supplemental expert
designation; review emails re: exhibits;
review emails re: J. Vigdor; review L.
Lacey email; review C. Diamond email;
reivew W. Pierce email; reply to same;
attend A, Parker deposition; partial
attendance at B. Duncombe depasition
preparation; review S. Dahlberg email;
review L. Dawn-Fisher data set; review L.
Lawrence email; review . Liamond email;
review S. Dahlberg eraall; review J, Turner
email; reply to S. Dahlberg; review D.
Hinojosa email; review C. Diamond email;
review W_ Pierce cmail; conference with R.
Gray IV re: exbibits; review L. Lawrence
email; conierence with attorneys re: trial
scheduling, exhibits, strategy and
depositions.

Ei:ail B. Baker re: backup data for 0.75 hrs
Hanushek; confer with T. Hunter re: same; 0.75 hrs
prepare for 10/6/12 deposition; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher report; email
P. Colbert re: same; review email from S.
Rosen re: upcoming court training session;
confer with T. Hunter re: D. Casey and L.
Moak deposition; review emails from L.
Lawrence re: deposition exhibits; confer
with T. Hunter re: Moak draft supplemental
report re: FAST,

Work on Findings of Fact and Conclusions 7.80 hrs
of Law; draft responses to Charter

Invoice # 42145

$3,250.00
N/C

$1,793.75

$4,725.00

§ 75.00

N/C

$2,535.00

Page 2



10/03/2012

10/03/2012

10/03/2012

J10z-61

RGIV

REG

SEJ

interrogatories; respond to several emails
from other Plaintiff attorneys re: exhibits;
review article by B. Baker criticizing
Hanuschek; meet with Plaintiff attorneys re;
trial plan and other matters; conference with
R. Gray re: same; create list of Baker
exhibits for Richard IV.

Format and print final exhibit binders; 9.15 hrs
organize digital exhibits; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re; same;
review and reply to email from counsel re:
data run, meeting at equity center re: exhibts
and Kallison deposition preparation; format,
print, and bind new and final exhibit
binders.

Review R. Schulman email; review H. 9.25 hrs
McIntush email; review D. Thompson
email; attend B. Duncombe deposition;
attend D. Casey deposition; review emails;
reply to same; review deposition notice of J.
Folks; review correspondence re; Charters;
conference with R. Gray, 1V re: Findings of
Fact; review additional deposition notices;
review D. Hinojosa email; review material
re: L. Dawn-Fisher; conference with W.
Pierce, P. Colbert, and R. Freeman re:
preparation for K. Kallison deposition;
review emails; review deposition transciipts

re: exhibits.
Confer with R. Gray, 1V re: revisions to 2.00 hrs
exhibit notebook; conference with R. Gray, 2.45 hrs

1V re: same; conference with 7. Hunter re:
deposition schedule; revies: and revise
current schedule; corferonce with R. Gray
re: deposition transcripts received and
reviewed; review-=mail re: W. Pierce
deposition trarscript; email W, Pierce re:
review of saine; confer with T. Hunter re:
depositions; work re: Podgursky exhibits;
review email from S. Rodriguez re:
correcied Moak Casey report; review email
re. R Blincoe dissertation corrections;
canfer with T. Hunter re: charts from
Podgursky report; prepare charts for
exhibits; confer with T. Hunter re: letter to
superintendents re: trial testimony; email
superintendents re: same; review and
calendar Defendants’ notice of continuation
of Dr. Izquierdo deposition; review ermail
from Superintendent Chambers re;
availability for trial testimony; review and
return email from H.D. Chambers; review
and return email from M. French re: trial
testimony; review emails from J. Pfeifer re:
trial testimony and scheduling.

Invoice # 42145

$1,601.25

$4,162.50

$200.00
N/C

FPage



10/03/2012

10/04/2012

10/04/2012

10/04/2012

10/04/2012

10/05/2012

3102401

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

Attend deposition of W. Duncombe;
conference with R. Gray re: various matters;
draft letter to focus district superintendents;
work on Baker deposition preparation; work
on Findings of Fact and Conclusion of Law.
Review, format, and print appendix to
James Kallison’s expert report; conference
with counsel re: same and deposition
transcripts of Todd Williams and Reece
Blincoe; review emails re: exhibits; research
re: Eanes 1SD; review inter-district
comparisons; conference with legal assistant
re: same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: exhibits; review Kallison
Appendix data and compare to discovery
responses; email counsel re: same; meeting
with Ray Freeman re: testing exhibits;
create digital folders of the deposition
exhibits of Todd Williams and Reece
Blincoe; conference with legal assistant re:
same.

Review D. Thompson emails (2); reply to
same; review D. Hinojosa email; review S.
Dahlberg email; review J. Turner email;
work re: exhibits; review M. Trachtenberg
email; telephone call to M. Trachtenberg -
left message; work re: deposition
preparation; review B. Schulman email;
review S. Dahlberg email; reply to same;
prepare for K. Kallison deposition.

Review discovery correspondznce from M,
Sisler; review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental responses to discovery; review
emails from J. Pfeifer re: court testimony;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; confer with
R: Gray re: expertieport of J. Knight; work
on exhibit notebocks (cont.).

Prepare B. Baker for deposition; conference
with P. Fraissinet and A. Brownson re:
same; iclephone conference with M.
Trachieriberg re: Picus/Baker; work on
Fizding of Fact; review L. Moak
supplements; review exhibits from R.
Blincoe and Williams deposition; review D,
Casey supplement report; email to R.
Blincoe re: same; conference with R. Gray
re: depositions and exhibits.

Finish preparing trial binders for testimony
of Reece Blincoe and Todd Williams;
conference with legal assistant re: exhibit
numbering; meeting with Ray Freeman re:
exhibits; review and reply to email from
Wayne Pierce re: same; draft and send email
to Discovery Superintendents re: Charter
School's Interrogatories.

Invoice # 42145

5.80 hrs

7.10 hrs

6.25 hrs

3.25 hrs

5.80 hrs

3.70 hrs

$1,885.00

$1,242.50

$2.812.50

$325.00

$1,885.00

$ 647.50

Fogr 4



10/05/2012

10/05/2012

10/05/2012

10/06/2012

10/06/2012
10/06/2012

10/06/2012

10/07/2012

10/07/2012

10/08/2012

10/08/2012

J0z401

SEY

SEJ
SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

Review and reply to emails; attend and
secure deposition of K. Kallison; review
emails; review deposition transcripts.
Review email to P. Colbert re: review of
deposition transcript and exhibits, return of
original to court reporter; confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review invoices for
depositions; work re: trial exhibits.

Attend deposition of L. Moak; conference
with Plaintiff’s attorneys re: Baker
depositions; conference with R. Gray re:
Kallison deposition.

Pre-deposition meeting with B. Baker and
T. Hunter; present B. Baker for deposition;
work re: deposition designations; work re:
exhibits; email attorneys re: trial strategy;
review replies.

Continue work re: trial exhibits.

Continue work re: trial preparation and
exhibits.

Conference with B. Baker and R. Gray re:
deposition; attend deposition of B. Baker;
conference with B. Baker re: follow up at
trial.

Draft findings of fact; conference with
counsel re: same; conference with legal
assistant re: marking of exhibits.
Conference with R. Gray, IV re: exhibiw;
email H.D. Chambers re: status (2); vaview
H.D. Chambers reply (2); work re:
deposition designations; review emails;
reply to same.

Telephone conference wicx Kay Freeman re:
6630 exhibits; confersnce with legal
assistant re: trial badges; conference with
counsel re: findings-of fact and conclusions
of law; continve drafting findings of fact;
meeting with counsel re: case status;
correct, revise, and update exhibits.
Review H.1D. Chambers email; reply to
same; work re: exhibits; work re: deposition
dezignations; work re: preparation for R.
Dawn-Fisher deposition; review P. Colbert
email with attachments; review J. Witte
email; reply to same; review M. Sisler email
cancelling S. Murdoch deposition; email D.
Thompson re: S. Murdoch; email M.
Trachtenberg re: Currah; conference with
staff re: trial preparation; review L.
Lawrence email; review S. Murdoch
material; review C. Diamond email; review
deposition notices of Wood & Rolle; review
D. Hinojosa email; reply to same;
conference with T. Hunter re: additional
exhibils; review State responses to Charter

Invoice # 42145

10.25 hrs

5.75 hrs

9.50 hrs

71.00 hrs

3.50 hrs
6.25 hrs

13.00 hrs

9.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

6.70 hrs

775 hus

$4,612.50

$575.00

$3,087.50

$4,950.00

$350.00
$625.00

$4,225.00

$1,662.50

$ 675.00

$1,172.50

$3,487.50

Page 5



10/08/2012

10/08/2012

10/05/2012

10/09/2012

nai-m

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

School discovery; review discovery
production re: Charter Schools; conference
with T. Hunter re: witness order; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: Findings of Fact;
review M. Trachtenberg email; review D.
Hinojosa email; review D. Thompson email;
review J. Turner email; review deposition
notice of S. Beaulieu; review Ft. Bend
discovery; review P. Colbert email; reply to
same,

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits;
conference with attorneys re: status and trial
preparation; confer with T. Hunter re: travel
for B. Baker; confer with R. Gray re: trial
badges; telephone conference with Justice
Center re: same; email attorneys re: same;
email B. Lesley re: review of deposition
transcript; confer with T. Hunter re; same;
review and calendar S. Bealieu deposition;
review email from L. Payton re: Dr. Bumns
errata; continue work on trial exhibits.
Conference with R. Gray and R. Gray IV re:
trial exhibits, trial order, trial logistics;
conference with L. Moak re: Baker
deposition, his deposition, the State’s case
and alternate way to look at the
disadvantage to our districts; conference
with W, Pierce re: latter; telephone
conference with T. Robertson re: Amiended
Petition and updating superintendeints
during trial; review Ft. Bend and State’s
response to Charter Interrogaiories; review
Education Code for Char¢:: Authorization;
edit Baker testimony; review Baker
exhibits; several emails with Baker and
Moak re: issues thavcame up in Baker's
deposition; review Los Colonia’s video;
email to G. falazar re: same; review
response; wlephone conference with S.
Dahlberg i¢: depositions; begin preparation
for Avala deposition; email to D. Hinojosa
re. nal order; same to P. Fraissinet.
Continue drafting findings of fact;
conference with legal assistant re; exhibit
marking; conference with counsel re:
exhibits; review same; review and reply to
email from superintendents re: response to
Charter School interrogatories.

Prepare for T. Currah deposition; attend T.
Currah deposition; review email re: A.
Cortez deposition; review Kallison
transcript; review L. Lawrence email;
conference with P. Colbert and W, Pierce
re: L. Dawn-Fisher deposition; review
MALDEF discovery responses; review L.

Invoice # 42145

6.15 1irs

7.50 hrs

7.75 hrs

10.75 hrs

N/

$2,437.50

$1,356.25

$4,837.50

Papa b



10/09/2012

10/09/2012

10/10/2012

10/10/2012

10/10/2012

1024H

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Lawrence emails; review D. Hinojosa email;

reply to same; review Calhoun County

objection to Charter discovery.

Review and organize L. Dawn-Fisher 10.00 hrs
exhibits and reports; continue work re: trial

preparation; review emails from counsel re:

deposition exhibits and trial exhibits; confer

with T. Hunter re: Podgursky bubble charts;

review email from L. Lawrence re: Calhioun

County ISD’s response to Charter Schools'

interrogatories.

Finalize discovery responses to Charters; 6.20 hrs
email to A. Brownson re: LDF's data and

Podgusky data; review responses; review

several email from B. Baker and respond,

review email from D. Hinojoas re: trial

witnesses; layout schedule for Ayala

deposition; telephone conference with W.

Pierce re: target revenue; get badge for

Court.

Continue drafting findings of fact and 7.40 hrs
conclusjons of law; continue work on

exhibits; conference with legal assistant re:

exhibits; review findings of fact and fill in

exhibit numbers; conference with counsel

re: exhibits.

Review P. Colbert emails; complete 5.25 hrs
preparation for L. Dawn-Fisher depositiun;

email W. Pierce re: testimony; revisw D.

Hinojosa email; reply to same; ravicw W.

Pierce email; reply to same; conference with

R. Gray, 1V re: exhibits, depozitions and

witness preparation; revia.D. Thompson

emails (4); reply to szme (4); review 1.

Turner email; review B. Baker revised

analysis of $6630; rcyiew D. Hinojosa

email; reply tosante; conference with D,

Thompson aid,F. Fraissinet re: §. Murdoch

testimony: review draft Rule 11 agreement;

conference with T. Hunter re: witness list;

review -}, McIntush emails (2); review D.

Hi:x0j0sa email; review W, Pierce email;

review J. Turmer email; review W. Pierce

email; complete preparation for L.

Dawn-Fisher deposition.

Confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; work 4.00 hrs
re: responses to Charter Schools' RFP’s; 4.00 hrs
confer with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits;

continue work re: responses to RFP's;

review and return email from court reporter

re: confirmation of L. Dawn-Fisher

deposition; review email from T. Hunter re:

Los Fresnos responses to RFP; review

emails re: depositions; review email re:

Calhoun Co. responses to Charter Schools’

Invoice # 42145

$1000.00

$2,047.50

$1,295.00

$2,362.50

$400.00
N/C

Fage 7



10/10/2012

10/11/2012

10/11/2012

10/11/2012

10241

RGIV

S

interrogatories; review Rule 11 agreement
re: deadlines; finalize and serve response to
Charter Schools’ interrogatories; confer with
T. Hunter re: same; continue work re;
exhibits; telephone call to Los Fresnos ISD -
left message; review emails from R.
Freeman re: meeting with Steering
Committee; review emails re: revisions to
master exhibit list; review email from W.
Pierce re: table for T. Hunter review; review
email re: Dr. Hanks errata; review email
from C. Pacheco re: documents produced by
Charter Schools; review email from J.
Wittte re: additional discovery answers;
review email re: Intervenors’ interrogatory
answers as exhibits; review email from and
confer with R. Gray, [V re: B. Lesley CV
and report as additional exhibits; confer
with attorneys re: revisions and additions to
Findings of Fact; confer with T, Hunter re:
status of revisions to Findings of Fact.
Attend deposition of L. Ayala; conference
with D. Hinojosa re: same and trial order;
draft Findings of Fact; meet with P.
Fraissinet re: trial order; conference with R.
Gray re: J. Wisnowski; finalize response t
Intervenor; telephone conference with ]:
Freeman re: update on litigation commiuiee;
conference with L. Halprin re: Bakér
exhibits; review exhibit list; rev.ew state aid
to wealthy districts.

Finalize findings of fact; conilerence with
counsel re; same; continve work on exhibits;
test technology in corrtroom; conference
with office manager and legal assistant re:
same; conference with counsel re: exhibits.
Review emails; ceply to same; review
Charter discovery responses; review
responses 1o Charter discovery; review W.
Pierce email; review R. Freeman email;
reply \o same; review P. Colbert emails;
secure deposition of L. Dawn-Fisher; review
emails; reply to emails.

Review emails from counsel re: additional
exhibits; telephone conference with M.
Sisler re: Plaintiffs’ document production;
telephone conference with G. Salazar re:
questions re; trial preparation; confer with
T. Hunter re: Findings of Fact; continue
work re: trial preparation; review email
from H. MclIntush re: Joint Motion for
Leave to Amend Disclosures; review email
from D. Hincjosa re: same; review emails
from T. Hunter and R. Gray, IV re:
additional exhibits; review email from I.

Invoice # 42145

8.50 hrs

8.75 hrs

11.50 hrs

2.50 hrs
1.75 hrs

$2,762.50

$1,531.25

$5,175.00

$250.00
N/C

Page B



10/11/2012

10/12/2012

10/12/2012

10/12/2012

3103401

TBH

RGIV

REG

SES

Pina re: Dr. Lopez’s errata; review email
from L. Medina re: applications for badge
access; confer with R. Gray, 1V re: Everman
reports; confer with T. Hunter re: including
additional superintendent testimony to
Findings of Fact, R. Blincoe CV as an
exhibit; review Findings re: testimony of J.
Knight; review email from N. Mills re:
Defendants’ supplement to third amended
disclosures.

Draft Findings of Fact for superintendents; 7.00 &irs
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
Target Revenue; review emails from R,

Gray IV re: exhibits and witness list;
respond to same; email to B. Baker re: C.
Wood,; review email from B. Baker re:
$3,500.00; email to R, Gray IV & W. Pierce
TE! same.

Conference with office manager re: trial 1.75 hrs
exhibit technology, conference with counsel
re: same and exhibits; review trial pad
presentation.

Review P. Fraissinet emails (2); reply to 6.75 hrs
same; review S. Murdock email; reply to
same; review W, Pierce email; reply to
same; review P. Colbert supplemental
report; conference with S. Jennings re:
supplemental report; review P. Fraissine;
email; reply to same; review W. Pidroe
email; reply to same; review supolemental
disclosures; review L. Lacy email; review S.
Dahlberg email; email attorneys re: same;
review email from T. Ro'»:rtson; review P.
Fraissinet email; revi<w M., Trachtenberg
emails (2); work on Findings of Fact &
Conclusions of Law; review W. Pierce
email; re: Averape; review P. Fraissinet
email; review PB. Freeman email; review
new exhibits; telephone conference with W.
Pierce re:'exhibits; begin outline of W.
Pierce testimony.

Review email re: supplemental Murdock 2.50 hrs
raports; review email from P. Fraissinet re: 1.75 hrs
same; confer with R. Gray re: supplemental
Murdock reports; confer with R. Gray, [V
re: status of trial exhibits; confer with R.
Gray re: supplemental report of P. Colbert;
email counsel re: same; work re: deposition
transcripts and files for trial; confer with R.
Gray re: revision of 6630 charts; confer with
R. Gray, IV re: Blincoe deposition as an
exhibit; review email from M. Sisler re:
Defendants’ supplemental responses to
Charter Schools and Edgewood’s RFP;
telephone conference with W. Pierce re:

Invoice # 42145

$2,275.00

$ 306.25

$3,037.50

$250.00
N/C

Prge 9



10/12/2012

10/13/2012

10/13/2012

10/13/2012

10/14/2012

10/14/2012

10/14/2012
10/15/2012

10/15/2012

g

REG

SEJ

SEJ

TBH
RGIV

REG

revisions to 6630 comparison charts; confer

with R, Gray, IV re: same; review and serve

second supplemental response to all parties’

RFD; confer with attorneys re: preparation

of witness list; review email from R.

Freeman re: 5576 exhibits; confer with R.

Gray re: same; confer with T. Hunter re:

H.D. Chambers’ availability and Dr. Kratch

exhibit.

Continue to draft Findings of Fact; review 6.50 hrs
calendar provided by Phillip; conference

with R. Gray re: same; review emails from

various Plaintiff's re: order of witnesses.

Review S. Murdock power point; review S. 5.25 hrs
Murdock report; outline W. Pierce

testimony; review M. Trachtenberg email;

reply to same; review P. Fraissinet email.

Continue work re: revisions to Findings of 2.75 hrs
Fact; review email from L. Halpemn re:

additional docs generated by Duncombe.,

Draft Finding of Facts and Conclusion of 8.00 hrs
Law; review emails from various Plaintiff

attorneys and respond.

Work on S. Murdock outline; email W. 3.00 hrs
Pierce re: exhibits; telephone conference

with W. Pierce re: exhibits and status;

review emails (15); reply to same; review J.

Kracht exhibit; review draft order.

Email T. Hunter re: Chambers’ aveilcbility; 1.75 hrs
review email from R. Gray re: addilional 3.00 hrs
5576 exhibit; review email from W. Pierce

re: same; review email from R. Gray re:

preparation of additiona! 3576 exhibit for

trial; continue work ra: irial exhibits; review

email from B. Lesley re: review of

deposition transcnpi; review email from H.

McIntush re: propased order on motion for

additional disclosures; review errata from B.

Lesley.
Draft Findings of Facts. 6.00 hrs
Finalize exhibits and serve on all parties; 12.00 hrs

ceting with counsel and Wayne Pierce re:
trizl testimony run through; Telephone
conference with Elizabeth Medina in Judge
Dietz’s court re: trial schedule.
Review list of common exhibits; work re: 10.75 hrs
exhibit list and witness list; review emails;
reply to same; review M. Trachtenberg
email; reply to same; review S. Murdock
email; email attorneys re: S. Murdock;
review L. Lacy email; review M. Bono
email; review message from W. Pierce re;
1&S rates; review emails; review L, Moak
email; telephone call to W. Pierce re: Dean
final data; work re: exhibits; conference

Invoice # 42145

$2.112.50

$2,362.50

N/C

$2,600.00

$1,350.00

$175.00
N/C

$1,950.00
$2,100.00

$4,837.50

Page L)



10/15/2012

10/15/2012

10/16/2012

L3[tF2iN

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

with W. Pierce re: trial testimony; review
M. Trachtenberg email; review notice from
court reporter; review L. Payton email;
review Edgewood witness list; review S,
Dahlberg email; conference with R. Gray,
IV re: call to Court; review Third Amended
Petition of Intervenors; review exhibits of
other parties; review W. Pierce deposition
corrections; conference with S, Jennings re:
same; review emails re: conclusions of law;
review M. Trachtenberg email; email State
re: witness order.

Review email from P. Fraissinet re:
potential additional Murdock slides; confer
with attommeys re: revisions to exhibit and
witness lists; continue work re: exhibit and
witness lists; review email from L. Lacy re:
Vigdor exhibits; review email from court
reporter re: L. Dawn-Fisher exhibits; email
court reporter re: comprehensive list of
depositions; review email from L. Moak re:
Guthrie article; confer with R. Gray re: W.
Pierce errata; review email from W. Pierce
re: same; email counsel re: same; email
counsel re: Plaintiffs' Exhibit and Witness
Lists; review email from L. Payton re: Hole
errata; review email from M. Lorber re:
Intervenors’ Second Amended Plea in
Intervention; review email from C.(Facheco
re: Charters’ First Amended Petition; confer
with T. Hunter re: final review and revision
of exhibit and witness lists; review email
from M. Sisler re: designaiion of deposition
testimony; confer with aitomeys re;
deposition designations; efile and serve
Exhibit and Witress Lists; review email
from S. Rodriguaz re: Ft. Bend ISD’ trial
filings; confcr with R. Gray, 1V re:
preparation of exhibit binders; review email
re: Caltiouit County 15D’s trial documents;
review cmail re; Defendants’ Master Exhibit
List and proposed witness list; review email
fvom M. Henderson re: witness list; review
2mail from R. Schulman re: designation of
experts and witnesses, exhibits, and
deposition designations; confer with
attorneys re: all parties’ exhibits; confer with
R. Gray re: review of Defendants’ exhibits.
Attend deposition of J. Gutherie; draft
Findings of Fact; conference with Plaintiff
attormeys re: various matters; attend trial
preparation for W. Pierce.

Conference with counsel and legal assistant
re: exhibits of all parties; meeting with legal
assistant re: same; test technology in Judge

Invoice # 42145

4.00 hrs
3.50 hrs

10.00 hrs

4.70 hrs

$400.00
N/C

$3,250.00

$ 82250

Fage L]



10/16/2012

10/16/2012

10/16/2012

EALIFEIE

REG

SEJ

TBH

Dietz's courtroom.

Review emails; reply to emails; conference 10.00 hrs
with staff re: exhibits, depositions, and W.
Pierce notebooks; review Charters Amended
Petition; email C. Diamond re: B.
Hammond; review P. Fraissinet emails (2);
reply to same; review revised L. Moak
report; review D. Hinojosa email; telephone
call with M. Trachtenberg and P. Fraissinet
re: Murdock deposition preparation; review
charter schools’ witness list; review draft of
Guthrie deposition; review J. Tumer email;
review D. Hinojosa email; attend J. Folks
depaosition; review emails re: witness order;
work re: opening; review J, Turner email;
review P, Fraissinet email; review email to
H.D. Chambers; review Whitehurst
deposition transcript; review H.D.
Chambers email; review J. Turmer email;
begin exhibit review; review amended
depaosition designations; review M. Bono
email; review P. Fraissinet email; review
updated trial calendar; telephone conference
with attorneys re: exhibits objections;
additional review of exhibits.

Email J. Pfeifer re: Podgursky bubble 3.00 hrs
charts; review email from J, Pfeifer re: 3.50 brs
same; confer with T. Hunter re: same;
review Intervenors’ exhibits; confer with R.
Gray re: same; review email re: Sdrewood
exhibit list; confer with attorncys re:
deadline to object to exhibits; review email
from H. MclIntush re: Mc2lz reports; review
email re: Dr. Guthrie ‘ranscript; efile and
serve amended exhibit list, review email re:
Whitehurst deposition exhibits; confer with
T. Hunter re: Podgursky charts for
superintendeats’ review; email
superintendents re: same; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: trial exhibits;
review 2mail from J. Pfeifer re; Podgursky
charts; review email re: Ft. Bend ISD's first
amended depo. designations; review email
from T. Hunter re: Podgursky charts; email
counsel re: Plaintiffs’ exhibits; review email
from counsel re: receipt of same; confer
with T. Hunter re: Findings of Fact; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: forwarding trial exhibit
to Judge's staff attorney; confer with T.
Hunter re: witness schedule; review email
re: Defendants’ amended Master Exhibit
List and corrected list; confer with T.
Hunter re: revisions to Findings.

Finalize trial schedule for 1st week; uncode 9.00 hrs
Podgusky’s scatter charts and email to J.

Invoice # 42145

$4,500.00

$300.00
N/C

$2,925.00

Page 11



10/17/2012

10/17/2012

10/17/2012

-

RGIV

REG

SE]

Pfeifer to review; review emails from J.
Pfeifer re: same and respond; conference
with all Plaintiff's attomneys and R. Gray re:
objection to exhibits; edit Conclusion of
Law and Findings of Fact.

Conference with counsel re: preparation and 4.20 hrs
case status, exhibits, and deposition
designations; review emails re: State
defendant’s amended exhibit list and
corrected witness list; print same for
counsel; review discovery and exhibit lists;
meeting with Wayne Pierce re: trial
testimony.

Review emails; reply to same; complete 7.00 hrs
review of exhibits; conference with R. Gray,
IV re; exhibits and Court schedule; review
C. Diamond email; reply to same; review P.
Fraissinet email; reply to same; review
notice from Court; reply to same; review C.
Diamond email; email W. Pierce re: Friday
meeting; email attomeys re: opening
statements; review draft conclusions of law;
review D. Hinojosa emails (2); review D.
Thompson email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review State’s supplemental
discovery; review P. Fraissinet email,
review S. Murdock material; review
amended witness list; outline opening; einail
W. Pierce re: testimony; review D.(H/nojosa
email; review M. Sisler email; roview H.
Mclntush email; review L. Mazk
Supplemental material; review S. Dahlberg
emails; conference with '»". Pierce re:
witness reparation; crenierence with T,
Hunter re: witness preparation; review L.
Halpern email; review B. Baker
supplemental rcpott; review T. Hunter
email; conference with S. Jennings re:
exhibits; continue review of exhibits.
Review einail re: Kallison transcript and 3.75 hrs
exhibiis; review email re: Dr, Baker
trzaseript and exhibits; review email re;
Eeulieau depo. and exhibits; review email
from M. Sisler re: data files; confer with
attorneys re: preparatjon for trial; review
email from E. Medina re: Judge’s request for
conference with all counsel; confer with T.
Hunter re: revisions to Findings; review
email from M. Sisler re: Defendants'
supplemental response to RFP; review
emails from M. Sisler re: corrected witness
list; confer with T. Hunter re: revisions to
Findings of Fact; review email re: backup
data for corrected Moak supplemental
report; review email from S. Hemandez re:

Invoice # 42145

$ 73500

$3,150.00

NiC

Pape 13



10/17/2012

10/18/2012

10/18/2012

10/18/2012

Kfli-Brls

RGIV

SEI

State’s exhibits; review email from T.
Robertson re: list of Coalition districts;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: Intervenors'
exhibit list.

De-code Podgusky charts; edit Findings of
Fact; edit and revise Conclusion of Law;
draft overtime for Findings of Fact; review
Intervenors exhibits for possible objections;
telephone conference with B. Baker re:
supplemental report; email to parties re:
Baker supplement; telephone conference
with L. Halpem re: Baker supplement.
Conference with office administrator re:
technology for trial; conference with legal
assistant re: exhibits; review trial
presentation; format and print data for
counsel; email Linda Halpern re: Podgursky
data; travel to courthouse re: test trial
technology; test technology in Judge Dietz’s
courtroom; review emails re; discovery;
review and print same; email Tedrah
Robertson re: contact information for
taxpayer plaintiffs; conference with counsel
re: same.

Travel to and from Houston; conference
with 8. Murdock and P. Fraissinet re:
testimony; review emails; reply to samz;
review E. Medina email; review W. Pierce
emails (2); review L. Lawrence email;
review master exhibit list; review C.
Diamond email; review H. McIntush email;
teview D .Hinojosa email; coiterence with
R. Gray, IV re: exhibits; zview D,
Thompson email; repty io same; review W,
Pierce email; reply to same; review L.
Payton email; review, supplemental
discovery; revicwy A. Cortez supplemental
report; email 2. Hinojosa re: same; outline
opening and outline Murdock testimony;
work on V. Pierce direct.

Revi=w.email from T. Robertson re:
litigaiion meeting; confer with T. Hunter re:
status of Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; continue work re: revisions to
same; confer with T. Hunter re: Fourth
Amended Petition; email B, Baker re:
review of depo. transcript; review and retum
email from L. Pina re: depo. designations;
review H. McIntush email re: amended
exhibit list; review email from L. Payton re:
Dr. Cain’s errata; review email from M,
Sisler re: supplemental responses to
discovery requests; revise, efile and serve
Fourth Amended Petition; review email
from C. Pacheco re: amended exhibit list.

Invoice # 42145

6.00 hrs

6.05 hrs

10.75 hrs

2.15 hrs

$1,950.00

$1,058.75

$4,837.50

NAC

Fage (¢



10/18/2012

1071972012

10/19/2012

10/19/2012

10/19/2012

310207

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Draft supplement to Response to RFD; draft
Amended Answer, collect material to
response of L. Halpern challenges, B.
Baker's supplemental report; finish ordering
Findings of Fact; finalize Conclusion of
Law; draft emails to superintendents re:
Pogursky's charts; review Charter School
exhibits.

Review emails re: exhibits, discovery,
supplemental expert reports; conference
with Judge Dietz re: trial; print and review
STAAR reports; meeting with counsel and
Wayne Pierce re: trial testimony; conference
with counsel re: defendant’s objections to
our exhibits.

Prepare for 10/19 hearing; review emails;
reply to same; review W. Pierce email; reply
to same; email D. Hinojosa re: same; work
re: W. Pierce testimony; review H,
MclIntush email; reply to same; review
amended disclosure responses; review
emails re; Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law; review M. Trachtenberg email;
review Charts Supplemental exhibit list;
review MALDEF deposition designations;
review pro hac vice motion; review emails
re: exhibits objections; attend status
conference; email S. Murdock re:
presentation; review W, Pierce emuil; reply
to same; email D. Hinojosa re: same;
conference with B. Wood, R.Gray, IV and
W. Pierce re: trial testimony; review
additional material re: Chuster Schools;
work re: 8. Murdock <esiimony; review D.
Ray email; review P. Fraissinet email;
review MALDEF apjections; review Ft.
Bend objectiors; 1aview State’s objections;
review addit{onal production.

Review emxil from C. Pacheco re: exhibits;
review cmail from T. Robertson re:
additivial questions from M. French; confer
wiih T. Hunter re: additional information for
secerintendents re: Podgursky charts;
review email from M, Sisler re: amended
exhibit list; confer with T. Hunter re: further
corrections and revisions to Findings of
Fact; confer with R. Gray re: status; review
email from C. Pacheco re: supplemental
documents; review email from M. Sisler re:
Defendants’ objections to exhibits; review
email from S. Rodriguez re: objections.
Prepare for conference with Judge; attend
meeting of Legislative Committee;
conference with R. Freeman; edit and draft
Findings of Fact; emails to M. Trachtenberg

Invoice # 42145

6.00 hrs

8.15 hrs

9.25 hrs

1.60 hrs

8.00 hrs

$1,950.00

$1.426.25

$4,162.50

LT

$2,600.00

Phge LS



10/20/2012

10/20/2012

10/20/2012

1072042012

10/21/2012

10/21/2012

10/21/2012

1072172012
10/22/2012

10/22/2012

10/22/2012
10/22/2012

RALIFRH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

DI

RGIV

SEJ

re: same; review objection of other parties;
review Plaintiff's emails on objection to
exhibits.

Telephone conference with Tim Wolff and
Wayne Pierce re: exhibits and backup data
for same; conference with counsel re: same;
draft memo re: same; telephone conference
with Shelley Dahlberg re: same.

Review M. Trachtenberg email; reply to
same; review S, Dahlberg email; reply to
same; review W. Pierce deposition; work re:
exhibits; review P. Fraissinet email; reply to
same; work re: objections; work re: exhibits;
work re: opening.

Review email from T. Hunter re: revisions
to Findings of Fact; review emails re:
objections to exhibits and deposition
exhibits; confer with T. Hunter re: Plaintiffs’
exhibits; review email from P. Fraissinet re:
findings re: Murdock report; continue work
re: revisions and preparation of Findings;
review email from counsel re: Findings of
Fact; confer with attomeys re: sending
Findings to Judge’s staff attorney.

Draft additional Findings of Fact; edit
Findings of Fact document; conference with
R. Gray re: Wayne's exhibits; conferencc
with other Plaintiff attormeys re: witness
order; draft trial brief; instruct lega( assistant
on pleadings for Monday; revie'v einails
from L. Halpemn re: Bruce Baker's
supplemental report; conferaiice with B.
Baker re: same.

Conference with courisel re: exhibits;
telephone conference with Wayne Pierce,
Tim Wolff, and Chailes Aki re; same;
continue reviewing STAAR results.

Prepare S. Muraock testimony; review and
reply to emails; complete opening; work re:
exhibits.aihd W. Pierce testimony.

Revievr 2mail from T. Hunter re: witness
scriequle; email C. Jenson re: Plaintiffs’
Findings of Fact; email C. Dupre re: charts;
<onfer with T. Hunter re: revisions to Trial
Brief; review email from L. Lawrence re:
master exhibit list and preadmitted exhibits.
Prepare for trial.

Draft Confidentiality Agreement between
the Equity Center and Calhoun County.
School Finance trial; meeting with Micah
Skidmore re: exhibit backup data.

Trial Day 1; prepare for Day 2.

Email Superintendents re: review and
testimony re: Podgursky bubble charts;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review

Invoice # 42145

6.15 hrs

6.50 hrs

6.15 hrs

6.00 hrs

6.00 hrs

7.50 hrs

1.20 hrs

6.00 hrs
1.00 hrs

9.80 hrs
12.00 hrs

0.60 hrs
1.50 hrs

$1,076.25

$2,925.00

NI

$1,950.00

$1,050.00

$3,375.00

N/C

$1,950.00
N/C

$1,715.00
$5,400.00

$ 60.00
N/C

Puge 16



10/22/2012

10/23/2012

10/23/2012

10/23/2012

10/23/2012

G20,

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

email from J. Reich re: additional exhibits;
efile and serve Trial Brief, confer with
attorneys re: same; review email re:
Bamberg errata; review email from T.
Robertson re: trial schedule; review email
from C. Nickell re: Colbert invoice; review
email from T. Hunter re: Chambers’ trial
testimony; review email re: report of Dr.
Cortez; email superintendents re: Podgursky
charts; review email from M. French re:
same; confer with T. Hunter re: G. Salazar
trial prep and testimony; review email from
T. Hunter re: ). Pleifer testimony; review
email fromT. Hunter re: taxpayer testimony
and preparation; telephone conference with
T. Robertson re: taxpayer prep and
testimony; review G. Salazar email re:
Podgursky charts; review email re: Casey
errata; review email from M. French re: trial
prep.

Conference with R. Gray re: pre-trial issues;
finalize trial brief; antend trial, draft Pfeiffer
testimony; several emails to M. French
responding to his questions; email to Pfeifer
re: trail testimony; instruct staff on
arranging meeting with taxpayer Plaintiffs:
conference with B. Wood.

Trial; conference with counsel re:
unweighted averages exhibits; telephone
conference with Wayne Pierce re: data
supporting exhibit; email same o Micah
Skidmore.

Trial Day 2, prepare for Day 3; review
Findings of Fact & Conclusions of Law,
Review emails re: Everman STAAR
reports; review eraii from M. French re:
State's export ciiatis; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; review email from court reporter
re: L. Dawi-Fisher depo. exhibits; email G.
Salazar Pudgursky charts; email court
reporter re: B. Lesley depo. exhibits; review
email from M. French re: Podgursky charts;
review email from M. Jacobs re: Calhoun
County exhibits; review email re: Frost and
Ray erratas; email J. Pfeifer re: outline of
testimony; review email from M. Jacobs re:
supplemental exhibit list; review email from
L. Lawrence updated master exhibit list.
Conference with R. Gray re: Murdock;
attend trial; work on J. Pfeifer testimony;
review email from A. Brownson and L.
Moak re: Podgursky charts; email same to
all superintendents; respond to email from
other attorney's calendar; conference with L.
Halpren re: Baker supplemental report;

Invoice # 42145

6.50 hrs

10.30 hrs

9.75 hrs

1.60 hrs

7.50 hrs

$2,112.50

$1,802.50

$4,387.50

N/C

$2.437.50

Paype 17



10/24/2012

10/24/2012
10/24/2012

10/24/2012

107252012

10/25/2012

1072572012

JiGiot

RGIV

REG
SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

forward backup data to L. Halpern,
conference with 8. Dahlberg re: taxpayer
witnesses.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Jerilyn
Pfeifer for testimony.

Trial Day 3, prepare for Day 4.

Review email from L. Lawrence re:
Waggoner demonstrative exhibit; review
email from T. Robertson re: meeting with
Plaintiff parents; review emails re;: Moak
district data reports; review email from L.
Lawrence re: revised Master Exhibit List;
review emails from court reporter re: erratas
for M. Miles, Schreder, and Duncombe;
review and retum email from W. Pierce re:
testifying witinesses and schedule; confer
with T. Hunter re: same; email testifying
superintendents re: trial transcript; review
email from S. Kincannon re: same; confer
with attorneys re: same; telephone
conferences, confer with attorneys, re:
meetings and trial prep. for H.D. Chambers;
confer with R. Gray re: trial transcript for
testifying superintendents’ review and
preparation for trial; confer with R. Gray re:
H.D. Chambers trial prep.; review email
from R. Gray, IV re: Everman reports;
review Everman STAAR reports; confer
with T. Hunter re: same; review and
compare Everman STAAR repo:ts and trial
exhibits re: same; confer with/T. Hunter re:
same; efile and serve amended Exhibit List;
confer with attomeys re: sume; review email
from M. Sisler re: revised exhibit list;
review email from court reporter re: Pompa
errata, confer with T, Hunter re: W. Pierce
trial prep.; revicw emails re: Podgursky
bubble charts; review email re: Limon
demonstraiive exhibit,

Attend irial; prepare J. Pfeifer for testimony;
review caveral emails from superintendents
d respond; conference with R.Gray re:

tiial; review several emails from Plaintiff
attorney and respond.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with plaintiff
counsel re: trial schedule.

Triat Day 4. conference with attorneys re:
schedule.

Organize and prepare Moak reports and
exhibits for T. Hunter review; email court
reporter re: transcript and exhibits; review
email from court reporter re: same; confer
with R. Gray re: 10/24 trial transcript; email
testifying superintendents re: review of
transcript; review and return email from T.

Invoice # 42145

12.00 hrs
12.50 hrs

1.60 hrs
2.00 hrs

7.50 hrs

10.65 hrs

11.00 hrs

2.25 hrs

$2,100.00
$5,625.00

$160.00
N/C

$2.437.50

$1.863.75
$4,950.00

N/C

Pags 18



10/25/2012

10/26/2012

10/26/2012

10/26/2012

10/26/2012

1072712012
10/28/2012

10/28/2012

10/28/2012

1072972012

Iz

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG
RGIV

REG

RGIV

Robertson re: scheduling Plaintiff parents
for trial prep; confer with T. Hunter re:
same; review and organize H.D. Chambers
and C. Dupre reports and exhibits for
attorney review; confer with R. Gray re:
same; review email re: K. Waggoner
demonstrative exhibit; confer with T.
Hunter re: same.

Attend trial; conference with J, Pfeifer and
R. Gray re: Pfeifer testimony; meeting of
Plaintiff's attorneys re: schedule and
strategy.

Review emails re: discovery, trial schedule;
exhibits; create powerpoint for testimony of
HD Chambers; email same to counsel and
witness; meeting with counsetl and Wayne
Pierce re: testimony; conference with
counsel re: schedule.

Conference with attomeys re: trial
presentation; conference with R. Gray, IV
re: demonstratives; review D. Thompson
emails (2); reply to same (2); review P.
Colbert message; review Power Point;
conference with P. Colbert re: status and
testimony; conference with W. Pierce, R.
Freeman, R. Gray, IV and T. Hunter re:
status, exhibits, and testimony.

Confer with T. Hunter re: trial witness
schedule; email W. Pierce and P. Coibert re:
same; revise, efile, and serve amenrled
exhibit list.

Draft outline for Pfeifer testinony; draft
cutline for taxpayer (4) t<.timony; attend
preparation of W, Pictce; conference with
R.Gray re; weekend schedule.

Outline H.D. Chzwiuers testimony.
Conference with counsel re: powerpoint for
superintendent; testimony; revise
powerpoini; legal research re; taxpayer
faimess.ciaim.

Prepae for call with H.D. Chambers; work
re.'W. Pierce exhibits; review H. McIntush
email; review amended witness list and
depositicn list for Ft. Bend; review L.
Lawrence email re: exhibits; telephone call
to H.D. Chambers re: status and trial
testimony; prepare for Day 5.

Prepare J. Pfeifer for testimony on Monday;
review L. Moak's slides and comment; send
back up data from B.Baker to L.Halpern;
email to all Plaintiff attorneys re: witness
order.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel
re: case status and testimony of HD
Chambers; preparation of Brad King for

Invoice # 42145

11.00 hrs

7.10 hrs

425 hrs

0.70 hrs

3.80 hrs

4.75 hrs
2.00 hrs

3.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

10.25 hrs

$3,575.00

$1,242.50

$1,912.50

R/

$1,235.00

$2,137.50
$ 350,00

$1,575.00

$ 48750

$1,793.75
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1072972012
10/29/2012

10/29/2012

10/30/2012

107302012
10/30/2012

107302012

10/31/2012

10/31/2012

1073172012

10/31/2012

3io-H

REG
SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

testimony; telephene conference with

Wayne Pierce re: exhibits.

Trial Day 5; prepare for Day 6. 9.75 hrs
Confer with T. Hunter re: M. French trial 0.00 hrs
testimony; email M. French re: same; confer

with attorneys re: revised Moak

presentation; review email from M. Sisler

re: supplemental discovery responses;

review email from L. Lawrence re: revised

exhibits; review email from R. Gray re:

change of plans for H.D. Chambers; revise

travel plans for H.D. Chambers; telephone

conference with H.D. Chambers’ office re:

same; review email from M. French re: triat

schedule; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

telephone conference with G. Salazar re:

date of testimony; confer with T. Hunter re:

same; review email re; cancelled

depositions; confer with T. Hunter and R.

Gray, IV re: Taxpayer testimony outlines;

confer with T. Hunter re: B. King trial prep.

Conference with I. Pfeifer re: testimony; 9.40 hrs
attend trial; review Finding of Facts for

edits and additions for J. Pfeifer;s

testimony; edit outline for taxpayer

testimony; conference with L. Halpern re:

Baker cross; email to Baker re: trial

preparation; respond to emails from M.

French and G. Salazar, meet with . Xing,

taxpayers witness for trial preparation.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with Wayne 12.85 hrs
Pierce re: testimony; meeting with Chip

Langston re: testimony; roceting with Randy

Pittenger re: testimory; meeting with

Norman Baker re; testimony; conference

with counsel re: sarne.

Trial Day 6, prepare for Day 7. 11.00 hrs
Review ema’l from L. Lawrence re: 0.00 hrs
amended exhibit list;

Edit testiiony of taxpayers, review 9.70 hrs

calendar of witnesses; attend trial, meet with

taimayers in preparation for their testimony.

Prepare for trial; trial; review state’s 9.90 hrs
amended answers to Calhoun County

interrogatories; conference with counsel re:

same.
Trial Day 7, prepare for Day 8. 10.75 hrs
Confer with T. Hunter and R. Gray, 1V re: 1.00 hrs

adding Kracht exhibit; review and revise

exhibit list; efile and serve Third Amended

Exhibit List; confer with R. Gray, IV re:

same.

Conference with taxpayer witnesses; attend 8.50 hrs
trial; conference with H.D. Chambers and

other staff from Alief; review Findings of

Invoice # 42145

$4,387.50
N/C

$3,055.00

$2,248.75

$4.950.00
N/IC

$3,152.50

$1,732.50

$4,837.50

N/C

$2,762.50
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Fact; finalize trial testimony for M. French.

TINMEKEEPER RECAP

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E.

TBH Hunter, Toni Partner

DI Jacks, John D, Partner

SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal
LVS  von Sternberg, Lynn

Fee Recap Totals

Hax

25475 hrs @
209.65 hrs @
218.10 hrs @
0.00 hrs @
5145 hrs @
0.00 hrs @

733.95

Invoice # 42145

45000 /r
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
275.00 /hr
100.00 thr
100.00 /hr

$227,353.75

$114,637.50
$36,688.75
$70,882.50
$ 0.00
$ 5,145.00
$ 0.00

$227,353.75
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

November 30, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#. 42173-1 REG
Qur file# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing thzough: 1173072012
¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austip, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
110172012 RGIV  Prepare for trial; trial; conference with 7.80 hrs $1365.00
counsel re: case status and trial schedule.
1170172012 REG Trial Day 8; work re: prepare for Day 9, 8.75 hrs $3,937.50
review emails.
110172012 SEJ Confer with R. Gray, IV re: amended 1.20 hrs N/C

exhibit list; confer with T. Hunter re:
objections to Baker exhibits; review updated
Master Exhibit List re: same; review emaj}
from L. Lawrence re: amended Master
Exhibit List and additional discovery
responses; email W. Pierce CV to 7.
Bennett; review and return emall from J.
Knight re: testimony schedule. confer with
T. Hunter re: same; confer with T. Hunter
te: Baker CV and objecticais by party;
prepare summary; en.3il M. French re:
testimony outline; confer with T. Hunter re:
summary of objeciions.

11/01/2012 TBH Conference with R, Gray re: witnesses and 8.00 hrs $2,600.00
trial testimony, attend trial; prepare for M.
French's ¢z:timony; review Findings of Fact;
email io Plaintiff's attorneys re: next week's
wituass order,

11/02/2012 RGIV  (npanize file and case structure; prepare 2.00 hrs $350.00
powerpoint for Quinlan ISD testimony;
email same to counsel and Michael French
for review; conference with counsel re: case
status; conference with legal assistant re:
amending exhibit list and adding exhibits.

11/02/2012 REG Review W. Pierce emails; reply 1o same; 375 hrs $1,687.50
conference with R. Gray, IV re: Power
Points; work re: deposition designations;
review discovery responses; review new
database produced by State; review T.
Robertson emails; review emails; review
additional exhibits; review deposition



11/02/2012

11/02/2012

11/03/2012
11/04/2012

11/05/2012

11/05/2012

11/05/2012

11/05/2012

11/06/2012

11/06/2012

31m-ol

SEJ

TBH

REG
REG

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

notices of D. Pierce and D. Dunn;
conference with T. Hunter re: same; review
R. Freeman email; reply to same; review B.
Baker outline; telephone conference with
W;. Pierce and R. Freeman re: 1&S data,
review additional emails; review W, Pierce
email with [&S chart; reply to email.
Confer with R. Gray, IV re: Murdock Power
Point presentation, Alief Power Point
presentation, and amended exhibit list;
review and revise exhibit list; efile and
serve amended exhibit list; confer with T.
Hunter re: revisions to master exhibit list;
revise, efile, and serve Fourth Amended
Master Exhibit List; confer with T. Hunter
re: Baker trial testimony outline; review
email from M. Sisler re: Pierce and Dunn
deposition notices, amended notices, and
second amended notices; review and update
deposition calendars.

Review news coverage of yesterday's
testimony, review several emails to and
from Plaintiffs attorneys re: witnesses for
Monday and Tuesday; edit draft of Baker's
testimony; email to Baker re: same.

Work on Kallison cross.

Review emails; reply to same; emait S,
Dahlberg re: &S data; prepare for Tay 9;
review 8. Dahlberg email; reply 10 same;
review emails; review STAAK-Power Point.
Prepare for trial; trial; prepaie Michael
French for testimeny: revise powerpeint for
same and send to all paities.

Trial Day 9; prepaie for Day 10; review
emails; review tmiat Power Points.

Review emal from L. Lawrence re:
amended =xhibit list; review email from H.
MclIntush re: Casey and Hoke trial
presentations; review and retum email from
T. Robertson re: trial schedule; confer with
R.Gray re: amended Duncombe report;
review and email R. Gray re: same; review
email from C. Pacheco re: notice of
appearance and withdrawal; review email
from T. Hunter re: trial schedule; review
email re: Edgewood exhibits; review emails
from J. Knight re: testimony schedule.
Conference with R. Gray re: witnesses;
attend trial; prepare M. French for trial.
Prepare for trial; trial; conference among
attorneys re: trial status and scheduling.
Trial Day 10; prepare for Day 11.

Invoice # 42173

1.00 hrs
0.75 hrs

3.65 hrs
0.25 hrs

3.25 hrs
3.00 hrs

10.95 hrs

9.50 hrs

0.75 hrs

10.00 hrs

10.15 hrs

10.75 hrs

$100.00
N/C

$1,186.25
N/C

$1,462.50
$1,350.00

$1916.25

$4,275.00

N/C

$3,250.00

$1776.25

$4,837.50

Page 2



11/06/2012

1 1/06/2012

FHAOT7/2012
11/07/2012
11/07/2012

11/07/2012

11/08/2012
11/08/2012

11/08/2012

3|2 {3

SEJ

TBH

RGIV
REG
SE)

RGIV
REG

SEJ

Review email from T. Hunter re: findings of
fact attributable to H.D. Chambers and W.
Pierce; prepare excerpts; review email from
L. Payton re: Carstarphen errata; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
response to RFP; review email from L.
Lawrence re: updated master exhibit list;
review email from D. Sawvel, court
reporter, re: invoice for transcripts; review
email from M. Patterson re; Defendants’
Seventh Amended Master Exhibit List;
confer with T. Hunter re: Defendants’
witness lists.

Conference with M. French re: testimony;
attend trial.

Prepare for trial; tnial.

Trial Day t1; prepare for Day 12,

Review emails from 1. Pina re: deposition
schedule; review emails from attomeys re:
deposition schedule; email H. Keller re: trial
testimony and preparation; telephone
conference with H. Keller re: same; review
email re; trial transcript; review and
calendar Wisnoski deposition notice; review
email re: Moak errata; review deposition
schedule re: J. Wisneski; review and tevise
calendar re: same; review and calendar
amended Wisneski notice; review eriail
from I. Pina re: Bast, Trotter ana Moe
deposition notices; confer with R. Gray, IV
te: exhibits; review Fourth- Amended Master
Exhibit List; email attoineys re: same; email
T. Hunter re: objections to exhibits; review

TTSFC master exhiibit list re; same; email T.

Hunter re: same: r=view email from C.
Diamond re:deposition schedule; review
email from T. Hunter re: scheduling Dr.
Kracht and H. Keller; email Dr. Keller re:
schedule; email T. Hunter re: Dr. Kracht's
availability; confer with T. Hunter re;
rescheduling M. French; email T. Hunter re:
. Kracht and H. Keller availability; review
email from C. Pacheco re; depositions.
Attend trial; email exchange with B. Baker
re: trial preparation; review exhibit list.
Prepare for trial; trial.

Trial Day 12; review emails; work re: prep
for Day 13.

Review email from L. Pina re: corrected
deposition notices; confer with R. Gray, IV
re: withdrawal of Dr. Baker's supplemental
report; review exhibit list re: same; review

Invoice # 42173

1.35 hrs

9.50 hrs

8.00 hrs
8.50 hrs
1.75 hrs

7.00 hrs

T7.00 hrs
9.00 hrs

0.25 hrs
1.00 hrs

N/C

$3,087.50

$1400.00
$3,825.00
N/C

$2,275.00

$1225.00
$4,050.00

$ 2500
NC

Page 3



11/08/2012

11/09/2012

/0972012

1170972012

11/09/2012

11/10/2012

11/11/2012

11/11/2012

111272012

314201

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

and calendar Moe and Veneble depositions;
prepare list of excerpts from Findings of
Facts re: C. Dupre; review emails re:
rescheduling depositions.

Attend trial; edit Baker testimony; review
email from Baker re: preparation and
respond; conference with Richard Gray IV
re: admission of exhibits; conference with
R. Gray re: witnesses.

Conference with counsel re: exhibits;
conference with counsel re: telephone
conference with Bruce Baker and exhibits
re: same; conference with legal assistant re:
expert reports of Bruce Baker; meeting at
Equity Center re: Bruce Baker testimony;
conference with counsel re: case status and
calendar.

Conference with R. Gray, 1V re:
demonstratives; review emails re:
depositions; conference with attorneys re:
schedule; work re: J. Kracht outline; review
invoice for Dr. Schanzenbach; email S.
Dahlberg re: L. Dawn-Fisher exhibits;
review emails; work re: trial schedule;
review D. Thompson email; review S.
Dahlberg email; reply to same; email ‘¥,
Pierce re: same; review D. Hinojosa email.
Review emails from A. Vasquez re: travel
arrangements for Dr. Kratch; review email
from R. Gray, 1V re: Plaintiifs exhibit list
and Dr. Baker exhibits; rcview email from
T. Hunter re: Schanzznoach invoice for
payment; review emails re: amended
deposition notices: review email from 1.
Pina re: Schanzendach invoice; confer with
R. Gray, IV re; Baker report and supporting
documents.

Confereirce with B. Baker re: trial
tesinony; conference with R, Gray re:
various matters; highlight Duncomb
w=stimony for B. Baker; edit B. Baker
testimony.

Read and outline C. Dupre deposition.
Create Pflugerville powerpoint for
testimony of Charles Dupree; conference
with counsel re: same.

Conference with R, Gray, 1V re: Power
Point; outline C. Dupre testimony; review
B. Baker Power Point; review L.
Dawn-Fisher new data charts.

Revise testimony PowerPoint re: Charles
Dupre; create PowerPoint for Dr. Kallison

Invoice #42173

7.50 hrs

3.75rs

3.65 hrs

0.75 hrs

5.00 hrs

2.25 hrs
1.75 hrs

3.50 hrs

4.65 hrs

$2,437.50

$656.25

$1,642.50

MNAC

$1,625.00

$1,012.50
$306.25

$1,575.00

$813.75

Fage 4



FI/E272012

11/12/2012

11/12/2012

11/13/2012

Jinn

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

cross examination; conference with counsel
re: all, conference with counsel re: Dr.
Baker travel schedule; Telephone
conference with plaintiff's counsel re: trial
schedule,
Work re: C. Dupre testimony; review 3.75 hrs
emails; reply to same; work re: analysis of
STAAR data; prepare for call with C.
Dupre; telephone call to C. Dupre re:
testimony and status; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: Kallison cross preparatien;
review P. Colbert email; review J. Turner
email; review emails re: W, Duncombe;
conference with T. Hunter re: B. Baker
direct; telephone conference with attorneys
re: scheduling witness depositions and
strategy; review M. Patterson email re:
exhibits; review emails; reply to same.
Email C. Dupre re: Pflugerville campus 1.75 hr=
data; review confirmation of travel for Dr.
Baker; review email from C. Pacheco re:
deposition exhibits; review emails from T.
Hunter re: Dr. Baker's schedule; review
email from T. Hunter re: Podgursky charts
reviewed by G. Salazar, confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review and calendar
Wolters deposition; review Ayala errata;
review email from G. Salazar re: charts for
discussion; email T. Hunter re: Dr, Baker's
testimony outline; review emaii re: Dr.
Baker's trial testimony sci:eaule; review
email from M. Patterion re: exhibits and
deposition schedule; review email from L.
Lawrence re: udpated Master Exhibit List;
review email fiom court reporter re: Dunn
deposition e::hbits; revise, efile, and serve
Fifth Amcaded Master Exhibit List; confer
with R. Gray re: same; review email re; tnial
endar; review email from R, Couto re:
exnerts' Power Point presentations; review
and calendar EC board meeting; review
email from M. Patterson re: Defendants’
amended Master Exhibit List.
Prepare Baker testimony; email to Baker re: 5.50 hrs
same; review response; review Baker
deposition; telephone conference with G.
Salazar re: Podgursky's charts; telephone
conference with all Plaintiff attorneys re:
witness order and coverage of deposition.
Prepare for trial; trial; conference with 8.85 hrs
counsel re: Kallison cross examination
exhibits; revise same; Telephone conference

Invoice # 42173

$1,687.50

NAC

$1,787.50

$1548.75

Page 4



FI/13/2012

11/13/2012

117132012

11/14/2012

11/14/2012

11/14/2012

1171472012

11/15/2012
11/15/2012

11/15/2012

302401

REG

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SE)

with Dr. Bruce Baker re; travel and airport
pick-up.

Trial Day 13; prepare for Day 14; review
emails; outline J. Kracht testimony.

Review and return email from C. Jenson re:
B. Baker Power Point presentation; review
email from H. MclIntush re: same; review
email from R. Gray re: same; review email
from M. Patterson re: exhibits.

Attend trial; conference with R, Gray re:
witnesses; read Baker deposition; email to
Baker re: various issues in preparation for
trial; review Baker slides and outline of
testimony.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare for testimony
of Bruce Baker; travel to airport to pick up
Dr. Baker; take Dr. Baker to hotel; return
home.

Trial Day 14; prepare for Day 15; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same; review
emails re: S, Klein; reply to same.

Review amended deposition notices; review
email from R. Gray re: Keller and Kracht
designations; review Plaintiffs’ designation:
and witness lists; email R. Gray re: same:;
review email from 1. Pina re: Trotter and
Hammond deposition notices; review email
from M. Patterson re: additional exiiibits;
email Dr. Kracht testimony outline and
Plaintiffs live pleading for review; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: data fics; review email
from T. Hunter re: trial zcnedule; review
email from 1. Pina re: Wolters depositicn
notice; review emaii from T. Robertson re:
trial schedule.

Attend trial; @inalize Baker testimony: email
to Baker r=. changes; review response; draft
Blincoe's testimeny; conference with R.
Grzy re; Bakers power point.

Prepare for trial; trial,

TNiial Day 15; review emails; reply to same;
prepare for B. Hammond deposition.

Email R. Blincoe re: schedule and
preparation; review emails from R. Blincoe
re: same (2); review amended deposition
notices; email K. Reeves re: Dr. Baker's
report; review email from 8. Rodriguez re:
Joint Motion to Supplement; review email
from M. Sisler re: Ninth Amended Master
Exhibit List; confer with T. Hunter re: R.
Blincoe trial testimony and draft outline of
testimony; review emails from I. Pina re:

Invoice #42173

8.75 hrs

0.40 hrs

8.00ras

10.75 hrs

9.25 hrs

1.60 hrs

9.00 hrs

8.00 hrs
8.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

$3,937.50

N/C

$2,600.00

$1881.25

$4,162.50

NI

$2,925.00

$1400.00
$3,825.00

N/C

Page £



11/15/2012

11/16/2012

11/16/2012

11/16/2012

11/16/2012

11/1772012

1171772012

11/18/2012

11/18/2012

11/19/2012

11/19/2012

11/19/2012

0201

RGIV

LVS

RGIV

TAHH

RGIV

SEJ

deposition schedule; review and return
email from M. Sisler re: Plaintiffs’ exhibits;
email Dr. Kracht re: travel arrangements;
review emails from R, Gray, 1V re: Baker
Power Point presentation; review email
from M. Sisler re; amended deposition
notices; review emails from R. Gray re: C,
Dupre availability and preparation schedule;
review email from C. Dupre re: same.
Conference with B. Baker re: testimony;
attend trial; review emails from various
people and respond; meet with B. Baker.
Revise and update Kallison cross
PowerPoint; conference with counsel re:
same.

Prepare for B. Hammond deposition; attend
Hammond deposition; review emails; reply
to same.

Draft Keller testimony; draft Blincoe
testimony; send emails to Blincoe re: same;
emails to Richard Gray IV re: Power points
for Keller and Blincoe.

Review email from T. Hunter; respond to
same. (n/c)

Review and reply to email from counsel ve:
Harrison Keller and Reece Blincoe
testimony presentations; build both
presenations; print same for covnsel

Work re: Pflugerville Power Point
presentation; work re: Kallison
cross-examination; revier h. Mclntush
email; review D. Hinojusa emails (2);
review emails re: A. Odden report; review
D. Hinojosa email; veply to same.

Review emails, prepare for meeting with C.
Dupre; work re: Power Point presentation;
conferencs with C. Dupre re: preparation for
testimony.

Preoure for R. Blincoe's testimony; edit
Bliticoe testimony outline; meet with H.
Keller; conference with R. Gray re: same.
Prepare for trial; revise Brownwood
PowerPoint; trial; prepare Reece Blincoe for
testimony.

Trial Day 16; prepare for Day 17; review
emails; conference with R. Gray, IV re:
deposition summaries.

Review email from R. Gray re: rescheduling
Dr. Kracht's testimony; telephone
conferences with Dr. Kracht's office re:
same; telephone call to Dr. Kracht - left
message; telephone conference with Dr.

Invoice # 42173

10.00 tirs

0.75 hrs

275 hrs

3.00 bhrs

0.05 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.75 hrs

3.50 hrs

4.00 hrs

11.70 hrs

10.50 hrs

1.85 hrs

$3,250.00

$131.25

$1,237.50

$ 97500

N/C

$262.50

$1,237.50

$1,575.00

$1,300.00

$2047.50

$4,725.00

NAC

Papge?



11/19/2012

11/20/2012

11/20/2012

11/20/2012

Jtoi-m

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

Kracht re: rescheduling testimony and
attorney meeting; confer with R. Gray re:
same; review email from R. Gray, IV re:
downloading Picus study for attomey
review; prepare Findings of Fact excerpts
pertaining to R. Blincoe; review emails
from M. Sisler re: Motion for Leave; review
email from S. Rodriguez re: exhibits; review
email from 1. Pina re: supplemental
deposition designations; review email from
A. Vasquez re: Dr. Kracht's expenses;
review Defendants’ supplemental responses
to Calhoun County's RFP; confer with R.
Gray re: same; review updated Kallison
report; confer with R. Gray re: same; review
email from M. Sisler re: supplemental
responses to Edgewood RFP; review email
from court reporter re: Folks efrata; review
email from M. Jacobs re: supplement to
Odden report; review email from C. Dupre
re: schedule; confer with R. Gray re: same;
review email from Dr. Kracht re: testimony
outline; review Kallison appendices.
Attend trial; outline R. Blincoe testimony;
review Blincoe deposition; meet with R.
Blincoe to prepare for trial.

Prepare for trial; trial; revise Kallisnn cross
slides; conference with counsel re: same;
meeting of plaintiff attorneys re: schedule.
Review Abeline Power Point: ieview
emails; review La Fiera Power Point; Trial
day 17.

Review emails from R. Gray re: updated
Kallison report for 3. Pierce review; email
W. Pierce re: same; review emails from R.
Gray re: M. Srench testimony and
preparatizn for testimony; telephone call to
M. French re: same - left message; review
emaiitrom M. French re; availability; email
R. Cray re: same; confer with R. Gray, IV
=" W. Pierce exhibits; review email from T.
Hunter re: C. Wood report for Dr. Baker's
review; email C. Dupre re: Odden expert
presentation; prepare G. Salazar trial
notebook; review and organize updated
Kallison report, appendices, and CV for
attomey review; confer with R. Gray, IV re:
exhibits; review Master Exhibit List re:
same; email R. Gray, IV re: same; review
emails from A. Vasquez re: Dr, Stephenson
contact information, Dr. Kracht's expenses,
and Dr, Kracht's schedule for testimony;

Invoice # 42173

10.00 hrs

10.20 hrs

10.15 hrs

175 hrs

$3,250.00

$1785.00

$4,567.50

NAC

Page B



11/20/2012

11/21/2012

11/21/2012

11/21/2012

111232012

11/24/2012

11/25/2012

11/25/2012

11/25/2012

111252012

11/26/2012

3102-m

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

RGIV

REG

RGIV

confer with attomeys re: counties map;
prepare map as exhibit; confer with R. Gray,
1V re: same; confer with R. Gray, 1V re: R.
Blincoe testimony schedule.

Attend trial; conference with R. Blincoe;
exchange emails with B. Baker re: Craig
Wood; review email from D. Hinojosa re:
testimony of Winsowski; conference with R,
Gray re: witness schedule; email to M.
French re: same; email to G. Salazar re:
same; review emails from Plaintiff attomeys
re: Guthrie.

Revise Kallison PowerPoint; conference
with counsel re: same; print same:
conference with legal assistant re: Sixth
Amended Exhibit list; meeting at Equity
Center re: Kallison cross examination and
case status.

Conference with W. Pierce and R. Freeman
re: K. Kallison testimony; review emails;
reply to same.

Review email from C. Pacheco re:
supplemental repott; revise, file, and serve
Sixth Amended Master Exhibit List; confey
with R. Gray, 1V re: same; review and
calendar L. Taylor deposition notice; rav.ew
email from court reporter re; Dunn
transcript; email B. Baker re: C/ Wuod
report and related documents,

Review reports re: Charter experts; review
emails; reply to same; begin outline of K.
Kallison cross-examjaation.

Review emails; reply to same; work re:
schedule; work r=* Kallison cross; work re:
Lisa Dawn-Fishar examination.

Meeting with counsel re: prepare for cross
examinating of James Kallison; build
exhibits re: same.

Review S. Dahlberg emails (2); reply to
s2m2 (2); review J. Turner emails; work re:
Power Point; complete Kallison cross
preparation; review A. Kauffman email;
reply to same; telephone call to A.
Kauffman re: status and A. Cortez
testimony.

Review emails; reply to same; trial Day 18;
prepare for Day 19.

Prepare trial testimony of G. Salazar; review
Plaintiff attomey emails re: Scott proffer
and Bum's testimony.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Michael
French for testifying; meeting with counsel

Invoice #42173

9.50 hrs

4.25 hrs

3.50 hrs

1.25 his

3.75 hrs

2.75 hrs

5.60 hrs

475 hrs

10.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

11.00 hrs

$3,087.50

$743.75

$1,575.00

AT

$1,687.50

$1,237.50

$980.00

$2,137.50

$4,837.50

$ 32500

$1925.00



11/26/2012

11/26/2012

11/27/2012

11/27/2012

11/27/2012

11/27/2012

11/28/2012

11/28/2012
11/28/2012

1102 01

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

re: cross examination of James Kallison;
prepare PowerPoint for Los Fresnos 1SD.
Confer with R. Gray re: Dr. Kracht's trial
testimony; telephone conference with Dr.
Kracht's office re: same; confer with R.
Gray, 1V re: Los Fresnos newsclip; review
deposition schedule; email court reporter re:
same; email C. Pacheco re: Taylor
deposition; review emails re: same; confer
with T. Hunter re: Pfeiffer errata sheet;
review file re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: revisions to Master Exhibit List; confer
with R. Gray re: expert designation and
documents received from Charter Schools.
Attend trial; draft Salazar trial testimony,;
email to Salazar re: same; meet with M.
French to prepare for trial.

Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Gonzalo
Salazar for testimony.

Trial day 19; prepare for day 20; review
emails; reply to same.

Review and retum email from R. Gray, 1V
re: current exhibit numbers; confer with R,
Gray, 1V re: Kallison Power Point
presentation; review email from J. Knight
re: trial testimony; confer with T. Hunier re:
same; review email from 1. Pina re: Cortez
supplemental report; revise Master, Exhibit
List; confer with T. Hunter re: same.
Conference with M. French v=: testimony;
attend trial; prepare G. Salazar for trial;
conference with Plairtiif attomeys re:
schedule.

Prepare for trial znd cross of James
Kallison; trial; prepare for tomorrow’s trial;
conference with counsel re; schedule;
continue Suilding Los Fresnos PowerPoint;
emails-Sielley Dahlberg and John Tumer
re; Yallison slides; conference with counsel
r2:same.

Trial Day 20; prepare for Day 21.

Review message from R. Gray re:
rescheduling C. Dupre; telephone
conference with C. Dupre's office re: same;
email attomeys re: same; review and revise
Master Exhibit List; review email from C.
Pacheco re: additional exhibits; review
documents re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: Whitehurst deposition transcript; review
file re: same; review email from C. Pacheco
re: Charter Plaintiffs’ field wiess trial
prep; continue work preparing witness files

Invoice # 42173

1.00 hrs

9.50 hrs

9.75 hrs

9.00 hrs

1.15 hrs

9.00 hrs

10.95 hrs

10.25 hrs
3.30 hrs

NIC

$3,087.50

$1706.25
$4,050.00

NAC

$2,925.00

$1916.25

$4,612.50
N/C

Page 101



11/28/2012

11/29/2012

11292012
11/29/2012

11/29/2012

11/30/2012

11/30/2012

11/30/2012

310208

TBH

RGIV

REG
SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

for attomey review.

Attend trial; prepare Podgursky bubble
rebuttal for Los Fresnos; prepare proffer for
Lesley and Colbert; conference with W.
Pierce, R. Freeman and R. Gray re: trial;
review C. Wood report; review Whitechurst
reportt; email to B. Baker re: same.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel
re: schedule.

Trial Day 21, review emails; reply to same.
Review email re: Woode Rolle
supplemental report for Charter Plaintiffs;
review amended master exhibit list; review
email re: trial transcripts; confer with R.
Gray re: same; revise P. Colbert proffer
(cont.).

Attend trial; review Whitehurst deposition;
edit proffer; conference with R. Gray and
Richard Gray 1V re: witness order and
Findings of Fact; conference with Plaintiff
attorneys re: responsibility for State’s
witnesses; email to G. Salazar re: when he
will testify.

Organize file; review Kallison cross
examination PowerPoint; review amicus
brief of The Texas State Teachers
Association; conference with counsel re:
findings of fact; research inter-couniy
district comparisons for cross examination
of Lisa Dawn-Fisher; conference with
counsel re: same; review ¢tucle from Ray
Freeman re: Texas Higi: School Graduation
Rates; finalize and email Los Fresnons
PowerPoint preseniation to counsel for
review; conferciace with legal assistant re:
same.

Review emails ; reply to same; conference
with artgmieys re: exhibits, cross
exzniination preparation; prepare for Equity
Center meeting; attend Equity Center Board
meeting; review amended discovery; review
State’s amended exhibit list; review emails;
reply to same, work re: witness scheduling;
review emails; reply to same.

Review email from T. Hunter re: C. Dupre

trial testimony schedule; telephone call to C.

Dupre re: same - left message; email C.
Dupre re: status; review email from T.
Hunter re: Bealieu and Housson; review file
re: documents pertaining to same; email S.
Dahlberg re: expected testimony;, confer
with R. Gray re: same; review and revise

Invoice # 42173

8.50 hrs

8.65 hrs

9.00 trs
05 Vhrs

9.00 hrs

3115 hrs

3.50 hrs

2.75 hrs

$2,762.50

$1513.75

$4,050.00
$ 70.00

$2,925.00

$551.25

$1,575.00

M
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TIMEKEEPER RECATP

Master Exhibit List; review email from L.
Lawrence re: same; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; confer with T. Hunter re; adding
superintendent errata sheets as exhibits;
continue work organizing and preparing file
for attomey trial prep.

REG 11l Richard E. Gray Partner 183.05 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 161.15 hrs @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 146.65 hrs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 1.95 hrs @
LVS  von Sternberg, Lynn 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 492.80
310201 Invoice # 42173

450.00 hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 Mr
100.00 /-
100.00 /hr

$158,430.00

$82,372.50
$28,201.25
$47.661.25
$ 195.00
$ 0.00

$158,430.00

Puge 12



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

December 31, 2012

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice#: 42673-1 REG
Our file# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 12/31/2012

¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

12/01/2012 REG Review emails; reply to same; review C, 2.75 hrs $1237.50
Dupre oudine; outline R. Coleman
deposition; outline R. Coleman cross;
review State’s disclosures.

12/02/2012 RGIV  Finalize Los Fresnos and Pflugerville 2.00 hrs $350.00
PowerPoints; conference with counsel re:
same; build Lisa Dawn-Fisher cross
examination PowerPoint; conferencewith
counsel re: cross of Rob Coleman.

12/02/2012 REG Conference with R. Gray, IV re: fower 2.25 hrs $1012.50
Points; work re: cross-examinaticn
preparation; review emails;«2ply to same.

12/03/2012 RGIV  Prepare for trial; trial; prepare Gonzalo 10.75 hrs $1881.25
Salazar for testimony; prepare and build
PowerPoints for proffers of Bonnie Lesley

and Paul Colbert.

12/03/2012 REG Review emails; v2ply to same; trial Day 22: 10.00 hrs $4500.00
prepare for Day 23.

12/03/2012 TBH Attend trial; review Whithurst deposition; 9.00 hrs $2925.00

review roaierials on S. Housson; meet with
G. Salazar to prepare for trial.

12/04/2012 RGIV  Prepare for trial; trial. 8.50 hrs $1487.50

12/04/2012 REG Tnal Day 23; prepare for Day 24; 9.00 hrs $4050.00
conference with L. Moak re: S. Beaulieu.

12/04/2012 TBH Attend trial; conference with G. Salazar; 8.00 hrs $2600.00

review P. Colbert’s supplemental report;
review master exhibit list; telephone
conference with P. Colbert re: supplemental
report.
12/05/2012 RGIV  Prepare for trial; trial; conference with legal 9.05 hrs $1583.75
assistant re: case file; Telephone conference
with Joe Wisnoski re: Legislative Budget
Board fiscla report; email Holly McIntush
re: Dan Casey materials,
12/05/2012 REG Review emails (17); reply to same; trial Day 8.50 hrs $3825.00

310240 Invoice # 42673 Page 1



12/05/2012

12/05/2012

12/06/2012

12/06/2012

12/06/2012

12/06/2012

12/07/2012

12/07/2012

12/07/2012

12/08/2012

12/09/2012

31624

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

REG

RGIV

24; prepare for Day 25.

Review notice and calendar Bast deposition; 1.55 hrs
review Master Exhibit List; review M.,

Sisler emails re: Gallegos deposition;

review M. Patterson email re: Whitehurst

Power Point Presentation; review and

calendar deposition notice for Gallegos;

review T. Hunter email re: notice to the

Court re: J. Knight de-designation; draft

notice and email T. Hunter re: status; review

T. Hunter email re: AG representative for J.

Knight deposition; review transcript and

email T. Hunter re: same.

Attend trial; finalize proffers; conference 7.00 hrs
with P. Colbert re: his reports; outline cross

of Whitehurst; conference with R. Gray and

Richard Gray IV re: status.

Prepare for trial; trial; research members of 9.25 hrs
Legislative Budget Board; conference with

counsel re: cross examinations.

Trial Day 25; prepare for Day 26; review 8.75 hrs
emails; reply to same.
Review email re: deposition exhibits; email 0.60 hrs

court reporter re; L. Davis deposition

transcript; review email re: same; review

and retum email from R. Gray, 1V re:- L.

Davis transcript; review email from 3.

Rodriguez re: Wisnoski transcripi-and L.

Davis transcript; review T. Hunter email re:

superintendents’ replies re: Podgursky

bubble charts; review files re: same.

Attend trial; edit cross ¢F Whitehurst; 8.00 hrs
review NCLB goals: conference with

R.Gray re: cross of Whitehurst.

Meeting at Equity Center re: cross 3.15 hrs
examination of Lisa Dawn-Fisher; review

admitted exhibits; revise same; conference

with legai assistant re: same.,

Review. W. Pierce email; prepare for 3.00 hrs
meetuig re: L. Fisher; conference with W,

Picrce R. Freeman, P. Colbert, and R. Gray,

iV re: L. Fisher testimony; review emails;

reply to same.

Review email from court reporter re: 0.80 hrs
exhibits; review Defendants’ designation of

L. Davis; email R. Gray re: same; review S.

Rodriguez email re: Podgursky transcript;

review S. Dahlberg email re: State’s

proposed trial calendar.

Review L. Davis report; review L. Davis 2.00 hrs
deposition; review emails; reply to same.

Build PowerPoint for cross examination of 2.15 hrs

Lisa Dawn-fisher; review emails re: State's

Invoice # 42673

NAiC

$2275.00

$1618.75

$3937.50

N/C

$2600.00

$551.25

$1350.00

NiC

$900.00

$376.25

FPage 1



12/09/2012

12/09/2012

12/10/2012

12/10/2012

12/10/2012

12/10/2012

12/11/2012

12/11/2012

noi-,

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

exhibits.

Review emails; reply to same; review Power
Point presentations; review L. Halpem
email with new material re: Podgursky.
Review email re: supplement to Podursky
report; review S. Dahlberg email re: trial
presentation for Zyskowski and Davis.
Prepare for trial; trial; continue building
PowerPoint for cross examination of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher, conference with counsel re:
same; review email from Ray Freeman re:
same.

Trial Day 26; prepare for Day 27, review
emails; reply to same.

Review C. Pacheco email re: additional
exhibit designations; review Master Exhibit
List; review emails re: deposition exhibits;
review L. Halpem email re: errata and
revisions to Podgursky's report; review M.
Sisler email re: deposition of M. DiBella;
calendar deposition; review M. Patterson
email re: Defendants’ Eleventh Master
Exhibit List; email court reporter re:
Zyskowski transcript; review email from
court reporter re: same; confer with R. Gray,
V1 re: deposition transcript for Zyskewsk;
review email from R. Gray, V1 re:
Podgursky documents for attomey review;
review email re: 11/5 final trial transcript;
review email from M. Trachtenberg re:
article for Coleman cross-e;amination;
review email from S. Dzhlberg re: Givens
trial presentation; réview email from J.
Tumer re: Whitehurst exhibit; review T.
Hunter email re: Fiadings attributable to W.
Pierce; review Sindings re: same; confer
with R. Gray, IV re: same; review amended
DiBella qcposition notice; calendar EC
school finance workshop event; review T,
Hoster email re: trial transcript containing
Cnambers’ testimony; review L. Lawrence
einail re: master exhibit list.

Attend trial; review Podgusky report and
deposition in preparation for cross;
conference with P. Fraissinet re: Podgusky
cross; conference with Plaintiff attomeys re:
closing arguments; conference with Richard
Gray IV re: Findings of Fact.

Prepare for trial; trial; conference with
counsel re: findings of fact; revise findings
of Wayne Pierce.

Trial Day 27, prepare for Day 28; review
emails; reply to same; work re:

Invoice # 42673

2.25 hrs

0.20 hrs

9.30 hrs

8.75 hrs

2.60 hrs

7.00 hrs

12.50 hrs

9.75 hrs

$1012.50

NIC

$1627.50

$3937.50

N/C

$2275.00

$2187.50

$4387.50

Page 3



12/11/2012

12/11/2012

12/12/2012

12/12/2012

12/12/2012

12/12/2012

12/13/2012

12/13/2012
12/13/2012

62 0]

SE)

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

cross-examination exhibits.

Review email re: amended Master Exhibit
List; revise Findings of Fact; confer with R.
Gray, IV re: same; review C. Pacheco email
re: cancelling Patridge deposition; review
Master Exhibit List; review M. Patterson
email re: State’s trial presentation for Dr.
Podgursky; review email from R. Gray, IV
re: college remediation report; email M.,
Trachtenberg re: same; continue work re:
revising Findings; review emails re: trial
transcripts containing Pfeifer and Chambers
testimony; review file re: same; review R.
Freeman email re: slides for L. Dawn-Fisher
cross-examination; review email from R.
Gray re: college remediation report; review
email re: cancelling Trotter and S. Partridge
depositions; review T. Hunter email re;
Vigdor Power Point presentation; review
Vigdor file re: same.

Attend trial; review emails on Dr. Podgusky
from P. Fraissinet and respond; finalize
Podgusky cross; meet with Plaintiff
attomeys to discuss Findings of Fact; edit
Findings of Fact; conference with Richard
Gray IV and R. Gray re: same.

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel
re: findings of fact.

Trial Day 28; prepare for Day 29; work on
findings.

Revise Findings of Fact; review email from
C. Pacheco re: revisiors to service list;
review emails re: drafi trial transcripts;
review M. Patterson emails re: State’s trial
presentation re;-Ur, Podgursky; review W,
Pierce email so; Hammond news releases.
Attend trial: review material for Podgusky
cross; cenference with R.Gray and Richard
Gray I'V re: Findings of Fact.

Mectiug with counsel re: equity findings of
fact; revise and update equity findings of
tact; conference with counsel re: same and
case schedule; email counsel re; headings
for same.

Trial Day 29; work on findings.

Review emails re: depositions; confer with
attomneys re: Pfeifer trial testimony
transcript; email H. McIntush re: same;
review email from M., Sisler re: depositions;
review emails from M. Patterson re:
Podgursky Power Point presentation and
State’s amended presentation; confer with T,
Hunter re: Focus Districts’ Power Point

Invoice # 42673

4.60 hrs

9.00 hrs

10.00 hrs

9.50 hrs

4.70 hrs

5.00 hrs

10.00 hrs

8.25 rs
1.50 hrs

NAT

$2925.00

$1750.00

$4275.00

N/C

$2925.00

$1750.00

$3712.50
N/C

Page 4



12/13/2012
12/14/2012

12/14/2012

12/14/2012

1271412012
12/15/2012

12/15/2012
12/16/2012

12/16/2012
12/16/2012

12/17/2012

12/17/2012

12/17/2012

ER]i B

TBH
RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

TBH
RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

presentations used at trial; confer with R,
Gray, IV re: same; review and calendar M.
DiBella deposition notice; review and
calendar R. Wolters deposition; review C,
Diamond email re: revised exhibit; review
M. Patterson email re: Housson trial
presentation and data; review R. Gray email
re: same; review email from court reporter
re: revised admitted exhibit list.

Draft Findings of Fact,

Review revised findings; email counsel
heading and subheadings from same;
conference with counsel re: James Kallison
findings; print powerpoint of Bruce Baker
for counsel; continue building PowerPoint
for cross examination of Lisa Dawn-Fisher
re: focus district AEIS and STAAR results;
draft findings of fact regarding Wealth
Hold-Harmless/Target Revenue; conference
with counsel re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; work on
findings; outline L. Fisher deposition;
review Charter trial calendar; conference
with T. Hunter re: findings.

Review email from C. Pacheco re: S.
Partridge deposition; review email froin T,
Pacheco re: Charter Plaintiffs' propos=d trial
calendar; review email from C. Pasheco re:
D. Dunn's errata; review emails 12:
deposition exhibits; calendar S. Partridge
deposition; email S. Rodriguez re: final trial
transcripts; review emei re: same; review T.
Hunter emails re: masier exhibit list and
revisions to Findings.

Draft Findings of Tact.

Work re: findings; work re: L. Fisher
cross-exanunation.

Draft Findings of Fact.

Review and edit findings of fact; conference
with counsel re: same.

Waork on findings of fact.

revise Findings of Fact; review emails re:
depaosition exhibits.

Meeting with counsel re: review and revise
findings of fact; draft findings of fact for
focus districts.

Work on findings; review emails; reply to
same; telephone conference with M.
Trachtenberg re: findings; review deposition
notice.

Work re: findings attributable to
Superintendents; review email from L. Pina
re: Eissler deposition; review and calendar

Invoice # 42673

7.00 hrs
4,59 hrs

4.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

5.00 hrs
3.75 hrs

5.00 hrs
3.25 hrs

5.50 hrs
4.00 hrs
13.15 hrs

8.75 hrs

3.95 hrs

$2275.00
$787.50

$2137.50

NAC

$1625.00
$1687.50

$1625.00
$568.75

$2475.00
N/C

$2301.25

$3937.50

NAL

Page 5



12/17/2012

12/18/2012

12/18/2012

12/18/2012

12/18/2012

12/19/2012

12/19/2012

12/19/2012

12/20/2012

310201

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

Tl

SEJ

TBH

deposition; continue work re: revising
Findings of Fact; review and calendar
deposition notices; review and calendar
Eissler, D. Pierce, S. Partridge, and M.
DiBella deposition notices; review M. Sisler
re: email re: Pierce and Flemister
depositions; review T. Hunter email re:
revisions to Findings.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV to edit Findings of Fact.

Conference wuth counsel re: exhibit and
deposition numbers for findings of fact;
review Master Exhibit Lisr re: same; email
legal assistant re: findings and chart used in
testimony of Charles Dupre.

Work on findings; work on conclusions of
law; prepare bullet point submission to
Court; review D. Hinojosa email;
conference with T. Hunter re: witness
examinations; reply to emails; work on
conclusions of law; review W. Pierce emails
(2); reply to same (2).

Continue work re: revising Findings of Fact;
review emails re: contact information for
Judge Dietz and C. Jenson; review emaj!
from court reporter re: 11/7 trial trapesity;
confer with attorneys re: de-designatioa of
J. Knight as expert; T. Hunter email re:
findings attributable to Focus Oistricts;
review T. Hunter email re: de-designation of
J. Knight.

Draft TTSFC submissicn: o Common
Findings; review proposed Conclusions of
Law,

Work on findings and conclusions; review
emails; reply v same; review W. Pierce
email; revicw analysis re: L. Fisher;
telephops conference with W. Pierce - lefi
message; telephone call to W, Pierce re: L.
Firtiaa-analysis; edit and revise Focus
Daztrict findings and conclusions of law,
Work re: revisions to Findings of Fact;
review emails re: deposition exhibits;
review emails re: proposeq joint findings of
fact; review T. Hunter email re: exhibits and
additional revisions to findings.

Review emails from M. Trachtenberg re:
Joint Findings.

Review emails; reply to same; work on
findings and conclusions; review W. Pierce
email; reply to same; work re:
cross-examination; telephone conference
with re: status and strategy;

Invoice # 42673

11.00 hrs

1025 hrs

5.25 hrs

4.25 hrs

11.00 hrs

7.50 hrs

7.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

7.25 hrs

$3575.00

$218.75

$2362.50

$3575.00

$3375.00

NIC

$162.50

$3262.50

Pap= 6



12/20/2012

12/20/2012
12/21/2012

1272212012
12/26/2012

12/2712012

12/27/2012

12/28/2012

12/29/2012

12292012
12/30/2012

12/31/2012

12/31/2012

12/31/2012

12/31/2012

3oz

SEJ

TBH

TBH

TBH

RGIV

RGIV

SE1

draft letter to Court re: findings.

Revise Findings of Fact; confer with
attorneys re: same; email Judge Dietz re:
proposed Findings and correspondence from
R. Gray.

Edit Findings

Work re: L. Fisher cross, work on findings;
work re: R. Coleman cross and S. Bielieu
cross; review W. Pierce email; review
emails; reply to same.

Review and reply to emails.

Review and reply to emails; work re: R.
Coleman cross.

Review emails; reply to same; work re: S.
Bielieu testimony; review additional emails;
reply to same; work re: findings; review
material provided by L. Fisher.

Conference with R. Gray re: Findings of
Fact, intervenor and State witnesses and
Lisa Dawn Fischer; organize file for Linda
Roska's cross examination.

Work re: findings and cross-examination;
review emails; reply to same; review W.
Pierce email.

Review emails; conference with R. Gray, TV
re: exhibits for cross-examination; review
W. Pierce email; reply to same.

Prepare for cross of Linda Roska:

Review W. Pierce email; reply tc same;
email S. Dahlberg re: L. Fisher; review S.
Dahlberg auto reply.

Meeting with counsel re: cross examinations
of Rob Coleman; Shinzy Beaulieu; and Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; review report of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher re:-avirage tax rate
comparison.

Build PowerFPoint re: 41 v 42 comparison;
confererce with counsel re: same.

Work 1o cross-examination preparation;
revicw emails; reply to same; conference
with R. Gray, IV re: exhibits.

Review email from C. Pacheco re: C. Wood
¢rrata; review T. Hunter email re: Parker
and McAdams deposition transcripts and
Roska transcript; review M. Patterson email
re: Defendants Twelfth Amended Master
Exhibit List; review email from court
reporter re: 11/8 final transcript; review M.
Bono email re: Pierce deposition; review
calendar re: same; review email from court
reporter re: amended exhibit list; review and
compare amended exhibit list to TTSFC
exhibit list; review email from court reporter

Invoice # 42673

7.00 hrs

2.00 hrs
3.25 hrs

035 hrs
1.50 hrs

2.25 hrs

2.00 hrs

1.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.00 hrs
0.35 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.35 hrs

2.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

N

$650.00
$1462.50

$157.50
$675.00

$1012.50

$650.00

$787.50

$675.00

$650.00
$157.50

$262.50

$236.25

$1125.00

N/C

Pags 7



re: corrected 11/8 trial transcript; review
emails from T. Hunter re: findings; Review
and calendar M. Flores deposition notice;
review and calendar B. Flemister deposition
notice.

TIMEKEFPER RECAP
REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 140.95 hrs @
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 111.65 hrs @
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 102.50 hrs @
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 0.00 hrs @
Fee Recap Totals 355.10

Itoz4 Invoice # 42673

450.00 /hr
175.00 /hr
325.00 /hr
100.00 /hr

$116,278.75

$63,427.50
$19,538.75
$33,312.50
$ 0.00

$116,278.75

Fage &



GRAY & BECKER, P.C.

500 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701
512.482.0061
Janvary 31, 2013
Tax ID No.; 74-2427406
Invoice#: 42738 REG
Our file#: 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Fairness Coalition Billing through: 01/31/2013
c/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701
Re: School Finance Litigation
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
01/02/2013 RGIV  Conference with counsel re: exhibits; print 0.25 hrs $ 43.75
same,
01/02/2013 REG Work re; cross-examination of R. Coleman, 5.00 hrs $2,250.00

S. Beaulieu and L. Dawn-Fisher; review
emails; reply to same; conference with R.
Gray, IV re: depositions; review C.
Diamond email; review D. Hinojosa email;
review J. Turner email; reply to sanie; email
attorneys re: cross-examination: review S.
Dahlberg email; review M. Trachtenberg
email; review D. Hinojos» email; review D.
Thompson email; review P. Fraissinet
email; review D. Thompson email; review
S. Beaulieu deposition transcript; telephone
conference with'W. Pierce re: analysis of L.
Dawn-Fisher data and examination;
telephone cail to D. Hinojosa - left message;
telephote call to D. Hinojosa re: L.
Dawrni-Fisher cross-examination.

01/02/2013 SEJ Fzview and update trial transcript files; 0.00 hrs NIC
email S. Rodriguez re: 11/1/12 transcript
and Parker and McAdams deposition
transcripts; review emails from S.
Rodriguez re: same; review deposition
exhibits produced by Parker and McAdams;
prepare for attorney review.

01/02/2013 SEJ Review emails re: S. Beaulieu deposition 0.70 hrs N/iC
transcript; telephone call to B, Schulman's
office re: transcript and exhibits - left
message; email 5. Rodriguez re: same;
confer with R. Gray re: same; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: Beaulieu

3102-01 Invoice # 42738 Pepe 1



01/02/2013

01/03/2013

01/03/2013

01/03/2013

01/03/2013

01/04/2013

01/04/2013

01/04/2013

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

SE]

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

exhibits; review emails from A. Herrera re:
Beaulieu transcript and exhibits.

Research on L. Roska; conference with R.
Gray re: trial schedule.

Meeting with counsel re: intervenors and
charter school witnesses and findings of
fact; review expert report of Allen Parker;
meeting at equity center re: Lisa
Dawn-Fisher cross examination; conference
call with plaintiffs counsel re: intervenor
and charter witnesses.

Conference with attorneys re: findings of
fact and witness cross-examination;
conference with R. Gray, IV and W. Pierce
re: L. Dawn-Fisher examination; review
ernails; reply to same; work re: preparation
for cross-examination; telephone conference
with attorneys re: cross-examination and
trial strategy; work re: cross-examination of
S. Beaulien and R. Coleman; outline cross
of R. Coleman; outline cross of S. Beaulien,
Review emails re: findings to send to
co-counsel; review emails re: deposition
exhibits; review ernails re: Parkcr deposition
transcript; review 11/13/12 trial transeript;
revise common findings.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
IV re: Intervenor and Ciiarter witnesses and
Final Findings of facts; telephone
conference with Maiatiff attorneys re: cross
of intervenor witnesses.

Meeting at Equity Center with Adam Pierce
re: running data for cross examination of
Lisa Dawn-Fisher; meeting with counsel,
Wayne Pierce, Ray Freeman, and Adam
Pizrce re: cross examination of Lisa
Lawn-Fisher; review and reply to email
irom Shelley Dahlberg re: exhibits used
with James Kallison; print exhibits for
counsel; review Lisa Dawn-Fisher cross;
meeting with counsel re: cross of Rob
Coleman and Shirley Beaulieu.

Meeting re: L. Dawn-Fisher examination;
work with R. Gray, IV re: Beaulieu and
Coleman cross-examinations; work re:
outline of L. Dawn-Fisher examination;
review emails; reply to same.

Review emails re: M. Hurley deposition

Invoice # 42738

1.00 hrs

5.35 hrs

9.00 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.50 hrs

8.20 hrs

8.50 hrs

2.55 hrs

$ 325.00

$936.25

$4,050.00

$180.00

$ 487.50

$1435.00

$3,825.00

NG

Page 2



01/05/2013

01/05/2013

01/06/2013

01/06/2013

01/06/2013

01/07/2013

01/07/2013

01/07/2013

01/07/2013

310201

RGIV

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

transcript; review status of trial transcripts;
confer with attorneys re: same; telephone
conference with M. Patterson re: W. Pierce
Power Point presentation; telephone
conference with M. Sisler re: same; review
email from R. Gray, IV re: W. Pierce trial
presentation; review R. Gray, IV email re:
additional admitted exhibits; review
Efficiency Intervenors' designations re;
upcoming trial witnesses; email T. Hunter
re: admitted exhibits; review and calendar J.
Strohmeyer deposition; prepare files re:
Intervenors’ designations and depositions
for attorney review; telephone conference
with M. Patterson re: trial exhibits; email! R.
Gray, IV re: same.

Meeting with counsel re: prepare for cross
examination of Lisa Dawn-Fisher.

Outline L. Dawn-Fisher cross-examination;
review R. Freeman email; reply to same.
Meeting with counsel re; prepare for cross
examinations of Lisa Dawn-Fisher, Rox
Coleman, and Shirley Beaulieu,

Work re: preparation for cross-eXarnination
of State’s witness; review emails; reply to
same; review Power Point presentations.
Review exhibit list and determine what we
need to admit.

Prepare for wial; trizi; prepare for cross of
Lisa Dawn-Fisher; review powerpoint to be
used during dircct examination of Lisa
Dawn-Fisher.

Trial Day 58, prepare for Day 31; review
emails, reply to same.

Review and organize trial transcripts; email
aitorneys re: status of trial transcripts;
toview file re: Intervenors’ live pleading;
email T. Hunter re: same; review email re:
Ft. Bend exhibits; review email re: Coleman
and Beaulieu trial exhibits; review email
from T. Hunter re: admitted exhibits; review
master exhibit list re: exhibits withdrawn;
confer with T. Hunter re: same; prepare
slide exhibits from dropout report; confer
with T. Hunter re: same.

Attend trial; prepare for Eissler deposition;
prepare for L. Roska cross; edit Findings of
Fact.

invoice # 42738

3.00 hrs

6.50 hrs

3.40 hrs

5.75 hrs

1.50 hrs

10.25 hrs

11.50 hrs

3.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

$525.00
$2,925.00

$595.00

$2,587.50

$ 487.50

$1793.75

$5,175.00

$300.00

$2,600.00

Fage 3



01/08/2013

01/08/2013

01/08/2013

01/08/2013

01/09/2013

01/0%/2013

01/09/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SE]

Prepare for trial; trial; conference with legal 12.30 hrs
assistant re: trial exhibits; review, revise,
and prepare for cross examination of Lisa

Dawn-Fisher,

Trial Day 31; prepare for Day 32; review 11.75 hrs
emails; reply to same.

Review R. Gray email re: documents 3.20 hrs

provided by Efficiency Intervenors; review

file re: same; review emails re: admitted

exhibits; review court reporter's list of

admitted exhibits; revise Plaintiffs' Eighth

Amended Master Exhibit List; review

emails re: same; prepare exhibits for

submission; review email from M. Sisler re:

Defendants amended exhibit list; confer

with T. Hunter re: index of trial transcripts;

review and calendar T. Sage deposition;

review emails from R. Gray, IV re: admitted

exhibits; review emails from R. Gray re:

Intervenors' documents produced with

disclosures; email R. Gray, IV re: Baker

trial presentation; review email from R.

Gray, IV re: same; review email from M.

Patterson re: additional exhibits; email M.

Patterson re: Baker trial presentation and

supplemental report; review ewail from S.

Dahlberg re: Fisher trial nresentation,

Attend trial; review Mov deposition in 10.00 hrs
preparation for Eisslei's deposition; figure

out computationin Edgewood IV; email to

P. Colbert and .. Moak and review

comments,

Prepare for wial; trial; email admitted 9.15 hrs
TTSFC Exhibit to Shelley Dahlberg and

Caro! J<nson.

Trial Day 32; prepare for Day 33; review 10.50 hrs
cmails; reply to same; conference with T,

Hunter re: R, Eissler deposition.

Review emails re: Intervenors' expert 1.00 hrs
reports and responses to requests for 0.70 hrs
disclosure; email C. Diamond re: same;

prepare reports and exhibits for attorney

review; review email from T. Hunter re;

rough draft of trial transcript containing L.

Dawn-Fisher testimony; review email from

M. Patterson re: G, Day presentation;

review email from R. Gray, IV re: L.

Dawn-Fisher Power Point, revised exhibit

Invoice # 42738

$2152.50

$5,287.50

N/iC

$3,250.00

$1601.25

$4,725.00

$100.00
N/C

Page 4



01/09/2013 TBH
01/10/2013 RGIV

01/10/2013 REG

01/10/2013 SEJ

01/10/2013 TBH

01/11/2013 RGIV

01/11/2013 REG

3102-01

list, and USB flashdrive; review emails re:
Currah excerpts; review State's disclosures
re: testimony of L. Roska; emai! T. Hunter
re: same; review email from M., Jacobs re:
Beaulieu exhibits; review email from M.
Patterson re: Coultress trial exhibits; review
email re: Ft. Bend Plaintiffs’ amended
exhibit list; review and organize additional

trial transcripts.
Attend deposttion of Rob Eissler. 8.50 lws
Review findings of fact for Wayne Pierce; 4.£5 hrs

conference with legal assistant and counsel
re: same; conference with counsel re: cross
examination of Roska.

Trial Day 33; review emails; reply to same; 8.50 hrs
begin preparation of cross for intervenor

witnesses.

Review and return email from C. Jenson re: 1.30 hrs
TTSFC proposed findings; email T. Hunter 1.30 hrs

re: L. Roska designation; confer with T.
Hunter re: transcript containing B, Baker's
trial testimony; review file re: same; ccafer
with attorneys re: Power Point preseniation
for L. Roska cross-examination;review
email from T. Hunter re: Intervenors'
exhibits; review exhibits re: 822 report;
email T. Hunter re: same; review email from
T. Hunter re: R. Eissler deposition transcript
and exhibits; telephorns conference with
court reporter re:'sane; email T. Hunter re:
status; review email from T. Hunter re:
Intervenors' aamutted exhibits; review
master exhibit list re; same; email T. Hunter
re: same; prepare slides for Roska
cross-¢xamination; review email from court
reporeer re: R. Eissler transcript; revise,
iinalize, e-file and serve Plaintiffs’ Eighth
Amended Exhibit List; review email from
L. Lawrence re: deposition exhibits.

Attend trial; continue preparing Roska 9.00 hrs
cross; begin preparing Eissler cross.
Review testimony of Wayne Pierce; review 4.80 hrs

and compare findings of fact for same;

conference with counsel re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; conference 3.75 hrs
with attorneys re: findings of fact; review

exhibit list; work re: exhibits; begin outline

of closing brief.

Invoice # 42738

$2,762.50
$813.75

$3,825.00

$130.00
N/C

$2,925.00

$840.00

$1,687.50

Pege 5



01/11/2013

01/11/2013

01/12/2013

01/13/2013
01/13/2013

01/14/2013

01/14/2013

01/14/2013

01/14/2013

01/15/2013

3102-01

SE]

REG
REG
TBH

RGIV

REG

SE]

TBH

RGIV

Review email from H. McIntush re: 1.80 hrs
admitted exhibits; review email re:

corrected 10/25 trial transcript; review email

from T. Hunter re: State's additional

exhibits; review exhibits and prepare for

attorney review; review email from T.

Hunter re: State's exhibits; review email

from C. Pacheco re: Rolle errata; review

email from T. Hunter re: additional slides

for Roska cross-examination; review

dropout report and prepare slides; review

email from court reporter re: Eissler

exhibits.

Conference with R. Gray re:trial progress; 4.00 hrs
conference with L. Lawrence re; Roska

testimony; begin gathering material for

Eissler cross; begin editing common

Findings of Fact.

Review M. Hurley deposition; outline 1.75 hrs
examination of M. Hurley.

Review emails; reply to same. 0.50 hrs
Prepare for trial; review State's exhibits; 3.00 hrs
conference with L. Lawrence re: Rocka

CToss,

Prepare for trial; trial; meeting with counsel 9.05 hrs
re: findings of fact.

Trial Day 34; prepare for Day 35; review 9.25 hrs
emails; reply to same; review T. Sage

report.

Review email frera T, Hunter re: triai 0.90 hrs

transcripts; review email re: L. Ayala trial

presentation and exhibits; review email re:

L. Roska frial presentation; review email

from court reporter re: Moe deposition

transcript; review email from C. Pacheco re:

Sage expert report; review emails re:

coalition meeting; review email from R,

Gray, IV re: admitted exhibits; review

exhibit list re: same; review A. Penn email

re: Coleman testimony and exhibits.

Attend trial; finalize cross of L. Roska; 9.00 hrs
conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray

IV re: Findings of Fact.

Review findings of fact and trial testimony 6.80 hrs
of Wayne Pierce; revise findings of fact;

conference with counsel re: same; review

email re: corrected master data set of Lisa

Dawn-Fisher; conference with counsel re:

Invoice # 42738

N/C

$1,300.00

$ 787.50

$ 225.00
$ 975.00

$1583.75

$4,162.50

NiC

$2,925.00

$1180.00

Pape £



01/15/2013

01/15/2013

01/15/2013

01/16/2013

01/16/2013

01/16/2013

01/17/2013

01/17/2013

01/17/2013

01/17/2013
01/18/2013

31020t

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH
RGIV

same; telephone conference with Wayne
Pierce re: same; review data set.

Trial Day 35; prepare for Day 36; review
emails; reply to same; work re: findings of
fact; review new database; telephone
conference with W. Pierce re: same.
Review email from M. Patterson re:
additional exhibits; review email from R.
Gray re: 1/22 counsel meeting.

Draft Findings of Fact; conference with R.
Gray and Richard Gray IV re: same and trial
deadlines.

Review corrected master dataset from Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; do cross examination
calculations on same; telephone conference
with Wayne Pierce and Ray Freeman re:
same; conference with counsel re; same;
draft affidavitre: same and differences
between master datasets.

Trial Day 36; prepare for Day 37; review
emails; reply to same; work re: affidavit re;
new Lisa Dawn-Fisiher database.

Review email from court reporter re: Cissler
transcript.

Review language for affidavit of Wayne
Pierce re: corrected master da‘aset for Lisa
Dawn-Fisher; conference with counsel re:
same; review and revise findings of fact for
Wayne Pierce re: equiiy exhibits;
conference with counsel re; same; telephone
conference with Toni Hunter re: focus
district findirgs.

Trial Day 37, review emails; reply to same;
conference with attorneys re: findings and
exhibitz, review material re: T. Sage
deposition; telephone conference with T.
ciunter re: findings.

Review email from M. Sisler re: Sage
deposition notice; review email from C.
Pacheco re: T. Sage report and documenits;
prepare initial draft of W, Pierce affidavit;
confer with R. Gray, IV re: same; review
master exhibit list; review emails re: timing
for updated findings.

Work on Findings of Fact,
Review and revise findings of fact for

Wayne Pierce; review and revise affidavit of
Wayne Pierce re: Lisa Dawn-Fisher's

Invoice # 42738

10.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

8.00 ks

7.20 hrs

8.75 hrs

0.10 hrs

5.45 hrs

8.00 hrs

1.10 hrs

2.00 hrs
5.80 hrs

$4,725.00

NfC

$2,600.00

$1260.00

$3,937.50

N/C

$953.75

$3,600.00

N

$ 650.00
$1015.00

Page T



01/18/2013

01/18/2013

01/19/2013

01/19/2013

01/20/2013

01/20/2013

01/20/2013
01/21/2013

01/21/2013

01/21/2013

310201

SEJ

RGIV

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH
RGIV

REG

SEl

corrected master dataset; telephone

conference with Wayne Pierce re: same;

testimony of Wayne Pierce; conference with

counsel re: same.

Review emails; reply to same; work on 2.75 hrs
findings of fact; work re: revised data; work

re: W. Pierce affidavit.

Review email from T. Hunter re: status of 1.50 hrs
findings; review email from M. Jacobs re:

district-specific findings; review email from

H. McIntush re: equity findings; continue

revising findings.

Review and revise findings of fact for 2.00 hrs
Wayne Pierce; review defendant’s cross

examination of Wayne Pierce.

Review emails; reply to same; work on 3.50 hrs
findings; work on cross of Parker; work on

W. Pierce affidavit.

Review and revise findings of fact for 2.75 hrs
Wayne Pierce; review cross examination of

Wayne Pierce by Calhoun County Plaintiifs;

conference with counsel re: findings oi fact.

Review emails; reply to same; conference 2.75 hrs
with R. Gray, IV re: findings; wark re:

Daubert motion (Parker); work re: Parker

CTOSS.
Work on Findings of Fact, 3.00 hrs
Conference with counse! ie: findings of fact; 4.80 hrs

review affidavit of Wayne Pierce; telephone

conference with *¥ayne Pierce re: same;

meeting with counsel re: causes of action;

proposed order; dndings of fact; daubert

motion re: Allen Parker; review, revise, and

update findings of fact for Lisa

Dawn-*isher; conference with counsel re:

samie.

‘Work re: findings, Daubert challenge and 4.50 hrs
Parker cross-examination; review and reply

to emails; work re: W. Pierce affidavit;

work re: attorney fee affidavit; prepare for

Day 38 of trial; review C. Diamond email;

conference with attorneys re: 1/22 meetings;

review Hurley Power Point.

Review email re: Gallagos, Abbott erratas; 3.00 hrs
revise findings for common document; 4.00 hrs
confer with T. Hunter re: same; review

emails from T. Hunter re: revised findings;

review emails from H. MclIntush re:

Invoice # 42738

$1,237.50

NAC

$525.00

$1,575.00

$481.25

$1,237.50

$ 975.00
$840.00

$2,025.00

$300.00
N/C

Papge &



01/21/2013

01/22/2013

01/22/2013

01/22/2013

01/22/2013

01/23/2013

0172372013

3102-01

RGIV

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

findings; finalize inserts to common
findings; email attorneys re: same.

Work on Findings of Fact; review email
from P. Colbert; conference with R. Gray
and Richard Gray IV re: Plaintiff meeting
tomorrow; Daubert motion, Findings of
Fact, and Amended Petition; email to T.
Robertson re: Amended Petition; review
revised Common Findings.

Draft Motion to Exclude for Allan Parker;
conference with counsel re: same; review
deposition of Allan Parker re: same; review
Gammill v. Jack Williams; review Daubert
v. Robinson; meeting with plaintiff's
counsel re: relief, findings of fact, and
attorneys fees.

Trial Day 38; prepare for Day 39; review
and reply to emails; conference with
attorneys re: findings/judgment.

Revise findings (cont.); confer with
attorneys re: same; confer with R. Gray, TV
re: admitted exhibits; review and compare
most recent list of admitted exhibits“~ith
Plaintiffs’ Eighth Amended Exhinit List;
email R. Gray re: same; review email from
C. Pacheco re: amended exhibit list; review
email from M. Patterson re: amended
exhibit list; review trial iranscripts re:
Kallison testimony; ¢zview email re; 11/19
irial transcript; review emails re: amended
petition, updated list of districts; confer with
R. Gray, IV ie; L. Dawn-Fisher inserts to
findings; review and revise inserts; review
email irom I. Pina re: exhibits.

Reviaw and edit Common Findings; Review
firal-version of Common Findings; review
L. Dawn-Fisher Findings; review and edit
Equity Findings of Fact; meet with Plaintiff
attorney re: relief, Findings,

Review testimony of Lisa Dawn-Fisher,
James Kallison, and Wayne Pierce re:
findings of fact; conference with counsel re:
same; meeting with Wayne Pierce and Ray
Freeman re: case status; continue drafting
motion to exclude re: Allan Parker.

Trial Day 39; prepare for Day 40; review
and reply to emails; work re: Parker cross;
work re: findings; conference with W,

Invoice # 42738

5.00 hrs

9.15 Jirs

10.50 hrs

1.50 hrs
6.00 hrs

8.00 hts

7.10 hrs

6.75 hrs

$1,625.00

$1601.25

$4,725.00

$150.00
N/C

$2,600.00

$1242.50

$3,037.50

Page ¥



01/23/2013

01/23/2013

01/24/2013

01/24/2013

310201

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

SEJ

Pierce and R. Freeman re: status.

Review email from I. Pina re: motion to 1.30 hrs
exclude expert; review email from R. Gray, 1.30 hrs
IV re: West Orange Cove II attorney fee

affidavit; review file re: same; revise

amended petition; confer with T. Hunter re:

same; email T. Robertson re: same; revise

findings; confer with T. Hunter re:

submission date; review emails from C.

Pacheco re: exhibits; review notice and

emails re: D. Casey deposition; review

emails re: additional transcripts; review

email re: filing amended petition; review

email from T. Hunter re: revisions to

petition; revise petition; revise findings as to

L. Dawn-Fisher and Kallison; confer with

attorneys re: same; email clients re:

findings; confer with attorneys re: same;

confer with T. Hunter re: filing and serving

amended petition; review email from M.

Patterson re: Partridge presentation.

Work on cites for Findings of Fact; create 4.50 hrs
document to send to Judge's law cleck; meet

with W. Pierce and R. Freeman to discuss

various matters; merge facilities Findings

into Common document; eraai to H.

MclIntosh re: same,

Review and reply to email from rebecca 3.60 hrs
Couto de Silvare: Los Fresnos STAAR

Reports; confererice with counsel re: same;

review deposition exhibits for Gonzalo

Salazar re: samz; conference with legal

assistant re. case files; review Motion to

Exclude testimony of Allan Parker;

confercrice with legal assistant re: seventh

arrended petition; review Edgewood IV

vpinion; draft findings of fact re: same;

ineeting with counsel re: same and other

findings of fact; review and print

defendant’s plea to the jurisdiction.

Finalize, efile and serve TTSFC Plaintiffs’ 1.50 hrs
Seventh Amended Petition; email C. Jenson

re: same; email clients re: joint findings and

amended petition; review emails re:

revisions to amended petition; revise and

efile TTSFC Plaintiffs’ Eighth Amended

Petition; confer with T. Hunter re: same;

review email from C. Pacheco re: L. Roska

Invoice # 42738

$130.00
N/C

$1,462.50

$630.00

NAC

Page 10



01/24/2013

01/25/2013

01/25/2013

01/25/2013

01/26/2013

01/26/2013

01/26/2013

01/27/2013

01/28/2013

3102-01

TBH

RGIV

REG

REG

SEJ

REG

RGIV

exhibit; review email from H. McIntush re:

exhibits,

Attend trial; review Common Findings of 6.50 hrs
Fact; conference with R. Gray and Richard

Gray IV re: Edgewood IV,

Review State Defendant’s Plea to the 4.85 hrs
Jurisdiction and Order on same; conference

with counsel re: Report of Allan Parker;

conference with counsel re: scheduling and

closing argument; review Edgewood IV;

create findings of fact from same;

conference with counsel re: same and

overall findings of fact; review testimony of

Wayne Pierce and tax payer plaintiffs re:

findings of fact; conference with counsel re:

same.

Review plea to jurisdiction filed by the Sate; 4.50 hrs
conference with attorneys re: same; begin

drafting closing; additional work re:

findings; review emails; reply to same;

review emails re: Charter exhibits; work ce;

attorney’s fees.

Draft response to Defendant’s Plea t2-ihe 6.00 hrs
Jurisdiction; email edits and sugges:ions for

Common Findings of Fact to Plaintiffs; edit

our insert to Common Findings of Fact.

Review and reply to emails; conference call 1.00 hrs
with attorneys re: findings.
Review emails re: upzted list of coalition 0.50 hrs

districts; review <mails from T. Hunter re:
Jjoint submission of findings; review emails
re: deposition transcripts; review email re:

inal calendar.

Telephone conference with Plaintiffs 1.00 hrs
attorneys to discuss financial findings.

Wik re: preparation for meetings with 7.75 hrs

Coalition members; meetings with Coalition
members; prepare for Day 41; work re:
findings; review and reply to emails.
Review emial from David Thompson re: 4.45 hrs
findings of fact on the issue of the cost of a
Geneal Diffusion of Knowledge; draft
findings re: same; conference with legal
assisant re: drafted findings; meeting with
plaintiffs counsel re: findings of fact; revise
findings of fact; conference with counsel re:
same; review number of districts that can
get to $6576 at $1.00 and $1.04.

Invoice # 42738

$2,112.50

$848.75

$2,025.00

$1,950.00

$ 450.00

N/C

$ 325.00

$3,487.50

$778.75

Page 11



01/28/2013

01/28/2013

01/28/2013

01/29/2013

01/29/2013

01/29/2013

01/29/2013

01/29/2013

3102-01

REG

SEJ

RGIV

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

Trial Day 41; prepare for Day 42; review 8.00 hrs
and reply to emails; work re: draft findings.
Review emails re: Charter Plaintiffs’ 1.00 hrs

exhibits and deposition designations; review

emails re: Charter Plaintiffs’ trial exhibits;

review email re: Rule 11 agreement and

stipulations; review email re: T. Sage

deposition and exhibits; review email from

court reporter re: 11/26 trial transcript;

review emails re: updated list of coalition

districts; review emails from T. Hunter re:

joint submission of findings; review emails

re: deposition transcripts; review email re:

irial calendar.

Edit Common Findings; meet with Plaintiff 8.50 hrs
attorneys to discuss financial findings;

conference with R. Gray re: same; review

Moak report.

Review number of districts achieving $6576 0.55 hrs
at a $1.04 or less tax rate; conference with

counsel re: same; revise and update findiags

re: same; conference with counsel re: James

Kallison cross examination; review 2inss

examination.

Review Wayne Pierce testimony re: 2.25 hrs
findings of fact; conference wiih counsel re:

same; review emails from Ray Freeman re:

same; meeting with counsel re: case status.

Trial Day 47, prepare for Day 43; review 9.25 hrs
and reply to emzils; work re: findings of

fact; work on closing argument.

Review C, Pacheco email re: witness Q.75 hrs
presentations; review email from court 0.35 hrs
reporter re: admitted exhibits; review email

re: Edgzwood exhibits and Cortez

supplemental report; review email from M.

Sisler re: objections to Charter Plaintiffs’

amended petition; review C. Pacheco email

re: corrected trial exhibits; review C.

Pacheco email re: documents uploaded to

the AG FTP server; review M. Sisler email

re: notice of withdrawal of objections;

confer with T. Hunter re: additional

proposed findings; review C. Pacheco email

re: Rolle presentation; review emails re:

additional proposed findings; review emails

re: admitted exhibits.

Work on Findings of Fact; conference with 8.30 hrs

Invoice # 42738

$3,600.00

N/C

$2,762.50

$ 96.25

$393.75

$4,162.50

$ 75.00
N/C

$2,697.50
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01/30/2013

01/30/2013
01/30/2013

01/30/2013

01/31/2013

01/31/2013

01/31/2013

3102-01

RGIV

REG
SEJ

RGIV

SEJ

R. Gray on pleadings; conference with R.
Gray on Common Findings on Level of
Finding needed;emails to M. Trachtenberg
re: same; email to Lt. McIntosh re: facility
findings.

Review and reply to email from counsel re:
Bruce Baker Supplemental Report and
exhibits; review Baker Report and exhibits;
conference with legal assistant re: equity
center redlined findings of fact; conference
with counsel re: meeting re: same; review
redlined findings; telephone conference with
Ray Freeman re: findings of fact;
conference with counsel re: same; draft
same; meeting with Wayne Pierce, Ray
Freeman, and Toni Hunter re: findings of
fact.

Trial Day 43; review and reply to emails.
Revise findings (cont.); confer with T.
Hunter re: same; review emails from C.
Pacheco re: expert presentations; review
emails re: exhibits; confer with T. Hun‘er re:
1, Pfeifer contact information; revie'v email
from R. Freeman re: revisions to/fujdings;
review email re: Calhoun County and Fort
Bend trial brief; review email fiom C.
Pacheco re: Dunn presentation; review
emails re: Cortez supplemental report;
review email from M Patterson re: trial
exhibits; review 2mails re: Baker exhibits;
review email from R. Gray re: 11/27 trial
transcript.

Work on Findings of Fact; meet with W,
Pierce and R. Freeman on same; review trial
brief.on adequacy/suitability; review State’s
exhibits.

Review and revise findings of fact;
conference with counsel re: same;
conference with legal assistant re: same;
meeting with counsel re: review edits to
findings of fact.

Work on file cleanup; work on findings;
review emails; reply to same; review
additional exhibits; work on closing; work
re: fee issues; review Edgewood plea to
jurisdiction and motion to dismiss; email D.
Hinojosa re: same.

Revise findings (cont.); review updated list

Invoice # 42738

5.30 hrs

8.00 s
1.50 hrs
2.00 hrs

8.00 hrs

3.70 hrs

4.75 hrs

3.00 hrs

$927.50

$3,600.00
$150.00
N/C

$2,600.00

$647.50

$2,137.50

$300.00

Page 13



01/31/2013 TBH

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

of admitted exhibits from court reporter; 1.40 hrs
review email from C. Pacheco re: additional

exhibits; confer with T. Hunter re: revisions

to common findings; review email re:

Edgewood exhibits; review email from M,

Patterson re: additional exhibits.

Edit Findings of Fact; conference with R. 5.00 hrs
Gray re: same; review Edgewood's Plea to

Jurisdiction; conference with R, Gray re:

same; emails exchange with M.

Trachtenberg re: same.

REG I, Richard E. Gray Partner 193.50 hrs @ 450.00 hr
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 147.15 hrs @ 175.00 thr
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 129.30 lrs @ 325.00 /hr
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 13.15 hrs @ (00.00 /hr
Fee Recap Totals 488.10

3102-01 Invoice # 42738

N/C

$1,625.00

$156,663.75

$87,075.00
$25,751.25
$42,022.50

__$ 181500

$156,663.75
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GRAY & BECKER, P.C.
900 West Avenue
Austin, Tx 78701

512.482.0061

February 24, 2013

Tax ID No.: 74-2427406
Invoice# 42921-1 REG
OCurfile# 3102 00001
Texas Taxpayer and Student Faimess Coalition Billing iacough: 02/24/2013

¢/o Equity Center
1202 Colorado, Suite 300
Austin, TX 78701

Re: School Finance Litigation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

01/14/2013 TBH Read Edgewood findings; exchange several 3.50 hrs $1,137.50
emails with D. Hinojosa re: Edgewood
findings and how to coordinate working
together on equity findings; conference with
R. Gray and Richard Gray IV re: same;
review proposed findings from W. Pierce
and P, Colbert; conference with R, Gray and
Richard Gray 1V re: same; exchange enils
with M. Trachtenberg re: formatting and
generating final document.

01/16/2013 TBH Conference with R. Gray and Itichard Gray 0.50 hrs $ 162.50
1V re: Edgewood Findings of Fact.
02/01/2013 RGIV Review emails re: exhibits: review Wayne 2.30 hrs $402.50

Pierce’s edited and propozed findings of
fac1; conference with counsel re: findings of
fact; meeting with counsel re: PowerPoint
for closing arguinent; create same; review
findings of fact
02/01/2013 REG Work re: findings; work re: closing; review 4.75 hrs $2137.50
emails; ply to same; review additional
state exhibits; review M. Sisler email with
addinonal production; review Edgewood

supplemental exhibits.
02/01/2013 5EI Revise findings; review curren: list of 2.50 hrs $250.00
admitted exhibits and compare to TTSFC 3.00 hrs N/C

Plaintiffs’ exhibit list; confer with T. Hunter
re: same; review email from M. Sisler re:
supplemental responses to RFP; review
email from M. Patterson re: exhibits; review
email from M. Patterson re: documents
produced; review email from T. Hunter re:
revisions to findings; review email from l.
Pina re: trial exhibits; confer with T. Hunter
re: revisions to common findings; review
email re: Plaintiffs’ Plea to the Jurisdiction

310281 Invoice # 42921 Fage 1



02/01/2013

02/02/2013

02/02/2013

02/02/2013

02/03/2013

02/04/2013
02/04/2013

02/04/2013

02/04/2013

02/05/2013

02/05/2013

02/05/2013

18

TBH

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

SE)

RGIV

SEl

and Motion to Dismiss; review email re:
11/26 trial transcript; revise common
findings; confer with T. Hunter re:
combining Plaintiffs' findings with common
findings; revise commen findings; review
email from A. Penn re: Defendants’ exhibits;
review email from M. Lorber re: Efficiency
Intervenors’ Trial Brief; review email from
H. Mclntush re: partial joinder.

Finalize common documenis; conference
with R. Gray re: same.

Continue building closing PowerPoint;
email to counsel for review.

Work re: closing; review additional
exhibits; review additional pleadings;
review and reply to emails.

Conference with R. Gray and Richard Gray
1V re: closing argument.

Work re: closing argument; review and
reply to emails.

Trial re: closing arguments.

Axtend last day of wial (Day 44); present
clsoing argument; receive Court's ruling;
post decision analysis with clients.

Review emails from T. Hunter re: re#isions
to common findings; review emails re: Ft.
Bend 1SD trial exhibits; reviewenil from
L. Lawrence re: Calhoun County exhibits;
review email from H. Mclntusa re: amended
exhibi1 list; review emai! {vom T. Hunter re:
forwarding redlined comumon findings to
counsel; revise findings; confer with T.
Hunter re: additionl revisions to common
findings; revizw ¢mail from court reporter
re: 11728 wrial transcript; review email from
H, Mclntich re: exhibits; revise findings.
Attend trial; conference with W. Pierce; R.
Gr2y; A. Kaufman and others re: ruling; edit
Fuding of Fact; conference with S.Jennings
re: Finding of Fact.

Email Carol Jenson and Della Sawvel re:
exhibits.

Work re: findings; email attorneys re:
meeting with Judge; review emails; reply to
same; email findings to M. Trachtenberg.
Confer with R. Gray, 11l re: emailing
common findings to counsel; email counsel
re: same; review and return email from S.
Rosen re: flashdrive left in courtroom;
confer with R. Gray re: Moak engagement
letter; review file re: same.

Invoice # 42921

450 hrs

0.35 hrs

3.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

4.75 hrs

7.15 hrs
8.50 hrs

1.70 hrs

7.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

375 hrs

0.40 hrs

$1,462.50
$ 61.25

$1687.50

$ 325.00
$2137.50
$1251.25
$3825.00

NAC

$2,275.00

$ 17.50

$1687.50

N/C

Prge 2



02/06/2013

02/06/2013

02/072013

02/0712013

02/0712013

02/08/2013

02/11/2013

02/12/2013

02/12/2013

02/12/2013

02/13/2013

02/1372013

02/13/2013

02/14/2013

320

REG

SEJ

RGIV

REG

SEJ

REG

RGIV

RGIV

RGIV

SEJ

RGIV

Review emails: reply to same; work re:
findings; review additional exhibits.
Review email from S. Rodriguez re: D.
Casey deposition changes and signature
pages.

Review file; conference with legal assistant
re: same; organize file.

Review emails; reply to same; work re:
affidavit on attomey fees; review email
from S. Rosen re: 2/13 meeting; review 1.
Pena email; review withdrawal of R. Couto.
Confer with R. Gray re: call from M.
Asofsky, Texas ACLU; email M. Asofsky
Plaintiffs’ current pleading; review email
and notice from |. Pina re: withdrawal of
attomey, R. Couto.

Review emails; reply 10 same; work re:
attomey fees affidavit.

Review and reply to emails; work re:
attomey fee claim; review R. Freeman
email; reply to same.

Review and reply to email from Tedrah
Robertson re: article for equity center and
STAAR; create exhibit re: FIRST rating To:
focus districts; review and reply to emal
from counsel re: same; review email from
Mark Trachtenberg re: counse!'s egits 1o
omnibus findings of fact; review omnibus
findings of fact.

Review and reply to ems'is re: Judge Dietz's
ruling; review emails 12: findings of fact and
exhibits.

Review emails; r2piy to same; work re:
exhibits; telepiions conference with M.
Gallindo re! s:hool finance issues; work re;
findings:

Conference with counsel re: attomeys fees;
meziing with counsel and Judge Dietz re:
findings of fact, final judgment, and time
lines for all.

Review emails; reply to same; review M.
Trachtenberg email; re: attomey fees;
prepare for 2/13 meeting with Court;
conference with R. Gray re: findings;
review W, Pierce email; reply to same.
Review email from court reporter re: 11/29
transcript; telephone conference with court
reporter re: outstanding invoices; review
email from court reporter re: same.

Review email from Wayne Pierce re:
ASATR email from Superintendent of

Invoice # 42921

2.75 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.75 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.65 hrs

1.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.10 hrs

$1237.50

NfC

$ 87.50

$787.50

NiC

$675.00

$675.00

$280.00

$113.75

$675.00

$437.50

$1170.00

WNAC

$367.50

Fage



02/14/2013

02/1572013

02/15/2013

02/15/2013

02/16/2013

02/17/2013

02/18/2013

02/18/2013

02/18/2013

02/19/2013

310301

RGIV

SEJ

REG

REG

RGIV

REG

TBH

RGIV

Ch.41 district; legal research re: attomeys
fees; conference call with counsel re: media.
Review M. Galindo email; review W. Pierce
email; review P. Colbert email; with
findings: conference with T. Hunter re:
findings; review A. Kauffman email with
attachment; review W. Pierce emails (2);
reply to same (2); work re: attomey’s fees
proof and affidavit; reply to various calls.
Email exhibits to media; conference with
legal assistant re: Kallison Tour of Texas
and other exhibits; review emails re:
findings of fact.

Telephone conference with W. Pierce re:
findings; review all bills re: redaction
necessary for attomey's fees affidavit; work
on affidavit; review emails; reply to same;
research recovery of expenses.

Confer with R. Gray, 1V re: exhibits; review
admitted exhibits; email C. Jenson and D.
Sawvel re: Ex. 3236; amend TTSFC exhibit
list; efile and serve amended exhibit list;
confer with T. Hunter and R. Gray, 1V re:
same; review email from D. Sawvel re:
same; review email from Clerk re: aimended
exhibit list; review email from C. Pacheco
re: letter to Court; review emafl from 1. Pina
re: amended exhibit list; email M. Jacobs re:
Ex. 3240; confer with R. (3ray, 1V re: same.
Brief meeting with attorieys re: findings
and attomey’s fees proof.

Complete review and redaction of bills re:
attomey’s fees proof.

Legal research re: recovery of attomey’s
fees; telephore conference with Mark
Trachtenherg re: same, review and reply to
email-from Lacy Lawrence re: same;
tei~phone conference (voicemail) with Chris
Damond re: same; conference with counsel
re: same; meeting with counsel re:
MALDEFs findings of fact and conclusions
of law.

Work re: attomey’s fees; work re: findings;
review emails; reply to same; review D.
Thompson email re: findings; conference
with T. Hunter re: same.

Work on Findings of Fact and Conclusions
of Law.

Legal research re: attomey's fees; email Fort
Bend plaintiffs re: same; conference with
counsel re: same; meeting with T. Hunter

Invoice # 42921

030 hrs

2.15 hrs

0.65 hrs
1.00 hrs

0.50 fus

1.50 hrs

4.80 hrs

6.25 hrs

4.00 hrs

4.60 hrs

$787.50

$ 52,50

$967.50

$65.00
N/IC

$225.00

$675.00

$840.00

$2812.50

$1.300.00

$805.00

Frge 4



02/19/2013

02/19/2013

02/19/2013

02/20/2013

02/20/2013

02/20/2013

02/20/2013

0212172013

3lpaa1

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

REG

SEJ

TBH

RGIV

and D. Hinojosa re: equity findings of fact;
review email from Shelley Dahlberg re:
TTSFC exhibit 3240; revise same and email
to counsel for review; review and revise
redlined version of omnibus equity section;
conference with counsel re: same.

Work re: findings and attorney's fees
claims; review emails; reply to same.
Review emails from C. Wooten re: D. Ray
and B. Wood CV’s; review email from S.
Dahlberg re: revised exhibit list.

Work on consolidating equity findings with
Edgewood and Ft. Bend; conference with D.
Hinojosa re: same; edit Conclusions of Law
edits; exchange emails with M.Tractenberg
re: several Findings of Fact.

Review and make comments to Paul
Colberst proposed additional findings of
fact and conclusions of law; telephone
conference with Paul Colbert re: same;
email Paul Colbert comments re: same;
conference with counsel re: same; review
emails re; findings of fact; review finding:
of fact and edits to document; email comisel
re: same.

Review and reply to emails; work re:
findings; work re: attomey's fecs aifidavit;
telephone conference with various
legislators re: status.

Review email from couri reporter re:
admitted exhibits; cimpare to TESFC
Plaintiffs’ master exhibit list; review email
from S. Rosen re: b, Wood security badge;
telephone corderence with B. Wood's office
re: same; te;~phone conference with S.
Rosen rz; same; confer with T. Hunter re:
revisions to findings; revise findings.

Edit Findings of Fact and conclusions of
Law; exchange emails with D. Hinojosa and
D. Thompsom re: same; exchange emails
with D. Thompson and P. Fraissinet re:
facility findings.

Review and reply to email from Tedrah
Robertson re: article for equity center on
Judge Dietz’s ruling; review and reply to
email from Wayne Pierce re: case status;
conference with counse] re: all; legal
research re: attorney's fees; review caselaw
re: same; email Wayne Pierce re: State
average M&O revenue per WADA;
telephone conference with Paul Colbert re:

Invoice # 42921

2,75 his

0.15 hrs

7.00 hrs

1.80 hrs

2.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

6.00 hrs

3.80 hrs

$1237.50

N/C

$2,275.00

$315.00

$900.00

N/C

$1,950.00

$665.00
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proposed findings of fact and conclusions of
law; revise same; email same to counse] for
review,
02/21/2013 REG Review emails; reply to same; work re: 2.00 hrs $900.00
findings; work re: attorney’s fees affidavit
and proof; review calls; retum calls.

02/21/2013 SEJ Review emails re: attomey's fees affidavits. 0.10 hrs N/C
02/21/2013 TBH Draft Findings of Fact. 4.00 hrs $1,300.00
02/22/2013 RGIV  Conference with counsel re; exhibts to use 3.60 hrs $630.00

in presentation to the Mexican American
Legislative Caucus; print same; email Marty
Golando re: same and presentation of
exhibits; conference call with plaintiffs
counse] re: findings of fact; conference with
T. Hunter and R. Gray 111 re: same;
conference with counsel re: revisions to
STAAR findings of fact; revise findings of
fact re: focus district STAAR results;
conference with counsel re: same.

02/22/2013 REG Work re: preparation for MALAC meeting; 2.00 hrs $500.00
review emails; reply to same; work re: 0.25 hrs N/C
findings; work re: attomey’s fees proof;
telephone call to W. Pierce - left message:
various telephone conferences with
attomeys re: findings.

02/22/2013 SEJ Review email and attachments from M. 0.20 hrs $20.00
Patterson re: additional exhibits; i=view
email from C. Pacheco re: amended exhibit
list and supplemental discovery responses.

02/22/2013 TBH Draft and edit Findings of Fact; patriciate in 6.00 hrs $1,950.00
telephone conference with all Plaintiff
attomey re: FL Bend Equity Findings;
patriciate in telephone call with M.

Tractenberg, P. Faissinet, M. Jacobs and
M. Bono re; charter findings.

02/23/2013 REG Review draft findings; review and reply to 1.50 hrs $675.00
emails:
02/23/2013 TBH Continue 10 edit Findings of Fact; email to 4.00 hrs $1,300.00
M. Jacobs, H. Mclntush and Richard Gray
1V re: same.
0272412013 REG Work on findings/conclusions; work re: 1.50 hrs $675.00
attorney’s fees affidavit; review and reply to
emails.
$49,548.75
TIMEKEEPER RECAP
REG 111, Richard E. Gray Partner 61.00 hrs @ 450.00 /hr $27.450.00
RGIV  Gray, IV, Richard E. 36.15 hrs @ 175.00 thr $ 632625
TBH  Hunter, Toni Partner 4750 hrs @ 325.00 Mr $15.437.50
SEJ Jennings, Susan Paralegal 3.35 hrs @ 100.00 /hr $ 33500
Fee Recap Totals 148.00 $49.548.75

NGt Invoice # 42921 Page &



Exhibit “G”
Ray & Wood Time Records



2M16/20133:24 PM

et

A B e 1T o0 J ET1T°F G H i ] K L ] N

| |Texas Taxpayer Coalition

2 i

3 Dats Thnokesper  |Hours  |Ratle Amcunl | Narstive 1

4 |0B/Z2/2011 (RBW Z00] 9/5.00] 750.00 |Allanded mesling € Sauly Canter,

5 |DAZA011 |DOUG Z00|  375.00] 750.00 [Atltended iigetion meeting. |

8 |Cami2011 |DOUG 1,000 375.00| 375.00 |Alisnded meetng B TASH Legal Defense Fund,

7 08B0t |RBW 100, 375.00] 37500 |Attended mesing @ TASE Legs Defenss Fund,

B |0ao2011 |DOUG 150 375.00] 562.50 |Alisnded medling willh TASA sl the Equity Cantar.

8 o@iI20il |RBW 3.50]  375.00] 1,312.50 | Trevel i San Antonlo, Aliended Ben Antonio |.5.D. mestng.rravel betk 1o Austin,

10 (08aZ011 |DOUG 5000 87500 1,125.00 |Altanded two (7) seperats mestings @ U Equily Center i n w lswaull

11 [OWIB/2011 |DOUG 0.80] _ 375.00] 337,50 |Reviewed and revised organizational Gocuments for non,vot Sssocistion.

12 |0W2Z32011 |RBW 1.50] 376.00] 50250 |Emalis back and forth 18: rumBer of ORETS I OIEemCw00nel GOTUMSNS.

13 |00/26/2011 |DOAUG Z00] 375.00] 750.00 |Allended ofice meeting with Rick Grey and Devid MInoioss.

14 [OW28/2011 |REW 2.00]  3I75.00] 750.00 |Altendey office mesting with Fick Gray and Dav Hnojoss.

16 |0W/282011 |RBW 200, a75.00 750,00 | Aiended offce masting with Wayne Plarcs aro “Ahers.

18 | Do/aaiz011 |DOUG 200] 37500 750.00 | Altended offics mesting With Wayne Plorce.]

17 | 100472011 [RBW 1.00] 37E.00] 375,00 |Reviewsd and revised finel dreft of orparaionsl Gocuments, Emsiied b Weyne Fiercs,

18 | 100572011 |DOUA 0,20 3I75.00] 1500 |Reviewsd and revissd organizaionsl Goourments for nomprofd assodation,

18 10062011 | DOUG 0.40| 37500] 150.00 |Reviowed and revised orpanizationsl dosuments for onprofl asscoistion,
20 | 1/082011 |RBW 050 375.00] (8750 |Reviewed end revised last final v s of organizationsl documents. Emaied 10 Wayne Bierce,
21 joU/132012 [DOUG 0.20] 375.00  76.00 |Researchre: SoShews. | ! 1 1 -
22 101/ T772012 | DOAIG 0.30] 37500 112,50 |Heviowsd 505 leiier and 28, %ne Confanenth with chtn ra; sam,
23 DOUG 0.10 376.00 37 50 | Telaphone confarence Wi ©-COunesl 18 SO0 e, -
24 REW 3.00]  375.00( 1,(25.00 | Attended meeating 810 G.scuBSion.
25 DoUG 0.40] 37800 150,00 | Reviewed newiy-SicA arvertion.
28 133] 375.000 496.75 |Altended meeting L dimciss biigation strategy.
27 250, 37500 93750 | Attendsd meetrs tu discuss Hligation sirstegy.
28 008] 37500]  30.00 |Reviewsd pruiu motions. |

385 375.00] 1,443.75 | Adterded moving end Pretial Confersncs,
3,88 375,00, 1,445.75)| Alenden mesting end Preui Conferanns.

~ 1,251 375,00, 468.75) Remas Vgl Harey's Bpert Report,
T 280] 376.00| 997.50 Mewtny ol Gray & Deckers office. CoT
T 078] 37500 281.951 rlaphons converseton with chent.
2.50] 376.00] 837,501 nesling wih Jutige Deats, and meeting ai Gray & Backsr

. Z00] 3r500] 75007 Waesting re; Trisl Siralagy
T 2.00] 97600 JEbuu;| Wesling re: Trial Simisgy
3,00 376.00] 1,135.00'| Superimendent Maeling 81 Gray snd Becker|

0.75] 375.000 | 281.25 [Phomw calls i | |
"T350]  a78.00; 1.312.50(| Superintendent Meeting, and maeling with Tony Hunier

“0.20) .0 ITHAT 7500 |Ressarch re; Efficlency Clam
~ 400 I7E.00| 1,500.00! Melling with Superintendants
. 308, 375.000 1,143.75)|Rasesrching and drafting efficlency memo

. L2800 (3TEOD:  937.50i | Meating with Superintendents I

- f‘-uzmi 375.00 m.mfmmmwmhmuasmmmmmmmm
S 375.00 {67.50| Telephons converaations, viewsd proposal

375.00; 1,312.50,|Maating with clianls |
375.00) 375.00)| Mesting with Rick Gray
376.00| 1,125.00 | Atend hesring on school finence matter

1082012

375,00  750,00:| Atendence et pretrial hearing, |

ssaasarassssaaaataazses

16192012 . 375.00] Ba7.50 | Ressarching and Graliing Mema on hold hammioss 155ue.
1012012 |RB 375.00| 2,062.50;| Aiandance st tial
V002 -375.00|_ 2,531,285 | Aliendance et bial
022a012 375,00 112.50,| Reviewing end revising proposed trial brsf.
1012 . 315,00| 2,531.25.|Alisndance ai ingi
T0/2Ar012 ~ 1375.00] 1,125,00.|Aliendance af trisl
Toizea012 | 37500, 2.631.95 | Alengsnce o el
0132 376.00] 2,531.25, Altend trisl
10/2W2012 _ S75.00] 2,531.25|Attend triel
TOiaia012 || RBWY .. j . T 375.00] 2.591.25) Attend il
11073172012 Inaw G878 375000 2,531.25( Attend trisl
. . e
=
3 ;,
emmmmsg‘aﬁ&mgﬂmewcm Page 102




2/18/20133:24 PM

A B C D E F T a 7] ]

81 11012 |RBW “8.78| 375,00 2,651.25 [Atiend tisl
82 |11/0872012 |REW 875 375.00] 2.531.25 |Attend trisl
83 [11/08/2012 |RBW 7.50] 375.00] 2,812.50 |Altend triai
B4 [1107/2012 |{RBW 4.00| 375.00 1,500.00 |Aftand tial
85 111162012 |REW 5.30| 37500 1,687.50 |Altend trial
86 1102012 |RBW 8.25] 375.00] 2,343.75 |Aliend biel
g7 |11/202012 [RBW 8.25]  375.00] 2,343.75 [Atend trial
68 |1/Z7/2012 |REW 8.25] 375.00] 2,343.75 |Atlend Uil
89 |1 V22012 |RBW 338 375.00] L,216.75 |Altend tnal
70 1i/2wa012 |REW 3.00] 375.00] 1,125.00 |Altsnd tial
71 |12/032012 |REW 6.50, 375.00| 2,437.50 |Altend trial
72 | 12/04/2012 |RBW 325  375.00] 1,218.75 |Attand bial
73 | 121002012 |RBW 8.50] 375.00| 2,437.50 |Altend trial
74 [12110/2012 |RBW §:50] 375.00] 2,062.50 [Altsnd trial
75 01072013 |REW 8.25] 375.00| 2,343.75 |Altend tna!
78 (0170822013 |RBW 3.25]  376.00| 1,218.75 |Altend tral
¥7 | 0VOWR01S |RBW 8.25| 375.00] 2.343.75 |Altend tral
78

78

80 TGTAL FEES 87,435.00
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